

Filing Receipt

Filing Date - 2023-07-21 12:12:17 PM

Control Number - 50788

Item Number - 369

SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS DOCKET NO. 50788

RATEPAYERS APPEAL OF THE DECISION BY WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION TO CHANGE WATER AND SEWER RATES

BEFORE THE STATE OFFICE

OF

ADMINISTRATIVE HEARINGS

AFFIDAVIT OF JAMIE L, MAULDIN RELATED TO THE RATE CASE EXPENSES IN DOCKET NO. 50788 OF WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION

STATE OF TEXAS § SCOUNTY OF TRAVIS §

BEFORE ME, the undersigned authority, on this day, personally appeared Jamie L. Mauldin, who being by me first duly sworn, on oath deposed and said the following:

1. My name is Jamie L. Mauldin. I am a principal with the law firm of Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle and Townsend, P.C. (Lloyd Gosselink) and counsel for the Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation (WOWSC) in State Office of Administrative Hearings (SOAH) Docket No. 473-20-4071.WS and Public Utility Commission of Texas (PUC) Docket No. 50788. I have been practicing public utility law since 2011 and have represented WOWSC in Docket 50788 since Ratepayers' original filing on April 27, 2020.

2. I am familiar with the work performed by Lloyd Gosselink and the technical consultant on behalf of the WOWSC in connection with Docket No. 50788 concerning the *Ratepayers Appeal of the Decision by Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation to Change Water and Sewer Rates* (Rate Appeal). I am over the age of 18 years and am not disqualified from making this affidavit. My statements are true and correct.

3. Reimbursable rate case expenses relating to the Rate Appeal have been incurred by WOWSC since January 31, 2023, when WOWSC last filed testimony related to rate case expenses. My first supplemental direct testimony supports the reasonableness of the legal and consultant expenses WOWSC incurred as of May 31, 2021. My second supplemental testimony supports the reasonableness of the legal and consultant expenses incurred by WOWSC as of September 30, 2021. My third supplemental testimony supports the reasonableness of the legal and consultant expenses of the legal and consultant expenses incurred by WOWSC as of September 30, 2021. My third supplemental testimony supports the reasonableness of the legal and consultant expenses incurred by WOWSC as of December 15, 2021. My fourth supplemental

1

testimony supports the reasonableness of the legal and consultant expenses incurred by WOWSC as of May 23, 2022. WOWSC's First Errata to Fifth Supplemental Direct Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin supports the reasonableness of the legal and consultant expenses incurred by WOWSC as of January 31, 2023. WOWSC is now requesting the reimbursement of all reasonable rate case expenses after January 31, 2023.

4. The Proposal for Decision (PFD), issued on June 29, 2023, recommends that the rate case expenses incurred as of January 31, 2023 in the amount of \$474,184,04 are reasonable and comparable to the rate case expenses awarded in other, arguably less complex rate appeals.¹ The PFD also recommends that WOWSC file an affidavit or supplemental testimony closer in time to the Commission's consideration of this matter, or allow WOWSC to recover trailing rate case expenses through a compliance docket.²

5. Based upon my review, I recommend that WOWSC be allowed to recover the reasonable and necessary legal and consultant rate case expenses of \$183,326.64 as of April 30, 2023, which includes expenses incurred from February 1, 2023, through April 30, 2023, pursuant to SOAH's direction. Since the First Errata to Fifth Supplemental Direct Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin, WOWSC has incurred necessary and reasonable additional attorney fees associated with this proceeding, including briefing, preparation of pleadings defending WOWSC and myself from abusive allegations of misconduct, drafting replies, and preparing and attending the second hearing on the merits. As discussed above, the PFD issued on June 29, 2023, also recommends recovery of rate case expenses incurred after January 31, 2023, and recovery of trailing rate case expenses incurred between the date of this filing and when the Commission's decision becomes final. WOWSC will look to the Commission for guidance on how to handle these trailing expenses.

6. WOWSC is aware that the rate case expenses incurred in this rate appeal are significantly higher than the contested rate increase, but this proceeding has been heavily litigated over the last three years, and WOWSC has had to engage in extensive discovery and motion practice, in addition to being required to prepare two additional rounds of testimony and participate in a second hearing on the merits due to the Commission's remand.

¹ SOAH Proposal for Decision with Memorandum at 55 (Jun. 29, 2023).

 $^{^{2}}$ Id.

7. Based on my experience and education and following a thorough and critical review of all of the relevant information, I concluded that the reasonable and necessary rate case expenses for legal services as of April 30, 2023 is \$657,065.72. A rate case expense summary sheet detailing each expense by attorney and consultant is attached as **Attachment A**. I recommend that the Commission find this amount to be the reasonable and necessary reimbursable legal and consultant rate case expenses for WOWSC in this proceeding. I also recommend that the Commission allow WOWSC to recover its consultant rate case expenses of Grant Rabon of NewGen Strategies & Solutions (NewGen), pursuant to Texas Water Code Ann. §§ 13.183, 13.185(c), and 13.187 (TWC), and 16 Texas Administrative Code (TAC) § 24.33.

8. WOWSC engaged the services of Lloyd Gosselink in May 2020. I have directed the work performed by Lloyd Gosselink employees on behalf of WOWSC since that time. I have reviewed the billings of Lloyd Gosselink submitted to WOWSC for legal services from February 1, 2023, through April 30, 2023, in connection with WOWSC defending the Rate Appeal. I affirm that those billings accurately reflect the time spent and expenditures incurred by Lloyd Gosselink on WOWSC's behalf. Those billings were accurately calculated before they were tendered and did not include any double billing. None of the charges billed to WOWSC have been recovered through reimbursement for other expenses. The expenses charged were associated with the review and defense of the Rate Appeal and were necessary to advise WOWSC and to accomplish tasks in the rate proceeding.

9. For the period of February 1, 2023, through April 30, 2023, Lloyd Gosselink billed \$180,301.64 for legal services in connection with WOWSC's proposed rate increase. This figure includes legal fees and expenses. The fees and expenses were necessary and for the legal representation of WOWSC. The legal work included advising WOWSC on rates, review of the Rate Appeal, preparation of pleadings, review and preparation of evidentiary exhibits, preparation of testimony, briefing, hearing, and other trailing expenses.

10. The hourly rates for attorneys of \$280–\$330 and for the paralegals of \$150, upon which the billings are based, are generally lower than the same hourly rates charged to other clients for comparable services during the same time frame. My hourly rate for this proceeding is significantly lower than my normal hourly rate charged to similar clients. Additionally, our firm's hourly rates are at the lower end of the range compared to the rates charged by other lawyers with similar experience providing similar services. To further minimize expenses, I used associates and

3

paralegals where possible because of their lower billing rates. In assigning the tasks to attorneys, I ensured that the attorneys did not duplicate the work of one another. The hours spent to perform the tasks assigned to Lloyd Gosselink were necessary to complete those tasks in a professional manner and on a timely basis. My many years of experience participating in utility rate cases aid in our efforts to keep rate case expenses reasonable.

11. The invoices submitted by Lloyd Gosselink include a description of services performed and time expended on each activity. The invoices dated from March 15, 2023, through May 11, 2023, for this proceeding are attached as **Attachment B**. Lloyd Gosselink has documented all charges with time sheets, invoices, and records.

12. Neither Lloyd Gosselink nor any consultants for WOWSC have charged for luxury items, including first-class airfare, limousine service, entertainment, or alcoholic beverages. No meals were charged in excess of \$25 per person, and no individual billed for more than 12 hours per day. The documentation in this case is similar to that provided in many previous rate cases before the Commission.

13. The current amount requested for legal expenses of \$180,301.64 is reasonable given the complexity of this case and comparable to the rate case expenses awarded in other rate appeals.³ WOWSC has incurred significant additional attorney fees associated with this proceeding due to the Commission's remand to SOAH, including briefing, preparation of pleadings defending WOWSC and myself from abusive allegations of misconduct, drafting replies to exceptions, and participating in a second hearing on the merits with additional briefing.

14. For the period of February 1, 2023, through March 31, 2023, the expenses for Grant Rabon of NewGen are \$3,025.00. Based on my years of experience working with utility consultants, Mr. Rabon's hourly rate of \$275.00 and hourly rates of his associates, upon which the billings are based, is comparable to rates charged by consultants with similar levels of expertise and experience as Mr. Rabon. I have also reviewed the number of hours Mr. Rabon and his associates have spent on the review, analysis, and testimony regarding depreciation in this proceeding and on responding to discovery. In my opinion, the amount of time spent is appropriate given the complexity of this case. The NewGen invoice from services dated from February 1, 2023

³ Ratepayers Appeal of the Decision by Bear Creek Special Utility District to Chang Rates, Docket No. 49351, Order on Rehearing at 3, Findings of Fact No. 56 (Nov. 19, 2021) (Bear Creek Order) awarding \$409k in rate case expenses.

through March 31, 2023 for this proceeding are attached as Attachment C. The amount requested for NewGen's expenses of \$21,757.50, as of the date of filing, is reasonable.

15. The total amount requested for rate case expenses from May 1, 2020, through April 30, 2023, in the amount of \$657,065.72 for Docket No. 50788, which includes legal fees, consultant fees, and expenses, are reasonable given the complexity, length, and novel issues presented in this case.

JAMIE L. MAUI DIN

Ļ

SUBSCRIBED AND SWORN TO BEFORE ME, the undersigned authority, on this 21st day of July, 2023.



Attachment A 1 of 1

Docket No. 50788 Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation Rate Case Expenses

	Date	LGRT Inv. #	1	.GRT Fees	Non-Consultant Disbursements	LGRT INVOICE ACTUAL TOTAL	NOTES
	6/26/2020	97511347	\$	7,674.00	s -	\$ 7,674.00	Provided in Direct Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	7/8/2020	97512426	\$	1,275.00	s -	\$ 1,275.00	Provided in Direct Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	8/26/2020	97513856	\$	5,110.50	s -	\$ 5,110.50	Provided in Direct Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	10/22/2020	97515385	S	68,535.00	\$ 66.80	\$ 68,601.80	Provided in Direct Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	11/12/2020	97516427	S	8,820.00	s -	\$ 8,820.00	Provided in Direct Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	12/22/2020	97518766	s	29,870.00	\$ 55.52	\$ 29,925.52	Provided in Direct Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	1/11/2021	97519431	S	4,213.00	s -	\$ 4,213.00	Provided in Direct Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	2/9/2021	97519807	\$	11,650.00	s -	\$ 11,650.00	Provided in Direct Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	3/8/2021	97520641	\$	11,440.50	\$ 36.80	\$ 11,477.30	Provided in Direct Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	4/13/2021	97521461	S	26,576.50	\$ 1,296.75	\$ 27,873.25	Provided in First Supplemental Direct Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	5/13/2021	97522524	\$	14,404.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 14,409.00	Provided in First Supplemental Direct Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	6/2/2021	97522723	S	41,117.00	s -	S 41.117.00	Provided in First Supplemental Direct Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	6/22/2021	97523260	S	-	\$ 0.20		Provided in Second Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
1	7/14/2021	97524054	\$	36,773.00	\$ 871.18		Provided in Second Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
1	8/11/2021	97524965	S	1,913.00	\$ 265.40		Provided in Second Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
1	9/13/2021	97525699	\$	135.50	s -	And a second	Provided in Second Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	10/12/2021	97526506	S	81.00	s .		Provided in Second Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	12/14/2021	97527557	S	27,634.00	\$ 856.96	\$ 28,490.96	
	12/28/2021	97527992	S	24,136.00	\$ 8,586.92		
•	1/27/2022	97528271	S	15,803.00	\$ 497.00		Provided in Fourth Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	2/10/2022	97529009	S	16,996.00	\$ 23.00		Provided in Fourth Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
-	3/8/2022	97529849	S	1,414.00	\$ 49.60		Provided in Fourth Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	4/14/2022	97531067	s	392.00	\$ 49.45		Provided in Fourth Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	5/24/2022	97532228	S	5,166.00	s -		Provided in Fourth Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	6/13/2022	97532541	s	4,088.00	s -		Provided in Fifth Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	7/12/2022	97533223	s	4,592.00	s -		Provided in Fifth Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	8/9/2022	97533946	S	2,758.00	s -		Provided in Fifth Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	9/12/2022	97534700	s	350.00	s -		Provided in Fifth Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	10/17/2022	97535419	S	616.00	s -		Provided in Fifth Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Maildin
	11/15/2022	97536174	s	6,218.00	s -		Provided in Fifth Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	12/27/2022	97537121	5	19,112.00	s -	0,22,0,00	Provided in Fifth Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	1/12/2023	97538168	S	19,999.00	s -		Provided in Fifth Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	2/7/2023	97538496	5	23,484.00	s -		Provided in Fifth Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
3	3/15/2023	97539469	S	66,778,50	\$ 208.20	NA SAUGUARA	Provided in Affidavit of Jamie L. Mauldin
3	4/14/2023	97540226	S	74,830.00		The set of the set of the set	Provided in Affidavit of Jamie L. Maudain Provided in Affidavit of Jamie L. Maudain
	5/11/2023	97540228	s	35,074.00			Provided in Affidavit of Jamie L. Maulain Provided in Affidavit of Jamie L. Mauldin
	2/11/2025	Totals	-	619,028,50	s 16,279.72	3 33,407.47	Proviaca in Affiaavii of Famie L. Mailian
		Totals	1.2	019,020,00	LGRT TOTAL	5 635,308.22	
					DOAL TOTAL	o outgoudias	
	Date	NewGen Inv. #	N	ewGen Fees		NewGen INVOICE ACTUAL TOTAL	NOTES
	5/31/2021	11372	\$	4,000.00			Provided in First Supplemental Direct Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	6/30/2021	11542	S	5,390.00			Provided in Second Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	11/30/2021	12260	S	1,687.50			Provided in Third Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	12/28/2021	12395	S	750.00			Provided in Third Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	1/31/2022	12527	S	500.00			Provided in Fourth Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	10/31/2022	14633	5	3,925.00			Provided in Fifth Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
8	11/20/2022	14818	S	260.00			Provided in Fifth Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
1	12/31/2022	14998	s	260.00			Provided in Fifth Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L. Mauldin
	1/31/2023	15206	S	1,960.00		\$ 1,960.00	
1	2/28/2023	15370	S	825.00		\$ 825.00	
	3/31/2023	15550	s	2,200.00		\$ 2,200.00	Provided in Affidavit of Jamie L. Mauldin
	strat an addaed		-			and an Ar Ar Ar	a second of a grant of a summer of a summer
		Totals	8 I SSC	21,757.50			

TOTAL RATE CASE EXPENSES S

657,065.72



816 Congress Avenue, Suite 1900 Austin, Texas 78701 Telephone: (512) 322-5800 Facsimile: (512) 472-0532

www.lglawfirm.com

March 15, 2023

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation		
Attn Joe Gimenez		
Board President	Invoice:	97539469
424 Coventry Road	Client:	3870
Spicewood, TX 78669	Matter:	4
	Billing Attor	mey: JLM
	Tax ID #	74-2308445

INVOICE SUMMARY

For professional services and disbursements rendered through February 28, 2023:

RE: PUC Rate Appeal

Professional Services	\$ 66,778,50
Total Disbursements	<u>\$ 1,033,20</u>
TOTAL THIS INVOICE	\$ 67,811.70

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation PUC Rate Appeal I.D.3870-4-JLM March 15, 2023 Invoice: 97539469

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Date	Atty	Description Of Services Rendered	Hours
2/01/23	JLM	Confer with co-counsel regarding Rebuttal testimony; review Staff's and Ratepayers	2,50
		responses to RFIs; correspondence; begin reviewing rebuttal Testimony.	
		(Testimony; Discovery)	
2/01/23	RAA	Draft Supplemental Rebuttal Testimony of Mike Nelson, Joe Gimenez III; draft	7.30
		WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers' Sixth RFI (Administration, Discovery).	
2/01/23	AMB	Review, edit, and bate stamp attachments for WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers'	3.00
		Amended 6th Request for Information for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case	
		Management)	
2/02/23	JLM	Revise M. Nelson rebuttal testimony; confer with co-counsel regarding outstanding	2,70
		RFIs. (Testimony; Discovery)	
2/02/23	RAA	Draft Response to Ratepayers' Sixth RFI, Supplemental Rebuttal Testimonies of	7,70
		Mike Nelson and Joe Gimenez III. (Discovery, Administration).	
2/03/23	JLM	Meeting with team to discuss rebuttal testimony; work on responses to Ratepayers	4,10
		6th RFIs; confer with co-counsel; correspondence. (Discovery; Testimony)	
2/03/23	RAA	Draft Response to Ratepayers' Sixth RFI; Supplemental Rebuttal Testimonies of Joe	8.30
		Gimenez III, Mike Nelson; attend client call regarding same. (Administration,	
		Discovery).	
2/03/23	AMB	Review, edit and bate stamp attachments for WOWSC's Responses to Ratepayers'	3.00
		Amended 6th Request for Information. (Administration/Case Management)	
2/04/23	RAA	Draft the Supplemental Rebuttal Testimony of Joe Gimenez III. (Administration).	3,50
2/06/23	JLM	Revise Supplemental Rebuttal Testimony; revise and finalize Responses to	6,00
		Ratepayers 6th RFIs; confer with co-counsel. (Discovery; Testimony)	
2/06/23	RAA	Draft the Supplemental Rebuttal Testimony of Joe Gimenez III and Mike Nelson,	6,60
		Response to Ratepayers' Seventh RFI. (Administration, Discovery).	
2/06/23	AMB	Review, edit, finalize, e-file, serve, and save WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers'	4.00
		Amended Sixth Request for Information for Docket No. 50788.	
		(Administration/Case Management)	
2/07/23	JLM	Review draft Rebuttal testimony; revise Fifth Supplemental Testimony of Jamie L	3.60
		Mauldin; confer with co-counsel; work on Rebuttal Testimony (Testimony)	
2/07/23	RAA	Draft Supplemental Rebuttal Testimony of Joe Gimenez III, WOWSC Response to	1,80
		Ratepayers' Seventh RFL (Administration, Discovery).	
2/07/23	AMB	Review and edit Supplemental Rebuttal Testimony of Mike Nelson and Joe Gimenez	5,20
		for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management)	
2/08/23	JLM	Confer with co-counsel on rebuttal testimony; work on testimony and responses to	3,50
		7th RFI's. (Testimony; Discovery)	
2/08/23	JEF	Assist with RFI responses related to litigation issues.	.20
2/08/23	RAA	Draft Supplemental Rebuttal Testimony of Joe Gimenez III and Mike Nelson,	6.40
		Response to Ratepayers' Seventh RFI. (Administration, Discovery).	
2/08/23	AMB	Review and edit Supplemental Rebuttal Testimony of Mike Nelson and Joe Gimenez	4.20

Attachment B 3 of 28

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C.

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation PUC Rate Appeal I.D.3870-4-JLM March 15, 2023 Invoice: 97539469

Date	Atty	Description Of Services Rendered	Hours
	*	for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management)	
2/09/23	JLM	Work on rebuttal testimony. (Testimony)	5,50
2/09/23	RAA	Finalize Supplemental Rebuttal Testimonies of Mike Nelson and Joe Gimenez III;	7,90
		draft Response to Ratepayers' Seventh RFI (Administration, Discovery).	
2/09/23	AMB	Review and edit Supplemental Rebuttal Testimony of Mike Nelson and Joe Gimenez	9,10
		and attachments for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management)	
2/10/23	JLM	Finalize Supplemental Rebuttal Testimony; work on Responses to 7th RFIs.	4.30
		(Testimony; Rebuttal)	
2/10/23	RAA	Draft Response to Ratepayers' Seventh RFI. (Discovery).	4.60
2/10/23	AMB	Finalize, e-file, serve, and save Supplemental Rebuttal Testimony of Mike Nelson	4.70
		and Joe Gimenez with attachments; work on redactions for Attachment Ratepayers'	
		7-9 for WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers' 7th RFI for Docket No. 50788.	
		(Administration/Case Management)	
2/13/23	JLM	Finalize Responses to Ratepayers 7th RFI's. (Discovery)	,50
2/13/23	RAA	Review and finalize Response to Ratepayers' Seventh RFI. (Discovery).	,70
2/13/23	AMB	Review, edit, finalize, e-file, serve, and save WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers'	3,90
		Seventh Request for Information and attachments for Docket No. 50788.	
- / /		(Administration/Case Management)	
2/14/23	JLM	Correspondence with K. Allen regarding responses to Ratepayers 7th RFIs.	.50
a (1 4 (aa		(Discovery)	10
2/14/23	RAA	Review opposing counsel's email regarding WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers'	.10
0/14/02		Seventh RFI. (Administration).	1.50
2/14/23	AMB	Print out Supplemental Rebuttal Testimony of M. Nelson and J. Gimenez with	1,50
		attachments to prepare binder with tabs and labels for J. Mauldin for Docket No.	
2/16/22	TI NA	50788. (Administration/Case Management)	1.90
2/15/23	JLM	Confer with co-counsel on Ratepayers' request for more information to Responses to	1,80
0/15/00	DAA	Ratepayers 6th and 7th RFIs. (Discovery)	5 50
2/15/23	RAA	Evaluate Ratepayers' opposing counsel's allegations regarding WOWSC's Response	5.50
		to Ratepayers' Sixth and Seventh RFIs, assess Texas discovery law, produce	
2/16/23	JLM	responsive records, draft response to opposing counsel's email. (Discovery). Confer with co-counsel on supplemental discovery responses; correspondence to K.	1.30
2/10/23	JLIVI	Allen regarding supplemental discovery.(Administration; Discovery)	1.50
2/16/23	DAA	Draft Supplemental Responses to Ratepayers' Amended Sixth RFI and Seventh RFI.	2,50
2/10/23	KAA	(Discovery).	2,50
2/16/23	AMB	Update calendar with Order Setting Hearing on Merits information; work on shell	4,40
2/10/23	AMD	for WOWSC's Supplemental Response to Ratepayers' Amended 6th RFI and 7th	4,40
		RFI; correspondence with R. Arnett regarding attachments for responses; prepare	
		attachments for WOWSC's supplemental responses for Docket No. 50788.	
		(Administration/Case Management)	
2/17/23	RAA	Draft WOWSC Supplemental Responses to Ratepayers' Amended Sixth and Seventh	1.70
	1.1.11	RFL (Discovery).	1.70
2/21/23	JLM	Review responses to Supplemental RFIs; confer with co-counsel and support staff on	1.50

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C.

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation PUC Rate Appeal I.D.3870-4-JLM March 15, 2023 Invoice: 97539469

Date	Atty	Description Of Services Rendered	Hours
		production; correspondence to opposing counsel. (Discovery)	
2/21/23	RAA	Draft Supplemental Responses to Ratepayers' Amended Sixth RFI and Seventh RFI. (Discovery).	6,90
2/21/23	AMB	Review, edit and prepare WOWSC's Supplemental Response to Ratepayers' Amended 6th Request for Information for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management)	4,60
2/22/23	JLM	Work on Responses to Supplemental 6th and 7th RFIs; calls and correspondence regarding same; confer with co-counsel; review and edit; review Ratepayers 8th RFIs. (Discovery)	4.80
2/22/23	RAA	Draft Supplemental Responses to Ratepayers' Amended Sixth RFI, Seventh RFI; review and evaluate Ratepayers' Eighth RFI. (Discovery).	8.00
2/22/23	AMB	Work on shell for WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers' 8th Request for Information; prepare letter to PUC requesting to void item from Interchange; Teams Meeting with J. Mauldin and R. Arnett regarding WOWSC's Supplemental Response to Ratepayers' 6th Request for Information; print out Attachment Ratepayers' 7-9 emails for J. Mauldin to review; update WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers' 7th Request for Information removing Attachment Ratepayers' 7-18 for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management)	9.40
2/23/23	JLM	Confer with co-counsel on Supplemental Responses to Ratepayers 7th RFIs; document review; meeting with client to discuss Ratepayers 8th RFIs; work on objections; calls with client regarding same. (Discovery)	4.30
2/23/23	SNM	Discussion with co-counsel strategizing next steps in objections to request for information; review previous requests for information; draft request for information (Discovery).	2,10
2/23/23	RAA	Draft Supplemental Response to Ratepayers' Amended Sixth RFI, Seventh RFI; Response to Ratepayers' Eighth RFI. (Discovery).	9,20
2/23/23	AMB	Extensive work on Supplemental Attachment Ratepayers' 7-9 for WOWSC's Supplemental Response to Ratepayers' 7-9; update letter to PUC requesting item be voided from Interchange for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management)	8,3 0
2/24/23	JLM	Correspondence with K. Allen regarding supplemental RFI Responses; review Ratepayers 9th RFIs; correspondence with client related to 8th RFIs; confer with co- counsel regarding objections to 8th RFIs. (Discovery)	3.50
2/24/23	SNM	Draft objections to RFI (Discovery).	5,70
2/24/23	AMB	Finalize, e-file, serve, and save WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers' 7th Request for Information, WOWSC's Supplemental Response to Ratepayers' 7th Request for Information, Privilege Log and Letter to PUC regarding item to be voided from Interchange; create shell for WOWSC's Objection's to Ratepayers' 8th Request for Information; prepare shell for WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers' 9th Request for Information; calendar deadlines for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management)	5.40
2/26/23	JLM	Revise Objections to Ratepayers 8th RFIs; correspondence related to same. (Discovery)	2.30

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C.

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation PUC Rate Appeal I.D.3870-4-JLM March 15, 2023 Invoice: 97539469

Date	Atty	Description Of Services Rendered	Hours
2/26/23	SNM	Draft and edit objections to RFIs (Discovery).	2.60
2/27/23	RMD	Review and finalize Objections to Ratepayers' Eighth Request for Information;	.80
		confer internally regarding the same. (Administration/Case Management; Discovery)	
2/27/23	SNM	Finalize objections to RFI; file objections to RFI (Discovery).	2,50
2/27/23	RAA	Draft response to Ratepayers' Eighth RFI. (Discovery).	6.00
2/27/23	AMB	Review, finalize, e-file, serve and save WOWSC's Objections to Ratepayers' 8th	7.80
		Request for Information; review emails sent by R. Arnett to download and organize	
		attachments for WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers' 8th Request for Information for	
		Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management)	
2/28/23	JLM	Work on responses to Ratepayers 8th RFIs; analyze Ratepayers motion to compel;	8.60
		confer with co-counsel; correspondence with K. Allen. (Discovery; Testimony)	
2/28/23	RAA	Draft Response to Ratepayers' Eighth RFI. (Discovery).	10,70
2/28/23	AMB	Worked on preparing extensive attachments for WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers'	16.60
		8th Request for Information for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case	
		Management).	

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

\$ 66,778.50

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Name	Staff Level	Hours	Rate	Total
Jose E de la Fuente	Principal	.20	330.00	66.00
Jamie L Mauldin	Principal	61.30	310.00	19,003.00
Roslyn M Dubberstein	Associate	.80	320.00	256.00
Samantha N Miller	Associate	12,90	285,00	3,676.50
Rick A Arnett	Associate	105,40	280,00	29,512.00
Amanda M Benavides	Paralegal	95,10	150,00	14,265.00
TOTALS		275.70		\$ 66,778.50

DISBURSEMENTS

Date	Description	Amount
	Photocopying	208.20
2/28/23	NewGen Strategies an Voucher # - 000116758 NewGen Strategies and Solutions,	825.00
	LLC, Consultant Services, Professional services through February 2023 regarding	
	Windermere Oaks WSC Rate Appeal, 02/28/2023	
	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	
	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	\$ 1,033.20

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C.

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation PUC Rate Appeal I.D.3870-4-JLM March 15, 2023 Invoice: 97539469



816 Congress Avenue, Suite 1900 Austin, Texas 78701 Telephone: (512) 322-5800 Facsimile: (512) 472-0532

www.lglawfirm.com

April 14, 2023

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation		
Attn Richard Schaefer		
424 Coventry Road	Invoice:	97540226
Spicewood, TX 78669	Client:	3870
-	Matter:	4
	Billing Attorne	ey: JLM
	Tax ID # 74	4-2308445

INVOICE SUMMARY

For professional services and disbursements rendered through March 31, 2023:

RE: PUC Rate Appeal

\$ 80,027.47
\$ 5,197,47
\$ 74,830,00

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation PUC Rate Appeal I.D.3870-4-JLM

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Date	Atty	Description Of Services Rendered	Hours
3/01/23	JLM	Finalize Responses to Ratepayers 8th RFIs; review Motion to Compel; confer with	4,00
		co-counsel; correspondence. (Discovery)	
3/01/23	RAA	Draft Response to Ratepayers Eighth RFI, Ninth RFI. (Discovery).	9,00
3/01/23	AMB	Prepare remaining attachments for WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers' 8th Request for Information; finalize, e-file, serve, and save WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers' 8th Request for Information. (Administration/Case Management)	8.30
3/02/23	JLM	Calls and correspondence with client regarding informal discovery requests; correspondence with K. Allen regarding informal discovery requests; call with M. Lander and K. Allen regarding same; confer with co-counsel. (Discovery)	4.50
3/02/23	RAA	Draft WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers' Ninth RFI, Motion to Compel; confer with client regarding potential Supplemental Response to Ratepayers' Eighth RFI; participate in call with opposing counsel and PUC Staff. (Discovery, Administration).	9,10
3/02/23	AMB	Finalize WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers' Ninth Request for Information and attachments; send correspondence to K. Allen regarding additional links to download WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers' Eighth Request for Information for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management)	1.00
3/03/23	JLM	Finalize Response to Ratepayers 9th RFIs; revise Response to Motion to Compel; confer with co-counsel on Response to Ratepayers Motion to Compel 6-9. (Discovery)	.90
3/03/23	RAA	Draft Response to Ratepayers' Motion to Compel, Ratepayers' Motion to Preclude Admission or Consideration of Evidence or, Alternatively, to Compel a Complete Response to Ratepayers' Response to Ratepayers' Request for Information Amended 6-9; compile records for WOWSC's Supplemental Response to Ratepayers' Eighth RFI; email correspondence with opposing counsel. (Discovery, Administration).	10,00
3/03/23	AMB	Review, e-file, serve, and save WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers' Motion to Compel; e-file, serve, and save WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers' Ninth RFI; draft shell for WOWSC's Supplemental Response to Ratepayers Eighth RFI; download documents for Supplemental Attachment Ratepayers 8-24 for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management)	6.50
3/04/23	RAA	Draft Response to Ratepayers' Motion to Preclude Evidence or, Alternatively, Compel a Complete Response to Ratepayers' Amended 6-9. (Discovery).	1,80
3/06/23	JLM	Prepare for hearing; review Response to Motion to Preclude Testimony and Compel Response to 6-9; confer with co-counsel on Supplemental RFI responses; work on Responses to Objections to Testimony; review draft motion to compel discovery responses; call with M. Lander.(Discovery; Testimony)	5,90
3/06/23	RAA	Draft Response to Ratepayers' Motion to Preclude Evidence or, Alternatively, Compel a Complete Response to Ratepayers' Amended 6-9; review Ratepayers' Objections to WOWSC's Supplemental Testimonies; draft Response to Ratepayers'	7.20

Attachment B 9 of 28

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C.

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation PUC Rate Appeal I.D.3870-4-JLM

Date	Atty	Description Of Services Rendered	Hours
		Objections to WOWSC's Supplemental Testimonies; review previous RFI responses	
		regarding revenue requirement; review Ratepayers' draft motion to compel, assess	
		possible response. (Discovery).	
3/06/23	AMB	Review, e-file, serve, and save WOWSC's Supplemental Response to Ratepayers'	3,00
		Eighth Request for Information, Statement of Confidentiality and attachments; draft	
		shell for WOWSC's Supplemental Response to Ratepayers Amended Sixth Request	
		for Information; file organization in DMS for Docket No. 50788.	
a (0.5 (0.5		(Administration/Case Management)	.
3/07/23	JLM	Work on supplemental RFI responses; call with client; confer with co-counsel;	5.60
0.000.000		finalize response to Motion to Compel (Discovery)	0.40
3/07/23	RAA	Draft Response to Ratepayers' Objections to the Supplemental Rebuttal Testimonies	9.40
		of Mike Nelson and Joe Gimenez III; attend client call regarding remaining	
		discovery responsibilities; review Ratepayers' Request for Relief (Administration,	
2/07/22		Discovery).	= 00
3/07/23	AMB	Review, finalize, e-file, serve, and save WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers Motion	5,00
		and prepare attachments; file organization; review SOAH Order No. 29 to prepare	
		for Hearing on the Merits for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management)	
3/08/23	JLM	Work on supplementing RFIs; confer with co-counsel; calls to client; work on	7.00
5106125	JLW	responses to Objections and other ratepaver pleadings. (Discovery)	7.00
3/08/23	RAA	Draft Response to Ratepayers' Objections to the Supplemental Rebuttal Testimonies	9.90
5/00/25	IV III	of Joe Gimenez III and Mike Nelson; draft Supplemental Responses to Ratepayers 8-	2.20
		1, 8-26; attend client call. (Administration, Discovery).	
3/08/23	AMB	Draft five of WOWSC's Supplemental Response to Ratepayers' and Staff's Request	4,50
-,,		for Information; draft WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers' Objections and Motion to	
		Strike Supplemental Testimony of Mike Nelson for Docket No. 50788.	
		(Administration/Case Management)	
3/09/23	JLM	Review draft filings (Discovery; Administration)	.40
3/09/23	RAA	Draft Supplemental RFI Responses, Amended RFI Response, Responses to	10.60
		Ratepayers' Objections to Mike Nelson and Joe Gimenez Supplemental Rebuttal	
		Testimonies. (Discovery, Administration).	
3/09/23	AMB	Review WOWSC's Supplemental Responses to Ratepayers' and Staff's Request for	7.50
		Information; review and edit WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers' Objections and	
		Motion to Strike Supplemental Rebuttal Testimony of M. Nelson and J. Gimenez;	
		draft shell for WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers Request for Relief for Docket No.	
		50788. (Administration/Case Management)	
3/10/23	JLM	Finalize supplemental RFIs; finalize Responses to testimony objections; draft and	4,00
		finalize Statement of Position. (Administration; Discovery)	
3/10/23	RAA	Draft Responses to Ratepayers' Objections to Nelson's and Gimenez's Supplemental	6.80
		Testimonies; draft response to Ratepayers' Request for Relief. (Discovery,	
a (1 0 (a c		Administration).	~ = ~
3/10/23	AMB	Review, edit, finalize, e-file, serve, and save WOWSC's Supplemental/Amended	6.50

Attachment B 10 of 28

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C.

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation PUC Rate Appeal I.D.3870-4-JLM

Date	Atty	Description Of Services Rendered	Hours
		Responses to Ratepayers' and Staff's Request for information, WOWSC's Statement	
		of Position, and WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers' Objections and Motion to Strike	
		Supplemental Rebuttal Testimony of M. Nelson and J. Gimenez; review SOAH	
		Order No. 29 for Hearing of the Merits deadlines for Docket No. 50788.	
		(Administration/Case Management)	
3/12/23	RAA	Draft Response to Ratepayers' Request for relief related to discovery. (Discovery).	2,30
3/13/23	JLM	Work on hearing prep; revise response to Ratepayers Motion. (Hearing; Discovery)	2,00
3/13/23	RAA	Draft Response to Ratepayers' Request for Relief. (Discovery).	9.30
3/13/23	AMB	Work on shells for WOWSC's Exhibit and Witness List for Docket No. 50788.	1.90
		(Administration/Case Management)	
3/14/23	JLM	Finalize filings; work on hearing preparation. (Discovery; Hearing)	1.00
3/14/23	RAA	Draft WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers' Request for Relief, correspond with client	5,50
		regarding same; prepare summary sheets for hearing. (Discovery, Administration).	
3/14/23	AMB	Review, edit, finalize, e-file, serve, and save WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers'	5,50
		Request for Relief for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management)	
3/15/23	JLM	Work on hearing preparation; correspondence; confer with co-counsel.(Hearing;	4,50
		Correspondence)	
3/15/23	RAA	Review WOWSC's legal invoices/payments to verify Ratepayers' summary table,	2.20
		prepare WOWSC's Supplemental Response to Ratepayers' 6-14. (Discovery).	
3/15/23	AMB	Prepare exhibit binders for Hearing of the Merits; Review and edit WOWSC's	6.00
		Second Supplemental Response to Ratepayers Amended Sixth Request for	
		Information for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management)	
3/16/23	JLM	Hearing prep; calls and correspondence. (Hearing)	2,50
3/16/23	RAA	Review Ratepayers' WOWSC legal payment/invoice summary table, prepare	2,30
		Attachment Ratepayers' Amended 6-14 (Discovery).	
3/16/23	AMB	Work on preparing J. Mauldin, court reporter, and SOAH exhibit binders for	5,00
		Hearing on the Merits; draft WOWSC's Second Supplemental Responses to	
		Ratepayers Amended Sixth Request for Information Nos. 6-14 & 6-15, Statement of	
		Confidentiality, and Confidential Attachments; Prepare, finalize, e-file, serve, and	
		save Errata to Direct Testimony of J. Mauldin for Docket No. 50788.	
		(Administration/Case Management)	
3/17/23	JLM	No Charge - Work on hearing preparation; calls and correspondence; finalize	2.00
		pleadings. (Hearing)	
3/17/23	RAA	Prepare Supplemental Response to Ratepayers' Amended 6-14, prepare for hearing.	1,40
		(Discovery, Administration).	
3/17/23	AMB	Work WOWSC's Second and Third Supplemental Response to Ratepayers Amended	9,00
		Sixth Request for Information Nos. 6-14 & 6-15, Statement of Confidentiality, and	
		Confidential Attachments; e-file, serve, and save WOWSC's Exhibit List and	
		WOWSC's Witness List; correspond with parties regarding exhibits for Hearing of	
		the Merits for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management)	
3/19/23	JLM	No Charge - Hearing Preparation. (Hearing)	3.80
3/20/23	JLM	Hearing preparation; confer with co-counsel. (Hearing)	6.50

Attachment B 11 of 28

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C.

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation PUC Rate Appeal I.D.3870-4-JLM

Atty	Description Of Services Rendered	Hours
RAA	Prepare for hearing; review Ratepayers' exhibits; Compare WOWSC legal	8.90
	invoices/payments with Ratepayers' WOWSC legal fee/payment summary table.	
	(Administration).	
AMB	Work on printing extensive exhibits from Ratepayers and Commission for Hearing	7,60
	•	
	50788. (Administration/Case Management)	
JLM		8,00
RMD		.90
		8,60
AMB		4.60
	•	
	• •	
		9,80
RMD		2,30
		9.50
AMB	•	10.20
RAA		1.00
AMB		.30
	•	• • • •
JLM		1,00
		1 10
RAA		1,10
		1.50
AMB	•	1,50
		• • •
КАА		2.60
		1.00
АМВ		1.90
		2.50
КАА		2,50
4.140		5 40
АМВ		5,40
	• •	
D	•	50
		.50
АМВ		5.80
	AMB	 invoices/payments with Ratepayers' WOWSC legal fee/payment summary table. (Administration). AMB Work on printing extensive exhibits from Ratepayers and Commission for Hearing on the Merits to be placed in binders for J. Mauldin and R. Arnett for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management) JLM Prepare for hearing; confer with co-counsel and G. Rabon. (Hearing) RMD Review J. Mauldin testimony and prepare for questioning on rate case expenses. (Administration/Case Management) RAA Review Ratepayers' and Staff's Exhibits in preparation for hearing. (Administration). AMB Prepare hearing documents for J. Mauldin: print Direct and Supplemental Testimony of J. Mauldin to be placed in binder for R. Dubberstein for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management) JLM Hearing on the Merits; prepare for same. (Hearing) Finish preparing for Ratepayer rate case expenses questioning; appear in hearing. (Administration/Case Management) RAA Prepare for hearing; attend hearing. (Administration). AMB Attend Hearing of the Merits for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management) RAA Review Texas law and PUC filings involving optional completeness, draft email summary regarding same. (Administration). AMB Calendar Initial Brief and Reply Brief deadlines for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management) JLM No Charge - Work on briefing outline; confer with co-counsel; meet with WOWSC to discuss hearing recap and next steps. (Brief, Hearing) RAA Review Texas law and PUC filings introlving optional completeness, draft email summary regarding saue updated HOM exhibits from Commission Staft to the DMS for Docket No. 50788. (Administration). AMB Download and save updated HOM exhibits from Ratepayers to the DMS for Docket No. 50788. (Administration). AMB Download and save updated HOM exhibits from Ratepayers to the D

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C.

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation PUC Rate Appeal I.D.3870-4-JLM April 14, 2023 Invoice: 97540226

Date	Atty	Description Of Services Rendered	Hours
		(Administration/Case Management)	
3/31/23	RAA	Review Ratepayers' exhibits for optional completeness, confer with support staff regarding same.	.50
3/31/23	AMB	Download, save and send Hearing of the Merits transcript to J. Mauldin and R. Arnett; correspond with R. Arnett regarding transcript for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management)	1,00

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

\$ 74,830.00

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Name	Staff Level	Rate	Hours	Amount	N/C Hr	N/C \$
Jamie L Mauldin	Principal	310.00	66.60	20,646.00	6.80	2,108.00
Roslyn M Dubberstein	Associate	320.00	3.20	1,024.00	.00	.00
Rick A Arnett	Associate	280.00	132.00	36,960.00	.00	.00
Amanda M Benavides	Paralegal	150,00	108,00	16,200.00	.00	.00
TOTALS			309.8 0	\$ 74,830. 00	6.80	\$ 2,108.00

DISBURSEMENTS

Date	Description	Amount
3/22/23	Amanda Benavides Check # - 009911112 Meal Lunch for J. Mauldin, R. Arnett and A. Benavides during Hearing of the Merits.	42.77
	Photocopying	237.40
3/31/23	Corporate Couriers Check # - 000040806 Corporate Couriers, Courier, Courier services, 3/31/2023	89.24
3/31/23	Kennedy Reporting Se Check # - 000040812 Kennedy Reporting Service, Court Reporting, PUC Hearing transcript, 03/22/23, 3/31/2023	2,628.06
3/31/23	NewGen Strategies an Voucher # - 000117074 NewGen Strategies and Solutions, LLC, Consultant Services, Professional services through March 2023 regarding Windermere Oaks WSC Rate Appeal, 03/31/2023	2,200.00
	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	\$ 5,197.47
	TOTAL THIS INVOICE	\$ 80,027.47

Attachment B 13 of 28

Amanda Benavides

From: Sent: To: Subject: amandavelasquez21@yahoo.com Thursday, March 23, 2023 10:23 AM Amanda Benavides Fwd: Your Jimmy John's Online Order is confirmed!

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Jimmy John's <orders@jimmyjohns.com> Date: March 22, 2023 at 8:06:13 AM CDT To: Amanda Benavides <amandavelasquez21@yahoo.com> Subject: Your Jimmy John's Online Order is confirmed!



THANK YOU FOR YOUR ONLINE ORDER

If you have any questions regarding your order, please do not hesitate to contact us at 512-457-4900, and reference your order confirmation number 17059387701198848.

Order Number:

17059387701198848

	Store Information:	JJ0491 515 Congress Ave Austin , 78701 512-457-4900	
	Scheduled:	2023-03-22 at 11:00 AM	
	For:	Delivery	
		Thanks for your order!	
	Address:	816 Congress Ave. Suite 1900 Austin 78701	
	Delivery Instructions:	Lloyd Gosselink	
	Contact:	Amanda Benavides 19154743858 amandavelasquez21@yahoo.com	
	ITEM	EACH	PRICE
1	BBQ Jimmy Chips®	1.59	\$1.59
1	Pickle (Halved)	1.59	\$1.59
1	Pickle (Halved)	1.59	\$1.59
1	#11 COUNTRY CLUB® (REG	GULAR) 8.49	\$8.49
	FOR: Amanda		
	SELECTIONS: Unwich®No Tomato, Reg Cuc	pumber	
1	Salt & Vinegar Jimmy Chips	® 1.59	\$1.59
	FOR: Amanda		
1	Pickle (Quartered)	1.59	\$1.59
	FOR:		

FOR: Amanda

Attachment B 15 of 28

1	#1 THE PEPE® (REGULAR)	7.19	\$7.19
	FOR: Jamie		
	SELECTIONS: Unwich®		
1	#4 TURKEY TOM® (REGULAR)	7.19	\$7.19
	FOR: Rick		

Subtotal:	\$30.82
Tip:	\$3.00
Delivery:	\$4.99
SERVICE CHARGE	\$0.99
TAX	\$2.97
Total:	\$42.77
Credit Card Visa x-4687:	(\$42.77)

DOWNLOAD MY APP!



Please do not reply to this email. It is not a monitored email address

16	of	28
----	----	----

N	V	Ό		С	Ε
---	---	---	--	---	---

11402

CORPORATE COURIERS AND LOGISTICS 2335 KRAMER LANE, SUITE F AUSTIN, TX 78758

RECEIVED

Invoice No.	Customer No.
70596	1201
Invé Date	Total Duo
3/31/23	525432
	A State of the sta
	<u> </u>

ON-DEMAND DELIVERIES 24/7 ASK ABOUT OUR WAREHOUSE

THANKS FOR YOUR BUSINESS

(512) 479-4007

LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW 816 CONGRESS AVE SUITE 1900 AUSTIN, TX 78701

1000-0000

120

338.32

APR 0 4 2023

Lloyd Gosselink

Customer No. | Invoice No. Amount Due Period Ending Pg 20596 3/31/23 Service Detail 1201 70596 525, 32 1 Total Date Ordr No. Charges Sv0 _.__ RICOH/ LLOYD GOGUNE 816 CONGRESS AVE TX 78701 3/17/23 SOAH 8.00 1189829 4HR Base 300 WEST 15TH STREET Fuel Srchg: 1.28 9 28 AUSTIN TX 78701 Wght: 2 Lbs Caller: RICOH OFFICE SER Time: 08:08 Signed: PEGAU N. Wght: RICON/ LLOYD GOSSELINK B16 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 78701 3/17/23 AMY BURT/KENNEDY REPORTING SERV. 28.00 1189833 411R Baso 100 E WRITESTONE BLVD STE 148 CEDAR PARK TX 78613 Fuel Srchg: 32,48 AUSTIN TX 78701 CEDAR Caller: RICOH OFFICE SER Time: 08:13 Wght; 2 Lbs Signed: DON P. BOX 277 RICOH/ LLOYD GOSSELINK 816 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 78701 AMY BURT/KENNEDY REPORTING SERV. 100 E WHITESTONE BLVD STE 148 3/29/23 1191928 4HR Base 28.00 100 E WHILL CEDAR PARK 2 Lbs DOWNTOWN F: 15.00 AUSTIN TX 78701 Caller: RICOH OFFICE SER Time: 11:15 Signed: UPS FRONT COUNTER TX 78613 47.48 Fuel Srchg: 4.48 Comment: WK Total Charges for Ref. - AMB/JLM/RAA 3870-4: 89.24 3/23/23 1190955 2HR RICOH/ LLOYD GOSSELINK WILLIAMSON COUNTY 45.95 Base : 405 MLK GEORGETOWN TX 78626 Woht: 7 Lbs 816 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 78701 GEORGETOWN T Caller: RICOH OFFICE SER Time: 13:28 Wght: 7 Lbs Comment: WK Return : DOWNTOWN F: 51.95 15.00 183 128.56 Fuel Srchg: 15.66 RICON/ LLOYD GOSSELINK WILLIA 816 CONGRESS AVE 405 ML AUSTIN TX 78701 CEORGE Caller: RICON OFFICE SER Tima: 14:22 Wght: Signod: SYIWIA MCDADE 3/29/23 1191978 18R 18R WILLIAMSON COUNTY 51.95 Base 405 MLK Return 51.95 Fuel Srchg **GEORGETOWN** TX 78626 120.52 1 Los Total Charges for Ref. - CAD 884-52: 249.08 USPS 4516 BURLESON ROAD 3/16/23 1189554 EXP LLOYD COSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW 15.00 15.00 Base 2 816 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 78701 AUSTIN TX Caller: JOHN SANTOS TX 78744 AUSTIN Time: 16:38 Signed: SYLVIA Commont: 2020 3/17/23 1189759 EXP USPS 4516 BURLESON ROAD LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW 15.00 Base 15.00 616 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 78744 Callor: JOIN SANTOS Time: 16:18 Signed: MELISSA LOPEZ TX 78701 AUSTIN Commont: 2020 **PPROVED FOR PAYMENT** 8Y -OATE 137 Continued SILLTO: 7430-6000

INVOICE PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT

17 of 28

INVOICE

CORPORATE COURIERS AND LOGISTICS 2335 KRAMER LANE, SUITE F AUSTIN, TX 78758

LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW 816 CONGRESS AVE SUITE 1900 AUSTIN, TK 78701
 Invoice No.
 Customer No.

 70596
 1201

 Invoice Total Due
 Total Due

 3/31/23
 525.32

ON-DEMAND DELIVERIES 24/7 ASK ABOUT OUR WAREHOUSE THANKS FOR YOUR BUSINESS (512)479-4007

Ordr No. 1190009 1190343 1190561 1190785 1191032	EXP	USPS 4516 BURLE AUSTIN Caller: JC Signed: SY USPS 4516 BURLE AUSTIN Caller: JC Signed: SY USPS 4516 BURLE AUSTIN Caller: JC Signed: SI USPS 4516 BURLE AUSTIN Caller: JC	ESON ROAD TX 78 NEN SANFOS (LVIA ESON ROAD TX 78 DEN SANTOS (LVIA MCDADE ESON ROAD TX 78 DEN SANTOS SSON ROAD TX 78 DEN SANTOS STATES	3744 Time: 3744 Time: 3744 Time:	16:43 16:42 16:45 16:33	Comment: LLOYD GOSSELINK 816 CONGRESS AV AUSTIN Comment: LLOYD GOSSELINK 816 CONGRESS AV AUSTIN Comment: LLOYD GOSSELINK 816 CONGRESS AV AUSTIN Comment:	ATTORNEYS AT TX 78701 2020 ATTORNEYS AT TX 78701 2020 ATTORNEYS AT TX 78701 Wait: 16 M WA ATTORNEYS AT E TX 78701 2020 2020	LAW 1 LAW 1 LAW 1	Base Base Mait Ti	: : מתח	15.00 15.00 7.00	15.0 15.0 22.0
1190343 1190561 1190785	EXP	USPS 4516 BURLE AUSTIN Caller: JC Signed: SY USPS 4516 BURLE AUSTIN Caller: JC Signed: SY USPS 4516 BURLE AUSTIN Caller: JC Signed: SI USPS 4516 BURLE AUSTIN Caller: JC	ESON ROAD TX 78 NEN SANFOS (LVIA ESON ROAD TX 78 DEN SANTOS (LVIA MCDADE ESON ROAD TX 78 DEN SANTOS SSON ROAD TX 78 DEN SANTOS STATES	3744 Time: 3744 Time: 3744 Time:	16:43 16:42 16:45 16:33	LLOYD GOSSELINK 816 CONGRESS AV AUSTIN Comment: LLOYD GOSSELINK 816 CONGRESS AV AUSTIN Comment: LLOYD GOSSELINK 816 CONGRESS AV AUSTIN Comment: LLOYD GOSSELINK 816 CONGRESS AV AUSTIN	ATTORNEYS AT TX 78701 2020 ATTORNEYS AT TX 78701 2020 ATTORNEYS AT TX 78701 Wait: 16 M WA ATTORNEYS AT E TX 78701 2020 2020	LAW 1 LAW 1 LAW 1	Base Base Wait Ti	: : מתח	15.00 15.00 7.00	15.0 22.0
1190561 1190785	EXP	4516 BURLE AUSTIN Caller: JC Signed: SY USPS 4516 BURLE AUSTIN Caller: JC Signed: SY USPS 4516 BURLE AUSTIN Caller: JC Signed: SI USPS 4516 BURLE AUSTIN Caller: JC	SEN SANTOS (LVIA SEON ROAD TX 78 DEN SANTOS (LVIA MCDADE ESON ROAD TX 78 DEN SANTOS (LVIA	Time: 3744 Time: 3744 Time:	16:42 16:45 16:33	Comment: : LLOYD GOSSELINK 81.6 CONGRESS AV AUSTIN Comment: 1 LLOYD GOSSELINK 81.6 CONGRESS AV AUSTIN Comment: :	2020 ATTORNEYS AT TE TX 787D1 Wait: 16 M WK ATTORNEYS AT E TX 78701 2020	LAW) I	Base Wait Tì	: . 00	15.00 7.00	22.0
1190785	EXP	USPS 4516 BURLE AUSTIN Caller: JC Signed: SI USPS 4516 BURLE AUSTIN Caller: JC	ISON ROAD TX 78 DEN SANTOS MVIA	3744 Tiwa:	16:33	LLOYD GOSSELINK 816 CONGRESS AV AUSTIN Comment: :	ATTORNEYS AT E TX 78701 2020					
		Caller: JC Signed: SI USPS 4516 BURLE AUSTIN Caller: JC)en Santos LYVIA	T1me:	16:33	Comment:	2020	LNW :	Base	:	15.00	15.0
1191032	EXP	Caller: JC	SON ROAD			LLOYD GOSSELTNE						
i	3 1	Signed: SY	den Santos Ilvia	Timo:	16:32	Comment;						
1191250	EXP	USPS 4516 BURLE AUSTIN Caller: JC Signed: SI	ISON ROAD TX 76 DEN SANTOS LYVIA	3744 Time:	16:27	LLOYD GOSSELINK 815 CONGRESS AV AUSTIN Comment: :	ATTORNEYS AT E TX 78701 2020	LAW	Base	÷	15.00	15.0
1191602	EXP	USPS 4516 HURLF AUSTIN Caller: JC Signed: SY	ESON ROAD TX 78 DEN SANTOS KLVLA MCDADE	3744 Time:	17:02	LLOYD GOSSELINK 816 CONGRESS AV AUSTIN Comment:		LAW)	Base	Ŧ	15.00	15.0
1191812	EXP	Carres: JC	JEN SANIOS	3744 Timo:	16:42			law (Baso	ĩ	15.00	15.0
												Continue
		1191602 EXP	1191602 EXP USPS 4516 BURLA AUSTIN Caller: JC Signed: S) 1191812 EXP USPS 4516 BURLA AUSTIN Caller: JC Signed: NC	1191602 EXP USPS 4516 BURLESON ROAD AUSTIN IN 7K 7 Caller: JOHN SANTOS Signed: SYLVIA MCDADE 1191812 EXP USPS 4516 BURLESON ROAD AUSTIN IX 77 Caller: JOHN SANTOS Signed: NO MAIL	1191602 EXP USPS 4516 BURLESON ROAD AUSTIN IX 78744 Caller: JOEN SANTOS Time: Signed: SYLVIA MCDADE 1191812 EXP USPS 4516 BURLESON ROAD AUSTIN IX 78744 Caller: JOEN SANTOS Timo: Signed: NO MAIL	1191602 EXP USPS 4516 BURLESON ROAD AUSTIN TX 78744 Caller: JOHN SANTOS Time: 17:02 Signed: SYLVIA MCDADE 1191812 EXP USPS 4516 BURLESON ROAD AUSTIN TX 78744 Caller: JOHN SANTOS Time: 16:42 Signed: NO MAIL	1191602 EXP USPS LLOYD GOSSELINK 4515 BURLESON ROAD 016 CONGRESS AV AUSTIN TX 76744 AUSTIN Caller: JOIN SANTOS Time: 17:02 Comment: 1191812 EXP USPS LLOYD GOSSELINK 4516 BURLESON ROAD 816 CONGRESS AV AUSTIN TX 78744 Caller: JOIN SANTOS TX 78744 AUSTIN Caller: JOIN SANTOS Timo: 16:42 Signed: NO MAIL	1191602 EXP USPS LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT 4515 BURLESON ROAD 916 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN IX 73744 AUSTIN Caller: JOEN SANTOS Time: 17:02 Signed: SYLVIA MCDADE Comment: 2020 1191812 EXP USPS 4516 BURLESON ROAD 816 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN IX 78744 Caller: JOEN SANTOS Time: 16:42 Signed: NO MAIL Comment: 2020	1191602 EXP USPS LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW 4515 BURLESON ROAD 916 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 78744 Caller: JOEN SANTOS Time: 17:02 Signed: SYLVIA MCDADE Comment: 2020 1191812 USPS LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW 4516 BURLESON ROAD G16 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 78744 AUSTIN TX 78744 AUSTIN TX 78744 AUSTIN TX 78701 Caller: JOEN SANTOS Time: 16:42 Signed: NO MAIL Comment: 2020	1191602 EXP USPS LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW Base 4516 BURLESON ROAD B16 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN B16 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN B17:02 1191812 EXP USPS LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW Base 4516 BURLESON ROAD 1191812 EXP USPS LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW Base 4516 BURLESON ROAD 4516 BURLESON ROAD EXP LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW Base 816 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 78744 Callur: JOHN SANTOS Timo: 16:42 Signed: NO MAIL Comment: 2020	1191602 EXP USPS LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW Base : 4515 BURLESON ROAD 916 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 76701 Caller: JOIN SANTOS Time: 17:02 Comment: 2020 1191812 EXP USPS LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW Base : 4516 BURLESON ROAD 816 CONGRESS AVE 816 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN Base : 77 78744 Caller: JOIN SANTOS TX 78744 AUSTIN TX 78701 Caller: JOIN SANTOS Time: 16:42 Signed: NO MAIL	1191602 EXP USPS LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW Base : 15.00 4515 BURLESCN RCAD 016 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 78744 AUSTIN TX 78701 Caller: JOEN SANTOS Time: 17:02 Signed: SYLVIA MEDADE Comment: 2020 1191812 EXP USPS LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW Base : 15.00 4515 BURLESCN ROAD SIG CONGRESS AVE 4516 BURLESCN ROAD 816 4515 BURLESCN ROAD 816 AUSTIN TX 78744 AUSTIN AUSTIN TX 78744 AUSTIN AUSTIN TX 78744 AUSTIN AUSTIN TX 78744 AUSTIN AUSTIN TX 78744 AUSTIN

INVOICE PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT

18 of 28

INVOICE

CORPORATE COURIERS AND LOCISTICS 2335 KRAMER LANE, SUITE F AUSTIN, TX 78758

LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW 816 CONGRESS AVE SUITE 1900 AUSTIN, TX 78701
 Involce No.
 Customer No.

 70596
 1201

 Invc Date
 Iotal Due.

 3/31/22
 525.32

ON-DEMAND DELIVERIES 24/7 ASK ABOUT OUR WAREHOUSE THANKS FOR YOUR BUSINESS (512)479-4007

-			Customer No. Invoice No. Period Ending Amount Due Pg	·	· · · -
Date	Ördr No.	Svc	1201 70596 3/31/23 525.32 3 Service Detail	Champer	Totol
3/30/23	1192031	EXP	USPS LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW Base : 4516 BURLESON ROAD 816 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 78744 AUSTIN TX 78701 Caller: JOEN SANTOS Time: 16:45 Sigmed: SYLVIA MCDADE Comment: 2020	15.00	Total 15.00
3/31/23	1192293	EXP	USPS 4S16 EURLESON ROAD AUSTIN TX 76744 Caller: JOHN SANTOS Time: 17:27 Signed: MAILROOM COUNTER. NO B Comment: 2020	15.00	15,00
			Total Charges for Ref MAIL: 187.00		
		1			
				Total	525.32
	<u> </u>	<u> </u>	INVOICE PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT	I	<u> </u>

19 of 28

	N	V	Ο	IC	Ε
--	---	---	---	----	---

CORPORATE COURIERS AND LOGISTICS 2335 KRAMER LAME, SUITE P AUSTIN, TX 78756

LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW 816 CONGRESS AVE SUITE 1900 AUSTIN, TX 78701
 Invoice No.
 Customer No.

 70596
 1201

 Invc Date
 Total Due

 3/31/23
 \$25.32

ON-DEMAND DELIVERIES 24/7 ASK ABOUT OUR WAREHOUSE THANKS FOR YOUR BUSINESS (512)479-4007

				Customer No.	Invoice No.	Period Ending	Amount Du	ie Pg			7
ſ				1201	70596	3/31/23	525.3	12 4			
Date	Ordr No.	Svc			Service	Detail			Charges	Total	
		1 1									
			Reforance		Description			fotal Amt	1		
	1		AMB/JIM/RA CAD 864-52	A 3870-4			3 2	09.24 249.00			
			MAIL MAIL				12	187.00			
						Reference Totals :	17	525.32			
						Total Amount Due :	17	525.32			
									1		
	1	1									
	!										
]										
		ł									
									i		
		i									
		1									
1											
Į	1	1									
$\mathbf{\nabla}$											1/
	INVOICE PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT										

	INEDY	APR 0 - 20	73	DATE	INVOICE NO
A record	dofexcellence	Lloyd G <u>osse</u>	l <mark>ink</mark> EASE NOTE i		DRESS
Lloyd Gos	selink Rochelle & Townsend ess Avenue, Suite 1900 78701	Keni 100 E	FOR REM nedy Report E. Whitestone r Park, TX 78	ing Servi Blvd. Ste.	ice, Inc.
OB NUMBER	SERVICE ORDERED BY	DOCKET NUMBER] [CASE	NAME
23057	Jamie Mauldin	50788	Ratepa	ayers Appe	al - Windermer
DATE TAKEN	DESCRI	PTION	QUANTITY	<u>RATE</u>	AMOUNT
3/22/2023	State Office of Administra Public Utility Commission Hearing on Remand Via Zoom Videoconference Original & One Copy - Fiv	of Texas	332	7.24	2,403.68
3/22/2023 3/22/2023	Prorated Zoom Rate Hourly Reporting Fee (\$45 After Hours Hourly Repor split) Administrative Fee	• •	7.5 0.75	22.50 27.50 35.00	168.75 20.63 35.00
	Tax ID # 74-1837735	AP PROVED F BY <u>AM B</u> - DATE. <u>413</u> BILL TO: <u>387</u>	attoched 0-4		
	THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSH TERMS: Due	NESS!	Total		\$2,628.06
		· · ·	edits	\$0.00	

512-474-2233 order@kennedyreporting.com

ī



. . .

816 Congress Avenue, Suite 1900 Austin, Texas 78701 Telephone: (512) 322-5800 Facsimile: (512) 472-0532

www.lglawfirm.com

May 11, 2023

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation Attn Richard Schaefer		
424 Coventry Road	Invoice: 975	40928
Spicewood, TX 78669	Client:	3870
	Matter:	4
	Billing Attorney:	JLM
	Tax ID # 74-23	08445

INVOICE SUMMARY

For professional services and disbursements rendered through April 30, 2023:

RE: PUC Rate Appeal

.....

Professional Services	\$ 35,074,00
Total Disbursements	\$ 413,47
TOTAL THIS INVOICE	\$ 35,487.47

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation PUC Rate Appeal I.D.3870-4-JLM May 11, 2023 Invoice: 97540928

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Date	Atty	Description Of Services Rendered	Hours
4/03/23	RAA	Review Staff and WOWSC testimonies and briefs, SOAH Preliminary Order, and	4,60
		Commission Order Remanding Proceeding; evaluate Texas precedent regarding	
		ratepayer appeals; draft initial brief. (Administration).	
4/03/23	AMB	Work on drafting shell for WOWSC's Initial Brief for Docket No. 50788.	1,10
		(Administration/Case Management)	
4/04/23	JLM	Confer with co-counsel on optional completeness and Initial Brief. (Administration)	.70
4/04/23	RAA	Draft Initial Brief; evaluate Staff and Ratepayers Exhibits for WOWSC's Motion for	8.50
		Optional Completeness. (Administration).	
4/04/23	AMB	Prepare WOWSC's Motion to Admit Exhibits Pursuant to the Rule of Optional	5,20
		Completeness, exhibit list and exhibits for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case	
		Management)	
4/05/23	JLM	Finalize Motion for Optional Completeness and exhibits. (Hearing)	,40
4/05/23	RAA	Draft Initial Brief; review Motion for Optional Completeness and incorporate	8,50
		additional Ratepayers Exhibits. (Administration).	
4/05/23	AMB	Download exhibits Ratepayers uploaded to share file; forward Ratepayers exhibits to	2.80
		R. Arnett for review; update and send WOWSC's Motion to Admit Exhibits Pursuant	
		to the Rule of Optional Completeness and exhibit list to J. Mauldin for review for	
		Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management)	
4/06/23	RAA	Draft Initial Brief. (Administration).	4,10
4/06/23	AMB	Finalize, e-file, serve, and save WOWSC's Motion to Admit Exhibits Pursuant to the	4,70
		Rule of Optional Completeness; print WOWSC's optional complete exhibits for	
		binder to SOAH ALJs and court report; correspond with Ricoh for delivery of	
		binders for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management)	
4/07/23	RAA	Draft Initial Brief. (Administration).	2,70
4/07/23	AMB	Review and redline WOWSC's Initial Brief with extensive footnotes for Docket No.	6,00
		50788. (Administration/Case Management)	
4/09/23	JLM	Revise Initial Brief. (Brief)	1.60
4/10/23	JLM	Work on initial brief. (Brief)	1.00
4/10/23	RAA	Draft Initial Brief, Proposed Findings of Fact and Conclusion of Law.	5.50
		(Administration).	
4/11/23	JLM	Finalize initial brief; findings of fact and conclusions of law; review other parties'	1,50
		initial briefs: correspondence. (Briefs)	
4/11/23	RAA	Draft Initial Brief, Proposed Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law; review	4,80
		Ratepayers' and Staff's Initial Briefs. (Administration).	
4/11/23	AMB	Review, finalize, e-file, serve, and save WOWSC's Initial Brief and Findings of Fact	3,60
		and Conclusion of Law; send Word version of WOWSC's Initial Brief and FoF and	
		CoL to SOAH ALJs for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management)	
4/12/23	RAA	Evaluate Ratepayers' and Staff's Initial Briefs; draft WOWSC's Reply Brief.	5.50
		(Administration).	

Attachment B 23 of 28

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C.

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation PUC Rate Appeal I.D.3870-4-JLM May 11, 2023 Invoice: 97540928

Date	Atty	Description Of Services Rendered	Hours
4/12/23	AMB	Work on drafting shell for WOWSC's Reply Brief for Docket No. 50788.	1.30
		(Administration/Case Management)	
4/13/23	RAA	Draft Reply Brief. (Administration).	9,00
4/14/23	RAA	Attend client call; Draft Reply Brief, Reply to Ratepayers' Response to WOWSC's	7,70
		Motion to Admit Exhibits Pursuant to the Rule of Optional Completeness.	
		(Administration).	
4/14/23	AMB	Review and save Ratepayers Response to WOWSC's Motion regarding Optional	.30
		Completeness for Docket No. 50788. (Administration/Case Management)	
4/17/23	RAA	Draft Reply to Ratepayers' Response to WOWSC's Motion to Admit Exhibits	5.60
		Pursuant to the Rule on Optional Completeness; Reply Brief. (Discovery,	
		Administration)	
4/18/23	RAA	Draft Reply Brief. (Administration).	9,10
4/18/23	AMB	Review, redline, finalize, e-file, serve and save WOWSC's Reply to Ratepayers'	2,20
		Response to WOWSC's Motion regarding Optional Completeness for Docket No.	
		50788. (Administration/Case Management)	
4/19/23	RAA	Draft Reply Brief. (Administration).	6,10
4/20/23	RAA	Draft Reply Brief.	9.40
4/21/23	RAA	Draft Reply Brief. (Administration).	5.50
4/21/23	AMB	Review and redline WOWSC's Reply Brief for Docket No. 50788.	2.00
		(Administration/Case Management)	
4/25/23	RAA	Draft Reply Brief. (Administration).	4.50
4/28/23	RAA	Draft Reply Brief. (Administration).	.30
4/28/23	AMB	Review and redline extensive footnotes on WOWSC's Reply Brief for Docket No.	4,60
		50788. (Administration/Case Management)	

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

\$ 35,074.00

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Name	Staff Level	Hours	Rate	Total
Jamie L Mauldin	Principal	5.20	310.00	1,612.00
Rick A Arnett	Associate	101.40	280.00	28,392.00
Amanda M Benavides	Paralegal	33.80	150.00	5,070.00
TOTALS		140,40		\$ 35,074.00

DISBURSEMENTS

Date	Description	Amount
4/06/23	Corporate Couriers Check # - 000040865 Corporate Couriers, Courier, Courier	77,97
	services, 4/15/2023	

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C.

Winderme PUC Rate I.D.3870-	May 11, 2023 Invoice: 97540928				
Date	Description	Amount			
4/07/23					
	Reporting, PUC Prehearing conference, 03/21/23, 4/7/2023				
	Photocopying	.50			
	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	\$ 413.47			
	TOTAL THIS INVOICE	\$ 35,487.47			

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C.

25 of 28

			INV	/OICE					
	CORPORATI LOGISTIC 2335 KRAN AUSTIN, S	s Mer lani	E, SUITE F	RECEIVE	D		Invoice No 70760 Invc Da 4/15/	ite	atomer No. 1201 IO(3) Due
	LLOYD GO 816 CONG SUITE 19 AUSTIN, 4	RESS AVI	ATTORNEYS AT LAW	AFR 1.6 2023 Lloyd Gosselini	K 1	SK ABOUT	DELIVERI OUR WARE R XOUR BU 4007	HOUSE	
			Customer No. Invoice No.	Period Ending Amoun	t Due	Pg	 ,		
Date	Ordr No.	Svc	1203. 70760 Servic	4/15/23 30 e Detail	4.45	1		Charges	Total
/06/23	1193496	2HR	RICOH/ LLOYD GOSSELINK 816 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 78701 Callor: RICOH OFFICE SER Time: 12:59 Signed: KEVIN G	STATE OFFICE OF ADMIN HE 300 W 157H ST AUSTIN TX 7870 Wght: 3 Lbs Commaent: WK			TOWN F: Srchg:	10.00 15.00 1.70	26.70
/06/23	1193499	2HR	RICOE/ LLOYD GOSSELINK 816 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 76701 Caller: RICOH OFFICE SER Time: 12:03 Signed: C.STEVENS	Wght: 3 Lbs Comment: WK	YE 148 .3	DOWN	TOWN F: Srchg:	31,00 15,00 5,27	51.27
/03/23	1192524	EXP	Total Charges for Ref AND USES 4516 BURLESON ROAD AUSTIN TX 78744 Caller: JOHN SANTOS Time: 17:20 Signed: SYLVIA MCDADE	LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEY 816 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 7870	S AT 1AU	I Baso	:	15.00	15.00
/04/23	1192874	EXP	USPS 4516 BURLESON ROAD AUSTIN TX 78744 Caller: JOHN SANTOS Time: 16:56 Signed: NO MAIL	LLOYD GOSSHLINK ATTORNAY 816 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 7870 Comment: 2020		f Base		15.00	15.00
/05/23	1193098	F,XP	USPS 4516 EURLESON ROAD AUSTIN TX 78744 Caller: JOHN SANTOS Time: 16:55 Signed: SXIVIA M	LLOYD COSSFLINK ATTORNKY 816 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 7870 Comment: 2020		i Baae	ſ	15.00	15.00
/06/23	1193335	EXP	USPS 4516 BURLESON ROAD AUSTIN TX 78744 Caller: JOHN SANTOS Time: 16:40 Signed: SYLVIA MCDONALD	LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEY 815 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 7870 Commont: 2020		l Base	:	15.00	15.00
/07/23	1193596	FXP	USPS 4516 EURLESON ROAD AUSTIN TX 78744 Caller: JOHN SANTOS Time: 16:47 Signed: NO MAIL	LLOYD GOSSHLINK ATTORNEY 816 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 7870 Wait: Comment: 2020	ı.		: Time :	15.00 14.00	29.00
/10/23		EXP	USPS 4516 BURLESON ROAD AUSTIN TX 78744 Caller: JOHN SANTOS Time: 16:48 Signed: RICON DA VRACHIT	Comment: 2020	1			15.00	15.00
APPF BY DATE BILL ⁻	10:1L	130 00 -	PAYMENT <u>- 0000</u> 144 - USP - 0000 140.45 30	rs delivery -	(>1	43	-4/1	ef	Continued

26 of 28

INVOIC	Έ
--------	---

CORPORATE COURIERS AND LOGISTICS 2335 KRAMER LANE, SUITE F AUSTIN, TX 78758

LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW 816 CONGRESS AVE SUITE 1900 AUSTIN, TX 78701
 Invoice No.
 Customer No.

 70760
 1201

 invc Date
 Total Due

 4/15/23
 304.45

ON-DEMAND DELIVERIES 24/7 ASK ABOUT OUR WAREHOUSE THANKS FOR YOUR BUSINESS (512)479-4007

			Customer No. Involce No.	Period Ending Amount Due	Pg		
Date	Ordr No.	Svci	1201 70760 Service		2	Charges	Total
1/11/23	1194074	EXP	USPS 4516 BURLESON ROAD AUSTIN TX 76744 Caller: JOHN SANTOS Time: 16:29 Signed: SILVIA MCDADE	LIOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAN 816 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 78701 Comment: 2020	Base :	15.00	15.00
1/12/23	1194285	EXP	USPS 4516 BURLESON ROAD AUSTIN TX 78744 Caller: JOEN SANTOS Time: 16:41 Signed: LEFT IN MAIL ROOM	LLOYD GOSSELINE ATTORNEYS AT LAW 816 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 78701 Comment: 2020	Base :	15,00	15.00
/13/23	1194524	EXP	USPS 4516 BURLESON ROAD AUSTIN TX 78744 Caller: JORN SANTOS Tima: 16:59 Signed: SYLVIA MEDADE	LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW 81.6 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 78701 Comment: 2020	Base :	15.00	15.00
/14/23	1194771	EXP	USPS 4516 BURLESON ROAD AUSTIN TX 78744 Caller: JOHN SANTOS Time: 16:48 Signed: LEFT IN MAIL ROOM	LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW 816 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 78701 Comment: 2020	Base :	15.00	15.00
			Total Charges f	or Ref MAIL: 154.00			
/14/23	1195016	2HR 1HR	RICOH/ LLOYD GOSSELINK 816 CONGRESS AVE AUSTIN TX 78701 Caller: RICOH OFFICE SER Time: 14:25 Signed: DELIVERED	TCEQ-OFFICE OF THE CHIEF CLERK 12100 PARK 35 CIRCLE BLDG F AUSTIN TX 78753 Wght: 50 Lbs Comment: DL	Basa : Return : DOMNTOWN F: DOLLY CHAR: Fuel Srchg:	5.00	62.48
			Total Charges for Ref NEV/SRT/Y	04/лиs 2513-13: 62.40			
						Total	304.45
·					EIPT		

27 of 28

i

INVOIC	E
--------	---

Period Ending

4/15/23

Reference Totals :

Total Amount Due :

70760 Service Dotall

Description

Amount Due

Orders

2 20 1

13

13

304.45

3

Customer No. | Invoice No.

1201

CORPORATE COURIERS AND LOGISTICS 2335 KRAMER LANE, SUITE F AUSTIN, TX 78758

Ordr No. Svc

Date

LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW 816 CONGRESS AVE SUITE 1900 AUSTIN, TX 78701

Reference

AMB/JIM/RAA 3870-4 MAIL NEV/SRT/YXM/JMS 2813-13

Customer No. 1201 Total Due 304.45 Invoice No. 70760 Invc Date 4/15/23 ON-DEMAND DELIVERIËS 24/7 ASK ABOUT OUR WAREHOUSE THANKS FOR YOUR BUSINESS (512)479~4007 Pg Total Charges \square Total Amt 77.97 164.00 62.48 304.45 304.45

INVOICE PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT

KFN	INEDY				1	nvoice
					DATE	INVOICE NO
Arecord	dofexcellence				4/7/202.	3 2304000
BILL TO			PLE	ASE NOTE I FOR REM		1
-	selink Rochelle & Townsend, ess Avenue, Saite 1900	P.C.	Kenr	nedy Report	ing Servi	ce, Inc.
Austin, TX	C 78701 NEC	EIVED		. Whitestone		148
	APR 1	1 2023	Cedar	Park, TX 78	3613	
	Lloyd G	iosselink		107		
OB NUMBER	SERVICE ORDERED BY	DOCKET N	IUMBER] [CASE	NAME
23055	Jamie Mauldin	507	88	Ratepa	ayers Appe	al - Winderme
DATE TAKEN	DESCRIP	TION			RATE	AMOUNT
	State Office of Administrati	ve Hearings				
	Public Utility Commission	of Texas				
	Prehearing Conference Via Zoom Videoconference					
3/21/2023	Minimum Reporting Fee - One-Half Day Administrative Fee			1 1	300.00 35.00	300.00 35.00
	Tax ID # 74-1837735	D FOR 1 B - att 111 370 - 4 140	AYMENT			
	THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSIN	IESS!		Total		\$335.00
	TERMS: Due o	on re cei pt				
			F	_ii Payments/Ci	redits	\$0.00
			-			

Direct all inquiries to: Amy Burt 512-474-2233 order@kennedyreporting.com

Attachment C 1 of 4

275 W.Campbell Road, Suite 440 Richardson, TX 75080 Tel: 972-680-2000 Fax: 972-680-2007

Invoice

Invoice Date: Feb 28, 2023 Invoice Num: 15370 Billing Through: Feb 28, 2023

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 816 Congress Avenue Suite 1900 Austin, TX 78701

rategies & Solutions

NewGen

LG- Windermere Oaks WSC Rate Appeal (LG- Windermere Oaks WSC Rate Appeal TX-RLS2111:) - Managed by (Rabon

Grant)											
Contract Am	Contract Amount: \$20,000.00			t Amount: \$20,000.00 Amount Billed: \$19,557.50			50	Amount Remaining: \$442.50			
Professional Services											
<u>Employee</u>	<u>Descripti</u>	on			Hours	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>				
Grant S. Rabon	Profession	al Fees			3.00	\$275.00	\$825.00				
					Total Ser	vice Amount:	\$825.00				
					Amount Due	This Invoice:	\$825.00				
						This in	voice is due on 3/30/2023				
			Account Summa	ry							
Services BTD	Expenses BTD	Last Inv Num	Last Inv Date	Last Inv Amt	Last	Pay Amt	Prev Unpaid Amt				

Service	es BTD	Expenses BTD	Last Inv Num	Last Inv Date	Last Inv Amt	Last Pay Amt	Prev Unpaid Amt
\$19,5	57.50	\$0.00	15206	1/31/2023	\$1,960.00	\$0.00	\$18,732.50

Time Detail and Notes Follow on Next Page

Stakeholders

Electronic Copy

Economics

www.newgenstrategies.net

Strategy

Attachment C 2 of 4

275 W.Campbell Road, Suite 440 Richardson, TX 75080 Tel: 972-680-2000 Fax: 972-680-2007

NewGen Strategies & Solutions

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 816 Congress Avenue Suite 1900 Austin, TX 78701

Invoice

Invoice Date: Feb 28, 2023 Invoice Num: 15370 Billing Through: Feb 28, 2023

Date	Name	Duration Notes						
Project (Name	roject (Name) - LG-Windermere Oaks WSC Rate Appeal TX-RLS2111: (LG-Windermere Oaks WSC Rate Appeal)							
Rabon, Grant								
2/3/2023	Grant S. Rabon	1.00 call to review Mike's testimony						
2/23/2023	Grant S. Rabon	1.00 call with legal counsel and client Re: RFIs						
2/28/2023	Grant S. Rabon	1.00 call with legal counsel and review of responses to RFIs						
	Total Rab	on, Grant: 3.00						
	Total LG- Windermere Oaks Appeal TX-RLS2111: - LG- Wi Oaks WSC Rate	ndermere						

Attachment C 3 of 4

275 W.Campbell Road, Suite 440 Richardson, TX 75080 Tel: 972-680-2000 Fax: 972-680-2007

Invoice

Invoice Date: Mar 31, 2023 Invoice Num: 15550 Billing Through: Mar 31, 2023

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 816 Congress Avenue Suite 1900 Austin, TX 78701

rategies & Solutions

NewGen

LG- Windermere Oaks WSC Rate Appeal (LG- Windermere Oaks WSC Rate Appeal TX-RLS2111:) - Managed by (Rabon

Grant)		_		_			
Contract Am	Contract Amount: \$30,000.00 Amount Billed: \$21,757.50		50	Amount Remaining: \$8,242.50			
Professional Services							
Employee	<u>Descripti</u>	on			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	Amount
Grant S. Rabon	Profession	al Fees			8.00	\$275.00	\$2,200.00
					Total Service Amount:		
					Amount Due	This Invoice:	\$2,200.00
						This in	voice is due on 4/30/2023
			Account Summa	ry			
Services BTD	Expenses BTD	Last Inv Num	Last Inv Date	Last Inv Amt	Last	Pay Amt	Prev Unpaid Amt

Services BTD	Expenses BTD	Last Inv Num	Last Inv Date	Last Inv Amt	Last Pay Amt	Prev Unpaid Amt
\$21,757.50	\$0.00	15370	2/28/2023	\$825.00	\$0.00	\$19,557.50

Time Detail and Notes Follow on Next Page

Electronic Copy

Economics

www.newgenstrategies.net

Stakeholders

Strategy

Attachment C 4 of 4

275 W.Campbell Road, Suite 440 Richardson, TX 75080 Tel: 972-680-2000 Fax: 972-680-2007

NewGen Strategies & Solutions

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 816 Congress Avenue Suite 1900 Austin, TX 78701

Invoice

Invoice Date: Mar 31, 2023 Invoice Num: 15550 Billing Through: Mar 31, 2023

Date	Name	Duration Notes	
Project (Name) -	LG- Windermere Oaks WSC Rate Appeal T	K-RLS2111: (LG- Windermere Oaks WSC Rate Appeal)	
Rabon, Grant			
3/1/2023	Grant S. Rabon	3.00 calls with client and legal counsel responses to RFIs	
3/7/2023	Grant S. Rabon	1.00 call with client	
3/20/2023	Grant S. Rabon	1.00 call with client and legal counsel	
3/22/2023	Grant S. Rabon	3.00 hearing	
	Total Rabon, Grant	8.00	
	Total LG- Windermere Oaks WSC Rate Appeal TX-RLS2111: - LG- Windermere Oaks WSC Rate Appeal :	8.00	

Economics