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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

o RECEIVED 1*/ 12 ( NA Y 1 9 2021 

RATEPAYERS APPEAL OF THE § BEFORE THE ~<*ttlkc DECISION BY WINDERMERE OAKS § 
WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION TO § PUBLIC UTILITY COMMISSION 
CHANGE WATER AND SEWER § 
RATES § OF TEXAS 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REOUEST FOR INFORMATION 

To: Ratepayers of the Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation (Ratepayers), by and 
through their representatives of record, Josephine Fuller, 328 Coventry Road, Spieewood, 
TX 78669, and Patti Flunker, 305 Coventry Road, Spicewood, TX 78669. 

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation (WOWSC) files this Response to the Third 

Request for Information (RFI) filed by Ratepayers Representatives (Ratepayers). The discovery 

request was received by WOWSC on April 30,2021; therefore these responses are timely filed. 

Pursuant to 16 Tex. Admin. Code (TAC) § 22.144(c)(2)(F), these responses may be treated as if 

they were filed under oath. 

The following files are confidential and witl be provided el€ctronicattv on the CD 

attached to this filing: 

CONFIDENTIAL Attachment Ratepayers 3-2 

If a responsive document exceeds 99 pages, the response will indicate that the attachment 

is voluminous, and pursuant to 16 TAC §§ 22.14*h)(2), the document will be provided 

eleclronically on the CD attached to this filing and made available for inspection at the offices of 

WOWSC's attorneys, Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle and Townsend, P.C., located at 816 Congress 

Avenue, Suite 1900, Austin, Texas 78701. Please call Patricia Martinez at 512-322-5883 during 

regular business hours, to make an appointment to review the documents. 

Respectfully submitted, 

LLOYDGOSSELINKROCHELLE 
& TOWNSEND, P.C. 

WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for In formation 1 
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816 Congress Avenue, Suite 1900 
Austin, Texas 78701 
(512) 322-5800 
(512) 472-0532 (Fax) 

C-1 \\ » 

JAMI# Lj KiAULDIN 
State BaFNo. 24065694 
jmauldin@lglawfirm.com 
REID BARNES 
State Bar No. 24101487 
rbarnes@lglawfirm.com 
ROBYN F. KATZ 
State Bar No. 24060985 
rkatz@lglawfirm.coin 

ATTORNEYS FOR WINDERMERE OAKS 
WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION 

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE 

I certify that, unless otherwise ordered by the presiding officer, notice of the filing of this 

document was provided to all parties of record via electronic mail on May 19,2021, in accordance 

with the Order Suspending Rules, issued in Project No. 50664. 

«)fl 
Jam~e L. Mauldin 

U 

WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for Information 2 

002 



SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REOUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-1 Provide all correspondence the WOWSC has received from February 2, 
2020 to present from any ratepayer/member related to the increased water 
and sewer rates, including their inability to pay the increased rates. Also, 
include all replies from the WOWSC to ratepayer/member correspondence 
mentioned above. 

RESPONSE: There are no responsive documents. 

Prepared by: Joe Gimenez 
Sponsored by: Joe Gimenez 

W OWSC's Response to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for In formation 3 
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REOUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-2 Provide all correspondence the WOWSC has received from the 
ratepayers/members related to their billed amount for water and/or sewer 
service from April 1, 2020 - Present. Also, include all replies from the 
WOWSC to ratepayer/member correspondence mentioned above. 

RESPONSE: Please refer to CONFIDENTIAL Attachment Ratepayers 3-2. 

Prepared by: Joe Gimenez 
Sponsored by: Joe Gimenez 

WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for Information 4 
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Attachment 3-2 is 
CONFIDENTIAL and is 

being provided under seal in 
electronic-file format on CD 
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REOUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-3 Provide all correspondence the WOWSC has received from the 
ratepayers/members related to their number of gallons used for water and/or 
sewer service used from April 1, 2020 - Present. Also, include all replies 
from the WOWSC to ratepayer/member correspondence mentioned above. 

RESPONSE: Please refer to the CONFIDENTIAL Attachment Ratepayers 3-2. 

Prepared by: Joe Gimenez 
Sponsored by: Joe Gimenez 

W OWSC's Response to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for In formation 5 
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REQUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-4 Has the WOWSC disconnected any water/sewer service for nonpayment 
from April 1, 2020 to Present? If yes, how many disconnections has been 
for nonpayment in this time frame? 

RESPONSE: Yes. Two have been disconnected for non-payment. One was disconnected 
after three months ofnon-payment. The day after service was disconnected, 
this customer paid. The other has been in arrears for several months and 
has not paid. 

Prepared by: Joe Gimenez 
Sponsored by: Joe Gimenez 

WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for In formation 6 
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REQUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-5 The WOWSC's February 2,2020 board meeting minutes page 3 #2. xviii. 
2. states "Communicate to membership what rates would be without legal 
expenses defending lawsuits'5' . State (in dollars and cents) what the 
WOWSC calculates water rates and sewer rates would be without legal 
expenses defending lawsuits. Produce all communications sent out to the 
membership addressing this matter. 

RESPONSE: The Board did not produce a rate study that "would be without legal 
expenses defending lawsuits." 

Instead, the Board asked TRWA's James Smith to produce rates assuming 
various costs forlegal expenses ($0; $30,000; $48,000; $72,000; $250,000). 
The legal expenses were not defined as "defending lawsuits," or "general 
counsel," or "responding to PIA requests.'° The responses for monthly base 
rates were, respectively: $118.15, $128.03, $133.96, $141.87, and $200.50. 

However, without considering cumulative legal expenses for 2020, the 
monthly base rate would have been $118.15. 

The Board authorized a report from NewGen Strategies to assess the 
company's financial health. The report was finalized on September 3,2020 
and mailed to members with a letter, "WOWSC Letter to Members 
11.6.2020), along with "Frequently asked questions 11.6.2020). See Direct 
Testimony of Joe Gimenez at Attachment JG-6. 

See Attachment Ratepayers 3-5a- 3-5g. 

Prepared by: Joe Gimenez 
Sponsored by: Joe Gimenez 

' http://www.wowsc.org/documents/778/2020-02-01_WOWSC_Annual_Board_Meeting_Minutes_Approved.pdf 

W OW SC' s Resp on se to Ratepayers Representatives 
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Attachment Ratcpayen 3-58 
WATER REVENUE REQUIREMENT & RATE DESIGN 

UTILITY: 

REVENU E REQU IREMENT 
BU DGET/COST OF SERVICE ITEM Item Cost % Fixed % Variable 

SALARIES 
CONTRACT LABOR 
CHEMI CALS AN D TREATMENT 
UTILITIES 
REPAIRSAND MAINTENANCE 
OFFICEEXPENSES BILLING 
ACCOUNTING &LEGAL 
HEALTHINSURANCE 
OFFICE SUPPUES 
TANKREPAIRS 
BAD DEBT 
PAYROLLTAXES 
TELEPHONE 
TRUCK &EQUIP. EXPENSE 
TRAVEL & ENTERTAINMENT 
EQUIPMENTRENTAL 
INSURANCE -WC &LIABILITY 
LICENSE &DUES 
POSTAGE & FREIGHT 
ADVERTISING 
SAMPLING 
EDUCATION 
DEPRECIATION 
MATERIALS &SUPPLIES 
SECU RITY 
MISCELLANEOUS 
LONG TERM DEBT 
PURCHASED WATER 
SLUG REMOVAL 
BOOKKEEPING 

0 78 0 22 0 
117,865 75 88.399 25 29,466 
12.035 60 7.221 40 4,814 
20.922 70 14,645 30 6,277 
71.060 50 35.530 50 35.530 
15.679 45 7.056 55 8623 

0 50 0 50 0 
0 50 0 50 0 

4.707 45 2.118 55 2,689 
0 50 0 50 0 
0 50 0 50 0 
0 50 0 50 0 

6.549 40 2,620 60 3.929 
0 50 0 50 0 

1.130 50 565 50 565 
250 50 125 50 125 

14.160 70 9.912 30 4.248 
178 50 89 50 89 

2,710 50 1,355 50 1,3 55 
0 30 0 70 0 

8.459 50 4.230 50 4.230 
0 50 0 50 0 

56,273 60 33,764 40 22509 
6.730 50 3,365 50 3.365 

0 60 0 50 0 
1.250 50 625 50 625 

49.882 100 49.882 0 0 
8.490 45 3.821 55 4.670 
2.363 50 1,182 50 1.182 
4.163 50 2,082 50 2.082 

0 50 0 50 0 
0 50 0 50 0 

SUB-TOTAL(LESSFIT&RETURN) 404.855 268, 683 100 136272 
56 OF TOTAL (FIXED +VARIABLE) 63 37 
PRiNC. & INTEREST - WATER 0 0.00 0.00 
MAINTENANCERESERVE- 0 0.00 0.00 
LESS OTHER REVENUE $0 0.00 0.00 

TOTAL $404.855 $268.583 $136.272 
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Attachment Ratcpayers 3-5a 

RATE CALCULATION 

GALLONAGE CHARGE PROPOSED RATE 
Vanable CosVTest Year Gallons/1,000 ===========> 10 48 /TH GAL USE -> $3.55 /TH.GAL. 

\1/ \1/ 
MINIMUMBILL 1 1 
Ftxed CosU13Customer Equivalents ============> 88 47 /MO YIELDS -> $118.15 /MO. 

88 47 /MO ind min gallons 118.15/MO. 
Avg Test-Yr Customer Equivalents = 253 inc. min. gail, 
Gallons Included In Minimum Bill = 0 
Test Year Gallons Billed (x 1,000) = 13,000 

REVENUES GENERATED 

Minimum Bill 
Connection SIR # of Connections Min Bill Including Gals R ev / Month R eq iY ear 
5/8",3/4" 253 $11815 $11815 $29,892 $358,705 
3/4" 0 $177 23 $ 177 23 $0 $0 
1" 0 $ 29538 $ 29538 $0 $0 
1-1/2" 0 $ 590 75 $ 59075 $0 $0 

0 $ 945 20 $ 94520 $0 $0 
0 $ 945 20 $ 945 20 $0 $0 

3" 0 $ 1.18151 $ 1,181 51 $0 $0 
4" 0 $ 2,953 76 $ 2,953 76 $0 $0 
6" 0 $ 5,907 53 $ 5,907.53 $0 $0 

TOTAL MINIMUM CHARGES=> $358.705 
GALLONAGECHARGES=> 13,000 @ $3 56 /1,000 GAL 46.150 

TOTAL REVENUE GENERATED=> $404.855 

Printed on time 

NOTES 
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Attachment Ratepayers 3-5a 

UTILITY 

Date Referenced: 1-Jan-97 DEPRECIATION 
ANALYSIS 

Ver./Est. Actual 
Acquired Original Economic Deprec. Annual Accum. Net 

Description Date COS t Li fe, yrs Life Deprec. Deprec. Plant 

Land 1-Jun-79 0 n/a n/a n/a n/a 0.00 
Structures. 

Masonry 1-Jun-79 0 30 17.6 0-00 0.00 
Wood 1-Jan-01 0 15 -4.0 0.00 0.00 

Well 1-Jun-79 0 30 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Pumps: 

Booster >=7HP 1-Jan-01 0 10 -4.0 0.00 0.00 
Booster <7HP 1-Jun-79 0 5 17.6 -- 0.00 

Motor 1-May-94 0 3 2.7 0.00 0.00 
Well,<5 1-Jan-01 0 5 -4.0 0.00 0.00 
Well,>5 1-Jun-96 0 10 0.6 0.00 0.00 

Hypochlorinator 1-Aug-94 0 5 2.4 0.00 0.00 
Gas Chlorinator 1-Jan-01 0 10 -4.0 0.00 0.00 
Tanks: 

Pressure 1-Jun-79 0 50 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Ground 1-Jun-79 0 50 17.6 0.00 0.00 

Dislrib. System 1-Jun-79 0 50 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Distrib. System 1-Jun-93 0 50 3.6 0.00 0.00 
Services 1-Jun-79 0 20 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Services 1-Jun-93 0 20 3.6 0.00 0.00 
Meters 1-Jun-79 0 20 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Meters 1-Jun-93 0 20 3.6 0.00 0.00 
Compressor 1-Jan-01 0 10 -4.0 0.00 0-00 
Electrical Controls 1-May-94 0 30 2-7 0.00 0.00 
Furniture/Fixtures 1-Jan-81 0 10 16.0 -- 0.00 
Heavy Equipment 15-Feb-89 0 10 7.9 0.00 0.00 
Light Vehicles 15-Sep-87 0 5 9.3 -- 0 00 
Shop Tools 1-Jan-81 0 15 16.0 -- 0.00 
Computer/Software 1-Feb-95 0 5 1.9 0.00 0.00 
Fendng 1-Jun-79 0 30 17.6 0.00 0.00 

Total $0 $0 $0 $0 

011 



Attachment Ratcpayers 3-5a 
1999 WATER REVENUE RECUIREMENT & RATEDESIGN 

UTILITY Maunm,Ile SUD 

REVENUE REQUIREMENT 
COST OF SERVICE ITEM Itern Col % F,ced % Vsnsb!e 

SALARIES 232.878 50 116.439 50 116,439 
CCNTRACT LABCR 3,672 50 1,836 50 1,838 
UNIFORMS 4196 100 4196 0 0 
CHEMICALSAND TREATMENT 15,735 0 0 100 15,735 
UTILffl ES 47.205 0 0 100 B.205 
RERURSAND MAINTENAN CE 20.980 0 0 100 20.980 
OFFICE RENT 14.000 10 14000 0 0 
ACCOUNTING&LEGAL 15,000 10 15,000 0 0 
HEALTH INSURANCE 31.470 10 31,QO 0 0 
OFFICE SUPPLIES 15,735 10 15,735 0 0 
MISCELLANEOUS 5.245 0 2.623 50 2,023 
PAYROLLTAXES 17,932 0 8,966 50 8,966 
BANK CHARGES 500 10 500 0 0 
TRUCK&EQUIP EXPENSE 15735 0 7.808 50 7,808 
SMALL TOOLS & SUPPLIES 15735 0 7.868 50 7,888 
FUEL 10,490 0 5.245 50 5.245 
CCMPUFER CHARGES 2,000 10 2.000 0 0 
TRANSPORTATION 12.588 0 6,294 50 6.294 
EQUIPMEMF RENTAL 5,000 0 2500 50 2.500 
CCMMUNICATIONS 6000 10 0.000 0 0 
PRINTING 7500 10 7500 0 0 
INSURANCE - WC & LIABILFY Z ? Z ? 4 10 27 , 274 0 0 
LICENSE & DUES 2000 10 2000 0 0 
POSTAGE & FREIGHT 7867 5 10 7,868 0 0 
ADVERTISIN G 31€ 10 3.147 0 0 
DIRECTORS EXPENSE 2098 10 2,098 0 0 
SAMPLING 5245 0 0 100 5,245 
TRAVEL & ENTERTAINMENT 1049 100 1,049 0 0 
CCNFERENCES &WORKSHOPS 2000 100 2,000 0 0 
INCREASE IN VARIABLE 199583 0 0 100 1.998 

SUB·TOFAL (LESS Frr & RETURN) 552,271 301,474 250.798 
% OFTOTAL (FIXED +VARIABLE) 0 58 042 
PRINC & INTEREST -WATER 532283 31040842 221784 58 
MAINT & REPLAC RESERVE 55.227 
LESS OTHER REVENUES -75,000 -4375000 -18229 17 
LESS SEWER RATEALLOC -75,388 1 -7536839 

TOTAL $989.413 $492,854 $454,3* 
RATE CALCULATION 

GALLOMAGECHARGE 
Vsnsble Cofreet Yea, Gallona,1.000 ===========- 3 02 MH GAL 

PROPOSED RATE 
USE-> $425 rrH GAL 

07503121 
V W 

MINIMUM BILL I 
Fxed Coit/12~Cuiomer Equw slent, == ==========, 16 40,MO WB.DS-7 

2245 JMO) ind mn gallons 
$1168 KMO 

20 18 KMO ind mn gallons 
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Attachment Ratepaycrs 3-5a 
1999WATER REVENUE CONT 

Aw g Teir¥ Cuionler Equt,sleita = 2504 
Gallons Induded In M,nimumB,!i = 2,000 
Test Year Gallons Purrped * 1.000) = NE 
Test Year Gallons Billed (x 1,000) = 150.239 

R EVEENUES GENERATB) 

Min,num B,1 
Conne¢In Size # of Connec~ona 1,!in Bill Indud,ng Gi Re.lMonth Re~jYear INSERT DATA 
5/8'.314 2432 $1168 $2018 $40,073 $588.871 NO CF 98- CUST = 2432 88'.314 EQUIV 2432 
1' 0 S 1950 $ 28 00 $0 30 NO CF 1' CUST = 0 1' EQUIV 0 
1-152 0 $ 3889 $ 4739 $0 $0 NO CF 1-1/2·CUST= 01-1;2 EQUW 0 
2- 1 $ 6224 $ 7074 $71 $840 NO CF 2' CU ST = 12 EQUA/ 533 
2-VT 0 $ 93 42 3 101 92 $0 70 NO OF 2-1/2·CUST= 0 2-V2 EQUM 0 
3' 0 $ 11878 $ 12528 W $0 NO OF 3· CUST = 03· EQUIV 0 
t 0 $ 19487 $ 203 17 $0 $0 NOOF 4·CUST= 0 4 EQUM 0 
6' 2 $ 38922 i 39772 $795 $9.545 NO OF 6' CU ST = 2 6 EQUW 66 66 

2435 2503 99 

GULONAGE CHARGES» 
TOTAL MINIMUM CHARGES=, $599,266 

01,799 . 54 25 /1,000 GU 390.147 24048 

3989.413 2454 
NOTES NO DEPREJATION. MAINTENANCE RESERVE INSTEAD 
BASED ON EEGINNING CONNECrIONS =2376AND ENDINGCONNECTICNS = 24@5, WHICH IS 5% GROWTH RATEE 

NET REVENUE GREATERTHAN OR =1 1 DEPA SERVICED 
NET REVBNUE = $587,51012 
1 1 DEBT SERVICE = $585.511 30 
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Attachment Rakpayus 3-5b 
WATER REVENU E REQUIREMENT & RATE DESIGN 

UTI LITY 

REVENUE REQUIREMENT 
BUDGET/COST OF SERVICE ITEM Item Cost % Fixed % Variable 

SALARIES 0 78 0 22 0 
CONTRACT LABOR 117,865 75 88,399 25 29,466 
CHEMICALS AND TREATMENT 12,035 60 7,221 40 4,814 
UTI UTIES 20,922 70 14,645 30 6,277 
REPAIRSANDMAINTENANCE 71,060 50 35,530 50 35.530 
OFFICE EXPENSES BILLING 15,679 45 7,056 55 8.623 
ACCOUNTING &LEGAL 30.000 50 15.000 50 15.000 
HEALTH INSURANCE 0 50 0 50 0 
OFFICE SUPPLIES 4.707 45 2,118 55 2,589 
TANK REPAIRS 0 60 0 50 0 
BAD DEBT 0 50 0 50 0 
PAYR OLL TAXES 0 50 0 50 0 
TELEPHONE 6,549 40 2,620 60 3.929 
TRU CK & EQUI P, EXPEN SE 0 50 0 50 0 
TRAVEL & ENTERTAINMENT 1,130 50 565 50 565 
EQUIPMENT RENTAL 250 50 125 50 125 
INSURANCE-WC&LIABILITY 14.160 70 9.912 30 4,248 
LICENSE&DUES 178 50 89 50 89 
POSTAGE &FREIGHT 2.710 50 1.355 50 1,355 
ADVERTISING 0 30 0 70 0 
SAMPLING 8.459 50 4,230 60 4,230 
EDUCATION 0 50 0 50 0 
DEPRECIATION 56,273 60 33,764 40 22,509 
MATERIALS & SUPPLIES 6.730 50 3.365 50 3,365 
SECURITY 0 50 0 50 0 
MISCELLANEOUS 1,250 50 625 50 625 
LONGTERM DEBT 49,882 100 49.882 0 0 
PURCHASED WATER 8 490 45 3,821 55 4,670 
SLUG REMOVAL 23 63 50 1.182 50 1 .182 
BOOKKEEPING 4163 50 2,082 50 2.082 

0 50 0 50 0 
0 50 0 50 0 

SUB-TOTAL (LESS FIT & RETURN) 434.855 283.583 100 151,272 
% OF TOTAL (FIXED +VARIABLE) 63 37 
PRINC. &INTEREST - WATER 0 0.00 0.00 
MAINTENANCE RESERVE- 0 0.00 000 
LESS OTHER REVENUE $0 0.00 0,00 

TOTAL $434,855 $283.583 $151.272 

014 



Attachment Ratepayers 3-5b 

RATE CALCU LATION 

GALLONAGE CHARGE 
Variable CosVTest Year Gallons/1,000===========> 11 64 /TH GAL USE-> 

PROPOSED RATE 
$3.55 /TH.GAL. 

\1/ \1/ 
MINIMUM BILL 1 
Fixed Cost/12/Customer Equ/alents ============> 93 41 /MO YIELDS -> $128.03 /MO. 

93 41 /MO ind min gallons 128.03 /MO. 
Avg Test-Yr Customer Ecu/alerts = 253 inc. min. gail, 
Gallons Included In Minimum Bill = 0 
Test Year Gallons Billed (x 1,000) = 13,000 

REVENUES GENERATED 

Minimum Bill 
Connection Size # of Connections Min Bill Including Gals R ev /M onth Rev f,fear 
5/8't 3/4" 253 $128 03 $128 03 $32.392 $388,705 
3/4" 0 $192 05 $ 192 05 $0 $0 
1" 0 $ 32008 $ 320 08 $0 $0 
1-1/2" 0 $ 64016 $ 64016 $0 $0 
2" 0 $ 1,024 26 $ 1,024 26 $0 $0 
2-1/2" 0 $ 1,024 26 $ 1,024 26 $0 $0 
3" 0 $ 1,280 32 $ 1,280 32 $0 $0 
4" 0 $ 3.200 80 $ 3,200 80 $0 $0 
6" 0 $640160 $ 6,40160 $0 $0 

TOTAL MINIMUM CHARGES=> $388.705 
GALLONAGE CHARGES=> 13,000 @ $3 55 /1,000 GAL 46,150 

TOTAL REVENUE GENERATED=> $434.865 

Printed on time 

NOTES 
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Attachment Ratepayers 3-5b 

UTILITY~ 

Date Referenced 1-Jan-97 DEPRECIATION 
ANALYSIS 

Ver./Est. Actual 
Acquired Original Economic Deprec. Annual Accum. Net 

Description Date COS t Li fe, yrs Li fe Deprec. Deprec. Plant 

Land 1-Jun-79 0 n/a n/a n/a n/a 0.00 
Structures: 

Masonry 1-Jun-79 0 30 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Wood 1-Jan-01 0 15 -4.0 0.00 0.00 

Well 1-Jun-79 0 30 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Pumps: 

Booster >=7HP 1-Jan-01 0 10 -4.0 0.00 0.00 
Booster <7HP 1-Jun-79 0 5 17.6 -- 0.00 

Motor 1-May-94 0 3 2.7 0.00 0.00 
Well,<5 1-Jan-01 0 5 -4.0 0.00 0.00 
Well,>5 1-Jun-96 0 10 0.6 0.00 0.00 

Hypochlorinator 1-Aug-94 0 5 2.4 0.00 0.00 
Gas Chlorinator 1-Jan-01 0 10 -4.0 0.00 0.00 
Tanks-

Pressure 1-Jun-79 0 50 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Ground 1-Jun-79 0 50 17.6 0.00 0.00 

Distrib. System 1-Jun-79 0 50 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Distrib. System 1-Jun-93 0 50 3.6 0.00 0.00 
Services 1-Jun-79 0 20 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Services 1-Jun-93 0 20 3.6 0.00 0.00 
Meters 1-Jun-79 0 20 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Meters 1-Jun-93 0 20 3.6 0.00 0.00 
Compressor 1-Jan-01 0 10 -4.0 0.00 0.00 
Electrical Controls 1-May-94 0 30 2.7 0.00 0.00 
Furniture/Fixtures 1-Jan-81 0 10 16.0 - 0.00 
Heavy Equipment 15-Feb-89 0 10 7.9 0-00 0.00 
Light Vehicles 15-Sep-87 0 5 9.3 -- 0.00 
Shop Tools 1-Jan-81 0 15 16.0 -- 0.00 
Computer/Software 1-Feb-95 0 5 1.9 0.00 0.00 
Fencing 1-Jun-79 0 30 17.6 0.00 0.00 

Total. $0 $0 $0 $0 

016 



Attachment Ratepayers 3-5b 
1999 WATER REVENUE REQJIREMENT & RATE DESIGN 

UTILITY Maunce,ille SUD 

REVENUE REQUIREMENT 
COST OF SERVICE ITEM Item CIa % FKed % Vonsble 

SALARIES 232,878 50 116.439 50 116.439 
CCNTRACr LABCR 3.672 50 1,836 50 1.836 
UNIFORMS 4198 100 4,196 0 0 
CHEMICALSAND TREATMENT 15735 0 0 100 15.735 
UTILMES 47,205 0 0 100 9.205 
RER~I RS AND MAINTENAN CE 20.980 0 0 100 20.980 
OFFICE RENT 14.000 10 14,000 0 0 
ACCOUNTING & LEGAL 15.000 10 15,000 0 0 
HEALTH INSURANCEE 31.470 10 31,QO 0 0 
OFF ICE SUPPLIES 15.735 10 15735 0 0 
MISCELLANEOUS 5.245 2,823 50 2,623 
PAYROLLTAXES 17.932 0 8,960 50 8,966 
BANK CHARGES 500 10 500 0 0 
TRUCK & EQUIP EXPENSE 15,735 0 7.888 50 7.868 
SMALL TOOLS & SUPPLIES 15,735 0 7,868 50 7.868 
FUEL 10,490 0 5.245 50 5,245 
COMPUTER CHARGES 2,000 10 2,000 0 0 
TRANSPORTATION 12588 0 6.294 50 6.294 
EQUIPMENT RENTAL 5.000 0 2.500 50 2.500 
COAMUNICATIONS 6000 10 8,000 0 0 
PRINTING 7500 10 7,500 0 0 
INSURANCE - WC & LIABILr Y 27274 10 27 . 274 0 0 
LICENSE & DUES 2000 10 2.000 0 0 
POSTAGE & FREIGHT 7867 5 10 7,868 0 0 
ADVERTISIN G 3147 10 3.147 0 0 
DIRECTORS EXPENSE 2098 10 2.098 0 0 
SAMPLING 5245 0 0 100 5245 
TRAVEL & ENTERTAINM BIT 1049 100 1049 0 0 
CCNFERENCES &WORKSHOPS 2000 100 2000 0 0 
IN CR EASE IN VARIABLE 199563 0 0 100 1,996 

SUB-TOTAL (LESS Fr & RETURN) 552.271 301.•V4 250.798 
% CF TOTAL (FIXED + VARIABLE) 058 042 
PRINC & INTEREST -WATER 532283 31049842 221784 58 
MAINT & REPLAC RESERVE 55.227 
LESSOTHERREVENUES -75,000 -43750 00 -1822917 
LESS SEWER RATEALLOC -75368 1 -7536839 

TOTAL $989.413 $492,854 $454.353 
RA1E CALCULATION 

GALLONAGE CHAR GE 
Vangble Coa/Te/Yesr Gallona'1.000 ===========> 3 02 KH GAL 

PROPOSEDRATE 
USE-> 3425 /TH GAL 

07503121 
4' 

MINIMUM BILL I I 
Fu(ed Coa'13Cuaorner Equw alent == ==========, 18 40 U,10 YIELDS -> 31168 KMC. 

2245 JMO ind mn. gallons 20 18 KMO. ind mn gs!!ona 
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Attachment Ratepayers 3-5b 
1999 WATER REVENUECONT 

Avg Tezt-Yr Cuaomer Equl,'alenm = 2504 
Gallons Induded In MinimumB,11 = 2.000 
Test Year Gallons Pu,rped (x 1,000) = NE 
Tea Year Gallons Billed (x 1,000) = 150.239 

REVENUES GENERATED 

Minin·um Bil 
Connecz,on Size # of Connectons Mm Bill Induding G, Re, k Month Re'; Year INSERT DATA 
88·, 314 2432 $1168 $2018 $4@,073 $588,871 NO Cf 5'8' CUST = 2432 N8'.N4 EQUW 2432 
1' 0 $ 1950 $ 28 00 ® $0 NO CF 1' CUST= 01- EOUIV 0 
1-1~2 0 S 3889 3 4739 $0 $0 NOCF 1-1,2·CUST= 0 1-1#2 EQUIV 0 
2 1 $ 6224 $ 7074 $71 $849 NO CF r COST = 12 EQUN 533 
2-Vr 0 3 93 42 $ 10192 $0 70 NOCF 2-112· CUST= 0 2-1~2 EQUW 0 
3' 0 $ 11878 $ 125 28 $0 $0 NO CF 3· CUST= 03 EQUW 0 
4 0 $ 19487 $ 203 17 $0 $0 NO OF 4· CUST= 0 4· EQUIV 0 
6 2 $ 389 22 $ 39772 $795 $9.545 NO CF 6' CU ST = 2 6 EQUW 88 68 

2435 2503 99 

GALLONAGE CHARGES=> 
TOTAL MINIMUM CHARGES== 

91.799 @ $4 25 /1000 GU 
$599,266 

390.147 24048 

$989.413 24354 
NOTES NO DEPREOATION, MAINTENANCE RESERVE INSTEAD 
BASED ON EEGINNINGCONNECTIONS =2376AND ENDING CONNECrICNS = 2495. WHICH iS 5% GROWTH RATE 

NET REVENUE GRBATERTHAN OR =11 DEBT SERVICEO 
NET R EV8·1UE = $587.51012 
1 1 DEBT SERVICE = S585.51130 
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Attmchmcnt Ratcpaycrs 3-5c 
WATER REVENUE REQUIREMENT & RATE DESIGN 

UT LIly 

REVENUE REQUIREMENT 
BUDGET/COST OF SERVICE ITEM Item Cost % Fwed % Variable 

SALARIES 
CONTRACT LABOR 
CHEMICALSAND TREATMENT 
UTILITIES 
REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE 
OFFICE EXPENSES BILLING 
ACCOUNTING & LEGAL 
HEALTHINSURANCE 
OFFICE SUPPLIES 
TANK REPAIRS 
BAD DEBT 
PAYR OLL TAXES 
TELEPHONE 
TRUCK&EQUIP. EXPENSE 
TRAVEL& ENTERTAINMENT 
EQUIPMENT RENTAL 
INSURANCE-WC&LIABILITY 
UCENSE&DUES 
POSTAGE & FREIGHT 
ADVERTISING 
SAMPLING 
EDUCATION 
DEPRECIATION 
MATERIALS & SUPPLIES 
SECURITY 
MISCELLANEOUS 
LONGTERM DEBT 
PURCHASED WATER 
SLUG REMOVAL 
BOOKKEEPING 

0 78 
117.865 75 

0 22 
88,399 25 

0 
29.466 

12.035 60 7.221 40 4,814 
20,922 70 14,645 30 6,277 
71.060 50 35.530 50 35.530 
15.679 45 7.056 55 8623 
48.000 50 24.000 50 24.000 

0 50 0 50 0 
4,707 45 2.118 55 2.589 

0 50 0 50 0 
0 50 0 50 0 
0 50 0 50 0 

6,549 40 2,620 60 3.929 
0 50 0 50 0 

1,130 50 565 50 565 
250 50 125 50 125 

14.160 70 9,912 30 4.248 
1 78 50 89 50 89 

2,710 50 1.355 50 1.356 
0 30 0 70 0 

8,459 50 4.230 50 4.230 
0 50 0 50 0 

56.273 60 33.764 40 22.509 
6,730 50 3 3 65 50 3.3 65 

0 50 0 50 0 
1.250 50 625 50 625 

49,882 100 49.882 0 0 
8.490 45 3.821 55 4,670 
2363 50 1.1 82 50 1.182 
4,163 60 2,082 50 2.082 

0 50 0 50 0 
0 50 0 50 0 

SUB-TOTAL (LESS FIT & RETURN) 452.855 292,583 1 00 160.272 
% OF TOTAL (FIXED + VARIABLE) 63 37 
PRINC. &INTEREST -WATER 0 0.00 0.00 
MAINTENANCE RESERVE- 0 000 0.00 
LESS OTHER REVENUE $0 O. 00 0.00 

TOTAL $402,855 $292.683 $160.272 
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Attachment Ratepaycrs 3-5c 

RATE CALCULATION 

GALLONAGE CHARGE 

Variable Cost/Test Year Gallons/1.000 ===========> 1233 /TH GAL USE-> 
PROPOSED RATE 

$3.55 /TH. GAL. 

\1/ \1/ 
MINIMUM BILL | | 
FIxed Cost/13Customer Equivalents ============> 9637/MO YIELDS -> $133.96 /MO. 

9637 /MO. incl min. gallons 133.96 /MO. 
Avg Test-Yr Customer Equb,alents = 253 inc. min. gail, 
Gallons Included In Minimum Bill = 0 
Test Year Gallons Billed (x 1,000) = 13.000 

REVENUES GENERATED 

Minimum Bill 
Connection Sim # of Connectiors Min Bill Including Gals R ev /Month Rev rrear 
6/8". 3/4" 253 $133 96 $133 96 $33,892 $406.705 
3/4" 0 $200 94 $ 200 94 $0 $0 
1" 0 $ 334 90 $ 33 4 90 $0 $0 
1-1/2" 0 $ 669 80 $ 669 80 $0 $0 
2" 0 $ 1.071 69 $ 1,07169 $0 $0 
2-1/2" 0 $ 1,071 69 $ 1,07169 $0 $0 
3" 0 $ 1.339 61 $ 1.339 61 $0 $0 
4" 0 $ 3.34902 $ 3,349 02 $0 $0 
6" 0 $ 6.698 04 $ 6.698 04 $0 $0 

TOTAL MINIMUM CHARGES=> $406,705 
GALLONAGE CHARGES=> 13,000 @ $3 55 /1,000 GAL 46.150 

TOTAL REVENUE GENERATED=> $452,855 

Printed on tim e 

NOTES 
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Attachment Ratepayem 3-5c 

UTILITY: 

Date Referenced 1-Jan-97 DEPRECIATION 
ANALYSIS 

Ver./Est. Actual 
Acquired Original Economic Deprec. Annual Accum. Net 

Description Date COS t Li fe, yrs Life Deprec. Deprec. Plant 

Land 1-Jun-79 0 n/a n/a n/a n/a 0.00 
Structures 

Masonry 1-Jun-79 0 30 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Wood 1-Jan-01 0 15 -4.0 0.00 0-00 

Well 1-Jun-79 0 30 17.6 0.00 0-00 
Pumps 

Booster >=7HP 1-Jan-01 0 10 -4.0 0.00 0.00 
Booster <7HP 1-Jun-79 0 5 17.6 -- 0.00 

Motor 1-May-94 0 3 2.7 0.00 0.00 
Well,<5 1-Jan-01 0 5 -4.0 0.00 0.00 
Well,>5 1-Jun-96 0 10 0.6 0.00 0.00 

Hypochlonnator 1-Aug-94 0 5 2.4 0.00 0.00 
Gas Chlorinator 1-Jan-01 0 10 -4.0 0.00 0.00 
Tanks: 

Pressure 1-Jun-79 0 50 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Ground 1-Jun-79 0 50 17.6 0.00 0.00 

Dish-ib. System 1-Jun-79 0 50 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Dislrib. System 1-Jun-93 0 50 3.6 0.00 0.00 
Services 1-Jun-79 0 20 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Services 1-Jun-93 0 20 3.6 0.00 0.00 
Meters 1-Jun-79 0 20 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Meters 1-Jun-93 0 20 3.6 0.00 0.00 
Compressor 1-Jan-01 0 10 -4.0 0.00 0.00 
Electrical Controls 1-May-94 0 30 2.7 0.00 0.00 
Furniture/Fixtures 1-Jan-81 0 10 16.0 -- 0.00 
Heavy Equipment 15-Feb-89 0 10 7.9 0.00 0.00 
Light Vehicles 15-Sep-87 0 5 9.3 -- 0.00 
Shop Tools 1-Jan-81 0 15 16.0 -- 0.00 
Computer/Software 1-Feb-95 0 5 1.9 0.00 0.00 
Fencing 1-Jun-79 0 30 17.6 0.00 0.00 

Total $0 $0 $0 $0 
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AttachmentRatepayws 3-50 
1999 WATERREVENUE R EaJIREMENT & RATE DESIGN 

UTILITY- Mau,ioe.,Ile SUD 

REVENUE REQUIREMENT 
COST OF SERVICE ITEM Item Col % Fxed % Vsnsble 

SALARIES 232,878 50 116,439 50 116.439 
CONTRACT LABOR 3,872 50 1.836 50 1,836 
UNIFORMS 4.198 100 4,196 0 0 
CHEMICALSAND TREATMENT 15,735 0 0 100 15.735 
UTIUTIES €,205 0 0 100 47.205 
REBAIRSAND MAINTENANCE 20.980 0 0 100 20,980 
OFFICE RENT 14,000 100 14,000 0 0 
ACCOUNTING & LEGAL 15.000 100 15.000 0 0 
HEALTH INSURAN CE 31,470 100 31,470 0 0 
OFFICE SUPPLIES 15,735 100 15735 0 0 
MISCELLANEOUS 5,245 50 2.023 50 2,623 
PAYROLLTAXES 17,932 50 8,966 50 8.966 
BANK CHARGES 500 100 500 0 0 
TRUCK&EQUIP EXPENSE 15735 50 7.868 50 7.868 
SMALL TOOLS & SUPPLIES 15.735 50 7.888 50 7.888 
FUEL 10.490 50 5.245 50 5 245 
CCMPUTER CHARGES 2,000 100 2.000 0 0 
TRANSPORTATION 12.588 50 6.294 50 6,294 
EQUIPMENT RENTAL 5.000 50 2.500 50 2,500 
CCMMUNICATIONS 6000 100 6,000 0 0 
PRINTING 7500 100 7,500 0 0 
INSURANCE - WC & LIABILFY Z ? 274 100 27 . 274 0 0 
LICENSE & DUES 2000 100 2,000 0 0 
POSTAGE & FREIGHT 7867 5 100 7,868 0 0 
ADVERASING 3147 100 3,147 0 0 
DIRECTORS EXPENSE 2098 100 2.098 0 0 
SAMPLING 5245 0 0 100 5.245 
TRAVEL & ENTERTAINMBIT 1049 100 1.049 0 0 
CONFERENCES &WORKEHOPS 2000 100 2.000 0 0 
INCREASE IN VARIABLE 1095 03 0 0 100 1.996 

SUBTOTAL (LESS FIT & RETURN) 552,271 301,474 250,798 
h CF TOTAL (FD<ED ·r VARIABLE) 058 042 
PRINC &INTEREST -WATER 532283 3104@842 221784 58 
MAINT & REPLAC REEERVE 55,227 
LESS OTHER REVENUES -75.000 -4375000 -18229 17 
LESS SEWER RATEALLOC -75,368 1 -7536839 

TOTAL $989.413 $492.854 $454,353 
RATE CALCULATION 

GALLONAGE CHARGE 
Vsnsb!e CoIHestYear Gsuonul.000 ===========> 3 02 /TH GAL 

PROPOSED RATE 
USE-, $425 /TH GAL 

I 07503121 
W W 

MINIMUM BILL ] I 
Ftxed Cos:i'12'Cuaorner Equw alerm ============, 16 40 /MO. MELDS-, Sll 68 JMO 

22.45 /MO ind mn. gallons 20 18 JMO Ind ran gallona 
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Attachment Ratepayers 3-5e 
1999 WATER REVENUECONT 

Avg Tea-Yr Cumomer Equwalenm = 2504 
Gallons Included In Minimum Bill = 2,000 
Teat Yesr Gallonm Punlped * 1,000)= NE 
Teat Year Gallon3 Billed (x 1,000) = 150.239 

REVENUES GENERAT ED 

Mininum Bil 
Connecin Sim # of Connecoona Mill Bill Indud,ng G,Re'/Mo/h Rm k Yesr INSERT DATA 
5~8-. 3;4 2432 $1188 1$2018 349,073 $588.871 NO CF 5~8 CUE = 2432 5/8'.3/4 EQUW. 242 
1' 0 3 1950 t 2800 10 W NO CF 1' CUST = 01 EQUM 0 
1-1~2 0 $ 3889 $ ~9 $0 $0 NO CF 1112·CUST= 0 1-112 EEQUN 0 
2· 1 $ 6224 S 7074 $71 $849 NO OF 2· CUE = 12 EQUM 533 
2-In' 0 $ 9342 $ 10192 $0 $0 NOCF 2-1;2·CUST= 0 2-1~2 EQUM 0 
3' 0 $ 11678 $ 12528 $0 $0 NOOF 3·CUE= 03 EQUM 0 
4' 0 $ 19467 $ 203 17 $0 $0 NO OF 4· CUST = 0 4· EQUM 0 
W 2 $ 38922 $ 39772 $795 $9.545 NO CF 6' CUST = 2 6 EQUW 66 66 

2435 2503 99 

GULONAGE CHARGES=> 
TOTAL MINIMUM CHAR GES=, 

91,799 @ $425 /1.000 (At 
$599.266 

390,147 24048 

$989.413 24354 
NOTES NO DEPREOATION, MAINrENANCE RESERVE INSTEAD 
BASED ON EEGINNING CONNECrIONS =2378AND ENDING CONNECTIONS = 2495. WHICH IS 5% GROWTH RATE 

NET REVENUEGREiTERTHAN OR =1 1 DEBTSERVICEI 
NET REVENUE = $587.51012 
1 1 DEBT SERVICE = $585,51130 
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Attaohment Ratcpaym 3-5d 
WATER REVENUE REQUIREMENT & RATE DESIGN 

UTI LITY: 

REVENUE REQU]REMENT 
BUDGET/COST OF SERVICE ITEM Item Cost % Fixed % Variable 

SALARIES 
CONTRACT LABOR 
CHEMICALS AND TREATMENT 
UTILITIES 
REPAIRSANDMAINTENANCE 
OFFICE EXPENSES BILLING 
ACCOU NTI NG & LEGAL 
HEALTH INSURANCE 
OFFICE SUPPUES 
TANK REPAIRS 
BAD DEBT 
PAYROLL TAXES 
TELEPHONE 
TRU CK & EQUI P. EXPEN SE 
TRAVEL & ENTERTAINMENT 
EQUIPMENT RENTAL 
INSURANCE -WC &LIABILITY 
LICENSE&DUES 
POSTAGE & FREIGHT 
ADVERTISING 
SAMPLING 
EDUCATION 
DEPRECIATION 
MATERIALS & SUPPLIES 
SECURITY 
MISCELLANEOUS 
LONGTERM DEBT 
PURCHASED WATER 
SLUG REMOVAL 
BOOKKEEPING 

0 78 0 22 0 
117.865 75 88.399 25 29.466 

12,035 60 7.221 40 4,814 
20,922 70 14,645 30 6,277 
71.060 50 35.530 50 35.530 
15,679 45 7.056 55 8623 
72,000 50 36,000 50 36.000 

0 50 0 50 0 
4.707 45 2,118 55 2.589 

0 50 0 50 0 
0 50 0 50 0 
0 50 0 50 0 

6.549 40 2.620 60 3.929 
0 50 0 50 0 

1,130 50 565 50 565 
250 50 1 25 50 125 

14,160 70 9,912 30 4,248 
1 78 50 89 50 89 

2,710 50 1355 50 1.355 
0 30 0 70 0 

8,459 50 4.230 50 4.230 
0 50 0 50 0 

56.273 60 33.764 40 22.509 
6.730 50 3365 50 3.3 66 

0 50 0 50 0 
1,250 50 625 50 625 

49,882 100 49,882 0 0 
8,490 45 3.821 55 4.670 
2363 50 1,182 50 1.182 
4.163 50 2,082 50 2.082 

0 50 0 50 0 
0 50 0 50 0 

SUB-TOTAL(LESS FIT & RETURN) 476.855 304.583 100 172.272 
Do OF TOTAL (FIXED + VARIABLE) 63 37 
PRINC. & INTEREST WATER 0 0.00 0.00 
MAMNTENANICE RESERVE' 0 0.00 0.00 
LESS OTHER REVENUE $0 0.00 0.00 

TOTAL $476.855 $304,583 $172.272 
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Attachment Rakpayers 3-5d 

RATE CALCULATION 

GALLONAGE CHARGE 
Vartable CosUTest Year Gallons/l.000 ===========> 1325 /TH GAL USE-> 

PROPOSED RATE 
$3.55 /TH-GAL. 

\1/ \1/ 
MINIMUM BILL 1 1 
FNed Cost/1 3Cistomer Equvalents ============> 10032 /MO YIELDS -> $141.87 /MO. 

10032 /MO ind min gallons 141.87 /MO. 
Avg Test-Yr Customer Equwalents = 253 inc. min. gail, 
Gallons Included In Minimum Bill= 0 
Test Year Gallons Billed (x 1,000) = 13.000 

REVENUES GENERATED 

Minimum Bill 
Connection Size # of Connections Min Bill Including Gals R ev /Month Rev/Year 
5/8".3/4 253 $1 41 87 $14187 $35,892 $430.705 
3/4" 0 $212 80 $ 21 2 80 $0 $0 
1" 0 $ 354 66 $ 35466 $0 $0 
1-1/2" 0 $ 709 33 $ 70933 $0 $0 
2" 0 $ 1.134 93 $ 1,134 93 $0 $0 
2-1/2" 0 $ 1,134 93 $ 1,134 93 $0 $0 
3" 0 $ 1.418 66 $ 1,418 66 $0 $0 
4" 0 $ 3.546 65 $ 3.546 65 $0 $0 
6" 0 $ 7,093 30 $ 7,093 30 $0 $0 

TOTAL MINIMUM CHARGES=> $430,705 
GALLONAGE CHARGES=> 13.000 @ $3 55 /1.000 GAL 46,150 

TOTAL REVENUE GENERATED=> $476.855 

Printed on time 

NOTES 
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Attachment Ratepayers 3-5d 

UTILITY: 

Date Referenced: 1-Jan-97 DEPRECIATION 
ANALYSIS 

Ver./Est. Actual 
Acquired Original Economic Deprec. Annual Accum. Net 

Descdption Date COS t Li fe, yrs Life Deprec. Deprec. Plant 

Land 1-Jun-79 0 n/a n/a n/a n/a 0.00 
Structures: 

Masonry 1-Jun-79 0 30 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Wood 1-Jan-01 0 15 -4.0 0-00 0.00 

Well 1-Jun-79 0 30 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Pumps 

Booster >=7H P 1-Jan-01 0 10 -4.0 0.00 0.00 
Booster <7HP 1-Jun-79 0 5 17.6 -- 0.00 

Motor 1-May-94 0 3 2.7 0.00 0.00 
Well,<5 1-Jan-01 0 5 -4.0 0.00 0 00 
Well,>5 1-Jun-96 0 10 0.6 0.00 0.00 

Hypochlorinator 1-Aug-94 0 5 2.4 0.00 0 00 
Gas Chlorinator 1-Jan-01 0 10 -4-0 0.00 0.00 
Tanks 

Pressure 1-Jun-79 0 50 17-6 0.00 0.00 
Ground 1-Jun-79 0 50 17-6 0.00 0.00 

Distrib. System 1-Jun-79 0 50 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Distrib. System 1-Jun-93 0 50 3.6 0.00 0.00 
Services 1-Jun-79 0 20 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Services 1-Jun-93 0 20 3.6 0.00 0.00 
Meters 1-Jun-79 0 20 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Meters 1-Jun-93 0 20 3.6 0.00 0.00 
Compressor 1-Jan-01 0 10 -4.0 0.00 0.00 
Electrical Controls 1-May-94 0 30 2.7 0.00 0.00 
Furniture/Fixtures 1-Jan-81 0 10 16.0 -- 0.00 
Heavy Equipment 15-Feb-89 0 10 7-9 0.00 0.00 
Light Vehicles 15-Sep-87 0 5 9.3 -- 0.00 
Shop Tools 1-Jan-81 0 15 16.0 -- 0.00 
Computer/Software 1-Feb-95 0 5 1.9 0.00 0.00 
Fencing 1-Jun-79 0 30 17.6 0.00 0.00 

Total. $0 $0 $0 $0 
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Attachment Rakpayers 3-5d 
1999 WATER REVENUEREQUIREMENT & RATEDESIGN 

UTILrrY Msunmille SUD 

REVENUE REQUIREMENT 
COST OF SERVICE TTEM Item Col % Fied % Vansble 

SALARIES 232,878 50 116,439 50 116.439 
CONTRACT LABCR 3.672 50 1,836 50 1.836 
UNIFORMS 4190 100 4.196 0 0 
CHEMICALSAND TREATMENT 15735 0 0 100 15,735 
UTILITIES 47205 0 0 100 47,205 
REMIRSAND MAINTENANCEE 20.980 0 0 100 20,980 
OFFICE RENT 14,000 100 14,000 0 0 
ACCOUNTING & LEGAL 15.000 100 15,000 0 0 
H EALTH INSURANCE 31.470 100 31.€0 0 0 
OFFICE SUPPLIES 15735 100 15,735 0 0 
MISCELLANEOUS 5.245 50 2.823 50 2,623 
PAYROLLTAXES 17.932 50 8,968 50 8,966 
BANK CHARGES 500 100 500 0 0 
TRUCK & EQUIP EXPENSE 15.735 50 7,868 50 7.868 
SMALL TOOLS & SUPPLIES 15,735 50 7.888 50 7,868 
FUEL 10.4@0 50 5,245 50 5,245 
COMPUTER CHARGES 2.000 100 2.000 0 0 
TRANSPORTATION 12.588 50 6,294 50 6,294 
EQUIPMENT RENTAL 5,000 50 2.500 50 2,500 
COMMUNICATIONS 8000 100 6,000 0 0 
PRINTING 7500 100 7500 0 0 
INSURANCE-WC & LIABILFY 27274 100 27,274 0 0 
LICENSE & DUES 2000 100 2000 0 0 
POSTAGE & FREIGHT 7867 5 100 7,868 0 0 
ADVERTISING 3147 100 3,147 0 0 
DIRECTORS EXPEN SE 2098 100 2098 0 0 
SAMPLING 5245 0 0 100 5,245 
TRAVEL & ENTERTAINMBUT 1049 100 1.049 0 0 
CONFERENCES &WORKSHOPS 2000 100 2.000 0 0 
INCREASE IN VARIABLE 1995 03 0 0 100 1,996 

SUBTCTAL (LESSFK & RETURN) 552.271 301,/4 250,798 
% OF TOTAL (FKED ·r VARIABLE) 058 042 
PR INC & INTEREST -WATER 532283 31049842 221784 58 
MAINT & REPLAC RESERVE 55,227 
LESS OTHER REVENUES -75.000 -4375000 -18229 17 
LESS SEWER RATEALLOC -75368 1 7536839 

TOTAL $989.413 $492.854 $454,353 
RATE CALCULATION 

GALLONAGE CHARGE 
Vaneble CofemYesr Gsllonul.000 ==========> 3 02 /TH GAL 

PROPOSED RATE 
USE-> $425 /TH GAL 

07503121 
4' W 

MINIMUM BILL I 1 
Fixed CodlbCu,omer Equw alerts ============, 16 40 810 YIELDS-p- $1168 XMO 

2245 JMO ind mn gallons 20 18 /MO ind mn gallons 
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Attachment RakpayerB 3-5d 
1999 WATER REVENUECONT 

Avg Test-Yr Cumomer Equr,alentm = 2504 
Gsllcna Induded In M[n,mumB,1]= 2.000 
Test Year Gallons Purfped (x 1.000) = NE 
Tent Year Gallons Billed (x 1.000) = 150.239 

REVENUES GENERAT W 

Minin-um Bil 
Conned»n Sim # of Connecmona Min Bill Indud,ng Gi Re, jMomh Re,JYear INSERT [1#TA 
98'.3/4 242 $1168 $2018 $40.073 $588.971 NO CF 5/8' CUSr = 2432 W8',3/4 EQUIV 2432 
1 0 $ 1950 $ 28 00 10 $0 NO CF 1' CUST = 01 EQUIV 0 
1-1~2 0 $ 3889 $ 439 10 W NO CF 1-ln·CUST= 0 1-112 EQUIV 0 
2· 1 $ 8224 $ 7074 $71 $840 NO CF 2· CUST = 12 EQUA/ 533 
2-ln· 0 $ 93 42 $ 10192 $0 $0 NO CF 21/2· CUST= 0 2-1,2· EQUW 0 
3· 0 $ 11678 $ 12528 SO $0 NOCF3·CUST= 0 3 EQUIV 0 
4· 0 $ 19467 $ 203 17 $0 $0 NO CF 4· CUST = 0 4· EQUIV 0 
6' 2 $ 389 22 $ 3U772 $795 39,545 NO CF 6' CUST = 2 6· EQUM 66 66 

2435 2503 99 

GU.LONAGE CHARGES=> 
TOTAL MINIMUM CHARGES=, 

91.799 ® $4 25 ; 1.000 GU 
$599,266 

390,147 24048 

$989,413 2454 
NCrES NO DEPREaATION. MAII~ENANCE RESERVE INSTEAD 
BASED ON BEGINNING CONNECrIONS =2378 AND ENDINGCONNECTICNS = 24@5, WHICH IS 596 GROWTH RATE 

NET RE/ENUE GRE*TERTHAN OR =1 1 DEBT SERVICEO 
NET R EV84UE = $587,510 12 
1 1 DEBT SERVICE = $585,511 30 
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Attachment Ratcpiy= 3-5© 
WATER REVENUE REQUIREMENT & RATE DESIGN 

UTI LITY 

REVENUE REQUIREMENT 
BUDGET/COSTOF SERVICE ITEM Item Cost % Fixed % Variable 

SALARIES 0 78 0 22 0 
CONTRACT LABOR 117,865 75 88.399 25 29,466 
CHEMICALSANO TREATMENT 12,035 60 7,221 40 4,814 
UTILITI ES 20,922 70 14,645 30 6.277 
REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE 71,060 50 35,530 50 35,530 
OFFICE EXPENSES BILLING 15,679 45 7,056 55 8,623 
ACCOUNTING &LEGAL 250,000 50 125.000 50 125.000 
HEALTH INSURANCE 0 50 0 50 0 
OFFICESUPPLIES 4,707 45 2.118 55 2.589 
TANKREPAIRS 0 50 0 50 0 
BAD DEBT 0 50 0 50 0 
PAYROLL TAXES 0 50 0 50 0 
TELEPHONE 6,549 40 2 620 60 3,929 
TRUCK&EQUIP. EXPENSE 0 50 0 50 0 
TRAVEL& ENTERTAINMENT 1,130 50 565 50 565 
EQUIPMENT RENTAL 250 50 125 50 125 
INSURANCE -WC &LIABIUTY 14,160 70 9,912 30 4,248 
UCENSE & DUES 178 50 89 50 89 
POSTAGE &FREIGHT 2,710 50 13 55 50 13 55 
ADVERTISING 0 30 0 70 0 
SAMPLING 8,459 50 4,230 50 4,230 
EDUCATION 0 50 0 50 0 
DEPRECIATION 56,273 60 33.764 40 22,509 
MATERIALS & SUPPLIES 6.730 50 3.365 50 3,365 
SECURITY 0 60 0 50 0 
MISCELLANEOUS 1,250 50 625 50 625 
LONGTERM DEBT 49,882 100 49.882 0 0 
PURCHASED WATER 8,490 45 3.821 55 4.670 
SLUG REMOVAL 2.363 50 1,182 50 1,182 
BOOKKEEPING 4.163 50 2,082 50 2.082 

0 50 0 50 0 
0 50 0 50 0 

SU8-TOTAL(LESS FIT & RETURN) 654.855 393.583 100 261.272 
5% OF TOTAL (FIXED +VARIABLE) 63 37 
PRINC. &INTEREST - WATER 0 000 0.00 
MAINTENANCE RESERVE- 0 0 00 0.00 
LESS OTHER REVENUE $0 0.00 0.00 

TOTAL $654.855 $393.583 $261.272 
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RATE CALCULATION 

GALLONAGE CHARGE 
Variable Cost/Test Year Gallons/1,000 ===========> 2010 /TH GAL USE -> 

PROPOSED RATE 
$3.55 /TH.GAL. 

\1/ \1/ 
MINIMUM BILL 1 1 
Fixed Cost/13Ctstomer Equivalents ============> 129 64 /MO YIELDS -> $200.50 /MO. 

129 64 /MO incl min gallons 200.50 /MO. 
Avg Test-Yr Customer Equivalents = 253 inc. min. gail, 
Gallons Included In Minimum Bill= 0 
Test Year Gallons Billed (x 1,000) = 13.000 

REVENUES GENERATED 

Minimum B 
Connection Size # of Connections Min Bill Including Gals Rev /Month Rev /Year 
5/8", 3/4 253 $200 50 $200 50 $50,725 $608,705 
3/4" 0 $300 74 $ 300 74 $0 $0 
1" 0 $ 50124 $ 50124 $0 $0 
1-1/2" 0 $ 1.002 48 $ 1.002 48 $0 $0 
2" 0 $ 1.603 97 $ 1,603 97 $0 $0 
2-1/2" 0 $ 1,603 97 $ 1.603 97 $0 $0 
3" 0 $ 2,004 96 $ 2,004 96 $0 $0 
4" 0 $ 5.012 39 $ 5,012.39 $0 $0 
6" 0 $ 10,024 79 $ 10,024 79 $0 $0 

TOTAL MINIMUM CHARGES=> $608.706 
GALLONAGE CHARGES=> 13,000 @ $3 55 /1,000 GAL 46150 

TOTAL REVENUE GENERATED=> $664,856 

Printed on: tim e 

NOTES 
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UTILITY: 

Date Referenced- 1-Jan-97 DEPRECIATION 
ANALYSIS 

Ver./Est. Actual 
Acquired Original Economic Deprec. Annual Accum. Net 

Description Date COS t Life, yrs Life Deprec. Deprec. Plant 

Land 1-Jun-79 0 n/a n/a n/a n/a 0.00 
Structures: 

Masonry 1-Jun-79 0 30 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Wood 1-Jan-01 0 15 -4.0 0.00 0.00 

Well 1-Jun-79 0 30 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Pumps: 

Booster>=7HP 1-Jan-01 0 10 -4.0 0.00 0.00 
Booster <7HP 1-Jun-79 0 5 17.6 -- 0.00 

Motor 1-May-94 0 3 2.7 0.00 0 00 
Well,<5 1-Jan-01 0 5 -4.0 0.00 0.00 
Well,>5 1-Jun-96 0 10 0.6 0.00 0.00 

Hypochlorinator 1-Aug-94 0 5 2.4 0.00 0 00 
Gas Chlorinator 1-Jan-01 0 10 -4.0 0.00 0-00 
Tanks: 

Pressure 1-Jun-79 0 50 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Ground 1-Jun-79 0 50 17.6 0.00 0.00 

Distrib. System 1-Jun-79 0 50 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Distrib. System 1-Jun-93 0 50 3.6 0.00 0.00 
Services 1-Jun-79 0 20 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Services 1-Jun-93 0 20 3.6 0.00 0.00 
Meters 1-Jun-79 0 20 17.6 0.00 0.00 
Meters 1-Jun-93 0 20 3.6 0.00 0.00 
Compressor 1-Jan-01 0 10 -4.0 0.00 0.00 
Electrical Controls 1-May-94 0 30 2.7 0.00 0 00 
Furniture/Fixlures 1-Jan-81 0 10 16.0 - 0.00 
Heavy Equipment 15-Feb-89 0 10 7.9 0.00 0.00 
Light Vehicles 15-Sep-87 0 5 9.3 -- 0.00 
Shop Tools 1-Jan-81 0 15 16.0 -- 0.00 
Computer/Software 1-Feb-95 0 5 1.9 0.00 0.00 
Fendng 1-Jun-79 0 30 17.6 0.00 0.00 

Total $0 $0 $0 $0 
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1999 WATERREVENUE REQUIREMENT & RATE DESIGN 

UTILTTY M8UnCE<Ille SUD 

REVENUE REQUIREMENT 
COST OF SERVICE rrEM Item Co= % F*ed % Vansble 

SALARIES 232,878 50 116.439 50 118,439 
CCNTRACT lABCR 3,672 50 1,836 50 1.830 
UNIFORMS 4,196 100 4196 0 0 
CHEMICALS AND TREATMENT 15735 0 0 100 15.735 
UTILfri ES 4,205 0 0 100 £P.205 
REF*IRSAND MAINTENANCE 20.980 0 0 100 20.980 
OFFICE RENT 14,000 100 14.000 0 0 
ACCOUNTING & LEGAL 15,000 100 15,000 0 0 
HEALT H INSURAN CE 31.470 100 31.470 0 0 
OFFICE SUPPLIES 15,735 100 15735 0 0 
MISCELLANEOUS 5,245 50 2623 50 2,823 
PAYROLLTAXES 17.932 50 8,986 50 8.966 
BANK CHARGES 500 100 500 0 0 
TRUCK& EQUIP EXPENSE 15,735 50 7,868 50 7.868 
SMALL TOOLS & SUPPLIES 15,735 50 7,868 50 7,868 
FUEL 10.490 50 5245 50 5.245 
CCMPUTER CHARGES 2.000 100 2,000 0 0 
TRANSPORTATION 12.588 50 6.294 50 8.294 
EQUIPMENT RENTAL 5.000 50 2,500 50 2.500 
CCMMUNICATIONS 6000 100 6000 0 0 
PRINTING 7500 100 7,500 0 0 
IN SURANCE - WC & LMBIL [ Y WZ ? 4 100 27 , 274 0 0 
LICENSE & DUES 2000 100 2,000 0 0 
POSTAGE & FREIGHT 7867 5 100 7.868 0 0 
ADVERTISING 31•V 100 3.147 0 0 
DIRECTORS EXPEN SE 2098 100 2,098 0 0 
SAMPLING 5245 0 0 100 5,245 
TRAVEL & ENTERTAINMENT 1049 100 1.049 0 0 
CONFERENCES &WORKSHOPS 2000 100 2000 0 0 
INCREASE IN VARIABLE 199583 0 0 100 1.996 

SU BTCTAL (LESSF[r & RETURN) 552,271 301,474 250,798 
% CF TOTAL (FKED + VARIABLE) 058 042 
PRINC & INTEREST -WATER 532283 31049842 221784 58 
MAINT & REPLAC REEERVE 55,227 
LESS OTHER REVENUES -75.000 -4375000 -18229 17 
LESS SEWER RATEALLOC -7 5368 1 -7536839 

TOTAL- $989.413 $4@2.854 $454.353 
RATE CALCULATION 

GALLONAGE CHARGE 
Vfnable CofremYear Gillondl.000 ===========> 3 02 mi GAL. 

PROPOSED RATE 
USE-7 $425 ZTH GAL 

I I 07503121 
MINIMUM BILL l' i 
Fu:ed Cofl /Cuaorner Equwalent ============, 16 40 U,to Yla.Ds-> $11 68 #MO 

2245 2MO ind mn gallons 2018 #MO ind mn gsllona 
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1999 WATER REVENUECONT 

Av g Tei-Y¥ Customar Equwslenta = 2504 
Gallona Included In M,n,mum8,11 = 2,000 
Teat Year Gallons Pumped (x 1,000) = NE 
Teat Year Gallons Billed e, 1.000) = 150239 

REVENUES Gel ERAT ED 

M,nimm Bil 
Connedlon S,ze # of Connec~ona M,r Bill Induding Gs Rei/Mordh Rei/Year INSERT DATA 
5~8,314 2<2 $1188 $2018 $40.073 $588.871 NO CF 5~8· CUST = 2402 98'.314 EOUM 2432 
1 0 $ 1950 $ 28 00 $0 $0 NOCF 1·CUE= 01 EQUM 0 
1-1;2· 0 $ 3889 3 4739 30 30 NO CF 1-1;2-CUST 01-42 EQUM 0 
2' 1 S 6224 S 7074 571 $849 NO CF 2' CUST = 12· EQUW 533 
#2- 0 $ 93 42 S 10192 SO $0 NO CF 2-1;2'CUST= 0 2-lin· EQUW 0 
3· 0 $ 11678 S 12528 $0 $0 NOCF 3·CUST= 03 EQUW 0 
4- 0 $ 19467 3 203 17 $0 $0 NO CF 4' CUST= 0 4· EQUW 0 
6- 2 $ 38922 S 397.72 $795 $9.545 NO CF 8' OUST = 2 8· EQUIV 66 66 

2435 2503 99 

GULONAGE CHARGES=> 
TOTAL MINIMUM CHARGES=o $599.268 

91,799 @ $4 25 M.000 GU 390,147 24948 

$989,413 24B54 
NCr ES NO DEPRECIATION. MAINTENANCE RESERVE INSTEAD 
BASED ON BEGINNING CONNECTIONS =2376 AND ENDING CONNECrICNS = 2495. WHICH IS 5% GROWTH RAT E 

NET REVENUEGREATERTHAN OR =11 DEBT SERVICEo 
NEr REVBVUE = $587.51012 
1 1 DEBT SERVICE = $585.51130 
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y - r. .Cf, 4/. .. 

Windermere Oaks Water.Supply Corporation 
,Committed to Providing Clean, S*Water for WI C)u 

.-¥f= 

.»e-r~ 

November 6,2020 

Dear WOWSC Member, 

An interesting summer passed by and wethought an update on the watercompany in order. 

First, our neighborhood is growing and the water company is preparing for it Between homes 
and hargars, we've added 46 new taps inthe last few years. These require usto produce an 
approximate average of 400,000 more gallons of water per month. To facilitate this growth, we received 
an LCRA grant for$14,000, to add to our$34,000 investment, to fund recycling projects at our water 
and wastewater plants. Once complete, this will save us about 200,000 gallons of treated water per 
month, sothatwecan provide service to our new neighbors and members without adding a lot of new 
storage capacity. 

But we are also inthe process of purchasing a new clarifier. Ours is about 30-years-old and is 
showing its age - and inadequacy to meet our growth. Its' nine-foot height lacks the capacity of the 30-
foot clarifier Ridge Harborbuilt a few years ago. And they do not even have 250 tapsyet. Overthe last 
few months, we have brought in tankertrucks to address system shortages due to heavy use, broken 
pipes, and the inability of our clarifierto keep up w ith demand. A new clarifier w ill cost $300-500,000, so 
we are proceedirE carefully, But we have $300,000 in financing already approved from a lender atthese 
record-low interest rates. We should be in shape for installing this by next summer. 

Second, we continueto focus on our company's financial health, which we believeto be in 
good condition. We have enclosed a report which describes metrics we are using.The report also shows 
the impacts of the legal fees needed to respond to lawsuits against us, including what-if scenarios as 
thoughthe legal fees had not been incurred. The report also describes the impact of sellirg our 
company to a for-profit corporation - namely higher fees to all of us due to corporate overhead, taxes, 
and profit allowances of new state laws. The waterboard does not wantto see that occu r. We will be 
adoptirig Policiesthat explain in even more detail to members and futu re Boards how the corporation 
manages its finances. 

Third, we continue to suffer the financial impact of lawsuits filed against the corporation. One 
lawsuit alleges a lengthy list of inappropriate actions by the 2015-16 Board related to sale of land inthe 
airport. T his suit isterrib ly expensive because of its expansive scope of allegations. Moreover, since the 
plaintiffs have been unwilling to settle since our October 26, 2019 open meetirg to amend and 
supersede the 2016 contract, we will not be able to collect $20,000 that the title company offered to 
resolve the matter. Another suit is the rate case filed at the Public Utility Commission, signed by the 
three plaintiffs-John Richard Dial, Stuart Bruce Sorgen, and Rene Ffrench- in the land sale case and 
filed by their allies. An ally to the plaintiffs also intervened in a lawsuit that was on the verge of being 
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completed, in a case whichthe WOWSC has reached an agreementto settle in our favorwith the 
Attorney General; that plaintiffs intervention is prolorgirg the use and expense of legal services inthat 
matter. All legal fees spent defending the corporation are passed on to our279 ratepayers, and we 
discuss reasons for this in an enclosed document. Large fees spread amorig oursmall ratepayer base 
creates higher monthly water rates. Even the legal fees defending the 2020 rate case to the Public Utility 
Commission will at some point be directly paid by members, possibly inthe form of higher rates. The 
WSC would very much like to see all of these matters put behind us, sothatthe WSC, its board, and its 
financial resources can be fully dedicated to the most important task at hand - runnirg a strong and 
responsive WaterSupply Corporation. (An enclosed (1&A documents addressesthese legal challenges in 
more depth.) 

Fourth, as previously mentioned, the Board was approved for $680,000 in loans, of which we 
have received $350,000 at 3.75% interest rate for 20 years. This new loan paid off a higher-interest loan 
forthe wastewatertreatment plant and funds various long-term projects. The longer-term, lower-
interest loan cut our monthly debt payment in half, freeing up funds foroperational needs, including 
legal services. 

Finally, we are proceeding cautiously in the Covid-19 era. We continue to ensure that our 
treatment processes keep up with national guidelines. And we continue to have open meetings on 
Zoom, sothat our corporation does not sufferany liability claims from someone becomirg grievously ill 
at an in-person meeting. We are complying with Governor Gregg Abbott's orders allowir~ 
teleconference calls for organizations like ours. Our insurance would neither coverthe legal fees or 
settlement from any Covid-19 related claims againstthe company, so we are not taking cha nces. 

We hope this Ietterand the enclosed report provides a meanirgful look intothe water 
company's current condition. Please contact any of your Board members with questions. 

Sincerely, 

. 0 ·rf\ -CU f./( t, it ''~ ' ~ ~' 

Joe Gimenez Patricia Gerino Mike Nelson Dorothy Taylor Rich Schaefer 
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NewGen 
8140 N Plopac Expy 
Bldg I, fte 240 
Austin, TX 787§9 
Phone (512) 479-7900 Strategies & Solutions Fax- (§I)) 419.1905 

September 3,2020 
via email 

Mr. Joe Gimenez 
Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
424 Coventry Road 
Spicewood, TX 78669 

Subjed: Financial Assessment 

Dear Mr. Gimenez: 

NewGen Strategies and Solutions, LLC (NewGen) performed a high-level financial assessment of 
Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation (WOWSC) to document the impact of the lawsuits on 
WOWSC's financial position and provide possible financial policies that may benefitthe utility. 

Recent History 
NewGen reviewed the financial results for 2017, 2018, and 2019 to assess WOWSC's recent financial 
history. The following tables provide a summary of WOWSC's financial condition as measured by various 
common benchmarks overthe past three years. It is important to recognize that WOWSC's involvement 
in two lawsuits brought against WOWSC by TOMA Integrity, Inc. and by Rene Ffrench, John Richard Dial, 
and Stuart Bruce Sorgen have placed significant strain on the financial condition of the utility. Further, 
WOWSC is currently defending its March 2020 rate change, necessitated by legal expenses, at the Public 
Utility Commission of Texas (PUCT). WOWSC's future financial condition depends on the duration and 
outcome of its various legal challenges. 

Table 1 
Leverage Ratios 

2017 2018 2019 
Debt to Cap ita li zation 

Debt $ 388,064 $ 357,549 $ 331,989 
Equity 1,177,136 1,179,199 1,128,317 
Total $ 1,565,199 $ 1,536,748 $ 1,460,306 

Ratio 25% 23% 23% 
Debt to Net PIant Assets 

Debt $ 388,064 $ 357,549 $ 331,989 
Net Asset Value of Plant 1,396,139 1,363,874 1,285,272 

Ratio 28% 26% 26% 

The debt to capitalization ratio and debt to net plant assets ratio provide an indication of the leverage of 
the utility. There is not a target leverage ratio that is ideal for all utilities but, generally, the lower the 

Economics 1 Strategy 1 Stakeholders 1 Sustainability 
www.newgenstrategies.net 
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leverage ratio, the more financial flexibility the utility has and the easier it is for the utility to finance its 
capital needs. As a point of reference, in a recent Fitch Ratings report (Fitch Medians)1, the median value 
of debt to net plant assets for small systems (defined as utilities serving fewerthan 100,000 persons) was 
36%. Thus, WOWSC is less leveraged than the Fitch median small system by this metric. It is important 
to note that WOWSC is significantly smallerthanthe average system defined as a small system by Fitch. 

Table 2 
Debt Service Coverage 

2017 2018 2019 
Available for Debt Service $ 85,606 $ 91,885 $ 55,681 
Debt Service 50,118 50,104 50,089 

Ratio 1.71 1.83 1.11 

Debt service coverage is a measure of financial flexibility that judges a utility's financial margin to pay debt 
service from net revenues after priority expenses, such as operation and maintenance (0&M) expenses, 
are paid. It is common for utility debt covenants to have a requirement for debt service coverage, such 
as 1.25. WOWSC's debt service coverage decreased precipitously in 2019 due, in large part, to lawsuit 
expenses. The Fitch Medians report indicates the median debt service coverage for small systems was 
2.6, which is significantly higher than WOWSC's current debt service coverage despite the fact that 
WOWSC has relatively low leverage. A key benefit of sufficient debt service coverage is that it indicates 
revenue in excess of cash 0&M that can be used to cash fund some portion of capital expenses. 

Table 3 
Days Cash on Hand 

2017 2018 2019 
Actual Results 

Liquid Assets $ 144,112 $ 168,542 $ 150,994 
Less Capital Expenditure Reserve (47,158) (41,983) (41,983) 
Net Unrestricted Reserves $ 96,954 $ 126,559 $ 109,012 

Total Cash Operating Expenses $ 291,019 $ 371,260 $ 503,795 

DCOH 122 124 79 
Modified Results i f There Were No Lawsuits 

Lawsuit Related Legal Costs (® $ - $ 25,480 $ 159,173 
Modiled Net Unrestricted Reserves 96,954 152,039 293,665 
Modified Cash Operating Expenses 291,019 345,780 344,622 

DCOH (hypothetical) 122 160 311 
(a) Includes costs directly related b ongoing lawsuits as well as general counsel services for Public 

Information Act requests 

1 Fitch Ratings, 2019 Water and Sewer Medians, Public Finance, November 12, 2018. 
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Days cash on hand (DCOH) serves as an indication of liquidity or ability to meet short-term liabilities, 
particularly under unforeseen hardships. This is generally calculated as current unrestricted cash and 
investments, divided by annual cash operating expenditures, divided by 365 days in a year. The Fitch 
Medians report indicates the median DCOH for small systems was 627. 

As shown in Table 3, WOWSC's actual DCOH has been declining significantly as a result of lawsuit 
expenses. Table 3 also shows a hypothetical DCOH based on what NewGen estimates would have been 
the financial impact if WOWSC had not had the Iawsuitexpenses(with all else equal). WOWSC tookaction 
in February 2020 to increase water and sewer rates to help mitigate the financial impact of the lawsuits. 
WOWSC's financial condition would be significantly improved, and rates could be lowered, if all 
outstanding legal disputes were resolved. 

Current Conditions 
NewGen developed a financial projection for 2020 based on the WOWSC 2020 budget (with a few line 
items adjusted), current rates, new CoBank loans, and assumed lawsuit expenses, as shown in Exhibit A. 
The analysis indicates WOWSC will essentially breakeven on a cash basis if lawsuit expenses are limited to 
approximately $245,000 in 2020. It is worth noting that WOWSC has been billed for approximately 
$169,000 for legal expenses related tothe lawsuit as of May 2020. Thus, further financial deterioration is 
possible if legal expenses do not abate despitethe significant increase in rates approved in February 2020. 

Financial Policies 
It is good governance for utilities to have written financial policies to guide the utility and ensure 
consistent decision-making overtime. NewGen is not aware of any written financial policies for WOWSC. 
Therefore, we suggest the following possible financial policies for consideration by WOWSC. Not all of 
these policies may be needed orappropriate. Further, the inclusion of one policy may impactthe stated 
target of another policy. For example, whether or not WOWSC opts to maintain an emergency reserve 
fund may alter the number of days cash 0&M WOWSC targets for its operating reserve. Utilities that 
employ financial policies, such as the ones suggested below, tend to be rewarded with better interest 
rates from lenders and more favorable terms for financing. Further, financial policies can help guide 
consistent, optimal decision-making. 

To be clear, the targets listed in the financial policies below are merely suggestions. The actual targets 
appropriate for each of the policies below should be selected by the WOWSC Board based on WOWSC's 
priorities, values, and risk tolerance. WOWSC may not need to adopt all of the suggested policies listed 
below but, rather, may pick and choose the policies that are appropriate for WOWSC. 

List of Possible Financial Policies 

• The term of debtgenerally shall not exceed the useful life of the asset financed, and shall notgenerally 
exceed 30 years. 

• Debt service coverage of at least 1.50x shall be targeted (and actual debt service coverage shall be in 
compliance with all relevant debt covenants). 

" Orgoing routine, preventive maintenance should be funded on a pay-as-you-go basis. 

m Capital projects should be financed through a combination of cash, referred to as pay-as-you-go 
financing (equity contributions from current revenues), and debt. An equity contribution ratio of at 
least 15% is desirable. 
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• The utility shall maintain operatirE cash reserves equivalent to a minimum of 90 days of budgeted 
cash operations and maintenance expense. 

• The utility shall maintain an emergency reserve with a minimum of 30 days of budgeted cash 
operations and maintenance expense. 

• The utility shall maintain a repair and replacement reserve with a target balance of 50% of current 
yeardepreciation. 

• Ratesshall be designedtogenerate sufficient revenues tosupportthe full cost of operations and debt; 
providedebtservice coverage and meet otherdebt covenants, if applicable; and ensure adequate and 
appropriate levels of reserves and working capital. 

New Fair Market Value Process 
The 86th Texas Legislature passed House Bi113542, which established a fair market valuation process that 
may be used by Class A or CIass B waterorsewer utilities acquiring another retail public utility (or facilities 
of another retail public utility).2 This new fair market valuation process provides an acquiring utility the 
opportunity to put more than original cost less depreciation into rate base (i.e., a positive acquisition 
premium). Rate base for regulated utilities, such as investor-ow ned utilities (IOUs), isthe invested capita I 
on which they are allowed the opportunity to earn a return. Traditional rate regulation limits the primary 
component of rate base to original cost less depreciation. Thus, the opportunity to put a positive 
acquisition premium into rate base is attractive tothe acquirirg rate regulated utility. The presumed goal 
of House Bill 3542 was to make it more attractive for larger, more efficient and well financed utilities to 
acquire smaller and/or distressed utilities. The target utilities may be less efficient due to the scale of 
theiroperations or may lack access to sufficient funding to invest in facilitiesto improve service or satisfy 
regulatory requirements.3 Thus, although a positive acquisition premium may result in higher rates for 
the customers of the acquired system, there is the potential benefit to customers of more efficient 
operations and/or improved service or regulatory compliance. Consolidatirg systems within a larger 
entity has the potential to achieve greater economies of scale and spread capital cost recovery over more 
customers, benefiting ratepayers. 

While each situation is different, and there can be benefits of IOU ownership, it is important to note that 
IOUs have structu ral cost disadvantages as compared with not-for-profit entities, such as WOWSC. First, 
an IOU's retu rn on investment, as established by the PUCT, includes profitthat a not-for-profit entity does 
not require. Second, the IOU must pay taxes (property taxes, sales taxes, and income taxes) that a not-
for-profit entity does not pay. Thus, in order for the IOU to charge the same or similar rates as the not-
for-profitentity, the IOU must operate more efficiently thanthe not-for-profit entity in orderto overcome 
these structural cost disadvantages and still generate a return for its investors. Further, whereas 
important decisions for WOWSC, such as rate-setting or impacts to community aesthetic, are made by a 
board that is elected by the customers, customers of IOUs must rely on the PUCT to ensure that rates, 
policies, and decisions are just, reasonable and inthe public interest of all ratepayers. Thus, there is some 
loss of control that would accompany a transition from WOWSC's current governance structure to IOU 
ownership. 

2 The new rules were adopted bythe PUCT in Docket No. 49813. 
3 NewGen is in no way implying that WOWSC is ineffi dent or lacks access to sufficient capital funding. These are 
simply example attributes thatare sometimes cited when discussing candidate target utilities underthe fair 
market valuation process. 
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We appreciate the opportunity to assist WOWSC. If there are any questions rega rding this financial 
assessment, please feel free to contact me. 

Sincerely, 

NewGen Strategies and Solutions, LLC 

-41.ja---
Grant Rabon, Executive Consultant 

040 



Attachment Ratepayers 3-5f 
Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corp Exhibit A 

Adia| Actual Actual Budget Projected 
2017 2018 2019 2020 Adjustrnents 2020 N otes 
A B C E F G H 

1 Revenue 
2 Standby Fees $ 41,977 $ 38,959 $ 44,079 $ 33,000 $ 11,079 $ 44,079 A 
3 Service 279,873 341,066 369,541 390,000 145,553 535,553 B 
4 Late Charge 6,750 8,575 5,092 5,000 5,000 
5 Membership Transfer Fees 70 350 (1,982) 2,800 (2,800) C 
6 Equity Buy-In Fees 24,000 41,800 50,600 27,600 18,400 46,000 D 
7 Tap Fees 8,250 16,425 20,700 10,350 13,900 24250 D 
8 Reconned Fee 35 
9 Miscellaneous - 2,035 59,149 -
10 $ 360,956 $ 449211 $ 547,180 $ 468,750 $ 654,882 
11 Other 
12 Intere~ Income $ 362 $ 331 $ 481 $ 300 $ 300 
13 Property Sales 
14 $ 362 $ 331 $ 481 $ 300 $ 300 
15 
16 Tctal Revenue $ 361,318 $ 449,543 $ 547,661 $ 469,050 $ 655,182 
17 
18 Operating Expenses 
19 Operatcr $ 109,800 $ 116,825 $ 117,865 $ 123,375 $ 123,375 
20 Chemicals 10,425 10,602 12,035 12,450 12,450 
21 Electricity 20,143 21,585 20,922 22,400 22,400 
22 S Iudge Removal 8,095 4,521 2,363 5,000 5,000 
23 LCRA Raw Water Fee 8,551 8,468 8,490 9,000 9,000 
24 Lab Fees 5,244 7,166 8,459 6,500 6,500 
25 Website 358 358 - 500 500 
26 New Service Taps 15,455 10,462 20,985 7,200 17,050 24250 E 
27 Bank Charges 481 411 222 600 600 
28 Acccunting 4,263 6,465 5,848 17,800 17,800 
29 Billing Services 15,928 14,350 15,679 20,000 20,000 
30 Ccntract Services 2,657 4,783 3,069 9,000 9,000 
31 Legal and Appraisal 2,247 12,501 7,411 - 7,386 7,386 F 
32 Legal - Lawsuit Related - 25,480 159,173 110,000 135,223 245223 G 
33 Dues and Subscripticns 2,552 1,835 178 4,000 4,000 
34 TCEQ Fees 1,818 1,816 1,816 2,100 2,100 
35 Insurance 12,577 14,083 14,161 21,000 21,000 
36 Meals and Entertainment - 131 - 500 500 
37 Office Supplies 1,570 1283 4,707 3,400 3,400 
38 Telephone and Internet 4,156 4,526 6,549 6,000 6,000 
39 Pcstage and Shipping 2,510 2,094 2,710 5,000 5,000 
40 Equipment Rental - - 250 1,500 1,500 
41 Repairs and Maintenance 35,481 76,824 71,060 50,000 11,121 61,121 F 
42 Repair Parts 8,468 7,523 6,730 16,000 16,000 
43 Pnnting - 2,184 168 1,500 1,500 
44 Interest 15,307 13,603 11,815 14,000 28 14,028 H 
45 Taxes - P roperty - - 40 40 
46 Meetings and Conferences 2,933 1,382 1,130 2,500 2,500 
47 $ 291,019 $ 371260 $ 503,795 $ 471,365 $ 642,174 
48 
49 Net Income before Depreciaticrl $ 70,300 $ 78283 $ 43,866 $ (2,315) $ 13,008 
50 
51 Debt Principal $ 34,812 $ 36,502 $ 38,274 $ - 13,008 $ 13,008 H 
52 
53 Net Cash Flav before Cash Capital Outlay $ 35,488 $ 41,781 $ 5,592 $ (2,315) $ 

Nctes 
A Assumedto bethesame asin2019 
B Forecasted based on eight months at current ratesand fourmcnths at prior rates as well as 1 0 additional water and sewer customers in 2020 
C Assumed to be $0 based cn recent adual fees 
D Based on l 0 water and sewer customers added per year 
E Assumedtobe equaltothetap feerevenue 
F Based cn an average of the actual results fcrthe Iastthr·ee years 
G Estimate for this analysis, Includes costsdlrectly related to ongoing lawsuits as well as general counsel servicesfor Public Irfonnation Ad requests 
H Based crl CoBank estimates for loans in the amounts cf $230,000 and $150,000 
I Assumes bad debt does not increase g gnificantly 

Prepared by NewGen Strategies and Solutions Page lofl 
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IeE=:nitted to Providing Clean, SafeWater for 

r ».• . .Z 

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
NIOur Residents -K,Ot,-»2-%-,:~~.e-

Frequently Asked Questions 

Will the company need to raise rates again in 2021? 
It might. The water company continues to face unprecedented legal expenses in response to 
suits filed against it. Just recently the company received notice that the attorney for plaintiffs' 
John Richard Dial, Stuart Bruce Sorgen and Rene Ffrench wants five more depositions of current 
and former directors. These are extremely costly to the corporation. Meanwhile, the rate 
protest filed by Josie Fullerand Patti Flunker is already nearing $100,000 in legal costs, primarily 
to defend against their efforts to see privileged information in legal invoices from 2019 which 
can be used by their friends, Dial, Sorgen and Ffrench against the corporation in their lawsuit. 
And Danny Flunker has filed suit as intervenor in a case which the company filed to protect its 
privileged legal invoices from the attorney representing Dial, Sorgen and Ffrench (the Attorney 
General now agrees that the information in the invoices is privileged). The legal fees needed to 
protect the corporation are Iikelyto exceed the $250,000 which the directors budgeted for 
2020. All legal fees are part of the general and administrative fees which may be included for 
consideration in the rate base. None of these fees are being incurred in a lawsuit that the 
corporation brought. 

What are the costs? 
The company is currently paying about $20,000 a month to our law firms, but we have a 
backlog of bills owed to them, at about $200,000. As long as the court cases continue, these 
costs will mount and we all will pay for them in the form of higher rates or special assessment. 

Is the WOWSC paying for directors' legal costs? 
Yes, the WOWSC is paying legal fees for the defense of eight current and former Board 
members in the case brought by plaintiffs Dial, Ffrench and Sorgen. The plaintiffs seekto hold 
these volunteer Board members personally liable for damages and penalties for acts the 
plaintiffs allege were beyond the powers of the Board and illegal. These allegations have not 
been proven in court. The current Board does not believe that the allegations are true and has 
agreed for the company to pay defense costs. This is standard practice for corporations to 
advance legal fees to defend its directors, and is contemplated and expressly allowed by Texas 
law. The Board followed Texas law in requiring each current and former Boa rd directorto affirm 
that they had not committed wrongdoing. And the Board may seek reimbursement of defense 
costs if a court finds otherwise. 
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Why is the company paying these fees? 
The company is protecting benefits our customers have received from decades of service from 
volunteers performing a wide range of business activities. Before the plaintiffs and their allies 
began their legal attacks on the company, our members benefited from low monthly base rates 
for water service which has been delivered by volunteer Board members. If the lawsuits were 
to drop, the monthly base rates could be decreased once the corporation finishes payment for 
legal fees. 

Is it legal for the company to pay directors' legal fees? 
Absolutely yes! The Texas Legislature and U.S. Congress recognizethe value of volunteersto 
non-profit corporations. The benefit is that a community does not have to pay these volunteers 
and yet receives considerable amounts of managerial and administrat ive support that keeps the 
company from needing to hire employees. The Texas Legislature and U.S. Congress have 
established robust legal protections from personal liability when no egregious abuses have 
occurred. Payingthese legal fees is also specifically allowed by Texas business law, by decision 
of the Board. 

Doesn't the corporation have insurance for these costs? 
Yes, the corporation has Directors & Officers insurance which should, in the opinion of our 
counsel, cover these costs. The petitions bythe plaintiffs allege felonious activity (in part) which 
has delayed the insurance company's response. The Board is continuingto pursue its claims on 
insurance. 

What would happen if the corporation did not pay these legal fees? 
In the view of the Board, the corporation would likely fail to attract any more volunteers to its 
service if people knew they could be held personally liable and then also be required to spend 
personal funds to defend themselves against a group of people who routinely sue the 
corporation. The value of volunteerservice is worth protecting. 

Has volunteerism suffered? 
Yes! Considerthat our 2020 election was cancelled due to lack of volunteer candidates. There 
were two positions open and only one sitting Board member agreed to run - no other 
candidates stepped forwa rd from the community. The Board had to re-appoint another 
member who had previously served but had not applied. 

Is the WOWSC paying for the defense costs of Friendship Homes? 
No. That is one of the many false allegations by the plaintiffs and their allies. Friendship Homes 
is the company which purchased the 4.3 acres of land from the watercompany in 2016. The 
title company for Friendship Homes is paying for its attorney's filings, attendance at 
depositions, etc. 
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Did the company give 0.5 acres to Friendship Homes? 
No. This is yet another contrivance of the plaintiffs and their allies. A series of errors at the title 
company did not convey all 4.3 acres covered by the sale contract at the time of the sale. The 
conveyance has been corrected with sworn affidavits confirming how the errors were made 
and their need for correction. The 2019 Board sought to correct this oversight to undo any 
potential liability it might face if the error remained. 

Has the water company been losing or winning in the cases filed against it? 
Overall, yes. Summarily, no. Our Board sought protection against cyberbullying against directors 
from the plaintiffs and their allies. The judge granted almost everything we asked for. Our 
company has asked the Attorney General to protect client-attorney privileged documents, 
namely legal invoices which could providethe plaintiffs with insights into strategy. The AG has 
agreed with our lawyers (but an intervention by Mr. Flunker is continuingthe case and adding 
to our costs). The Public Utility Commission dismissed wide-ranging complaints about financial 
mismanagement alleged by Ms. Fuller and Ms. Flunker, but has continued its inquiry into the 
company's legal expenses in 2019. Again, the company is trying to protect these legal invoices 
as attorney-client privileged documents so that its legal protections in the Dial, Sorgen, Ffrench 
suit remain. The PUC judge did rule against ourcompany's request to abate (postpone)the rate 
case until afterthe other case concludes. Mediation is slated later in November. 

Did anything come of the letter to Burnet County Sheriff and District Attorney alleging 
organized crime atthe water company? 
No. While some officials may ask a few questions at some point afterthe civil case concludes, 
there was nothing criminally illegal about the activities alleged in the letter. Again, the letter is 
a false narrative, created by a handful of people who believe every action of the water 
company to somehow be part of a grand conspiracy. If anything, the letter further 
demonstrates the type of bullying and harassment which dissuades people from volunteering 
for board service and demonstrates the mindset which keeps adding tothe legal costs. 

What is the status of Public Information Act requests? 
The company continues to receive PIA requests and responds to them in a timely and complete 
manner. In 2019, we received 46 requests with morethan a hundred questions. The company 
responded with hundreds of emails and documents containingthousands of pages. In 2020, the 
company has received 32 requests and has supplied hundreds of emails and documents 
containingthousands of pages. In some circumstances the company has appealed tothe 
Attorney General to retain or redact some information related to the court cases. The company 
is incurring significant legal costs respondingto multiple inquiries related to legal invoices that 
the Texas Attorney General believes to contain attorney-client privileged information. 
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What is the cost to the corporation? 
Over the corporation's history, it has never received this many PIA requests. The corporation 
contracted in July 2019 with Director Joe Gimenez to serve as Public Information Officer to 
defray costs for services that would be assigned tothe law firm. Gimenez receives $416 per 
monthforthis service, in addition to all the volunteer services he provides. Nonetheless, the 
PIA requests still require legal review and, sometimes, filings with the Attorney General to keep 
attorney-client counsel privileged. These requests increase the legal fees passed to ratepayers. 

Didn't a majority of members vote to remove Joe Gimenez from the Board? 
No. This is another false allegation of the plaintiffs' allies. In December 2019, only 56 members 
voted to remove Director Gimenez. Company bylaws required that a majority of ALL members -
or 127 at the time - vote to remove for removal to happen. 

Did the company lawyers help Mr. Gimenez retain his position? 
No. The lawyers only assistedthe company in holding a legally valid removal proceeding with 
mail-in ballots and counsel on meeting processes and procedures, which the company wanted 
to follow. Again, the allies to the plaintiffs who wanted Mr. Gimenez removed are fueling this 
false narrative in the neighborhood. The lawyers alsoassisted the corporation respond to 
various instances of business interference in the process leading up to the December hearing. 

Sign up for ALERTS at: 
https://www.wowsc.org/ 
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REOUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-6 The WOWSC's February 2,2020 board meeting minutes page 3 #2. xviii. 
3. states "Include statement why special assessment is not pursued, special 
assessment is at the end of the fiscal years"2. Provide 1]le WOWSC's 
explanation for not pursuing a special assessment and produce all 
communications sent out to the membership addressing this matter. 

RESPONSE: WOWSC did not pursue the special assessment for several reasons. Per 
WOWSC's Tari ff, an assessment can be done at the end of the fiscal year 
(see Voluminous Attachment Staff 1-24, Section G. 11). 

In November and December 2019, the law firms billed another $121,659.17 
which was not included in the $166,000 billed and paid in 2019 (and thus 
not considered for the rate study). Although we did not consider this total 
amount (of $121,659.17) at the time, we had indications that a special 
assessment for the 2019 amounts would be about $449 per member (271 
members) for legal. fees. 

Moreover , the lawsuits ' end ( for both . Double F Hanger Operations , LLC , 
Lawrence R. Ffrench, Jr., Patricia Flunker, and Mark A. McDonald v. 
Friendship Homes & Hangars, LLC, and Burnet County Commissioners 
Court, Cause No. 48292, in the 33rd District Court, Burnet County, Texas, 
and Toma Integrity v. WOWSC, Cause No. 47531, inthe 33rd District Court, 
Burnet County, Texas) were indeterminable in January 2020. WOWSC did 
not have payment agreements with either law firm at the time, so in our 
minds the amounts were due wilhin 30 days, as it had been paying 
throughout 2019. The cash onhand, and projections ofcash on hand, would 
quickly run out without additional income, especially in view of about 
$40,000 more needed to pay for the generator, $34,000 in conservancy 
projects agreed to with the LCRA, and other critical infrastructure projects 
(SCADA system and security system). 

Based on those considerations, the company would need continuing 
additional revenue from higher rates in 2020 to keep pace withthe legal fees 
which were being incurred. 

Prepared by 
Sponsored by: 

Joe Gimenez/Mike Nelson 
Joe Gimenez/Mike Nelson 

2 Id. 

W OW SC' s Resp on se to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for Information 8 

046 



SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REQUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-7 Provide the denial letter referenced in WOWSC's answer to Staff's RFI 
2-7(ii), specifically, the denial letter from Allied World to the WOWSC 
cited in the letter from Shidlofsky Law Firm to Allied World Specialty 
Insurance Company , which states , '< By letter dated December 19 , 2019 , 
Allied World denied coverage for the WSC and the Director Defendants 
under policy number 5105-0560-03 with respect to the Second Amended 
Original Complaint filed in the Underlying Lawsuit."3 

RESPONSE: See Attachment Ratepayers 3-7. 

Prepared by: Joe Gimenez 
Sponsored by: Joe Gimenez 

3 https://interchange.puc.texas. gov/Documents/50788_74_1109904.pdf 

WOWSC's Resp onse to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for Information 9 
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APR CLAIMS 
8055 Tufts Ave Suite 600 Denver, CO 80237 

Phone: 877-533-1211 Fax: 720-529-9345 

December19,2019 

SENT VIA EMAIL AND CERTIFIED MAIL RRR TO: 

Dorothy Taylor - Director 
Windennere Oaks Water Supply Corp. 
PO Box 279 
Spicewood, TX 78669 
director2@wowsc.org 

Jose E. de la Fuente - Attorney at Law 
816 Congress Ave. Ste 1900 
Austin, TX 78701 
jdelafuente@lglawfirm.com 

Re: Insured: Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
Insurer: Allied World Specialty Insurance Company 
Date ofLoss: 10/28/2016 
Policy #: 5105-0560-03 
Policy Period: 3/17/2016 to 3/17/2017 
Subj ect: Friendship Homes and Hangars 
Claim #: 2017001776 

DISCLAIMER OF COVERAGE 

Dear Ms. Taylor and Mr. de la Fuente, 

Network Adjusters, Inc. is the authorized third-party claims administrator for Allied World Specialty 
Insurance Company. Allied World issued a Commercial Water Plus Package Policy to Windermere 
Oaks Water Supply Corporation (hereinafter "WOWSC") under policy number 5105-0460-03, which 
includes Public Official and Management Liability Coverage Form (Claims-Made) (the "POMI 
Coverage Section") for the Policy Period of March 17, 2016 through March 17, 2017 (the "Policf'). 

This correspondence shall provide Allied World's supplemental coverage position under the Policy in 
connection with anew filing thatnow comes fojward as a Second Amended Original Petition, the style 
of which is Renee Ffrench , John Richard Dial , and Stewart Bruce Sorgen , Intervenor Plaintiffs vs . 
Friendship Homes and Hangars, LLC, Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation and its Directors, 
William Earnest, Thomas Michael Madden, Dana Martin, Robert Mebane, and Patrick Mi*lligan, 
Defendants, filed in District Court, Burnet County, Texas, 33rd Judicial District under Cause No. 
48292. 

This is the fourth filing on this matter going back to 2016. This newly filed Complaint contains new 
claims, adds additional Defendant parties, and seeks monetary damages and punitive damages from all 
ofthe current and former directors of Windermere Oaks Water Supply. 

This current Pleading involves an allegation that WOWSC itself breached their fiduciary duty to 
WOWSC by approving the land sale and by failing to pursue claims related to the land sale, as well. 
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This matter arises out of certain sale of land by WOWSC to Friendship Homes and Hangars, LLC 
(Dana Martin.) Certain members ofWOWSC have asserted that former Board members ofWOWSC 
and WOWSC itselfbreached their fiduciary duty to WOWSC byapproving theland sale and by failing 
to pursue claims related to the land sale respectively. 

We have reviewed the information provided to us along with the relevant provisions of the Policy and 
completed our coverage investigation. As discussed below, Allied World has determined that there 
is no coverage afforded for this action under the Policv. 

This correspondence is directed to you in your capacity as an authorized representative of the above-
named Insured for insurance coverage purposes. To the extent that you are not acting on behalf of the 
Insured with respect to insurance matters, we request that you direct a copy of this letter to the 
appropriate representative and advise the undersigned accordingly. 

To assist you in understanding this coverage analysis, we suggest that you review the Policy along 
withthis letter. This letter does not modify any ofthe terms and conditions ofthe Policy. Allied World 
must reserve its right to decline or limit coverage should any of the exclusions, endorsements, or any 
other provision of the Policy prove to be applicable. 

SUMMARY OF ALLEGATIONS 

The sum-mary of facts that follows is based upon the allegations contained within the documents and 
information received to date. We recognize that those allegations are unsubstantiated at this time, and 
nothing in this letter is intended to suggest or imply that they have any legal or factual merit. 

Windermere Oaks Time Line of Events 

FIRST PETITION 
January 24, 2017 

Correspondence was received involving a "potential" claim as a "situation" that is developing within 
Windermere. WOC sold a parcel of land to one of their board members Dana Martin and the sale is 
approved by the Board of Directors. According to standards in place by the BOC, the petition must 
have 10% of the ownership, signed to be accepted for review. This particular transaction only had 5% 
ofmembership and was not accepted bythe Board of Directors. 

MANDAMUS ACTION 
December 22, 2017 

Attorney Bill Aleshire, ofAustin, Texas, representing TOMA, Integrity, Inc., filed aMandamus Action 
seeking discovery requests and there is no demand for monetary damages. The style ofthe pleading is, 
Integrity, Inc. vs. Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation that was filed in the District Court of 
Barnett County, Texas, 33rd District Court under Cause number 47531. This Complaint reads that, on 
December 19, 2015, the WOWSC Board, acting without any competitive bid process or public 
announcement other intent, sold valuable property belonging to WOWSC to a business owned by one 
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of the Board members (Dana Martin). Additionally, the board also gave the board member a right o f 
first refusal for the purchase of even additional WOWSC property. There is no item on the meeting 
agenda giving Fair Notice to the public, or WOWSC ratepayers, that any WOWSC property would be 
sold. They submit that this is ablatant violation ofthe Texas Open Meetings Act. Property was sold to 
Dana Martin for $200,000. 

This claim was analyzed under the Policy's General Liability coverage form and the Public Officials 
coverage form. It was a mandamus action seeking equitable and injunctive relief to avoid the action 
and decisions that the Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation made to sell a parcel of property 
to a Board member. Here, TOMA Integrity, Inc. filed the petition in seeking to enforce the application 
of the Texas Open Meetings Act. This was a one-count Complaint seeking that Mandamus action. 

AMENDED COMPLAINT 
April 10,2017 

Attorney Bill Aleshire filed his fiISt amended complaint in the matter seeking the court to set the date 
on the mandamus action to reverse the violation of Toma public notice section 551.041 and declare 
avoid the action the WOWSC board took on December 19,2015 to sell WOWSC property. 

PETITIONER INTERVENTION 
May 31, 2019 

Attorney Bill Aleshire filed an Original Petition in Intervention in the matter. The Plaintiffs are Ren6 
Ffrench, John Richard Dial, Stewart Sorgen as Intervenor Plaintiffs and as representatives for 
Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation vs Friendship Homes and Hangers, LLC, Windermere 
Oaks Water Supply Corporation and its Directors William Earnest, Thomas Michael Madden, Dana 
Martin, Robert Mebane and Patrick Mulligan as Defendants again in 33rd District Court. This 
Intervenor Pleading was filed to protect the interests of WOWSC and its members from the financial 
scar that was caused by the name Defendant WOWSC Directors. These Defendant Directors are said 
to have acted inconsistently with the limitation on their authority by selling the property to one of their 
own Board members for a very small fraction ofthe value of the property This action that was taken 
bythe Directors was done inaclosed session. Intervenormembers stand as representatives ofWOWSC 
for the Corporation's claims against the name Defendant Directors for betraying WOWSC by 
exceeding their authority. 

SECOND AMENDED ORIGINAL PETITION 
November 5, 2019 

Plaintiff-Intervenors in this case are three (3) members ofWOWSC who filed this intervention seeking 
to protect the interests of WOWSC and its members from the financial harm that was caused by the 
named Defendant, WOWSC Directors. It is alleged that those Defendant Directom acted inconsistently 
with the limitation ontheir authority by selling WOWSC property to one oftheir own Board members 
for a small fraction of the value of the property and to challenge ownership by the Defendant, 
Friendship Homes, of certain property. Intervenor Plaintiff members stand as representatives of 
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WOWSC for the Corporation's claims against the named Defendant WOWSC Directors for betraying 
WOWSC members by exceeding their authority inthe sale of this plot ofland to another Director at a 
reduced price. 

At a WOWSC Board meeting on December 19, 2015 and February 22, 2016, the Defendant WOWSC 
Directors approvethe sale ofWOWSC property, approximately 3.86 acres, along the west side ofPiper 
Lane to Defendant, Friendship Homes and Hangars. The company, later created by then WOWSC 
Board member, Dana Martin, was the sale of this property which was done without public notice or 
competition for sale of the land and had been adjudged to have violated the Texas Open Meetings Act. 
These negotiations were done in closed session after an executive session was completed. The price 
approved bythe Defendant, WOWSC Directors, forthe property was to net $200,000 to WOWSC. An 
appraisal of the property was commissioned by the Defendant, WOWSC Directors, and in particular, 
Dana Martin, hemelf, identifying the highest and best use of the property as "vacant land." TIle 
appraisal failed to recognize as Defendant Martinbeing arealtorherselfwho had sold similar properties 
in the area, that the property's highest and best use was division into several airport hangar lots, for 
which the value was actually $700,000. 

The Intervenor-Plaintiffs now seek to enjoin the performance of anyact or the transfer of property by 
the WOWSC that 1) recognizes or facilitates the sale of Tract 1 (3 acres), and 2) that recognizes or 
facilitates the implementation of the unauthorized right of first refusal of Tract 2 (7 acres) without full 
and fair compensation to WOWSC. Additionally, they seek the sum of $100,000.00. 

Intervenor-Plaintiff members ask the Court to set aside and enjoin the land sale contract, enjoined 
implementation of Defendant, Friendship's right of first refusal and denial of an access easement from 
Tract 1 onto Tract 2; set aside and enjoin the performance ofthe land sale contract in Tract 1 as being 
inconsistent with the expressed limitation on the authority of the Defendant WOWSC Directors. 

Causes of Action 

As to the Causes of Actions in his Pleading, Plaintiffs allege: 
...Ultra vires actions 
...Unauthorized conveyance of property by current and former Directors 
...Ultra vires use o f cooperative assets by current and former Directors 
. . .Adverse transactions 
...Disbursement of cooperative funds for the benefit of Directors, current and former 
...Breach of fiduciary duties 
...Contractual fraud 
...Conspiracy by Directors to disperse cooperative funds 
...Exemplary damages 
...Attorney fees 

SUMMARY OF COVERAGE 

We direct your attention to certain terms and conditions in the policy of insurance issued by Allied 
World that have affected coverage in this matter. As you know, the Policy is comprised of multiple 
coverage parts. Due to the nature ofthe underlying facts and allegations made therein and based upon 
the information received to date, it is Allied World's position that analysis of this matter is properly 
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conducted under Insuring Agreement (A) the POML Coverage Section of the Policy. We expressly 
note that the Commercial General Liability Coverage Section is inapplicable because the Petition does 
not allege "bodily injury" or "property damage" caused by an "occurrence" or "personal and 
advertising injury" caused by an offense and, therefore, the insuring agreement for the Commercial 
General Liability Coverage Section is not met. We further note that coverage under Insuring 
Agreement (B) of the POML Coverage Section is applicable, because the Petition seeks "damages", 
defined to mean monetary damages, arising out of a "claim" for a "wrongful act". If you disagree or 
would like us to review this matter under any other coverage section, please contact rae. 

Please note that the following observations concerning coverage arebased onthe information presently 
available and may be subject to change in the event Allied World becomes aware of additional 
information. 

We direct your attention to the PUBLIC OFFICIALS AND MANAGEMENT LIABILITY 
COVERAGE FORM WA-PO 00006 00 (03/12), a part of your Policy which states in pertinent part: 

SECTION I. - COVERAGES 

A. COVERAGE A. INSURING AGREEMENT - LIABILITY FOR 
MONETARY DAMAGES 

1. We will pay those sums that the insured becomes legally obligated to pay as 
"damages" arising out of a "claim" for: 
a. a "wrongful act," or 
b. an "employment practices" offense, or 
c. an offense in the "administration" of your "employee benefit plans," to which this 
insurance applies. 
We will have the right and duty to defend any "claim"seeking those "damages." 
However, we will have no duty to defend the insured against any "claim seeking 
<'damages" for a "wrongful act" or an "employment practices" offense or an offense in 
the "administration" of your "employee benefit plans" to which this insurance does not 
apply. We may, at our discretion, investigate any "wrongful act," "employment 
practices" offense or an offense in the "administration" of your "employee benefit 
plans," and settle any "claim" that may result. 
However: 

The amount we will pay for "damages" is limited as described in SECTION IV. -
LIMITS OF INSURANCE; and 

Our right and duty to defend ends when we have used up the applicable limit of 
insurance inthe payment of"damages" or "defense expenses" under Coverages A. and 
B. 
No other obligation orliability topaysums orperform acts or services is covered under 
this insurance unless explicitly provided for below under Coverage A. 
Supplementary Payments. 

2. This insurance applies to "claims" for "wrongful acts" or offenses only if: 
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a. The "wrongful act" or offense takes place in the "coverage territory, and or after 
the retroactive date shown in the declarations and before the end of the policy period; 
and 

b. A "claim" is first made against any insured in accordance with paragraph 3.c. below, 
during the policy period or any Extended Reporting Period we provide according to 
SECTION VII. - EXTENDED REPORTING PERIODS. 

SECTION II. - EXCLUSIONS 

This insurance does not apply under either Coverage A or Coverage B to: 
*** 

5. Attorney's Fees and Court Costs 

Any award of court costs orattorney's fees which arises out of anaction for "injunctive 
relief' 

*** 

8. Claims Against Other Insured 

Any actions for "injunctive relief' or "claims" brought: 
a. By a Named Insured against any other insured; or 

b. By one Named Insured against another Named Insured. 
*** 

11. Contractual Liability 
"Damages, " " defense expenses, costs or loss based upon, attributed to, arising out of, 
in consequence of, or in any way related to any contract or agreement to which the 
insured is a party or a third-party beneficiary, including, but not limited to, any 
representations made in anticipation of a contract or any interference with the 
performance of a contract. 
12. Criminal Acts 

"Damages, "defense expenses," costs or loss arising out of or contributed to by any 
fraudulent, dishonest, criminal or malicious act of the insured (except for "sexual 
abuse" whichis excluded inthe Sexual Abuse exclusionbelow), orthe willful violation 
of any statute, ordinance or regulation committed by or with the knowledge of the 
insured. However, we will defend the insured for covered civil action subject to the 
other terms of this Coverage Form until either a judgment or final adjudication 
establishes such an act, or the insured confirms such act. 

*** 

15. ERISA, COBRA and WARN Act Liability 

"Damages," "defense expenses," costs or loss arising out of or contributed to by any 
insured's obligations under: 
a. The Employee Retirement Income Security Act of 1974 (ERISA); 
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*** 

19. Violation of Law 
" "Damages, "defense expenses, costs or loss arising from an insured's willful 

violation of any federal, state, or local law, rule, or regulation. 
*** 

27. Profit, Advantage or Remuneration 

Any "Damages," "defense expenses," costs or loss based upon or attributable to the 
insured gaining any profit, advantage or remuneration to which the insured is not 
legally entitled. 

*** 

SECTIONVI. -CONDITIONS 

Lastly, in addition to the foregoing, Allied World continues to reserve its rights, 
remedies, and defenses, including, without limitation, its right to disclaim or limit 
coverage as this matter continues to evolve, to the extent that: 
1. the parties involved are not insureds; 
2. this matter does not involve "wrongful acts"; 
3. any amounts incurred in connection with do not constitute covered or insurable 

"damages" or "defense expenses"; and 
4. this matter involves covered and uncovered matters or parties. 
Please note that Section VI, Condition (6) of the Policy's POML Coverage Section 
provides that if other valid and collectible insurance is available to the insured for a 
loss or"defense expenses" we cover under this Coverage Form, this insurance is excess 
over any of the other insurance and its deductible or self-insured retention provisions, 
whether primary, excess, contingent or on any other basis. Accordingly, please advise 
as soon as possible if there are any other insurance carriers that have been placed on 
notice ofthis matter. In addition, please forwardus copies of anyand all other coverage 
letters issued by any other insurance carrier(s) in connection with this "claim." Allied 
World expressly reserves its rights related to other insurance. 

SECTION VIII. - DEFINITIONS 
*** 

3. "Claim" means: 

a. written notice, from any party, that it is their intention to hold the insured 
responsible for "damages" arising out of a "wrongful act" of offence by the insured; 
b. a civil proceeding in which "damages" arising out of an offence or "wrongful act" 
to which this insurance applies are alleged; 
c. an arbitration proceeding in which "damages" arising out of an offense or 
"wrongful acf' to which this insurance applies are claimed and to which the insured 
must submit or does submit with our consent; 
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d. any other civil alternative dispute resolution proceeding in which "damages" 
arising out of an offense or "wrongful act" to which this insurance applies are claimed 
and to which the insured submits with our consent; or 

e. a formal proceeding or investigation with the Equal Employment Opportunity 
Commission, or with an equivalent state or local agency. 

A "claim" does not mean any ethical conduct review or enforcement action, or 
disciplinary review or enforcement action. 

*** 

5. "Damages" means monetary damages 

6. "Defense expenses" means reasonable and necessary fees or expenses incurred by 
or onbehalf ofthe insured for: 
a. Legal fees charged by the insured's attorney; 
b. Court costs; 

c. Expert witnesses; and 

d. The cost of court bonds, but we do not have to furnish these bonds. 
"Defense expenses" do not include: 

(1) Any salaries, charges or fees for any insured, insured's "volunteer workers" 
or "employees," or former '<volunteer workers" or "employees"; or 

(2) Any expenses other than a.,b., c. and d. above. 
*** 

12. "Injunctive relief' means equitable relief sought through a demand for the 
issuance of a permanent, preliminary or temporary injunction, restraining order, or 
similar prohibitive writ against an insured, or order for specific performance by an 
insured. 

*** 

25. "Wrongful act" means any actual or alleged error, act, omission, neglect, 
misfeasance, nonfeasance, or breach of duty, including violation of any civil rights 
law, by any insured in the discharge oftheir duties for the Named Insured, individually 
or collectively, that results directlybut unexpectedly and unintentionally in"damages" 
to others. 

EXPLANATION FOR ALLIED WORLD'S DISCLAIMER OF COVERAGE 

Based onthe foregoing Policy language and our review ofthe materials received, we have determined 
that the Policy willnot afford coverage forthe Complaint for several reasons. Please take note ofseven 
(7) enumerated exclusions that will give preclusive effect to a coverage grant. 

First, in the Petition, Plaintiff seeks equitable and injunctive reliefto void the action and decisions that 
the Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation (WOWSC) initiated to sell a parcel of WOWSC 
property to a Board member. According to Section I[ of the Policy's POML Coverage Section 
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Exclusion (27), this insurance does not apply under Coverage (A) to "damages," "defense expense," 
costs or loss based upon or attributable to the insured gaining any profit, advantage or remuneration to 
which the insured is not legally entitled. 

Second, according to Section II ofthe Policy's POML Coverage Section, Exclusion (19), this insurance 
does not apply under Coverage (A) to "damages," "defense expense," cost or loss arising from an 
insured's willful violation of any federal, state, or local law, rule or regulation. In this matter, there 
were violations of the Texas Open Meetings Act (TOMA) as there was no public notice given to 
WOWSC members of the upcoming meeting nor items listed on the agenda. Given the allegations, 
Allied World further reserves its rights to limit coverage to the extent the insured willfully violated any 
federal, state, or local law, rule or regulation. 

Third, we note that the Petition seeks attorney's fees. According to Section II of the Policy's PCMI 
Coverage Section, Exclusion (5), this insurance does not apply under Coverage (A) to any award of 
court cost or attorney's fees which arises out of an action for "injunctive relief'. Allied World 
expressly disclaims coverage for any award of attorney's fees which arise out of the Petition. 

Lastly, Exclusion 8 "claims against another insured" is appli cable. We submit that you refer the matter 
to your Directors and Officers (D and O) carrier for their review and consideration. This portion of the 
Pleading is better addressed under a Fidelity Liability Policy which is not specifically contained within 
the Policy form of your current Public Officials - Management Liability, as well as the General 
Liability coverage part. Nevertheless, the ERISA exclusion would apply as to fiduciary duties. 

In the complaint, the plaintiffs have made a claim for punitive damages. Allied World denies any 
obligation to provide payment for punitive damages, or any other damages, that do not meet the 
definition of "loss" or "losses" as defined above and by the policy. You should, therefore, take 
whatever actions you deem appropriate to protect your interests, including notifying any prior carriers 
that may provide coverage for this loss. 

Based on the above considerations, as to the Exclusions, Allied World denies the coverage grant for 
defense representation and indemnity under the Policy to WOWSC. 

Allied World's coverage position addressed herein is based upon the facts currently known, and Allied 
World will consider and evaluate any additional infonnation you may present to it, which you believe 
to be relevant to its coverage determination. 

Please understand that this letter is not intended to provide an exhaustive review of all Policy terms, 
conditions and exclusions and Allied World expressly reserves its right to rely upon and enforce 
additional Policy tenns when appropriate. Allied World mayrevise its coverage position and raise any 
other coverage issues or coverage defenses without prejudice, waiver or estoppel. Furthermore, this 
letter does not constitute a waiver of any policy provisions or defenses available to Allied World. 
Allied World expressly reserves all of its rights and defenses under the Policy and applicable law. 
Additionally, Allied World reserves the right to seek a determination in a court oflaw regarding any 
issues ofcoverage discussed herein as well as those notraised bythis letter, but ofwhich Allied World 
may subsequently become aware. 

If you have any questions or concerns regarding Allied World's coverage position or anything stated 
herein, or if you have additional infonnation which you believe may affect Allied World's coverage 
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position, please do not hesitate to contact the undersigned at 303-221-9676 or by email 
pf[yan(@networkadjusters.com. 

You may contact the Texas Department of Insurance 
to obtain information on companies, 

coverages, rights or complaints at 
1-800-252-3439 

You may write the Texas Department of Insurance 
P.O. Box 149104 

Austin, TX 78714-9104 
FAX#(512)475-1771 

Web: http://www.tdi.state.tx.us 
E-mail: ConsumerProtection@tdi.state.tx.us 

Sincerely, 

p,6 F4.l 
Pete Hynn 
General Adjuster 
Network Adjusters, Inc. on behalf ofAllied World Specialty Insurance Company 
pflynn@networkadjusters.com 
303-221-9676 

"Any person who knowingly presents a false or fraudulent claim for the payment of a loss is guilty 
of a crime and may be subject to fines and confinement in state prison." 
cc: Sandy Batchelor (via email only) 

AIA Insurance Agency, Inc. 
sbatchelor@aiainsagencv.com 
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REOUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-8 Admit or Denythe WOWSC filed on March 19, 2021 a Civil Action lawsuit 
in United States District Court for tile Western District of Texas, Case 
1:21-CV-00258-RP4 (see exhibit A) in which WOWSC and former and 
current board members Dana Martin, William Earnest, Thomas Michael 
Madden, Robert Mebane, Palrick Mulligan, Joe Gimenez, David Bertino, 
Mike Nelson, Dorothy Taylor, and Norman Morse are named as plaintiffs 
in an Original Complaint, by the Shidlofsky Law Firm against Defendant 
Allied World Specialty Insurance Company. 

RESPONSE: Ratepayers 3-8 is subject to a pending objection. 

Prepared by 
Sponsored by: 

4 https://www.pacermonitor.com/publidcase/39116925/Windermere_Oaks_Water_Supply_Corporation_etal_v_All 
ied_World_Specialty._Insurance_Company 

WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for In formation 10 
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REOUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-9 If the answer to RFI 3-8 is admit, state whether the WOWSC is paying 
litigation expenses for the individual plaintiffs and the legal and factual 
bases (i f any) on which the WOWSC is doing so. 

RESPONSE: Ratepayers 3-9 is subject to a pending objection. 

Prepared by: 
Sponsored by: 

WOW SC' s Resp onse to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for Information 11 
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REOUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-10 Please produce all agreements between the WOWSC or Lloyd Gosselink, 
on the one hand, and any of the individual plaintiffs in Case 
1:21-cv-00258-RP, on the other hand, concerning payment, advancement 
or reimbursement of litigation expenses. 

RESPONSE: Ratepayers have agreed to withdraw this RFI. 

W OW SC's Response to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for Information 12 
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 507SS 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REOUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-11 Produce all invoices reflecting legal expenses incurred by or on behalf of 
the individual plaintiffs in Case 1:21-CV-00258-RFP. 

RESPONSE: Ratepayers have agreed to withdraw this RFI. 

W OW SC's Resp on se to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for In formation 13 
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERM ERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REQUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-12 Produce the records that reflect payments, if any, by the individual plaintiffs 
for litigation expenses in Case No. 1:21-CV-00258-RFP. 

RESPONSE: Ratepayers have agreed to withdraw this RFI. 

W OWSC's Resp onse to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for In formation 14 
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REQUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-13 What financial account/fund /bank account is the WOWSC pulling funds 
from to pay the Shidlofsky Law Firm's for representation of the WOWSC 
and the individual plaintiffs in Case 1:21-cv-00258-RP? 

RESPONSE: Ratepayers 3-13 is subject to a pending objection. 

Prepared by 
Sponsored by: 

W OWSC's Response to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for In formation 15 
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REQUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-14 Are any of WOWSC funds used to pay the Shidlofsky Law Firm for 
representation of the WOWSC and past and current directors' 
representation in Case 1:21-cv-00258-RP generated by the income of the 
water and/or sewer rates? 

RESPONSE: Ratepayers 3-14 is subject to a pending objection. 

Prepared by: 
Sponsored by: 

WOW SC's Response to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for In formation 16 
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REQUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-15 Admit or Deny, legal expenses billed for November 2019 were included in 
the 2020 rate increase? 

RESPONSE: Deny. The company received the following invoices in December 2019: 
• On December 19, 2019 WOWSC received invoice #97505976 from 

Lloyd Gosselink totaling $30,012.10 and invoice #97505739 totaling 
$17,579.00. 

• On December 25, 2019, the WOWSC received invoice #10352 totaling 
$10,530 for November 2019 Services. 

Payment for all of the above could not be made until 2020. 

Thus the amount in the rate study calculation performed by James Smith in 
late January 2020 did not include these items because they had not been 
included in the 20191egal fees for WOWSC's fiscal year end statement. 

Prepared by: Joe Gimenez 
Sponsored by: Joe Gimenez 

W OW SC's Response to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for Information 17 
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REOUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-16 What was file total amount of billing for legal services in November 2019 
was included in the 2020 rate study? 

RESPONSE: The total amount ofbilling for legal services in November 2019 which was 
included in the 2020 rate study was $0. Please see lhe response to 
Ratepayers 3-15. 

Prepared by: Joe Gimenez 
Sponsored by: Joe (Jimenez 

W OWSC's Response to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for Information 18 
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REOUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-17 Admit or Deny, legal expenses billed for December 2019 were included in 
the 2020 rate increase. 

RESPONSE: Deny. Invoices from Lloyd Gosselink and Enoch Kever for services 
provided in December were received in January 2020 and February 2020. 
They were not included in the 2020 rate study calculation performed in late 
January 2020 that was based on actual expenses in 2019. 

Prepared by: Joe Gimenez 
Sponsored by: Joe Gimenez 

WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for In formation 19 
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REQUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-18 What was the total amount of billing for legal services in December 2019 
included in the 2020 rate study? 

RESPONSE: The total amount of billing for legal services in December 2019 which was 
included in the 2020 rate study was $0. 

Prepared by: Joe Gimenez 
Sponsored by: Joe Gimenez 

WOW Ses Response to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for Information 20 
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REQUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-19 Please provide legal invoices for November and December 2019 which 
were not included in the WOWSC answers to Ratepayers request of 
RFI-1-9, submitted by the WOWSC on January 28,2021 under a protective 
order. 

RESPONSE: Please see Attachment Ratepayers 3-19. However, the provided invoices 
were not provided in response to Ratepayers 1-9 because they are not 
responsive to that request and were not included in the rate increase at issue 
in this proceeding. 

Prepared by: Joe Gimenez 
Sponsored by: Joe Gimenez 

W OW SC' s Respon se to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for In formation 21 
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Attachment Ratepayem 3-19 
816 Congress Avenue, Suite 1900 
Austin. Texas 7870 I 
Telephone: (5 I 2) 322.5800 
Facsimile: (5 I 2) 472-0532 

www. Iglawfirm.corn 

December 18,2019 

Winderm:re Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
Attn Joe Gimenez 
Board President Invoice: 97505739 
424 Coventry Road Client: 3870 
Spicewood. TX 78669 Matter: o 

Billing Attorney: MAG 

INVOICE SUMMARY 

For pro fessiona[ services and disbursements rendered through November 30,2019: 

RE: General Counsel 

Professional Services 
Total Disbui semeills 

$ 17.554.00 
$ 25.00 

TOTAL THIS INVOICE $ 17,579.00 

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, PC 
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Llovd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 

Wrz..2"ACC-?A...4.I-*-/7.I'4/ -V...<.@. r2/ I.//... 

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
General Counsel 
I.D.3870-0-MAC} 

December 18.2019 
Invoice: 97505739 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDF.RED 

Date Atty Description Of Services Rendered Hours 
1 I/01/19 JEF Review issues regarding scheduling member meeting on removal petition, .40 

comment on same. 
11/02/19 MAG Respond to telephone calls from Directors regarding removal procedures and M. .70 

Zeppa's opinion. 
11/04/19 MAG Review incoming correspondence from P. Flonker: follow zip with team reg:n~(ling .80 

same: work on research project to address plaintiff's allegations 
11/04/19 JEF Assist with PIA issues. review issues raised by purported charges not con:ained iii .80 

petition: work on approaches for indemnifying former and current directors in 
compliance with the law. 

11/04/19 JTB Assist client in reviewing potentially responsive documents and responding to PIA 1.80 
tequests. review bylaws regarding proceduies .elaled to iemoval petition and 
statement of charges against director sought to be removed. 

11/05/19 MAO Respond to telephone call from client Director; follow iii:~ with team regarding .40 
same--specifically bylaws and procedure with recall election. 

ll/05/19 JTB Phone call with client to discuss PIA requests and petition hearing: contbr with M. .90 
Gershon and J. de la Fuente regarding same. 

11/06/19 MAG Conference call with team regarding next steps on recall petition. .70 
11/06/19 JTB Conference call with M. Gershon J. de la Fuente and L. Killeen to discuss multiple 1.00 

client issues and action items. 
I 1/07/19 JEF Emails regarding purported member meeting, and strategy for dealing with same. .40 
11/07/19 JTB Correspondence with client regarding PIA requests and removal petition procedure: I.80 

review bylaws for purposeq of sanie: confer with T. de la Fiiente on path forward. 
review of correspondence from members regarding attempt to call special members 
meeting. phone call with client regarding same. 

11/08/19 MAG Telephone calls: research ofGovt Code: review file. 2.40 
11/08/19 JEF Review and edit letter regarding niembership meeting. .40 
11/08/19 JTB Continued bylaw and statute review regarding removal petition and voting .90 

procedures; phone calls with client regarding sallie. 
11/09/19 MAG Extended telephone calls with Client Dirccturs; follow up with M. Zeppa. tllen With 1.50 

11/10/19 JEF 
team. 
Review analysis of possible path on removal petition meeting and comment on .20 
same. 

lin l/19 MAO Prepare Board agenda items: internal discussion: research-; place another call to M. 3.20 
Zeppa; telephone calls with client; work on recall petition issues. 

11/Il/19 JEF Follow up on developments and path for member meeting; work on strategies for 50 
proper communication. 

11/11/19 JTB Correspondence with M. Gershon and J. de la Fuente regarding client action items 3.50 
and upcoming Board meeting; review and edit agenda for same; review and finalize 
correspondence to members regarding removal petition process and path forward. 

1.loyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend. P.C. 
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Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 

Windemiere Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
General Counsel 
1.D.3870-0-MAG 

December 18. 2019 
Invoice: 97505739 

Date Atty Description Of Services Rendered Hours 
11/1 I/19 AAC Case management. .20 
11/12/]9 JEF Work on PIA iSSL1CS regarding scope and costs. .30 
]1/12/19 JTB Review correspondence regarding D. Flunkcr 10/27 PIA request: review applicable 1.80 

provisions of Government Code regarding time limits on responding to requests 
from individual requests; confer with J. dc la Fuente and M. Gcrshon regarding 
same: draft email to client regarding same; rcvicu additional con-espondcnce from 
J. Fliller tegai-ding attempted special niembcl-ship meeting, email correspondence 
with client regarding applicable provisions iii the Bus. Org Code and WSC Bylaws. 

11/12/19 AAC Case filemanagement. .10 
Il/13/19 MAG Review several emails ancl proposal for Exec Session. .40 
ll/13/19 JEF Prepare for upcoming board meeting. work on insurance issues: review PIA .70 

infonnation. 
11/13/19 AAC Case file management. .20 
ll/14/19 MAO Work with team in preparation forupconting Board meeting and other action items. .SO 
I [/14/19 MAG Work regarding coop/wsc distinction and allegations regarding same in recently 2.20 

filed lawsuit. 
11/14/19 JEF Work on strategy lor member meeting and related issues: review and edit .40 

resolution on member meeting. 
ll/14/]9 JTB Work session with M. Gershon and J. de la F,iente to prepare for client Board 3.70 

meeting: draft resolution for board for upcoming meeting. 
ll/15/19 MAG Review incoming correspondence and follow up regarding same with teani. .40 
11/15/]9 JEF Work on post-meeting issues, agenda approach. 20 
11/15/19 JTB Review' Draft agenda: review correspondence to board from J. Fuller regarding l.50 

removal petition and improperly called special members meeting; discussions with 
client regarding sanie 

11/18/19 JEF Review discovery issues: coordinate defense matters: work on preparations for .70 
depositions: sign protective order on PIA appeal. 

ll/18/19 JTB Review and edit documents provided by D. Taylor in preparation for removal 1.80 
petition hearing, phone call with client regarding same. 

11/19/19 MAG Work with J. de la Fuente regarding allegations iii recently filed lawsuit and prep .40 
for Board meeting regarding same. 

11/19/19 JEF Work on matters for upcoming board nieeti,ig .40 
11/19/19 JTB Review email correspondence from petitioners: confer with J. de la Fuente and M. 1.90 

Gershon on path fonvard: draft documents for upcoming Board meeting: review 
agenda and other petition proceeding related documents from Board. 

ll/19/19 AAC Case file management. .20 
11/20/19 JEF Assist with preparation for board meeting: review and edit board correspondence .80 

regarding upcoming meeting and litigation: follow up on outcome ofmeeting. 
11/20/19 JTB Preparation for client Board meeting; prepare resolutions for Board action: review 8.50 

and edit documents provided by client pertaining to member correspondence and 
the removal petition proceeding: phone call with client regarding same: attend 
client board meeting: travel to Spicewood for purposes of same. 

l-]ovci Gosselink Hoclielle & Townsend. PC. 
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Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 

.-

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
General Counsel 
I.D.3870-0-MAG 

December 18,2019 
invoice: 97505739 

Date Atty Description Of Services Rendered Hours 
11/20/19 AAC Case file management: review correspondence and calendar membership meeting .20 

deadlines. 
I 1 /21/19 JTB Phone calls with client regarding action items fo[Iowing board meeting: finalize 2.30 

Board correspondence to members regarding removal petition: work to finalize 
agenda and notice correspondence regarding December 14th meeting. 

I I/21/]9 AAC Case file management. .10 
I 1/22/19 JTB Assist D. Taylor fitialize correspondence and other documents for petition 2.80 

proceeding: email correspondence regardir.g same: phone call with B. Earnest 
regarding analysis of cost of PIA request compliance/fulfillment and assistance: 
draft email to client regarding same. 

11/22/19 AAC Casefilenianagement; saveclientdocumentsto DMS file. .10 
It/25/19 JEF Follow up with client regarding purported meeting on Saturday: work on board .60 

communications regarding removal petition meeting, and proper path for 
communication from J. Gimenez. 

l I/25/19 JTB Review draft ballot for removal petition: discussion with client and with J. de la I.30 
Fuente regarding path forward on proposed correspondence from Director Gimenez 
to membership regarding charges brought against him; discussion with client 
regarding same. 

I 1/25/19 AAC Case file management: review client correspondence. .20 
l I/26/19 JEF Review agenda and comment on same: review draft letter to members and .80 

comment on same. including discussion of hearing procedures. 
ll/26/19 JTB Assist client in finalizing member correspondence and other documents 3.50 

encompassing notice for special menibership meeting: confer with J. de la Fuente 
regarding same. 

I I/27/19 JTB Review draft corespondence to membership regarding new public comment 1.50 
policy: review HB 2840 and bill analysis and TRWA correspondence: pho:ie call 
with client regarding same. 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES $ 17,554.OI) 

SIJMMARV OF PROFF.SSIONA]. SERVICES 

Name Staff Lcvel Ilours Rate Total 
Michael A Gcrshon Principal 13.90 300.00 4.170.00 
Jose E dc la Fuente Principal 7.60 300.00 2,280.00 
J Troupe Brewer Associate 40.50 270.00 10.935.00 
Audrey A Cooper Paralegal l.30 130.00 169.00 
TOTALS 63.30 $ 17,554.00 

DISBURSEMENTS 

1.loyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 
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Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 
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Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
General Counsel 
I.D.3870-0-MAG 

December 18,2019 
Invoice: 97505739 

Date Description Amount 
Photocopying 25.00 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $ 25.00 

TOTAL THIS INVOICE $ 17,579.00 

lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.e. 
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Attachment Ratepayers 3-19 
8 I 6 Congress Avenue. Suite 1900 
Austin,Texas 78701 
Telephone: (512) 322-5800 
Facsimile: (5 12)472-0532 

www.Iglawfirm.con 

December 18,2019 

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
Atm Joe Ginienez 
Board President Invoice: 97505976 
424 Coventry Road Client: 3870 
Spicewood, TX 78669 Matter: I 

Billing Attorney: JEF 

INVOICE SUMMARY 

For professional services and disbursements rendered through Noveinber 30,20 I 9: 

RE: TOMA Integrity Litigation 

Professional Services $ 29,925.00 
Total Disbursements $ 87.10 

TOTAL THIS INVOICE $ 30,012.10 

Retainer Held on Account $ 2,500.00 

lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 
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Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
TOMA Integrity Litigation 
I.D.3870-1-JEF 

December 18,2019 
Invoice: 97505976 

PROFF.SSIONAI. SERVICES RENDERED 

Date Atty Description Of Services Rendered Hours 
11 / 0 :/ 19 JEF Work on motions : obtain final documents for exhibits and review same : finalize 2 . 80 

and file plea tojurisdiction and motion for summary judgment. 
11/0./19 LRK Finalize motion. send final draft to J. de la Fuente: have paralegal finaliz: 7.2() 

[Exhibits: incorporate feedback from edits; final review of motion and exhibits: 
draft amended response: call with counsel for directors regarding amended answer 
Contents. 

1 ]/0:/19 KWM Assist with final edits to Brief in Support ofits Plea to the Jurisdiction and Motion 
for Summary Judgment; assist with final exhibits to Brief: office conferences with 
L. Killeen regarding s anie. 

I 1.'03/19 LRK Read and review new filings and correspondence froni opposing counsel sent after 
motion for summary.judgment was filed. 

I ] /04/ 19 JEF Review issues from new petition: call with counsel for co-defendants to discuss 
same: review relevant management and bylaws issues: review insurance policy: 
review and comment on emails regarding same: review issues with new petition 
and strategies for same; confer with co-defendants regarding same. 

I 1/04/ 19 JTB Research into bylaws and business organizations code regarding new filing against 
WOWSC with new claims and new basis for standing: research answers to 
questions and issued posed by J. de la Fuentc: email correspondence with J. dc la 
Fuente regarding same and path forward. 

11/04/19 LRK Read and review' amended petition: discuss with J de la Fuente: read and review 
other new filings: research question ofthe corporations status as a cooperative call 
with T. Brewer, email M. Gershon. 

11/06/19 JEF Call with all co-defense counsel regarding newly amended petition. and issues and 
approaches for same: emails from opposing counsel regarding motions filed; work 
with Litigation Team on palh forwaid in ligltt of Ilew claims against Ilew parties: 
review coop arguments; email to client regarding new claims and new parties. and 
path fonvard. 

1 l/06/19 JTB Conference call with M. Gershon J. de la Fuente and L. Killeen to discuss multiple 
client issues and action items. 

11/06/19 LRK Read and review second amended petition received, compare with fist amended 
petition; send internal list of what is new in pleadings: begin outlining amended 
niotion for qnmmary Judgment and plea to thejzirisdiction: call with other defence 
counsel: call WOWSC general counsel. follow up research. 

11:07/19 JEF Work on issues relating to coop status: email with co-defense counsel regarding 
path for\,ard and response lo opposing counsel's case position. 

11/07/19 JTB Research in AG opinions and common law regarding amended petition standing 
claim regarding WSC membership as a cooperative: confer with M. Get-shon J. de 
la Fuente and L. Killeen regarding same. 

11/07/19 LRK Call with T. Brewer, discuss research moving forward, begin research. 

4.00 

70 

2.10 

3.80 

5.10 

2.60 

I .50 

7.70 

60 

3.50 

.70 
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Atlm,ment Ratepgyers 3-19 
Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
TOMA Integrity Litigation 
I.D.3870-1-JEF 

December 18, 2019 
Invoice: 97505976 

Date Atty Description Of Services Rendered Hours 
11/OS/19 JEF Finalizc and send insurance coverage demand: review correspondence from .50 

opposing counsel. 
11/08/19 JTB Continued research on newly raised issue of WOWSC as a "cooperative." 1.50 
1 ]/08/ 19 LRK Research foi amended response. 2.10 
11/I 1/19 .ITB Draft sworn slalernent forms for clll-I-clit and past Board lilembers regarding suit 2.80 

and paynlcnl ofdefense costs. levicw business organizations code for purposes of 
same: confer with J. de la Fuenle tegaiditig same. 

ll/12/:9 JEF Eniails with counsel regarding deposilions, and fulluw up call regarding same and 1.20 
other discovery; work with client on plan for deposition preparation; review 
revised deposition notices. 

Il/12/:9 LRK Read and review' Plaintiffs fourth requests for production and intent to take .40 
deposition. 

11/13/19 JEt· Review pending discovery requests and likely responses to same; work on 1.80 
responsive pleading strategy: confer with co-defendants regarding discovery and 
pleading issues: email to opposing counsel regarding discovery issues and path 
forward. 

11/13/19 LRK Read and review new discovery requests. plan ofattack on responses: work on Z.40 
over-all case strategy. determine what we need to file in response :o amended 
petition; call with other defense counsel: outline standing arguments. email to J. de 
la Fuente ahead o f call with opposing counsel. 

11/13/19 KWM Review discovery requests received from Plaintiffs and Interveiiors and calendar .30 
deadline. 

11/14/19 JEF Work on overall strategy for dealing with new claims. upcoming depositions. and 1.90 
related matters: email aereement regarding deposition scheduling: prepare for 
deposition preparation with client. 

11/]5/19 JEF Prepare for deposition preparation session with J. Gimenez: conduct deposition 3.90 
preparation: email to co-defense counsel regardir.g same. 

11/15/19 LRK Deposition preparation session with J. Gimenez. 3.80 
l I/18/19 LRK Read and review motion to quash. new filings in matter, read and review .30 

correspondence with attorney for individual directors ahead of deposition. 
11/19/19 JEF Prepare for deposition with client; defend deposition: follow up on same: email to 7.00 

client litigation committee regarding same. and additional depositions: work on 
correspondence relating to litigation: work on litigation defensive strategy issues. 

11/19/19 JTB Review articles of incorporation and references therein to historic statutes to 2.50 
address issues raised iii deposition: research business organizations code and water 
code and predecessor statutes for purposes of same: relay findings to J. de la 
Fuente. 

11/19/19 LRK No Charge - Attend deposition of J. Gimenez. 6.30 
ll/19/19 KWM Download link with documents to Friendship Homes bates labeled production: 1.30 

discovery document management: review Friendship Homes Amended Responses 
to Plaintiffs 2nd Request for Production: Intervenors 5th Request for Production to 
WOWSC and Defendant Dana Martin's Motion for Protection and Motion to 

I-lovd Gosselnk Rochelle & Townsend, 1:C. 
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Attachment Ratcpaycrs 3-19 
Llo,d Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 

Windemiere Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
TOMA Integrity Litigation 
1.D.3870-1-JEF 

December 18.2019 
Invoice: 97505976 

Date Atty Description Of Services Rendered Hou rs 
Quash Plaintiffs Deposition Notice. 

11/20/19 JEF Prepare for and attend deposition: follow up on deposition issues for litigation 6.90 
strategy: work with T. Brewer on litigation update before meeting: follow up on 
same after meeting; work on strategy for tiext depositions. 

1 I /20/19 LRK Read and review Friendship's updated production in discovery; review deposition 3.80 
notes and research by T. Brewer done post-deposition questions: begin drafting 
responses to Plaintiffs third request tbr production, email paralegal to search 
internal WOWSC documents for responsive material. 

1 I/20/ 19 AAC Assist L. Killeen with discovery responsesi search client files for responsive .60 
documents. 

1 I /21/19 JFP Assess privilege issues associated with requests for document production .20 
1 I /21/19 JEF Emails with counsel for directors regarding next steps. .30 
1 [/21/19 LRK Review documents found in internal search pursuant to third request for 4.3 0 

production: call with J. Gimenez regarding documents needed for third request for 
production, finalize and edit responses, send to J. de la Fuenle fur review: begin 
drafting objections for forth requests for production: Read and review updated 
research ori status ab a cooperative to incorporate into inolion 

ll/21/19 AAC Assist I_. Killeen ancl Litigation Pi-actice Group with discovery responses. search 1.30 
client files for responsive documents and email L. Killeen regarding same. 

1[/22/19 J[r Review email regarding purported new deposition notice: prepare strategy to 2.30 
respond to same: fonvard same to client: communicate with co-defendants 
regarding same: revise insur:nce demand and send additional letter, work on 
outline for new PTJ and MSJ: emails regarding discovery and depositions: review 
and finalize discovery responses. 

I I /22/ I 9 LRK Read and review correspondence from J. Gimenez and D. Taylor, email J. 5.70 
Gimenez and G. Burris regarding documents responsive to Third Request for 
Production: draft and edit responses to Third Requests for Production; send to J. de 
la Fuente for review; prepare anc! review responsive documents for production: 
send documents to paralegal 

1 I/?2/19 KWM Assist with bates numbering responsive documents to Intervenor's Third Request .40 
for Prodliclion of Documents: eniail .I de la Fliente and L. Ki}leen regarding same 

ll/22/19 AAC Continue to assist L Killeen with discovery responses: search client files and l.00 
DMS for responsive documents. 

ll/25./19 JEF Review emails from opposing counsel regarding scope o f case and deposition 2.10 
notices: email conferences with co-defendants regarding same: work with 
Litigation team regarding same; work on outline of new motion to dismiss and 
motion for summary judgment. including conference with counsel for directors 
regarding same and preparation of initial executive summary: follow up on 
additional coverage demand to insurer: finalize written discovery responses. 

11/25/19 LIU<. Review strategy for motions to be filed moving forward; discuss litigation plan 4.2() 
with litigation learn: call with S, O'Brien: finalize Responses to Third Request for 
Production; begin drafting content for Motion to Dismiss. 

1.10\'d Ciosselink Rochelle & TO,VtlSetld, P.C. 
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Attachment Ratepayers 3-19 
Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 

Windennere Oaks Water Supply Corpuralioil 
TOMA Integrity Litigation 
I.D.3870-1-J Er 

December 18.2019 
Invoice: 97505976 

Date Atty Description Of Services Rendered Hours 
1]/26/19 JEF Review email from opposing counsel and from co-defendants regarding same; 1.So 

prepare response to same: review scheduling and approach to corporate 
representative deposition: multiple emails with team and opposing counsel 
regarding same: begin work on responsive pleading regarding bame. 

11/26/19 JTB Rev iew WOWSC response to discovery requests, .40 
11/26/19 LRK Final review Third Requests for Production; begin drafting dilatory pleas to try to 3.40 

get claims dismissed; read and review correspondence from defense counsel 
regarding response to continued discovery and litigation strategy moving forward: 
review motion for protection to file in response to notice of deposition to be filed. 

11/27/ i g JEF Review new deposition notice; emails with co-defendants and Litigation Team 1.10 
regarding same. and next steps: work on approach with TRWA regarding new 
theory of WSO being a coop. 

11/27/19 LRK Read and review aniended limited scope depoqition notice and formulate strategy .70 
for response and need for motion to quash. review case law research to incorporate 
into motion to dismiss. 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES $ 29,925.00 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Name Staff Level Rate Hours Amount N/C Ilr NiC $ 
Jose E de la Fuente Principal 300.00 38.90 11,670.00 .00 .00 
J Troupc Brewer Associate 270.00 16.00 4.320.00 .00 .00 
Janics F Parker Principal 290.00 20 58.00 .00 .00 
Lindsay R Killeen Associate 235.00 54.00 12.690.00 6.30 1.480.50 
Karen W Mallios Litigation 135.00 6.00 810.00 .00 .00 
Audrey A Cooper Paralegal 130.00 2.90 377.00 .00 .00 
TOTALS 118.00 $ 29,925.00 6.30 $ 1,480.50 

DISBURSEMENTS 

Date Description Amount 
Copy Service 54.00 
Photocopying I .60 
Postage 31.50 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $ 87.10 

TOTAL THIS INVOICE $30,012.10 

1.!ovd Gosselink Rochelle & townsend, r.c. 
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Lloyd 
A Gosselink 

Attachment Ratepayers 3-19 
8 I 6 Congress Avenue, Suite I 900 
Ati<tin, Tpxaq 7870 I 
Telephone (512)322-5800 
Facsimile: (5 I 2) 472-0532 

www.Iglawfirm.com 

January 30,2020 

Windet-mere Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
Attn Joe Giinenez 
Board President Invoice: 97506478 
424 Coventry Road Client: 3870 
Spicewood, TX 78669 Maller: 0 

Billing Attorney: MAG 

INVOICE SUMMARY 

For professional services and disbursements rendered through December 31,2019: 

RE: General Counsel 

Professional Services $ 10,695.50 
Total Disbursements S 92.80 

TOTAL THIS INVOICE $ 10,788.30 

lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend. PC. 
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Attachment Ratepayers 3-19 
Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
General Counsel 
I.D.3870-0-MAG 

January 30.2020 
Invoice: 97506478 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

Date Atty Description Of Services Rendered Hours 
12/02/19 MAG Review inconiing correspondence: work regarding client advisory to new Director. .40 
]2/02/ I 9 JEF Review communication regarding members meeting outcome. .20 
12/02/19 JTB Review email correspondence regarding attempted special members meeting and 1.SO 

voting on removal petition: review statute and bylaws for purposes of Sallie: 
internal email correspundence legal-ding same: cot iespondence with client 
iegardiny fulfillment of recent PIA request: finalize correspondence to newest 
Board members regarding duties and obligations. 

12/02/19 KWM Review PIA Appeal calendar deadline for Bates Production. .10 
12/02/19 AAC Case management. .20 
12/03/19 MAG Review ancl follow up on incoming correspondence and client action required. .30 
12/04/19 MAG Review and follow up regarding D. Flunker correspondence. .20 
I 2/01/19 JEF Review messages from Flunker re PIA officer and results o f meeting. .20 
12/04/19 JTB Continue work on Presiding Officer hearing script and other preparation for 1.10 

membership meeting. 
I 2/04/19 AAC Case management . 10 
I 3/05/19 DCN No Charge - Office conference with M. Gershon regarding WSC issues. .20 
1 2/05/ 19 JEF Work on issues regarding upcoming member meeting. and approach for same. .40 
l 2/05/19 JTB Review correspondence from client regarding upcoming special membership 1.70 

meeting on removal petition: internal correspondence regarding same and path 
forward for client: continue work on presiding officer hearing script: work on 
position paper regarding the lawful payment to PIO for such services: review client 
Bylaws and Business Organizations Code for purposes of same. 

12/06/19 JTB Draft hearing script and preparation for membership meeting 3.50 
12/07/19 JTB Work on hearing script for presiding officer and other preparations for special 1.50 

members meeting. 
12/09/19 JEF Review processes and information for member meeting: review documents to .80 

assist with same and edit same. 
12/09/19 JTB Finalize Hearing Script and memo/written statement on interpretation oi-WOWSC 3.20 

Bylaws and Articles of incorporation as well as Bus Org and Water Codes 
regarding payment of PIO for services provided to WSC. 

12/10/19 JTB Review J. de la Ftenle edits to Hearing Script and PIO S:lary memo: draft 3.10 
revisions to sallie. 

12/ !0/19 AAC Review Agreed Protective Order fi-om Attorney Geneial PIA appeal; pull. review, l.20 
and bales lillmbet legal invoices for production; draft covci- letter; case file 
nlanagenlenl. 

12/11/19 JEF Work on process and script for upcoming member meeting. .20 
12/11/19 JTB Phone calls with client regarding upcoming special members meeting and 1.70 

documents regarding same. revisions to documents following client input. 
12/12/19 JTB Preparation for special members meeting: phone calls with client regarding same: 3.30 

Lloyd (jossellnk Hocllelle st -I-ownsend. r.c. 
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Attachment Ratepayers 3-19 
Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 

Windermerc Oaks Water Supplv Corporation 
General Counsel 
1.D.3870-0-MAG 

January 30.2020 
Invoice: 97506478 

Date Atty Description Of Services Rendered Ho u rs 
review bylaws regarding voting list requirements. 

12/13/19 AAC Case management .30 
12/ I 4/ I 9 .1~1'B Attend special members meeting on removal petition for J. Ginien:z; preparation 4.50 

For same 
12/16/19 JEF Emails regarding holiday schedule. and interaction with PIA obligations. .50 
12/16/19 JTB Review draft agenda and revisions thereto: draft edits to same: email 2.20 

correspondence with client: draft resolutions for holiday business hours and 2020 
director elections. 

12/I 0/19 AAC Case management. .10 
12/17/19 JEF Review updated member communication, .20 
12/17/19 JTB Work on resolutions for upcoming mccting: call with J. Grissom regarding -. , U 

1 lf) 

settlement offer for his claim related to grinder pump: phone calls with client 
regarding sonic and recent member actions following recall petition meeting. 

12/17/19 CLT Research system to locate information regarding unopposed elections and email l.00 
same :o T. Brewer and D. Klein. 

12/18/19 JEF Review and edit resolution on holidays .30 
12/18/19 JTB Draft holiday schedule and dates of closure for corporate business resolution: 2.80 

re,iew AG complaint filed by D. Flunker and related doctimentq: email 
correspondence with client regarding same. 

12/18/19 AAC Finalize production documents and cover letter related to PIA lawsuit with the .60 
Attorney General's office: email cover letter and production documents to 
opposing counsel. 

12/19/19 JEF Review plan for member letter and discuss same with client. .30 
12/26/19 JEF Review member meeting agenda and information, including member letter. and .30 

comment or. same for proper approach. 

TOTAI, PROFESSIONAL SERVICES $ 10,695.50 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Name Staff Level Rate Hours Amount N/C Hr N/C $ 
Michael A Gershon Principal 300.00 .90 270.00 .00 .00 
Duncan C Norton Principal .00 .00 .00 .20 80.00 
Jose E de la Fiiente Principal 300.00 3.40 1.020.00 .00 .00 
T Troupe Brewer Associate 270.00 33.10 8.937.00 00 00 
Karen W Mailing I.i t i gat ion 135.00 10 13.50 00 00 
Christina L Thompson Paralegal 130.00 1.00 130.00 .00 .00 
Audrey A Cooper Paralegal 130.00 2.50 325.00 .00 .00 
TOTALS 41.00 $ 10.695.50 .20 $ 80.00 

DISBURSEMENTS 

Lloyd Gossehnk Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 
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Attachment Ratepayers 3-19 
Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 

( -, ~,-+~.I .. 

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
General Counsel 
1.D.3870-0-MAU 

January 30.2020 
Invoice: 97506478 

Date Description Amount 
11/30/19 Thomas Process Check # - 000037851 Thomas Process, Citation of Service, 80.00 

Service on Ken Paxton, Attorney General of State of Texas, Windermere Oaks 
Water Supply Corporation, 10/3/2019 
Color Prints 2.00 
Photocopying 10.80 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS S 92.80 

TOTAL THIS INVOICE $ 10,788.30 

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend. EC. 
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Lloyd 
4 Gosselink 

Attachment Ratepayers 3-19 
8 I 6 Coigrpqc Avenue. Suite 1900 
Austin, Texas 78701 
Telephone: (5 I 2) 322-5800 
Facsimile: (5 I 2) 471-0532 

www.Iglawfi,·m.com 

January 16,2020 

Windcrmere Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
Attn Joe Gimenez 
Board President Invoice: 97506700 
424 Coventry Road Client: 3870 
Spicewood, TX 78669 Matter: 1 

Billing Attorney : JE ¥ 

INVOICE SUMMARY 

For professional services and disbursements rendered through December 31, 2019: 

RE: TOMA Integrity Litigation 

Professional Services $ 32.434.50 
Total Disbursements $ 979.77 

TOTAL THIS INVOICE $ 33,414.27 

Retainer Held on Account $ 2,500.00 

I~Ioyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, RC. 
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Attachment Rntepayers 3-19 
Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 

Windemiere Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
TOMA integrity Litigation 
I.D.3870-1-JEF 

January 16.2020 
Invoice: 97506700 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

Date Atty Description Of Services Rendered Hours 
12/02/19 JEF Review amended deposition notice for corporate representative; begin work on 1.80 

approach for motion to quash: email with counsel for directors regarding same, 
and planned motions to dismiss: work on strategy for same. 

12/02/19 JTB No Charge - Review amended deposition notice; client correspondence regarding .80 
Sallie. 

12/02/19 LRK Draft Motion to Qiiash and Motion for Protection in response to deposition notice 4.10 
for corporate representative received [ 1/27, send to J de la Fuente tor review, read 
and review correspondence to J. Gimenez, send email to detbnsc counsel updating 
timeline for ftllng motion. 

12./02/19 LRK No l'harge - Draft Motion to Quash and Motion for Protection in response to 2.00 
deposition notice for corporate representative received I l/27. send to J de la 
Fuente for review. read and review correspondence to J. Ginienez. send email to 
defense counsel updating timeline for filing motion. 

12/02/19 KWM Review Winderniere's responses to Intervenor's Third Requests for Production of .20 
dociiments and bates labeled production. 

12/03/19 JEF Work on motion to quash and for protection: follow up on additional issues for .80 
motion lo dismiss. 

12/03/19 LRK Research, draft. edit mid fitlalize n]otion to qutsh col-pul-ate deposition, draft the 3.00 
declaration of J. Gimenez to be included in tlie niotion to quash. 

12/03/19 LRK No Chau#e - Reseai-ch. draft, edit ancl finalize motion to quash corporate 3.()0 
deposition; draft the declaration of J. Gimcncz to be included in the motion to 
quash. 

I 2/03/19 KWM Assist with editing and proof reading Motion for Protection and Motion to Qliash 1.0() 
Plaintiffs, Intervcnors Deposition Notice to Windcrmcrc Oaks Water Supply 
Corporation; assist with exhibits to Motion; office conference with L. Killeen 
regarding same. 

I 2/0.1: l 9 JEF Finalize and file motion to quash and for protection. .80 
12/04/19 LRK Read and review signed declaration to be attached as exhibit to motion to quash: 4.20 

final review of motion to quash and exhibits: gel on file: begin dra fting 91 a motion 
to dismiss. 

12/04/19 LRK No Charge - Read and review signed declaration to be attached as exhibit to 2.00 
motion to quash: final review of motion to qiiash and exhibits: get on file: begin 
drafting 917 niotion to rlismiss. 

13/04/19 KWM Assist uith finalizingexhihitsto Motion for Protection and Motion to Quashi .30 
office conference with L. Killeen regarding same. 

12/05/19 JEF Work on discovery response approach: work on motion to dismiss issues. .80 
including 9 la issiles: review email from opposing counsel regarding motion to 
quash and for protection. 

13/05/19 L.RK Research and draft new motion to dismiss plaintiffs claims: work on nile 9 la 7.()0 

1.lovd Gosselink Rochelle & -Ibwnsend, P.(:. 
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Attachment Ratepayers 3-19 
Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
T()MA Integrity Litigation 
I.D.3870-1-JEF 

January 16.2020 
Invoice: 97506700 

Date Atty Description Of Services Rendered Hours 
motion. plea to the jurisdiction ar.d motion tbr summary judgment. 

12/05/19 LRK No Charge - Research and draft new motion to dismiss plaintiffs claims: work on 2.30 
rule 9 la motion. plea to the jurisdiction and motion for summary judgment. 

] 2 /()6/ I 9 .1EF Work on plea to jurisdiction. rule 9 la. and motion for summary judgment: confer 2.10 
with counsel for directors regarding same: follow up on client deposition 
transcript. 

12/06/19 LRK Research and draft 9 la motion lo dismiss. send diaft to J. de la Fuente for review: 4.10 
send J. Gimenez deposition transcript for review: call with J. Gimenez. 

I 2/06/ ] 9 KWM O ffice con furcnce with L. Killccn to receive assignment to assist with cite .20 
checking, proof reading and editing Winderniere's Joint Motion to Dismiss Under 
Rule 91 a; First Amended Joint Brief in Support of their Pleas to the Jurisdiction 
and First Amended Joint Motion for Summary Judgment: begin assignment. 

| 2/07/19 JEF Review coninients oti draft motions from counsel for directors. .40 
12/08/19 LRK Review and incorporate edits into motion to dismiss to be filed. I JO 
12/09.19 JEF Work on motion to dismiss and plea to jurisdiction: confer uith coi,nsel for 2.60 

directors regarding same: review issues related to new cause ofaction under 
chapter 22. work on strategies for same. 

12/09/I 9 LRK Draft motion to dismiss. call with S. ()'Brian, follow up research on standing to 7.70 
bring claims. draft responses to plaintiffs fourth requests for production. 

12/10/19 JEF Prepare for and attend deposition of Dana Martin: follow up with client regarding 7.50 
same: work on discovery responses. 

12/10/19 LRK Research and drafi responses to fourth requests fur production: formulate objection 6.00 
strategy iii line with overall discovery goals. call with J Gimenez. email B. Earnest 
and S. O'Brien to set up call. review responsive documents. assign documents to 
paralegal 

12/10']9 LRK No Charge -Research mid draft responses to Iburth requests for production: 2.20 
formulate objection strategy in line with overall discovery goals. call with J 
Ginienez, email B. Earnest and S. O'Brien to set up call, review responsive 
documents, assign documents to paralegal 

I 2/l 0/19 KWM En.ail L. Killeen regardingpreviousproduceddocuments; o ffice conference 1.00 
tegatding suppleniental Pioduction and Disclosures and status of Motion to 
Dismiss under Rule 9 la: assist with additional document production. 

12/11/19 JEF Finalize discovery responses. .30 
12/11/19 LRK Research and draf: responses to fourth requests for production: refine objection 6.00 

strategy in line with overall discovery goals. call with B. Earnest ancl S. O'Brien, 
call with M. Nelson, call with D. Taylor, call with N. Morse. send to J. de la 
Fuente: begin drafting rcqicstf for disc:osnrc 

12/1]/19 LRK No Charge - Research and draft responses to fourth requests for production: refine l.70 
objection strategy in line with overall discovery goals. call with B. Earnest and S. 
O'Brien, call with M. Nelson, cal. with D. Taylor, call with N. Morse. send to J. dc 
la Fuente: begin drafting requests for disclosure. 

12/1 I/19 KWM Office conference with L. Killeen regarding final set of documents for review for 1.00 

L]ovd Gosseljnk Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 
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Attachment Ratepayers 3-19 
Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 

Winderniere Oaks Water Supply CorporaliOII 
TOMA Iiltegrity Litigation 
I.D.3870-1-JEF 

January 16,2020 
Invoice: 97506700 

Date Atty Description Of Services Rendered Hours 
Fourth production of documents; final review, redaction and bates label set of 
documents; email L. Killeen regarding same. 

12/ll/19 AAC Case file mailagemenl: pull insurance documents forlitigation practice group. .20 
12/12/19 JEF Work on discovery responses and documents to produce: follow up with counsel 1.90 

for directors on signed statements for production: review cuts of deposition video 
posted online, confer with co-defendants regarding issues relating to same: initial 
work on privilege log; follow up on deposition issues with staff; work on motion to 
dismiss. mciuding prior case admission that WOWSC is subject to TOMA and is 
not a eoop 

12/12/19 LRK Draft requests for disclosure: ensure responses are in line with over all litigation 5.00 
strategy and consistent with positions for motions moving fonvard. add exhibits to 
requests for disclosure: begin document search for privilege log for fourth requesls 
for production. 

12/12/19 LRK No Charge - Draft requests for disclosure: ensure responses are in line with over 2.90 
all litigation strategy and consistent with positions for motions moving fonvard, 
add exhibits to requests for disclosure: begin document search for privilege log for 
fourth requests for production. 

l 2/12/19 KWM Produ:tioncasemanagement: officeconferencewith L. Killeen regarding 2.00 
privilege log and responsive documents to Request for Disclosures: d,aft response 
to request for privilege log: assist with exhibits to Request for Disclosures; email 
L. Killeen regarding same: email asbignmenl from J. de la Fuente lo capture videos 
of Integrity Now on YouTL.be. 

12/12<'19 AAC Search client files for notarized indcmnification statements from former directors. .50 
email L. Killcen regarding same. 

12/13/19 JEF Review tariff for in formation relating to non-coop status; work on motion to 1.70 
dismiss rela:ine to status as a WSC vs. :oop: review denial of T()MA petition for 
review, and update client regarding same: call with counsel for directors regarding 
representation iqsiies: work on discovery reqponqes: work on draft motion to 
dismiss and motion for summary .judgment: review relevant meeting minutes. 

12/13/19 LRK Finalize drafting discovery. refine objections. edit and prepare for filing, organize 5.00 
documents to be produced and review discovery strategy inovrr.g fonvard. 

12/13/19 LRK No Charge - Finalize drafting discovery, refine objections. edit and prepare for 3.20 
filing. organize documents to be produced and review discovery strategy moving 
forward. 

12/16/19 JEF Review discovery responses; review and edit privilege log: work on motion to l.6() 
dismiss; calls witt insurance adjuster. 

12/ I 6/19 LRK Finish drafting and editing privilege log. send to J. de la Fuente, oversee document 3.00 
management with paralegal for privilege document organization, serve privilege 
log: firialize rcspoitses to fifth request fur production, organize ducunlenls lu be 
produced. 

12/16/19 LRK No Charge - Finish draAing and editing privilege log, send to J. dc la Fuente. 1.70 
oversee document nianagement with paralegal for privilege document 

1.lovrl Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.(.. 
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Attachment Ratepayers 3-19 
Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
TONIA Integrity Litigation 
I.D.3870-1-JEF 

January 16.2020 
Invoice: 97506700 

Date Atty Description Of Services Rendered Hours 
organization. serve privilege log: finalize responses to fifth request for production. 
organize documents to be produced. 

12/I 6/19 KWM Review emails and assist with documents from J. de la Fuente regarding privilege 4.00 
log: review Friendship's Responses to Plaintiff-Intervenor's Second Request for 
Production. Newly Name Directors Plea to the Jurisdiction and Original Answer. 
WOWSC's Responses to Plaintiffs' Request for Disclosure and WOWSC's Request 
for Disclosure to Intennor-Plaint:ffs: proofread and edit Joint Motion to Dismiss 
under Rule 9 ia: office conference with L. Killcen regarding Sallie. 

12/I 6/ 19 AAC Case fi le management. .10 
I 2/ 17/ 19 JEF Work on pleas to iurisdiction and Rule 9 la n:otions, including additional review of 2.80 

statutes: emails with opposing counsel regarding agreement to motion to extend 
time for their motion for rehearing. 

I 2/17/19 LRK Research governing documents for inclusion in brief. .50 
12/18/19 JEF Call from media; communicate with c[ient team regarding same, and strategy for I .90 

handling media: work on draft motion to dismiss: work on correspondence 
regarding litigation. 

12/18/19 LRK Draft, edit and research arguments to be contained in motion to dismiss. research 8.3() 
standing issues and prior cases to use as evidence fur res judicata argument. refine 
motion content to be in line with over-all litigation strategy. 

12/18/19 HEG Research Secretary of State records for certificate o f formation. .60 
12/ I 8/19 AAC Assist litigation practice group with search for discovery production documents: .10 

case file nlatiagement. 
12/19/19 JEF Work on draft motions to dismiss, including Rule 91a motion: work with co- 4.30 

defense on same: work on representation issues for defense of directors paid by 
WOWSC, including insurance coverage issues. 

12/19/19 LRK Finalize arguments in motion to dismiss, circulate to defense counsel. incorporate 6.7() 
S. O'Brien and J. de la Fuente edits to motion. call with J. Gimenez: draft 
declaration for exhibits to be included in motion to dismiss. 

12/19/19 KWM Assist with compiling and finalizing Exhibits to Rule 91 a Motion: editing and 5.00 
proofreading Motion: office conferences with L. Killeen regarding sa me. 

12/20/19 JEF Work on senii-final draft of motion to dismiss for client review. send same for 1.80 
review: review insurance coverage response, and confer with potential coverage 
counsel regarding possible paths fonvard for handling same; review comments 
from counsel for directors regarding draft motions. 

12/22/19 JEF Work on strategy issues Ior motion to disniiss: email to client regarding same: .80 
email to counsel Ibr directors regarding same. 

12/23/I9 JEF Confer with client regarding possible changes in approach/strategy on motion to 4.20 
dismiss: work on changing same: work with staffon finalizing motion for filing, 
including reviews and edits to same: confer with counsel for directors regarding 
same; finalize and file motion: send email to opposing counsel regarding same and 
scheduling. 

l 2/23/ ]9 LRK Finalize. edit and prepare for filing motion lo dismiss. draft leller lu the court to be 6.00 

l.lord Gosselhk Rochelle & Townsend, P,C. 
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Attachment Ratepayers 3-19 
Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 

V-'... I.- -· It *·.1.'IT.Pfir.-:·V.-'-/&---W..k=•1.- t' ,~.• ..··.-·..//¥~,/-i: 

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
TOMA Integrity Litigation 
1.D.3870-1-JEF 

January 16.2020 
Invoice: 97506700 

Date Atty Description Of Services Rendered Hours 
filed with motion to dismiss. read and review answer to determine if it needs to be 
modified, email copy to litigation sub-committee and other defense counsel. 
review declaration. 

12/23/19 LRK No Charge - Firlalize. edit and prepare for filiIig motion to dismiss. draft letter lo 1.20 
the court to be filed with molion lo dismiss. read and review answei to determine il 
it needs to b¢ modified, email copy to litigation sub-committee and otlicr defense 
counsel, review declaration. 

12/23/19 KWM Review Final Versions of Defendant Windermcrc Oaks Water Supply .70 
Corporation's and its Directors' Joint Motion to Dismiss Under Rule 91 a' First 
Amended Joint Briefin Support of Their Pleas to the Jurisdiction: and First 
Amended Joint Motion for Suniniary Judgment: and Correspondence to the court. 

12/30/19 JEF Review email from opposing counsel regarding motions: email with counsel for .30 
directors regarding nlotions. 

I 2/3 1 /19 J F.F Work on strategies relating to director defenses. and possible impact on entity .80 
defenses. including conference with counsel for directors regarding same: review 
motion and proposed order regarding scheduling. and prepare reply to same: work 
on alternate litigation strategies. 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES $ 32,434.50 

SIJAI]W.ARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

N a nie Staff Level Rate Hours Amount N/C Hr NiC $ 
Jose E de la Fuente Principal 300.00 3920 11.760.00 .00 .00 
J Troiipe Brewer Associate .00 .00 .00 .SO 216.00 
Lindsay R Kil[een Associate 235.00 78.30 18.400.50 22.20 5.217.00 
Hannah E Ging Para legal 130.00 60 78-00 .00 .0() 
Karen W Mailing Litigation 135.00 15.40 2.079.00 .00 .00 
Audrey A Cooper Paralegal 130.00 90 117.00 .00 .00 
TOTALS 134.40 $ 32.434.50 23.00 $ 5.433.00 

DISBURSEMENTS 

Date Description Amount 
12/05/19 Lanier Parking Inc. Check # - 000037775 Lanier Parking Inc.. Parking. November 75.00 

2019 Parking Validations for 816 Congress Garage. 12/5/2019 
I 2/06/l 9 Kim Tindall & Assoei Check # - 000037837 Kim Tindal[ & Associates. LLC. 900.77 

Citation of Sen,ice, Certi fied Copy of J. Gimenez Transcript, 12/6/2019 
Color Prints I .00 

1.!ovd Gosselink Hocllelle & lownsend. 1-).C. 
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Attachment Ratepayers 3-19 
Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 

-r-'te7'~- .·Ir.- ·-~*- ..,- . . -/ . / .- /. 

Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation 
TOMA Integrity Litigation 
I.D.3870-1-JEF 

January 16,2020 
Invoice: 97506700 

Date Description Amount 
12/31/19 GL Grp 0014237/00007 Voucher # - 000000000 December 2019 Secretary of State 3.00 

Web Inquiries, Research 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $ 979.77 

TOTAL THIS INVOICE $ 33,414.27 

lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 
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Attachment Ratepayers 3-19 

ENOCH KEVER PLLC 
Bridgepoint Plaza 

5918 W. Courlyard Dr., Suite 500 
Austin, TX 78730 

(512)615-1210 
Tax I.D. Number: 27-4508316 

November 30,2019 

Invoice N o.: 10352 
Joseph J. Gimenez Ill Client N o.: 19062 
Windennere Oaks Water Supply Corporation Matter No.: 00001 
345 Coventry Road Bill Through: 11/30/2019 
Spicewood, Texas 78669 

Re: Land Sale Litigation 

Balance of invoice dated: 10/31/2019 $3,956.46 
Net Balance Forward $3,956.46 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

11/01/2019 SLO Confer with clients regarding status of the case; draft amended answer; 
confer with Bob Mebane regarding deposition preparation; confer with 
Lindsay Killeen regarding potenlial additional defenses. 

11/01/2019 LL Proofread and linalize amended plea to the jurisdiction and amended 
answer; lile same. 

1.00 hrs 

0.80 hrs 

11/01/2019 PKL Review and revise amended answer. 0.10 hrs 

11/03/2019 SLO Review Plain~ffs' First Amended Petition. 1.00 hrs 

11/04/2019 SLO Conference with defense counsel regarding Plaintiffs' First Amended 0.50 hrs 
Petition. 

11/04/2019 LL Review all filings; review deadlines. 0.50 hrs 

11/06/2019 SLO Conference call with defense counsel regarding plaintiffs' amended 0.60 hrs 
petition. 

11/07/2019 SLO Review opposing counsel's lengthy emails and Joe de la Fuente's 0.40 hrs 
response regarding emails; confer with defense counsel. 

11/08/2019 SLO Review and analyze briefs in support of pleas to Ihe jurisdiction, 1.00 hrs 
motions for summary judgment, and Plaintiffs' Second Amended 
Pelition. 

11/11/2019 SLO Review summary judgment/brief lilings and attached evidence; review 2.40 hrs 
and analyze Second Amended Peuon; confer with clients regarding 
same. 

11/12/2019 SLO Review and analyze Second Amended Petition; confer with defense 1.30 hrs 
counsel regarding discovery requests; confer with Dana Martin 
regarding notice of deposition. 

11/12/2019 LL Review notices of intent to take oral deposition. 0.20 hrs 

11/13/2019 SLO Review Plaintiffs' new discovery requests; conference call wilh defense 1.00 hrs 
counseL 
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Attachment Ratepayers 3-19 
Windermere WS Directors Page 2 
Client Number 19062 

11/13/2019 LL Review several new discovery filings and calculate deadlines. 0.40 hrs 

11/14/2019 SLO Multiple conferences with opposing counsel and defense counsel 1.00 hrs 
regarding deposition of Dana Martin. 

11/15/2019 SLO Draft motion to quash and for protective order related to Dana Martin's 0.80 hrs 
deposition; confer with Molly Mitchell regarding same. 

11/15/2019 LL Proofread motion to quash; draft exhibits for same; finalize and file 0,70 hrs 
motion to quash. 

11/16/2019 SLO Confer with opposing counsel and defense counsel regarding discovery 0.50 hrs 
issues; confer with WOWSC counsel regarding potential representation 
of recently-named individual director defendants. 

11/18/2019 SLO Meeting with Bob Mebane to prepare for deposition; confer with Dana 4.20 hrs 
Martin; confer with Joe Gimenez; review WOWSC and Friendship 
Home's document production ahead of depositions. 

11/18/2019 LL Review and download Friendship production and other discovery filings. 0.30 hrs 

11/19/2019 SLO Participate in deposition of Joe Gimenez; confer with Bob Mebane 
regarding his deposition. 

7.30 hrs 

11/20/2019 SLO Prepare for deposition with Bob Mebane; defend Bob Mebane's 7.80 hrs 
deposition; debrief with Bob Mebane. 

11/21/2019 SLO Confer with Kathryn Allen regarding service of process; confer with 0.30 hrs 
defense counsel regarding next steps. 

11/21/2019 LL Review amended petition and calculate deadline for answer for newly 0.20 hrs 
named defendants and deadline for TRCP 91a motion to dismiss. 

11/22/2019 SLO Confer with defense counsel regarding notices of depositions; confer 0.50 hrs 
with opposing counsel regarding same. 

11/22/2019 LL Review second notice of deposition of Dana Martin; discuss same with 0.50 hrs 
Shelby O'Brien; calculate deadlines for motion to quash. 

11/25/2019 SLO Call with defense counsel; review Kathryn Allen:s email regarding 0.40 hrs 
discovery. 

11/26/2019 SLO Review discovery requests to Dana Marlin and confer with Molly 0.60 hrs 
Mitchell regarding documents produced; conference with defense 
counsel. 

11/26/2019 LL Review newly filed discovery; organize all discovery. 0.30 hrs 

11/27/2019 SLO Review new deposition notices; confer with defense counsel regarding 0.40 hrs 
depositions. 

11/27/2019 LL Review amended notice of deposition of WOWSC Corporate 0.10 hrs 
Representalive. 
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Windermere WS Directors Page 3 
Client Number 19062 

Timekeeper Summary 
Timekeeper Hours Rate Amount 

Lindsey, Laci 4.00hrs 150.00 $600.00 

Lear, Paula K. 0.10hrs 300.00 $30.00 
O'Bden, Shelby 33.00hrs 300.00 $9,900.00 

Total fees for this matter $10,530.00 

EXPENSES 

11/30/2019 Westlaw/Electronic Research 1.87 

Total expenses for this matter $1.87 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL EXPENSES 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS INVOICE 

NET BALANCE FORWARD 

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE 

$10,530.00 

$1.87 

$10,531.87 

$3,956.46 

$14,488.33 
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Attachment Ratepayers 3-19 

ENOCH KEVER PLLC 
Bridgepoint Plaza 

5918 W. Courtyard Dr., Suite 500 
Austin, TX 78730 

(512) 615-1210 
Tax I.D. Number: 27-4508316 

Decem-ber 31, 2019 

Invoice N o.: 10518 
Joseph J. Gimenez Ill Client No.: 19062 
Windermere Oaks Water Supply Corporation Matter No.: 00001 
345 Coventry Road Bill Through: 12/31/2019 
Spicewood, Texas 78669 

Re: Land Sale Litigation 

Balance of invoice dated: 11/30/2019 
Net Balance Forward 

$14,488.33 
$14,488.33 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

12/02/2019 SLO Confer with defense counsel regarding amended disposilive filing; 
confer with Dana Martin regarding scheduled deposition. 

0.20 hrs 

12/03/2019 SLO Coordinate preparation for Dana Martin deposition. 0.20 hrs 

12/04/2019 SLO Review WOWSC's motion for protective order. 0.10 hrs 

12/05/2019 SLO Email clients update on status of case; confer wilh defense counsel 0.30 hrs 
regarding written discovery. 

12/05/2019 LL Review and conlirm upcoming deadlines; draft second amended 0.50 hrs 
answer. 

12/06/2019 SLO Research and revise amended dispositive motion to dismiss. 3.70 hrs 

12/07/2019 SLO Research and revise amended dispositive motion to dismiss. 4.00 hrs 

12/09/2019 SLO Draft Second Amended Answer; prepare for Dana Martin deposition; 
review documents provided by client; call with WOWSC counsel 
regarding amended disposilive hearing. 

4.00 hrs 

12/09/2019 LL Review new documents from client. 0.10 hrs 

12/10/2019 SLO Prepare for Dana Martin's deposition; defend Dana Martin's deposition. 8.50 hrs 

12/11/2019 SLO Telephone call with Bill Earnest and Lindsay Killeen regarding 0.90 hrs 
responses to requests for production; review WOWSC's production. 

12/12/2019 SLO Confer wilh co-counsel regarding amended answers; confer with 
defense counsel regarding potential claims; review and comment on 
Friendship Homes' responses to requests for production; review and 
edit responses to requests for disclosure; research additional defenses 
for assertion. 

4.30 hrs 

12/12/2019 LL Revise and linalize original answer of newly named directors; tile same; 
draft response to request for disclosure; revise same; review recent 
discovery filings; discuss discovery matters with Shelby O'Brien. 

1.60 hrs 
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Windermere WS Directors Page 2 
Client Number 19062 

12/12/2019 GEZ 

12/13/2019 SLO 

12/13/2019 LL 

Address and frame proper wording and handling of discovery 
responses and proper identification of witnesses on potentially collateral 
issues and provide recommendations to protect clients. 
Research potential defenses for directors; draft amended answer; draft 
and serve responses to requests for disclosure; confer with directors 
regarding indemnificalion forms. 
Review and revise response to request for disclosure; finalize and 
serve same; save newly produced documents. 

0.20 hrs 

3.40 hrs 

1.00 hrs 

12/17/2019 SLO Phone calls with clients. 0.70 hrs 

12/17/2019 LL Review rules governing 91 a motion and TCPA motion; calculate 
deadlines for newly named directors and check deadline for original 
directors; discuss same with Shelby O'Brien. 

0.40 hrs 

12/18/2019 SLO Multiple conferences with clients regarding case. 3.60 hrs 

12/19/2019 SLO Research and revise amended motion for summary judgment, 
amended brief in support of plea to the jurisdiction, and Rule 91a 
motion to dismiss; conference with defense counsel and client about 
issues in case. 

5.30 hrs 

12/20/2019 SLO Confer with clients regarding amended dispostive filing; make linal 2.00 hrs 
revisions to dispositive filing; confer with defense counsel regarding 
same. 

12/20/2019 SLO 

12/30/2019 SLO 

Review defense counsel's edits to amended dispositive filing; confer 
with Joe de la Fuente regarding same. 

Confer with client regarding deposition transcript and erratta; email 
update to clients regarding status of case; review correspondence from 
opposing counsel; research viability of a motion to dismiss under the 
Texas Citizens Participation Act. 

0.40 hrs 

2.20 hrs 

12/30/2019 LL Review recent filings; review calendar of deadlines; communicate with 0.60 hrs 
court reporter regarding payment for deposition. 

12/31/2019 SLO Research viability of motion to dismiss under tile Texas Citizens 1.80 hrs 
Participation Act; confer with Joe de la Fuente regarding same. 

Timekeeper Summary 
Timekeeper Hours Rate Amount 

Zausmer, Gary E. 0.20 hrs 300.00 $60.00 
Lindsey, Laci 4.20 hrs 150.00 $630.00 

O:Brien, Shelby 45.60h]-s 300.00 $13,680.00 

Total fees for this matter $14,370.00 
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EXPENSES 

12/10/2019 Apple Spice - Lunch during Dana Martin deposition 51.92 
12/31/2019 Kim Tindall & Associates (Invoice # 69355) - Court reporting services 891.73 
12/31/2019 Westlaw/Electronic Research 63.52 

Total expenses for this matter $1,007.17 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL EXPENSES 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS INVOICE 

N ET BALAN CE FORWARD 

TOTAL BALANCENOW DUE 

$14,370.00 

$1,007.17 

$15,377.17 

$14,488.33 

$29,865.50 
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REQUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-20 State whether lhe WOWSC intends to pursue recovery of litigation 
expenses paid, advanced or reimbursed for each individual defendant in 
Cause No. 48292 as to whom it is finally determined that the person has not 
met the standard set forth in 8.101(a) or that indemnification is prohibited 
by Section 8.102. 

RESPONSE: Ratepayers have agreed to withdraw this RFI. 

WOWSC's Response to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for Information 22 
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REOUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-21 If the answer to the preceding RFI was anything other than an unequivocal 
"yes" for each person as to whom it is finally determined that the person has 
not met the standard set forth in 8.101(a) or that indemnification is 
prohibited by Section 8.102, state the legal and facmal bases (if ally) on 
which the WOWSC contends it need not pursue such recovery. 

RESPONSE: Ratepayers have agreed to withdraw this RFI. 

W OW SC's Resp on se to Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for In formation 23 
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-20-4071.WS 
PUC DOCKET NO. 50788 

WINDERMERE OAKS WATER SUPPLY CORPORATION'S RESPONSE TO 
RATEPAYERS REPRESENTATIVES THIRD REOUEST FOR INFORMATION 

Ratepayers 3-22 Provide the WOWSC's determination and calculation of the demand of 
$250,000 in Case 1:21-CV-00258-RP (see exhibit B) and if this demand 
includes legal expenses from 2019 which the WOWSC included in the 2020 
WOWSC rate increase. 

RESPONSE: Ratepayers 3-22 is subject to a pending objection. 

Prepared by 
Sponsored by: 

WOWSC's Responseto Ratepayers Representatives 
Th ird Request for In formation 24 
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