Reference No.:

128317-00788-LSD1

Page 3

Invoice No: 1615351 Invoice Date: 09/10/18

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>	Rate	<u>Description</u>
08/08/18	A. Mehta	1.9	684.00	360.00	Calls with Staff (O. Spencer) to discuss Staff's comments on settlement stipulation and proposed order; revise settlement stipulation, proposed order, and joint motion to admit evidence and prepare all documents for filing. (Settlement)
08/14/18	A. Mehta	0.3	108.00	360.00	Review SOAH Order No. 5 and send necessary documents to PUC as instructed in order. (Settlement)
Total Hours	5	14.9			

Total Fees \$5,960.40

SUMMARY BY TIMEKEEPER

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Partners:			
S. Sparks	3.30	560.00	\$ 1,848.00
Total Partners	3.30		\$ 1,848.00
Associates:			
A. Mehta	11.20	360.00	\$ 4,032.00
Total Associates	11.20		\$ 4,032.00
Paralegals:			
P. Collins	0.40	201.00	\$ 80.40
Total Paralegals	0.40		\$ 80.40
TOTAL	14.90		\$ 5,960.40

TOTAL FOR THIS NOTATIONAL INVOICE:

\$5,960.40



Remit by mail to: P. O. Box 130989 Dallas, Tx 75313-0989

Remit by wire or ACH to:

Federal Tax ID:

Payment due upon receipt. Please include Invoice No. with remittance.

 Ref No.: 128317-00788-LSD1
 Invoice No: 1624934

 (214)953-5826/vholley@jw.com
 Page 1
 Invoice Date: 11/08/18

PNM Resources, Inc. Legal Apay MS0806 414 Silver Avenue SW Albuquerque, NM 87102

Re: TNMP EECRF 2018

201700089

NOTATIONAL INVOICE for legal services rendered and expenses incurred in connection with the above-referenced matter under the Legal Services Retainer Agreement for the period ending 10/31/18:

NOTATIONAL INVOICE SUMMARY

Total Fees \$4,368.00

Total Expenses 0.00

Total For This Notational Invoice: \$4,368.00

Page 42 of 45

Reference No.:

128317-00788-LSD1

Page 2

Invoice No: 1624934 Invoice Date: 11/08/18

TIME DETA	AIL: Timekeeper	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Description</u>
<u>Duto</u>	Timokoopor	<u> </u>	7 till Galle	<u>rtato</u>	
10/06/18	S. Sparks	1.8	1,008.00	560.00	Further analyze Proposed Order. (Settlement)
10/08/18	S. Sparks	1.1	616.00	560.00	Analyze Proposed Order from CADM, and correspondence with client regarding revisions to same; telephone conference with Staff regarding revisions to same. (Settlement)
10/09/18	S. Sparks	2.4	1,344.00	560.00	Analyze Staff's Correction of Proposed Order; correspondence with client regarding same. (Settlement)
10/10/18	S. Sparks	1.6	896.00	560.00	Prepare Corrections to Proposed Order; analyze PUC Rules regarding EECRF requirements for same. (Settlement)
10/11/18	S. Sparks	0.4	224.00	560.00	Review revised Proposed Order; correspondence with client regarding changes to same and next steps. (Settlement)
10/12/18	S. Sparks	0.5	280.00	560.00	Attend Open Meeting to determine approval of Final Order. (Settlement)
Total Hours	3	7.8			

Total Fees \$4,368.00

SUMMARY BY TIMEKEEPER

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Partner:			
S. Sparks	7.80	560.00	\$ 4,368.00
Total Partner	7.80		\$ 4,368.00
TOTAL	7.80	_	\$ 4,368.00

TOTAL FOR THIS NOTATIONAL INVOICE:

\$4,368.00



Remit by mail to: P. O. Box 130989 Dallas, Tx 75313-0989

Remit by wire or ACH to:

Federal Tax ID:

Payment due upon receipt. Please include Invoice No. with remittance.

Ref No.: 128317-00789-LSD1 Invoice No: 1624947 (214)953-5826/vholley@jw.com Page 1 Invoice Date: 11/08/18

PNM Resources, Inc. Legal Apay MS0806 414 Silver Avenue SW Albuquerque, NM 87102

Re: TNMP EECRF 2018 - non retainer expense matter .788

201700089

For expenses incurred in connection with the above-referenced matter for the period ending 10/31/18:

INVOICE SUMMARY

Total Expenses 22.00

Total Due This Invoice: \$22.00

Page 44 of 45

Reference No.: 128317-00789-LSD1 Page 2 Invoice No: 1624947 Invoice Date: 11/08/18

EXPENSE SUMMARY:

E107 Delivery Fees 22.00

Total Expenses <u>22.00</u>

EXPENSE DETAILS:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	Quantity	<u>Amount</u>	
10/10/18	Delivery Fees Courier Depot; Ticket #851206; Requester = Elizabeth Foix (512) 236-2341; Destination = 100 Congress Avenue Ste. 1100		12.00	
10/10/18	Delivery Fees Courier Depot; Ticket #851206.01; Requester = Elizabeth Foix (512) 236-2341; Destination = 1701 N Congress Ave G-113		10.00	
Total Exper	nses			22.00

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE: \$22.00

Page 45 of 45

90	
Customer Number	
Imining Musebas	
Invoice Number	
105385	
Invoice Date	
10/13/2018	

On Demand

Date Ready Order Type Deliver Date	Order ID Caller	Origin	Destination		References	
10/10/2018 11.38 AM	851206	Jackson Walker LLP	Public Utility Com		128317.00788	
Rush Bike 10/10/2018 12 36 PM	Elizabeth Foix (512) 236-2341	100 Congress Avenue Ste 1 Austin TX 78701	100 1701 N Congress Austin TX 78701-			
			Rush Bike	\$12.00		
POD: Puc stamp			Order Total:	\$12.00		
10/10/2018 12 08 PM ASAP Bike	851206.01	Public Utility Commission 1701 N Congress Ave G-113	Jackson Walker L 100 Congress Av		128317.00788	
10/10/2018 12.23 PM	Elizabeth Foix (512) 236-2341	Austin TX 78701-1494	Austin TX 78701			
			ASAP Bike	\$10.00	<u>.</u>	

of 9

Docket No. 48404 - TNMP 2019 EECRF Cities Rate Case Expenses

	Invoice Date	Invoice No.	Billing Period	Through Period	Invoice Amount	Total Billed to Date		
Lloyd Gosselink	7/12/2018	97493474	6/1/2018	6/30/2018	\$1,933.07	\$ 1,933.07		
	8/8/2018	97494180	7/1/2018	7/31/2018	\$2,306.18	\$ 4,239.25		
	9/12/2018	97494881	8/1/2018	8/31/2018	\$ 715.00	\$ 4,954.25		
							\$	4,954.25
							Ė	,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,
ReSolved Energy	7/5/2018	4221	6/1/2018	6/30/2018	\$1,510.50	\$ 1,510.50		
	8/7/2018	4238	7/1/2018	7/31/2018	\$1,950.00	\$3,460.50		
				;			\$	3,460.50
Lloyd Gosselink +	,							
Consultant	7/12/2018	97493474	6/1/2018			\$ 3,443.57		
	8/8/2018	97494180	7/1/2018	7/31/2018	\$4,256.18	\$ 7,699.75		
	9/12/2018	97494881	8/1/2018	8/31/2018	\$ 715.00	\$ 8,414.75		
TOTAL							\$	8,414.75



Exhibit MSS-3

Page 2 of 28 16 Congress Avenue, Suite 1900 Austin, Texas 78701

Telephone: (512) 322-5800 Facsimile: (512) 472-0532

www.lglawfirm.com

July 12, 2018

Cities Served by TNMP Attn Bobby Gervais

City Attorney c/o City of Manvel Texas

PO Box 187

Manvel, TX USA 77578

Invoice:

97493474

Client:

1670

Matter: Billing Attorney:

33 CLB

INVOICE SUMMARY

For professional services and disbursements rendered through June 30, 2018:

RE: 2019 TNMP EECRF

Professional Services Total Disbursements

\$ 1,898.00 \$1,545.57

TOTAL THIS INVOICE

\$3,443.57

Lloya Gosselink Rochelle & Townsena, P.C.

TNMP Cities Steering Committee 2019 TNMP EECRF I.D.1670-33-CLB July 12, 2018 Invoice: 97493474

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Date	Atty	Description Of Services Rendered	Hours
6/04/18	TRL	Review filing and prepare summary email to client group; prepare intervention resolution; prepare model staff report; prepare engagement agreement with K. Nalepa and send to him for review and signature; distribute protective order certifications for signature in preparation for filing; draft, file, and serve motion to intervene (Administration).	1.30
6/05/18	TLB	Review filing and distribute client communication; review filing and engagement agreement (Administration).	1.30
6/05/18	TRL	Prepare, finalize, file, and serve Cities Protective Order Certifications; send copy of certifications to Counsel and request a copy of all confidential filed with the Application; prepare draft list of issues for attorney review; scan and save fully executed engagement agreement with K. Nalepa and send to him for his file (Administration).	.90
6/06/18	TLB	Review application (Administration).	.90
6/07/18	TLB	Review filing and issues (Administration).	.50
6/07/18	ЛLМ	Review list of issues; review application (Administration).	.80
6/07/18	TRL	Prepare copy of confidential information and send to K. Nalepa for consultant review; prepare log of confidential materials received (Administration).	.30
6/12/18	JLМ	Telephone call and correspondence regarding procedural schedule (Administration).	.30
6/15/18	TRL	Update resolution tracking chart with new resolutions received; review incoming documents and organize accordingly for attorney review (Administration).	.20
6/20/18	ЛLМ	Finalize RFIs; call to K. Nalepa regarding findings with applications; conference with T. Brocato regarding proceeding status (Administration).	.20
6/26/18	JLM	Prepare Request for Hearing (Administration).	.30
6/26/18	TRL	Calendar all deadlines from Procedural Schedule (Administration).	.30
6/29/18	TRL	Finalize, file, and serve Cities Served by TNMP's Request for Hearing (Administration).	.30

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

\$ 1,898.00

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Name	Staff Level	Hours	Rate	Total
Thomas L Brocato	Principal	2.70	375.00	1,012.50
Jamie L Mauldin	Associate	1.60	275.00	440.00
Tanya R Leisey	Paralegal	3.30	135.00	445.50
TOTALS		7.60		\$ 1,898.00

DISBURSEMENTS

Lloya Gosselink Rochelle & Townsenu, P.C.

TNMP Cities Steering Committee 2019 TNMP EECRF I.D.1670-33-CLB July 12, 2018 Invoice: 97493474

Date	Description	Amount
6/15/18	Corporate Couriers Check # - 000035336 Corporate Couriers, Courier services, 6/15/2018	8.00
6/15/18	Corporate Couriers Check # - 000035336 Corporate Couriers, Courier services, 6/15/2018	8.00
6/15/18	Corporate Couriers Check # - 000035336 Corporate Couriers, Courier services, 6/15/2018	12.00
6/15/18	Corporate Couriers Check # - 000035336 Corporate Couriers, Courier services, 6/15/2018	7.07
6/30/18	ReSolved Energy Cons Voucher # - 000094945 Resolved Energy Consulting, LLC, Consultant Services, Professional services for June 2018 - Regarding Project LG TNMP 18 EECRF (48404), 7/5/2018	1,510.50
	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	\$ 1,545.57
	TOTAL THIS INVOICE	\$ 3,443.57

CORPORATE COURIERS
2335 KRAMER LAME, STE. F V
AUSTIN, IX 78758
41599

LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW 816 CONGRESS AVE SUITE 1909 AUSTIN, TX 78701 RECEIVED

JUN 19 2018 ·

Lloyd Gosselink

TINYOLOG NOZW	*Customer No.
51656	1201
TEN INVESTMENT	A 25 J. Foto Dun
6/15/18	WAS THE BEAUTIFUL
(分に)中心のない	「本意味」は、またのでは、またいできる。
#3 - 14 F. S. S. 124 14.	PROBLEM COLUMN ENGL.

NOW ACCEPTING VISA, M/C & AMEX FOR INVOICE PAYMENT PLEASE CALL 512.479.4007 TO GET SETUP.

				Cimioweald	Invoice No.5	Redoc Engine	Amount Due	A01 P (4.77)			
	O-10 N - 400	L Mines		1201	51656	6/15/18	1,116.89				
Company (A.)	Unit No	2AC	企业总域的企业的	小海岸的地域	250 M	THE PASSED STATES	Secretary Secretary	A CHARLES	T.K.	Coarges	13-3-3-4-4-10001
6/04/17	405526	18K 18K	916 CONGRE AUSTIU Caller: OF Signed: -RO	TX 78701 FICE SERVICES	Time: 14:59	PUC 1701 N, CONGRESS AUSTIN Wght: 1 Lbs	S AVE. TX 76701	Base Return	:	12.00 12.00	24.00
6/05/1±	90585 t	18K 18K	916 CONGRE AUSTIN Calier: OF Signed: MC	TX 76701 FICE SERVICES DADE	Fime: 14:42	PUC 1701 M. COMGRESS: JUSTIN Wght: 1 Lbs	5 AVE. TX 76701	Base Return	*	12.00	24.00

CORPORATE COURIERS
2325 KRAMER LAME, STE. F
AUSTIN, TX 78759
41998

إفر

	Gustomer No
51656	1201
Control Date (1995)	SERVICE TO SERVICE SERVICES
6/15/18	1,116.69
のないないないというない	いからは、意味されていますの
The Design of the second of the second	1757年於中國的集制了47

LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW \$16 CONGRESS AVE SUITE 1900 AUSTIN, TX 78701

NOW ACCEPTING VISA,M/C & AMEX FOR INVOICE PAYMENT PLEASE CALL 512.479.4007 TO GET SETUP.

				- Customer No.	involce No.	Send endud.	Amount Pine	P. 6.10	95 KGP			
				1201	51656	6/15/18	1,116.09	1 4				
Date	Ords:No.:	Svc	是自然企業的	"你们的"	TENENT C		STATE OF THE STATE	100	4.77	CO. 5	Charges	是中心是E TOMIN
6/08/18	806680	18K 18X	elé CONGRU AUSTIN Caller: O Signed: Ro	TX 78701 PFICE SERVICES DRIGUEZ	Time: 12:40	1	TX 78701	12.5	Base Return	:	12.00 12.00	24.00
1		1 1	10	M CUERTER LOS	Ret JAKY	1670-33 1669-46:	24.00		1			

CORPORATE COURIERS 2335 KRAMER LAME, STE. F AUSTIN, TX 78758 41998

į.

LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW 916 CONGRESS AVE SUITE 1900 AUSTIN, TX 70701

Zinvoice No.	DCWHOLENGE WY
51656	1201
まな可可ない 対象光線	TOTAL DURN HOLES
6/15/19	1,116.69
CARLO	ればきたないまないということ
Bereit entre 1915 en 1930	n germe karendi.

NOW ACCEPTING VISA, M/C & MAEX FOR INVOICE PAYMENT PLEASE CALL 512.479.4007 TO GET SETUP.

		-		i Sinstomacko i		a konduranda ka	AN ANGENIE DE LE				
— • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •				1201	51656	6/15/18	1,116.89		Marana Suri 1859		
Date	Graf No.	Sve	公共是在1000万万 里	企業的企業	19 (19 a) 5 10 11 11 11 11 11 11 11 11 11 11 11 11		्रिक्ट क्षेत्रक्ष्याच्या स्टब्स् इत्यास्त्रक्ष्याच्या स्टब्स्		学派手机	in in the same of	Production Control
6/07/18	8 0 6 304	4HR	816 COMGRE AUSTIN Caller: OF	ELINK ROCHELLE SS AVE TX 7070 FIGE SERVICES TA STEVENS) 1	RESOLVED ENERGY 11044 RESEARCH B AUSTIN Wght: 1 Lbs		LLC Basi Fue	Srchg:	12.50 1.63	14.13
			•		r Ref TRL 1	669-46 (1670-33:	14.13	7.06	7.07		

ReSolved Energy Consulting, LLC

11044 Research Blvd, A-420 Austin, Texas 78759 Phone (512) 331-4949

Invoice

DATE	INVOICE NUMBER
7/5/2018	4221

BILL TO	
Thomas Brocato	
Lloyd Gosselink Law Firm	
816 Congress Ave, # 1900	
Austin, Tx 78701	

		PROJECT			
	LG	LG TNMP 18 EECRF (48404)			
DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	AMOUNT		
Consulting (Nalepa) Consulting (Murphy) Total Labor		.1 260.00 .9 205.00			
Work Completed thru - June 30, 2018	1	TOTAL DUE	\$1,510.50		

REC p. 12083

Monthly Recap

Karl Nalepa

Date	Task	Hours
June 4, 2018	Review filing. Complete and submit protective order certifications. (Admin/CM 0.70)	0.70
June 7, 2018	Review preliminary issues and send comments to J. Mauldin. (Admin/CM 0.30)	0.30
	Review draft prefiminary order. (Admin/CM 0.20)	0.20
June 12, 2018	Review proposed procedural schedule and discuss with J. Mauktin. (Admin/CM 0.20)	0.20
June 14, 2018	Emails with T. Brocato and J. Mauldin regarding case issues. Monitor PUC Open Meeting regarding	
	order on bonus calculation. (Policy 0.30)	0.30
June 15, 2018	Download and review latest filings. (Admin/CM 0.20)	0.20
	Review filing. (Misc Acctg 0.20)	0.20
June 19, 2018	Analyze issues and prepare discovery. (Misc Acctg 1.00)	1.00
June 20, 2018	Complete discovery and send to T. Brocato. Call with T. Brocato and J. Mauldin to discuss issues.	
	Prepare summary of adjustments and send to T. Brocato. (Admin/CM 0.80)	0.80
June 21, 2018	Prepare revised bonus adjustment then reverse revision based on Commission's order. (Misc Accig	
	0.20)	0.20
June 26, 2018	Discuss bonus adjustment with B. Murphy. (Admin/CM 0.30)	0.30
	Prepare draft testimony, (Policy 0.70)	0.70

5.10

Admin/CM = Administration/Case Management Misc Acctg = Miscellaneous Accounting

LG TIMP EECRF 48404 Recap_June 2018_KJN

REC p. 2143

Monthly Recap

Brian T. Murphy

Date	Task	Hours
	Review filing and bonus calculation. (Misc Acctg 0.60)	0.60
June 26, 2018	Review Commission decision on EECRF bonus, discuss with K. Nalepa. (Policy 0.30)	0.30
		0.90

Misc Acctg = Miscellaneous Accounting

LG TNMP 18 EECRF 48404

Recap_June 2018_BTM

REC p. 334 3



816 Congress Avenue, Suite 1900 Austin, Texas 78701 Telephone: (512) 322-5800 Facsimile: (512) 472-0532

www.lglawfirm.com

August 8, 2018

Cities Served by TNMP Attn Bobby Gervais City Attorney c/o City of Manvel Texas

PO Box 187

Manvel, TX USA 77578

Invoice:

97494180

Client: Matter: 1670

Billing Attorney:

33 **CLB**

INVOICE SUMMARY

For professional services and disbursements rendered through July 31, 2018:

RE: 2019 TNMP EECRF

Professional Services Total Disbursements

\$ 2,170.00 \$ 2,086.18

TOTAL THIS INVOICE

\$4,256.18

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C.

TNMP Cities Steering Committee 2019 TNMP EECRF I.D.1670-33-CLB August 8, 2018 Invoice: 97494180

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Date	Atty	Description Of Services Rendered	Hours
7/05/18	TRL	Prepare rate case expense tracking spreadsheet and update with invoice received from	.20
		K. Nalepa (Administration).	
7/10/18	JLM	Telephone call with PUC Staff regarding issues and RFI (Administration).	.20
7/11/18	TLB	Review filings and issues (Administration).	.30
7/17/18	JLM	Telephone call with K. Nalepa regarding settlement issues; telephone calls with	1.10
		TNMP regarding same; correspondence regarding same; telephone calls with PUC	
		Staff regarding same (Administration).	
7/17/18	TRL	Revise rate case expense tracking chart with the invoice for June time	.10
		(Administration).	
7/18/18	JLM	Correspondence regarding potential settlement; advise K. Nalepa to draft testimony	.40
		(Administration).	
7/18/18	TRL	Prepare rate case expense affidavit and supporting documentation in preparation of	.60
		filing with testimony on Friday (Rate Case Expense).	
7/19/18	JLM	Review and finalize testimony; telephone calls with PUC Staff regarding issues	1.40
		(Administration).	
7/19/18	TRL	Proofread the Direct Testimony of Karl Nalepa (Administration).	.60
7/20/18	TRL	Finalize, file, and serve the Direct Testimony of Karl Nalepa (Administration).	.50
7/23/18	JLM	Telephone calls with K. Nalepa regarding settlement; telephone call with TNMP	1.40
		regarding settlement; telephone call with PUC Staff regarding settlement;	
		correspondence regarding same (Administration).	
7/24/18	JLM	Settlement call with TNMP and PUC Staff; follow-up call with K. Nalepa	.70
		(Administration).	
7/26/18	JLM	Telephone call with K. Nalepa regarding RFIs; telephone call with S. Sparks	.80
		regarding RFIs and settlement offer; correspondence regarding same	
		(Administration).	
7/31/18	JLM	Telephone call with O. Spencer (PUC) regarding settlement status; correspondence	.50
		regarding settlement; confer with T. Brocato regarding status (Administration).	

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

\$ 2,170.00

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Name	Staff Level	Hours	Rate	Total
Thomas L Brocato	Principal	.30	375.00	112.50
Jamie L Mauldin	Associate	6.50	275.00	1,787.50
Tanya R Leisey	Paralegal	2.00	135.00	270.00
TOTALS		8.80		\$ 2,170.00

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C.

TNMP Cities Steering Committee 2019 TNMP EECRF I.D.1670-33-CLB

August 8, 2018 Invoice: 97494180

DISBURSEMENTS

Date	Description	Amount
6/30/18	Corporate Couriers Check # - 000035385 Corporate Couriers, Courier services, 6/30/2018	5.00
6/30/18	Corporate Couriers Check # - 000035385 Corporate Couriers, Courier services, 6/30/2018	6.00
7/13/18	Corporate Couriers Check # - 000035422 Corporate Couriers, Courier Services, 7/13/2018	8.48
	Photocopying	68.70
7/31/18	Corporate Couriers Check # - 000035494 Corporate Couriers, Courier Services, 7/31/2018	20.00
7/31/18	Corporate Couriers Check # - 000035494 Corporate Couriers, Courier Services, 7/31/2018	28.00
7/31/18	ReSolved Energy Cons Voucher # - 000095445 ReSolved Energy Consulting, LLC, Consultant Services, Professional services for July 2018 - Regarding Project LG TNMP 18 EECRF (48404), 8/7/2018	1,950.00

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS \$ 2,086.18

TOTAL THIS INVOICE \$ 4,256.18

CORPOPATE COURTERS 1999 KRAMER LAME, STE. F ANNIEL, TX 76758 41448

LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW 816 CONTRESS AVE SUITE 1400 AUSTIN, TX 74701

invoice No.	- Customer No
51837	1201
Tinve Date	Total Dus
#/ 10/ LB	549.69
于大学学者中国的 对	画は特殊はくさんでも
the periodicine of the	10.00

NCH ACCEPTING VISA, N/C 4 AMEX FOR INVOICE PAYMENT PLEASE CALL 512,479,4007 TO GET SETUP.

				Cratomer No?	Invoice No.	Period Ending	. Amount Due	23 4 4 BASSON			_
				129;	51837	6/30/18	549,69			Charman II -	
Date	Ordr No	Syci			Sorvice	Dotall 2	San	re-ingrapheteristis	****	cusinos.	<u> </u>
1/20/14	45,624¢	SBK SKX	F16 CONGR AUSTIN Calter: O	SELINK ROCHELLE ESS AVE TX 7370: FFICE SERVICES . RODRIGUEZ	1	PUC 1701 M. CONGRES AUSTIN Wigher 1 Lbs	TX 79701	Base Retu		10.00	30.00
j			Total	Charges for Re	of SPLIT	COSTS SEE BELCW:	20.00			}.	
\$/25/18	-11416	18E 26E	LLOYD GCS 516 COMGR AUSTIM Caller: O	SELINK ROCHELLE	4 TOWNSERD	PIX: 1701 N. CONGRES AUSTIN	S AVE. TX 79701	Base Retu	rn !	#.nn 10.na	19.00
		.	Total	Charges for Re	.C TRL 160	59-19 1720-37 &s	10.00	(le.00)		

rīcoh	Nyquist	7/3/2018	33	1	
trl	Secretariat	7/20/2018	 	686	

Photocopying - 687 @ \$0.10/each = \$68.70

IORFORATE YOURIERS 2335 FRAMER LANE, STE. F AUSTIN, TX 79759 41505

::

LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW #16 CONGRESS AVE SUITE 1990 AUSTIN, TX 78701

involce No.	Customer No.
52004	1201
	- Jotal Due
7/13/16	86H.15
1.1.4.4	The second of the second of the second

HOW ACCEPTING VISA, M/C & AMEX FOR INVOICE PAYMENT PLEASE CALL 512.479.4007 TO GET SETUP.

				Customer No.	Invoice No.:	2. Period Enting-2.	Amount Due	Pg		
				1201	52004	7/13/18	86A.15		Chames	,%√ , in (otal .
Date	Ordr No.	Sve		3. 11 · 15 比较性	Service	a Detail: 1987	M. 188 . 18 22	** ** ** 1,**, *	AND THE PERSON	*** **********************************
/03/16	41233o	2HR	916 CONGRE	TX 79701 FICE SERVICES		RESOLVED ENERGY 11044 RESEARCH E AUSTIN Mght: 1 Lbs		inel 5	: 15.00 Frong: 1.95	16.95 [†]
			Tota	il Charges ter i	Rof18P 3	862-03 1670-33:	16.95			l
	l	ı					()		1	Continued i

CORPORATE COURIERS 2335 KRAMER LAME, STE. F AUSTIN, TX 78750 41954

\$ 188148P

LLOYD COSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW 816 CONCRESS AVE SUITE 1900 AUSTIN, TX 7870]

ď.

561200

NOW ACCEPTING VISA, M/C & AMEX FOR INVOICE PAYMENT PLEASE CALL 512.479.4007 TO GET SETUP.

Lloyd Gossaliak

				cherount up-	Tuikarde Horas	Portod En	计加升	- Amount Due	全的用户	<u>5]</u>			**************************************
ate : .	Ordr No.	Cuel.		1201	52195	7/31	/(0	636.74	1	7			
20/16	415919	45K 18K	LLOYD GOSS 816 CONGRE AUSTIN Caller: OF	TX 76701 FICE SERVICES	& TOWNSEND	PUC 1701 M. CC AUSTIN Wght:			Ba Re		3 3	6.00 12.00	20.00
-			Signed: SY		ges (or Ref.	- 1670-33	JLM:	20.00				17.50	

CORPORATE COURIERS 2335 KRAMER LANE. STE. F AUSTIN, TX 78759 41996

1.

TANIMARIE NOMETAN FORMATION NO. 1101
52195
1201
1201
1201
1731/10
536.74
1200444 ACMARIE NO. 1101
1200444 ACMARIE NO. 1101
120044 ACMARIE NO. 1101
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
12004
120

LLOYD GOSSELINK ATTORNEYS AT LAW #16 CONGRESS AVE SUITE 1900 AUSTIS, TX 78701

HOW ACCEPTING VISA, M/C 6 AMEX FOR INVOICE PAYMENT PLEASE CALL 512.479.4007 TO GET SETUP.

				A Citarbullet Work	LIMBICS NOT	di Renod	Finding Fi	#:::\vecViuoail	Dita	100 March	1774			
	_			120:	52195	7,	/31/16		6.74					
Date:	Ordr No.	Svc .		A THE PARTY OF THE	计数据处理	TENDETE	建设的	TOX IVE		在2.1年19		V:13	Chaldos:	HAS COLUMN
7/24/18	916753	19K	616 CONGRE	TX 78701 FICE SERVICES DRIGUEZ			i Lbs	7 AVE. TX 7970	1		Basa Return	*	12.00 16.00	

ReSolved Energy Consulting, LLC

11044 Research Blvd, A-420 Austin, Texas 78759 Phone (512) 331-4949

Invoice

DATE	INVOICE NUMBER
8/7/2018	4238

BILL TO	
Thomas Brocato	
Lloyd Gosselink Law Firm	
816 Congress Ave, # 1900	
Austin, Tx 78701	

		PROJECT	
	LG TNI	MP 18 EECRF (48	3404)
DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	AMOUNT
Consulting (Nalepa)	7.5	260.00	1,950.00
Work Completed thru - July 31, 2018	тот	AL DUE	\$1,950.00

Monthly Recap

Karl Natepa

LG TNMP 18 EECRF 48404

Date	Task	Hours
July 16, 2018	Download and review responses to discovery. (Admin/CM 0.50)	0.50
July 17, 2018	Discuss case issues with J. Mauklin, Prepare outline of testimony. (Admin/CM 1.50)	1.50
July 18, 2018	Prepare draft testimony and send to J. Mauldin for review. (Policy 3.30)	3.30
July 19, 2018	Cell with J. Mauldin and Staff to discuss proposed adjustments. (Policy 0.70)	0.70
July 24, 2018	Prepare for and participate on call with TNMP and PUC Staff to discuss proposed adjustments. Call with J. Mautidin to discuss. (Policy 0.80)	0.80
July 25, 2018	Propere additional settlement terms regarding the Energy Education program. Send to J. Mauldin for review. (Policy 0.70)	0.70
		7 8

Admin/CM = Administration/Case Management

Recep_July 2018_KJN

Exhibit MSS-3



816 Congress Avenue 196028

Austin, Texas 78701 Telephone: (512) 322-5800 Facsimile: (512) 472-0532

www.lglawfirm.com

September 12, 2018

Cities Served by TNMP Attn Bobby Gervais City Attorney

c/o City of Manvel Texas

PO Box 187

Manvel, TX USA 77578

Invoice:

97494881

Client:

1670

Matter:

33

Billing Attorney:

CLB

INVOICE SUMMARY

For professional services and disbursements rendered through August 31, 2018:

RE: 2019 TNMP EECRF

Professional Services Total Disbursements \$ 715.00 \$.00

TOTAL THIS INVOICE

\$ 715.00



Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C.

TNMP Cities Steering Committee 2019 TNMP EECRF I.D.1670-33-CLB September 12, 2018 Invoice: 97494881

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Date	Atty	Description Of Services Rendered	Hours
8/01/18	JLM	Correspondence regarding abatement filing (Administration).	.40
8/06/18	JLM	Correspondence regarding settlement documents; review settlement documents; telephone call with S. Sparks regarding abatement; correspondence regarding same; correspondence with K. Nalepa regarding same; edit settlement documents (Administration).	2.00
8/08/18	JLM	Finalize settlement documents; correspondence regarding same (Administration).	.20

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

\$ 715.00

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Name	Staff Level	Hours	Rate	Total
Jamie L Mauldin	Associate	2.60	275.00	715.00
TOTALS		2.60		\$ 715.00

TOTAL THIS INVOICE

\$ 715.00



816 Congress Avenue, Suite 1900 Austin, Texas 78701 Telephone: (512) 322-5800 Facsimile: (512) 472-0532

www.lglawfirm.com

September 11, 2018

Cities Served by TNMP Attn Bobby Gervais City Attorney c/o City of Manvel Texas

PO Box 187 Manvel, TX 77578

USA

Client: 1670 Matter: 33

Billing Atty.: CLB

REMINDER STATEMENT

RE: 2019 TNMP EECRF

Invoice Number	Invoice Date	Fees	Expenses	invoice i Total	Payments / Credits	Balance
97494180	August 08, 2018	2,170.00	2,086.18	4,256.18	0.00	4,256.18
				Total Ame	ount Due:	\$4,256.18

^{*}Note: Last payment of \$ 3,443.57 was received/applied on August 13, 2018

AGED ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE

0 - 30 Days	31 - 60 Days	61 - 90 Days	91 - 120 Days	Over 120 Days
-	4,256.18	-	-	-

ReSolved Energy Consulting, LLC

11044 Research Blvd, A-420 Austin, Texas 78759 Phone (512) 331-4949

Invoice

DATE	INVOICE NUMBER		
7/5/2018	4221		

BILL TO	
Thomas Brocato	
Lloyd Gosselink Law Firm	
816 Congress Ave, # 1900	
Austin, Tx 78701	

		PROJECT	
	LG TN	MP 18 EECRF (48	3404)
DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	AMOUNT
Consulting (Nalepa) Consulting (Murphy) Total Labor	5.1 0.9	260.00 205.00	1,326.00 184.50 1,510.50
Work Completed thru - June 30, 2018	тот	AL DUE	\$1,510.50

Monthly Recap

Karl Nalepa

Date	Task	Hours
June 4, 2018	Review filing. Complete and submit protective order certifications. (Admin/CM 0.70)	0.70
June 7, 2018	Review preliminary issues and send comments to J. Mauldin. (Admin/CM 0.30)	0.30
June 8, 2018	Review draft preliminary order. (Admin/CM 0.20)	0.20
June 12, 2018	Review proposed procedural schedule and discuss with J. Mauldin. (Admin/CM 0.20)	0.20
June 14, 2018	Emails with T. Brocato and J. Mauldin regarding case issues. Monitor PUC Open Meeting regarding	
	order on bonus calculation. (Policy 0.30)	0.30
June 15, 2018	Download and review latest filings. (Admin/CM 0.20)	0.20
June 18, 2018	Review filing. (Misc Acctg 0.20)	0.20
June 19, 2018	Analyze issues and prepare discovery. (Misc Acctg 1.00)	
June 20, 2018	Complete discovery and send to T. Brocato. Call with T. Brocato and J. Mauldin to discuss issues.	
	Prepare summary of adjustments and send to T. Brocato. (Admin/CM 0.80)	0.80
June 21, 2018	Prepare revised bonus adjustment then reverse revision based on Commission's order. (Misc Acctg	
ļ	0.20)	0.20
June 26, 2018	Discuss bonus adjustment with B. Murphy. (Admin/CM 0.30)	0.30
June 29, 2018	Prepare draft testimony. (Policy 0.70)	0.70

5.10

Admin/CM = Administration/Case Management Misc Acctg = Miscellaneous Accounting

Monthly Recap

Brian T. Murphy

Date	Task	Hours
June 4, 2018	Review filing and bonus calculation. (Misc Acctg 0.60)	0.60
June 26, 2018	Review Commission decision on EECRF bonus, discuss with K. Nalepa. (Policy 0.30)	0.30

0.90

Misc Acctg = Miscellaneous Accounting

ReSolved Energy Consulting, LLC

11044 Research Blvd, A-420 Austin, Texas 78759 Phone (512) 331-4949

Invoice

DATE	INVOICE NUMBER	
8/7/2018	4238	

BILL TO	
Thomas Brocato	
Lloyd Gosselink Law Firm	
816 Congress Ave, # 1900	
Austin, Tx 78701	

		PROJECT	
	LG TNMP 18 EECRF (48404)		
DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	AMOUNT
Consulting (Nalepa)	7.	5 260.00	1,950.00
Work Completed thru - July 31, 2018	Т	OTAL DUE	\$1,950.00

Monthly Recap

Karl Nalepa

Date	Task	Hours
July 16, 2018	Download and review responses to discovery. (Admin/CM 0.50)	0.50
	Discuss case issues with J. Mauldin. Prepare outline of testimony. (Admin/CM 1.50)	1.50
July 18, 2018	Prepare draft testimony and send to J. Mauldin for review. (Policy 3.30)	3.30
July 19, 2018	Call with J. Mauldin and Staff to discuss proposed adjustments. (Policy 0.70)	0.70
July 24, 2018	Prepare for and participate on call with TNMP and PUC Staff to discuss proposed adjustments. Call	
	with J. Mauldin to discuss. (Policy 0.80)	0.80
	Prepare additional settlement terms regarding the Energy Education program. Send to J. Mauldin for review. (Policy 0.70)	0.70

7.50

Admin/CM = Administration/Case Management

LG TNMP 18 EECRF 48404 Recap_July 2018_ KJN