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1 
	

I. INTRODUCTION 

	

2 	Q. PLEASE STATE YOUR NAME AN1YADDRESS. 

	

3 	A. 	My name is Georgia N. Crump. I ani an-attorney and a principal at the law firm of 

LloYd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. ("Lloyd Gosse4nIC), which has its 

	

5 	principal place of business located at 816 Congress = Avenue; Suite 1900, Austin, 

	

6 	Texas 78701. 

	

7 	Q. ON WHOSE BEHALF,ARE YOU TES. TIFYING IN THIS PROCEEDING? 

	

8 	A. 	I am filing direct testimony on behalf of PK-RE Development Company, Inc. d/b/a 

	

9 	Greenshores utility Services and d/b/a Oak Shores Water System (PK-RE"), which 

10. 	filed the,  Application to Change Rates for Water and Sewer Service (`Rate 

	

11 	Applicatioe) with the public Utility Commfssion of Texas.  C`Commissioiq in this 

	

12 	case. : 

	

13 	Q. PLEASE SUMMARIZE ÝOUR PROFESSIONAL . AND EDUCATIONAL 

	

14 	BACKGROUND. 

	

15 	A. 	I have been licensed to practice law in Texas since 1978. I have'represented utilities, 

	

16 	regulatory authorities, and consumers in numerous rate proceedings in niy 39 years of 
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1 	experience as an 'attorney. A copy of my resume is attached to my testimony as 

2 

3 

4 Q. 

5 

6 A. 

7 

8 

Attachment A. 

II. 	PURPOSE AND SCOPE  

WHAT IS THE PURPOSE AND SCOPE OF YOUR TESTIMONY IN THIS 

PROCEEDING? 

The purpose of my testimony is to present expert opinion testimony concerning the 

reasonableness of the legal and consultant rate case expenses PK-RE incurred in 

preparing and prosecuting this rate application. 

9 Q. PLEASE EXPLAIN HOW THE RATE CASE EXPENSES ASSOCIATED 

1 0 	WITH LEGAL FEES WERE INCURRED AND PAID. 

11 	A. 	PK-RE and Undine Development, LLC (Undine) entered into a letter agreement on 

12 	March 24, 2016, wherein PK-RE and Undine indioated their intention to sell PK-RE s 

13 	water and sewer utility assets to Undine. The parties intended that PK-RE would also 

14 	file an application to increase the water and sewer rates, and that ihe increased rates 

15 	would be in effect before the closing of the sale to Undine.- Because the new rates 

16 	would benefit Undine, Undine and PK-RE agreed that Undine would retain 

17 	professionals to assist in the Rate Application, and Pk-RE would reimburse Undine 

18 	for the reasonable and necessary expenses. To that end, Undine engaged the services 

19 	of Mr. Don Clayton to prepare the Rate Application schedules, and Undine engaged 

20 	my firm to handle the filing of the Rate Application and the prosecution of the Rate 

21 	Application at the Commission.. yr. Clayton and I have been submitting our invoices 

22 	to Undine, and Undine has been responsible for,their payment. However, because the 

23 	expenditures by Undine in suppoi:t of the Rate Application benefit PK-RE, this 

24 	testimony, and Mr. Clayton's testimony, and the invoices are being presented in 
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support of PK-RE s recovery,of rdasonable and neèessary rate -case expenses in this . 

	

2 	docket. 

	

3 	 Reimbursable, rate case expenses were incurred by PK-RE before the Rate 

	

4 	Application wds filed with the Coinmission on Octobef'12 2016, beginning,  in June 

	

5 	2016. PK-RE is requesting reimbursement of all reasonable rate case expenses. My 

	

6 	testiMony supports' the reasonableness of the legal expenses incurred by PK-RE 

regarding tlie rate aPplication proceeding at the Commission, and I also provide 

	

8 	testimony on the reasonableness of the consuhant expenses. Mr. Clayton provides 

	

9 	additional testimony on the reasonableness of his expenses: 

	

10. 	Q. ARE YOU SPONSORING ANY SCHEDULES? 

	

11 	A. 

	

12 	• 	 III. RECOMMENDATIONS  

	

. 	13 	Q. WHAT ARE YOUR RE'COMMENDATIONS?, 

	

14 	A. 	Based upon my review, I recommend that PK-RE be allowed to recover .the 
• 

15  reasonable.  and necessary legal rate C'ase expenses of $37,578.46 as of March 31, 

	

16 	2017, plus -the supplemental amount, that i11 be ik•ovided at hearing. I also 

	

17 	recommdnd :that the Commission allow PK-RE to fecover its consultant rate case 

	

1.8 	expenses described in the Direct Testimony of Doriald J. Clayton, both pursuant 'to 

	

19 	Texas Water Coae Ann. §§ 13.183, 13.185(c), 'and .13.1871, and 16 Texas • 

	

20 	Administrative Code § 24.33 rrAo. . 

21 Q. PLEASE DESCRIBE THE PROCESS YOU UNDERTOOK TO REACH 

	

22 	YOUR CONCLUSION. 

23• 	A. 	Based on-my experience and education, and folfovVing a thorough and critical feview 

	

.24 	of all'. of the relevant information, I concluded 'that the reasonable and nebessary 
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1 	PK-RE rate case expenses for legal and consultant services as of March 31, 2017, is 

	

2 	$61,578.46. I recommend that the Commission find this amOuni to be the reasonable 

	

3 	and necessary reimbursable rafe case expenses'for PI@RE  in this proceeding. 

	

4 	 Undine engaged the services of Lloyd Gosselink in September 2016,. as 

	

5 	described above. I have directed the work performed by Lloyd Gosselink employees 

	

6 	since that time. I have reviewed the billings of Lloyd Gosselink submitted to Undine 

	

7 	for legal services from September 1, 2016, through March 31, 2017, in-connection 

	

8 	with PK-REls-prOposed rate increase. I affirm that those billings accurately reflect 

	

9 	the time spent and expenditures incurred by. Lloyd Gosselink on this mátter. Those 

	

10 	billings were accurately calculated before they were tendered and did not include any 

	

11 	double billing.. None of the charges billed to Undine have been recovered through 

	

12 	reimbursement 'for other exPenses. The eXpenses charged were associated with the. 

	

13 	preparation, filing, and prosecution of PK-RE's,Rate Application and were necessary 

	

14 	to accomplish tasks in the Rate Application proceeding. The services provided to 

	

15 	,PK-RE under the auspices of Undine were the same services that PK-RE would have 

	

16 	had to obtain itself if it had independently funded the Rate Application. -No 

	

17 	additional fees or charges were incurred, aš a result of the invoices being submitted to 

	

18 	Undine. 

	

19 	 For the period September 1, 2016 through March 31, 2017, Lloyd Gosselink 

	

20 	billed $37,578.46 for legal services in connection with PK-RE's* Rate Application. 

	

21 	This figure Mcludes legal fees and expenses. The fees and expenses were necessary 

	

22 	and for the legal representation of Undine on behalf of PK-RE. The legal work 

	

23 	included review of-the Rate Application, preparation of pleadings, assistance -to 

24 	pK-RE in the preparation and filing of discovery responses, and assistance to PK-RE 
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1 
	

'in the preparation of testimony to be 'ubmitted for the Rate Application to be filed 

	

2 
	

with the Commission. 

	

3 
	

The attorneys hourly rates of $275-$375, upon which the billings are based, 

	

4 	are the same hourly rates charged other clients for comparable services during the 

same time-frame. Our firm's hourly rates are at the lower end of the range compared, 

	

- 6 	to the rates charged by other lawyers with similar-  experience providing similar 

	

7 
	

services. To minimize-  expenses, I used associates and paralegals, where possible 

	

8 
	

because'of their lower billing rates. In assigning the tasks to attorneys, I ensured that 

	

9 
	

the attorneys did not duplicate the work of one another. The hours spent to perform 	- 

	

10 
	

the tasks assigned to Lloyd Gosseiink ,were necessary to complete those tasks in a 

	

11 
	

professional manner and on a timely basis'. All of the work performed by Lloyd 

Gosselink to date was accomplished 'by just two lgAryerš. My many years of 

	

13 	experienCe particitating in utility rate cases aid in our efforts tO ,keep rate case 

	

14 	expenses reasohable. 	
4 

	

15 	 The invoices submitted by LlOyd Gosselink include a description of services 

	

, 16 	performed and time expended on each activiiy. The:  invoices dated from 

	

17 	September 1, 2016, through March 31, 2017, for this proceeding are attached to my 

	

18 	testimony as Attachment B. Lloyd Gosselink has documented' all charges with time 

	

19 	sheets: invoices; and records. Lloyd Gosselink has not charged for hixury items, 

	

20 	including first-class airfare, limousine service, entertainment, or alcoholic beverages. 

21, 	No meals were chatted in excess of $25 per person, and no individual billed for more 

	

22 	than 12 hours per day. The documentation in this case is similar to that provided in 

- 	23 	many previous rate casesbefore the Commission. 
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The current amount requested for legal expenses of $37,578-.46 (through 

	

2 	March 31, 2017) is reasonable given the complexity of this case. PK-RE anticipates 

	

3 	that it will incur additional attorney fees associated with its Rate, Application, 

	

4 	especially if a contested case hearing is conducted, and reserves the-right to request 

additional incurred rate case expenses at the appropriate time. 

6 Q. ARE THE LEGAL EXPENSES THAT PK-RE IS SEEKING TO RECOVER 

	

7 	JUST, *REASONABLE, NECESSARY, AND IN THE PUBLIC INTEREST? 

	

8 	PLEASE EXPLAIN. 

	

9 	A. 	Ye's... The legal expenses that PK-RE seeks to recover are just, reasonable, necessary, 

	

10 	 and .in the public interest. PK-RE is a Class C utility, but determined that merely 

	

11 	filing for a Class C indexed increase wOUld riot be sufficient to allow it to recover its 

	

12 	reasonable expenses and earn a reasonable return on its investment, therefore it 

	

13 	decided to file a Class B rate change application. Reasonable and necessary legal 

	

14 	expenses r  ašsociated with preparation of a rate apOication have long been 

	

15 	recoverable; recovery is allowed, 13,7 Commission rule and is authorized by Texas 

	

16 	Water Code Ann. § 13185(g). For the reasons I mentioned-above, it was reasonable 

	

17 	and necessary for PK-RE to 'rely upon the assistance offered „by Undine in the 

	

.18 	,preparation of PK-RE s. Rate Application, the time spent was reasonable and 

	

19 	necessary, and the hourly rates charged are reasonable. 

	

20 	Q. WAS IT REASONABLE AND NECESSARY FOR PK-RE TO INCUR LEGAL 

	

21 	EXPENSES TO PkEPARE PREFILED DIRECT TESTIMONY? 

	

22 	A. , Yes., Although a request was made by Undine at the prehe'aring conference in this 

	

23 	matter held on March 16, 2017, that the hearink be held on an informal basis as 

	

24 	provided in Texas Water Code § 13.1871(1) and in an effort ,to help minimize rafe 
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case expenses, no agreement was reached among the parties as to how that might 

	

2 
	

work. The Comniission's rules do not contain any detail on informaP 1?earings, 

	

3 
	

therefOre neither the Staff nor the intervenors were willing to waive the Ming of 

	

4 
	

prefilea testimony. 

	

5 	Q. DID PK-RE INCUR ANY CONSULTANT EXPENSES IN THIS RATE CASE? 

	

6 	A. 	Yes. PK-RE incurred the expenses assoCiated with Mr. Don Clayton. Mr. Clayton's 

	

7 	invoices are included as Attachment C. 

	

8 	Q. ARE THE CONSULTANT EXPENSES FOR MR. CLAYTON REASONABE, 

	

9 	AND NEeESSARY? 

	

1 10 	A. 	Yes. Mr. Clayton.  addresses the specifics of the work he performed to prepare the 

	

11 	schedules for the Rate Application., His testimony also provides detailed information 

	

12 	on the expenses aS'sociated-with his wOrk. Based on my,years of experience working 

	

13 	with utility consullants, Mr. Clayton's hourly rate of $200, rupon.which the billings 

	

14 	are based, is coMparable to rates charged by consultants with similar levels of 

	

15 	expertise and experience 'as Mr. Clayton. Mr. Clayton charged a lump sum amount 

	

16 	for the preparation of the Rate Application of $15,000.00. At his hourly rate of $200, 

	

17 	this charge for the preparation of the filing computes to 75 hours of work. Because 

	

18 	the 'Class B rate filing package requires a substantial amount o detailed information, 

	

19 	- and because of the work 'required of Mr. Clayton to assemble thd data, interview 

	

20 	Mr. Eppright and his accountant to verify the data, and prepare the schedules, in my 

	

21 	,opinion it was reasonable for Mr. Clayton to charge this amount. I have also 	. 

	

22 	reviewed the number of hours Mr. Clayton has spent on thd provision oT litigatiOn 

	

23 	support for the Rate Application, and can testify that the hours (45) and the amount 

	

24 	are appropriate for this case. The amount requested for consultant expenses of 
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1 	$24,000, as of March 31, 2017, is reasonable. The consultant expenses will, be. 

	

2 	supplemented at the hearing on the merits. 

	

3 	Q.  DOES PK-RE INTEND TO RECOVER ITS RATE CASE'EXPENSES? 

4 A. Yes: 

	

5 	Q. HOW DOES PK-RE INTEND TO RECOVER ITS RATE CASE EXPENSES?' 

	

6 	A. 	Rate case expenses (legal and consultahts) are non-recurring expenses and are 

	

7 	generally recovered through a surcharge on customers bills; that is what PK-RE is 

	

8 	requesting in this case. PK-RE proboses to recover reasonable and necessary rate 

	

9 	case expenses through a surcharge'assessed over a 36-month period. 

	

10 	 Water and sewer utilities are permitted to recover their reasonable expenses, 

	

11 	including rate case expenses, from their customers pursuant to Texas Water Code 

	

12 	Ann. §§ 13.183, 13.185, and 13.1871, and 16 TAC § 24.33. Therefore, I recommend 

	

13 	that PK-RE be' permitted to recover ,through a surcharge its reasonable legal and 

	

14 	consultant rate case expenses. 

	

15 	 IV. CONCLUSION  

	

16 	Q. DOES TI-HS CONCLUDE YOUR TESTIMONY AT THIS TIME? 

	

17 	A. 	Yes, it does. I reserve the right to make corrections, revisions, or deletions at the time 

	

18 	of a hearing on the merits. 
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ATTAbHMENT A 
Page 1•of 1 

GEORGIA.  N. CRUMP cs a Principal with the Austin firticv of Llo'yd Gosselink Rochelle & 
Townsend, P.C. Georgia chairs the firm's Energy 'and Utility Practice Group and -focuses on 
utility- and energy-related iLsues, and municipal law. She represents both private and municipal 
clients and has been actively, involved in Munitipal law and utility administrative law throughout 
her legal career. 

. Experience: 	 . 

, • . re'presenting individual, and coalitions of municipalities at the Railroad 'Commission of 
Texas and the Public Utility Commissicin, 

• representing municipalities and privately-owned water and wasteWater utilities at the 
Public Utility Commission, 

 

• " advising niunicipalitieš in the development and leasing of dark fiber facilitieS` and in the 
-' siting and permitting of cellular facilities, 	4 

• advising municipally-owned electric utilities and electric cooperativ-  es in pole attachinent 
agreements, and , 	4 

• assisting municipalities in gas and electric franchise negotiations and renewals. 

Practide Ardas: Energy and Utility; Water; Munitipal Law 

Education / Professional Licenses: 
J.D., Baylor University, Waco,' Texas (1978) 
A.B., Muhlenberg College, Allentown, Pennsylvania (1975), 
Admitted to State Bar of Texas (1978) 

Honors & Awards: 
AV Peer Review Rated by Martindale-Hubbell since 1993 
Best Lawyers in America 2011:2017' 
Women in the Law Top Peer-Nominated Lawyers 2016 

• Best AttorneYs in Texas 2012, by Best Lawyers 
Top Lawyers 2011, by Corporate Counsel 

Professional Associations '& Memberships: 	• 

State' Bar`of Texas 
American Bar Association 
Austin Bar Asociation 
Texas City Aitorneys Associati6n 
Inteinational Municipal Lawyers Association 
National Association of TeleCommunications Officers and Adirisors 
Texas Association of Telecommunications Officers and Advisors 
State Bar College of Texas 
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ATTACHMENT B 
Page 1, of 26 

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle 8: Townsend, P.C. 

Undine LLC 
	

October 10, 2016 
Green Shores Rate Application 	 Invoice: 91476486 

„I.D.3799-0-ONC 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

Date Atty Description Of Services Rendered Hours 

9/01/16 GNC Office conference with T. Leisey regarding review of filing requirements. 1.40 
9/01/16 TRL Research PUC website for Class B rate filing packages; prepare and file request for 3.10 

PUC docket number, meet with G. Crump to discuss research findings; finalize 	. 
timeline of application process and request for additional client 
infonnation/documents for G. Crump's review; determine form for 
Verification/Certification of Application affidavit. 

9/02/16 GNC Correspondence to client regarding rate filing requirements; office conference with 1.20 
T. Leisey regarding same and preparation of affidavits. 

9/02/16 TRL • Contact PUC for form affidavit to attich to application; convert affidavit into 
workable form to send to client.. 

.60 

.9/06/16 TRL Case/file management. .10 
9/07/16 TRL Discuss d/b/a issue with R. Melcher; research and report d/b/a issue to G. Crump to 

receive guidance going forward. 
.80 

9/09/16 TRL Compile e-mails and documentation for G." Crump's review regarding the d/b/a issue. .30 
9/12/16 GNC Correspondence with client regarding notice issues. .80 
9/12/16 TRL Prepare clarifying letter regarding PUC case style. .20 
9/13/16 GNC Correspondence with client regarding 	 rate increase notice. • sc-1 
9/14/16 GNC Telephone call with C. Thomas regarding notices. .70 
9/21/16 GNC Correspondence with client regarding notice. .30 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 	12./457.5b 

SUMMARY 01? PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Name 
	

Staff Level 
	

Hours 
	Rate 
	 Total 

Georgia N Crump 
	

Principal 
	

375.00 
Tanya R Leisey 
	

Paralegal 
	

125.00 
TOTALS 

DISBURSEMENTS 

Date r Description 
9/23/16 Courier Depot Check # - 000031836 Courier, Courier Depot, 9/17/2016, 95403 - 

Courier Services 9/1 1/16-9/17/16 

Amount  
16.00 

Lloyd possellnk Rochelle & 'Townsend, P.C. 
Paget2 
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ATTA6FIVENT B 
Page 2 of 26 

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 

Undine LI;C 
	

October 10; 2016 
Green Shores Rate Application 	 Invoice: 97476426 
I.D.3799-0-GNC 

Date Description 
	 Amount 

Postve 
	

1.78 

TOTAL DISBURSE1VIENTS 
	

$ 17.78 

TOTAL THIS INVOICE 
	

111,4t5iit 

.0,  

Lloyd Gossellnk Rochelle &11,wnsencl: P.C. 

i 	13 
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ATTACHMENT B 
Page 3 of 26 

tloyu osse1itk Rochelle & Townse J.C.  

Undine LLC 
Green Shores R.ate Application 
I.D.3799-0-GNC 

November 15, 2016 
Invoice: 97477419 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED' 

Date Atty Description Of Services Rendered 	 - 	 Hours  
10/04/16 GNC Review notices and applications; compare information to requirements of PUC 	1.90 

statute and rules: 	. 
10/05/16 GNC Review notice and applications; correspondence to client regarding changes needed. 	1.30 

130 
10/07/16 GNC Correspondence regirding rate filing, notices, and annual report, .50 
10/06/16 GNC Review materials for rate filing; review notices; telephone call with R. Eppright. 

10/10/16 GNC Review application and schedules. 	 .90 
10/11/16 GNC Review rate application; correspondence with D. Clayton with questions regarding 	1.00 

same. 
10/12/16 GNC Correspondence regarding notices and mailingi prepare verification for annual 	1.50 

report; prepare annual report for filing; review final rate application for filing; 
telephone call with client regarding same. 	 . 

10/12/16 TRL Organize, review, finalize, and file the firfal packet for Class B rate change - 	3.20 
ipplication; prepare final verification and file PK-RE's Annual Report for 2015. 

10/17/16 GNC Correspondence with client regarding Order No. 1. 	
_ 	 ,60 

10/20/16 TRL Setup and begin a tracking spreadsheet to track ail ratepayer protests and comments 	.50 
that are being filed with the PUC in Docket No. 46333. 

10/21/16 GNC Telephone call with C. Siano (OPUC) regarding rate filing; correspondence with 	.80 
client regarding sarne. 	 , 

10/24/16 GNC Review filings. 	 .90 

10/24/16 TRL Update protestant tracking chart with recent protests filed. 	 .30 
10/25/16 GNC Review rules arid statutes; revile draft informational filing. 	 1.10 

10/26/16 GNC Telephone 'call with R. Melcher regarding rate case. 	 .60 

10/27/16 ONC Review comments filed in rate case. 	 .50 

10/28/16 TRL Update protestant tracking chart with recent protests filed. 	' 	, 	 .30 

10/31/16 GNC Telephone call to R. Daigneault (PUC) regarding procedures; office conference 	2.20 
with J. Mauldin regarding same; review filings; develop strategies for rate case. 

10/31/16 ILM No Charge - Office conference'with G. Crumçgardingproceeding history and. 	2.50 

upcoming call with client. review water cod 
10/31/16 IIEG No Char e 

10/31/16 TRL Update protestant tracking chart with recent protestS filed. 	 .40  
• 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES $ 6,250.00 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Name Staff Level 	Rate 	Hours 	Amount N/C $ 

Georgia N Crump Principal 	375.00 	15.10 	5,662.50 .00 .00 

Mauldin, Jamie Associate 	 .00 	.00 	.00 , 2.50 687.50 

Lloyd Gossellnk,Rochelle & TowOsend, P.C. 
Pagep 
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AfrACHMENT B 
Page 4 Of 26 

lairt%  

Lloyd ..osselink Rochelle & Townsen .C. 
• - 

Undine LLC 
Green Shores Rate Application 
I.D.3799-0-GNC 

November 15, 2016 
Invoice: 97477419 

Hannah E Ging 
Tanya R Leisey 
TOTALS 

    

AgmFosat 

Paralegal 
Paralegal  

.00 	.00 
125.00 . 4.70 

19.80 

.00 
587.50 

6,250.00 

.50 

.00  
3.00 

60.00 
.00  

$ 747.50 
7 	 

DISBURSEMENTS.  

Amount  
12.00 

24.00 

37.01 

$ 73.01 

$ 6,323.01 

Date Description 
9/09/16 Courier Depot Check # - 000031746 Courim, Courier Depot, 9/3/2016, 95208 - 

Courier Services 8/28/2016-9/3/2016 
10/20/16 Courier Depot Check # - 000032042 Courier, Courier Depot, 10/15/2016, 95822 - 

Courier Services 10/9/16 - 10/15/16 
10/20/16 Courier Depot Check # - 000032042 Courier, dourier Depot, 10/15/2016, 95822 - 

Courier Services 10/9/16 - 10/15/16  

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 

TOTAL THIS INVOICE 

Lloyd Gossellnk Rochelle & lbwnsend, EC. 
Pa843  
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. 11/09/16 GNC R.ate Case 
1 	p a e pro es 	trac ng,chart with recent protests filed. 

e with PUC Staff and client re 	in rate case rocess. 	.40 

11 Ti6 GNC No Charge - Office conference with J. lvfauldin and T. Leisey regarding 	or 
cases. 

11/10/16 GN 	R.ate Case 	IIII" Oita" I 	AA 	kd e d re rdin Informational Filin . 	.40 

AtTACHMENT B 
Page 5 bf 26 

Lloyd osseIin1Rocbee & Townsend, P.C. swt=nrcr 	  

Undine TLC 
Green Shores R.ate Application 
I.D.3799-0-GNC 

 

December 16, 2016 
Invoice: 97478357 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

Date' Atty Description Of Services Rendered 	 Hours 
11/01/16 GNC No Charge - Office conference with J. Mauldin. ' 	 .20 
11/01/16 GNC T1erhone call wìeh Rìvtelcber and M. Ashfield regarding strategy for rate case 	2.20 

elephone call with R. Daigneault and M. Crnich (PUC Staff) 
regarding processing of cases; review letter agreement with PK-RE Development. 

11/01/16 JLM No Char e 	 eparation for telephone call; 	 2.20 
d rate case proceedings; review 

k I ermit. 

11/03/16 PLM No Charge - Review water regulations for 1-year time period for filing closing 
documents (Water 24.112(e). 

11/04/16 TRL Update protestant tracking chart with recent protests filed'. 
11/07/16 GNC Research rulemakings regarding rate cases; correspondence with client regarding 

same and rocedures. 

.30 
1.30 

11/10/16 JLM Rate Case. Meeting with G. Crump to discuss rate case. 
11/10/16 TRL Meet with G. Crum • and J. Mauldin to discuss tasks and 'a 

case 

.40 
coming filings (.3 rate 	MN , 3 

11/11/16 GNC Rate Case. orrespondence with client regarding meeting with OPUC wad response 
to PUC Staff Attorney; revise Informational filing; correspondence with R. 
E n r ardin same. 

Uoyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 
Pagel2 
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3.50 



C Staff and client on rate case 11/11116 JLM 

11/14/16 GNC • . te ase. Telephone call with R. Eppriglit an-d . Clayton regarding investments; 
draft pleading in response to Order No. 1; finalize Infoimational Filing; 

Client re ardin m e • 

...11/15/16 GNC R.ate case. Finalize Informational filing 

2.10 

NC R.ate Case. Meeting with C. Siano (OPUC) and R. Melcher, M. Ashfeld3. 
Mauldin re:: din: rate case docke review a 	memo re ding meeting, 

11/16/16 JLM Rate case. Prepare for meeting with OPUC and Undine; rneeting with Undine an 
OPUC; draft summ memo for client. 

11/17/16 GNC Rate case. Correspondence with client; correspondence with R.. Eppright re 
• • 	es ice' is 

: 4 

J ATTACHMEfVf 
Pa6e 6 of 26 

, 
Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle  & Townsend, P.C.  

Undine LLC 
Green Shores R.ate Application 
I.D.3799-0-GNC 

December 16, 2016 
Invoice: 97478357 

Da 	 ed 

go 

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, RC. ' 
• Pagep 
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ATTACHMENT B 
Page 7 of 26 

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C.  
Undine LLC 
Green Shores Rate Application 
I.D.3799-0-GNC 

Decemtier 16, 2016 
Invoice: 97478357 

	

,ONNO1/0040101111.10110K 	 

Date Atty Description Of Services Rendered 	 Hours 
11/18/16 GNC Rate case. Conference caIJ.vvith PK-RE regarding rate case issues; telephone call to 	2.00 

R. Dai eault T.JC Sta 	ding questions onre-noticing for rate case. 

11/21/16 GNC Rate case. Correspon ence with PUC Staff regarding rate case notices; review 	2.70 
email with draft cover letter for same; revise draft cover letter. 

11/21/16 TRI, 	evise 1st o srotests led in the Rate 	2 

1/22/16 GNC Rate case. Review revised schedules and notices; correspondence to client 
regarding same; revise cover letter. 

11/23/16 GNC Rate case. Revise cover letter regarding notice; correspondence with client 	1.50 
regarding notice and cover letter. 

11/28/16 GNC Rate case. Email to client regarding notice and cover letter, correspondence with 	1.20 
PUC Staff regarding revised notices; telephone call with R. Eppright regarding 
same. 

11/29/16 GNC Rate case. Correspondence with R. Eppright with revised notices and cover letter, 	.50 
coirespondence to PUC Staff regarding same. 

11/30/16 GNC Rate case. Review errata schedule; correspondence with D. Clayton regarding same; 	1.20 
e 	• 0, ,,,se,ewithREsirjhtre. snsaxfle. 

prepare, file, and serve 	11111 ..(b 
TILL PK.-RE's First Errata to Application (.6 Rate Case).  

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL-SERVICES 4 10 1 0 lD 1111111111 

S'ITIVIMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Name  
Georgia N Crump 
Mauldin, Jatnie L 

Staff Level 
Principal 
Associate 

Rate  
375.00 
275.00 

Lloyd Gossolink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 
Pagel4 
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Paula L McConnick 	Taralegal 	.00 	00 	.00 	.50 - 	60.00 
Tanya R Leisey 	Paralegal 	125.00 
TOTA.1..IS 

ATTACHMET B 
Page 8 of 26 

edik 	 ("4\ 

1==. 

	 Lloyd GosselinkRochell&& Townsend,  P.C. 

Undine LLC 
Green Shores Rate Application 
I.D.3799-0-GNC 

December 16, 2016 
Invoice: 97478357 

DISBURSEMENTS 

Date Descri tion 	 .114, OMNI 
	 mount 

11/22/16 Courier Depot Check # 000032301 Courier, Courier Depot, 11/19/2016, 96360 - 
	35.00 

Courier Services .11/13/2016 - 11/19/2016 

.TOTA.I., DISBURSEMENTS 

TOTAL THIS INVOICE t101 0(00.0 

AiLIS,OD 

Llojid dosseunk ROchelle 81. Townsend, RC. 
Pagel5 
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=7777, =MOM= 

=1:77:71111111111111111M 

17.7:711:11 

On Demand 
Deo Ready 
Ordenlype 	Order l0 
Drava— r 	•---qh___.;__ML_,._...91 
1171.02001131 PM 	797012 	Wye: Gaze* Rodsollo &Toms PUC.conlod Reeents 	• JAC 
ASAP 25ce 	 910 Comm Avott 1000 	1701 Nortb Congessinenno Itt 27994 
11/14/20113 231 Pal 	Pete Atom 	Austin 1X78701 	 AunIn TX 711701 

(512)3224300 
Agri eft 	mob 

POD: Rad Ontor Told: 	810.00 

11fl412O1ß18 PM 
	

797912.01 	PUO -Contd Remora 	Lloyd Goondirdc Recho5e &UN MC 
ASAP Iltko 	 1701 Nona Comets Avenue Root MI CooplosAsto 01950 	3711047 
101412010 3211 PM 
	

Pete Juana Ansla TX 78701 	 ANSI TX 70701 
(am 3224801) 

 

ASAP BIM 	" 
Order Tests 

$10.00 
POD: Raman 810.00 

Rofonnono 
Cesdnadon 

J 

11/1742010 1127A61 
1 Hoar 1154 Convoy. 
11/15/2010 1227 PM 

POD: On SIM  

7118013 . . - ilia Coisotiok Rolsolis &Tomo PlIC.. Cordnd Racardo 	MC 375.0 
1319Coogroos Ave 0 1070 	1701 WO Cohlroge AvellPs rti 

Pete Amu AtsAn IX 70701 	 Audn 7X NM 
(012) =WOO 

MOO 

1 Hour 130° Odom 
Order Utah 

SLOG 

700013.01 	PUG *Control Rourds 	Lloyd Gooselok Rohde & Tax CNC 37994

.../ 

 
1701 NOfth WWI= Annus Root S1$ConzassAvo1ine 

Pots Jumos 	Aydin TX 7/1701 	 Austin TX 70701 
(512) 3224300 I 

21tour85n Demi 	. 87.00  

11/10/2018 11= AM 
2Kouran. Dettvety 

, 	11/1520101p Pal 

Roam Onlor Teak 	$7.00 

20 
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Grindstone 	 ' 1.1/1y2o1p OCE-ScAN 	.. 	3799 _. .. 	__. _........... _ 
Grindstone 	 13114120169CE-SCAN 	3799 

G;indstone 	 1.1.114p0?.6 OCOCAN 	. .3799 _ ..............___ .... 
Grindstone 	 11/14/2016.0CE-SCAN 	' ' 3799 

Grindstone 	 . 11/14/2016.9CE-S.c.AN 	3799 

36 

20 
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ATTACHMENT B 
Page 11 of 26 

Lloyd k4osselink Rochelle & Townsend, .e.C. 

Undine 	 January 20, 2017 
Green Shores Rate Application 	 Invoice: 97478885 
LD.3799-0-GNC 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

Date A 	Descri tion Of Services Rendered Hours 

12/09/16 GNC Rate case. Tele hone call with C. Siano OPUC ; corre ondence with client. 	• .60 

12/15/16 .ILM ,Rate case. Follow-up on revised notice affidavit. 
12/15/16 TR.L Rate case. R.eview filings and determine status of affidavit of re-notice and discuss 

, _same with G. Crum and J. Mauldin 	- 

12/16/16 JLM 

12/16/16 TRL 

R.ate case. e ep one c s with M. Ashfield regarding refiling affidavit of notice; 	1. 
office conference with T. Leisey on tracking delivery of affidavit and possible filing 
of same on behalf of PK-R_E Development. 	 =. 

Rate case. Call the PUC and determine status of PK-RE mailing the affidavit of 
notice; prepare PK-RE affidavit of notiCe for filin and file same. 

80 

Lloyd Gossellnk Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 
Pagel2 
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Lloyd Gosseilnk  Rodielle & Townsend,  

Undine LLC 
	

'January 20, ib17 
Green Shores Rate Application 	 Invoice: 97478885 
I.D.3799-0-GNC 

• Descri Son Of Services e d red 
	

Hours . 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES liA7.5r) 

'SUMMARY O'F PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Natne 	 Staff Level 	Rate 
Georgia N Crump 
Mauldin, Jamie L 
Tanya R Leisey 
TOTALS 

Principal 
Associate 
Paralegal  

375.00 
275.00 
125.00' 

DISBURSEMENTS 

Amount  
, 	8.00 

19.51 

33.66 

Date Description 
12/07/16 Courier Depot Check # - 000032353 Courier, Courier Depot, 12/3/2016, 96565 = 

Courier Services 11/27/16 - 12/3/16 
12/14/16 Courier Depot Check # - 000032417 dourier, Courier Depot, 12/10/2016, 96667 - 

Courier Services 12/4/16 - 12/10/16 
12/17/16 Courier Depot Check # - 000032453 6ourier, Courier Depot, 12/17/2016, 96856 

Courier Services 12/11/16.- 12/17/16 ,  

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 
	t. 

TOTAL THIS INVOICE 
	

Coq tt?"1 

Lloyd Gossellnk Rochelle & Townsend, PC. 	
Pagef3 
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Lloya Gosselink Rochelle & To ena, AC: 

Undine LLC 
	

Fehmary 13, 2017 
Green Shores Rate Application 	 Invoice: 97479585 
I.D,3?99-O-GC 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

Date A 	Descri ttion Of Services Rendered 	 Hours 

1/13/17 GNC Rate case. Review Staffs recommendation; correspondence with client regarding 
same. 

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, RC. 
Pagel2 

24 



.716117 TRL Rate Cse• Revìew pro ests and update protestant traektng spreads ieet to t•enti 
issues to be e eot 	rvenors. 

.50 

ATTACHMENT B 
Page:14 of 26 

Lloyt. ,;osselink Rochelle & TownsenG, 
= 

Undine LLC 
	

ebruary 13, 2017 
Green Shores Rate Application 	 Invoice: 97479585 
1.D.3799-0-GNC 

Date 	Descri . tion Of Services Rendered Hours 

   

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 	/1/ .5b 

SUMMARYIDF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Name 	 - Staff Level 	Rate 
Georgia N Crump 	Principal 	375.00 
Mauldin, Jamie L 	Associate 	275.00 
Tanya R Leisey 	Paralegal 	125.00 
)TOTALS 

DISBeRSEMENTS' 

        

     

Amount 

  

  

• , 	tion 

    

     

       

       

        

- 

1..1o)t3 Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, RC. 
Pagel3 ‘, 
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Llo ta t'y'osselink Rochelle & Townseno, P.C. 

Undine LLC 
Green Shores Rate Application 
LD.3799-0-GNC 

TOTAL HISBURSEMEDiTS 

TOTAL THIS INVOICE 

February 13, 2017 
Invoice: 97479585 

DO 

0 21 2.. 50 

1 Lloyd Gossellnk Rochelle & TOwnsend. P.C. 
Pagelti 

26 



2/01/17 TRL Rate Case.  Prepare handout for G. Crump's meeting with intervenors and client. 

2/03/17 TRL No Chaige - Rate Case. esearc government rate case expense estimate. 
2/06/17 ONC Rate case. Correspondence with R.. Eppright re ardin effective date of interizn rates. 1.00 

NI 	Rate case Draft List of Issues 2.00 

2/08/17 GNC Rate case. Review and revise draft list of issues, 
2/08/17. ILM 	 evise List of Issues; confer with GNC regardin same. 

/08/1 TRL Rate Case. Prepare example preliminary orders from other Class B rate cases for 
ttornevreview in re aration of finalizin list reissues: 

2/09/17 GNC Rate case. Review note 

1.20 
90 

Lloyd Gosšelink Rochelle & Townsend, P.t.. 

ATTACHMENT B 
Page 16 of 26 

March 13, 2017 
Invoice: 97480444 

  

Un cline LLC 
Green Shores Rate Application 
I.D.3799-0-GNC 

 

PROYiSSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

Date A 
	

Descri tion Of Services Rendered 
	

Hours 

ate 	ase. roo ad list of issues for filing; update highhg t acus orner ist WI all 	.90  

Lioyd Gossellnk Rochelle & Townsend, RC. 
Papp 

27 



2/21/17 GNC Rate case. Review Notice issues. .60 

Eppri t re ardin same. 

ATTACHMENT B 
Page 17 of 26 

Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. 

Undine LLC 
Green Shores Rate Application 
I.D.3799-0-GNC 

March 13, 2617 
Invoice: 97480444 

Date Atty Description Of Services Rendered Hours 

2/10/17 GNC Rate case. Review PUC Staffs List.  of Issuer finalize Undines List o Issues. 	.50 

2/14/17 GNC Rate case. Review SOATI Order regarding suspension of rates; research suspension 
	

2.50 
provisions and prior orders; correspondence with client and R.. Eppright regarding . 

2/14/17 MM. Rate Case. Confer with G. Crump regarding rate suspension dates. 	 • 
2/ • / 	TRL R.ate Case R.eview SOAH Order No, 1 a • . 	deadlines. 	 .20 

2/15/17 GNC 1.30 Rate case. Review SOAH Order; correspondence regarding notice of prehearing 
conference; telephone call with R. Eppright regarding interim rates; telephone call 

'th 	A field re 	same 

10 2/15/17 	e case:Draft notice of preheanng co erence; review ema 	orn c en ; con er 
with G. Crump regarding notice; send draft notice to PUC Staff. 

2/16/17 GNC Rate case. Correspondence with PUC Staff regarding Notice; revise draft Notice; 
v w corres ondencato R. E ri ht 

.50 

2/16/17 J14 
	Rate case. Revise proof of notice of prehearing coaference and affidavit; email to R. 	.80 

Lloyd Gossellnk Rochelle & Townsend, F.C. 
Pagel3 
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ATTACHMENT 13 
Page 18 of 26 

Lloyd Gonelink Rochelle & Townsend,  P.t. 

Undi.neLLC  
Green Shores Rate Application 
I.D.3799-0-GNC Mt. 

IvIarch f3, 2017" 
Invoice: 97480444 

	4111111111111110MIIIMIlIMMINIMIUMENIMINIMNIMI 

Date AttyDescri ti Of Services Rendered 	 Hours  

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES t 51705$ 00 11111.11111 

SUMMARY OF PR:OFESSIONAL SERVICES , 
t., 

Name ,„ 	, 	Staff Level 	Rate  Hours 	Amoun 	N/C 	NC 
' 	Georgia N Crump 	Principal 	375.00 

' Mauldin, Jamie L" t 	Associate 	275.00 
-", Tanya R Leisey 	Paralegal 	125.00 

Paraleial Assistant 	Paralegal A ' 	.00  
TOTALS 	, 

DISBURSEMENTS 

Date Descd tion 
	 Arnount 

2/09/17 Ceritral Parking-Syst Che  •70-003 	Parknag, Gen 	arking System, 
, 	1/31/2017, 1000002225,- January 2017 Parking Validations 

2/24/17 Corporate Couriers -Check # - 000032817 Courier, Corporate Czuriers, 2/15/2017, 
45629, Gust No. 1201 - Courier Services 2/6/17 - 2/15/17  

8.00 

MIN its")t)  

   

TOTAL DISBURSE1VIENTS 
	

S24.00 

TOTAL THIS4NVOICE 
	

S; 22-61,D0 INN 

LloYd Gossellnk*chelle & Towrisend, 
Pagel4 
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=MATS won= 
2215 SRAM LANS, STE. P 
AUSTIN. TX 70768 
41994 

LLOYD SMELT= ATTORNEYS AT WV 
816 CONCOMSS Avg 
SUITS 1900 
AUSTIN, TX 71701 

ROW =SATINS VISA.N/C 
AMU FOR DIVOICS PAYMENT 
PLEASE CALL $12.478.4007 
TO GET SWOP. 

1201 

GNAW:NEW NW. triVOle0 No. • POOR gitang AtnoWUXIss 

45479 	2/16/17 1,283.44 

2/10/17 700530 
215 

8.00 Base 
Rptur0 24.00 

/ 
4.00 LLOYD 000SELINg TOWNSEND 6 ROCRELLE TUC 

BLS COMM AVE 	 1701 N. CDROXISs AVE. 
AUSTIN 	' 	TX 76701 	 AUSTIN 	TX 78701 
Ca1lwri 07715I SERVICES Tim, 11,25 woe, 	s Lb. 
Signed, CSLESTS 

ME= 7:11TVIIIM tf,7•1=31!PNIMEN 

MENI111.11131111111111 

INNINSINEINEEIIIMMINEMINIMMEIMI 

ATTACHMENT B 
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INVOICE 
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,w4  

Lloyd tiosselink Rochelle & Townsend, r:C.  

Undine LLC 
Green Shores Rate Application 
I.D.3799-0-GNC 

  

April 17, 2017 
Invoice: 97481059 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

ff 	3/01/17 GNC 
,t 

Descri tion Of Services Rendered 

Rate case. Review PUC Staff discovery requests; correspondence to R. Eppright 
regarding same. 

Hours 

3/01/17 JLM Rate case: Telephone call with R. Eppright regarding interim rates; confer with G. 2.50 
Crump on filing interim rate request for R. Eppright; draft request for interim rates; 
research rules on interim rates: 

3/01/17 TRL Rate case. Review Staffs First RFI,to PK-RE and calculate and calendar Objection 
and response deadlines. 	• 	• 

.20 

3/02/17 GNC Rate case. Revise interim rate pleading confer with J. Mauldin iegarding same. 1.00 
3/02/17 JLM Rate case. Continue drafting PK-RE's motion for interitn rates; reviie draft. 1.00 
3/03/17 ONC .Rate case. Revise interim rate request. .60 
3/03/17 JIM Rate case. Revise PK-RE motion for interim rates. 1.00 
3/06/17 GNC Rate case. Revise motion for interim rates. .30 
3/06/17 JLM Rate case. Telephone calls with R. Eppright regarding interim rates and PUC open 

meeting; confer with G. Crump regarding preliminary order. 
1.00 

Rate case. Telephone call with R. Melcher regarding procedures for preheiring 3/07/17 GNC .20 ' 

7O7/17 , JIM Rate case. Finalin PK-RE motion for interim rates. 	 .50 

3/08/17 JLM Rate case. Telephone call with R. Eppright with update on PUC consent agen 
need to attend open meeting; review emails from client and opposing cdunsel 

tt: 	1 .  it 	 .1 t 	Vte' 

- DO 	• 

3/10/17 JLM Rate case. Telephone call with R. Eppright regarding response to J.. Carlton's request 
for agreement to extend response deadline on Motion for Interim Rates; email to G. 

	' .40 

Uoyd Gossellnk Rochelle & Townsend, P.C.- 
Pagel2 

3 



	IIIIIIMIIIII IIIIIMINIMM111•1001011111111111111111MINIMINI 

3/13/17 JLM Rate case E ad to J. Carlton. regarding Motion for Interim Rates. 2 

3/14/17 GNC Rate case. Office conference with J. Mauldin and T. Leisey regarding upcoming 
rehearin • 	 id tasks to prepare for same. 

50 

ATTACHMENT B 
Page 21 of 26 

Lloyd tAsselink Rochelle & Townsend r.C. 

Undine LLC 
	

April 17, 2017 
Green Shores Rate Application 

	
Invoice: 97481059 

I.D.3799-0-GNC 

3/14/17 ILM 

3/14/17 TRL 

Rate case. Office conference with G. Crump and T. Leisey regarding prehearing 
conference preparation; telephone call with R. Eppright regar4j.rik same; draft 
proposed procedural schedule. 
Rate Case. Meet with G. Crump and J. Mauldin to discuss upcorning'prehearin 
confe 

1.30 

.20 

.50 

.20 
4.10 

3/1 	1 7 JLM Rate case. Continue drafting procedural schedule for Docket No. 46333. 
3/15/17 TRL Rate Case, No Charge - Update G. Crump's Case noteboolc. 
3/16/17 GNC R.ate case, Pre are for and attend prehearíxi cdnference. 

' 	3/16/17 JLM Ra 	har e - Pre are for and attend rehearin conference. 

3/20/17 JLM Rate case. Telephone call to R. Melcher regarding proposed procedural schedule; 
discussions with G. Crump regarding same;-emails to PUC Staff regarding same; 

• revise proposed procedural schedule. 
3/20/17 TRL Rate CaSe: Prepare PK-RE Productiodresponsive tó Staffs 1st RFI and revise 

Response accordingly, 
3/21/17 GNC Rate case. " 	• 	re onses for R. 
3/21/17 JLM Rate case. 

mails to parties with proposed procedural 
dule. 
	

*seaj.eed ro osed rocedural schedule filing. 

1.50 

1.60 

1.4 
2Oo 

3/16/17 JLM Rate case. Follow-up call with R. Eppriglat regarding scheduling settlement meeting. 	.40 
4.10 

ILIvl Rate case. Draft proposed procedural schedule; email proposed schedule to parties. 	.50 

3/21 17 TRL Rate Case. Finalize and file PK-RE response to ta s irst RFL 	 • 
3/22/17 GNC Rate case. CorresPondence with PUC Staff and consultants 'regarding spreadsheets in. 	:60 - 

discovery responses. 
3/22/17 ILM Rate case. Emails and telephone calls to parties to get agreement on proposed 

roceclural schedule; revise Motion. 

L.loYd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C:- 
Pagel3 

32 

1.50 



ATTACHN/lENT B - 
Page 22 of 26 

Lloyd ti'rosseli ROchelle & To se 	r.C. 

 

• Undine LLC 
Green Shores Rate Application 
LD-.3799-0-GNC 

  

Apri117, 2017 
Invoice: 97481059 

Date Atty Description Of Services Rendered  
correspondence with parties regarding same; review rate proposals. 

3/23/17 .ILM Rate case. Review rotests to Moti 

 

Hours 

.80 

        

3/24/17 GNC Rate,case. Correspondence with parties rigarding settlement meeting. 
3/27/17 GNC Rate case. Correspondence with client regarding upcoming settlement negotiations; 

.30 

.90 

   

411 	* 

    

^4. 

3/28/17 GNC Rate case. Pre are for and attend settlement conference: 	 1.70 

3/28/17 	ate case. Prepare or an at en se ement co erence. 	 0 
3/29/17 .ILM Rate case. Review resPonses to PK-RES Motion for Interim Rates and make notes; 	2.00 

begin drafting Reply to responses. , 
- 3/30/17 GNC Rate case, Review Reply to Responses to PK-RES Motion for Interim Rates. 	 ,30 

3/30/17 ILM Rate case. Telephone call with R. Eppright; review and revise Re 1 to r onses to 	3.40 

. 	
iiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieview PIC-RE 2016 financi 

send Reply to R. Eppright for execution. , 
3/30/17 TRL Rate Case. Proofread PK-RE Reply to Responses to Ivlotion for Interim Rates. 
3/31/17 GNC • Rate case. Review Reply to Responses to PK-RE's Motion for Interim R.ates;'review, 	1,60 

acquisition adjustment schedules; telephone call with M. Ashfield regarding same; 
corre • ondence to parties. 

3/31/17 ,ILM Rate case. Research water code for statutory extension deadline rules. 	 .50 

TOTAL PROFESSI9NAL SERVICES di tr, 5411 sti MIN 

SUIVLNIARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Name 
Georgia N Crump 
Mauldin, Jamie L 
Tanya R Leisey 
Linda Y Quintanilla 
TOTALS 

Staff Level 
Principal 
Associate 
Paralegal 
Paralegal  

-Rate 
375.00 
275.00 
125.00 
120.00 

   

DISBURSEMiNTS 

Date Description 

 

Amount 

Lloyd Gosselink RoChelie & Townsend, P.C. 
, Pagei4 

33 
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p 

Llo d tiosselink Rochelle & Townsend, r.C. 

Undine LLC 
	

April 17, 2017 
Green Shores Rate Application 

	
Invoice: 97481059 

I.D.3799-0-ONC 

3/09/17 Corporate Couriers Check # - 000032877 Courier, Corporate Couriers, 2/28/2017, 	18.00 
45836 - February 2017 Courier Services 

3/16/17 Georgia N. Crump Check # - 009902309 Parking Parking for Undine prehearing 
	15.00 

• conference (Docket 46333). 
3/28/17 Corporate Couriers Check # - 000032972 Courier, Corporate Couriers, 3/15t2017, 

	24.00 
46014 Cust No. 1201 - For Courier Services Rendered * p 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 
	

ao 
TOTAL THIS INVOICE 
	.4's is, Sq. CD 

Lloyd Gossellnk Rochelle & Townsend. RC. 
1 	, 	 Papp 
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milwrmuslmosan4 
10366 

000007613D 
$15.00 
$0 

111.4SLV.1..111511...rtint.,. . 4Tretazs..t.zesatisa.zrzma- 

Total 

400 Vest 15th Street 
Thank You for Your visit 

Please COM Main I 

VISA 
Account 1 
SIlp 
Auth Coda 

Credit Card Amaunt 
Cash Amount 

ATTACHMENT B 
Page 25 of 26 

P/S 103 	 A PaWent No.00000126 
T/D 101 	 Ticket No.010200 
Entry Tise 	03/16/2017 (Thu) 9:09  
Exit Ilea 	03/16/2017 (Thu) 13:25 
Parkins Tlae 	 4:16 
Parkins Fee 	 Rate A 	$15.00 

3Q9cf -0 
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4angibl LLG 

no Oxford Valley Rd / Suite 1604 / Yardley, Pennsylvania 19067-2706 
TEL .215.369.9345 / FAX 215.369.9344 / www,tangibloom 

ATTACHMENT C 
Page 1 of 2 

INVOICE 

SOLD TO: 	Undine LLC 
	

DAtE: June 10, 2016 
10913 Metronome Drive 
	

INVOICE #: 	40-35701.01 
Houston, TX 77043 
	

TERMS: Net 30 Days 

ATTENTION: Mr. Ed Wallace 

FORM OF CONTRACT: 

REQUESTED BY: 	Ed Wallace 

PROJECT: 	P&K Development 

SCOPE OF SERVICES: Prepare base rate case as of 12-3-15. 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 	 TERM: 04/01/16 THROUGH 05/31/16 

Lump Sum Quotation 
Previous Amount Invoiced 
Amount Due This Period 
Remaining Arnount 

AMOUNTS 
$15,000.00 

$0.00 
$15,000.00 

$0.00 

  

TOTAL AMOUN'T DUE THIS INVOICE: 
	$15,000.00 

38 
Inv30-01 (revised 02/04) 



DATE: March 31, 2017 

INVOICE #: 357001.002 

TERMS: 1% 10 Net 30 

ACH PAYMENT TO COVENANT, BANK: . 931919021 11000817196 

Undine, LLC 

10913 Metrqnom'é Drive 

Houston, TX 77043 

ATTACHMENT C 

Page 2 of2 - 

\T a n ,i b 1 	

INVOICE 
Tangibl Group, Inc. I 201 King of Prussia Road I Suite 650 I Radnor, Pennsylvania 19087 

Tangibl, LLC is now Tangibl Group, Ink. If paying by check please send to our new address above. 

ATTENTION: 	 Ms. Carey Thomas 

FORM OF CONTRACT: 	Verbal 

•REQUESTED BY: 	 Mr. Ed Wallace 

PROJECT: 	 PK-RE Rate Case 

SCOPE OF SERVICES: 	Provide litigation support for PK-RE Rate Case: 

- ftespond to Staff data requests — set 1 - 40 hours 

- Develop settlement rates — 5 hours 

PROFESSIONAL 

LABOR: 

SERVICES 	 TERM: 02/27/17 THROUGH 03/31./17 

CLASSIFICATION 	 AMOUNTS HOURS 

40 Executive @ $200 CLADO1 = Donalcl J. Clayton, P.E. $8,000.60 

5 • ExeCutive @ $206 CLAD01 = Donald J. Clayton, P.E. 4 51,000.00 • 

SUBTOTAL: $9,000.00 

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS Il;%1VOICE: $9,000.00 
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