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APPLICATION OF DOUBLE §  BEFORE THE STATE OFFICE -
DIAMOND UTILITY COMPANY, INC.  § OF e
FOR WATER AND SEWER §  ADMINISTRATIVE HEARINGS
RATE/TARIFF CHANGE §

DOUBLE DIAMOND UTILITY COMPANY, INC.’S
RESPONSE TO COMMISSION STAFFE’S THIRD REQUEST FOR INFORMATION
STAFF NO. 3-1

COMES NOW, Double Diamond Utility Company, Inc. (“DDU”) and files its Response
to Commission Staff’s Third Request for Information — Staff No. 3-1. DDU agrees and
stipulates that all parties may treat these responses as if they were filed under oath.

Respectfully submitted,

John J. Carlton

The Carlton Law Firm P.L.L.C.
2705 Bee Cave Road, Suite 200
Austin, Texas 78746

(512) 614-0901

Fax (512) 900-2855

State Bar No. 03817600

ATTORNEY FOR DOUBLE DIAMOND
UTILITY COMPANY, INC.

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE
I hereby certify that I have served or will serve a true and correct copy of the foregoing

document via hand delivery, facsimile, electronic mail, overnight mail, U.S. mail and/or
Certified Mail Return Receipt Requested to all parties on this the 20® day of September 2017.

John Carlton

DDU’s Response to Staff’s Third Request for Information Page1of2
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SOAH DOCKET NO. 473-17-0119.WS
PUC DOCKET NO. 46245

COMMISSION STAFF'S THIRD REQUEST FOR
INFORMATION TO DOUBLE DIAMOND UTILITY
COMPANY, INC. QUESTION NOS. STAFF 3-1

Staff 3-1 Please provide invoices for all White Bluff and The Cliffs rate case expenses
claimed for recovery. Please provide timely updates as any new claimed expenses
are incurred. Details for the invoices should include the date the service was
provided, the person providing the service, a detailed narrative of the services
provided, and all supporting documentation for any expense included in the
invoice.

RESPONSE: Responsive non-privileged documents will be produced.

Prepared by: Christie Rotramel
Sponsored by: Randy Gracy, John Carlton, Jay Joyce, Victoria Harkins.
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THe

LAw FIirm {nvoice # 2876
P.L.L.C. Date: 08/03/2016
2705 Bee Cave Road, Suite 200
Austin, Texas 78746
Phone: 512-614-0901
Double Diamond Utilities, Co. /
5495 Beit Line Rd. ! U
Suite 200 \d (_/
Dallas, TX 75254 ’\
0110 - Double Diamond Utilities, Co. - 2016 Rate Application
Date Attorney Description Quantity Total
07/27/2018 JJC Receive and review correspondence from C. Rotramel; Receive 0.80 $28C.00
and review correspondence from A. Abazari; Teleconference with
J. Joyce's office regarding application; review application filing and
requirments.
07/27/2018 ALL Work regarding application. 0.70 $12250
07/28/2016 ALL Draft Naotice of Proposed Rate Change; teleconference with C. 270 $472.50
Rotramel regarding affidavit; correspondence to and from C.
Rotramel regarding affidavits for applications; revise and fnalize
affidavits; receive and review correspondence from J. Joyce
regarding notice for application; prepare cover letter.
07/28/2016 JJC Review rate application documents; work regarding affidavit 1.80 $665.00
verifying application; Teleconference with A, Abazari regarding
filings.
07/28/2016 JJC Work regarding application filing; finalize cover letter for same; 1.50 $525.00
Teleconference with J. Joyce regarding notices and application
forms.
Time Keeper Quantity ‘ Rate Total
John Carlton 42 $350.00 $1,470.00
Amy Loera 3.4 $175.00 $5985.00
Subtotal $2,065.00
Total $2,065.00
Page 1of 83 Page 10f2 DDU16 - 016003
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Statement of Account

Outstanding Balance New Charges Payments Received Total Amount Outstanding
{ $0.00 + $2,065.00 ) - ( $0.00 = 7 o o

Detailed Statement of Account

Current Invoice
invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received Balance Due
2878 08/03/2016 $2,065.00 $0.00 $2,065.00
Outstanding Balance $2,065.00
Total Amount Qutstanding $2,065.00

Please make all amounts payable to: The Cariton Law Firm, P.L.L.C.

Payment is due upon receipt. Please include invoice numbers as an additional reference so we may accurately
jdentify and apply your payment. Thank you!

Page 2 of 83 Page 2 of 2 DDU16 - 016004



Law Firwm

THE

P.L.L.C.

2705 Bee Cave Road, Suite 200
Austin, Texas 78748
Phone: 512-614-0901

Double Diamond Utilities, Co.
5495 Belt Line Rd.

Suite 200

Dallas, TX 75254

0110 - Double Diamond Utilities, Co. - 2016 Rate Application

Date
08/01/2016

08/04/2016

08/08/20186

08/09/2018

08/09/2016

08/16/2016

08/17/20186

08/18/2016

08/19/20186

08/24/20186

Attorney
AlLL

ALL

JJC

ALL

JJ4C

ALL

ALL

JJC

ALL

JJC

Page 3 of 83

Description

Work on finalizing filing package for water and sewer rate/tariff
change applications; file same with PUC.

Reaceive and review Order No. 1; calendar deadline; draft
correspondence to C. Rotrame! regarding Order No. 1.

Draft correspondence to PUC regarding nofice of rate change;
Receive and review correspondence fo C. Rotramel regarding
same; Receive and review reply from PUC staff; draft response.to
C. Rotramel.

Corraspendence to and from C. Rotramel regarding notices and
letters to customers; draft customer letters; create and share
application folder with C. Rotramel.

Work regarding notice of rate chang; draft letter to customers;
Teleconference with C. Rotramel; Telecanference with J. Joyce.

Receive notification of protest filings; obtain copies of same from
PUC exchange.

Receive notification of protest filings; obtain copies of same from
PUC exchange.

Receive and review correspondence from C. Rotramel regarding
notices and deadline for hearing requests; review protest letters.

Receive notification of protest filings; obtain copies of same from
PUC exchange.

Teleconference with V. Dygert at PUC regarding application; draft

correspondence to J. Joyce regarding same; Receive and review
reply; draft correspondence to V. Dygert regarding same.

Page 10f 3

INVOICE

{nvoice # 2925
Date: 09/08/2016

Quantity
6.60

0.30

0.60

1.70

2.00

0.20

0.20

0.50

0.80

0.40

Yotal
$1,155.00

$52.50

$210.00

$297.50

$700.00

$35.00

$35.00

$175.00

$157.50

$140.00

DDU16 - 016005




08/25/12016 J4JC Receive and review correspondence from V. Dygert regarding 0.30  $105.00
notice and application sufficiency; draft correspondence to J. Joyce
regarding same; draft response to V. Dygert; work regarding

affidavit of notice.

08/26/2016 JJC Work regarding affidavit for pulblication of noftice; review protest 040  $140.00
filings.

08/29/2016 ALL Draft correspondence to C. Rotramel regarding affidavits for 0.30 $52.50
notices.

08/30/2016 ALL Review Order No. 1; receive and review correspondence from C. 0.30 $52.50
Rotramel regarding signed affidavits.

08/30/2016 JJC Work regarding affidavits for notice; Receive and review 0.20 $70.00
correspondence to C. Rotramel; draft response.

08/31/2018 ALL Draft cover letter to PUC filing affidavits for Netice of Proposed 6.20 $35.00
Rate Change.

08/31/2016 J4JC Work regarding affidavits of notice and application completeness 0.20 $70.00

issues; Receive and review correspondence from V. Dygert
regarding same; draft response.

Time Keeper Quantity Rate Total
John Carlton 4.6 $350.00 $1,610.00
Amy Loera 10.7 $175.00 $1.872.50
Subtotal $3,482.50
Total $3,482.50

Statement of Account

Qutstanding Balance New Charges Payments Received Total Amount Outstanding
{ $2,065.00 +  $3,482.50 IR $0.00 e ts B B

Detailed Statement of Account

Other Invoices

Invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received Balance Due

2876 08/03/2016 $2,065.00 $0.00 $2,065.00

gl s
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Current Invoice

Invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received Balance Due
2925 09/08/2016 $3.482.50 $0.00 $3,482.50
Outstanding Balance $5,547.50

Total Amount Outstanding $5,547.50

Please make all amounts payable to: The Carlton Law Firm, P.L.L.C.

Payment is due upon receipt. Please include invoice numbers as an additional reference so we may accurately
identify and apply your payment. Thank you!

Page S of 83 Page 3 of 3 DDU16 - 016007



Austin, Texas 78746
Phone: 512-614-0901

Law Frrum

P.L.L.C.
2705 Bee Cave Road, Suite 200

Double Diamond Utilities, Co.
5495 Belt Line Rd.

Suite 200

Dallas, TX 75254

0110 - Double Diamond Utilities, Co. - 2016 Rate Application

Services

Date
0g/01/20186

06/01/2016

09/07/2016

09/12/2016

06/13/201€

09/13/2016

09/14/2016

0911412016

Attorney

ALL

JJC

ALL

ALL

JJc

JJC

ALL

Page 6 of 83

Description

Finalize correspondence to PUC filing Affidavits of Notice of
Proposed Rate Change; prepare copies; file same electronically
with PUC: arrange delivery of same for filing at PUC; forward
copies to V. Dygert and M. Cmich with PUC.

Receive and review correspondence from V. Dygert regarding
referral of application to hearing; draft correspaondence to C.
Rotramel regarding same; Receive and review reply.

Receive filing notification of Order No. 2 Deeming The Application
Administratively Complete; forward copy of same to C. Rotramel,
R. Gracy and J. Joyce.

Receive filing notification of Order of Referral; obtain copy of same
from PUC exchange; draft List of Issues.

Receive and review SOAH Order No. 1; calendar deadlines; draft
Notice of Prehearing Conference.

Receive and review correspondence from PUC regarding referral of
case to State Office of Administrative Hearing; review and finalize
draft notice of prehearing conference; Teleconference with J. Joyce
regarding application; work regarding preliminary filings for case;
review and revise list of issues.

Receive and review correspondence from C. Rotramel regarding
notice of prehearing conference; draft response.

Draft correspondence to V. Dygert and M. Cmich regarding Notice
of Prehearing Conference.

Page 1of 3

INVOICE

Invoice # 2967
Date: 10/05/2016

Quantity  Total

0.70  $122.50

0.50 $175.00

0.20 $35.00

0.50 $87.50

0.80 $140.00

2.80 $980.00

0.20  $70.00

0.20  $35.00

DDU16 - 016008



09/15/2016 ALL Finalize List of Issues; prepare copies; receive and review 060 $105.0C
correspondence from M. Crnich regarding Notice of Prehearing
conference; revise and finalize same.

09/15/2016 JJC Receive and review correspondence from M. Crnich regarding 0.40 $140.00
notice of prehearing confererice; draft response.

09/16/2016 ALL File List of Issues with PUC; forward copy of same to V. Dygert and 040  §70.00
M. Crnich; receive copy of Commission Staff's List of Issues.

08/20/2016 ALL Draft Motion for Protective Order. 040  $70.00

08/20/2016 JJC Work regarding notice of preliminary hearing. 0.50 $175.00

09/21/2016 ALL Draft correspondence to C. Rotramel regarding Notice of 0.30  $52.50

Prehearing Conference.

08/21/2016 JJC Finalize notice of prefiminary hearing; Receive and review 0.50 §$175.00
correspendence from C. Rotramel regarding same; draft response.

09/22/2018 JJC Receive and review correspondence from C. Rotramel regarding 0.50 $175.00
notice of prehearing conference; draft responses.

09/26/2016 ALL Receive and review correspondence from C. Rotramel regarding .10 $17.580
affidavit; revise affidavit and send to C. Rotramel.

09/28/2016 ALL Draft correspondence to PUC clerk filing Affidavit of Notice to 0.20 $35.00
Customers of Prehearing Conference.

09/28/2016 ALL Finalize correspondence to PUC filing Affidavit of Notice of 040  $70.00
Prehearing Conference; prepare copies of same and arrange
delivery of same to PUC for filing; forward copy of same to V.
Dygert and M. Cnrich.

Services Subtotal $2,730.00

Expenses

Type Date Description Quantity  Rate Total
Expense 08/31/2016 Corporate Couriers 1.00 $19.26 $19.26
Expense 08/01/2016 Copies (143 @ .10) 1.00 $14.30 $14.30
Expense 09/15/2016 Copies (36 @ .10) 1.00 $3.60 $3.60
Expense (9/16/2016 Corporate Couriers 1.00 $29.96 $29.96
Expense 08/29/2016 Copies (44 @ .10) 1.00 $4.40 $4.40
Expenses Subtotal $71.52
Time Keeper Quantity Rate Total

John Cariton 54 $350.00 $1,890.00

Page 7 of 83 Page 20f 3 DDU16 - 016009



Amy Loera 4.8 $175.00 $840.00
Subtotal $2,801.52

Total $2,801.52

Statement of Account

Quistanding Balance New Charges Payments Received
{ $0.00 +  $280152 )-{ $0.00 y=

Detailed Statement of Account

Current Invoice

Invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received Balance Due
2967 10/05/2016 $2.801.52 $0.00 $2,801.52
Outstanding Balance 52
Total Amount Outstanding $2,801 .5'2\;
/,

Please make all amounts payable to: The Cariton Law Firm, P.L.L.C.

Payment is due upon receipt. Please include invoice numbers as an additional reference so we may accurately
identify and apply your payment. Thank you!

Page 8 of 83 Page 3of 3 DPDU16 - 016010



THE

INVOICE

Law Fizm invoice # 3018
P.L.L.C. Date: 11/06/2018
2705 Bee Cave Road, Suite 200
Austin, Texas 78748
Phone: 512-614-0901 RECEIVED NOV 09 2016
Dounle Diamond Utllities, Co.
5435 Belt Line Rd.
Suite 200
Dallas, TX 75254
0110 - Double Diamond Utilities, Co. - 2016 Rate Application
Date Attorney Description Quantity Total
10/03/2018 JJC Receive and review carrespondence from C. Rotramel regarding 110 $385.00
customer protest; draft response; Receive and review
correspondence fram B. Nunltey regarding same; Receive and
review correspondernce from C. Rotramel regarding prehearing
conference; draft response.
10/07/2016 JJC Teleconference with A. Abazari regarding prehearing conference 050 $175.00
issues; observe PUC action on list of issues.
10/11/2016 JJC Receive and review correspandence from J. Freeland regarding 0.80  $315.00
White BIuff protestant group; draft correspondence to R. Gracy and
C. Rotramel regarding same; Receive and review comrespondence
from C. Rotramel regarding intervention requests; draft response.
10/12/2016  JUC Review PUC Preliminary Order and application filings; draft 110 $385.00
correspondence to V. Dygert and M. Crnich regarding same.
10/13/2016 JJC Draft correspondence to J. Joyce regarding hearing schedule; 0.20 $70.00
Receive and review reply.
10/17/2018 ALL Prepare file for prefiminary hearing. 190  $332.50
10/17/2016 JJC Teleconference with J. Joyce regarding hearing schedule; draft 110 $385.00
correspondence to M. Crnich regarding prefiled testimony
deadline; prepare for preliminary hearing; draft correspondence to
C. Rotramel; Receive and review reply.
10/18/2016 JJC Attend prefiminary hearing; Teleconference with J. Joyce regarding 4.20 §$1,470.00

scheduling; Teleconference with V. Harkins regarding consulting
work; Receive and review correspondence from V. Harkins; draft
update to R. Gracy; Receive and review reply.

Page 1 0of 3
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10/18/2016 ALL Draft correspondence to R. Garey, C. Rotramel and J. Joyce 0.30 $52.50
regarding Requests for information from White Biuff; calendar
response date.

107192016 JJC Work regarding hearing schedule; Receive and review 0.70  $245.00
correspondence from J. Freeland regarding discovery requests
from White Biuff; work regarding responses and objections.

1072012016 ALL Correspondence to and from V. Harkins regarding signed 0.40 $70.00
agreement.
10/20/2016 JJdC Work regarding engineering consultant; draft correspondence to V. 0.40 314000

Harkins; Receive and review reply.

10/21/2016 ALL Create shared folder for discovery responses; receive SCAH Order 070  $122.50
No. 2 Memorializing Prehearing Conference; calendar deadiines
per order; receive and review SOAH Order No. 3 Protective Order.

10/24/2016 ALL Receive and review protective order certifications from White Bluff 1.80 $315.00
Ratepayers Group; mark and bates label confidential documents
per protective order; receive and review certifications and requests
for information from The Cliffs Utility Committee; prepare
Response to White Biuff Ratepayers Group's First Request for
information 1-1.

10/24/2016 J4JC Receive and review correspondence from J. Smith regarding PUC 0.80  $280.00
protective order filings; draft response; Receive and review
correspondence fraom J. Freeland regarding PUC protective order
filings; draft response.

10/25/2018 44C Review documents for production and response to White Bluff RFl 3.70 $§1,295.00
1-1; Teleconference with J, Freeland regarding confidential filings;
Teleconference with J. Joyce regarding same; Receive and review
correspondence from J. Smith regarding protective order
certification; work regarding prefiled..

10/25/12016 ALL Finalize Response to White Bluff Ratepayers Group's First 240  $420.00
Request for Information RFI 1-1; prepare copies of same for filing
with PUC; prepare confidential filing; forward response to all
parties and confidential documents to R. Freeland.

10/26/2018 ALL Receive and review correspondence from J. Smith regarding PO 0.40 $70.00
Certifications; send confidential documents to J. Smith; draft
correspondence 1o R. Gracy, C. Rotramel. J, Joyce and V., Harkins
regarding The Cliffs Utility Committee’s First Request for
Information.

10/26/2018 JJIC Work regarding discovery responses; Teleconference with R. 3.50 $1,225.00
Gracy and C. Rotramel; draft correspondence to C. Rotramet
regarding affiliated interest issues; Receive and review
correspondence from J. Smith; draft response; draft
correspondence to V. Harkins; Receive and review reply.

10/27/12016 ALL Research and review files for prefiled testimony in prior water and 120 $210.00

sewer case, receive additional Protection Order certifications from
PUC staff.

Page20of3
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10/27/2016 ALL Receive and review Staff's Protection Order Certifications; forward Q.20 $35.00
confidential documents to M. Cnrich with PUC.

10/27/2016 JJC Work regarding prefiled testimony issues. 040  $140.00
10/28/2016 JJC Work regarding discovery requests. 0.80  $280.00
10/31/2016  JJC Receive and review correspondence from J. Smith regarding 060 $21000

confidentiality certificates; Receive and review correspondence
from J. Freeland regarding protected filings.

Time Keeper Quantity Rate Total
John Cariton 20.0 $350.00 $7,000.00
Amy Loera 9.3 $175.00 $1,627.50
Subtotal $8,627.50
Total $8,627.50

Statement of Account

Outstanding Balance New Charges Payments Received
{ $0.00 + $8827.50 )-{ $0.00

Detailed Statement of Account

Current Invoice

Invoice Number Due On Amount Due Paymenis Received Balance Due
3018 11/06/2016 $8,627.50 $0.00 $8,627.50
Quistanding Balance $8,827.50

Totali Amount Outstanding $3,827.50

Please make all amounts payable to: The Carlton Law Firm, P.L.L.C.

Payment is due upon receipt. Please include invoice numbers as an additional reference so we may accurately
identify and apply your payment. Thank you!

Page 30f 3
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THE

INVOICE

Law FizMm invoice # 3069
P.L.L.C. Date: 12/02/2016
2705 Bee Cave Road, Suite 200
Austin, Texas 78746
Phone: 5§12-614-0801
RECEIVED JAN 05 207
Double Diamond Utilities, Co.
5495 Belt Line Rd.
Suite 200
Dallas, TX 75254
0110 - Double Diamond Utilities, Co. - 2016 Rate Application
Services
Date Attomey Description Quantity  Total
11/01/2018 J4JC Receive and review corresponderice from J. Freeland regarding 0.60  $210.00
confidential filings: Teleconference with J. Joyce regarding
discovery responses; Receive and review correspondence from V.
Harkins regarding document review; draft response.
11/02/2018 ALL Receive and review correspondence from C. Rotramel regarding 0.20 $35.00
discovery, receive and review correspondence from J. Smith
regarding PO Certifications.
11/03/2016 ALL Waork regarding Response to White Bluff Ratepayer Group's First 1.00 $175.00
Request for information.
11/03/2016 JJC Research and review PUC rate case regarding rate base, rate of 180  $830.00
refum, expenses and other issues related to application.
11/04/2016 JJC Teleconference with V. Harkins regarding rate base issues. 040  $140.00
11/04/2016 ALL Receive and review White Bluff Ratepayers Group’s Motion to 0.60  $105.00
Declassify; calculate and calendar response date; prepare draft
response.
11/04/2016 JJC Teleconference with V. Harkins regarding rate issues. 040  $140.00
11/07/2016 ALL Receive and review correspondence from V. Harkins regarding 0.80  $140.00
pracedural schedule; draft response; receive WBRG's Third
Protective Order Certifications; revise Response to WBRG's First
Request for information.
11/07/2016  JJC Receive and review correspondence from V. Harking; draft 2.80 $1,015.00

response, work regarding discovery responses; draft

Page 1 of 5
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correspondence to J. Joyce and C. Rotramel; Receive and review
replies; Teleconference with C. Rotramsl.

11/08/2016 ALL Revise and finalize Response to WBRG's First Request for 4,40  $770.00
Information; organize and bates production documents; file
response electronically with the PUC, prepare copies of same for
delivery to PUC; prepare confidential submission; arrange delivery
of same to PUC for filing; forward copies to all parties.

11/08/2016 JJC Finalize discovery responses for White Bluff; Receive and review 1.50  $525.00
correspondence from C. Rotramel regarding discovery responses
for The Cliffs.

11/09/2016 JJC Work regarding response to The Cliffs discovery; Teleconference 130 $455.00

with C. Rotramel's office.

11/09/2016 KANC Review motion to declassify documents as confidential; review 250  $812.50
protective order in matter; draft response for filing.

11/10/2018 ALL Finalize Response to WBRG's Motion to Declassify; prepare 1.60  $280.00
copies of same and arrange delivery to to PUC for filing; serve
copy of same to all parties; work regarding response to TCUC's
First Request for information.

11/10/2016 JJC Review draft discovery responses; Receive and review 140  $450.00
correspondence from J, Joyce regarding same; Receive and
review correspondence from J. Freeland regarding discovery
responses; draft correspondence o J. Joyce regarding same;
review motion in response to White Bluff motion to declassify;
Teleconfersnce with B. Fairchild regarding consulting services;
Receive and review correspondence from J. Smith regarding
production; draft response.

11/11/2016 ALL Work regarding Response to TCUC's First Request for Information. 070 $12250

111112016 JJC Review and revise responses to The Cliffs requests for 4,50 $1,575.00
information; Teleconference with J. Joyce regarding same;
research prior applications.

11/14/2016 ALL Organize production documents and bates label; burn same 1o CD; 3.60 $630.00
prepare same for confidential filing; finalize response to TCUC's
First Request for Information; prepare copies of same and arrange
delivery to PUC for filing; forward copies of response and
production documents to all parties.

11/14/2016 JJC Finalize discovery responses to The Cliffs; draft correspondence to 260  $3810.00
J. Joyce regarding response; Receive and review reply; work
regarding request related o in camera review from Judge’s
assistant.

11715/2016 JJC Work regarding discovery issues; Teleconference with A. Abazari; 090 §315.00
Receive and review correspondence from J. Freeland regarding
Motion to reject application; draft correspondence to R. Gracy
regarding same.

11/18/20168 ALL Receive WBRG's Motion to Reject Application or Suspend Rates 0.30 $52.50
Based on Misrepresentations in the Applicatiory; calendar response
deadline; receive corespondence from V. Harkins; draft response.

Page2of 5
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11/16/2018

111712016

1111772016

11/21/2016

11/2172016

11/22/2016

111222016

11/23/2016

14/28/2016

JJC

ALL

JJc

J4ic

ALL

4JC

JJC

ALl

Page 14 of 83

Teleconference with V. Harkins regarding rate case issues;
Teleconference with R. Gracy regarding same; Receive and review
correspondence from J. Freeland regarding discovery responses;
draft correspondence to R. Gracy regarding same.

Review offsite files; research PUC rules; receive filing notfication
for SOAH Order No. 4 Requiring DDU Certifications; obtain copy of
same from PUC exchange; receive and review correspondence
from V. Harkins; draft response.

Teleconference with J. Freeland regarding discovery issues and
rate syspension; review 2010 sewer rate case filings; work
regarding discovery issues; Teleconference with J. Joyce
regarding same; Teleconference with J. Dickson regarding
discovery responses; Receive and review correspondence from C.
Rotramel regarding same.

Draft Response to WBRG's Motion to Reject Application or
Suspend Rates based on Misrepresentations in the Application;
draft Response to SCAH Order No. 4.

work regarding supplemental discovery responsas; conference
with C.Rotramel; receive and review correspondence from J.
Joyce; telephone conference with J Joyce semicolon telephone
conference with R. Gracy; telephone conference with J. Freeland;
review filing deadlines; telephone conferenee with M. Crnich office;
telephone conference with J. Smith's office.

Receive filing notification of Staff's Response tc WBRG's Motion;
retrieve copy of same from PUC exchange; draft Agreed Motion to
Suspend Effective Date and Abate Proceeding for 90 Days;
organize supplemental documents; draft Amended and First
Supplemental Response to WBRG's First RF; review PUC rules
regarding voluminous production.

Work regarding motion to abate and suspend rates; draft
correspondences to R. Gracy regarding same; Receive and review
reply from C. Rotramet; Teleconference with J. Smith regarding
same; Teleconference with M. Crnich regarding same; work
regarding revised rate calculations; Receive and review
correspondence from J. Freeland regarding agreement for delayed
response o motion to revoke or suspend; draft response; work
regarding discovery responses; Receive and review
correspondence from J. Smith; draft response.

Receive and review correspondence from J. Freeland regarding
agreed abatement; Receive and review correspondence from J.
Smith regarding same; Receive and review correspondence from
M. Cmich regarding same; draft correspondence to R. Gracy
regarding same; Receive and review reply; finalize and file motion
to abate; Tefeconference with J. Joyce regarding same.

Draft Motion for Leave; finalize same and prepare copies for filing;

arrange defivery of same for filing at PUC; forward copy of same to
all parties.

Page 30f5

1.70 $595.00
0.80  $140.00
240  $840.00
0.50 $87.50
5.00 $1,750.00
3.20 $560.00
4.50 §1,575.00
250  $875.00
0.80 $140.00
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11/28/2016 JJC Work regarding discovery and abatement issues, draft motion for 0.80  $280.00
leave to file response to Order No. 4; Receive and review
correspondence from J. Freeland.

11/29/2016 JJC Receive and review correspondence from Judge regarding Order 0.30  $105.00
granting abatement.

11/30/2016 ALL Receive SOAH Grder No. 5 Granting Agreed Motion to Suspend 0.20 $35.00
Effective Date and Abate Case for 80 days and Granting Motion to
Delay Response; update calendar entries.

11/30/2016 JJC Work regarding application issues; Receive and review 0.40  $140.00
correspondence from C. Rotramel: draft response.

Services Subtotal $16,650.00

Expenses

Type Date Description Quantity  Rate Totat
Expense 11/08/2016 Corporate Couriers 1.00 $28.86 $29.96
Expense 11/10/2016 Copies (36 @ .10) 1.00 $3.580 $3.80
Expense 11/10/2016 Corporate Couriers 1.00 $23.96  $29.96
Expense 11/14/2016 Copies (23 @ .10) 1.00 $2.30 $2.30
Expense 11/14/2016 Corporate Couriers 1.00 $20.96 $29.96
Expense 11/28/2016 Copies (12 @ .10} 1.60 $1.20 $1.20
Expense 11/30/2016 Cormorate Couriers 10.25.16 100 31928  $19.26
Expenses Subtotal $116.24
Time Keeper Quantity Rate Total

John Cardton 359 $350.00 $12,565.00
Kelii Cariton 25 $325.00 $812.50
Amy Loera 18.7 $175.00 $3,272.50

Subtotal $16,766.24
Total $16,766.24

Statement of Account

Outstanding Balance New Charges Payments Received Tatal Amount Qutstanding
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( $0.00 +  $18,766.2¢  )-{ $0.00 =

Detailed Statement of Account

Current Invoice
Invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received Balance Due
3069 12/02/20186 $16,766.24 $0.00 $16,766.24
Dutstanding Balance $16,766.24
Total Amount Qutstanding $16,766.24

Please make aif amounts payable to: The Carlion Law Firm, P.L.L.C.

Payment is due upon receipt. Please include invoice numbers as an additional reference 5o we may accurately
identfy and apply your payment. Thank you!
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Lo INVOICE

Law FirM Invoice # 3124
P.L.L.C. Date: 01/11/2017
2705 Bee Cave Road, Suite 200
Austin, Texas 78746
Phone: 512-614-0901
Double Diamond Utiiities, Co.
5495 Belt Line Rd.
Suite 200 8 20V
Dallas, TX 75254 RECE‘VED JAN !
0110 - Double Diamond Ultilities, Co. - 2016 Rate Application
Services
Date Attorney Description Quantity Total
12/08/2016 JJC Teleconference with V. Harkins and J. Joyce regarding application 0.70  $245.00
changes.
12/09/2016 JJC Receive and review correspondence from C. Rotramei regarding 080 $315.00
status; draft response; response to J. Freeland questions; draft
correspondence 1o R. Gracy and C. Rotrame! regarding White Bluff
information request.
12/12/2016 JJC Receive and review correspondence from J, Joyce regarding 0.70  $245.00
application revisions; draft response; Receive and review
carrespondence from C. Rotramel regarding discovery issues; draft
response.
12/13/2016 JJC Teleconference with J. Joyce, R. Gracy and Double Diamond 1.30 $455.00
representatives regarding application revisions; Teleconference
with J. Joyce and V. Harkins regarding same; draft correspondence
to C. Rotrame! regarding same.
12/14/2016 JJC Receive and review correspondence from C. Rotramel regarding 0.60 $210.00
application documents; draft response; draft correspondence 1o V.
Harkins and J. Joyce regarding same.
12/1672016 JJC Review Rock Creek filing issues; review prior rate case electronic 0.60 $210.00
files; draft correspondence to J. Joyce and V. Harkins regarding
same.
12/18/2016 JJC Teleconference with J. Joyce and V. Harkins regarding application 1.10  $385.00
amendment. .
12/21/2016 JJC Teleconference with R. Gracy regarding revised application filing; 0.80 $315.00

Teteconference with V. Harkins regarding application; Receive and
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review correspondence from V. Harkins regarding rate base issues;
draft correspondence to C. Rotramel regarding same.

Expenses

Type Date Description
Expense 12/07/2018 Corporate Couriers 11.28.16

Services Subtotal $2,380.00

Quantity  Rate Total
1.00 $24.61 $24.814

Expenses Subtotai $24.81
Time Keeper Quantity Rate Tatal
John Cariton 8.8 $350.00 $2,380.00
Subtotal $2,404.61
Total $2,404.61
Statement of Account
Outstanding Balance New Charges Payments Received Total Amount Outstanding

( $16,766.24 +  $2,404.61 y-{ $0.00

Detailed Statement of Account

Other Invoices

F AV O /4

Payments Received Balance Due

$0.00 $16,766.24 (2

Payments Received Balance Due
$0.00 $2,404.81
Outstanding Balance $19,170.85

Total Amount Outstanding $19,170.85

Invoice Number Due On Amount Due
3089 12/02/2016 $16,766.24
Current Invoice

Invoice Number Due On Amount Due
3124 011172017 $2,404.61
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Please make all amounts payable to: The Cariton Law Firm, P.LL.C.

Payment is due upon receipt. Please include invoice nurbers as an additional reference so we may accurately
identify and apply your payment. Thank youl
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THE

INVOICE

Law Firm invoice # 3165
P.L.L.C. Date: 02/01/2017
2705 Bee Cave Road, Suite 200
Austin, Texas 78746
Phone: 512-614-0901
Double Diamond Utilities, Co.
5485 Belt Line Rd.
Sute 200 RECEIVED FEBU 1237
Datlas, TX 75254
0110 - Double Diamond Utilities, Co. - 2016 Rate Application
Date Attorney Description Quantity  Total
01/03/2017 JJC Work regarding procedural issues. 040 $140.00
01/06/2017 JJC Receive and review correspondence from C. Rotramel regarding 1.80 $630.00
rate application documents; Teleconference with J. Joyce and V.
Harkins regarding same.
01/08/2017 JJC Receive and review correspondence from C. Rotramel regarding 0.30 $105.00
application documents; draft response; draft correspondence to J.
Joyce and V. Harkins regarding same.
01/10/2017 ALL Receive correspondence fram V. Harkins; review production 090 $157.50
documents; teleconference with V. Harkins regarding same; bates
{abel documents.
01/12/2017 ALL Teleconference with V. Harkins regarding documents; bates labe! 1.10  $192.50
documents.
01/13/2017 JJC Teleconference with C. Rotramel regarding status of case; 0.50 $175.00
Teleconference with J. Freeland regarding revised application;
Teleconference with V. Harkins regarding same.
Q1/16/2017 ALL Receive and review correspondence from V. Harkins; draft 1.50 §$262.50
response; bates Iabel documents.
01/16/2017 JJC Receive and review correspondence from C. Rotramel regarding 230 $805.00
application documentation; draft correspondence to V., Harkins
regarding same; Receive and review reply; draft response;
Teleconference with C. Rotramel; Teleconference with V. Harkins.
01/19/2017 JJC Teleconference with V. Harkins and J. Joyce regarding asset 0.70 324500
values.
01/20/2017 JJC Receive and review correspondence from V. Harkins regarding 020 $70.00
asset value,
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01/23/2017 ALL Correspondence from and to V. Harkins; bates tabel documents. 0.80 $140.00

01/24/2017 ALL Correspondence to and from V. Harkins; bates {abe! documents; 1.20  $210.00
teleconference with V. Harkins regarding same.

01/24/2017 J44C Receive and review correspondence from V. Harkins regarding 020 370.00
application documents.

01/26/2017 JJC Receive and review correspondence from C. Rotramel; 040 $140.00
Teleconference with C. Rotramel; Receive and review
correspondence from V. Harkins.

012712017 JJC Teleconference with V. Harkins regarding asset evaluation; 090 $315.00
Teleconference with J. Joyce regarding application revisions;
Teleconference with C. Rotramel regarding same.

Time Keeper Quantity Rate Total
John Cariton 7.7 $350.00 $2,695.00
Ay Loera 55 $175.00 3962.50
Subtotal $3,657.50
Total $3,657.50

Statement of Account

Outstanding Balance New Charges Payments Received Total Amount Qutstanding
( $0.00 + $3857.50 - $0.00 y=| $3,657.50 '« .. . |

Detailed Statement of Account

Current Invoice

Invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received Balance Due
3165 02/01/2017 $3,657.50 $0.00 $3,857.50
Outstanding Balance $3,657.50
Total Amount Qutstanding $3,657.50

Please make all amountis payable to: The Carlton Law Firm, P.L.L.C.

Payment is due upon receipt. Please include invaice numbers as an additional reference so we may accurately
identify and apply your payment. Thank you!
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INVOICE

Law Frzwm Invoice # 3222
PLLL.C. Date: 03/01/2017
2705 Bee Cave Road, Suite 200
Austin, Texas 78746
Phone: 512-614-0901
Double Diamond Utilities, Co.
5495 Beit Line Rd.
Suite 200
Dallas, TX 75264
0110 - Double Diamond Utilities, Co. - 2016 Rate Application
Date Attorney Description Quantity  Total
02/02/2017 ALL Receive correspondence from V. Harkins. 0.20 $35.00
02/15/2017 JJC Telecenference with J. Joyce regarding revised application tables 030  $105.00
and discovery responses.
021772017 2JC Work regarding discovery production of voluminous materials; 210  $735.00
rasearch regarding rate base issues; conference with A. Abazari
regarding same.
02/20/2017 JJC Review revised asset lists and workpapers; draft correspondence 3.80 $1.330.00
to J. Joyce and V. Harkins regarding same; work regarding revised
application and discovery responses.
02/21/2017 ALL Drafis response o J. Freeland; work regarding application; draft 3.60 $630.00
index for production; work regarding discovery.
022172017 JJC Werk regarding amended discovery responses and revised 080  $210.00
appiication pages.
02/22/2017 ALL Work regarding discovery. 100 $175.00
02/22/2017 JJC Revise discovery responses. 0.80 $280.00
02/23/2017 ALL Work regarding discovery respornses. 150  $262.50
Time Keeper Quantity Rate Total
John Cariton 78 $350.00 $2,660.00
Amy Loera 6.3 $175.00 $1,102.50
Subtotal $3,762.50
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Total $3,762.50

Statement of Account

Custanding Balance New Charges Payments Received Total Amount Quistanding
{ $0.00 +  $3.76250  3-{ $0.00 y=| $3,762.50 |

Detailed Statement of Account

Current invoice

Invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received Balance Due
3222 03/01/2017 33.762.50 $0.00 $3.762.50
Quistanding Balance $3,762.50
Total Amount Qutstanding $3,762.50

Please make all amounts payable to: The Carlton Law Firm, PLL.C.

Payment is due upon receipt. Please include invoice numbers as an additional reference so we may accurately
identify and apply your payment. Thank you!
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THE INVOICE

Law Firu Inveice # 3277
P.L.L.C, Date; 04/07/2017

2705 Bee Cave Road, Suite 200
Austin, Texas 78748
Phone: 512-614-0901

Double Diamond Utilities, Co.
5495 Belt Line Rd.

Suite 200

Dallas, TX 75254

0110 - Double Diamond Utilities, Co. - 2016 Rate Application

Services
Date Attorney Description Quantity  Total

02/28i2017 ALL Work regarding status report. 0.20 $35.00

03/01/2017 ALL Draft status report; finalize same; prepare copies; arrange deliver 0.80  $140.00
of same to PUC for filing; forward copy to all parties.

03/01/2017 JJC Draft status report; Teleconference with J. Freeland's office; 0.80  $280.00
Teleconference with J. Smith; Teleconference with M. Crnich’s
office; draft correspondence to parties regarding status report;
Receive and review replies from J. Freeland and M. Crnich: finalize
status report for filing: Receive and review reply from J. Smith,

03/06/2017 ALL Receive SOAH Order No. 8 Requiring Status Report or Procedural 0.20 $35.00
Schedule; calendar deadline.

03723/2017 ALL Work regarding new application package. 070 $122.50

03/27/2017 J4JC Review revised application materials and work papers; 286 $1,015.00
Teleconference with J. Joyce's office regarding same; work
regarding updated discovery responses.

03/28/2017 J4JC Work regarding application revisions; Teleconference with J. 0.70  $245.00
Joyce; Teleconference with V. Harkins regarding same.

0313072017 JJC Receive and review correspendence from C. Rotrame! regarding 080 $315.00

status of case; draft response; Receive and review
carrespondence from J. Joyce regarding rate comparisons; draft
response; Receive and review reply.

Services Subtotal $2,187.50

Page 10f 2
Page 25 of 83 DDU16 - 016027



Expenses

Type Date Description Quantity  Rate Total
Expense 03/01/2017 Corporate Couriers 100 $29.86 32996
Expenses Subtotal $29.96

Time Keeper Quantity Rate Total

John Carlton 53 $350.00 $1,855.00
Amy Loera 19 $175.00 $332.50
Subtotal $2,217.46
Total $2,217.46

Statement of Account

Outstanding Balance New Charges Payments Received Total Amount Outstanding
{ 80.00 + 8221748 ) $0.00 y=1 $2,217.46 1

Detailed Statement of Account

Current Invoice

Invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received Balance Due
3277 04/07/12017 $2,217.46 $0.00 $2,217.46
Qutstanding Balance $2,217.46
Total Amount Dutstanding $2,217.46

Please make all amounts payabie to: The Cariton Law Firm, P.L.L.C.

Payment is due upon receipt. Please include invoice numbers as an additional reference so we may accurately
identify and apply your payment. Thank you!
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THE INVOICE

Law FirM Invoice # 3341
P.L.L.C. Date: 05/06/2017

2705 Bee Cave Road, Suite 200
Austin, Texas 78746
Phone: 512-614-0901

Double Diamond Utilities, Co.
5495 Belt Line Rd.

Suite 200

Dallas, TX 75254

0110 - Double Diamond Utilities, Co. - 2016 Rate Application

Services
Date Attorney Description Quantity Total

04/03/2017 ALL Work regarding amended application. 0.70 $122.50

04/04/2017 ALL Work regarding amended application. 0.80 $140.00

04/04/2017 JJC Receive and review correspondence from C. Rotramei regarding 0.40 $140.00
revised application; draft response.

04/06/2017 ALL Waork regarding production; revise discovery responses; work 240  $420.00
regarding amended application.

04/07/2017 JJC Work regarding corrected filings; Teleconference with R. Gracy, 0.80 $280.00
DDU staff, J. Joyce and V. Harkins regarding filing corrections.,

047102017 JJC Receive and review correspondence from C. Rotramel regarding 0.40 $140.00
status; draft response; Teleconference with J. Joyce regarding
same.

04/1112017 ALL Work regarding amended application. 3.00 $525.00

04/1212017 JJC Teleconference with J. Joyce regarding revised calculations and 1.10  $385.00
tates; revise correspondence for filing with PUC.

04/18/2017 ALL Work regarding amended application. 1.00 $175.00

04/19/2017 ALL Work regarding amended application. 070 $122.50

04/19/2017 JJC Waork regarding revised filings with PUC. 040 $140.00

04/20/2017 ALL Work regarding amended application. 1.30 $227.50

04/20/2017 JJC Review documents for confidential filings. 080 $210.00
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04/21/2017 JJC Work regarding production of confidential materials. 040 $140.00

04/24:2017 JJC Work regarding corrected filings; Receive and review 1.50 $525.00
correspondence from C. Rotramel; draft response.

04/25/2017 ALL Work regarding amendment application. 270 $472.50

04/25/2017 JJC Review and revise filing for application corrections. 0.80 $315.00

04/26/2017 ALL Revise and finalize Designation of Protected Materials in Response 450 $787.50

to SCAH Order No. 4; prepare copies of same for PUC; revise and
finalize amended application package; file same electronically;
travel to and from PUC and file documents; forward copies to all

parties.
04/26/2017 JJC Review and finalize application materials, protected materials 2.80 $380.00
designation and cover istter for filing.
04/27/2017 ALL Revise discovery. 150 $262.50
04/27/2017 JAO Update hearing binders. 0.40  $20.00
04/2812017 ALL Work regarding discovery, 480 $840.00
04/28/2017 JJC Waork regarding discovery update and status report. 040 $140.00
04/28/2017 J4J4C Work regarding discovery supplementation; Receive and review 090 $315.00

correspondence from J. Freeland regarding schedule; draft
response; draft status report.

Services Subtotal $7,825.00

Expenses

Type Date Description Quantity Rate Total
Expense 04/27/2017 Rainmaker - digital prints 1.00 $183.16 $183.16
Expenses Subtotal $183.16
Time Keeper Quantity Rate Total

John Cariton 10.6 $350.00 $3,710.00
Amy Loera 234 $175.00 $4,095.00
Jennifer Osborne 0.4 $50.00 $20.00
Subtotal $8,008.16
Total $8,008.16
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Statement of Account

Outstanding Balance New Charges Payments Received Total Amount Outstanding
( $2,217.48 + $8,008.16  )-{ $0.00 y=1 el re840,22562. 7 ]

Detailed Statement of Account

Other Invoices

Invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Recelved Balance Due Ay &?
3277 04/07/2017 $2.217.46 $0.00  $2217.48 M /1 // y
Current Invoice C"y/ O/C@ 7 / /

Invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received RBatance Due
3341 05/05/2017 $8,008.16 $0.00 $8,008.16

Outstanding Balance $10,225.62
Total Amount Outstanding $10,225.62

Please make all amounts payable to: The Cariton Law Firm, P.LL.C.

Payment is due upon receipt. Please include invoice numbers as an additional reference so we may accurately
identify and apply your payment. Thank youl
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INVOICE

Law Firvu Invoice # 3388
p.L.L.C. Date: 06/06/2017
2705 Bee Cave Road, Suite 200
Austin, Texas 78746
Phone: 512-614-0901
Double Diamond Utilities, Co.
5495 Belt Line Rd.
Suite 200
Dallas, TX 75254
0110 - Double Diamond Utilities, Co. - 2016 Rate Application
Services
Date Attorney Description Quantity  Total
05/01/2017 JJC Work regarding revised discovery responses; Teleconference with 240  $840.00
J. Freeland.
05/01/2017 ALL Finalize status report; prepare copies of same; arrange delivery of 2.50  $437.50
same to PUC f{or filing; revise discovery responses.
05/02/2017  JJ4C Work regarding amended discovery responses; draft 3.30 $1,155.00
correspondence to C. Rotramel; Receive and review reply.
teleconference with A. Abazari; review correspendence to R.
Gracy, draft response.
05/02/2017 ALL Work regarding discavery responses. 340  $585.00
05/03/2017 ALL Receive SOAH Qrder 7 Scheduling Prehearing Conference. 0.10 $17.50
05/03/12017 ALL Revise discovery. 0.50 $87.50
050372017 JJC Teleconference with A. Abazari; Review and finalize discovery 150 $525.00
responses; Teleconference with R. Gracy and C. Rotrarmel.
05/04/2017 JJC Review Rock Creek testimony issues. 040 $140.00
05/08/2017 ALL Receive and review WBRG's Second Request for information; 0.40 $70.00
draft correspondence to J. Freeland.
05/09/2017 ALL Revise discovery. 210 $367.50
05/10/2017 ALL Draft shell for response to WBRG’s second request for information; 070  $122.50

draft correspondence to C. Rotramel, R. Gracy, J. Joyce and V.
Harkins regarding same.
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05/10/2017 JJC Review and finalize discovery response. 050 $175.00

05/11/2017 ALL Revise and finalize discovery responses; prepare copies of same 380 $630.00
for filing with PUC; forward copies of same to parties; forward
same to C. Rotramet, R. Gracy and J. Joyce; review PUC rules
regarding objections; draft and finalize Rule 11 Agreement; forward
same to J. Freeland; receive correspondence to C. Rotramel; draft

response.
05/12/2017 ALL Receive and review Rule 11 Agreement from J. Freeland. 0.20 $35.00
05/15/2017 JJC Work regarding index of documents produced in discovery and 120  $420.00

organization of case files; Teleconference with V. Harkins;
Teleconference with Teleconference with J. Joyce.

05/16/2017 ALL Work regarding Objections to WBRG's Second Request for 1.00  $175.00
information.
05/17/2017 ALL Draft and finalize Rule 11 Agreement; forward same to J. Freeland: 1.20  $210.00

review proposed schedule; receive signed Rule 11 Agreement
from J, Freeland.

05/19/2017 JJC Teleconference with J. Freeland regarding discovery responses 070 $245.0C
and settlement discussions; Receive and review comrespondence
from. J. Freeland regarding proposed hearing schedule; draft
correspondence to V. Harkins and J. Joyce regarding same.

05/22/2017 ALL Correspondence to and from C. Rotramel regarding discovery; 0.60 $105.00
review revised proposed procedural schedule from J. Freeland;
receive and review correspondence from J. Smith; draft response.

05/22/2017 JJC Receive and review correspondence from J. Smith regarding 0.20 $70.00
prehearing conference.

05/23/2017 JAD Update pleadings and discovery binders. 360 $180.00

05/23/2017 JJC Receive and review correspondence from J. Joyce and V. Harkins 0.30  $105.00

regarding heanng schedule; draft correspondence to J. Freeland
regarding same,

05/24:2017 ALL Revise and finalize Objections to WBRG's Second RF; prepare 240  $420.00
copies of same; arrange defivery of same for filing with PUC;
forward same to all parties.

05/24/2017 KANC Review and revise discovery objections; review caselaw cited in 100  $325.00
same.
052412017 JJC Teleconference with V. Harkins regarding discovery responses; 190  $685.00

Teleconference with J. Freeland's office regarding discovery
responses and objections: Teleconference with C. Rotramel
regarding discovery responses, draft and finalize objections to
discovery from White Biuff; draft correspondence to R. Gracy and
C. Rotramei regarding discovery responses; Receive and review
reply.

05i26/2017 ALL Update pleadings binder; revise draft procedural schedule; forward 140  $245.00

same to C. Roframel, V. Harkins and J. Joyce; teleconference with
J. Joyce regarding same; correspondence to and from J. Freeland
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regarding same; draft correspondence to ALJ filing same;
correspondence 1o and from H. Aguirre regarding same; forward
schedule to all parties.

05/28/2017 JJC Attend prehearing conference; work regarding revised procedural 250  $875.00
schedule for filing with Judge.

05/30/2017 ALL Prepare copies of proposed procedural schedule for filing with 180  $280.00
PUCG; arrange delivery of same 1o PUC; revise Responses to
WBRG's Second RF; correspondence from and to J. Freeland
regarding Rule 11 Agreement.

05/30/2017 JJC Work regarding discovery responses. 1.50  $525.00

05/31/2017 ALL Revise Response 1o WBRG's Second RFI; bates label and finalize 230 $402.50
response; electronicaily file same; arrange delivery of same for
filing with PUC, forward copy to ali parties.

058/31/2017 JJC Finalize discovery response for White Biuff second RFls; 1.70  $585.00
Teleconference with C. Rotramel regarding same.

Services Subtotal $11,040.00

Expenses
Type Date Description Quantity  Rate Total
Expense 04/07/2017 Conference call fees. 1.00 $18.34 $18.34
Expense 05/01/2017 Corperate Courier fee. 1.00 $24.38 $524.38
Expense 05/11/2017 Copies (75@ .10) 1.00 $7.50 $7.50
Expense 05/11/2017 8CDs 1.00 $40.00 $40.00
Expense 05/11/2017 Corporate Courier fee. 1.00 $19.80 $19.80
Expense (05/24/2017 Copies (44 @ .10} 1.00 $4.40 $4.40
Expense 05/24/2017 Corporate Courier fee 1.00 $30.80 $30.80
Expense 05/30/2017 Corporate Courier fee 1.00 $17.60 $17.60
Expense 05/31/2017 905 b&w copies, 2 sided 1.00 $103.84 §103.84
Expense 08/31/2017 Corporate Courier fee 1.00 $30.80 $30.80
Expenses Subtotal $297.46
Time Keeper Quantity Rate Total
John Cariton 18.1 5356.00 | $633500
Kelli Carlton 1.0 $325.00 $325.00
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Amy Loera 24.0 $175.00 $4.200.00
Jennifer Osborne 36 $50.00 $180.00
Subtotal $11,337.46

Total $11,337.46
Statement of Account
Outstanding Balance New Charges Payments Received Total Amount Outstanding
{ $8,008.18 £ $11.33748 ) $0.00 )= $1934562 - - |
Detailed Statement of Account
Other Invoices
invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received Balance Due
3341 05/05/2017 $8.008.16 $0.00 $8,008.16
Current Invoice
invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received Balance Due
3338 06/06/2017 $11,33746 $0.00 $11,337.46

Outstanding Balance $19,345.62
Total Amount Cutstanding $19,345.62

Please make all amounts payable to: The Carlton Law Firm, PLL.C.

Payment is due upon receipt. Please include invoice numbers as an additional reference so we may accurately
dentify and apply your payment Thank you!

Page 4 of 4

Page 33 of 83 DDU16 - 016035



Tue

Law Firm Invoice # 3429
P.L.L.C. Date: 06/15/2017
2705 Bee Cave Road, Suite 200
Austin, Texas 78746
Phone: 512-614-0901
Double Diamond Utilities, Co.
5495 Belt Line Rd.
Suite 200
Dallas, TX 75254
0110 - Double Diamond Utilities, Co. - 2016 Rate Application
Type Date Description Quantity Rate Total
Expense 06/06/2017 Rainmaker - 15,483 digital prints. 1.00 $1449.08 $1,448.08
Time Keeper Quantity Rate Total
Subtotal $1,449.08
Total $1,449.08
Statement of Account
Outstanding Balance New Charges Payments Received Totali Amount Outstanding
( $11,337.46 +  $1,449.08 )-{ $0.00 X

Detailed Statement of Account

Other Invoices

invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received Balance Due
3388 06/06/2017 $11,337.46 $0.00 $11,337.46

Current invoice
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Invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received Balance Due
3429 06/15/2017 $1,449.08 $0.00 $1.449.08
Outstanding Balance $12,786.54
Total Amount Outstanding $12,786.54

Please make all amounts payable to: The Carlton Law Firm, P.L.L.C.

Paymaent is due upon receipt. Please include invoice numbers as an additional reference so we may accurately
identify and apply your payment. Thank you!
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THE

INVOICE

Law FirMm Invoice # 3430
P.L.L.C. Date: 07/06/2017
2705 Bee Cave Road, Suite 200
Austin, Texas 78746
Phone: 512-614-0801
Double Diamond Utilities, Co.
5495 Belt Line Rd.
Suite 200
Dallas, TX 75254
0110 - Double Diamond Utilities, Co. - 2016 Rate Application
Services
Date Attormey Description Quantity  Total
06/01/2C17 ALL Receive and review correspondence from C. Rotromet; draft 0.20 $35.00
response.
06/01/2017 ALL Forward copy of RFI response to C. Rotramel, R. Gracy, J. Joyce 0.10 $17 50
and V. Harkins.
C6/01/2017 JJC Receive and review correspondence from C. Rotramel regarding 040 $140.00
assets; draft response.
06/05/2017 ALL Review production; discussion with J. Carlton regarding same; 1.00  $175.00
arrange copies of same,
06/05/2017 JJC Work regarding discovery production index. 0.30 $105.00
06/06/2017 ALL Receive and review SOAH Order No. 8 Memorializing Prehearing 0.80 $140.00
Conference, Confirming Suspension of Rates, Adopting Procedural
Schedule and Notice of Hearing on the Merits; calendar deadlines;
forward copy of same to C. Rotramel, R. Gracy, J. Joyce and V.
Harkins.
06/06/2017 JJC Work regarding discovery issues and testimeny preparation; 2,10 $735.00
Teleconference with A. Abazari regarding asset issues; Receive
and review correspondence from SOAH regarding procedural
schedule and rate suspension; work regarding interim rate issues;
draft correspondence to J. Joyce and V. Harkins regarding same;
Teleconference with C. Rotramel.
06/0772017 ALL Receive and review WBRG's Motion to Compel; calendar deadline. 0.30 $52.50
06/07/2017 JJC Draft correspondence to J. Freeland regarding motion to compel; 150  $525.00

Receive and review correspondence from J. Freeland regarding
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same; teleconference with J. Freeland regarding same; work
regarding response filing; work regarding expert testimony.

06/08/2017 ALL Draft Motion to Extend Response to WBRG'’s Motion to Compel; 0.80 $140.00
draft vacation letter.

06/08/2017 JJC Work regarding agreement for response to motion to compe; 0.30 $105.00
Receive and review correspondence from C. Rotramel regarding
rate suspension and WBRG web posting.

06/09/2017 ALL Finalize Motion to Extend Response to Motion to Compel; prepare 0.60 $105.00
copies of same; arrange delivery of same to PUC for filing; forward
copy of same to all parties.

06/08/2017 JJC Receive and review correspondence from C. Rotramel; draft 0.80 $280.00
response; Teleconference with R. Gracy regarding status of case;
Receive and review correspondence fram J. Freeland regarding
request for documents; draft response; review Moticn to Compel.

06/12/2017 JIC Raceive and review correspondence from J. Joyce regarding 140  $490.00
response to document request; draft reply; Teleconference with A.
Abazari regarding case issues.

0611272017 JAQ Update pleadings and discovery binders. 0.80 $80.00

06/13/2017 ALL Revise and finalize vacation notice; prepare copies of same; file 0.40 $70.00
with PUC; forward copy to all parties.

06/14/2617 ALL Receive and review correspondence from J. Freeland regarding 110  $192.50
WBRG's Third RF! to DDU, prepare shell response for same; draft
correspondence to R. Gracy, C. Rotramel, J. Joyce and V. Harkins
regarding same; receive and review correspondence from V.
Harkins regarding testimony; review files and draft response.

06/14/2017 JJC Receive and review correspondence from J. Freeland regarding 2.80 $1,015.00
3rd Reguests for information; work regarding responses and
chjections; meeting with J. Joyce regarding testimony preparation;
draft correspondence to R. Gracy and C. Rotramel regarding case
status; work regarding V. Harkins testimony preparation.

06/14/2017 JAQ Continue drafting index with description of the documents 350  $350.00
produced for binders 1 through 11.

06/15/2017 ALL Review files; draft correspondence to J. Joyce. 0.20 $35.00

06/15/2017 JAO Continue drafing index with description of the documents 700  $700.00
produced for binders 1 through 11.

06/15/2017 JJC Work regarding direct testimony preparation and discovery review. 040  $140.00

08/16/2017 JAO Continue drafling index with description of the documents 580  $580.00

produced for binders 1 through 11.
06/16/2017 JJC Teleconference with C. Rotramel regarding discovery responses; 1.10  $385.00
Receive and review correspondence from J. Joyce regarding

spreadsheets; draft correspondence to J. Freeland regarding
same; work regarding review of asset documentation,
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06/16/2017 JSOQ Review asset invoices. 0.30 $45.00
06/19/2017 JSO Review asset invoices. 2.00  $300.00

06/20/2017 ALL Receive and review SOAH Order No. 9 Extending Deadline to 0.60 $105.00
Respond to WBRG's Motion to Compel; receive and review
correspondence from V. Harkins regarding discovery responses;
review production and draft response; teleconference with V.
Harkins regarding same.

0672012017 JAO Continue drafting index with description of the documents 6.80 $68000
produced for binders 1 through 11.

06/21/2017 JJC Receive and review correspandence from V. Harkins regarding 040 $14000
response to 3rd RFI's from White Biuff; work regarding same;
receive protective order certifications from PUC Staff.

06/21/2017 4SO Review asset invoices. 340 $510.00

06/22/2017 JJC Work regarding R. Gracy direct testimeny. 240  $840.00

06/22/2017 ALL Continue drafting index with description of the documents 150  $262.50
produced for binders 12 through 22.

06/22/2017 JAOD Continue drafting index with description of the documents 530  $530.00
preduced for binders 1 through 11.

06/22/2017 JSO Review asset invoices. 120 $180.00

06/23/2017 ALL Continue drafting index with description of the documents 070 $12250

produced for binders 12 through 22.

06/26/2017 ALL Continue drafting index with description of the documents 7.40 $1,295.00
produced for binders 12 through 22.

06/26/2017 JAO Continue drafting index with description of the documents 620  $620.00
produced for binders 1 through 11.

06/27/2017 ALL Continue drafting index with description of the documents 160 $28000
produced for binders 12 through 22; revise prefiled testimony for R.
Gracy; revise Response to WBRG's Second RFI; receive and
review correspondence from C. Rotramel; draft response.

06/27/2617 JAO Continue drafting index with description of the documents 270  $270.00
produced for binders 1 through 11.
06/28/2017 JAO Update pieadings and discovery binders. 0.60 $60.00
06/30/2017 JJC Weork regarding discovery production index; Teleconference with 110  $385.00
C. Rotramel's office; review trending study.
Services Subtotal $13,217.50
Expenses
Type Date Description Quantity Rate Total

Page 30of 5

Page 38 of 83 DDU16 - 016040



Expense 06/09/2017 Corporate Couriers fee. 1.00 $19.80 $18.80

Expense 06/19/2017 (910@S50.10 ) 8.5x11 b&w prints 1.00 $9
Expenses Subtotal
Time Keeper Quantity Rate
John Carlton 15.1 $350.00
Jessica O'Connor 6.9 $150.00
Amy Loera 17.3 $175.00
Jennifer Osbome 38.7 $100.00

Statement of Account

Outstanding Balance
{ $12,786.54 +

Detailed Statement of Account

Other invoices

Invoice Number
3388
3429

Current Invoice

Invoice Number

3430
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New Charges
$13,246.40

Due On
06/06/2017
06/15/2017

Due On
07/06/2017

N

10 $3.10
$28.90

Total

85,285.00
$1.035.00
$3.027.50
$3.870.00

Subtotal $13,2 Q“““*}
Total :@/ ;

Payments Received Total Amount Qutstanding

- $0.00 y=1 $26,032.94 ]

Amount Due Payments Received
$11,337.46 $0.00
$1,445.08 $0.00

Amount Due Payments Received
$13,246 40 $0.00

Outstanding Balance

Total Amount Outstanding

Page4 of 5

Balance Due \/}
$11,337.46
$1,448.08 \ \

Balance Due
$13.246.40
$26,032.94
$26,032.94
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Please make all amounts payable to: The Cariton Law Firm, P.L.L.C.

Payment is due upon receipt. Please include invoice numbers as an additional reference so we may accurately
identify and apply your payment. Thank you!
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INVOICE

Law FiruM invoice # 3501
P.L.L.C. Date: 08/09/2017
2705 Bee Cave Road, Suite 200
Austin, Texas 78746
Phone: 512-614-0801
Double Diamond Utilities, Co.
5495 Belt Line Rd.
Suite 200
Daltas, TX 75254
0110 - Double Diamond Utilities, Co. - 2016 Rate Application
Services
Date Attorney Description Quantity  Total
07/05/2017 ALL Receive and review TCUC's Second RF; calendar response; draft 0.70  $122.50
response to Motion to Compel.
07/08/2017 JJC Work regarding rate base issues; Teleconference with C. Rotramel 220 $770.00
regarding discovery responses; Teleconference with J. Joyce's
office; draft correspondence to J. Joyce; work regarding responses
to WBRG 3rd RFIs; work regarding response to motion to compel,
C7/06/2017 ALL Draft objections to WBRG's Third Request for Information. 080  $140.00
07106/12017  JJC Teleconference with J. Freeland regarding discovery and motion o 280  $980.00
compel; work regarding response to motion to compel; draft
correspondence to J. Freeland regarding same; meeting with J.
Joyce regarding testimony and issues; Teleconference with C.
Rotramel regarding discovery responses; Receive and review
correspondence from C. Rotramel regarding same.
07/07/2017 ALL Finalize Response {o Motion to Compel; prepare copies of same; 070 §$122.50
arrange delivery of same for filing with PUC; forward same to all
parties.
07/07/2017 JJC Receive and review correspondence from J. Joyce regarding 050 $17500
discovery responses; work regarding same.
0771012017 ALL Receive and review correspondence from J. Joyce; work regarding 0.30 $52.50
discovery; draft correspondence fo J. Joyce regarding
spreadsheets.
07/10/2017 JJC Work regarding prefiled direct testimony and exhibits; draft 310 $1,085.00

correspondence to C. Rotramel and R. Gracy regarding same;
work regarding responses to discovery; Receive and review
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correspondence from V. Harkins regarding testimony; draft
response; draft correspondence io J. Joyce regarding testimony

07/11/2017 ALL Review filings on PUC exchange; review discovery procedures and 170  $297.50
filing requirements; work regarding discovery.

07/11/2017  JiC Receive and review correspondence from J. Joyce regarding rate 080  3$210.00
calculations; draft correspondence to R. Gracy regarding same;
Receive and review reply; Teleconference with E. Garcia regarding
case assignment and scheduling.

07/12/2017 ALL Revise and finalize Response to WBRG's Third RFI; prepare 120 $210.00
copies of same; file with PUC; forward copies of same {o all
parties.

07/12/2017  JJC Review and revise discovery respanses to WBRG Third RFls; 490 $1715.00

review documents for production; Teleconference with R. Gracy
regarding status of case; Receive and review correspondence from
V. Harkins regarding testimony; draft response; Receive and
review correspondence from C. Rotramel regarding documents for
production and exhibits for testimony; draft response;
Teleconference with J. Joyce regarding testimony and discovery;
draft correspondence to J. Joyce regarding discovery response
and document production; Receive and review reply.

07/13/2017 ALL Work regarding documents responsive to WBRG's Third RFI; 300 $525.00
forward documents to ail parties,

07i13/2017 JJC Teleconference with J. Joyce regarding testimony; Receive and 140  $490.00
review correspondence from C. Rotramel regarding discovery
responses; draft response; Teleconference with J Freeland
regarding discovery responses and seftlement discussions.

07/14/2017 ALL Finalize correspondence to PUC; arganize production for filing: 400  $700.00
update production index and binder; work regarding Response to
TCUC's Second RFI; draft Exhibit List to Direct Testimony; prepare
initial draft J. Cariton Prefiled Testimony.

07/14/2017 JJC Work regarding The Cliff discovery and responses: draft 080  $280.00
correspondence to J. Smith regarding same.

07/17/2017 ALL Revise Exhibit List; draft correspondence to J. Joyce and V., 400  $700.00
Harkins regarding production index; work regarding prefiled
exhibits.

07/1712017  JJC Work regarding prefiled testimany; draft correspondence to 43¢ $1,505.00

experts; Receive and review replies; draft correspondence to R.
Gracy; work regarding exhibit list.

G7/18/2017 ALL Draft First Supplemental Response to WBRG's Third RFI; bates 3.50 $612.50
label and organize responsive documents; work regarding prefiled
testimony; receive and review Commission Staff's Notice of
Change of Counsel; receive and review Staff's First RF1 to DDU;
draft correspondence to E. Garcia.

0711812017 JJC Work regarding preparation of prefiled testimony and exhibits; 420 $1.470.00
Receive and review correspondence from C. Rotramel; draft
response; Receive and review correspondence from J. Joyce; draft

Page2of 5
Page 42 of 83 DDU16 - 016044



07/18/2017 JSO

07/19/2017 ALL

07/19/2017 JJIC

07i20/2017 ALL

07/20/2017 JJC

072172017 ALL

07/2172017 JJC

07/24/2017 ALL
07124/2017 JJC

07/25/2017 ALL

07/25/2017 JSO
0712512017 JJC
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response; Receive and review correspondence from J. Smith; draft
response; review J. Joyce draft testimony.

Work regarding J. Carlton prefiled testimony.

Revise and finalize First Supplemental Response to WBRG's Third
RF1; prepare documents for confidential filing; prepare copies and
arrange delivery of same to PUC for filing; forward copy to all
parties; work regarding prefiled testimany and exhibits.

Receive and review correspondence from J. Smith regarding
discovery requests; draft response; Draft correspondence to J.
Joyce regarding exhibits for testimony; Teleconference with J.
Joyce regarding same; draft correspondence to T. Grout regarding
draft testimony; receive and review correspondence from C.
Rotramel regarding same; review discovery responses and J.
Joyce work papers to prepare exhibits; Receive and review
correspondence from V. Harkins regarding draft testimony; draft
response; teleconference with £. Garcia regarding scheduling for
hearing: Teleconference with J. Fresland regarding same; draft
revised schedule; Teleconference with R. Gracy's office regarding
same; Receive and review correspondence from R. Gracy
regarding same.

Receive and review correspondence from V. Harkins; draft
response; work regarding TCUC's Second RFI.

Draft Motion tc Modify Procedural Schedule; draft correspondence
to J. Freeland, J. Smith and E. Garcia regarding same; Receive
and review reply from E. Garcia; finalize Motion; Teleconference
with J. Freeland; work regarding prefiled testimony.

Work regarding Response to TCUC's Second RFI; work regarding
Response to Staff's First RF|; work regarding prefiled testimony
and exhibits.

Teleconference with J. Joyce regarding testimony and discovery;
work regarding exhibits for testimony; Receive and review
corraspondence from Staff regarding discovery requests;
Teleconference with J. Joyce regarding same; work regarding
response and objection issues for Staff's First RFls.

Work regarding prefiled testimony.

Work regarding exhibits for prefiled testimony; Teleconference with
J. Joyce regarding same.

Receive and review correspondence from C. Rotramel; draft
response; work regarding prefiled testimony.

Work regarding response tc TCUC's Second RFi.

Review and revise testimony regarding rate case expenses; review
and comment on V. Harkins draft testimony; conference with J.
Joyce regarding exhibits, draft testimony and discovery responses;
Teleconference with J. Freeland regarding settlement discussions
and hearing schedule.
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150  $225.00
360 $630.00

6.30 $2,205.00

070 $122.50
120 $420.00
190 $33250
180  $665.00
170 $297.50
140  $490.00
430 $752.50
090 $135.00
380 $1,365.00
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07/25/2017 JSO Work regarding J Carlion prefiled testimony. 180  $270.00
07/26/2017 ALL Work regarding prefiled testimony. 110 $192.50
07/27/2017 JJC Work regarding exhibits for testimeny: review and revise 380 $1,330.00

responses and document production for The Cliff's second RFls;
Teileconference with £, Garcia regarding Staff's First RFls.

07/27/2017 JSO Response TCUC 2nd Request for information 180  $285.00
07/27/2017 JSO Work regarding Response to TCUC Second RFI. 170 $255.00
07/28/2017 JJC Finalize discovery responses to The Cliffs second RFY; 340 $1,190.00

Teleconference with J. Joyce regarding same; draft
correspondence to C. Rotramel regarding same; Receive and
review reply; Teleconference with R. Gracy and C. Rotramet;
Teleconference with A. Kukreja regarding insurance issues; draft
correspondence o J. Joyce regarding same.

07/28/2017 JAO Finalize package to file DDU Response o Cliffs Second Request 1.70 $85.00
for Information .

07/31:2017 JSO Finalize prefiled testimony for J. Carlton. 120  $180.00
Services Subtotal $23,590.00

Expenses
Type Date Description Quantity Rate Total
Expense 07/14/2017 Corporate Courier fee. 1.00 3$57.20 $57.20
Expense 07/19/2017 Courier fee. 1.00 $17.60 $17.60
Expense 07/20/2017 Courler fee. 1.00 $18.70 $18.70
Expense 08/01/2017 b&w 8.5x11 copies {365 @ $0.10 sach) 100  $39.51 $39.51
Expense (8/04/2017 Copy fees for testimony and exhubits for filing. (8,385 1.00 $936.81 $936.81
b&w @ $0.10 each and 398 color @ $0.69 each)
Expenses Subtotal $1,069.82
Time Keeper Quantity Rate Totat

John Cariton 467 $350.00 $16,345.00
Jessica O*Connor 8.0 $150.00 $1.350.00
Amy Loera 33.2 $175.00 $5.810.00
Jennifer Osborne 17 $50.00 $85.00

Subtotal $24,659.82
Total $24,659.82
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Statement of Account

Outstanding Balance New Charges Payments Received Totat Amount Outstanding
{ $13,245.40 +  $24658.82 )-{ $0.00 y=F . 5. < 43790622 - . |

Detailed Statement of Account

Other Invoices

Invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received Balance Due

3430 07/06/2017 $13,246.40 $0.00 $13,246.40

Current Invoice
fnvoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received Balance Due
3501 08i09/2017 $24,659.82 $0.00 $24,659.82
Outstanding Balance $37,906.22
Total Amount Cutstanding $37,906.22

Please make all amounts payable to The Cariton Law Firm, P.L.L.C.

Payment is due upon receipt. Please inciude invoice numbers as an additional reference so we may accurately
identify and apply your payment. Thank you!
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EXPERGY®

325 N. Saint Paul Street, Suite 2100

Dallas, TX 75201
214 432-2500
Tax ID# 26-3106033

Bill To:

Mr. Randy Gracy

Double Diamond Utilities, Inc.
5495 Belt Line Road, Suite 200
Dallas, TX 75254

Invoice

Date

Invoice #

5/2/12016

DDU-1617

Billing Period: 4/1/2016 - 4/30/20186
Terms Project
Due on Receipt PUCT Rate Applications for The Cliffs and White Biuff
Hours Description Rate Amount
25.0 |Jay Joyce $ 225 5,625
- |Sr. Consuitant 125 -
Write-off {1,500)
Travel Expenses
Transportation 15
Meals -
Lodging -
Cther -
Total Expenses 15
Total 4,140
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Expergy®
Professional Services
April 2016

Jay Joyce

Double Diamond Utilities

Rate Applications for The Cliffs and White Bluff

=
51
[ng
[

4-Apr

19-Apr

20-Apr

21-Apr

23-Apr

27-Apr

28-Apr

29-Apr

TOTAL

1.0

6.0

[
L
<@

Activity

Mg w/ R. Gracy & C. Rotramel at DDU offices to
kickoff project and discuss issues

Reviewing initial data received from DDU

Reviewing initial data received from DDU; work on
competing applications

Research PUCT water and wastewater rate
applications

Compiling list of additional data needed for
applications

Reviewing new data received from DDU; initial
calculations of potential rate increases

Reviewing new data received from DDU; initial
calculations of potential rate increases

Review of prior DDU cases and comparison of
current and prior data
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Invoice

Date invoice #

EXPERGY®

7/11/20186 DDU-1828

325 N. Saint Paul Street, Suite 2100
Dallas, TX 75201
214 432-2500
Tax ID# 26-3106033

Bill To:

Mr. Randy Gracy

Double Diamond Utilities, Inc.
5495 Belt Line Road, Suite 200
Dallas, TX 75254

Billing Period: 5/1/2016 - 6/30/2018

Terms Project
Due on Receipt PUCT Rate Applications for The Cliffs and White Bluff

Hours Description Rate Amount

87.0 |Jay Joyce g 225 1% 19,575
- iSr. Consuitant 125 -

Write-off 3 (14,715)

Trave] Expenses
Transportation $ -
Meals -
Lodging -
Other -

Total Expenses $ -

Total| § 4,860
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Page 1 of 2

Expergy®
Professional Services
May and June 2016

Jay Joyce

Double Diameond Utilities
Rate Applications for The Cliffs and White Bluff

Date Hours Activity

3-May 4.0  Compiling data for applications

4-May 8.5 Compiling data for applications

9-May 1.0 Prep for meeting

10-May 1.5 Meeting w/ R. Gracy & C. Rotamel re: open issues
13-May 8.0 Work on completing applications

14-May 6.0 Work on completing applications

15-May 2.0 Work on completing applications

16-May 4.0  Work on completing applications

17-May 8.0 Work on completing applications
18-May 6.0  Work on completing applications
19-May 7.0 Work on completing applications
28-May 2.0  Work on completing applications
29-May 4.0 Work on completing applications

30-May 6.0 Work on completing applications

31-May 8.0 Work on completing applications; proofreading
applications

{-jun 4.0  Finalizing DDU application and sending to DDU for
final review
21-Jun 4.0 Revising application; prep for meeting
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Expergy®
Professional Services
May and June 2016

Jay Joyce

Double Diamond Utilities
Rate Applications for The Cliffs and White Bluff

Date Hours Activity

22-Junt 3.0 Migat DDUw/ C. Rotramel, M. Barerra, J. Pickens
re; review of White Bluff applications

TOTAL 87.0
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Ms. Christie Rotrame!
February 26. 2014
Page 4

Timing and Fees

We are prepared to commence this assignment upon receipt of a signed engagement letter. After
we conduct the initial research and analysis described above, we will develop a list of
information necessary to conduct the rate analysis and meet with you to discuss issues and gather
dara. Once we receive the initial data, we will follow-up as required with verbal and written
questions to make certain the information is complete and accurate. Assuming that information
is provided to us in a timely manner, we will have the rate applications ready for filing by your
late April/early May target date.

Our fee for performing these services will be based on the time required to complete the
analyses, plus reasonable direct expenses. Such expenses may include travel, data collection
charges, report processing, postage, reproduction and similar expenses directly related to this
project. We understand your desire to control costs and will staff the projects as efficiently as
possible. We estimate that the fees and expenses to prepare the rate applications and supporting
documentation for filing will be §3,000% which is approximately $5 per utility connection (924
water + 809 sewer = 1,733 utility coninections). This amount includes up to five meetings with
you and your representatives to discuss issues, options, findings, and recommendations.
Assuming that this project includes no more meetings than these five, $9,000 may be considered
as a not-to-exceed fee and expense amount for the preparation of the rate applications. However.
if any additional meetings cause the fees and expenses to exceed $9,000, these additional
amounts will be billed at our standard hourly rates plus expenses.

Any and all additional assistance after the filing date of the rate applications {e.g., meeting with
Staff, responding to data requests, revisions 1o rate applications, testimony, hearings assistance,
post-hearings assistance, etc.) will be billed at our standard hourly rates plus expenses.

Invoices will be issued periodically and are due and payable upon receipt. Our standard hourly
billing rates for this engagement are as follows:

Jay Joyce $225 ~ 00

Senior Consultant ~ $125 P 0{ | L/ /40 b 5

* If a price index rate application is used for The Cliffs, the total estimate of fees and expenses is reduced to $6,000.
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Ms. Christie Rotramel
February 26. 2016
Page 5

Acceptance

Should this proposal meet with your approval, we ask that you confiem our agreement by signing
this letter below and retuming a copy to me.

We are pleased to have this opportunity to assist you with this engagement. If you have any
questions, please do not hesitate to contact me at (214) 432-2500.

Sincerely,

TN ™

A < .
—""70 U e A
/

s

N
S 4
K

Jay Joyce
President
Expergy

Double Diamond Ultilities
Acccptance of t ﬁﬁ_sj:rvn.eo as specified:

%“e @,

Date: /5/’ 7/ "/é
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EXPERGY®

325 N. Saint Paul Street, Suite 2100

Dallas, TX 75201
214 432-2500
Tax ID# 26-3106033

Bifl To:

Mr. Randy Gracy

Double Diamond Utilities, inc.
5495 Belt Line Road, Suite 200
Dallas, TX 75254

Invoice

Date

Invoice #

9/1/2016 DDU-1643

Billing Period: 8/1/2016 - 8/31/2016
Terms Project
Due on Receipt PUCT Rate Applications for The Cliffs and White Bluff
Hours Description Rate Amount
5.5 |Jay Joyce $ 22518 1,237
- Sr. Consuitant 125 -
Trave! Expenses
Transportation 3 -
Meals :
Lodging -
Cther -
Total Expenses $ -
Total| $ 1,237
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Expergy®
Professional Services
August 2016

Jay Joyce

Double Diamond Utilities
PUCT Rate Proceedings for The Cliffs and White Bluff

Time;
Date Hours Activity 7
4

%
1
@

Responding to questions from C. Rotramel re: ',
proposed tariffs; researching tariff issues

24-Aug 1.5 Responding to questiond from PUCT Staff re: rate
applications

TOTAL 5.5

Page 1 of 1
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EXPERGY®

325 N. Saint Paul Street, Suite 2100

Dallas, TX 75201
214 432-2500

Tax ID# 26-3106033

Bill To:

Mr. Randy Gracy

Double Diamond Utilities, inc.
5495 Beit Line Road, Suite 200
Dallas, TX 75254

Invoice

Date

Invoice #

11/1/12016

DDU-1658

Billing Period: 107172018 - 10/31/2016
Terms Project
Due on Receipt PUCT Rate Applications for The Cliffs and White Bluff
Hours Description Rate Amount
11.0 jJay Joyce $ 22519% 2,475
- |I8r. Consultant 125 -
Trave enses
Transportation 3 -
Meals ‘
Lodging -
Other ;
Total Expenses $ -
Total| $ 2,475

Page 55 of 83

DDU16 - 016057




Page 56 of 83

Expergy®
Professional Services
October 2016

Jay Joyce

Doubie Diamond Utilities

PUCT Rate Proceedings for The Cliffs and White Bluff

Conv. w/ J. Carlton re: procedural schedule and
potential issues

Reviewing White Bluff discovery requests and
making preliminary responsibility assignments

Reviewing White Bluff discovery requests and
making preliminary vesponsibility assignments

Discovery responses

Discovery responses

Time;
Date flours Activity

18-Oct 1.0
19-Oct 1.0
21-Oct 1.5
27-Oct 4.0
30-Oct 3.5
TOTAL 11.0

Page 1 of |
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Invoice

Y® Date Invoice #
EXPERG 121172016 DDU-1663
325 N. Saint Paul Street, Suite 2100
Dallas, TX 75201
214 432-2500
Tax ID# 26-3106033
Bill To:
Mr. Randy Gracy
Doubie Diamond Utilities, Inc.
5495 Belt Line Road, Suite 200
Dallas, TX 75254
Billing Period: 11/1/2016 - 11/30/2018
Terms Project
Due on Receipt PUCT Rate Applications for The Cliffs and White Bluff
Hours Description Rate Amount
32.5 |Jay Joyce $ 22513 7.312
- |8r. Consultant 125
Travel Expenses
Transportation 3
Meals
Lodging
Qther
Total Expenses $
Total| $ 7,312
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Page { of |

Expergy®
Professional Services
November 2016

Jay Joyce

Double Diamond Utilities
PUCT Rate Proceedings for The Cliffs and White Bluff

Date Hours  Activity

2-Nov 4.5 Responding to White Bluff discovery

7-Nov 1.5 Respanding to White Bluff discovery

8-Nov 3.0 Responding to White Biuff discovery

10-Nov 2.0 Responding to White TCUC discovery

11-Nov 4.0  Discovery responses

16-Nov 1.0 Conv. w/ J. Carlton re: motions

18-Nov 2.0 Revising White Bluff asset schedules

19-Nov 7.0 Revising White Bluf{ asset schedules

20-Nov 6.0 Revising White Bluft asset schedules

21-Nov 1.5 Conv. w/ . Carlton and V. Harkins re: asset listings:

running scenarios for J. Carlton

TOTAL

W
19
W
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Invoice

Y® Date Invoice #
EXPERG 17972017 DDU-1703
325 N. Saint Paul Street, Suite 2100
Dallas, TX 75201
214 432-2500
Tax ID# 26-3106033
Bill To:
Mr. Randy Gracy
Double Diamond Utilities, inc.
5495 Belt Line Road, Suite 200
Dallas, TX 75254
Billing Period: 12/1/20186 - 12/31/2016
Terms Project
Due on Receipt PUCT Rate Applications for The Cliffs and White Biuff
Hours Description Rate Amount
11.5 |Jay Joyce $ 2251 % 2,587
- |Sr. Consultant 125 -
Travel Expenses
Transportation $ -
Meals -
Lodging -
Other -
Total Expenses $ -
Total| $ 2,587
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Expergy®
Professional Services
December 2016

Jay Joyce

Double Diamond Utilities

PUCT Rate Proceedings for The Cliffs and White Bluff

o)
B
.
n

|

7-Dec

12-Dec

13-Dec

16-Dec

{9-Dec

TOTAL

Time:
Hours

2.0

L4
(v

Activity

Revising asset listings

Work on revising asset listings; review of settlement
offer

2 confcalls re: assets w’ DDU and separately w’ J,
Carlton

Analysis of new data from DDU

Analysis of new data from DDU: conf call w' V.
Harkins and J. Carlton re: new data

Page 1 of 1
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EXPERGY®

325 N. Saint Paul Street, Suite 2100
Dallas, TX 75201
214 432-2500
Tax ID# 26-3106033

Bill To:

Mr. Randy Gracy

Double Diamond Utilities, Inc.
5485 Belt Line Road, Suite 200
Dallas. TX 75254

Invoice

Date

invoice #

27812017

DDU-1708

Billing Period: 17112017 - 1/31/2017
Terms Project
Due on Receipt PUCT Rate Applications for The Cliffs and White Biuff
Hours Description Rate Amount
10.0 {Jay Joyce 3 2251 % 2,250
- |Sr. Consultant 125 -
Travel Expenses
Transportation 3 -
Meals -
Lodging -
Other -
Total Expenses $ -
Total| $ 2,250
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®
Expergy
Professional Services
January 2017

Jay Joyce

Double Diamond Utilities

PUCT Rate Proceedings for The Cliffs and White Bluff

Time:

Date Hours

6-Jan 1.5
{8-Jan 1.0
19-Jan 2.5
27-Jan 1.3
30-fan 3.3

TOTAL 10.0

Activity

Confcall w/ §. Carlton & V. Harkins re: asset
supporting data and revisions to applications

Reviewing revised asset data from V. Harkins

Conv. w' V. Harkins re: revised asset data: confcail
w. J. Carlton & V. Harkins re; revised asset data

Review of new asset data and supporting docs; conv,

w/ ). Cariton re: new data

Incorporating revised asset listings and contributed
capital data into revised rate application

Page 1 of |
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EXPERGY®

325 N. Saint Paul Street, Suite 2100
Dallas, TX 75201
214 432-2500
Tax ID# 26-3106033

Bill To:

Mr. Randy Gracy

Double Diamond Utilities, inc.
5485 Belt Line Road, Suite 200
Dallas, TX 75254

Billing Period 2/1/2017 - 2/28/2017

Invoice

Date

Invoice #

3/1/2017

DDU-1711

Terms

Project

Due on Receipt PUCT Rate Applications for The Cliffs and White Bluff

Hours Description

Rate

Amount

61.0 {Jay Joyce
- |Sr. Consultant

Travel Expenses
Transportation
Meals
Lodging
Other

Total Expenses

2251% 13,725
125

Page 63 of 83

Total| $ 13,725
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Page | of 1

Expergy®
Professional Services
February 2017

Jay Joyce

Double Diamond Utilities

PUCT Rate Proceedings for The Cliffs and White Bluff

Date Hours Activity
1-Feb 2.5 Incorporating revised asset listings and contributed
capital data into revised rate application
6-Feb 6.5 Incorporating new asset data into application
7-Feb 1.0 Identifving open issues on trending data
8-Feb 8.0 Incorporating new asset data into application
9-Feb 7.3 Incorporating new asset data into application
10-Feb 4.0 Incorporating new asset data into application
11-Feb 5.5 Incorporating new asset data into application
16-Feb 1.5 Incorporating new asset data into application
22-Feb 9.3 Updating work papers: checking updated schedules
and work papers
23-Feb 7.0 Updaring work papers: organizing work papers
24-Feb 8.0  Preparing narrative on corrections; finalizing errata
fiting
TOTAL ~ 610
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EXPERGY®

325 N. Saint Paul Street, Suite 2100

Dallas, TX 75201
214 432-2500

Tax ID# 26-3106033

Bill To:

Mr. Randy Gracy

Double Diamond Utilities, Inc.
5495 Belt Line Road, Suite 200
Dallas, TX 75254

Invoice

Date

invoice #

4/4/2017

DDU-17186

Billing Period: 3172017 - 313172017
Terms Project
Due on Receipt PUCT Rate Applications for The Cliffs and White Biuff
Hours Description Rate Amount
7.5 1Jay Joyce $ 2251% 1.687
Sr. Consultant 125 -
Travel Expenses
Transportation $ -
Meals -
Lodging -
Other -
Total Expenses $ -
Total| $ 1,687
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Expergy®
Professional Services
March 2017

Jay Joyce

Double Diamond Ultilities
PUCT Rate Proceedings for The Cliffs and White Bluff

Date Hours  Activity

25-Mar 2.5 Prepare additional exhibits for amended filing
30-Mar 5.0  Prepare additional exhibits for amended filing

TOTAL 7.5

Page 1 of |
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EXPERGY®

325 N. Saint Paul Street, Suite 2100

Dailas, TX 75201
214 432-2500

Tax ID# 26-3106033

Bill To:

Mr. Randy Gracy

Double Diamond Utilities, Inc.
5485 Belt Line Road, Suite 200
Dallas, TX 75254

Invoice

Date

Invoice #

5/1/2017

DDU-1721

Billing Period: 4/1/2017 - 4/30/12017
Terms Project
Due on Receipt PUCT Rate Applications for The Cliffs and White Bluff
Hours Description Rate Amount
9.5 |Jay Joyce 3 22519 2,137
- iSr. Consultant 125 -
Travel Expenses
Transportation $ -
Meals -
Lodging -
Qther -
Total Expenses $ -
Total| $ 2,137
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Page 1 of 1

Expergy®
Professional Services
April 2017

Jay Joyce

Double Diamond Utilities
PUCT Rate Proceedings for The Cliffs and White Bluff

Date Hours Activity

7-Apr .5 Confcall w/ 1. Carlton, R. Gracy, C. Rotramel re:
amended filing; prep for conf call

10-Apr 1.0 Follow-up on conf call issues

12-Apr 4.5 Revising amended filing per conf call follow-up and
conversations w/ J. Carlton

26-Apr 2.5  Final review of amended application

TOTAL 9.5
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EXPERGY®

3838 Oak Lawn Avenue, Suite 1000

Dallas, TX 75219
214 432-2500
Tax ID# 26-3106033

Bill To:

Mr. Randy Gracy

Double Diamond Utilities, Inc.
5495 Beit Line Road, Suite 200
Dallas, TX 75254

Invoice

Date

Invoice #

6/7/2017

DDU-1728

Billing Period: 5/1/2017 - 5/31/2017
Terms Project
Due on Receipt PUCT Rate Applications for The Cliffs and White Bluff
Hours Description Rate Amount
5.0 |Jay Joyce 3 22513 1,125
Sr. Consultant 125 -
Travel Expenses
Transportation 3 -
Meals -
Lodging -
Other -
Total Expenses 3 -
Total| $ 1,125
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Expergy®
Professional Services
May 2017

Jay Joyce

Double Diamond Utilities

PUCT Rate Proceedings for The Cliffs and White Bluff

Work on responses to WBRG 2nd Set

Work on respoases to WBRG 2nd Set

Date Hours  Activity
10-May 2.0
18-May 2.0
30-May 1.0 Discovery
TOTAL 3.0

Page | of |
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EXPERGY®

3838 Oak Lawn Avenue, Suite 1000

Dallas, TX 75219
214 432-2500

Tax ID# 26-3106033

Bill To:

Mr. Randy Gracy

Double Diamond Utilities, Inc.
5495 Belt Line Road, Suite 200
Dallas, TX 75254

Invoice

Date Invoice #

9/56/2017 DDU-1738

Billing Period: 8/1/2017 - 8/31/2017
Terms Project
Due on Receipt PUCT Rate Applications for The Cliffs and White Bluff
Hours Description Rate Amount
23.0 JJay Joyce $ 22518 5175
- |Sr. Consultant 125 -
Travel Expenses
Transportation $ -
Meals -
Lodging -
Other -
Total Expenses 3 -
Total| $ 5175

Page 71 of 83

DDU16 - 016073




Page [ of 1

Expergy®
Professional Services
August 2017

Jay Joyce

Double Diamond Utilities
PUCT Rate Proceedings for The Cliffs and White Bluff

Date Hours Activity

P2
2-54)7 4.0 Finalizing testimony exhibits and testimony

3-Sep 7.5 Finalizing testimony; reviewing and revising
testimony of other witnesses; work on responses to
Staff RF1's

4-Sep 2.0 Work on discovery responses for Staff RFT's

7-Sep 3.5 Work on discovery responses for Staff RFI's

9-Sep 2.0 Work on discovery responses for Staff RFI's

10-Sep 3.0 Work on discovery responses for Staff RFI's

15-Sep 1.0 Responding to discovery; conv, w/ J. Carlton re:
same

TOTAL 23.0
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EXPERGY®

3838 Oak Lawn Avenue, Suite 1000

Dallas, TX 75219
214 432-2500
Tax ID# 26-3106033

Bill To:

Mr. Randy Gracy

Double Diamond Utilities, Inc.
5495 Belt Line Road, Suite 200
Dallas, TX 75254

Invoice

Date

invoice #

8/1/2017

DDU-1733

Billing Period: 6112017 - 7/31/2017
Terms Project
Due on Receipt PUCT Rate Applications for The Cliffs and White Bluff
Hours Description Rate Amount
95.0 jJay Joyce $ 225 1% 21,375
- {Sr. Consultant 125 -
Travel Expenses
Transportation $ -
Meals N
Lodging -
Other -
Total Expenses $ -
Total| $ 21,375
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Expergy®
Professional Services
June and July 2017

Jay Joyce

Double Diamond Utilities

PUCT Rate Proceedings for The Cliffs and White Bluff

{4-Jun

27-Jun

28-Jun

H-Jul

7-dul

10-Jul

t1-Jul

12-Jul

13-Jul

14-jul

15-Jut

17-Jul

18-Jul

19-Jul

24-jul

6.0

8.0

7.0

6.0

7.5

7.5

9.0

Activity
Mtg. with J. Carlton to discuss testimony outline

Conv. with R.Gracy & C. Rotramel re: data
requirements

Conv. w/ C. Rotramel re: data; gathering data

Mrtg. with J. Carlton re: discuss discovery and
testimony

Work on discovery responses

Work on testimony & discovery responses
Work on testimony

Waork on discovery responses

Work on testimony

Work on testimony

Work on testimony exhibits

Work on testimony

Work on testimony; conv. w/ J. Carlton re: testimony
issues; compiling documents supporting application

Work on testimony; conv. w/ J. Carlton re: testimony
issues; pulling exhibits for Company witnesses

Work on testimony exhibit list

Page | of 2
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Page 2 of 2

Expergy®
Professional Services
June and July 2017

Jay Joyce

Double Diamond Utilities

PUCT Rate Proceedings for The Cliffs and White Bluff

Mig @ J. Carlton's office re: exhibits for testimony:
discuss testimony issues and testimonies for Company

Work on testimony & discovery responses

Updating testimony draft; preparing does for TCUC
discovery responses

Conv. w/ J. Carlton re: TCUC respanses; final
revisions to second testimony draft; work on
testimony exhibits, work papers, open issues

Time:
Date Hours  Activity
25-Jul 33
witnesses

26-Jul 4.0
27-Jul 6.5
28-Jul 6.0
TOTAL 95.0
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{;N(jﬁ'

“ 1 /", - » - a/ \
i i Harkins Engineering, Inc. :
2 s Date Invoice #
. EwS e rat Vi
3300 Lost QOasis Hollow IRECEIVED 1102017 995
Austin, TX, 78739 ) ; JAN 13 RECD
Phone (512) 784-8511 :
!
Fax (512) 280-1462 By e
Bil To
Mr. John Carlton
On hehalf of Double Diamond Utilitics Com
The Cacdton Law Finm, P.L.L.C,
2703 Bee Cave Road, Suite 200
Austin. Texas 78746
Project
Double Diamond
Service Date Quantity Description Rate Amount
H/12016 1§ lnitial Dat Review 130,00 13000
117402046 1.25 | mitial Duta Review 150.00 187.30
167216 2.5  Awchive files 150,41 37500
11772016 0.3 { Carnent Rute Appl Review 130.00 75.00
1192016 3} Current Rate Appl Review 150.00 430.00
1171372016 3 Decument Review, call Carlton 13000 43000
V11672616 2 31 Document Review, <all Carlton 130,00 375.00
11212016 1} Comt Call Jovee 150.00 1530.00
117292016 J1ODU Assets 15040 430.00
11302016 31DDU Assets 150.00 750.00
12172016 1.5 ] Spreadsheets Cont. Call Carlton 130.00 225.00
12/82016 1.5 | Spreadsheets Cout. Call Carlton 150.00 225.00
1271272616 3.3 { Rate Buse 130.060 375.00
1271372016 1.5 { Rate Base 130.06 225.00
1211672016 2} Rute Base 15600 3106
121922016 31 Asset [nventory 150.00 730.00
121212016 2.5 | Asset Inventory 150.00 375.00
1272272016 2.25 § Asset Inventory 130,00 337.50
1272372016 3 Assct fnventory 130.00 43006
1102017 Administrative Assistance Rate [ase 1,135

<¥ TJI,JD:

Thank you for your business!
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Total

$8.416.35 ]
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Remit ail siectronic payments 10 the foliowing account

C c# "” ”" Bank: Zions Bancoiporation

Account Name: Carcilo Depository
Engingers... Working Wondsrs 'Nith Watec ¥ ABA Numter/ Routing Number i 122105320
Account #: 560013387
Aren: Vitteria Haking Janaary 3, 2047
Harxing £rg'agering, Irc. Promes No: {GOH7A00
3300 Lost Cass Hoflow fewgice No: <Draft>

Austin, TX 78739
Principal In Charge  Scott Hoff
Project Manager Joshua Grimes

Engineerrg ard Admun strative Surpert for Harkps Engireerng, Inc

Profassional Services from Lecemnbar 1, 2016 to December 34, 2016

Professional Personnei
Hours Rate Amount
Decumart Processirg/Clericat

Jones, Loynda 127172016 S5.00 7419 37050
Asmigt aith DCA, spreadsheat codales

Jenss, Layrda 12,2201 4.50 74.10 333.45
Aczist withs DO Whate 8lufl soraacshent

Jones, Laynda 127508015 4.00 74,10 2%6.40
Assist with DO While BIuff sgroocuraet

Jones, Loynda 127643015 300 7410 222.30
Assisg with DO ‘White Bluff soroaceecot

Jornes, Loynda 12/972015 1.50 7410 L1113
Ansist with The UHFs scoountesg spiroadshoents

Jones, Loynda pRZA RSN 31 2.0 74.10 148.20
Aandst withs The Gty sty spraiiobest

lones, Loynda 1272272045 3150 740

Assist wnth DDLU The CHMS spreadhyset for 2009-2015%

REMIT YO: O Box 30835 - Sak Lake Dy, UT B4130-0835 - 1.830 523.5822
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H Harkins Engineering, Inc.

3309 Lost Qasis Follow
Austin. TX 78739
Phone (3123 784-8511
Fax (312)280-14582

Bill To

My doha Carlton

¢ hehady of Datble Diamend Dihities Com
e Calton fa Drm PLL CL

2703 e Cave Road, Sutte B34

Vst Poxas 78740

Invoice

Date

Invoice #

232097

A

RECEIVED

FEB 08 2017

CARLTOM LAY FIRM

Pre.act

Deuble Diamend

Quartity

Description

Rata

Amount

22T Cate Dase Wark

NI Du doe Rors
Taa .

LI H

. TS Qate sk

B Rate Hase

LV e Y B I B S i Y A i ¥

Cnalerer Ry haee s, Sates wsie

seeemier Rate buse tems, Males st

Cion s Revied, P Drocuments o Ams

i Hate use
3 Cond 2t Tand Reseurch
4 LA L adn Eanad Neseurc
- .
T VI Paad Bate Uase
[ 2 3ipal Rue Dase
AT a7 P31 Sl Rate Base
R, 0T 31 Cal lonae
3T Ruste Hase Dau Wark

13050
134y
IRV
:,:" ;f.
Phesd,
P Suets
P,
13
56
{5000
IS ITRRY
156745
153 44)

344280

KIRTAS:
3orp At
LR PR
2%
P12 3u
ol
st
ERTREY;
1St
22300
3T LG
MASREH

75 oM

392 84

Thank you for your business!
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¥ = | Harkins Engineering, Inc.

Invoice

Date invoice #
3300 Lost Oausis Hollow 3402017 104y
Austin, Texas 78739
512-784-8311 Cell RE
512-294-9234 Fax C EJVED
Bill To CARLTCN LAY FIRM
Mr Jobu Carlion
O bebalf of Double Diamond Utilities Com
The Carfton Law Fimm, P.L.L.C.
2703 Bee Cave Road. Suite 200
Austin. Tenas 78740
Project
Double Dramond
Service Date Quantity Description Rate Amount
32047 1 {Cont'Call Jav 136.00 13044
42017 331 Cont' Call DDV prep 13010 7300
207 P 3 Contf Call DDU 30,00 32506
'
- , : Total T A
Thank you for your business! S
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RECEIvgq Invoice
JUN 05 200 Date invoice #

' = § Harkins Engineering, Inc.

- . CA{:: / T ¢ . z
3300 Lost Oasis Hollow SN L AW Fioy 612017 159
Austin. Texas 78739 Y
512-784-8511 Cell
512-290-9234 Fax
Bill To
Mr Joha Carlten
On behall of Double Dizmond Utihities Com
The Cartion Law Firm. P.L.L.C.
2703 Bee Cave Ruwd. Suite 200
Austin, Texus 78746
Project
Double Diamond
Service Date Quantity Description Rate Amount
3152017 2IPUCRET 130.00 3000
hI8Rindl} ind 2 PUC RET {3600 300 4
3220317 0.3 RF1 150 G0 TRAN)

Total s75.00 {¢

Thank you for your business!
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Harkins Engineering, Inc.

3300 Lost Oasis Hollow
Austin. Texas 78739
3{2-784-8511 Cell
312-290-9234 Fax

aif To

Mr. John Carlton

O behalf ot Double Diumond Ctilities Com
The Carlton Loy e, P LL.C.

2703 Bee Cave Road, Suite 20U

Austin, Texas 78746

Invoice

Date

invoice #

6 302017

147}

RECEIVED

JuL

-1 217

-~XLTON LAW FIRM

Project
Double Diamond
Sernce Date Quantity Deseripuen Rate Amount
y 142517 i} 31 RFL dye dihgence L3 0 “3
5 20 2T IFIWHRF {3040 32599
RERTEING S 30 {1 Irended Data 136 o3 13404

Thank you for your business!
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Invoice

* * *
Harkins Engineering, Inc. ,
Date invoice #
3300 Lost Oasis Hollow 30672017 1024
Austin, Texas 78739
312-784-8511 Cell
512-290-9234 Fax
Bl To

Mr. John Carlon

On behaif of Double Diamend Utilities Com

The Carlton Law Firm. P.L.L.C.

2703 Bee Cave Road, Suute 200

Austin, Texas 78746

Project
Double Diamond
Service Date Quantity Description Rate Amount
{22017 21 Rate Buse 136100 300.00
£.5 2017 2 | Rate Base 130.00 300.00
272017 { | Update to Jay. Trended info 130.00 130.00
3232017 0.75 | Discotery responses, review errata 150.00 112.50
2242017 1.25 | Discovery responses. review errata 136.00 187.50
RECEIVED AUG 14 207
Total $1,050.00

Thank you for your business!
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Invoice

Harkins Engineering, Inc
e g g' ,ﬂ' Date Invoice #
3300 Lost Oasis Hollow RECEIVED 822017 1081
Austin, Texas 78739
512-784-8311 Cell AUG - 4 2017
512-290-9234 Fax N
CARLTON LAW FIRM
8ift To
Mr, John Carlton
On behall of Double Dismnond Utifines Com
Ihe Carlton Law Firm, P.LL.C.
2703 Bee Cave Rosd. Suite 208
Austin, Texas 78746
Project
Pouble Diamond
Service Date Quantity Description Rate Amount
74,2017 (.3 PWS Review 13060 73.00
7162017 2 731 TCEQ File Revien 150,00 412,50
7102017 1} Pretile Testimony 1000 15040
7112017 3 { Prefile Testimony 131,00 JSQH)O
7122017 1 { Prefile Testimony 150.00 150,00
713 2017 1.5 | Prefile Testimaony 15600 22300
7:47 2017 1.5 | Exhubuty 15006 22500
717 2017 2| Deant Testimom 150,00 300400
7182017 5§ Draft Testimony 150,01 750 60
7192017 31 Drall Testimony 13000 750 00
7282017 1.5 | Revise testimony 150.00 22500
. Total 3250 1
Thank you for your business! ' r
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