00/
8¥8S00anIWo I,

i mzow §N”’ 2y V&H B &
- MY Araoy,
40 NmOYL




UL
6¥8S00ANIAD.L

ALRNOY NOINZQ +
e mn_gnaozuﬂur Ly Ba.n 5:2!51“”
VW S NO 10} 152y -

WEISTNE DivE” i
PYIRIOINT CRIYZYR GO0 o J.

Y1908y
DIYUSIM A0 NMOL

P %q
AMYGNACS (NSWSSYVE JOVMO 1 b4

PR ——— mm.,w.\ﬁmw.% N, /I.
s W2 " > ,//// y D
gg L 1/ (a)
& s o) | e
Aaln A\ G

b wyoy owmaadnin, %+

N
CEEET T oY Kl
ol = My S NRRNE
i & amn TY o RGN
 zieoer i A1) AHAOUL 40 NMOL, 2.5, A
MIVTHLINOS OO r now e o ,hwx W &
| LE o PP
T 0 LTI - gt
: , N ) ,ﬁ
. ] VENO: £ i
D00 =k FIVOS VR = e e Ble i\ juvounosvameaionons < L E . B e gy suiney B
N 3t 3 Id A ’ e B i3y anoz
a1 B A o




¢0.
0S8S00ANAND.L

W A W2 GO WY

_1
3
4
ol R P
!

Bleln el s ” o > |
: ‘ : N i
é : , : ; )
“ ! .
VEIF-TI-00¢ -1 I ambug swnicsu ) i
' i q ~ am’
LiNOGH L

vuiions z0k TN TRARANGE IR < WIS % 4ol




UL

1S8S00dNAND.L
431em3YSEM Q81 asL 000°0EC'E {T) (pasodoud) pTOE oS ‘spucg anuaray
. 131IEMBIseM aal | asy 00059L°S "~ (Tin) {pesododd) #I0Z Sauds ‘Spuog XeL 1N
Buppungay| {000°506't Vv/N /N (T €T0Z 01198 ‘Spuog Sulpunjal Xel 1n
Joremasem / Jaeml 10006y 1lv/N FVIN {Twd) £TOZ 531195 a30N anuanay
-Je3ep] fooo’001’T | {v/N ] v/N (TN) Z10Z sof1as 'a30N anuanay
duipungor| 1000'SSEZ V/N V/N (TN} ZTOZ s9Lias 'spuog Bupungdy XeL 1N
uoness aai4| 000000 0T0Z/6T/1 000°000°C (TW) 0TOZ sauas ‘spuog xeL 1N
Jazemaisem / ;9iem| |0000EE V/N v/N (T} 6007531185 ‘BiqQ) 1,1PBURD 2aueuis Aiadold Qndl,
L aad| jooo'sry v/N v/N {tW) 200z 2035 ‘BIIq0 |,1orau0) dusul Auadaid qnd
Bujpungan| |866°'vEL'E VN /N (zn)-s00z sa|1es ‘spuog Bulpunyay xeL 1n
Jajemalsep) / Ja1em| 1000042 Y/N y/n (LA 100Z SauBS BqQ 1,39eauc) sdueuly Liiadodd gnd
uawea.dy JUSWaMmas| (000'00Z'T | [£002/ST/S 0000027 (ZIN) €00C 59198 ‘spuog xeL 1N
Buipunyay| |89TBYE’T vIN v/N" {Twi) £00Z So1BS ‘spuog Buipunjay XeL N
a31emalsem / 191em| {000°DTS'E zo0z/se/v D00'0TS'E . {zIN) Z00E Sal4as ‘spuog xelL N
‘D5BUIINd SaPBA} |000°0L V/N /N TE) B66T So1Bs "BI1G0 f,19E1IU0) Ueu|4 Auadold gnd
: ] ) Buipungoy| |zvT’o6K'E v/IN - V/N (TIA) £66T S8LI9S 'SpUng o ABH 1§ XEL 1N QUIOD SS 8 MM
aseyaund Auadoud reuossad| [009°8St V/N Y/N {TINI) 9661 SaM3$ BHQO j10e53u0) adueud Ajradoad qnd
. L Buipunyey| jzzs'svs’y v/N /N — (ZW) $66T. 591135 spuog Sulpunyay xe11n
Bujpunyay| [000'00SE /N Y/N " {TW) £66T SoMaS ‘spuog Buipunjey XeL N
Jp1emalsem /193&M| |000'0SEY 1661/31/6 0DO‘0SEY (T} 1661 soues ‘spuog ARY 1§ XBL N quin) §§ B AMA
_@seynund.Auadold jeuosiady 1000°92T v/IN VIN {TW) 6861 521495 "811q0 },1deauc) 2aueutd Auadoad qng
Jajemalsem / Jalem| 000’089’ 88-21CT _ 000°0£9°E (EN)-886T SoLIBS ‘Spuog Xel M
Premasem /4a1em| 1000028 |1 88-T1-0T 000°028°T ) {2} 8861 Salias ‘'spubg XeL N
duipunjay] looa'szo’s | |W/N . v/N {Tw) £B61 sauag “spucg Bulpunydy XeLn
Ja1emaisem £ saiem] |000°002°E £861/T/€ 000'00Z'€E {EiA) €861 SOLISS ‘SPUDY ASY '3 XEL 1N GUIOD SS 73 MM
J218MBISEN / 1918M] [D00'GE0T 0861/82/v 000'SE0Z (TIN) 086Y saas ‘'spuod AsY 78 XeL 1N QU] SS 18 MM
Jaremaisepn-/ 1a1em| | 000°0€5 TS | l9461/92/T | 600°0€5"T$ _ (TIN} 9Z6T SaLias 'Spusd A3Y '8 XBY 1N QW03 SS 8 MM
asoding plos panoiddy :eq pasciddy Junowy i anssy puog .
] ) junowy | [48ps0 DIOL oL

o . —_—

ST uyleny




o APPENDIX 3a
CONSTRUCTION-CONTRACT CHECKLIST

Disttict:
Bond Issue:
Engineer:
Construction Contract: Job No. Contract No, X Date {of execution) .
For: .
Contractor: Coritract Amounty ___ Prefindnced by:
1. CONSTRUCTION PLANS; 3. CONSTRUCTION PAY ESTIMATES
___Plans (__Sheet) w/ Eogr.Seal __ Date Est.No. AmftoDate Comments
___ Specifications (Add. # __ YSeal __ ‘
___TCEQ Approval
Witeit

= Wastewatet (for tr&atment plant)
—__ Wastewater (for cpllection systém if no City review)

___Cowrity Engin. Approyal (Drainagey
___Flopd Control Distriet Approva] (Drainage)
___ City Approvals (if in City or ETJ)

__ Recorded Plat

__ Other:

i

GRS SY®wauih W -

2, CONTRACT DOCUMENTS
___ Bid Advertisinig Affidavits
___Bid Tabuation
___Engr. Recommendation
___ Exec. Contract w/ Proposal Chg, Ord. TCEQ
___PerformanceBond ____Payment Bond Date Mo, Amount Asroval
___Natiee to Proceed 1
2
3
4
5

COMMENTS & NOTES:

4. CONTRACT COMPLETION DOCUMENTS
__W&S Test Results

___Notice of Final Inspection

___ TCEQ Inspection (Dist. No. __)

___Engy. Certificate of Completion {see App. 3b)
____ Contractor’s Affidavit of Bills Peid
___Letter of Acceptance

46

TCMUDO005852
704



-1V 72

£S8S00ANINDL
00601 93 06 425 96+, $ ) @ouENSS] J0 500 PelEWRSH IR0
T Y . -
00:000°04. 00°000'0} . L . A

00°000°0L 00°000°0} (+eeuibug - volisiddy 530 .L Bupidsid 4o} a84) Hoddy uoesljddy puog
00005 _ 00'005 , o0, Bty uopeoyddy DIOL
00'S.L0'€e 05:ZLy' vl Gunowe 1ed jo Y46z 5) uoiEoddy Blussasolyd J0j 634 DHAOL

000082 00005 ¢ SsjusWBIENS 1e9B40 JO Bunupd pUe Uopeiedaid

007005+ 00'00G" L wognaiisi ojuciosiy / Buisod jetsal
] 181800 (SO) Wawelels BRIYO

00°00% 60006 aa.ensibay Aueby Buiked s e 15414
) YN ‘Auedwio?) )Sny) UCHSIAIMIOA meN JO-jUES Byl - lensifioy Jusby Sukey

0000071 b00o0°LL d88
B sBuney
00 0eZ'8 00'S9L'S 984 |aauag Asusdny
00:059'88 00°52E' V. T UOLOH B 1SMpLE |IBDIN -sesusdxz/ a4 fasunoD puog
"00'05198; - 0Q'sgeRe: ¢ “Suj *sapuRoegIsamyINeS-sasiadxy / 98- AlosiApy [eppueuld
D00'0ET'6% 000'59.L'S% TWS)] B5usaxXg

SION anusasy Spuog xel N

ADNVYNSSI 40 LSOO aaLvViNLLST

¥10Z S3UIS ‘SANOE INNIAIY 000°0£2°6%
¥10Z SIS 'SANOY XV.L QI LINITNN 000°69L°SS
L'ON LORILSIA ALILLN TVCIDINNW N0 AHdOYL

€102/5/6



TGEQ Application Respeises
Trophy Club Mumcfpa! Uty Dietrict Mo §
Prgvided b Soutliwest Secuniies - Fhﬂnﬁd ﬂd;vit’gr to the Digtrict

SECTION & FINANGIAL INFORMATION

84, Growih No Growth

The edoomic fedsibifty of héée bond iséuies is basedd  on no-growth.
The Hghsst projecled-taxabis Yalue'shownn fFie cash flow schechile 1581.047.277.474

8B -Latest Cérifled Asseswad Valiation;
Latest erified Nt Tanable Assessed Valuation as of Sepiemisér 1, 2018 was $1,042.279 474

8C, - Higlorical Tax Dala:

Thefotiowing information’Is as of May $1,.2013.

Tax
2008
2009
2010
2041
12

‘Nei Taxable Debt Service: Mair Firt Profectk
Valuatian Tex Raté Tax Rat TaxRatg
s Wog 8 0444655 & 0014040 & 0116020
1018771,389. 0.058720 0027140 0.16p140
978,500,574 DTBYED 0.008790 £:108250
954,645,475 0.055860 0.009850 0.108250
993,598,863 5018500 0.008890 0.104000

8D - Caish dnd Yivstmel Bajances:
Fung balances ate'ds o May31, 2013, dngudited

Generat Fund $ 3913.446
Dbt Seryice Fund 681:002
Capltai Projects Fund 368,642

8E - Qutsianding indebledness

Estimaiéd Net Taxable Assessed Vakation used for Debt Ratio calulations fs as of Jully 1,2013

(1} - Bond Issues

(v}~ Other Obligaiions

Quistanding Proposed. Combinéd
Debt UL Tex DébL UL Ték Debt UL Tax Debt
Category Lanciog]. Pringival Brncipal
Walet /Wastewater § 4345000 § 5765000 & 9910000
Fire Protection 1,870,000 - 1,870,000
Totdls & 6615000 $ 5765000 $ 11,780,000
Ouistanding P d C
Debt Revenue Debt Revefiize Dibi Revenue Debt,
Cajegory . Eringloal Bringipal EBrincipat
Waler/ Waslewater  § 812000 § 9230000 § 10,042,000
(i}~ Bond_Anticjpation Notes: The Distict has no Bond Arilicipation Notes.
(i) - Commission Rule 283.53,~ Not applicable.
(v) - Tax Anticipation Noles: The District has no Tax Antidpalion Notes,
Principal
Oustainding
. A3 of 9:30-12
Public-Properly Finence Gontractual Qbligations. $ 137,000
Notes Payable for- Equipment 107,873
Notes Payable for Sround Storage 733,000
Contractual Obligations for. Gapita) Projects 445:000°
‘Fotal Other Obligations:  § 1,422,973

$

$

Total
Téx Rafe
0.244615
0205000
0.195000
0:475000
0.183380

1,047 277,474

Ralio
0.85%
0,18%
1.12%

Ratio-
Debtto AV
Niw

Curresit Year
Ambourif
Collagted
§ 2355444
2,084,303
2,039,374
1.708,043
, 600 252

TCMUDO005854

706



~

TGEQ Application Resimnsw
Trophy Club.Munttipal Utlutg District No.1_
Provided by Southwest Securities - Financlaf Advisor to the District

SECTION 8-FINANCIAL INFORMATION - Corifinued,
8F - Financial Peasiblily
i) - Bulld Out Projections:
s the feasibliily of the bond Issues based on growth? ho

(i - Debt-Servica Scheduls:
See.separate Atlachments 8F(il) - Debt Service Schedules

{i) - Revenus Projections:
{a) Does ihe District injend lo use net sévenués from opefations or debt service payimenits?  Yes for Revnue Bonds .
Ses separaie Attachment BF(m){a) - Revenue Projections (Proforma)

(b) Ddes the District intend fo'tise nef revehues received ffom a mufiicipafity through eithér a consent agreament of
siralegjc'partnership. agreement for debt sesvice payments?

{iv) - Opersfing Budget - Ste separate ‘Cosl of Issuanoe: Eslimale for inalusion by enginesr'ih Gpsrating. Budget.

{v) - Projecfed eash-Flow&nal)(s’is' for Proposed and Existing Debt &f District:
Not Applicable

{vi} - No-Growth Cash-Flow Aralysis forPropdsed and Ex;slmg Debt of District:
See separate Allachment BF{vi) - No-Growih Cash-Flow Analysis

{vii)~ Cash Flow Analysis for All Overlapping Taxing Enfifies; Not Applicable
(viii)- Combined Téx Rate: Not Applicable

{ix)- Total Taxable Value of Area q be.taxed:
2013 Certified Net Taxable Valualion: $. 1,047,277.474

1X) - Waiver of special appraisal; Not Applicabla
i) - Overtapping Tax Rates:

. Tax Year 2013
2012 Pigjeclsd
Tax Rate Per Tax Rate Per

Goveramental Eqtit —TexYemt  _$100Vaualion  _$100 Valuation _
Carroll independent School District 2012 1.400000 1.400000
Denton County 2012 0.282500 0.282900
Noithwest Independent School District 2012 1.375000 1.375000
Tarrant County” 2012 0.264000 0.264000
Taman! County College District 2012 0.148000 0.149000
Térrant Gounty Hospital Disfrict 2012 0.227300 0.227900
Towmn of Trophy Clab 2042 0 518500 . 0.518500
Westiake, Town of 2012 0.156800 0.156800

8G - Development Stafus:
Does the District have a developer as defined by Water Code Seclion 48.052{d)?  No

(1) - Status of Construction: - Not Applicable
(i} - Status of Growth Projecled in PreVious Bond Issus: - Not Applicable
8H - Market Informafiofi:

The District did hot do a market study.

TCMUDO005855
707



Attachment 8B

DENTON Caunt 2013 CERTIFIED TOTALS sl Céroton
W03 - TROBHY TLUB MUDNG |
Progrly Coiint: 3,182 ARB Approver Tolals Tigeris 6:26.41AM
Thre - Valus
“Homeste: A 164978583
Nor, Homesges 48,007,160
AgMerRets 0 .
Tiber Markel: 0 Totalland ) 212,965,753
[merovamant Vane |
Homesite: 541,515,976
Hon Horfeske: . 25,153,362  Total Improvements -3 566,667,738
[Werma - - —Viks ]
Farsonal Piophrty: 177 14,667,530
Mineral Property: 118 ‘85,857
Aty 0 O TotalNon Real 10} 14,763,387
Matket Vakiv - 784,416,878
I — Non Exsmpt_
Total Productivily Market:. o e
Ag Use: ’ 0 0 Productivity Loss Iz 0
Tigber Usey 0 0 Appraised Value - 794,416,878,
Productiity Loss: ¢ o
Homsstesd Cap, 4 1,512,355
Assessed Valuw: - 792,904,523
ov1 18 ] 183,000 122,000
pv2 [ 0. 80,000 90,000
oys 8 Y 80,000 80,000
DV4 25 LY 216,000 215,000
olas 4 0 24,000 24,000
DVHS 7 0 1,600,530 1,600,630
OVHSS 2 0 448,545 446,545
EX-XU (Prorafed) 1 [ 454,055 454,055
EX-xY 36 [ 18,083,418 18,083,413
EX3ph 9% . 0 8,223 6,223
AVE5s 572 14,055,714 [ 14,055,714
oOvess 34 800,000 .3 600,000  Total Examptions 4 36.088,560
Net Taxable = 756,915,843

APBROXIMATE TOTAL LEVY = NET TAXABLE * {(TAX RATE/ 100)
1,009,850.18 = 756,315,843 * {0,133300+ 100)

“Tax increment Finance Valuer 0
Tax inérefnent Fingnoe Levy:’ 0.00
W03/653062 Page 836 0f 1126 True Avtomation, Inc.

TCMUD005856
708



Attachment 88

PG TARRANT APPRAISAL DISTRICT

TROPHY CLUB NMUD #1

Valuation Summary

suppleiiiental certified appraisal roll.

2013 Supplemental Cerfified Appraisal Roll

I, Jeff Law, Chief Appralser for the Tamant Appraisal District, to the
best of my ability do solemnly swear that the attached is that portion
of the appraisal roll of the Tarrant Appraisal District which lists

property taxable by the above named entity and constitutes their’

0t SEP 2013

APPRAISED VALUE (Considers Vajua Caps) » « = crvrenaconnuns >$ 303,879,622
Absolute Exemption s 2,658,055
- Cases hefore ARB - ] 6,010.651.
Incompletes $ 30,509
Defarred, Special Use, and Partial Exemptions  § 4,818,878
. See Totals Report for breakdown of each Exemption
NET TAXABLEVALUE - ---i-cnrvmeac nanmen amemunn =>4 280, 361,531
Appraised value minus Absolute Exempﬁon amaunt, minus,ARB amotnt, o
minus [ncompletes; minus Deferred, Speciafl Use and Partial Exemphons
to equal fie NTV.
ESTIMATED NET TAXABLEVALUE -« - v re--c o. sremens -> 8 294,553,622
Inchiding suggested values to be used for pending A.R.B. accounts
{see page two), and incomplete atcounts (see page three).
. Jeff Law, g% lef Appraiser
Page 1 of 3 2500 Handiey-Edervife Road  Fod Warth, Texss 75113 (51}) 240024 LYRZS0L 8:212013
TCMUDO005857

709



Attachment Fii}:
Trophy Club MUD.
85,765,000 Unlimited Tax Bonds, Series 2014

FYE{9/30)  Principal  InterdstRate  Intérest _ Total
W8 § . & 17295000 ¢ 172,95000
2015 155,000.00, 6.00% 341,250.00 496,250,00
2016 165,000.00 6.00% 331,650.00 " 496,650.00
2017 175,000.00 6.:00% 321,450.00 486,450.00
2018 185,000.00 6.00% :310,650,00 495,650:00
2019 195,000.00.  6.00% 299,250.00 494,250,00
2020 205,000.00 6.00% 287,250.00 492,250.00
2021 220,000.00 6.00% 274,500,00 494,500.00
2022 23500000  6.00% 260,850.00 495,850.00
2023 250,000.00 6.00% 246,300.00. 496,300.00
2024 265,000.00 6.00% 230,850.00 495,850.00
2025 280,000.00 6.00% 214,500.00 494;500.00
2026 295,000.00  6.00% 197,250.00 492,250,060
2027 315,000,00 6.00% 178,950.00 493,950.00
2028 335,000.00 6.00% 159,450.00 494,450.00
2029 355,000.00 6.00% 138,750.00 493,750.00
3030 380,000.00  6.00% 116,700,860 296,700.00
2031 400,000.00 6.00% 93,300.00 493,300.00
2032 425,000.00 6.00% 58,550.00 493,550.00
2033 450,000,00 6.00% 47,300.00 492,300.00
2034 480,000.00 6.00% 1%,400,00 494,400.00

$ 5,765,000,00-

$ 4,301,100.00 $ 10,066,100.00

TCMUDO005858
710



——

Attachment. F{ii)
Teaghy Club MUD
49,230,000 Revetiue Bonds, Series 2014

EYE{9/30}) Principal intérest Rate Intérest Tatal
2014 § - $ 27690000 $  276,900.00
3013 245,000.00 6.00% 546,450.00 791,456.00
2016 260,000.00 6.00% 531,300:00 791,300.00
2017 27500000  6.00% 515,250.00 790,25000
2018 295,000.00 6.00% 498,150.00 793,150.00.
2019 315,000,400 6,00% 479,850.00 794,850,00
2620. 330,000.00 6,00% 460,500.00 790,500.00:
2021 355,600.00 6.00% 439,950.00 794,950.00
2022 375,000.00 6.00% 418,050.00 793,050.00

. 2023 400,000.00 6.00% 392,800.00 794,800.00
2024 420,000.00 5.00% 370,200.00- 790,200.00
2025. 450,000.00 6.00% 344,100.00 794,100.00
2026 475,000.00: 6.00% 316,350.00 791,350.00
2027 505,000,00 6.00% 286,950.00° 791,950,00
2028 535,000.00 5.00% 255,750,00. 790,750:Q0
2029 570,000.00 6.00% 227,600.00 792,600.00
7030 605,000.00 6.00% 187,350.00 792,350.00
2031 645,400.00 £.00% 149,850.00 794,850.00
2032 £80,000.00 6.00% 110,100.00 750,100.00
2033 725,000.00 6.00% - 67;950,00 792,950.00
2034 770,000.00 6.00% 23,100.00 793,100.00

$ 9,230,000.00

$ 6,895,500,00 $ 16,125,500,00

TCMUDO005859
711



Attactimient Flin)(al.

Trophy Ghib MUD #1. Cash Flow Proforma and Available Funds for Datit:Service:
$6,230,000 Reverire Bonds, Biries 2014

(NOGROWTH)

Expanses exchude prnciss],iritpres, Sepriciation, sand Capitaf Outlay

FY Year Waler o Avallable for Existing The. Tatal
Ending 8/30 | Conagclions | Révenues Expenses. Deb Service- | DébfService]  Bonds pebtservice | Coverageé.

2091, 3554 37,055,065  $5083531  S$1971534  $240,225 $240;245 831
2012 3,887 97,361,907  $5471568  $199033%:  5700,982 $700,983. bR
2013 38§77 S7.461907  S5474568  $1990339  $387.088 $387,088 514
2014 3887 $7,46L,907  $5471.568  4X9d0339 9530690 27690000  $807,5%0 246
2015, 3887 $7A461,907  $5471568 $1990339 3154200,  791,450.00  $9a5;650 240
2016 3887 87,463,007 $5471568  $1,090,339  $153406  751,30000  $944.706 211
2017 3887  $7.461507  $s4vises $1,990,335 790,25000  $790,250 252
2018 3887  $7,461,907  $5471,568  $1990,339 79315008 $793,150 251
2019 3887 $TA6L907  $5471568 41,990,339 754,850.00  $794,850 250
2020 3887 $7.4big07  Ssavises  $1.990339 79050000  $790,500 252
2021 3867  $7361,507  $5471568  §1.9%0339 79495000  $794,950 2.50
2022 3.88%  $7461907 55471568  $1590339 79305000,  §793,050 251
2023, 3887 $TAELI07  $5,471568 41,990,339 704,80000:  $794,800 256
2024. 3887  $7461,907 $5471568  $1590,339 790,20000  $750,200 252
2025 ‘3887 57461907  $5478%68 $1,990,339 734,10000  $794,200 253
2026 3887  $7.461,907  $5471568  $1990339 79135000  $794,350 252
2027 3887 $7,461907  $5471568 $1,850,339 791,95000  $791,350 251
2028 3,887  $7461507  $5471568  $1,950,339 790,750.00  $790,750 252
2029 3887 57451807  $537156R  $1,990,338 792,60000  $792,600 251
2030 3887  $7,461,907  $5471568  $1,990,339 79235000 792,350 351
2031 3867  37461,907  $3471,568  §1,000339 794,85000  $794,850 250
2032 Fesr  $7.461907 35,474,568  $1,990,339 790,16000  $798,100, 252
2033 3887 57461907  $5471,568  $4,990,339 79295000  $792,950 251
2034 3887  $7.461,907  §$5871,568  $1,990,339 793,10000  $793,100 253
Totals: $1,926,366  $14.539,450  §18,051,865

2011 Revenue and Expenditures from the 2011 Audit
2012 Revenue and Expenditures fronythe 2012 Audit

TCMUDO005860
712



{4

Attachment F{vi)

UM

2013  $993,598,863  $834,033 $834,033 6.0884 834,033 100%
2014 51,047,277,474  $695,226  § 172,550.00 $868,176 0.0873 868,176 100%
2015 $1,047,277,474  $618,508 496,250.00  §1,113,758 0.1120 1,014,758 100%
2016  $1,047,277,474, 5618658 496,650.00  $1,115,308 o121 * 1,915,308 100%
2017 $L047,277,474  $625783  496450.00  $1,122,233 0.1128 1,322,233 100%
2018 51,047,277474  $622,308 49565000  $1,117,958 01124 1,117,958 100%
2019 $1,047277,474  $633,533 49425000  $1,127,783 0.1134 1,120,783 100%
2020  $1,047,277,474  5624,083 49225000  $1,116,333" 01122 1,116,333 100%
2021 $1,047,277474  $628,333 494500.00 31,222,833 0.1128 1,122,833 100%
2022 $1,047277474. $631958  495850.00° $1,127,808 01134 1,127,808 100%
2023 $1,047,277474 5633458  495,300.00-  $1,129,758 0.1136 1,126,758 100%
2024 $1,047,277474  $153,183 49585000  $649,033 0.0652 640,035 100%
2025  $1,047,277.474  $152,683 49480000  $647,183 0.0650 647,183 100%
2026 $1,087,277,474  5148,083 49225000  $640,333 0.0644 640,333 100%
2027 $1,047,277,474 5153388 49395000  $647.3i8 0.0651 647,318 100%
2028  $1,047,277,474  §$153,243 484,450.00  -$647,693 . 0.0651 647,693 100%
2029 $1,047,277474  $152,783.  493,750.00  $646,533 0.0650 646,533 100%
2030 $1,047,277,474 $152,113 496,700.00  $548,813 0.0652 649,813 100%
2031 $1,047,272474  $151,163  493;300.00  '$644,463 0.0648 644,463 100%
2032 $1,047,277,474 493,550.00  $493,550 0.0406 493,550 "100%
2033 $1,047,277,474 492,300.00  $492,300 0.0495 492,300 100%
2034 $1,047,277,474 494,460.00  $494,400 0.0497 493,400 100%
Totals $8,382,491 $10,066,100.
lSeries 2014 Unlimited Tax Bonds have a projected interest rate of 6% .
t
TCMUDO005861

713



TOWN OF TROPHY CLUB, TEXAS
ORDINANCE NO, 2012-28

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF TROPHY CLUB, TEXAS,
REPEALING ARTICLE V)l ENTITLED “INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING
GODE* OF GHAPTER 3§ ENTITLED “BUILDINGS AND
CONSTRUCTION" OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE TOWN
OF TROPHY CLUB, TEXAS AND ADOPTING A NEW ARTICLE ViI
ENTITLED "INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE" OF CHAPTER 3
ENTITLED “BUILDINGS AND CONSTRUCTION" OF THE CODE OF
ORDINANCES OF THE TOWN OF TROPHY CLUB, TEXAS;
PROVIDING FOR THE INCORPORATION OF PREMISES; PROV!UING.
FOR AN AMENDMENT REPEALING THE 2003 INTERNATIONAL
PLUMBING- CODE WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS AND ADOPTING THE
2009 EDITION' OF THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE WITH
LOCAL AMENDMENTS THERETO, A COPY OF WHICH IS ATTACHED
HERETO AS EXHIBIT “A"; PROVIDING A CUMULATIVE REPEALER
CLAUSE; PROVIDING FOR SEVERABILITY; PROVIDING A PENALTY
NOT TO EXCEED THE SUM OF TWO THOUSAND DOLLARS
($2,000.00) FOR EACH OFFENSE AND A SEPARATE OFFENSE
SHALL BE DEEMED COMMITTED EACH DAY DURING OR ON WHICH
A VIOLATION OCCURS OR CONTINUES; PROVIDING FOR
PUBLICATION; PROVIDING FOR ENGROSSMENT AND
ENROLLMENT; AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE,

WHEREAS, the Town Council of the Town of Trophy Club, Texas (the “Town™ is
a home rule municipality empowered to do alf acts and make all regulations which may
be necessary or expedient for the promotion of the public health, safety and general
welfare; and

WHEREAS, the Town adopted the 2003 Edition of the Intemational Plumblig
Code in 2004; and

WHEREAS, the Town of Trophy Club Building Officlal and Community
Development Department have reviewéd the International Plumbing Code, 2009
Edition, (hereinafter “IPC”) and find that it is in the best interest of the Town of Trophy
Club to repsal the 2003 Edifion of the IPC: and all local amendments thereto and to
adopt the 2009 Edition of the International Plumbing Code apd local amendments
thereto as reflected in Exhibit “A” to this Ordinance; and

WHEREAS, the Town Council of the Town of Trophy Club, Texas deems it
necessary and beneficial to repeal the 2003 Edition of the Internatiorial Plumbing Code
and local amendments therets and to adopt the updated 2009 Edition of the
International Plumbing Code and local amendments as specified in this Ordinance fo
saféguard the health, property, safety and general welfare of the citizens of the Town of
Trophy Club by regulating the design, construction, quality of materials, erection,

TCMUD005862

714



——

installation, alieration, repair, location, rélocatiori; reptacement, addition to, use or
maintehance, of plumbing and other piping -systems and inspestion of plumbing
systems.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED: BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE
TOWN OF TROPHY CLUB, TEXAS:
 SECTION 1.
INCORPORATION CLAUSE

That all of the above pnemrses are frue-and correct and are hereby incorporated
ir the body of this Ordinance as if fully set forth herein,

SECTION 2.
AMENDMENTS

2.01. Atticle Vil entitled “international Plumbing Code” of Chapter 3 entitled “Buildings
ard Construction” adopting the 2003 Editioi of the IPC is hereby repealed in its entirety,
and a-new Article VIi entitied “International Plumbing Code” of Chapter 3 entitied
“Buildings and. Construction® contalning the 2009 Edifion of the Intefnational Plumbing
Code and local amendments thereto, is ‘hereby adopted as more fully set forth in
Exhibit “A”, a copy of which is attached Rereto-and incorporated herein,

SECTION 3.
L_IMULATIVE REPEALER ~

That this Ordinance shall be cumulative of all other ordinances ofthe Town and
shall not repeal any of the provisions of such ordinances except in those instances
where provisions of those ordinances are:in direct conflict with the provisions of this
Ordinance; whether such ordinances are codified or.uncodified, and all other provisions
of th& Ordunances of the Town of Trophy Club, codified ‘¢r tincodified, not in confiict with
the provisions. of this Ordinance, shall remain in full force and efféct. Notwithstanding
the foregoing, any complaint; action, cause 6f action o, claim which prior to the effective
date of this Ordinance has been initiated or has arisen under or pursuant to such
repealed Ordinance(s) shall continue to be -governed by the provisions of ' that
Ordinance and for that purpose the Ordinarice shall be deemed to remain and continue
in fuil force and effect,

SECTION 4.
EVEBABIL!TY

If any sectnon, article, paragraph, sentence, clause, phrase. or word in this
Ordinancs, or application tbereof io any person or circumstance, is held invalid or
unconstitutional by a Court of competent jurisdiction, such holding ‘shalt not affect the
validity of the remammg porfiens of the Qrdinance, and the Town Council hereby

declares it would have passed such rema:mng of the Ordinance despite such Invalidity,
which remaining portions shall remain in full force and effect.

ORD 2012-2¢ Page 20f 12

TCMUD005863

715



SECTIONS.
ENGROSSMENT AND ENROLLMENT

The Town Secretary of the Town of Trophy Club s hereby directed 1o engross
and énroll this Grdinance in accordance with the: Town Charter.

SECTION 6.
PENALTY

it shall be- unlawful for any persoh to violate ahy pravision of this Ordinance, and
ary pérson violating ¢or faifing to comply with any provision of this Ordirtance shall be
fined, upon conwiction, not less than One Dolfar ($1.00) nor more than Two Thougand
Doliars ($2,000.00), and-a separate offense shall be_deeriied committed upon each day
during-or on which & violation occurs or continues.

SECTION 7.
PUBLICATION

The Town Secretary. of the Town of Trophy Club is hereby diracted to publish,
the Caption, Penalty and Effective Date of this Ordinance as required by Section 52.011
of the Texas Local Government Code.

SECTION 8.,
EFFECTIVE DATE

This Ordihance shalil take effect on January 1, 2013, in aceordance with law, and
it is s0 ordained.

PASSED AND APPROVED by the Town Council of the Town of Trophy Club,

Texas, this the 10" day of December, 2012,
"Connie White, Mayor

Tawn of Trophy Club, Texas

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM;

ORD:-2012-29 Page 8 of 12

TCMUD005864
716



EXHIBIT A
INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE

Propo:ed Adoption.
Thie: 2002 edition, of the Intefnational Plumbing Coda of the Intemational Code Council,
is herein after amended, is from the effective date: hereof, hereby adopted as the
pluinbing cods. of the Town of Trophy Club. One copy of such Internationa Plumbing
Code i incorporated: herein by reference and.shall have been filed fof permanent
record and inspection in'the office of the clty secretary.

Amendments.
Ametidments 1o the Intemational Plumbing Céde adopted herein are as follows:

(1) (Page XiI, Table of Contents, Chapter 7, Section 714)
Table of contents, Chapter 7, Section 714 is hereby amended as follows
Section 714, Engineéred Drainage Design, Page 67
(2) (Page 1, Section 101.2)
Seéction 101.2 is héreby amended to change warding in exceptions tand 2 as
follows:
101.2 Scope (Paragraph unchanged)
Exceptions:.
1. Detactied one and two family dwellings (unchanged) International
Residential Code as adopted. )
2. Plumbing systems in existing buildings (unchanged) International Existing
Building Code or the provisions for existing buildings in the Interhational
Building Code as adopled.

(3) (Page 1, Section 102.8)

Section 102.8 is hereby amended as follows:

102.8 Reforenced codés and standards. The codes and standards reférenced
irt this code shall be those that are listed in Chapter 13 and such codes, when
specifically adopled, and standards shall be corisidered part of the
requlrements of this ¢ode to the prescribed extent of such reference. Where
the requirements of refererice standards or manufacturer's. installation
instructions do not conform to minimum provisions of this code, the provisions
of the codé shall apply. Whenever amendments have teen adopted fo the
referenced codes and standards, each reference to said code and standard

shall be considered to reference the amendments as well. Any reference to.

NFPA 70 or the ICC Eléclrical Code. shall mean the Electrical Code as
adopted.

(4} (Page 4, Section 106.5.6)
Secfion 106.5.6 is hereby amended as follows:
106.5.6 Rgtenﬂon of construction’ documents., (delete last senténce)

&

ORD 201229 Page 4 of 12

TCMUDO005865

717



e

(55 (Page 5, Sections 106.6.2:and 106.6.3)
Sections 106.6:2 and 106.6.3 are hergby amended as follows:
106,6.2 Fes schedule. The fees for all plumbmg work shall be as adopted by’
resolution of the governing body of the jurisdiction,
106:6.3 Fee Refunds. The code official shall establish a policy- for e
réfunding of fees {Delete balance. of section),

{B) Section 108 is addpted as set forth in the 2000 International. Plumbing Code.

{7) {Page 18, Section 305.6.1)
Section 305.6.1 is lereby amended as follows:
305.6.1 Sewer depth. Building sewers shall bé a minimum of 12 inches
(304mm) below grade,

(8) (Page 18, Section 305.9).
Section 305 9 is hereby amended as follows:
305.9. Protection of Components of plumbing system. Comiponents of &
plumbing system installed within 3 feet dong alleyways, driveways, parking
garages or other locafions in a manner in which they would be exposed to
dariage shall be récessed Into the wall or otherwise protected in an approved
manner.

(9) (Page 20, Settion 310.4)
Section 310.4 is hereby amended as follows:
310.4 Water closef compariment. (delete)

(10) (Page 21, Secfion 312.2)
Seption 312.2 Is hereby amended as follows:
312.2 Drairiage and vent watér test. (Bulk 6f section unchanged)but no section
shall be fested with less than a 4-foot (1220 mm) head of water. (unchariged
textyshall have been submitted to a test of not less than 4-foot (1220 mni)
head of water(Balance of section unchanged)

(11) (Page 22, Section 312.10.1)
Section 312.10.1 is hereby amended as follows:
312.10.1 Inspections. Annual inspections: shall be made of all backfiow
prevention assernbiies and ajr-gaps 1o determine whether they are operable.
In the absence &f local provisions, the owner is responsible fo ensure that
testing is performed.

(12) (Page 22, Section 312. 10.2)
‘Section 31 2.10.2 is hereby amended as follows:
312.10.2 Testing. Reduced pressure prirciple backflow preventer assemblies,
double check valve assemblies, double detector chieck valve assemblies and
pressure vacuum breaker assemblies shall be tested at the time of installation,
immediately aftér repairs or relocation and at least annually. The testing

ORD 2012-28 Page 5 of 12

TCMUDO005866

718



procedure shall be performed in accordance with applicablé local provisions,
In the absence of local provisions, the owner is responsible to ensure: that
testing is. done In accordance with one of the following standards:

(list of standards-unchanged)

(13) (Page 22, Section 314.2.1)
Section 314.2.1 i hereby amended as follows:
31421 Condensate disposal. Condensate from all cooling coils and
evaporators shall be conveyed from the drain pan ocitlet to an approved place
" of disposal.. {text tinchénged}... Condensate shall not discharge in & publicly
exposed area such as inta a street; alley, sidewalk, rooftop or other areas so
as {6 cause a nuisance.

(14) (Page 22, Section 314.2.2)

Section 314.2.2 is hereby amended as follows;

31422 Diain pipe materials and sizes. Componenis of the condensate
disposal system shall be cast iron, galvanized steel, copper, cross-linked
polyethylene, polyethylene, ABS, CPVC: or Schedule 80 PVGC pipe or tubing
when exposed to ultra violet light. All components shall be selected for the
pressure, temperature, and exposuré rating of the installation, (Remamder
unchanged)

(15) (Page 25, Section 4G1.1) .
Section401,1 s hereby amended to add a sentence as follows:
401.1 Scope. The provisions of this Chapter are meant to work in coordination
with the provisions of the Building Code. Should any confiicts arise betwsen
the two chapters, the Code Official shall defermine which provision applies:

(16) (Page 25, Section 403.1) “

Section 403.1 Is hefeby amended as follows:

403.1 Minimum number of fixtures. Plumbing fixtures shall be provnded for the

type of occupancy and in the minimum riumber as follows:

1. Assembly Occupancies: At least one drinking fountain shall be provided at
each floor level in an appraved focation,

Exception: A drinking fountain need notbe provided in a drinkmg or dining
establishment.

2. Groups A, B, F, H, |, M and 8 Occupancies: Buildings or portions thereof
where persons ate employed shall be. provided with at least one water
closet for each sex except as provided for in Section 403.2.

3 srgup E Occupancies: Shall be provided with fixtures as shown in Table

03.1

4, Group R Ooccupancies: Shall be provided with fixtures as shown i in- Table.
403.1.

It is recommended, but nof required, that the minimum number of fixtures

provided also comply with the number shown in Table 403.1. Types of

occupancies not showin in Table 403.1 shall be considered individually by the

ORD 2012-29 Page 6 of 12

TCMUD005867

719



——

Code Officlal. The number of occupants shall be determined by the
intetnational Building Code. Occupancy classification shail be defermined I
accordance with the Infemational Building Code.

(17) (Page 28, Section 403.1.3]
Section 403.1.37s hereby added as follows:
403.1.3 Finish matérial. Finish materials:shall comply with Sectioh 1208 of the
International Building Code.

(18) (Page 29, Section 405.6)
Section 405.6 is hereby amended as follows:
405.8 Plumbing in mental health centers, (delete)

(19) (Page 30; Secfion 409,2)
Section 409.2 is hereby amended as follows:
409.2 Water conhection, The water supply to a commercial dishwashing
machine shall be protected against backfiow by an air gap or backflow
preventer in accordance with Section 608,

(20) (Page-30, Sectiori 410.1)
Section 410.1 is hereby amended as follows:
410.1 Approval. Drinking fountains shall conform to ASME A 112.18.1, ASME
A 112,19.2 or ASME 112.19.9, and water coolers shall conform to AR1 1010.
Drinking fountains and water coolers shall conform to NSF61, Section 9.
Exception: A drinking fountairi heed not be provided in a dnnkjng or dining
establishment,

(21) (Page 30, Section 412.4)

Section 412.4 is hereby amended as follows:

4124 Required location. Floor drains shall be installed in the following areas.

1. In public coin-operated laundries and in the central washing facilities of
mulfiple family dwellings, the rooms containing thé automatic ciothes
washers shall be provided with floor drains located 10 readily drain thé
entire floor aréa,

2. Commercial kifchens. (In lieu of floor drains in commercial kitchens, the
code official may accept floor sinks.)

(22) (Page 28, Section 413,4)
Section 413.4 is hereby amended as follows:
413.4 Water supply required. Ali food waste grinders shall be provided with a
supply of cold water. The water supply shall be protected against backflow by
an air gap or with the installation of a backflow preventer in accordance with
Section 608.

ORD 201229 Page 7 of 12

TCMUDO005868

720



(23) (Page 31,. Section 417.5)
Sectioh 417.6 is hereby amended as follows:
417.5 Shower fisors. or Teceptors, Fldor surfaces shaill be constructed of
impervious, noncorrosive, nanabsorbent and waterproof materials. Thresholds
shall be a minimum of 2 iriches (54rmm) and a maximum of 8 inches {229mm),
measured from top of the drain fo top of thieshold or dam. Thresholds shall be
of sufficient widéh to accommodate a minimum twenty-two (22) inch {55%mm)
door.
Exceplion:  Showers designied fo comply with ICC/ANSEA117,1.

(24) (Page 31, Section 417.5.2)
Secfion 417.5.2 is hereby amended as follows:
417 ,5.2. Shower finihg. Floors under shower compartments, except where
prefabricated recepfors hdve ‘beeri provided, shajl be lined and made water
tight utllizing material complying with Secfions 417.6.2.1 through 417.5:24.
Such liners shall turn up on all sides at least 3 inches (76 mm)- above e
finished. threshold. level and shall extend outward dver the ‘threshold and
fastened to the outside of the threshold jaimb. Liners shall be- recessed and
fastened to an approvéd backing,..{text unchanged}...and Section 417.7.

(26) (Page 32, Section 417.7).
Section 417.7 is heréby added tofead as follows:
417.7 Test for shower recepfors. ShOWer receptors shall be. testéd for water
tightness by fi ling with water to the level of the rough threshold. The'drain

shall be plugged in a manner so that both sides of pans shafl be sub;eded to

= the test at the point where it is clamped to the drain.

(26) (Page 32, Section-419.3)
Section 419.3 is hereby amended as follows. _ '
419.3 Surrounding material. Wall and fioor space to a point 2 feet (610mm).in
front of a urinat lip and 4 feet (1219mm) above the floor at least 2 feet
(610mm) to each side of the. urinal shall be: waterproofed with a smooth,
readily cleanable, hard, nonabsorbent material.

(27) (P4ge 37, Section 502.3)
Section 502.3 is hereby amended as follows: :
502.3 Water heaters instajled in attics(bulk of paragraph unchanged)The clear
access opening dimensions shall be a minimum of 20 inches by 30 inches
(508mm by 762 mm), or larger where such dimensions are not large enough
to alfow removal of the water heater, ’

ORD 2012-29 Page B.of 12.

TCMUD005869

721



{28) (Page 37, Settion 502.6; 502.6.1)
Section 502.8, 5026.1 i hereby added as follows:
502.6 Water heaters above ground or flgor. When the attic, roof, mezzahine or
platform in which: & watef heater is installed is more- than elght {8) fest
{2438mmi) above the ground or ficor level, it shall be made aceessible by a
stairway or pzrmanem ladder fastened to the buxldmg
1

, than ten (10) feet (3048mmj above of floor level and be:
reached by a portable ladder.

502.6, 1lllummat;qn -and convenience ouflet. Whenever the mezzanine or
platform is riot adequately lighted or access fo a receptacle outlet is not
obtainable from the main level, lighting and a receptacle outlet shall be
provided in accordance with Section 502,3.1.

(29) (Page 38, Section 504.6.)

Seption 504 6. is hereby amended as foilows:

504.6 Reqmrements for discharge piping. The discharge piping serving a
pressure relief valve, temperaturé relisf valv or combination thereof shall:

1. Notbe directly connected to the drainage system.

2. Discharge throughi an ajrgap.

3. Not be smaller than the diameter of the outief of the valve.served and shall
discharge full size to the air gap.

4, Serve a single relief device and shall not connéct to piping serving any
other refief device or equipment,

Exception: Multiple relief devices may be installed to a single T & P discharge
piping system when approved by the administrative authority and permitted
by the manufactures installation instructions and installed with triose
instructions.

5. Discharge, to an indirect waste receptor or to the outdoors. Where
discharging fo the outdoors. in areas subject fo freezirig, discharge piping
shall be first piped to.an indirect waste receptor through an air gap located
in a conditioned area.

B. Dascharge In & manner that does not cause personal injury or structural
damage.

7. Discharge to a termination point that is readily observable by the building
dccupants.

8. Not be frapped.

9. Beinstalled 56 as to flow by gravity.

10. Nof terminate less than 6 inches or more than 24 inches (152 mm) above
grade nor more tharn 6 inches above the wasie receplor.

11. Not have athreaded connection at the end of such piping.

12, Not have valves or tee fittings.

13. Be constructed of those miaterials listed in Section 6054 or materials
test%d rated and approved for such use in accordance with ASME

A1124.1.

ORD 2012-29 Page 8'of 12

TCMUDO005870
722



(30} (Page 40, Settion 604.4.1)

Section §04.4.1 is hereby added as follows:

604.4.1 State maximuni flow rate, Where thie State mandated maximum flow
rate is more restrictive than those of this sechon. the State flow rafe shall take.
precedence.

*

(31) (Page 42, Section 605.3 and 605.4)
Section 605.3 and Section 6054 is hereby amended as follows:
805.3 and 605.4 Polybulylene (PB) plastic pipe and tubing is deleted,

(32) (Page 46, Section 606.1)
Sedtion 606,1 is hereby amended as follows:
608.1 Location of full-open valves. (ifems 4 and 5 are deleted)

(33) (Page 46, Section 606.2)
Section 606.2 Is hereby amiendéd as follows:
808.2 item 1; On the fixture supply to each plumbing fixttre. (balance of item 1
deleted)
Exception: Tub and shower vaives.
606.2 ifem-2; On the' water supply pipe to each sillcock when subject to
fréezing.

(34) (Page 48, Section 608.1)
Section 608.1 s hereby amended as follows:
608.1 General. A potable water supply system shall be designed, insfalled and
maintained in such a manner so as to prevent contamination from non-potable
liquids, sofids of gasses being introduced into the potable water supply
through cross-connections or. any other piping connections to the system.
Back fiow preventer applications shall conform to applicable local regulations,
Table 608,1, and as specifically stated in Sections 608:2 through 608.16.9.

{35) {Page 52, Section 608.16.5) .
Section 608.16.5 is hereby amended as foliows:
608.16.5 Connections to Lawn Irrigation Systems. The potable water supply
system to lawn irrigation systems shall be protected against backflow by an
atmospheric-type vacuum breaker, a pressure type vacuum breaker, a doubie-
check assembly or a reduced pressure pﬂnc:ple backfiow preventer{balance of
section unchanged)

(36) (Page 52 Section-608.17)
Section 608.17 is hereby amended as follows:
608.17 Protection of individual water supplies, An individual water supply shall
be located and constructed so as to be safe guarded against contamination in
accordance with applicable local regulations. In the absence’ of other local
regulafions, installation shafl be in accordance with sections 608.17.1 through
608.17.8.

ORD 2012-20 Page10 of 12

TCMUDO005871
723



(37) (Page 65, Section 712.5)
Saction f12 § is hereby added &s follows:
712.5 Dual pump. system. All sumps shall be automatically discharged and,
when i any "sublié- use"” docupancy where the sump serves more than 10
fixture. units, shall be provided with dual pumps or ejectors arranged to
functioh independently in case. of 6verload or mechanical failure. For storm
drainage pumips.atid pumping systérn, see Section 1113

(38) (Page 67, Section 714, 714.1)
Section 714, 714.1 Is hereby amended as follows:
Section 714 Engingered Drainage Dessgn
714.1 Design of drainage system, The sizing design and layout of the drainage
systems-shall be permitted to be designed by approved design methods.

(39) (Page.69, Section 802.1.6)

Section 802.1.6; change fo read as follows:

802.1.6 Domestic dishwashing machines; Domesti¢ dishwashing machines.
shall discharge  indirectly through an air gap or air break into.a standpipe
or waste receptor in accordarnice with Section 802.2, or discharge into a wye-

branch fitting on the talipiece of the kitchen sink or the dishwasher connection
of a food waste grinder, The wasté line of 4 domestic dishwashing machine
discharging into a kitchen sink tailpiece or food waste grinder shaill connect to

a deck-mounted air-gap.

(40) (Page 70, Section 802.4)
Section 8024 is hereby amended 1o add a sentence as follows:
802.4 Standpipes. No standplpe shali be installed befow the ground.

(41) (Page 71, Section 904.1)
Section. 904 1 is hereby amended as follows:
904.1 Roof extension, All open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be
terminated &t least six (8) inches (152mm) above the roof; except that where-a
roof is to be used for any purpése other than weather protection, the vent
ex%ensions shall be run at least 7 feet (2134mmy} above the roof.

(42) (Page 74, Section 912.1)
Section 912.1 is hereby amended as follows:
912,1 Type of fixture. A combination drain and vent system shall not serve
fixtures other than fioor drainis, stand pipes, ihdirect waste receptors.
Combination drain and vent systems shall not receive the discharge of a food
waste grinder or c!inical sink.

(43) (Page 79, Section 1602.10)

Section 1002.10 is hereby amended as follows:
1002.10 Plumbing in mental health centers. (delete)

ORD 2012-28 Page 11 of 12

TCMUDO005872
724



grarn”

(44) {Pag-83, Section 1101.8)
Saction 1101.8 is. hemby amenided as folfows:
1101.8 Cleanouts required. Cleanouts shalf be installed in the buliding storm
drainage system(remalrider 6f secfion unchanged),

(45) (Page 84, Section 1106.1)
Section 1106,1 is hereby dmended as foflows;
1106.1 General, The size of the verfical eonduclors and leaders, buiding
sform drains, building storm sewers, and’ any horizonfal branches of such
drains or-sewers shall be based on six (6) inches per hour rainfall rate.

(46) (Page 91, Section 1107.3)
Sectiori 1107 3 is hefeby amended as follows:
1107.3 Sizing of secondary drains. Secondary (emergency) roof drain systems
shall be sized i accordance with. Section 1106. Scuppers shall be sized to
prevent the depth of ponding water (baldnde of section unchanged),

(47) {Page 95, Sectiort 1 202.1)
Section 1202.1 is hereby amended as follows:
1202.1 Nonflammable medical gases. Exception #2 (delete)

(48} (Page 107, Appendix A through G)
Appendix A through G is hereby amended as follows:
Appendix A through G are for reference only as adopted and amended by
other codes.

ORD 2012-28 Page 120f 12

TCMUDO005873
725



9¢.
PL8SO0ANIND.L

SHAENIONS TYNOISSAA0Nd 40 ALAD0S TYNOLLYN
‘a1 fo uolstejQq BB ¥
HOLOVEL TLYATID NI SESINIONT TYNOISSEIOUd

SUTENIDNE TIALD 40 ALAID0S NVONMIAY
VONIAY 40 SEOLOVEINGD TYHINAD GELVIDOSSY

SHINYINOD DNISTINIONA 0 HONNOD NVOTEINY

gy iy by iy g ool (i 0 P
sasetjiug [apsta)oig 4

10 Ayoioeg ooy Aymoeg seopeivy

v HI‘G‘G Sy § N SO YA
@ By 0 HDV JHIY

Aq Aputof potsyigng pae poussy
pum

A3LLIAWOO SLN3WAJ0G
LOVHINOD INIOT SHIINIBNI

=0UOMd

& pamdard
SADIAYAS TVNOISSAIOUd
Hoa
WAANIONT ANV JANMO NIAMLAE
JNTINITEDY 40 WE0d THORS
. . “suppeinisy e tary Fujffoavor
o i 1R posl! o Jo saauieiewmasy nasd At of pojdepe 9§ DiMoys HAWIKIOR YL “SONESNIOR
30 901 5% 02 1000821 WILA pefainoLsy S SREOYE KR (1% IR wis yepodin sy L.14

oS EF

srlerdt.




LCL
SL8S00ANINDL

PR GRL Y DI FRAIRENY | Wy 10 1RRIN 40010
SIS I 28] s3I R SN WO IB0NRY fo i Eﬂ:ﬂ-u._.z_m

-

"TASN 4q 12000 313 0] 15T} 1 prog
pue suonwziowdio Sunoeaois 1T Moy Aq Aol PRI 1 rrtTdep DL S 30 MBukdod By g,

AEIRERRR
411658 (zaz)
S0E6-10IZ VA ‘umBuiisy “o0v aing ‘plesamog UoSIA 00ET
wuainy Jo 3 [RAUIL PIIRLO0SSY

b gvord
S2LT-8Y5 (0%
8:..3_8 VA W0I1S0Y '2au() 112 Rpuwkaly (081
aUug A1 39 ARI0S tususury

AT RRN
pLvl-Lyve (20D
0002 A “WOTBUISTAL M "N J098 QLT S101
wajedinog) SunsaurBug Jo frounog umouauy

GTRAR
288789 (£0L)
YELT-PIEZE YA “RUPURXA[Y ‘Rang BuTH 07y (
srouBuy etiorssajory o A1ai08 1eUONeN 6007 & Wiusdon

“sapay e 52014196 eub(esajond D dsodind
iy praase o Jo am o A:ea._wm $00¢ “005-T AT ao..cua 155«&2& s0) sosuging pue
RO IS0 ARy O Ulio4 PRPIRS U AQ POARS R 04 (1M 12UISUT PUB SN SITK
wout ap spoafoud 1sontr uo doumodiuy 10 Sanssy IO afues finf S SERIPPE 10 sa0p §f “Aipeidusod poe
adas porguny 4o soaATes foTesagosd 1) Ko 98T 10y PAPILS 5 U0} wONKaKlY FYRLASKGE SILL

WHOS STHD. X0 ASN NO ALON TVIXEIS

IO Ay 1 SBUMY2 v jesrandy Lenir 500-0) Al W pim ‘PAVALDIL] A suotsaead
ARYL eopRIninn QUOLMIO(T 1REU0]) ﬁsn s @ug P Jo (sonted 2002 004:0 () Wermo)
UOGRALISUNT) I} 40 SUCHIPL0) (RIUIL) PIEPUIIS W) Yiisv-3sn 0§ posedard uoaq suy wouradly i,




8¢/
9L8SO00ANND.L

waiey

) A Juzmeaily 30 it g 4051 O0D(F

“parsnips Somydloidde
o {[eys vonrsusdutos (L sif pue sanlas Jo poisod 5o A3 ‘PIINIIpUY SIUDW 10 Joquink
S} EpeSIXY UORONASUOD Zj2(dwioa O3 I3 [WNIOY AY; JT "SYUORE B FUFPI0XD VU UHILISUCD
91216003 0} SIORRIUOS By PUR 30O 10 SUTE A UD PRIORIPUC S§ SIVATS JO tios|duad
xf oy speuiy G SODWMS MEOMSHUM PANjARUMIINLSUDD sapnjm Il e T "D

P Dhits )10 113, 17775 D {] TR gp SN,
b ARy $IjE UF PATpIIop] 40 J00100 ) JU SRVYd NP 9 __xi&
103 SIRINOSEAL D URGLA SINATS 53¢ SI0jdos feys fomdeg g

JDTaURY 75 [(O%E FaRI0Ia

aum agponds Bugmoljay 3 umim
0L PR 0L *T0'L, SdmiBreg

UF QDY 305! s $93%208 11407 20t Aod YRGS JRUA0 RA0QE D) 338 501 03 WONIPPY UT SIS

yepny (s sxudug molosd M by sBusp o asnsonq pammbar 41 20 “pumG & peznopne

JT BRIy W U Yie) 1w oo s paplacad 9q 01 osres Jo ‘aptaoad (s seeuiBug Y

201098 Jo poran g pev wmsaBy-aieg  10°1
smogo) seaNe somuny soouleg puelding

SIS
J09doog *y xepuaddy paysene 3q1 1y paquossp Ajjerul am Ay Sigs 29pim S90S 3, J9emBUY

{30301, HoAwdXT 1LY JEMAIRALE, SWARSTAL

ssmoffo}
52 pOgUIps AfTesost 31 'ied ¥ are iawmaBy ST IAPUN SRS S HTEY 4IPS JO WIOE SR

(etaaugdog, ) ouy “dnosly 20RTvA AL,
e

(R0 PN Snu (rdorengy gni Apdoay,

wamng
Comwa 2anagr,) 30 SRR INTGNITIOY NY §1 STHL
SHOIAYES TYNOISSHA0Ed
oL
WIINIONT (INY FINMO NFAM AL

INANATAOY A0 WHOL LIOHS



ocL

LLSSO0ANINDL

. T
6 A SSG-;:-RV
»y ...ulv!u.:. Wing Lisgg prig DA
Prmoa anjes asoys sy H9jduroo o) s sope o) Ba;o.a aTARglo e 58] SANP OF O
dn aum * e vofrouHad; J0 o1 SAYED S 108 Aoud v 10°s YdwBming sopun Kued Sugrununion). @
“JIUACY UG 0N Tojtam 10 ¥dfaoas s powBug uodn sanaaps oumQ £q SouaaaueJod 7
@stou oy jo s

3o arep oL 2w SAVP 09 ‘B a6ty Sews ot Ut 3ng *0) thn pusika Eﬁeﬁﬁ_évongba
poued amd ay; KA ‘SuNs 3 N0 O) APWBRIP FNMUOD DYDY P DUNS Y] AR

o pandusne Apeefipsp seif Ared yons gy poeponad .?v 0 .~o=w g P K[quntoseas

0 10U IR RITEISGES GINS XD ) 01 PUE J1 1wyt asomoy ‘paptacd ‘ednou

20 1dwoaz Jo sfap pg v avout ou GIpIM AR gons aim oy Apuadinp spaaoosd:pun
I3 OF XYY IBUDISAUS $)E 1IALIOD 0. IMOU (NS 0 112031 J0 £ARD 10AIS UG
“sugBaq sorion yons Anuajeoat Kyned a1 Jf w1y (O YdRIBaIRg 1apun Ui [ermmSqRS

¥ jO jusas § 5% WA 100 e Jeamady sny ‘Bigdao) agr Fuyprespiaon o

) |V glefeny
HApUR 103U A VORSUIILER} ® JO JUARCOOK Td JALMQ) 0F KHIGUIL O 2AWY {jvys saomBaz

‘o000 5,RUTBUTE PUOAIq SUCSEXS 10] SANP (16 LR DIOW JoJ
pakaap am joafasd ot 10J $3iA38 5 29045817 O J1 aoy0l KAy SKep udAss sodn (7

ud ) ¢ s sautrgistiodios &, 0} K S0IATE
E_a.u& 0 _._aauc .ao:.m.ﬂ E.: SPURLOSP PUNLYJL FOOU 5.:5 skep waass vodn (1
et 4 q

UYL 20 STWG ¥ Pt wuond
Q1 unjivy [RHCISQAS ¥ 51 SR0MARE 3¢ Jof reauBug Aed o) amrey Ay Frteoruua)
S Jo ey o ySnony) suns) s, 5By AP i U g opad o} fvd g0
a2 Ay-ainjrey (EnUwISNS §0 162Aa AR W I2n08 wMUA sXep O vodn Lsxd oy g 8

‘a0 {
PO} 0q LeTit ImRBY §1Y3 Jopiem sounendrrad owuos oy nomdpe Yy, Y
uonoupRI,  10°€

PRI 0} Uaty O 1sa] OF IS POIRUY 0 ({TA Sauned

S.«__&uﬁ__uaub:.a._ rudug jsumde swiepd | [T¢ PUB AUB SDATEM JOUM() *$23261D pajwray SO0

Pus ‘sasuadio *ra0A108 J0J INP FUmaue (1w 1y UF pred useq swy SoswBig N woualy fn
Japan spors puadsns S0 01 20N0W USILA YN Lanos BUIAr mmys ‘et sopufiug ‘TonpHE uT
“Aep NI Pies WK (8501 3t ‘mu Aq pontwsad 150301ty o oI UmIXRL 23 J0) tattows 2 24071

JO-97Rt 2 1 PISEAIOUT 9 i soauHuy anp Munoume A uayl Woreut s eaurdog o E&E Y
2P 0F BV S2EEdNS DU S02MANS J0f saaugBity anp jusuied Auw pnu o) spwp fauwg 31 1403
ua%vcmagosua& PUR NP 1T FAOAU] 1S AIUOLL B 10 IMM() D} S30100GL Sy YRS
1310ADL [ i @ aoump 8 gaajoauy avedoud fpeys saouBugy woojesrf v

sampaosd wandog (0T

-~ *



0€L
8L8S00ANNDL

“j10a 1t Jo Suusogsad pus Burgsumy
sopeqguod yons o} sjqwidde suonemBol pue smep yiw Lo o) WLAWD ® JO ANJEY
£ue 20) 20U s WAlorg P 10 KT S0 QEIDE XY Doy W swwexdond pi ot
Lages o 0 Sggaagsgsgsuoéasg
n__w_—_ﬁn..sesosgswé assuodsaz 3q 0 1240 Aporme st Ssurlor [(ris Jou Jom

Kun sado utigae sasy 30 oNUod, 4ooup ‘astadas smn Aue 1 100 [eys weudling

“sprepuns o Jo sxuptjgnd o poe
“siagirdng *samonims ‘openuod A[e1oads o) powr Jou g Fupriout 'S0 &q paysnumg
Lusmonno fo AUsUp0 vonntiof paw sEeRRf udwap wxln Sy Jo g Awa BURINGS
N paw SemgBuy a J0 prpmus SuoBN0K ot 01 300/gng S90S § J00mBie Yl Yomeemos
a_g§8§¢§ah§5§a§_cgdg§ﬁ33xuﬁ§&5
“RU[E00[ GWES OUL Bf PR JUN SWNS JY) 1 SOURBUNIOND Seppuns spun Fsonowsd uomwsajoxd
voalns axjt Yo-sraquiots £q posn AIRIPIG NS PUE 0200 341 2 [1 Kratasy spg) opon JougBugy

q paysiuy 1opriagad ssorasos pamres pus Sugsauire fraolssajosd (e 4 ared Jo PIVPS YL

SUOHDIIDISUSY) JAOHID)
Aured 120 Aue J0 720 34y 0] 106 W, SUBTE) I 5K
JO WoTaG SALN[IXS Uik 31Ge o A0J 2 JHI Vv st oy RLIIpim saniiq)

e S3UNP [Ty "GN 30 At 3o 3350y 20 4] Gams .?ns 10 A2 10 [ERpLatpur Jo B:&..a
SLONAUOIGNS 0)deIILes Am sgcmaebgc%gb%?&&:owaa Spsadiy
alears o} pomarsnod o [reys juomdiBy sy wr Bumpon ‘stmiapio paplaosd Kiseodxo sSOfUn

Phaurso By S LM
Afnqpnodsl o Gup Are moyy soufses 3K SAMEISIP 10 SSDI T Iwawmisse ou MusuuBises
T 0} TUISTOD LA AT 0F Aneuoo 94y 0F PoIRES A|ERILI00ds ssojur) "] Aq pajoLsal 10 pIjapURE
[ Jgeue 10 Bopwiqns eswufisse Auw 3w 1001xs our o) Ka0XD “INI0 G JO SO VINEM
gL nouis Juowroudy spp ui (anp S18000q Axul 40.9np a5 WOF SKPUOU UORMIY JNOIM MG

Fopjous) ssarsay 10 Joptm siyBe Aune sarsuey 10 “@jqns ‘afisse Sy aourdng Jou RUMQ BPION

A BY S S0 SUORITG0 P Suaussare ‘uanca jjv jo wadsar g Kpud
S0 YIS 30 (SuBiSSE PrRs puR) SoanmuasaKdar (vao] Dk ‘HIOTERSIUIUPE ‘IOIIOIXD 'SI0FSI00NS
A & pur Jmxaly 1y o) Aed o 2D 0] punoq Aqary o (ouBug pue UMD JO
Sk A0 ﬁ&u!-.ub poiterad waniv 9 o} pow) J2ommBug pus UM Jo sealruaeaidar

108

e, pus ‘ssopesnsyuy W) pur puneq AqAIaY 2 SGug PO RENO Y

sShmpifiag puy idissy
“UOIBUIILIN JO WP N3 A YINCR] PAmOLY d: QUIERL I8 PLB ) By
S W SOUCHIOIIE UI PAYRILI Jfo PIuKiQBNE S00(N0S [[E JO} yatded TIF -9ARXAX O3 ok

s 0¥

HRUS0 DOMAUY ) PSR OF [iw semBilst ‘¢S .tp&!u.. Japun worwaruLa) Ao JO JUIAG 3 U) D)

“$011} AR9PID 11 speuIaII ORI AjquIossE
0} pue SHsey peafdoaconn puk pinaidiod Jo-snimis oy 01 s satou rmdaxd o ‘5o 0 FIURPD



el
6L8S00ANINDL

P Fo¥ia r‘
P AY IS poag b ety mhAny
N

g ULy M

Lred soyo G 30 sesumigy Jp (spsiRn 2andorpes J0 “bos 1 1056ES D' Ty BV ANOWT
pex vonesuadineg, ‘sSucdsay puowoaaug odmayaidune’) 8 £q pattop sensen Jo SOUTISRE
snoprezey ‘wnajonod sgog ‘Sopssgqse jo somsad o) uONIPUOD (ENAUOIANY SNOPSEZER
¥ 0} pAIPI2 SA0TAIY KWW APNII) 101 $20P SPorDe JO adoos £ asurdiug e oSpaimotnpie soned ayg,

aoies sy saaoni “saaurBiy
£ PaAIIAL LORESIIAIIDS J& IO PRIOY A SO OODOSS O PayHn 3q (WS ISy NG IIpun
£ 08 ANESY (A0 53nIus jeq APy (7} pos eforg g ob paimat Sem Lue o o Wy
Hunmsas 4o yo s sosrep frnuanbesiod 1o SIANPUL ‘[eopious ‘RS 61 UMK 40 10§
ST [¥ pus LB ‘SRnsUon puw ‘siatnred ‘Sramsuy “s1up3y 'sipjoanp S0 SRfoplo S0
ot i “roo e ysutede sarem {[) saugfuy puw saangy ' Aq peumsd xxs SO AP OL,

sanned pungs ug 11 Kire a1eas0 Jou {{BYS HUMQ) 0) STERIY P
1ons (p) puw Laasuidug & Eaia?s “uopaidiios HOIRIIYKAA UL INOLM SIDUIIOP St Jo
CONRAIPOAL 5 ‘asnal *asn fuw wrayy Rupmsar 0’0 100 Buishii ‘say Showoye Rurpnpsur ‘soswradxs
pre ‘s0s50] 'seBumep ‘S 10 Loy NIEBHNSUOS: [k, ‘ssafodd ‘syBe *sxeued ‘sIaquOm
‘SI0jocp ‘S30LI0 81 PR moutiug ssofuineg HIOY pim &y ) TS sunQ(g) numinsued
pus *soafopdus ‘st ‘sianwd "Soquiate .m_sos% wanEa a: 0 10 sonriug o} ansodxa (W]
0 b._snm Inatpu. pUE AL 9105 3 () ¥ o Ik .e%za_:ﬂu&a ogioads ot 207 Ippdordds su

Bug 49 ] ditioo ‘WoleaNsIiIA TIRLM O ‘SISWNI0P ay) JO TOREIFIpOY
£ 20 *53032 10 281 agu Ky @ samfuy 49 UomKdepe:10 YORIPLIAA TRUM ot *asodmd
50-05 210 A 0] 10 “oo{osd 190 A U0 *130fGIg P JO SUDBUIINY U0 SIHIC IO HMAQ Aq
FTRL 1O 33711010 *FmAuy £ porordaid ssojm 10ald2] A U0 st 105 jqwins aq 0y paydsandat sa
popujm You »aa_asuoov Yons .!: sodpajompon sy () isnonupug Smwmofjo ey o walgne

o1 JO Col d 0) Suprrar ol [y 105 jrowded Jpy Jo iseurdur 4q jdtocos
9 _333 oy A 39 S0 pare]as 10 e 300{01] U J0 AUOISTARG Pofosg A U SIUMIOR
S 33N 0} EUI0N PN ¥ JANY WS UMD 85_2_3 57 aafosd ot 100 %0 52? ‘uatmaop
yais wy {3y jo wlu 3y pine yfuddon oy Fupnpouy). frarmp Aniloxd puw diy bl
SUMIRL SOWBGEY PU FOIALE [0 SISy aw 2003 Aq paysiumy 10 pamdad susumoop Iy

“asmaoti0 sarde Sarwad au) ssopun (LOTIPE £00T ‘0040 DODIT) oMo SHRIMT REQUOD
yutof ssaourdiy oqy .3 ca.&a S I3RAUGT UONINNSUOD Al JO. SUORIPUOD [RINIID PISPLVIS,,
{1 20 O} AW Jop I Eu.énst_ﬁ_&—-gwnﬁ y

“sonuBug q SpRUT SS0UL UV 10710 10EIL0Y UOIONTSUDS A JO HORESLING 10 .anﬁaa—:_
‘uoywondde e 10 'S mbar won ay Supnda spuu wosdp Auw
Jof 10 'Itd BOY Ak Fupmopod 1o Faqs(eny IR0 J0 Hifs 1foad s v (seefordum
1m0 §;mourug o) sucsiod. oyto Aue jo 20 seatojdua Jo sjuzle sy jo Luw jo 1o ayddus
10 J0pRIOqNs “I0IRINCS Aite JO SUDISSRUO 1O SIOX Sy Jof ofqisuddsar og you feyy Houdug

e ‘SI502 UOJ Suipredas 1157 J0 do 5.2 g pue 51300
40 SPIG UOLANISUOD (FAIOR UMM SUOMBLIUA f0f aqueuodsa tou St bu:.»:w Eﬁ!..ou yoans pue
G qRENB0D Y] Yl soump Ul 3104t 31} tiuopad poR ALY of ity 3 0jowndos
Aue sof AppQISUOdsas SHaRSEE 100 Sosmnes Aire Jo somvaziopad sy Seommend oy saoupfoy

“poyeaoy

n_xa-o&aasoaaﬁ=o§5a825u23cauqe_=3v§?cw3£ﬁ womXAy SHY,



cel
088S00ANNDL

“popad
Fuyiiq otp Begmp poroiduios Kjjsapoe s20pAlak (wot a1 Jo sBaaaiad s Jo apnmss sxeuffug
o oy 29 (11 S0kt S toourRiesy 10 AHRWOUE PRI uinrue noustuadicg o Jo nopsod sl g

0s6or § TVLOLENS
e $ SVALS TORHEO) 0L
omsT § Sonmg Mo 0j0]
000'e6Z SNATIG ST LOPRALISHO UORONISUGD  »
0056 S SWIARS S0t TOREISTIIPY GoRonnsa)  »
o0'el S SOOIANG 9bwyg BUIpRIE o
ORI ST TO0)
000¥56 $ vioians
[T seolseg LGS VOVOSARUIOE
o'y ¢ SRS WS jemoans o
00zl § e i i
000'sse $ 00ja108 WEA[ SHEOBLIAMD ¢
EOEERE FG TR
aDO'sSt § violans
[} T4 SARG Bupzon G OINI0GD ¢
o00'st $ sodiassg unso)) pafory putiorssajord e
0000} § g Fukaams sxdndiodoy, »
000'0c UONEICJOTIBRIPY AL SoMSARS  »
000’56 § uliso opmuayag pire i A .
ssaofjo) su soauBusy Aud [eys UM 10T Y 4 Uty 398 sompaoosd o Butspy v
wit duaj—peauod fo sisog DL
"JORIIMASUL URIPAN
PONKIRG AND ¥ LG pooUNY a0 Pogipous .Bausxéaw e%cas-.sb.ahuﬁ_sg«. I
STpopin: e o _auefuaa a. 7 pue ss..n.so G Jusuionsde
MU AR SANNSUOD ¢ I diéey Assaidxa. 4 3 D mewedy Sl Y

housaBy pial 109

“Anf Yo e 1501 26100%0 Avursanied AU} MR IPISIOONEUM 5] TORWPSW J] *POIRIPI 3q {{eNYE
odSim oy oy ‘SIndep Sip. UEAOESI U1 [SE00SUN S suotoRo g1 "ndsip Jo S0pou soye
ep 0F 041 Saunp Qi Pood uy wo KRG ISP Yy S1eRoB GLaake ouBug e MO [

suopepifiay prwexry ajgvondkle v, ooumaduon Ting e st 1S g WD syt {Z) e
fuofpuory NEFIVAIAUE SIOMIEZAEE St SA0UR 30 ‘SiRLpotar ‘augs readondds sv ‘poe LUy
0} MORRINI0D JO FUEYRSUOD Jssioads spetfordde sumas (1) 0UME [Hum Aqasy paidype 199f01d
% g uoiisod s Yo ¥orAls Jo cateuueszed puadms ‘sifewep U0 Aon S0 jepanbasiioo 10§
Aramy mogim prarusiycdo syt e <Kews soourfng ‘wonipuon | fau] opsEsey) 8




L

188S00ANIADL

mrpes 0. o g Huu_.:“ m“_%a
0L X1, Swied Z029LXL, SHonEsy
e SHNG PRI SNy AN CZ8T
TT R Y TN TRV
ORI 9TV 9L,
woojou uark Joj ssappy ﬁo_a.: Fuaif Jop ssoppy
R — ) g .
verd aqumy
RG] S 1o a50s0rY Lesutdug
ipouds ovqy spoudys e
T SRR TR P, T ey SO L,
&g g
HFANIONT AINMO

. [ o o paymofpul s1 (1
3030 SATOYYT 9 “UAitanBy S PAoIXD ey oI Sonaed s IOTUHA SSINLIA NI

S0y &noy pepmag spoutligt ~ ¢ xipueddyy
+ 2PN SagmmY, Kofosg -7 KiPusddy
S99gAt0G 10005 5 Paudug— | xipuadily

eaapeoddysuounpogy

Aoy prepumy sy Kue g1 ‘o Sawmsuos 1, oWy pue sosuadxs aqusingusras sd
ss5w Bypq ojeardde (e Jof sayRa Kjmal prvpume soun sodorduty 5, syt Jo s Eed 9
3forg a3 o1 paBmr Sndl aA NG oy} 0 b2 mone vy sasumBuy fed e SSumg yaforg
& uo Ajdonp padelius Feadodins s wamBug Jo soons uuOmpRe 04 ISR 10UONIDY

0006z § IVIOLENS
BO0TT S Budeospire - Bisaq fony o 1 e

-

00061 Ppouny Aupnng Suy

v ~Bmg Moy o

o *smojof se soourBuy Aed rugs saung 1z yleSewg urusop
s Samproond o Basn pur soiAIse ST1SIp SVUSIERATIDIE J0g SSITMLS NI FAUIEDY

Wi

0L

WL



yeL
88S00dNND.L

(k] e

§i§$§iggisii 4 208 BDV3 AN
HAPIRG gem Anes pavpRRSf paiddy

Tetesg L TX,0 T g ponesad 3q fiwa
swsLandop USisep [eadooos AL, L) 03 uBISap fanKisouqd pus saatpy tiossd
S1oumQ) P Supoau i seoursiey Qﬁaﬂ.ggm.ﬁﬁg

555855138389&.85@5?3@5;83&&&«853
d oy 303 (e §_§: P j __._53 -

gi.av__?hnﬁmem S o BT oy,
“poaford p At i wBisap
oY dofead v.s%ﬁ avos .Eéﬁa o} o_m&g Egﬁ Amuqed o
WOQ) HORSULION; 31 ST M JRUIBUEY gﬂgﬂqﬂn&dﬁﬂg
SR ) WO PAIRARS 9q T8O (N £1) deux wtiesis) (B (p

¥ 1343 yone orEonae piw £doo P UHIROY H (el Tonvaugiuy Sams papiads]
Jorvmog “oswid st Sutmp susnaoxing posodosd gy a0 mourdg £q papiaaid
P agsifqEIe.9q (RS [RRU0D [SIROA PUR [ERWZIIOH "STONMIOP (TOPNNSI0D
pim uBjeop andord o) ATessaools UOFELLLIJUL PoNSY JtR0 P ‘ST pure SaUY
Mol snawpdy semnd ‘Symap pun suopsso] amonns “AydeBodoy oy yoafoud

Semojay atp op Anaans i ¢ opraoed [t mausBug RIAN IANST SNRIIGA0L
..55.528

308 Jo 30 pros uonwoo] dap wzis Jupxpes o wo
S§~3§u§5§6§u§5§32§3§§
JO 940] 7B ¥-pinold Jjm M SIGL YPOYIRUL FAISAULNOR JO/E AL
Buise souzy Agnn-potmg Ko DeIxs 3o UCHEO] PRI JO/pUR EIOZHOY Y
bsg%. 63 swoyerodo pyey Lnpmos s RUBuy
“uBissp yefosd pasodod: oﬂs _ﬁwasza it suonesado
pue. smomSKl £oy U0 UODWINIUE DQOIT UG 01 (SRR
PO MUONPPe Fmpico s ffom st ‘uoptunojn wousdpba pus  sposas
Rugtest ‘erop [rEopppe pydumg i 0o0i3ug TOITTIEY WY PUF SSURTRIROSSY
“sonwst aford Sujiraoiico
B0 o wiyg indu). und puw waford sy Jo -ampayss .ﬁ-p.&.e.a&eum

Ly

a9V

Y

TV

1oflnd 31 A9LAD1 0} M0 IR TooK (i sauiBiy MURSTIOWTA B0 TV
WIAIY ANty VIR,

ARG 3sEJ Aivupuioag

T
peiRp SRS reunissojold 20} Acedug
P 20uMD RaMg Womzally 30 dmog
oS 1 10 1l PUB U 0} PALJSS 'IIARE
Jo adoog saedmBng ‘1 xjproddy sty

JALLINWOO SINFWNIOQ
LOVEINOD ANIOr SHIINIDNG

=00J0[d




174

£88S00dNIND.L

$39) vy (6 Mib) Lisgg WIET DA

(%¢6) uBtsaq pemg0ag 2

(%59} oSt gl 9

(%45 €) uBisa] Avupusig ¢

“FOIII

wafoxd SUMONIO)] a1 K0} STENILKINS JIIMILP UKD Jo (943 simudosdde
ayy aredfard poe seotasoe udisop Aoy oradwos i zoouruy 1

é-o

‘sicioenuos ‘samng Seypnidug 20foid S g paatoau sored Sy &g spranmoop
pe sfuweip Siqenidde oy sssoop Sumpiacad 105 uuoperd uopwondde qom
$153foud o858 uORONY 01 170 JANeyS YosolanALFANG ([ Reuriuy FHTIS IR

“PAOGH POQUIRID WIBKS HEW 9N} T PITIIIOSSS SIOATE
[ruomsagord Fugonioy o oy [ efiud Y TSN Tuounwos, dopee
B9 Olft OF PAIJan L Birjaq ITVG) PUS SLETE] ARATIUDI MOM U] pR{TEIST! Futaq Supmn
UGN D DIA ‘SUTET] TUUNEAS) WEA MO XI5 opnfont A[riausB [jim sjuoiaaqudury
oL ‘QON 8'p jo Apwdes 1md onnespAy oz yead spracad pow xoyr Aep
“8amat (GDI) Aep 2d suorned voyw p7 Apotmumvarddy o Ayaedes ayIIPAY
s.umid ap sacmhug o), Jopio W ABo[oun (YEW) LowEar [E1B0101q STRQUIDI

134

Td

Sazion poford Sy o3 suakoaordan vBsp [ Ruduy ﬁg rd
sungongd alpsy guseL

S301ANIS oSy udsaq

A0S [WiBotaaryzm pire ‘Somronis sueisn] ‘sawads panSurpus

Jojpiy praspearqy Rupniout ‘siputiad 10.SUNUSSISSE VITALOLATY
‘swawnaop J0 suonwofdde st xrauflug 3o sdeopy Lusy g P
“otwton) Siupwitad sxsd] 16 fuotsiacs duw VAR 2

“shaatng 5d4 o) Au L0 SUONVIEISP SPUIOG-PUR
~syoour A onsinbow jususessa ‘sauupunoq Auoded o poywps Sirfoaing g

o "sHurnalf so/pene Supsom afiqud ‘sBagvey vatsss ‘vegreotiddy ymired
JHIANISEAL oaBE:QuﬁanazoE :s:& SO, v soump S Bukypors so
303 ss900ud uoie =Eu& DADL, W DM PARIOOSTE SI9JAIBS ®
{saswd [1) PIPAPUT TOR SIS

“oaford o 1o Fmdteuy sow Amoas L1 SE SISO LORNUITND
Tofoud U SUIPYES 10 {949 SR B Y T SUp FpraaKl ©f 51 $HYALS
g 3o asadind PRI, SAIIoN) wengean Jnemdisexn 103 Anopdinod Jo spAl(
Seproats quen s10foad voydRNsUED Jo sedk Jepure Jo Bunson s ut o Snem¥an
O PEINCHGNS ¢ A [Im SeuBuzy ST

“ousdo 3558,_3
pan KxojenEa) o1 £q suowasnbas MIA! HUIINZOP YOIONNSTOD 3o Suipumssaptm

1.

BU5q ¢ und a1 sopio up [oas] uopddwoo w0} de o ¢ udjsop
ALMM Poodold D1y A0 DL, A LM \ ootr i omBey FEHRTIIL

ol'vy

v

Y



1592
P88S00AINDL

&3 oLy

P gt .uﬁ_u g
hoid Sty 1o winy oS 6154001
s tawg ot paApe ) FPIRIY

“S£9p MPI3[ea ¥ MO[) potstt #hogg

Fuwo{iop a1 &l auaj Bnaosb:ﬂo?a_ugnasaﬁﬁ
ooy o ‘SUORON To/pIE Al p Kyred-patyp ‘smopant &

AqBusy sv st gite o) onp [oaon iy puokoq I bl IMPOYOS angeoy

o1y oy afep. 05 yaqIsundeas oq Jou fegs Soouidy “aoduyd oG) 4q papiaosd o

) $30]A72 $9pRIOBL POW Ya{Dug 41 10 ANpIOF ApesurKaide ey poyoNE A,

appagrs efug wonal Y

WP 193101 SATNIIBY,

T

PAIBP S9OIAMS Pruofssaold dog Raatifug
PHY UM Ua19q TR Y Y0 uneg
yoggap Jo yrind put s o) pasiags ‘ompapy
paforg sy g xpusddy st sy,



00T T
AN
bt w7
bl [T
Lok i
oy [Tr
des: verst]
an-g)
dasgrf oS
gl “Srera]
49513 Sl
vy el
Ty 2]
w1y B o0
vy DN
Ny ASH-T2]
P2 NS
b aon
Y N
uATOE| o8
unf-£2] 505X
any-stl 2O
1Y) PO-g
Nz das¢7]
fagryg o513
Aepust] 025y
o] Frow
A5 nyre|
v Tor-i .
1y Yoy-L1]
L s
#weg] Toyg]
anetE 1T T
§ Sy o]
3 -y I
5 3\{ - AWN-OT} i
328 J [T
%  — : s
4 w4y [T
%% w20t v
i' Ga41) =
= utpy fawy
uRioY Ay
i [TEy:
V1-0a) prome
59G-08 e
A0y e
3008, s
had| B
Xy e :
»os2] e t
tonat) AT
AoN-T1] o
sona] promes
row P
rory wist
BOY ord
b (2
e Litj93
A s
dosax i
d35-6) iy
G5 pres:
Soy-57] n T
Ve, . B
Iny7y) Fe
i -]
M5 prove
[ pr
B B I «l 12
! g
Bl o
=.§§§§ 1§ VR e
g 55‘§'§*g§§..§ ?Eig,g g,%lg 3
. 89 | s\EE “BIEE sl

TCMUDO005885
737



8¢.
988S00dNINDL

01404

whaide

D0IA
INGOS R _.cliu..m PRE 2RO NG IRRDY J9 BN h-..zﬁwu b inls ]

AP Mg el panpuriy ) mpoRily

orass

00088
00’00k
005528
00'GELS
ooz
00'9LE

00sos
DooLis
008
ool
00088
2008
Quress
0058
0'oLs
002es
00’598
avss
00°s0i8

UNOHALVY-

NS0 WD KUD S URIN 081,
TS MRID K0 S U BUO
AR AN SWAVIEN 0L
uBIGORL AU uei BUO
JOHRRUM $ AWM $IO /M0
2950 VSN 004
MU BONLL,
MR U OML
S VP WO

Sdosman -
qRuios el £ MGG 16
URPRIPR), Aaing uaueg
uBIL
voddng argeamswpy
URUEURIO QYO PY
Urdgey Qv Ut
Jonendo Qv } wubiseg
uBidluYeL §19
uronoe) fenng
1BUUOSIR LoneARSIT) Mold
{RUUCSIS UOIRASST) PIL]
ety oslorg

AHODFAVD VLS



O B8500aNINDL

ﬁgﬁvi-ﬂaﬁnse..
11y} smpdoalde 3o vopersdast vy xy penioAy tioadks Kosjaps Teiotewy 903 [I9
Wrow s DUA HASWONP PUOS JO CIRA 97T) Wion NOSTXTE IAMIIING ({1 44, XL 8 asx.._
95 P10 00 413 ‘splioq 10 30 KRt ang Suiaite wojngds Um ek 1 Mg e
g%%gi..&é..isétl!zi g ‘paiintien 71 "00i04e puog oYL
wiineq ol [[1 # TAR0310 ey
!_IEE_!_..!I.!.E: s-.:a gsgiiiﬁg ”m *

19p1ska 0110 £T8A{[38 PUB 0¥ DOMTRNINL SN (DL pOIICONS
a1l 91 1IIE DG PA2IPURE MOLAINE A3 $PJG EATHINIKI SoqyBisio U v ISP 11k WL 1

VI MRS TORDRTYT® é%gngeg
gglﬁuﬁ.ﬁ!giﬁéésxgdﬁn o 1

,,,,,

B ..s_%?u:.é:___!:i.éiu.s.iﬁif

AV ymoxo CIV] 5 G APk st “unieesh w] SN e Jo

£ 0.4 QYo STRMIEAS ¢ o $TEssks 1 ) ...33__.5933525::.5
Lereminida d 3y groe semod Jupe) 54 ‘popenes

PORATE. O 70 O DI I 30K JO STGATN K0P 41 10 TR B SN [ 0K %

{180 ¥} 59 Sprg

%ggaﬁéiségggagagg
A(ADY NERTL AN IRIP00) IO P A4S [WioEIwOI0NE N0 MTJO W .log._...a- z

!.--»‘-l.’n dgoeder

Y Iejoutaing §

O BRI 1 KD ok oot SO A oa) bk SOHOMRINOS VT

Y 10 ewurua W) SpaCS [Ea W) 0 W o SHATY ) 0 NN 0
aeln g P
79291 MXBL, D A4EN),

sl (KOIUNK 001

19N 33900 A iy anis Ondosr.
ORI SR ANSE $13J0 SRS

PR PP SRRSO ST

£102 ‘st ey e

IHVUENOD XAOSIAQY TYIDNYNIL

“oron moft g fugpmmel

TR



ov.
88800 NADL

@ PGP 0 Awapep 1L Aissasemmury wiqeind pus acp
SIS ([0 985 MRS “H0fIA7 76 YLLK 198 S{OPINDS SIF 0N} Ak AERPIOEON LI o1 206 [WioLMpN 1303 0]
23 &35 2 ‘ydeson of smm aue ey Kod ) & WHIN(T JOK D S0P POV peapIIpUL SL ) "NieN) Of RN MR
wesadie Sip ) TOVMROTIRIN 90 POr S A FASOPORE AR ) Jof Gopatapienes 5 9

00 AN one 31 WormeB] £33 50 vaa0edied 891 J0 UDIWEI RO 215,50 S3Es] ) (it pelwnoser Siveiis
e Jo yooned 2403 you [j7gs 1 130 00 LOedIngo- sy P Lanesy et pur pooNmpm Airwatonde
) poimdinuon wasy Sjoovia J& wRBaKd AU ey OIS0 POp BONP OF AT N S

doid st 30,

o0ae 1 4q 201352 A pid #4 1 SN 508 10 3005 23, "somRIEUL Pliss TUROJRA 183 W]
g&ﬂﬂn&-&sgﬁ&%gﬁ}_&giésgé%

"8 “oomids 0o U W wegewiein GIor J0 Wopanasd S DAKp ([N Ha Sopesdaickts Jp ‘v

S ks AL I83G TIOYS ONDRIOWIRMAL 00 4 JSATH T 1502 ol e 13yl Popes.
o 30 allen3 30 2005 Aw Suipopiny 5::..@:63% SI03 BV UDIINISHE 1 S5 0L, MOK Y04
AN I wika L SN 0) 3y o 200 AUadmo0e 02 ejeEAs 94 1w o4 ‘sojouedly fujas
PHOR S} 89 WATLIO) 0 30 fraead .30} aigeis » 91795 w) “swoelly Rupmi pldy

~Rymd govsaragy 22190 90 pwag jWdofarsy Junn], w 01 ot pUBYORNLE 1
..x..szs.sss_..as.za:as_.__Exa..ﬂ»»_‘igueﬁsaa.ﬁ 1

“{qRIOARY 5 111 '001LIQ MO TF *[OTIM W X T2 358 5 B0 20N
wedo-343 W].spusay Xk Jo O A1 JoL A8P N3 JWiE OF. SweiNp03 SpP 10 M1 WSIRLY
iRl o) Py aq I JAYN WP AWOUCOI PUT UOREIKIYET [uuaS
XD PUE 33001 PUOR TWTHSNG) ‘TLONEPNOR ISRIVER DHOQ JURIMA JO NOK SUIADE MM Ak

“000'5S $9050.03 W0 9 903 3w YN 949 40 Pl
L LE] S (VL0 oS Tun flaysod ey e Syt Tuswdasd
%uﬂhﬂhﬁn&saa"ﬂnfsuahn&!gagﬁis
sapdoo W00 R OROI WAL TS SO P30 3704 10 Deipote,
41 TR K4IMPI0 JONED M OF PIsN AU 3N SO LSRVRKYEE AU SN 11D
0 ) . S freI0 W ) wne o Wy

X P ) 4 pied 4q 9
2] ypdn yor 30 1500 Wy, ifa&i&iie.:!;«iﬁ...&_&s
B JO 060 08 wwudiieh A0 WK 4% (AW Yook Ok Aaagjop aty Ja) GFENAM [T
o, o Rupany snopigedin sy ut Apon Jumisaol n0f e {14 P SR FUY
SOL" MHINGARE “Le0 ‘Suoimed A1erseoes 11 30 NIt K UF peaNbL 6 Ani ¢
YR 405 ASUIOTE PUOG SH} 8 HUMURIL PON SIUEISEE {10 M POIIbAY §] DRI U0 R P

oy

TONBYMAAAN (ppinpy anr) Mdorg,
ORI IO 441,10 S

PRcs JUapirarg {ea0ucH ey,



l7L
688S00ANAND.L

> &) “£107 Sritay g0 o, Y1 90
1 wo-pond 1oying At ot RO TN 36 enonng 50 reog P WepIEI ¥ A9 GRIISTIOV

BONYIIIXY

Aoy Y e

. 001 el prganse uo Fupumes pU saudixy (19 40 Ksweioey
PR I0K £ prees ADERS F084 30 BIRIBE i £q PISOPU 99 NI Sousitecow 0y, “pIRRE
MY WHTENW0S P SO 9t 20 AMBEHUN iR Pk WeKIC) IMOK TRANEH Jeaedy dive
o Woisioo {14 3 0K £q peaieaon UaA, Pus ‘eroidap o pempure 9 fwododd s 6

“sapourtAop (3€) Ay s Sind 1w £ : DT T T T

™ Bupgel o [IVHH 0 610 055 S B TG PINOGS PUR ATIRORE 9 VOIS PURS PIMAY ST L

“Suopeliie0 240 30 Aajep Pr¥ RUIOL &1 1M prmeay serssdie
fe 100 mpadoalie e pux ‘SO Jo SUEHI *Aue g i Tugres pre sposdy Zuires s wiowisial
00 Ay o i J " d MRALLL L0 ULOS P8 WAYIUTY
TS (WO ‘WY meqpsip pue Fopagd ‘SAUNRYY Proy 4 Jo§ LSS

%50 000°000'sS A0

%ot 000'000'5S - $00'00('€$ BAO
%05t 000'000'cg g
TR e Ry
PORERF 1S J0a 00 a5 003t J0 330U
3G T 005 THUOE BIL 20 AICHADY JRIOUULT IG) S 308 30 B US 3f sprpoyos oty 3L
WINANHIS XA

oy

$ON DA Dl ediapeninr tinD Adasy,
TORAL IO MG ST LW

U 0201831 SQTIOUOY O,



[AZ7
068S00dNIND.L

5 101900

ey ey eayunads oS a0 pempe] paimboy
A Jopagrsnadsaraq Jou jpM sm nap 1dsoxa “SpUog St JO KIaliap pus soUenss]

L0 B LjLk Boj uraypdosdde 20 £7629900% $18 SURRIBIAD WA 5%
L pue s iod ‘s i bm—s..d. 1 INRIUIOO)
SLVL ey RAPALOL Ny pAoppesuLmassi o ey (2)
“opersrie Furjqeud Mz pus e P Yans
Jo uoy P UO[EZIOTING MR MR .Eﬁn!umahaa-:iuoﬁsﬁ
nznomne s oF sjendosdds 3o P Manes g mwdoag (1)
wonnp
Sumolpoy i Jeyeq moLuo pauuiopsd Apoarreeany 1o ‘uzopad 6] 1edxe sm uemedsiuo sty ar
INTINADVINELO Z400%

LEATAnun 31 WOy Mavsked 3essy s 10 459613 # £q pomoas ey M sprog aIp
3O 20106 A0 20 SU0 PUE SOXTE UEAIOIRA PE 5,500%) 91 30 sTpeid ¥ £q pawidos oq [ spuog oy 3o
TRITS QI X R0 ‘SPMOH !=fu§-ue sist oy FagSed pioe )543 13Ma DI IBIRM 5 Jonse] 2y
of siiwmoiordnst Joy spuny navsaagcgéu&%n:aooi SPEIOFT I SWE (MU SZARLR
B ‘MUY SIOHLI10 G4y ) Parivs] oq o3 (Spilog, o) spuog PROLRI}OE-A.A008 L 1A LAORAND
0 (onssf, 2w’ ONGdINARBA, N GNED dqdou o) @00 puog ¥ vwrgsad Uk am
SX0A12S 347} SUASITO) S8R BTED LU 195 0} §) apapirosdelus sp Jo ssodmd suy,

SRRBADURY) Dtae SeIpE]
FLOT Seg “SPUOETNINASY DR "§| 0L SRS “TPUOH

e, poitumu] § ‘ON 1081 Anf} ST 4D HC0IL I Tpasodozy g
29794 SPHRL ng) Aydory
MK odeamy 908
1 ‘oR wING Anpy sdroeyy amd Sydoay,

€102 ‘1 soqiundas
FUSSEL QLT qupony DBV 12 e ALY LG A 4
o el MERMMACSY ey
AV NTYMIRALI 360 BP0 MOOYA ALMN NALNIO HEOINANY INO GO
LATNLS SARYN U8 "N 00 QOOMMVE HINON 212 NI SEANONOL T08

‘ed"TTNOLUOH P ISMMRIVE “TIVOIN

FRNO L



vVL
168S00ANIAND.L

5 Jozated

Buypwesiis 101 ‘SpIL 0234 AT} FRIUM JaDOn SAIUNISURIING oyl 30 1dr
A1I0U PINBIV0D SIS SUL SO 0) SRS [0XF [DUAINL ¥ $1818 0) 100 J0.
1O8J RIeINI ¥ JO JUMIANS NIt AT UTEIN0D 106 S50 JUSIRIOP IMSOINP S0
10 JHWEIINS 15 [FSLGP ML IEE) RUADE ?ivsﬁuegvﬁﬁ sumjyo gaE_ﬂ

0 SpOG A1) 0) 10652 (YA 1UMETIIOD MSCAIP HTJO AL 10 10MTEIELS (8O0 e

JO MotAR210 0] o1 1 Fapsisse 9a0qw(5) o wpsquowp seidmxg  (¥)

Rayoyioy 1 Rupapn
gl 3 g P hégﬂ_ Rl
man 575 !»%gfubgﬁaﬁa 8__3__5_ am .ﬁsagﬁ Syt vy Sonmp n.o "

“prifas sy T o1 (1 PIIIE00 3 1oMSE]
ayt Jo swafodum o pos Jyurs mod jo tiaqumata 101D [ nof Jmy pumssIpmn 94 "Alunoes

nll..-.

GEQ&ESE»S Apos im am .Eehw&.t i:u o .a.assa .-_zancﬁs
Funzps seepsfeanidde ypua s 1 Aqf 1114 80 pat “wopy

-Epindaput AQ swres ayy AJyaa ) Juppun IO | Sus_uga stiosrd Jgo pus -3«50

yqud J0 wuoleafRo o Fv Wupessosd pagime o1 uedt A1 s s “fuonmdo Fuol
0 SuUapUAS I "OfUP 1130 SR FHIISID ASTE PLATONE O PO q Ik suazd() PRIOR 131,

i priog no 4o A o) prjne eq (v mmssy oy, {,Boxsopy, sp)sornd emgamd
JRYL 0] PRGOS 10 SPUOG S Olwp SY) U 1 K3 pardaliep o fiia suoxndQ puog MO

*sosodmd Kw1 Guroouy fikrapay S0y LOAOT SSOXT Y SpUdE 3 DO TSTpTL
30 AYjiqVpnioxe o1 piny *SPUOE-#1) 30 £Lmops pur uewrArd Jo Funoe A ‘spuog
i 10 3097 Jujpuiq pow Aipiw sus urpredas ( Saac puiog, 9tp) yuonndo

is] 0 Jeps “wonNsHYE MO OF Sy oy ay o welg ()
“tenss] ay) 30 Bupyepapum ampopssip dnmuyuco s ywa (1)

spuog

e.cﬁﬁ...;&uaeﬁ. fanssg [W35] 03 Bunum: UsESOUNe pass Jo Srepransd
1 oyt Koy Ul OSSO IS ‘porwontasgy  (9)

“Ubgrio) sl jusopy o easodmd

13 $PUOR SHi U LI SY) JO JURINR 1T ) #T) PIR PRSI 9g I Anig
ﬁz;s yawosmmd S25D10- QT ‘SPUOE Y} SQUIEOP YDA SPUOE 91 JO OIES o4 1M
DONOIULILY G PIATEUTUR9STY 9 01 ()=AuRielE IO RIP Jo rEOnNSIsOP Mk (s)

“swmondi opnt boog e aekey ()

"SS5 PUOE S JO WIS 91 o) JupwpRl sanssy NS ooy (5)



147
¢68S00ANND.L

§ o cotey

stqrisp pax endind SEog 00, s2iAmE shuamy Ruskipf swnidogdde sgs o gpa oa 'Barsory
01 1nbdans "KAPILISAON TRUOH ME J0 eoumnsst vodn POpnjousn o ({M 1ojje] euNNEIS
sup & puvesn digsuoymiag Juerp-fantonE oyl PO 3nssE B Jo usysiasades o

aﬁm!ﬁﬁaigsbﬁégmﬂ_gg

‘Fogp U1 KOSE] 87) 30 () ORI DEOT IO pyiisoon

18 Jowo] JowsTedie- sy o Uoynacys Lumsey mg tsaparsag Eu__-ﬁnisu 83—3 P

QIF [OSTNI00 PUOY $$ SIS INQ “sepwd e Buoure Lowy _u_Esn:a-u....s uanam pue Al

33010 Ak 0} 1850109 100 $1e 6. ‘WORINSTAA $i U1 Janss] KF AUD wiasasdar ax g piiKapn

Sﬁ.suase wl nRd 290 J1¢ YL SUWSTE WYL B4, S DMMIBG 18R |4 diysuonue:
o O [ N qQ I sanssy o ‘enspiumcsfedun my o zopnowse oudn

JTHSNOILYTIROINI)-AINNOLLY

“Suoiitido puog e dpust
©3 paambe 10U 7 1818 SA0® (10 198 Ayeogionds jou e Japi0 Aue Dupsppy (D

$oRO03 Jreunsaat] Aur 'ar 5 unindo so J0 suniem Juneanlae (D
*(spwog ey 1o] suogey 100 50P 1 fue mo
.a.e.s&amu#!.uo&gk«éﬂoﬁﬁé.ﬁiﬂﬁﬁ&!ﬁ!&o
(tA spuod oy oo Pied Jeesopun Jeqy eansse 0F Sressaoou suonoe Aus Jonusono
Auwd 1mpo Aie S0 samssp oy bi soape Sumupuoo Supisoid ‘Bmwogy oyy (9

. edpsahct wf PJOXE PUR SIS

10 “soumbing 4o suoTIRI *ANG Esgéﬂaﬁﬂg ()]
o Aue
AAWAUI0D MY 0) guggusguo_%ng_g “Quysory
o 'x spuog oy 0} § * ‘uo Sunndo

SuesgnuésgﬁudEFsg&EEaEsﬁg ()]

poog Ayl o iy
SY130 STUROAIPETY ATy od 3¥-av0ia Ao Jurssudio 10 uonednsoany ve Suppey @)

uopeEni o 30 smsed ees Jupsmyg  (a)
mepsBag o puonumsuos sme RnyRiy ()

“Smep

] 01 10d50 PR FEIATNS URULSAT 20 EDUNOIOUE AF] SHILTONS 01818 n.__.ies {3)

TOIERINIG,) AFURYIKY DUk MBUAS WU WO XIN9
UORIR DU TIAIAS INDOANY Jruntcguy ags wos) sTuImI Xu) sof Sie0nbas Furredasy [5]



172
£68S00ANINDL

§ Jopoly e

. R guu&iqauusmiaﬁ_.sn_m.%ﬂbvn:%
/5P 97 SIS 150008 KIOLEA K0 A1 AY POSTSAESHY [ NOF o uioressad

‘onpald yiis sadokz] Supniauy g uno.mQ ‘39BN pue soey Burpunisino ] e ed o
i 7 PRUNIRL6Q 1118104 /R prisTny Aj2adoxd pire miwind Yenberano iy

SorioD;

pred 00 10U 1M o qegreoxTe pun pumerdpen s, 'p tou ) fupuean aip
1 “Buwopywy).saye 20 s Pa[lrg g 1 903 10 e3) Ruirg puewen Aswony sexag wip Supnpxe
‘snadxo 23y P faavsal parisseaonduod ‘Soap SuiL g R0 ‘ol suoydaian
sawnsp Soy ‘sausaap ‘Sogupd pus Fm4doaoroyd ‘91900 e SeRRS FELeq 0L 10 pasmat IO
opeussaRrey el R 40§ PRSINqUIEAr 8] 0} 3ixs (Ut 84 ‘WUIPPE U] "000'000'CY #A0q0 S21zas
#q) v} spRogen youncws edonid a4 30 %605 °0 PUR “Swuat Ay UL G00'000°TS W3 JoF spuog
a1 o faowrs prdsaud s 30 9600°1 ‘W o1 T 060'000°CS YWY LY S5 SPUOR 1Y) JO JUROUIN-
disd 0 30 450671 9 J1iA JPUOE Jo SITI ITES 2O 32Y MO “MINAIS LOIISLIDD U] WM
T e sepriqisuiodess ath (u1) prs ‘Fupavury-sy of Tupoasp orvdiouus oM oum mp (1) Sayay

» shp Ind e3ujapun (A 04 TIENP O17 (1) Spuog A 43 pepuesaadar Sy
H[LJO GINPIYTS PR SIS “AMpans “wns) G Jo BUTPTRINPUN Jpanns no {8) aodn pesey

v I

. . Jydrsfuied spis ut pagposep
199U} IR WANTUOD 3RO JO MO 03 uBsCo 5058] 9P AR
IS S5 $1) JO UOTHIIOXE] “SPUog #q13 31 3O PedSE Aum 0} 1WA I 9q [{IW VD TR0
90101 TOATS QALY YY) K[SY[un 311) P LOTRIapIIN0D e £ parBs PLI JOUN JO MOUDI 3F
AUEBARE oNS 10 W10 BT G830 JO OK YD UON! mo ADE J0U SO d
s SYEL 0 3 OF Ipmag S15 JO-DOMNSSE Ot TIDE STMEINY AMDIDIINE NG [ SHRGL (INS
WG LI TR $1Kf 0 popiAosd rEnIoAjvesesdor o) Ame oo 1oaype Aesisape M ‘Emaso g
“UCHTUGS2RI TINE IAGTOQ KUt OP BAN “SPUO 801 JO SOUIRSST Y G PUAIOA SOTIND Y1 JO DI0NG
0 940 401V PArvEmI e UL Jussardier of padise oy LT om e o[qssord Ok s3] sonsST Ry s
SUCHIFTNL A I HUIGO aInL10 e sel o Jo w00 it Senssy e Ransdsaidor s s g
onp g $0imp T S1q)ss0d Sy *SuOISIAIPGNE peanjod yim SSeUjsRg OP oM ‘20 Suon ‘eauy)
Fupyuig JsiLtsaAm pem-guoisiap peantod Arem sitosaidas uuyy mo Sysae are noX Y

SIOTHINGD
Spuog ap o Funn mpssaend sig Jo wdpiostren # oy a1p uy sredronnd e oF




17
68S00ANND.L

§ pyavy

£10Z ‘L1 Joquunidag s
Sxorang Jo,pog ‘wapRaL
K/

{ ‘ON IS AT Moy quid Audozy,
paouddy puy padacay

1L WHOR 3 IS TR

T4 i BuUDpoM 03 PIMIO) XOO] I, ‘S ek
soF prnBio sy Burmas 4301750 PrIFOQING U £ pocFiy pus popep sano] 1ueurdaiue sip yo Lloa
posojaoe a3 Surmyes AQ asipit o3 esuard ik of ejquidecoy exe sty JutoRelo)eus i



EXHIBIT K

TCMUDO005895
747



TCEQ COMMISSIONERS/0GC Fax:5122335533 Bey 5 2014 02:17em P002/003

Bryan W. Shaw, Ph.D., (ﬂtav'maﬂ
Toby Baker, Commissioner
Zak Covar, Commissioner

" TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY
‘ Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution
May 5, 2014

To; Persons on the attached mailing list (by mail and ﬁcsMile 8s iz_;dicated)"

Re: Motions to Overtutn the Exeautive Director’s Approval of an Enginsering Project and
Bond Issuance for Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No, 1; TCEQ Docket No.
2014-0347-DIS; Intemnal Control No. D-09242013-030. :

This courtesy letter is in response to the above referenced Motions to Overtum
(“Motions™), Complete copies of the filings may be obtained from the Office of Chief Clerk,
TCEQ, Mail Code 105, P.O. Box 13087, Austin, Texas 78711-3087.

Section 50.139 of 30 Texas Administrative Code applies to these Motions. Thxs letter is
to notify all persons that, according to the - Chief Clerk’s records the Motions overruled by
operation of law on May 2, 2014,

If you have any questions about this matter, please contact Barham A. Rlchard Assistant
Gener;l Coupsel, at (512) 239-0107.

Respectfully,

e bt/

" Anne Idsal |
General Counsel

Mailing List

P.0. Box 13087 ﬁ,Auéﬂn,Ta:as78711-3087 . 512-%9-1060 * tceqg texes.gov

How is our customer service?  tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey
primeed om recyeled papar

TCMUDO005896
748



TCEQ F)OMMIS_S!ONERS/OGC Fax;§122395533

May 5 2014 02:17pm P003/003

Maﬂmg L:st .
Trophy Club MUD No. 1

Jenmifer McKnight
Geperal Manager .
" Trophy Club MUD No. 1
100 Municipal Drive
Trophy Club, Texas 76262

Robin A, Melvin .

Graves, Dougherty, Hearon & Moody, P.C.
401 Congress Ave., Suite 2200

Austin, Texas 78701

512/480-5600 FAX 512/480—5388

Stephen C. Dickman

301 Congtess Ave.,, Suite 2000
Austin, Texas 78701
512/495-6400 FAX 512/495-6401

David Klein-

Lloyd, Gosselink, Rochellc & Townsend, P.C. .

816 Congress Ave., Suite 1900
Austin, Texas 78701
512/322-5800 FAX 512/472-0532

_ Anthony S. Corbett

Freeman & Corbett

8500 Bluffstone Cove, Suite B-104
Austin, Texas 78759 |
512/451-6689 FAX 512/453-0865

Justin Taack

TCEQ Water Supply Division MC 154
PO Box 13087

Austin, Texas 78711-3087 .
512/239-1122 FAXI 512/239-6145

Todd Galiga

TCEQ Environmental Law Division MC 173
P.0O. Box 13087

Austin, Texas 78711-3087"
512/239-0600-FAX 512/239-0606

Blas Coy

TCEQ Office of Public Interdst Counsel MC 103-

P.O. Box 13087
Austin, Texas 78711-3087
512/239-6363 FAX 512/239-6377

TCEQ Docket No. 2014-0347-DIS .

Docket Clerk

TCEQ Office of Chief Clerk MC 103
P.0. Box 13087 R

Austin; Texas 7871 1-3087-
512/239-3300 FAX 512/239-3311

Brian Christian

TCEQ SBEA Division

Public Participation and Education Program MC 108
P.0. Box 13087

"Anstin, Texas 78711-3087

512/239-4000 FAX 512/239-5678

TCMUDO005897
749



Filed in Tho Distriet Court
of Travis County, Texas

OCY 30 2014
NO. D-1-GN-14-001983 / “ M
Awai Rodrgueziendoza, Cistk

EX PARTE IN THE DIiSTRICT COURT OF

TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY
DISTRICT NO.

TRAVIS COUNTY, TEXAS

U L0 A S s

201st JUDICIAL DISTRICT

FINAL JUDGMENT

On July 14, 2014 and October 27, 2014, the Court conducted a trial on the Original

Petition for Expedited Declaratory Judgment and Motion for Consolidation (the “Petition™) filed,

pursuant to Chapter 1205 of the Texas Govermnment Code (“Chapter 1205™), by the Trophy Club
Municipal Utility District No. 1 (the “District™) in the above-styled cause (the “Chapter 1205
Suif"). The District appeared and announced ready by and through its counsel of record. The
Attorney General of the State of Texas, having been served with process as required by Chapter
1203, filed an Original Answer and appeared. Opposing party Maguire Partners — Solana Land,
L.P. (*Maguire”™) also appeared and announced ready for trial. The Court heard and considered
arguments of counsel, all present opposing parties or intervenors, and evidence presented relative
to the relief sought in the Petition.

On July 14, 2014, the Honorable Judge Lora Livingston entered an order that
consolidated the following administrative appeals with the Chapter 1205 Suit: (i) Maguire
Pariners ~ Solana Land, L.P. v. Texas Commission on Environmental Quolity and Richard
Hyvde, in his official capacity as Execurive Director, Cause No. D-1-GN-14-000716, filed in the

126th Judicial District Court of Travis County, Texas (the “First State Court Action™), and (ii)

Maguire Partners — Solanu Land, L.P. v. Texas Commission on Environmental Quality and
Richard Hyde, in his official capacitv as Executive Director, Cause No. D-1-GN-14-001623,

filed in the 53rd Judicial District of Travis County, Texas (the “Second State Court Action™;

Final Judgment - . -1-
AHIR04124.4

TCMUDO005898

750



collectively with the First Stat? Coﬁn Action, the “Aggiﬁ_s_t_l;_a_t_i_\@__A_géggl_s_"). This Court has
jurisdiction over the Administrative Appeals. Further, the Court concludes that Chapter 1205
confers jurisdiction to fully and finally gdjudicate all issues that have been or could be raised in
any forum that affect the District’s authority to construct and finance the Necessary
Improvements and issue: the ljroposed Bonds, both as defined and described in the Petition and
below, including without limitation all claims and matters asserted in the Administrative
Appeals.

The Court, having considered the Petition, together with the arguments, authorities, and
evidence submitted in support thereof, is of the opinion that the Petition is meritorious and
should be_, and hereby is, GRANTED. All questions of fact were submittef to the Court througl;
proffered evidence. Such evidence, together with the arguments and authorities cited by counsel,
supports and is the basis of the Court’s findings and conclusions. In support of this Final
Judgment, the Court makes the follovying findings and conclusions:

1. The District has compliedkwith the statutory requirements of Chapter 1205,
incll;ding' without limitation, the provision§ referenced herein.

2. The District is a political subdivis;on of the State of Texas created by a March 4,
1975 Order of the Texas Water Commission (the predecessor to the Texas Commission on
Environmental Quality (*TCEQ™)). Therefore, the District is an “issuer” as defined in TEX.
Gov'T CODE ANN. § 120§.001 (1) and may issue “‘public securities” as the term is defined in TEX.
Gov'T CODE ANN. § 1205.001(2).

3. On August 27, 2013, the District passed Resolution No. 2013-0827A that
authorized and directed the President and Secretary of ‘.the District’s Board of Directors, the

i

District’s attorneys, and the District’s engineers:

Final Judzment -2-
408041244

TCMUD005899
751

-



(a8  To make application to [TCEQ) for an investigation and report upon the
feasibility of the District’s financing that portion of the Project described
in the Engineering Report prepared by The Wallace Group in connection
with this application.

{(b)  To request [TCEQ] to approve the unlimited tax and/or unlimited tax and

revenue bonds of the District in the principal amount not to exceed
85,769,217 and the revenue bonds of the District in the principal amount
not to exceed $9,230,783, each bearing interest at a net effective interest
rate not to exceed the maximum legal limit in effect at the time of
issuance, and each maturing serially in accordance with the schedule
provided in the aforesaid application and Engineering Report.

4, On or about September 24, 2013, the District filed an application with TCEQ for
expedited approval of a proposed engineering project and the issuance of up to $5,769,217 in
principal amount of its unlimited tax and/or combination unlimited tax and revenue bonds, and
up to $9,230,783 in revenue bonds, for the purpose of financing improvements to its wastewater
treatment plant and sewer system (the “Wastewater Treatment Plant”).

5. On Febmary 6, 2014, TCEQ entered AN ORDER APPROVING (1) AN
ENGINEERING PROIJECT, (2) THE ISSUANCE OF $5,765,000 IN UNLIMITED TAX
BONDS, AND (3) THE ISSUANCE OF $9,230,000 IN REVENUE BONDS FOR [THE
DISTRICT] (the “TCEQ Order”). The TCEQ Order approved the District’s issuance of up to
$14,995,000 in bonds to finance improvements to the Wastewater Treatment Plant (up to
$5,765,000 in principal amount of its unlimited tax bonds and up to $9,230,000 in revenue
bonds).

6. On March 7, 2014, Maguire filed the First State Court Action requesting that the
Court set aside the TCEQ Order or remand it back to TCEQ for reconsideration or for a
contested case evidentiary hearing. On May 30, 2014, Maguire filed the Second State Court

Action requesting, in addition to the same relief it requested in the First State Court Action, that

the Court set aside TCEQ’s denial of Maguire’s Motion to Overturn the TCEQ Order. The Court

Final Judgment -3-
408041234

TCMUD005900

752



finds that (i) the TCEQ 10rder should be, and herei)y is, affirmed in its enitirety and (ii) all relief
requested by Maguire in the Administrative Appeals Should be, and hereby is, denied. with
prejudice.

7. On June 23, 2014, pursuant to Chapter 1205, the District filed the Petition in the
Chapter 1205 Suit. -Pursuant to TEX. Gov'T CODE § 1205.024, the Petition briefly sets out, by
allegation, reference, or exhibit (1) the District’s authority to issue the Proposed Bonds described
in the Petition, (2) the purpose of the Proposed Bonds described in the Petition, (3) the holding
and result of any required election, (4) a copy of or a pertinent excerpt from each public security
authorization, including any essential action or expenditure of mongy, (5) the amount or
proposed maximum amount of the public securities, (6) the interest rate or rates or the proposed
maximum interest rate of the public securities, and (7) any other pertinent matter.

8. Venue for the Chapter 1205 Suit is proper in this Court pursuant to TEX. GOV'T
CoDE ANN. § 1205.022; since this is “a district court of Travis County.” (

9. © The District properly and timely served the Attorney General of the State of
Texas as required by TEX. .GOV’T CODE ANN. § 1205.042.

10.  Pursuant to TEX. Gov'T CODE § 1205.041, on receipt of the Petition, the Court
immediately entered an Order Setting Hearing that directed the clerk of the Court to issue an

Order and Notice of Hearing (the “Order”) in the form of a notice to all of the Interested Persons.

The Order, in general terms and without naming them, advised the Interested Persons and the
Attorney General of the State of Texas of their right to (1) appear for trial at 10:00 a.m. on the
first Monday after the 20th day afier the date of the Order, and (2) show cause why the Petition
should not be granted and the public securities or the public security authorization validated and

confirmed. The Order further gave a general description of the Petition.

Final Judgment -4-
40804124.4

TCMUD005901

753



11.  Proper and timely notice of the filing of the Chapter 1205 Suit, and of its initial
July 14, 2014 trial setting, was provided. Specifically, notice was provided by Order, and
publication of a substantial copy of the same was timely made in newspapers of general
circulation in Travis, Denton, and Tarrant Counties, Texas in accordance with TEX. Gov'T CODE
ANN. § 1205.043." Such publication is evidenced by the Affidavits of Publication filed of record
in this matter on behalf of the Austin American-Statesman, Fort Worth Star-Telegram, and
Denton Record-Chronicle.

12. On July 14, 2014, at 10:00 a.m., the Chapter 1205 Suit was called for trial as
mandated by TEX. Gov’T CODE § 1205.041(b). Counsel for the District, the Attorney General of
the State of Texas, TCEQ and Richard Hyde (in his official capacity as Executive Director of
TCEQ), and Maguire made an appearance on the record, and Judge Livingston entered an order
that consolidated the Administrative Appeals with the Chapter 1205 Suit and continued the trial
of the Chapter 1205 Suit until October 27, 2014.

13.  The Court has in rem jurisdiction, as well as personal jurisdiction, pursuant to
TEX. GOV'T CODE ANN. §§ 1205.041-1205.044, over all persons who reside in the territory of
the District, own property located within the boundaries of the District, are taxpayers of the
District, or have or claim a right, title or interest in any property or money to be affected by the
public security authorization or the issuance of the public securities by the District (collectively,
the “Interested Parties™), including without limitation Maguire, and over the District and the
Attorney General of the State of Texas.

14.  The Court has subject matter jurisdiction over this action pursuant to TEX. Gov’T

CODE ANN. § 1205.021. Each category of relief the District seeks in the Petition is within the

' The District is located entircly within Tarrant County, Texas and Denton County, Tcxas, and has its principal
office in Denton County, Texas.

Final Judgment -5-
40804124.4

TCMUD005902

754



subject matter set forth' in TEX. GOv'T CODE ANN. § 1205.021 and the Court has the jurisdiction
to fully and finally adjudicate the issues raised in the Petition, including without limitation the -
District’s requests for a declaratory judgment to conclusively establish (i) the District’s authority
to issue unlimited tax bonds and revenue bonds in one or more series in an aggregate principal
amount not to exceed $14,995,000 (up to $5,765,000 in-principal amount of its unlimited tax
bonds and up to $9,230,000 in revenue bonds) pursuant to the terms and conditions specified in
one or more bond otders (the “Progosed’Bonds” 2 (i) the legality and validity of using funds
from the Proposed Bonds to finance improvements to the Wastewater Treatment Plant, (iii) the
District’s authority.to award contracts for the construction of such improvements, and (iv) the
validity of the TCEQ Order.

15.  The District intends to use the Proposed Bonds to finance the design, planning,
acquisition, construction, and equipping of necessary improvements to the Wastewater
Treatment Plant (the “Necessary hﬁgrovements”).

'16.© The Necessary Improvements are needed and necessary for the District to
maintain regulatory compliance, to meet its customers’ service demands as the District’s
population increases, and to continue to support the health, safety, and welfare of the District’s
population. -+ +

17.  Pursuant to, among other things, the TCEQ Order and Sections 49.181 and 54.501
of the Texas Witer Code, the District is authorized to issue and deliver the Proposed Bonds'in

connection with the financing of the Necessary Improvements as described in the Petition in one

&
+

2 The Proposed Bonds are mor¢ particularly described in Exhibits A and B to the Petition (with
such changes and completion of blanks as are reasonably appropriate to accommodate the
structure of one or more series of Proposed Bonds as each particular series of Proposed Bonds is
priced and sold or in order to obtain the approval of the Attorney General of the State Texas
pursuant to TEX. Gov. CoDE § 1202.003).

Final Judgment . -6-
40R04124.4

TCMUD005903
755



or more series in an aggregate principal amount not to exceed $14,995,000, such amount
consisting of the sum of up to $5,765,000 in unlimited tax bonds and up to $9,230,000 in
revenue bonds. The Proposed Bonds, in the form described in Exhibits A and B to the Petition
(with such changes and completion of blanks as are reasonably appropriate to accommodate the
structure of one or more series of Proposed Bonds as each particular series of Proposed Bonds is
priced and sold or in order to obtain the approval of the Attorney General of the State Texas
pursuant to TEX. Gov. CODE § 1202.003) will constitute lawful and valid obligations and
contracts of the District, enforceable according to their terms, and all provisions for the payment
of, and pledges, liens and security provided for such debt and the interest thereon will constitute
valid and binding obligations and contracts of the District under the laws of the State of Texas,

18.  Pursuant to Tex. Water Code § 54.505, voter approval is not required for the
District’s issuance of the up to $9,230,000 in revenue bonds that were approved by the TCEQ
Order.

19.  With respect to the District’s issuance of up to $5,765,000 in unlimited tax bonds
for the Necessary Improvements, the District currently has $5,769,217 in voted but unissued tax
bonds. Therefore, the District has sufficient voter approval to issue the up to $5,765,000 in
unlimited tax bonds that were approved by the TCEQ Order. Specifically, an election was held
May 9, 2009, whereby voters from Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1 and voters from
Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 2 approved the consolidation of the districts and
specifically authorized (i) each district to assume the other district’s outstanding bonds, notes,
and obligations and voted but unissued bonds payable in whole or in part from taxation, (ii) the
District to provide for the payment of principal of and interest on the outstanding bonds, notes

and obligations of former Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1 and former Trophy Club

Final Judgment -7-
40R04124.4

TCMUD005904

756



Municipal Utility District No. 2, through the levy and collection of a sufficient ad valorem tax
upon all taxable property within the District, and (iii) the District to issue for and in the name of
the District the voted but unissued bonds of former Trophy Club Municipa! Utility District No. |
in the amount of $3,229,217 and of former Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 2 in the
amount of $4,540,000, being assumed by the District, as may be appropriate under the specific
authority and terms and conditions of the propositions submitted at the elections authorizing the
same, and to provide for the payment of the principal of and interest on such bonds by the levy
and collection of a sufficient tax upon all taxable property within the District.

20.  The actions taken or to be taken by the District, including the undertaking of
obligations, ex?'cution of contracts, and issuance and delivery of the Proposed Bonds are legal,
valid, binding, enforceable, and, with respect to the P;oposed Bonds, upon approval by the
Attorney General of the State of Texas, will'be incontestable under Texas l;w. Moreover, each
expenditure or proposed expenditure of money related to the Necessary Improvements is legal
and valid. - ’ i

IT IS THEREFORE ORDERED, ADJUDGED and DECREED that, pursiant to
Chapter 1295 , the District is entitled to a Final Declaratory Judgment as follows:

(a)  the District is an “issuer” of “public securities” within the meaning of TEX. Gov.
CoDE § 1205.001;

(b)  the TCEQ Order is a valid and final order of the TCEQ that may not be
challenged in this Court or any other court, agency, or forum;

{c) the Distriqt is authorized to issue and to deliver up to $5,765,000 in principal
amount of its unlimited tax bonds and up to $9,230,000 in revenue bonds.to finance. the

Necessary Improvements, in one or more series pursuant to the terms and conditions specified in

Final Judgment -8-
408041244

g TCMUD005905

757



the bond orders, substantial copies of which are attached as Exhibits A and B to the Petition,
with such changes and completion of blanks as are reasonably appropriate to accommodate the
structure of a particular series of the Proposed Bonds as each particular series of Proposed Bonds
is priced and sold and in order to obtain the approval of the Attorney General of Texas pursuant
to TEX. Gov. CODE §1202.003;

(d) the actions taken or to be taken by the District, including regarding the issuance
and delivery of the Proposed Bonds pursuant to the provisions of Chapters 49 and 54 of the
Texas Water Code are valid, binding, and incontestable under Texas law;

(e)  the contracts and agreements executed or proposed to be executed by the District
in connection with completing the Necessary Improvements are valid and legally binding
contracts and agreements, and are incontestable under Texas law; and

()  the Proposed Bonds and each installment thereof, when issued and executed
pursuant to the procedural requirements provided by law, including approval by the Attomey
General of Texas, will constitute lawful and valid obligations and contracts of the District,
enforceable according to their respective terms, and that all provisions for the payment of, and
pledges, liens and security provided for such debt and the interest thereon will constitute valid
and binding obligations and contracts of the District under the laws of the State of Texas.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED, ADJUDGED and DECREED that the TCEQ Order is
affirmed in its entirety.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED, ADJUDGED and DECREED that all relief requested
by Maguire in the Administrative Appeals, or otherwise in this consolidating proceeding, is

denied with prejudice.

Final Judgment -9-

40R04124.4

TCMUDO005906

758



IT IS FURTHER ORDERED, ADJUDGED and DECREED that the Proposed Bonds
shall be sold in compliance with the TCEQ Order.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED, ADJUDGED and DECREED that, pursuant to TEX.
GoV'T CODE ANN. § 1205.151, this Final Judgment shall, as to all matters adjudicated, be forever
binding and conclusive against the District, the Attorney General of the State of Texas, and all
Interested Parties, irrespective of whether any such parties filed an answer or otherwise appeared
herein. - ¢

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED, ADJUDGED and DECREED that, pursuant to TEX.
Gov’T CODE ANN. § 1205.151, this Final Judgment shall constitute a permanent injunction
against the filing by any person or entity of any action or proceeding contesting the validit); of
the Proposed Bonds, the authorization of the Proposed Bonds, the expenditure of money relating
to the Proposed Bonds, the provisions made for the payment of the Proposed Bonds or of interest
thereon, any matter adjudicated by this Final Judgment, and any matter that could have been
raised in these proceedings.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED, ADJUDGED and DECREED that the Proposed Bonds
may include a certificate that contains the follow statement: “This obligation was validated and
confirmed by a judgment entered ‘Lon [insert applicable date] by the 53rd Judicial District Court,
Travis County, Texas, in Ex Parte Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1, Cause No. D-1-
GN-14-001983, which perpetually enjoins the commencement of any suit, action, or proceeding
involving the validity of this obligation, or the provision made for the payment of the principal
and interest of the obligation.”

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED, ADJUDGED and DECREED that the District may (a)

complete any blanks contained in the forms of all documents and instruments proposed to be

Final Judgment -10-
308041244

TCMUD005907

759



executed, submitted or delivered as set forth in the Petition (with such changes and completion of
blanks as are reasonably appropriate to accommodate the structure of one or more series of
Proposed Bonds as each particular series of Proposed Bonds is priced and sold); (b) correct
clerical errors as may be discovered in the bond orders that are attached to the Petition as
Exhibits A and B; (c) make changes or corrections to the bonds orders that are attached to the
Petition as Exhibits A and B, or to any of the documents authorized and approved by the bond
orders, (i) in order to cure any ambiguity, formal defect, or omission in the bond order or such
other document, (ii) as may be suggested or required by the initial purchasers of or credit
enhancers for the Proposed Bonds, subject to the approval of the Attqmey General of the State
Texas, (ili) as may be suggested or required by the Attorney General of the State of Texas or his
representative prior to obtain the approval of the Proposed Bonds by the Attorney General of the
State of Texas, and (iv) as may be required or allowed by this Final Judgment.

The Court denies all other relief not granted in this Final Judgment. This Final Judgment
disposes of all parties and all claims, and is appealable.

SO ORDERED AND ADJUDGED on this

X day of October, 2014.
{

Final Judement -11-
40804124.4

TCMUDO005908

760



RESOLUTION 2013-0827B
TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 1

RESOLUTION TO DECLARE OFFICIAL INTENT TO
REIMBURSE COSTS OF THE UTILITY SYSTEM
IMPROVEMENT PROJECT

WHEREAS, the Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1 (the "District") is a duly
created governmental body of the State of Texas;

WHEREAS, the District expects to pay, or have paid on its behalf, expenditures in
connection with the design, planning, acquisition, construction and equipping of improvements
to the wastewater treatment plant and other improvements to the water and sewer system (the
"Project") prior to the issuance of tax-exempt obligations, tax-credit obligations and/or
obligations for which a prior expression of intent to finance or refinance is required by Federal or
state law (collectively and individually, the “Obligations™) to finance the Project;

WHEREAS, the District finds, considers, and declares that the reimbursement for the.

payment of such expenditures will be appropriate and consistent with the lawful objectives of the
District and, as such, chooses to declare its intention to reimburse itself for such payments at
such time as it issues Obligations to finance the Project;

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF
TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 1:

Section 1. The District reasonably expects to incur debt, as one or more series of
Obligations, with an aggregate maximum principal amount equal to $15,000,000 for the purpose
of paying the costs of the Project.

Section 2. All costs to be reimbursed pursuant hereto will be capital expenditures. No
Obligations will be issued by the District in furtherance of this Statement after a date which is
later than 18 months after the later of (1) the date the, expenditures are paid or (2) the date on
which the property, with respect to which such expenditures were made, is placed in service.

Section 3. The foregoing notwithstanding, no Obligation will be issued pursuant to this
Statement more than three years after the date any expenditure which is to be reimbursed is paid.

Section 4. The foregoing Sections 2 and 3 notwithstanding, all costs to be reimbursed
with qualified tax credit obligations shall not be paid prior to the date hercof and no tax credit
obligations shall be issued after 18 months of the date the original expenditure is made.

-

TCMUDO005909

761



PASSED AND APPROVED THIS AUGUST 27, 2013.

ATTEST:

Kevin R. Carr
Secretary, Board of Directors

TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY
DISTRICTNO. 1

{Oﬂm

Jim Moss T
President, Boéard of Directors

\ by
Sopeteg,
SN B TARS L,
SR QZ,,‘-G’-«
Tl Lz
= § & o0z
g oy oiv=
= A Q,:';’ S
AP =, ~S
S5as N &
// /C.T‘... \\

! ’Iu?ﬁ\“\\
TCMUD005910

762



SELECTED PROVISIONS OF THE BOND ORDER

SECTION 1: Definitions and Interpretations.

(@) Unless otherwise expréssly provided or unless the context clearly requires
otherwise, in this Order the following terms shall have the meanings specified below:

"Additional Parity Obligations" means the additional parity obligations
permitted to be issued by Section 18 of this Order. ‘

"Average Annual Debt Service Requirements” means that average
amount which, at the time of computation, will be required to pay the Debt
Service Requirement on all outstanding Bonds and Additional Parity Obligations
when due (either at Stated Maturity or mandatory redemption) and derived by
dividing the total of such Debt Service Requirement by the number of Fiscal
Years then remaining before Stated Maturity of such Bonds and Additional Parity
Obligations. For purposes of this definition, a fractional period of a Fiscal Year
shall be treated as an entire Fiscal Year. Capitalized interest payments provided
from bond proceeds and accrued interest on the Parity Revenue Obligations be
excluded in making the aforementioned computation.

"Closing Date" means the date of the initial delivery of and payment for
the Bonds. -

"Code" means the Internal Revenue Code of 1986, as aniended, -
including applicable regulations, published rulings and court decisions relating
thereto. K

"Construction Fund" means the construction fund established by Section*
12 of this Order.

"Debt Service Requirements" means as of any particular date of
computation, with respect to any obligations and with respect to any period, the
aggregate of the amounts to be paid or set aside by the District as of such date
or in such period for the payment of the principal of, premium, if any, and interest
(to the extent not capitalized) on such obligations; assuming, in the case of
obligations without a fixed numerical rate, that such obligations bear interest
calculated by assuming (i) that the interest rate for every 12-month period on
such bonds is equal to the rate of interest reported in the most recently published
edition of The Bond Buyer (or its successor) at the time of calculation as the
“Revenue Bond Index” or, if such Revenue Bond Index is no longer being
maintained by The Bond Buyer (or its successor) at the time of calculation, such
interest rate shall be assumed to be 80% of the rate of interest then being paid
on United States Treasury obligations of like maturity and (ii) that the principal of
such bonds is amortized such that annual debt:service is substantially level over
the remaining stated life of such bonds, and further assuming in the case of
obligations required to be redeemed or prepaid as to principal prior to Stated
Maturity, the principal armounts thereof will be redeemed prior to Stated Maturity
in accordance with the mandatory redemption provisions applicable thereto.

3

B-1
TCMUD005911

763



"Designated Payment/Transfer Office” means (i) with respect to the initial
Paying Agent/Registrar named herein, its designated office in St. Paul,
Minnesota, and (ii) with respect to any successor Paying Agent/Registrar, the
office of such successor designated and located as may be agreed upon by the
District and such successor.

"Event of Default" means any Event of Default as defined in Section 20 of
this Order.

"Existing Obligations" means the outstanding Trophy Club Municipal
Utility District No. 1 Revenue Note, Series 2012 and Trophy Club Municipal Utility
District No. 1 Revenue Note, Series 2013.

"Fiscal Year" means the twelve-month accounting period used by the
District currently ending on September 30 of each year.

"Government Securities” (i) direct noncallable obligations of the United
States of America, including obligations the principal of and interest on which are
unconditionally guaranteed by the United States of America, (ii) noncallable
obligations of an agency or instrumentality of the United States, including
obligations unconditionally guaranteed or insured by the agency or
instrumentality and on the date of their acquisition or purchase by the District are
rated as to investment quality by a nationally recognized investment rating firm
not less than AAA or its equivalent, (iii}) noncallable obligations of a state or an
agency or a county, municipality, or other political subdivision of a state that have
been refunded and on the date of their acquisition or purchase by the District, are
rated as to investment quality by a nationally recognized investment rating firm
not less than AAA or its equivalent and (iv) any other then authorized securities
or obligations under applicable law that may be used to defease obligations such
as the Bonds.

"Initial Bond" means the Bond described in Section 9.

"Interest and Sinking Fund" means the interest and sinking fund
established by Section 12 of this Order.

"Interest Payment Date” means the date or dates upon which interest on
the Bonds is scheduled to be paid until the maturity of the Bonds, such dates
being March 1 and September 1 of each year commencing September 1, 2015.

"Net Revenues" and "Net Revenues of the System” mean all of the
revenues of every kind and nature received through the operation of the System,
less the expenses of operation and maintenance paid thereof, including salaries,
labor, materials, repairs and extensions necessary to render efficient service;
provided, however, that only such repairs and extensions as in the judgment of
the Board, reasonably and fairly exercised, are necessary to keep the System in
operation and render adequate service to the District and the inhabitants thereof,
or such as might be necessary to meet some physical accident or condition
which would otherwise impair the security of the Bond or the Additional Parity
Obligations shall be deducted in determining "Net Revenues”.

"Bonds" means the District’'s revenue bond entitled "Trophy Club
Municipal Utility District No. 1 Water and Sewer System Revenue Bonds, Series
2015" authorized to be issued by this Order.

TCMUDO005912

764



"Order" means this Order.

"Outstanding" - When used in this Order with respect to Bonds or Parity
Revenue Obligations means, as of the date of determination, all Bonds
theretofore issued and delivered, except:

N those Bonds or Parity Revenue Obligations
cancelled by the Paying Agent/Registrar or dellvered to the Paying
Agent/Registrar for canceliation;

. (2) . those Bonds or Parity Revenue Obligations paid or
deemed to be paid in accordance with the provisions of Section 22
hereof, or substantially similar provisions with respect to Parity
Revenue Obligations; and

(3) those Bonds-or Parity Revenue Obligations that have
been mutilated, destroyed, lost, or.stolen and replacement Bonds
have been registered and delivered in lieu thereof as provided in
Section 21 hereof or similar provisions with respect to Parity
Revenue Obligations. -

"Parity Revenue Obligations" means the Bonds, the Existing Obligations,
and Additional Parity Obligations.

"Paying Agent/Registrar" means BOKF, NA dba Bank of Texas, Austin,
Texas, any successor thereto or an entity which is appointed as and assumes
the duties of paying agent/registrar as provided in this Order.

"Project" shall mean the acquisition, construction and equipment of
improvements to the District's wastewater treatment facilities.

"Record Date" means the fifteenth (15") day of the month next preceding
an Interest Payment Date.

¥

"ReserVe'Fund" means the fund established.in Section 12 of this Order.

"Required Reserve" means the amount required to be deposited and
maintained in the Reserve Fund under the provisions of Section 15 of this Order.

"System" means the District's water and sewer system, including all
present and future exiensions, additions, replacements and improvements
thereto.

(b)

Unless the context requires otherwise, words of the masculine gender shall be

construed to include correlative words of the feminine and neuter genders and vice versa, and
words of the singular number shall be construed to include correlative words of the plural
number and vice versa. . j

(c)

This Order and all the terms and provisions hereof shall be liberally construed to

effectuate the purposes set forth herein to sustain the validity of this Order.

)

SECTION 11: Pledge-Security for the Bonds.

(a)

. The Parity Revenue Obligations, including the Bonds, and the interest thereon,

and any and all other amounts payable thereunder, are and shall be secured by and payable
from a first lien on and pledge of the Net Revenues of the System (with the exception of those in

B-3
TCMUDO005913

765



excess of the amounts required to establish and maintain the Interest and Sinking Fund
hereinafter provided); and the revenues herein pledged are further pledged to the establishment
and maintenance of the Interest and Sinking Fund hereinafter provided.

(b) The Bonds are special obligations of the District secured by and payable from a
first lien on and pledge of the Net Revenues of the System, as provided in this Order, and is not
a charge on the property of the District or on taxes levied by the District. No part of the
obligation evidenced by the Bonds, whether principal, interest or other obligation, shall ever be
paid from taxes levied or collected by the District.

(c) Chapter 1208, Texas Government Code applies to the issuance of the Bond and
the pledge of the Net Revenues granted by the District under Section 11(a) of this Order, and
such pledge, therefore, is valid, effective, and perfected. If Texas law is amended at any time
while the Bonds are outstanding and unpaid such that the pledge of the revenues granted by
the District under Section 11(a) above is to be subject to the filing requirements of Chapter 9,
Texas Business and Commerce Code, then in order to preserve to the registered owners of the
Bond the perfection of the security interest in said pledge, the District agrees to take such
measures as it determines are reasonable and necessary under Texas law to comply with the
applicable provisions of Chapter 9, Business and Commerce Code and enable a filing to perfect
the security interest in said pledge to occur.

SECTION 12: Funds. The District hereby creates the following special funds or
accounts:

(a) Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1, Water and Sewer System Revenue
Bonds, Series 2015, Interest and Sinking Fund (the "Interest and Sinking Fund"),

(b) Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1, Water and Sewer System Revenue
Bonds, Series 2015, Reserve Fund (the "Reserve Fund");

(c) Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1, Water and Sewer System Revenue
Bonds, Series 2015, Construction Fund (the "Construction Fund").

SECTION 13: Revenue Fund. A Revenue Fund has previously been established on
the books of the District in connection with the District's Revenue Note, Series 2012. All gross
revenues of every nature received from the operation and ownership of the System shall be
deposited as collected into the Revenue Fund, and the reasonable, necessary, and proper
expenses of operation and maintenance of the System shall be paid from the Revenue Fund.
The revenues of the System not actually required to pay said expenses shall be deposited from
the Revenue Fund into the Interest and Sinking Fund to the extent provided hereunder and to
the interest and sinking funds as provided in the orders or resolutions authorizing the Parity
Revenue Obligations. However, until the Parity Revenue Obligations are retired, any surplus
Net Revenues of the System not required to be deposited in the funds and accounts established
by the orders or resolutions authorizing the Parity Revenue Obligations shall be deposited in the
Revenue Fund; provided, however, at such time as the Existing Obligations identified in Section
1 hereof are no longer outstanding, the following provision shall be applicable to such excess
Net Revenues:

Any Net Revenues remaining in the Revenue Fund after satisfying the foregoing
payments, or making adequate and sufficient provision for the payment thereof, may be
appropriated and used for any other District purpose now or hereafter permitted by law.

SECTION 14: Interest and Sinking Fund. (a) Net Revenues of the System shall be
deposited to the credit of the Interest and Sinking Fund at such times and in such amounts as
necessary for the timely payment of the principal of and interest on the Bonds.

B-4
TCMUD005914

766



(b) Money on deposit in the Interest and Sinking Fund shall be used to pay the
principal of and interest on the Bonds as such become due and payable.

- SECTION 15: Reserve Fund. To accumulate and maintain a reserve for the payment of
the Bonds and Additional Parity Obligations (the Required Reserve) equal to the lesser of (i) the
Average Annual Debt Service Requirements (calculated on a Fiscal Year basis and determined
as of the date of issuance of the Bonds, the most recently issued series of Additional Parity
Obligations then Outstanding or, at the option of the District, at the end of each Fiscal Year) for
the Bonds and Additional Parity Obligations or (ii) the maximum amount in a reasonably
required reserve fund for the Bonds and Additional Parity Obligations, from time to time that can
be invested without restriction as to yield pursuant to section 148 of the Code (as defined in
Section 24), the District agrees to maintain the Reserve Fund at an.official depository of the
District. All funds deposited into the Reserve Fund (excluding surplus funds which include
earnings and income derived or received from deposits or investments which will be transferred
to the Revenue Fund during such period as there is on deposit in the. Reserve Fund the
Required Reserve) shall be used solely for the payment of the principal of and interest on the
Bonds and Additional Parity Obligations, when and to the extent other funds available for such
purposes are insufficient, and, in addition, may be used to retire the last stated maturity or
interest on the Bonds or Additional Parlty Obligations. T .

Upon issuance of the Bonds, the total amount required to be accumulated and
maintained in'the Reserve Fund is hereby. determined to be $ (the "Required
Reserve"), which is equal to not less than the Average Annual Debt Service for the Bonds, and
on or before the 1st day of the month next following the month the Bonds are delivered to the
Purchasers and on or before the 1st day of each following month, the District shall cause to be
deposited to the Reserve Fund from the Net Revenues of the System an amount equal to at
least one-sixtieth (1/60th) of the Required Reserve. After the Required Reserve has been fully
accumulated and while the total amount on deposit in the Reserve Fund is in excess of the
Required Reserve, no monthly deposits shall be required to be made to the Reserve Fund.

As and when Additional- Parity Obligations aré delivered or incurred, the Required
Reserve shall be increased, if required, to an amount calculated in the manner provided in the
first paragraph of this Section. Any additional amount required to be maintained in the Reserve
Fund shall be so accumulated by the deposit of the necessary amount of the proceeds of the
issue or other lawfully available funds in the Reserve Fund-immediately after the delivery of the
then proposed Additionai Parity Obligations, or, at the option of the District, by the deposit of
monthly instaliments, made on or before the 1st day of each month following the month of
delivery of the then proposed Additional Parity Obligations, of not less than 1/60th of the
additional amount to be maintained in the Reserve Fund by reason of the issuahce of the
Additional Parity Obligations then being issued (or 1/60th of the balance of the additional
amount not deposited immediately in cash), thereby ensuring the accumulation of the
appropriate Required Reserve.

When and so long as the cash and investments in the Reserve Fund equal the Requnred
‘Reserve, no deposits need be made to the credit of the Reserve Fund; but, if and-when the
Reserve Fund at any time contains less than the Required Reserve (other than as the result of
the issuance of Additional Parity Obligations as provided in the preceding paragraph), the
District covenants and agrees to cure the deficiency in the Required Reserve by resuming
monthly deposits to said Fund or account from the Net Revenues, or any other lawfully available
funds, such monthly deposits to be in amounts equal to not less than 1/60th of the Required
Reserve covenanted by the District to be maintained in the Reserve Fund with any such
deficiency payments being made on or before the 1st day of each month until the Required
Reserve has been fully restored. The District further covenants and agrees that, subject only to
the prior payments to be made to the Interest and Sinking Fund, the Net Revenues shall be
applied and appropriated and used to establish and maintain the Required Reserve and to cure

B-5
TCMUDO005915

767



any deficiency in such amounts as required by the terms of this Order and any other order or
resolution pertaining to the issuance of Additional Parity Obligations.

During such time as the Reserve Fund contains the Required Reserve, the District may,
at its option, withdraw all surplus funds in the Reserve Fund in excess of the Required Reserve
and deposit such surplus in the System Fund, unless such surplus funds represent proceeds of
the Bonds, then such surplus will be transferred to the Interest and Sinking Fund.

The District, at its option and consistent with the provisions of this Section, may, to the
extent permitted by then-applicable law, fund the Reserve Fund at the Required Reserve by
purchasing an insurance policy that will unconditionally obligate the insurance company or other
entity to pay all, or any part thereof, of the Required Reserve in the event funds on deposit in
the Interest and Sinking Fund are not sufficient to pay the debt service requirements on the
Parity Revenue Obligations. All resolutions or orders adopted after the date hereof authorizing
the issuance of Additional Parity Obligations shall contain a provision to this effect.

In the event an insurance policy issued to satisfy all or part of the District’'s obligation
with respect to the Reserve Fund causes the amount then on deposit in the Reserve Fund to
exceed the Required Reserve, the District may transfer such excess amount to any fund or
account established for the payment of or security for the Parity Revenue Obligations (including
any escrow established for the final payment of any such obligations pursuant to Chapter 1207,
as amended, Texas Government Code) or use such excess amount for any lawful purpose now
or hereafter provided by law.

Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in this Section, the requirements set
forth above to fund the Reserve Fund in the amount of the Required Reserve may be
suspended for such time as the Net Revenues for each Fiscal Year are equal to at least 110%
of the Average Annual Debt Service Requirements. In the event that the Net Revenues for any
two consecutive Fiscal Years are less than 110% (unless such percentage is below 100% in
any Fiscal Year, in which case the hereinafter—specified requirements will commence after such
Fiscal Year) of the Average Annual Debt Service Requirements, the District will be required to
commence making the deposits to the Reserve Fund, as provided above, and to continue
making such deposits until the earlier of (i) such time as the Reserve Fund contains the
Required Reserve or (ii) the Net Revenues for a Fiscal Year have been equal to not less than
110% of the Average Annual Debt Service Requirements.

SECTION 16: Construction Fund.

(a) Money on deposit in the Construction Fund, including investment earnings
thereof, shall be used for the Project.

(b) All amounts remaining in the Construction Fund after the accomplishment of the
Project, including investment earnings of the Construction Fund, shall be deposited into the
Interest and Sinking Fund, unless a change in applicable law permits or authorizes all or any
part of such funds to be used for other purposes.

SECTION 17: Security of Funds — Investments.

(a) All moneys on deposit in the funds referred to in this Order shall be secured in
the manner and to the fullest extent required by the laws of the State of Texas for the security of
public funds, and moneys on deposit in such funds shall be used only for the purposes
permitted by this Order.

TCMUDO005916
768



(b) Investments. (i) Money in the funds established by this Order, at the option of
the District, may be invested in such securities or obligations as permitted under applicable law.

(i) Any securities or obligations in which money is so invested shall be kept and held
in trust for the benefit of the Owners and shall be sold and the proceeds of sale shall be timely
applied to the making of all payments required to be made from the fund from which the
investment was made.

(c) Investment Income. Interést and income derived from investment of any fund
created by this Order shall be credited to such fund.

SECTION 18: Additional Parity Obligations. In addition to the right to issue obligations
of inferior lien as authorized by the laws of this State, the District reserves the right to issue
notes, bonds and other obligations which, when duly authorized and issued in compliance with
law and the terms and conditions hereinafter appearing, shall be on a parity .with the Parity
Revenue Obligations, payable-from and equally and ratably secured by a first lien on and
pledge of the Net Revenues of the System; and the Parity Revenue.Obligations shall in all
respects be of equal dignity. The Additional Parity Obligations may be issued in one or more
instaliments, provided, however, that none shall be issued uniess and until’ the following
conditions have been met:

(a) A certificate is executed by the District Manager of the District and the President
of the Board to the effect that no default exists in connection with any of the covenants or
requirements of the Order or orders or. resolutions authorizing the issuance of the Bonds and all
then outstanding Parity Revenue Obligations;

(b) A certificate is executed by the District Manager of the District and the President
of the Board to the effect that the Interest and Sinking Fund and Reserve Fund contains the
amount of money then required to be on deposit therein; .

(c) A certificate is executed by a Certified Public Accountant to the effect that, in his
opinion, the Net Earnings of the System either for the last complete fiscal year of the District, or
for any twelve consecutive calendar month period ending not more than 90 days prior to the
passage of the Order authorizing the issuance of such Additional Parity Obligations, were at
least ___times the average annual principal and interest requirements for the then outstanding
Parity Revenue Obligations and the Additional Parity Obligations then proposed to be issued.

At such time as the Existing Obligations are no longer outstanding, the Accountant, in
making a determination of the Net Earnings, may take into consideration a change in the rates
and charges for services and facilities:afforded by the System that became effective at least
sixty (60) days prior to the last day of the period for which Net Earnings are determined and, for
purposes of satisfying the above Net Earnings test, make a pro forma determination of the Net
Earnings of the System for the period of time covered by his ceftification or opinion based on
such change in rates and charges being in effect for the entire period covered by’ the
Accountant's certificate or opinion.

PROVIDED, that the term "Net Earnings of the System" shall mean all of the Net
Revenues of the System, except that in calculating Net Revenues there shall not be deducted
as an expense of operation and maintenance any charge or disbursement for repairs: or
extensions which, under standard accounting practice, should be charged to capital
expenditures; and PROVIDED FURTHER, that it shall not be necessary for the District to meet
the above requirements to issue Additional Parity Obligations if the District obtains the written
consent of all of the holders of all outstanding Parity Revenue Obligations.

B-7
TCMUD005917

769



SECTION 19: Representations and Covenants as to Payment.

(a) While the Bonds are outstanding and unpaid, there shall be made available to
the Paying Agent/Registrar, out of the Interest and Sinking Fund and Reserve Fund, if
necessary, money sufficient to pay the interest on and the principal of the Bonds, as applicable,
as will accrue or mature on each applicable Interest Payment Date.

(b) The District will faithfully perform at all times any and all covenants, undertakings,
stipulations, and provisions contained in this Order and in the Bonds; the District will promptly
pay or cause to be paid the principal of, interest on, and premium, if any, with respect to, the
Bonds on due dates and at the places and manner prescribed in such Bonds; and the District
will, at the times and in the manner prescribed by this Order, deposit or cause to be deposited
the amounts of money specified by this Order.

(c) The District is duly authorized under the laws of the State of Texas to issue the
Bonds; all action on its part for the creation and issuance of the Bond has been duly and
effectively taken; and the Bonds in the hands of the Owners thereof is and will be valid and
enforceable obligations of the District in accordance with their terms.

(d) The District will at all times collect for services rendered by the System such
amounts as will be at least sufficient to pay all expenses of operation and maintenance, and to
provide Net Revenues equal to the amount that is sufficient to pay the scheduled principal of
and interest on the Parity Revenue Obligations, plus one times the amount (if any) required to
be deposited in any reserve or contingency fund or account created for the payment and
security of the Parity Revenue Obligations;

(e) If the System should become legally liable for any other indebtedness, the
District shall fix, maintain, charge and collect additional rates and services rendered by the
System, sufficient to establish and maintain funds for the payment thereof.

SECTION 20: Default and Remedies.

(a) Events of Default. Each of the following occurrences or events for the purpose of
this Order is hereby declared to be an "Event of Default," to-wit:

) the failure to make payment of the principal of or interest on the
Bonds when the same become due and payable; or

(i) default in the performance or observance of any other covenant,
agreement or obligation of the District, the failure to perform which materially,
adversely affects the rights of the Owners, including but not limited to, their
prospect or ability to be repaid in accordance with this Order, and the
continuation thereof for a period of 60 days after notice of such default is given
by any Owner to the District.

(b) Remedies for Default. (i) Upon the happening of any Event of Default, then
and in every case any Owner or an authorized representative thereof, including but not limited
to, a trustee or trustees therefor, may proceed against the District for the purpose of protecting
and enforcing the rights of the Owners under this Order, by mandamus or other suit, action or
special proceeding in equity or at law, in any court of competent jurisdiction, for any relief
permitted by law, including the specific performance of any covenant or agreement contained
herein, or thereby to enjoin any act or thing that may be unlawful or in violation of any right of
the Owners hereunder or any combination of such remedies.

(i) It is provided that all such proceedings shall be instituted and maintained for the
equal benefit of all Owners of the Bonds then outstanding.
B-8
TCMUD005918

770



(c) Remedies Not Exclusive. (i) No remedy herein conferred or reserved is
intended to be exclusive of any other available remedy or remedies, but each and every such
remedy shall be cumulative-and shall be in addition to every other remedy given hereunder.or
under the Bonds or now or hereafter existing at law or in equity; provided, however, that
notwithstanding any other provision of this Order, the right to accelerate the debt evidenced by
the Bonds shall not be available as a remedy under this Order.

(i) The exercise of any remedy herein conferred or reserved shall not be deemed a
waiver of any other available remedy.

SECTION 21: Mutilated,.Destroyed, Lost and Stolen Bonds. In case any Bond shall be
mutilated, or destroyed, lost or stolen, the Paying Agent/Registrar may execute and deliver a
replacement Bond of like form and tenor, and in the same denomination and bearing a number
not contemporaneously outstanding, in exchange and substitution for such mutilated Bond; and
with respect to a lost, destroyed or stolen Bond a replacement Bond may be-issued only upon
the approval of the District and after (i) the filing by the Holder with the Paying Agent/Registrar
of evidence satisfactory to the Paying Agent/Registrar of the destruction, loss or theft of such
Bond, and of.the authenticity of the ownership thereof and (ii) the furnishing to the Paying
Agent/Registrar of indemnification‘in an amount satisfactory to hold the District and the Paying
Agent/Registrar harmless. All expenses and charges associated with such indemnity and with
the preparation, execution and delivery of a replacement Bond shall be borne by the Holder of
the Bond mutilated, or destroyed, lost or stolen

Every replacement Bond issued pursuant to this Section shall be a valid and binding .
obligation, and shall be entitled to all the benefits of this Order equally and ratably with all other
Outstanding Bonds; notwithstanding the enforceability of payment by anyone of the destroyed,
lost, or stolen Bonds. .

The provisions of this Section are exclusive and shall preclude (to the extent lawful) all
other rights and remedies with respect to the replacement and payment of mutilated, destroyed,
lost or stolen Bonds.

SECTION 22: Satisfaction of Obligation of District. If the District shall pay or cause to
be paid, or there shall otherwise be paid to the Holders, the principal of, premium, if any, and
interest on the Bonds, at the times and in the manner stipulated in this Order, then the pledge of
taxes levied under this Order and all covenants, agreements, and other obligations of the
District to the Holders shall thereupon cease, terminate, and be discharged and satisfied.

Bonds or any principal amount(s) thereof shall be deemed to have been paid within the
meaning and with the effect expressed above in this Section when (i) money sufficient to pay in
full such Bonds or the principal amount(s) thereof at maturity or to the redemption date therefor,
together with all interest due thereon, shall have been irrevocably deposited with and held in
trust by the Paying Agent/Registrar, or an authorized escrow agent, or (ii) Government
Securities shall havé been irrevocably deposited in trust with the Paying Agent/Registrar, or an
authorized escrow agent, which Government Securities have been certified by an independent
accounting firm to mature as to principal and interest in such amounts and at such times as will
insure the availability, without reinvestment, of sufficient money, together with’ any moneys
deposited therewith, if any, to pay when due the principal of and interest on such Bonds, or the
principal amount(s) thereof, on and prior to the Stated Maturity thereof or (if notice of
redemption has been duly given or waived or if irrevocable arrangements therefor acceptable to
the Paying Agent/Registrar have been made) the redemption date therefor. The District
covenants that no deposit of moneys or Government Securities will be made under this Section
and no use made of any such deposit which would cause the Bonds to be treated as "arbitrage
bonds" within the meaning of Section 148 of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986, as amended,
or regulations adopted pursuant thereto.

B-9
TCMUDO005919

771



Any moneys so deposited with the Paying Agent/ Registrar, or an authorized escrow
agent, and all income from Government Securities held in trust by the Paying Agent/Registrar,
or an authorized escrow agent, pursuant to this Section which is not required for the payment of
the Bonds, or any principal amount(s) thereof, or interest thereon with respect to which such
moneys have been so deposited shall be remitted to the District or deposited as directed by the
District. Furthermore, any money held by the Paying Agent/Registrar for the payment of the
principal of and interest on the Bonds and remaining unclaimed for a period of three (3) years
after the Stated Maturity, or applicable redemption date, of the Bonds such moneys were
deposited and are held in trust to pay shall upon the request of the District be remitted to the
District against a written receipt therefor. Notwithstanding the above and foregoing, any
remittance of funds from the Paying Agent/Registrar to the District shall be subject to any
applicable unclaimed property laws of the State of Texas.

SECTION 23: Order a Contract - Amendments - Qutstanding Bonds. This Order shall
constitute a contract with the Holders from time to time, be binding on the District, and shall not
be amended or repealed by the District so fong as any Bond remains Outstanding except as
permitted in this Section and in Section 39 hereof. The District may, without the consent of or
notice to any Holders, from time to time and at any time, amend this Order in any manner not
detrimental to the interests of the Holders, including the curing of any ambiguity, inconsistency,
or formal defect or omission herein. In addition, the District may, with the written consent of
Holders holding a majority in aggregate principal amount of the Bonds then Outstanding
affected thereby, amend, add to, or rescind any of the provisions of this Order; provided that,
without the consent of all Holders of Outstanding Bonds, no such amendment, addition, or
rescission shall (1) extend the time or times of payment of the principal of, premium, if any, and
interest on the Bonds, reduce the principal amount thereof, the redemption price, or the rate of
interest thereon, or in any other way modify the terms of payment of the principal of, premium, if
any, or interest on the Bonds, (2) give any preference to any Bond over any other Bond, or
(3) reduce the aggregate principal amount of Bonds required to be held by Holders for consent
to any such amendment, addition, or rescission.

B-10
TCMUD005920

772



SOUTHWEST
SECURITIES.

A Hilltop Holdings Company

CLOSING MEMORANDUM

$9,230,000
Trophy Club Municipal Utility District ("MUD") No.1
Water and Sewer System Revenue Bonds, Series 2015 (the “Bonds”)

Date: February 9, 2015 -
To: Attached Distribution List
From: Dan A. Almon

Southwest Securities
(214) 859-9452
1. The closing time and date for the above-referenced issue is Tuesday,
February 17, 2015, at 10:00 A.M., Central Daylight Time. A final debt service schedule
is attached as Exhibit “A”. This transactlon will close through DTC’s “Fast” Book Entry
Only System.

2. Raymond James & Associates, as the authorized representative of a group of
purchasers (the “Purchasers”), shall wire $9,245,052.22 to BOKF, NA dba Bank of
Texas (the “Paying Agent/Registrar”) ABA #103900036, Account #600024642, Wealth
Management Account; Re: Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No.1, Water and Sewer
System Revenue Bonds, Series 2015, Attn: Jose Gaytan (512-813-2002) calculated as

follows:
Par Amount of the Bonds $9,230,000.00
Plus: Accrued Interest (02/01/15 - 02/17/15) 10,437.22
Plus: Bidder's Premium : 4,615.00
Total Amount to be Wired by Raymond James & Associates $9,245,052.22

TCMUD005921
773



Closing Memorandum

Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No.1
February 9, 2015

Page 2

4. The Paying Agent/Registrar shall retain $400.00 in payment of the first year's Paying
Agent/Registrar fee.

5. The Paying Agent/Registrar shall wire $189,869.00 from the proceeds of the Bonds, to
JPMorgan Chase Bank, Houston, Texas, ABA #021000021, for credit to Southwest
Securities Inc., Account #08805076955, for further credit to Trophy Club Municipal Utility
District No.1 Water and Sewer System Revenue Bonds, Series 2015 (#94-9030-119042),
Attn: Ms. Amanda Almanza, (214) 859-6353. Such amount is for the fees and expenses
associated with the legal authorization and issuance of the Bonds. (See Cost of Issuance
Breakdown, herein.)

6. The Paying Agent/Registrar shall wire $9,054,783.22, from the proceeds of the Bonds, to
TexPool per wiring instruction shown below:

State Street Bank and Trust Company, Boston, MA,
ABA (3400) 011 000 028

BNF (4200) - TexPool Account # 67573774

RFB (4320) — Location ID # 77384

Participant Name — Trophy Club MUD 1

For final credit by TexPool as follows:

a) 2014 WW Treatment Plant Construction Fund (OBI (6000) 449-0613300012)
in the amount (2000) of $9,039,731.00

Construction Fund Deposit includes $23,017.46 for the TCEQ
Bond Application Processing Fee (for $9,230,000 only) to be
paid by the District:

b) Revenue Interest & Sinking Fund (OBI (6000) 449-0613300013) in
the amount (2000) of $15,052.22

(Revenue 1&S Fund Deposit includes accrued interest of $10,437.22
and Bid Premium of $4,615.00)

7. Upon receipt of funds from the Purchasers, the good faith check in the amount of
$184,600.00 shall be returned uncashed (by a trackable method) to:

Luke Mattson

Raymond James & Associates
5956 Sherry Lane, 19" floor
Dallas, TX 75225

TCMUD005922
774



Closing Memorandum
Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No.1
February 9, 2015

Page 2
8. The Reconciliation of Receipts and Disbursements is as follows:
Receipts:
Par Amount of the Bonds $9,230,000.00
Plus: Accrued Interest (02/01/15 - 02/17/15) . 10,437.22
Plus Bidder's Premium 4,615.00
Total Receipts 9,245,052.22
Disbursements:
Trophy Club MUD Wastewater Treatment Plant Construction Fund $9,039,731.00
Trophy Club MUD Interest and Sinking (Revenue Debt Service
Fund) 15,052.22
First Year's Paying Agent/Registrar Fee 400.00
Costs of Issuance to be paid by Southwest Securities 189,869.00
$9.245,052.22

NOTE: Upon receipt of funds at delivery, the District will send a check in the amount of
$23,017.46 to the Texas Commission on Environmental Quality (“TCEQ”") for payment
of the TCEQ Bond Application Processing Fee. Check should be sent to the address
below:

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality
Attention: Andrew Paynter

12100 Park 35 Circle

Bldg. F - Mail Code 152

Austin, Texas 78753

TCMUD005923

3

775



SOUTHWEST
SECURITIES.

A Hilitop Holgings Company

February 9, 2015

Ms. Jennifer McKnight

General Manager

Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No.1
100 Municipal Drive

Trophy Club, Texas 76262

STATEMENT

For services rendered and expenses incurred in connection with the legal

authorization and issuance of $9,230,000 Trophy Club Municipal Utility

District No.1 Water and Sewer System Revenue Bonds, Series 2015

(See Cost of Issuance Breakdown on next page.) $189.869.00

TCMUD005924
776



TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO.1
$9,230,000 WATER AND SEWER SYSTEM REVENUE BONDS, SERIES 2015

COST OF ISSUANCE BREAKDOWN

UL Tax Bonds
Expense ltem: ! $9,230,000
Financial Advisory Fee / Expenses- Southwest Securities, Inc. - $ 86,150.00
Bond Counsel Fee /Expenses- Norton Rose Fulbright 73,650.00
Attorney General Fee (Reimbursed to Norton Rose Fulbright) 9,230.00
Ratings:
S&P 15,839.00

Paying Agent Registrar - Bank of Texas.

First Year's Paying Agent/ Registrar Fee 400.00
Official Statement (OS) Costs: )

Preparation / Printing / Internet Posting / Electronic Distribution 5,000.00
TCEQ Fee for Processing Application (0.25% of par amount)

(Based on TCEQ Application par amount of $9,230,000) 23,017.46
Total Estimated Cost of Issuance $ 213,286.46

COST OF ISSUANCE BREAKDOWN BY SOURCE OF PAYMENT

Cost of Issuance Expenses Paid from Wire to Southwest Securities

Financial Advisory Fee / Expenses- Southwest Securities, Inc. $ 86,150.00
Bond Counsel Fee /Expenses- Norton Rose Fulbright * 73,650.00
Attorney General Fee (Reimbursed to Norton Rose Fulbright) 9,230.00
S&P Rating Fee 15,839.00
Official Statement Preparation/Printing/Internet Posting/Electronic Distribution 5,000.00

§_189.860.00

Cost of Issuance Expenses Paid/Retained by the District from Construction Fund

TCEQ Fee for Processing Application (0.25% of par amount)

(Based on par amount of $9,230,000 only) 23,017.46
2301746
Cost of Issuance Expenses Retained by Paying Agent Registrar $ 400.00

Total Cost of Issuance’

2/2/2015

$ 189,869.00
23,017.46
$ 400.00

$ 21328646

TCMUD005925

77



$9,230,000

Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No.1
Water and Sewer System Revenue Bonds, Series 2015

Issuer

Ms. Jennifer McKnight

Ms. Renae Gonzales

Ms. Terri Sisk

100 Municipal Drive
Trophy Club, Texas 76262

Phone: 682-831-4610 (Jennifer)
682-831-4611 (Renae)
682-831-4618 (Terri)

Facsimile: 817-491-9312

jmcknight@tcmud.org

rgonzales@tcmud.org

tsisk@tcmud.org

Underwriter
Raymond James
5956 Sherry Lane
19" Floor

Dallas, TX 75225

Luke Mattson
214-692-9866
luke.mattson@raymondjames.com

Randall Hawkins
214-365-5546
randall.hawkins@raymondjames.com

Paying Agent/Registrar
Mr. Jose Gaytan

Ms. Anne-Marie Hansen
Bank of Texas (BOKF,NA)
Corporate Trust Services

100 Congress Ave., Suite 250

Phone: 512-813-2002 (Jose)

512-813-2001 (Anne-Marie)

Facsimile 512-813-2020
JGaytan@bankoftexas.com
AHansen@bankoftexas.com

Distribution List

Financial Advisor

Mr. Dan Almon

Southwest Securities

1201 Eim Street, Suite 3500
Dallas, Texas 75270

Phone: 214-859-9452 (Dan)
Facsimile: 214-859-9475
DAImon@swst.com

Bond Counsel

Mr. Bob Dransfield

Ms. Kristen Savant

Ms. Diane Callahan

Norton Rose Fulbright
2200 Ross Ave., Suite 2800
Dallas, Texas 75201

Phone 214-855-8068 (Bob)
214-855-8072 (Kristen)
214-855-8024 (Diane)
Facsimile 214-855-8200
Robert.Dransfield@nortonrosefutbright.com
Kristen.Savant@nortonrosefulbright.com
Diane.Callahan@nortonrosefutbright.com

TCMUD005926
778



SOUTHWEST EXHIBIT
SECURITIES.

A Hilltop Hotdings Compary

BOND DEBT SERVICE

$9,230,000
TROPHY CLUB MUD NO. 1
(Denton & Tarrant Counties, Texas)
Water & Sewer System Revenue Bonds, Series 2015
Final Numbers: As of January 20, 2015

Dated Date 02/01/2015
Delivery Date 02/17/2015

Period Annual

Ending Principal Coupon Interest Debt Service Debt Service
09/01/2015 136,988.54 136,988.54
09/30/2015 136,988.54
03/01/2016 117,418.75 117,418.75
09/01/2016 210,000 2.000% 117,418.75 327,418.75

-09/30/2016 444.837.50
03/01/2017 115,318.75 115,318.75
09/01/2017 365,000 2.000% 115,318.75 480,318.75
09/30/2017 - 595,637.50
03/01/2018 111,668.75 111,668.75
09/01/2018 375,000 2.000% 111,668.75 486,668.75
09/30/2018 598,337.50
03/01/2019 107,918.75 107,918.75
09/01/2019 380,000 2.000% 107,918.75 487,918.75
09/30/2019 595,837.50
03/01/2020 104,118.75 104,118.75
09/01/2020 390,000 2.000% 104,118.75 494,118.75
09/30/2020 598,237.50
03/01/2021 100,218.75 100,218.75
09/01/2021 400,000 2.000% 100,218.75 500,218.75
09/30/2021 600,437.50
03/01/2022 96,218.75 96,218.75
09/01/2022 410,000 2.000% 96,218.75 506,218.75
09/30/2022 602,437.50
03/01/2023 92,118.75 92,118.75
09/01/2023 420,000 2.000% 92,118.75 512,118.75
09/30/2023 604,237.50
03/01/2024 . A 87,918.75 87,918.75
09/01/2024 435,000 2.000% 87,918.75 522,918.75
09/30/2024 610,837.50
03/01/2025 83,568.75 83,568.75 '
09/01/2025 450,000 2.250% 83,568.75 533,568.75
09/30/2025 617,137.50
03/01/2026 78,506.25 78,506.25 .
09/01/2026 460,000 2.500% 78,506.25 538,506.25
09/30/2026 617,012.50
03/01/2027 ; 72,756.25 72,756.25
09/01/2027 475,000 2.500% 72,756.25 547,756.25
09/30/2027 620,512.50 °
03/01/2028 66,818.75 66,818.75
09/01/2028 490,000 2.750% 66,818.75 556,818.75
09/30/2028 623,637.50
03/01/2029 60,081.25 60,081.25
09/01/2029 510,000 2.750% 60,081.25 570,081.25
09/30/2029 630,162 50
03/01/2030 53,068.75 53,068.75
09/01/2030 525,000 3.000% 53,068.75 578,068.75
09/30/2030 631,137.50
03/01/2031 45,193.75 45,193.75
09/01/2031 545,000 3.000% 45,193.75 590,193.75
09/30/2031 635,387.50
03/01/2032 37,018.75 '37,018.75
09/01/2032 565,000 3.000% 37,018.75 602,018.75
09/30/2032 639,037.50
03/01/2033 28,543.75 28,543.75
09/01/2033 585,000 3.000% 28,543.75 613,543.75
09/30/2033 642,087.50
Jan 20, 2015 12:02 pm Prepared by Southwest Securities (AK) (Finance 7.010 Trophy Club MUD #1:WWSS-2015REV) Page 6

TCMUD005927
779



SOUTHWVEST
SECURITIES.

A Hilftap Hotdings Compary

BOND DEBT SERVICE

$9,230,000
TROPHY CLUB MUD NO. 1
(Denton & Tarrant Counties, Texas)
Water & Sewer System Revenue Bonds, Series 2015
Final Numbers: As of January 20, 2015

Period Annual
Ending Principal Coupon Interest Debt Service Debt Service
03/01/2034 19,768.75 19,768.75
09/01/2034 610,000 3.125% 19,768.75 629,768.75
09/30/2034 649,537.50
03/01/2035 10,237.50 10,237.50
09/01/2035 630,000 3.250% 10,237.50 640,237.50
09/30/2035 650,475.00
9,230,000 3,113,951.04 12,343,951.04 12,343,951.04
Jan 20, 2015 12:02 pm Prepared by Southwest Securities (AK) (Finance 7.010 Trophy Club MUD #1:WWSS-2015REV) Page 7

TCMUD005928
780



Ratings Call 01-05-15 Q&A

1)

2)

8)

Purpose of the bonds- Wastewater plant upgrade

Population and customer growth estimates- Population 10,459 (2013).
Per Ron 12-31-14, there are 82" homes under construction and 364 left to build out in Trophy
Club. As part of our FY 15 Budget, the Board set a 3.25% growth rate for meters.

Is there a minimum (take or pay) payment due to Fort Worth for water?- No.
Status of wastewater treatment plant expansion (and any other additional capital needs)-:
Currently WWTP expansion is in progress- Financed through tax and revenue bonds. No other

additional capital needs are planned to be financed this fiscal year.

Will water/sewer revenues be split into different funds, or remain consolidated in the General
Fund for audit purposes?- They will remain consolidated in the General Fund for Audit purposes

‘although they are separated in different general ledger accounts in the accounting system.

In the 2013 audit, how much of the unrestricted cash was available for utility system purposes?-
FY 13 audit had Cash of $3,954,832 in General Fund. $17,879 was in Debt Service, $330,571 was
in Capital Projects. Of the $3,606,382, $313,050 was in GASB and was restricted, $514,169 was
in Fire and not available for utility system purposes. $2,779,163 was available for utility system
purposes. :
Potential tax rate and utility rate increases {and multi-year financial projections)-

Tax rate increases are reviewed in June during the annual budget process. Utility rate increases
are reviewed annually in May as part of the annual budget process. For FY15 we do not expect a
utility rate increase. For FY 16, we will do a rate analysis in May 15 and we do expect a rate
increase of some amount to be determined.

Any policies or targets regarding debt service coverage or system liquidity (fund balances)?- *
No policies on debt service coverage. GASB 54 policy on fund balances states goal is to achieve
and maintain General Fund Unassigned Fund Balance equal to 35% of expenditures and not to
go below 25% barring unusual or deliberate circumstances.

TCMUD005929
781



INSTRUCTION SHEET

To move through this Electronic Transcript click on the Bookmark tab on the left side of
the screen.

1. Click on the Bookmark entitled Index of Documents.
2. Click on the document number to move to the document.
3. The document is searchable.

TCMUD005930
782



TRANSCRIPT OF PROCEEDINGS

RELATING TO |

$9,230,000
WATER AND SEWER SYSTEM REVENUE BONDS
. SERIES 2015

ISSUED BY
" TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT-NO. 1-
COUNTIES OF DENTON AND TARRANT

STATE OF TEXAS

Delivery: February 17, 2015

A »
NORTON ROSE FULBRIGHT

41468647.1/11411680

TCMUDO005931
783



TRANSCRIPT OF PROCEEDINGS
RELATING TO

$9,230,000
TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 1
WATER AND SEWER SYSTEM REVENUE BONDS
SERIES 2015

Dated February 1, 2015

index of Documents

Tab No. Description of Document

1 Order by the Texas Commission on Environment Quality approving an
Engineering Project and the issuance of Bonds

2 Certified Resolution approving and authorizing publication of Notice of Sale and
authorizing personnel and consultants to proceed with the arrangements for the
Bond Sale

3 Affidavit of Publication — Texas Bond Reporter

4 Affidavit of Publication — Star-Telegram, Inc.

5 Affidavit of Publication — Denton Record-Chronicle

6 Certified Bond Order

7 Paying Agent/Registrar Agreement

8 Official Bid Form

9 Notice of Sale and Preliminary Official Statement

10 Final Official Statement

11 Certificate of Certified Public Accountant

12 General Certificate

13 Signature and No-Litigation Certificate

14 Certificate as to Official Statement

15 Certificate as to Tax Exemption

16 Certificate of Managing Underwriter

17 Filed 8038-G Information Return

41468647.1/11411680
TCMUD005932
784



18 Attorney General's Opinion and Comptroller's Registration Certificate
19 Opinion of Bond Counsel &
20 Closing Instruction Letter

21 Receipt and Disbursement of Funds

22 Rating Letters

23 DTC Blanket Issuer Letter of Representations

24 Original Petition

25 Final Judgment

41468647.1/11411680
TCMUDO005933

785



TExXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY

AN ORDER APPROVING (1) AN ENGINEERING PROJECT,

(2) THE ISSUANCE OF $5,765,000 IN UNLIMITED TAX BONDS,
AND (3) THE ISSUANCE OF $9,230,000 IN REVENUE BONDS FOR
TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 1
OF DENTON AND TARRANT COUNTIES

An application by Trophy Club County Municipal Utility District No. 1 of Denton and
Tarrant Counties (hereafter “District”) was presented to the Executive Director of the Texas
Commission on Environmental Quality (TCEQ) for consideration of approval pursuant to TEX.
WATER CODE §§ 5.122 and 49.181. The District requests approval of an engineering project, the
issuance of up to $15,000,000 in bonds to finance improvements to the District’s existing
wastewater treatment plant. The TCEQ has jurisdiction to consider this matter, and the
following Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law are appropriate after examining the
application and supporting documentation.

FINDINGS OF FACT

1. The District filed an application with the TCEQ on September 24, 2013, for approval
of a proposed engineering project and the issuance of the issuance of up to $15,000,000 in
bonds. By Resolution No. 2013-0827A dated August 27, 2013, the District requested to issue up
to $5,769,217 in unlimited tax and/or unlimited tax and revenue bonds and up to $9,230,783 in
revenue bonds, for a total request of $15,000,000. Application material supports the issuance
of $5,765,000 in unlimited tax bonds and $9,230,000 in revenue bonds.

2. The Executive Director has investigated the District.

3. The application and accompanying documents have been examined, and a
memorandum was prepared on the project dated January 31, 2014, a copy of which is attached
and made a part hereof.

4. The District’s project and issuance of $14,995,000 ($5,765,000 in unlimited tax
bonds and $9,230,000 in revenue bonds) in bonds at a maximum net effective interest rate of
6.23% to finance the project should be approved.

5. The District’s board should be directed to ensure that system revenue is adequate to
meet operating expenses and debt service requirements on revenue debt.

6. The District should be directed not to expend a total of $12,991,567 ($11,297,015 for
construction plus $1,694,552 in contingencies) for the wastewater treatment plant
improvements pending District board’s receipt of plans and specifications approved by all
entities with jurisdiction, as necessary.

TCMUD005934
786



,7. The District should be advised that the legal, fiscal agent, and enginéering fees have
not been evaluated to determine whether these fees are reasonable or competitive. These fees
are included as presented in the engineering report.

8. The District should be directed that any surplus bond proceeds resulting from the
sale of bonds at a lower interest rate than that proposed shall be shown as a contingency line
item in the Official Statement and the use of such funds shall be subject to approval pursuant to
TCEQ rules on surplus funds.

CONCLUSIONS OF LAW

1. The TCEQ has jurisdiction to consider the engineering réport and bond application.
pursuant to TEX. WATER CODE § 49.181.

2. The Executive Director has investigated the District, and the TCEQ has found it
legally organized and feasible.

3. The TCEQ’s memorandum dated January 31,2014, on this engineering project and
bond issue should be adopted as the written TCEQ project report in compliance with TEX.
WATER CODE § 49.181(d).

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDERED BY THE TEXAS COMMISSION ON
ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY that the TCEQ’s memorandum dated January 31, 2014, on this
engineering project and bond issue is adopted as the written TCEQ project report. Pursuant to
TEX. WATER CODE § 49.181, the engineering project for Trophy Club Municipal Utility District
No. 1 of Denton and Tarrant Counties is hereby approved together with the issuance of
$14,995,000 ($5,765,000 in unlimited tax bonds and $9,230,000 in révenue bonds) in bonds at
a maximum net effective interest rate of 6.23%. The District’s board is directed to ensure that
system revenue is adequate to meet operating expenses and debt service requirements on
revenue debt. The District is directed not to expend a total of $12,991,567 ($11,297,015 for
construction plus $1,694,552 in contingencies) of the bond issue proceeds approved herein for
the wastewater treatment plant improvements pending District board’s receipt of plans and
specifications approved by all entities with jurisdiction, as necessary. The District is advised
that the legal, fiscal agent, and engineering fees have not been evaluated to determine whether
these fees are reasonable or competitive. These fees are included as presented in the
engineering report. The District is directed that any surplus bond proceeds resulting from the
sale of bonds at a lower interest rate than that proposed shall be shown as a contingency line
item in the Official Statement and the use of such funds shall be subject to approval pursuant to
TCEQ rules on surplus funds. The approval of the sale of these bonds herein shall be valid for
one year from the date of this Order unless extended by written authorization of the TCEQ staff.

BE IT FURTHER ORDERED that pursuant to TEX. WATER CODE § 5.701, the District
shall pay to the Commission 0.25% of the principal amount of bonds actually issued not later
than the seventh (7th) business day after receipt of the bond proceeds. The fees shall be paid by
check payable to thé Texas Commission on Environmental Quality.

TCMUDO005935
787



BE IT FURTHER ORDERED that to enable the TCEQ to carry out the responsibilities
imposed by TEX. WATER CODE §§ 49.181-182, the District shall; (1) furnish the Utilities and
District’s Section copies of all bond issue project construction documentation outlined under 30
TEX. ADMIN. CODE § 293.62, including detailed progress reports and as-built plans required by
TEX. WATER CODE § 49.277(b), which have not already been submitted; (2) notify the Utilities
and District’s Section and obtain approval of the TCEQ for any substantial alterations in the
engineering project approved herein before making such alterations; and (3) ensure, as required
by TEX. WATER CODE § 49.277(b), that all construction financed with the proceeds from the sale
of bonds is completed by the construction contractor according to the plans and specifications
contracted.

BE IT FURTHER ORDERED that failure of said District to comply with all applicable
laws and with provisions of this Order shall subject the District and its directors to all penalties
that are provided by law and shall further be considered by the TCEQ as grounds for refusal to
approve other bonds of the District.

The Chief Clerk of the TCEQ is directed to forward the District a copy of this Order.
If any provision, sentence, clause, or phrase of this Order is for any reason held to be

invalid, the invalidity of any portion shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of the
Order.

Issue Date: February 6, 2014

PO LA

For the Commission”

TCMUDO005936

788



Texas Commission on Environmental Quality

k\ TECHNICAL MEMORANDUM
To: ,&%87 Tammy Benter, Manager Date: January 31, 2014
Utilities and Districts Section

Thru:é&dﬁustin P. Taack, Water Supply Division
\S

Subject:  Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1 of Denton and Tarrant Counties;
Application for Approval of $15,000,000 in Unlimited Tax Bonds and Revenue
Bonds, Sixth Issue, 6.23% Net Effective Interest Rate, Series 2014; Pursuant to
Texas Water Code Section 49.181.
TCEQ Internal Control No. D-09242013-030 (TC)
CN: 600678536 RN: 101241248

4

A. GENERAL INFORMATION

The Texas Commissicn on Environmental Quality (TCEQ) received an application from Trophy
Club Municipal Utility District No. 1 of Denton and Tarrant Counties (the “District”) requesting
approval for the issuance of $15,000,000 in bonds to finance improvements to the District’s
existing wastewater treatment plant. By Resolution No. 2013-0827A dated August 27, 2013, the
District requested to issue up to $5,769,217 in unlimited tax and/or unlimited tax and revenue
bonds and up to $9,230,783 in revenue bonds, for a total request of $15,000,000. Application
material supports the issuance of $5,765,000 in unlimited tax bonds and $9,230,000 in revenue
bonds. '

According to documentation provided, the District currently setves 4,180 equivalent single~
family connections (ESFCs) on approximately 2,688 acres.
¥

B. ECONOMIC ANALYSIS ‘
Tax Rate Analysis — Tax[Revenué Supported Debt

The feasibility of this bond issue is based on no-growth to the 4,180 connections as of December
31, 2013. The feasibility of the tax supported debt is based on no-growth to the District’s
January 1, 2013 certified taxable assessed valuation of $1,047,277,474 ($756,915,943 for the
portion of the District within Denton County and $290,361,531 for the portion of the District
within Tarrant County). The feasibility of the revenue supparted debt is based on revenues
earned by the District through services provided to the District’s customers. A marlket study has
not been provided, and is not required since the feasibility is based on no-growth.

According to the Denton Central Appraisal District and a Tarrant Appraisal District certificate,
the District’s January 1, 2013 certified taxable assessed valuation for each respective county is
$756,915,943 and $290,361,531, or a total of $1,047,277,474. The annual debt service
requirements for the requested bond (tax supported) amount of $5,765,000 and existing debt
averages $838,78¢ for the 21-year life of the District’s bond debt. According to the engineering
report, the District levied a maintenance tax of $0.01 in 2012 and according to information
provided, is projecting to levy the same maintenance tax in the future.

TCMUDO005937
789



Tammy Benter, Manager
Page 2
January 31, 2014

The District’s financial advisor submitted a cash flow schedule considering the requested
$5,765,000 bond issue (tax supported), no-growth to the District’s January 1, 2013 certified
taxable assessed valuation of $1,047,277,474, a bond interest rate of 6%, 95% collection rate,
and a projected tax rate of $0.11 (maximum) per $100 assessed value, A Water Supply Division
financial analyst has reviewed the financial information submitted and concluded that the
following level debt service tax rate would be sufficient.

Projected
Tax Rate
District
Debt Service $0.11 W
Maintenance $001 ®
Sub-Total District Taxes $0.12
Town of Trophy Club $050 @
Town of Westlake $0.16 @
Total District Taxes $062 ®

Notes:

(1) Based on a net effective interest rate of 6.23%, a 95% collection rate, no~growth to the District’s January 1,
2013 certified taxable assessed valuation of $1,047,277,474, and at least a 25% ending debt service fimd
balance.

(2) The term “commission-approved tax rate” in 30 Texas Administrative Code (TAC) Section 293,85 refers to
an initial ad valorem debt service tax of at most $0.11 per $100 assessed valuation.

(3) Based on the operating budget provided, the District anticipates an operation and maintenance (General
Fund) tax rate of $0.01.

(4) Represents 2013 total tax rates based on information obtained from the Denton Central Appraisal District.
Information provided does not specify how much, if any, of each total tax rate is attributable to water,
wastewater, drainage, recreational , or road facilities as required by 30 TAC Section 293.59(f). As a result,
staff has included the total tax in order to determine compliance with 30 TAC Sections 293.59(1) and (k)(3).

(5) Represents the combined projected tax rate as defined by 30 TAC Section 293.59(f). The highest combined
projected tax rate is the portion of the District that overlaps with the Town of Trophy Club ($0.62), which is
less than the $1.20 limit allowed under 30 TAC Sections 293.59(1) and (k)(3).

The District’s financial advisor submitted a cash flow schedule considering the requested
$0,230,000 bond issue {revenue supported) and a bond interest rate of 6%. The cash flow
schedule provided indicates $1,990,339 ($7,461,907 in revenue less $5,471,568 in expenses)
being available for the District’s current and proposed debt service requirements. According to
the application material, the $1,990,339 is based on: the District’s 2012 fiscal year end audit; no
additional growth projected for revenue based calculations (e.g. service revenue, etc.); and
assumes no capital expenses that were accounted for in said fiscal year end. A Water Supply
Division financial analyst has reviewed the financial information submitted and concluded that
operating revenues appear to be sufficient for operating expenses and the District’s current and
proposed revenue debt. This determination is based on the following: the District’s current
operating budget provided (2013); no additional growth projected for revenue based
calculations (e.g. service revenue, etc.); excluding capital expenses and debt service
requirements that were/are accounted for in the current operating budget provided; and the
District's general fund balance of approximately $3,013,446 as of May 31, 2013 (as presented in
the engineering report).

TCMUDO005938

790



Tammy Benter, Manager
Page 3 .
January 31, 2014

Additional Financial Comments

The District is exempt from the 75% and 25% build-out requirements of 30 TAC Sections
203.59(1)(4) and 293.59(k)(7), respectively, based on its combined no-growth tax rate of $0.62.
being less than $1.20 pursuant to Sections 293.59(1) and 293.59(k)(11)(C).

C. ENGINEERING ANALYSIS
& !‘

ter

The District’s source of water is treated surface water from the City of Fort Worth pursuant to a
“Contract For Water Service Between The City Of Fort Worth, Texas, And Trophy Club
Municipal Utility District No. 1” dated September 16, 2010 (revised from previous bond issue).
The following table summarizes the water supply facilities serving the District along with the
ESFC capacity of each component based on criteria stated in 30 TAC Section 290.45:

Minimum Total Capacity. )

Eacility Requirements (ESFCs)

Ground . 6,000,000 gal.

Storage 200 gal/BSFC (44 500 ESFCS)®

1

’ 900,000 gal.
Elevated Storage 100 gal/ESFC (9,000 ESFCs)

Booster 2 gpm/ESFC or 13,500 gpm

Pump 1,000 gpm max. (6,750 ESFCs)

Note; (1) Total storage of 6,500,000 gallons provides for 34,500 equivalent single-family connections (ESFC) at 200
gpd per ESFC.

The District’s water supply facilities appear adequate to serve the existing 4,180 connections
upon which the feasibility of this bond issue is based.

Wastewater Treatment

Wastewater treatment for the District is provided by the District’s 1.75 million gallons per day
wastewater treatment plant. Under TPDES Permit No. WQ0011593001, the plant is authorized
to discharge 1.75 million gallons per day. Based on the indicated flow factor of 300 gallons per
day per ESFC, the District’s 1.75 million gallons per day plant can serve 5,833 ESFCs. The
District’s wastewater treatment plant capacity appears adequate to serve the existing 4,180
connections upon which the feasibility of this bond issue is based.

TCMUD005939
791



Tammy Benter, Manager
Page 4
January 31, 2014

According to the engineering report, the effective treatment capacity of the plant’s processes and
infrastructure has been reduced as a result of lowering of permit requirements. The proposed
bond issue (tax and revenue supported) includes funds to finance improvements to the District's
plant. According to the engineering report, the project (plant improvements) will be divided
into two phases to allow continuation of plant operations during construction.

Storm Water Drainage

Storm water from the Drainage generally drains through underground lines and swales, which
eventually outfall into Lake Grapevine,

Purchase of Existing Facilities and/or Assumption of Existing Contracts — None.
Facilities to be Constructed

Project Estimated Costs®
Wastewater Treatment Plant
Improvements $11,297,015

Note: (1) Estimated costs as presented in the engineering report. The $11,297,015 includes funds for both phases;
$5,777,199 for Phase 1A and $5,519,816 for Phase 1B.

Approved plans and specifications, and various construction contract documents have not been
provided.

D. SUMMARY OF COSTS

Construction Costs District’s Share ©
A. Developer Contribution Items — None.
B. District Items

1. Wastewater Treatment Plant Improvemernts $ 11,297,015
2. Contingencies (15% of Item No. 1) 1,694,552
3. Engineering (12% of Item Nos. 1 and 2) 1.561.000
Total District Items $ 14,552,567
Total Construction Costs $ 14,552,567
Non-Construction Costs
A. Legal Fees (0.5%) $ 154,975 @
B. Fiscal Agent Fees 154,975 @
C. Bond Issuance Expense 60,000
TCMUD005940

792



Tammy Benter, Manager

Page 5
January 31, 2014

D. Bond Application Report Costs 20,000

E. Attorney General Fee (0.10%) 14,995 @

F. TCEQ Bond Issuance Fee (0.25%) " 37488 @
Total Non-Construction Costs ! $ 442433

Total Bond Issue Requirement $ 14,995,000

Notes:

F.

(1) The facilities requested for funding are considered exempt from the 30% developer contribution
requirement of 30 TAC Section 293.47. .

(2) Represents the respective fees for the tax supported ($5,765,000) and revenue supported ($9,230,000)
bond issuances. Pursuant to the contract, fees are 1.5% of the first $3,000,000 of bonds issued, plus 1.0% of
the bonds issued from $3,000,000 to $5,000,000, plus 0.5% the bonds issued above $5,000,000.

(3) Represents the respective fees for the tax supported ($5,765,000) and revenue supported ($9,230,000)
bond issuances. Pursuant to the contract, fees are 1.5% of the first $3,000,000 of bonds issued, plus 1.0% of
the bonds issued from $3,000,000 to $5,000,000, plus 0.5% the bonds issued above $5,000,000.

(4) Represents the respective fees for the tax supported ($5,765,000) and revenue supported ($9,230,000)

~ bond issuances.

SPECIAL CONSIDERATIONS - None.

CONCILUSION,

Based on the indicated $27,004,217 in bonds approved by voters, and $21,325,000
previously approved by the TCEQ and/or issued by the District, the District appears to have
sufficient voter-authorized bonds ($5,769,217) for the proposed tax supported portion
($5,765,000) of the bond issuance.

Voter authorization is not required for the proposed revenue portion ($9,230,000) of the
bond issuance. Based on the review of the financial information submitted, operating
revenues appear to be sufficient for operating expenses and the District’s current and
proposed revenue debt.

Based on the review of the engineering report and supporting documents, the bond issue is
considered feasible and meets the economic feasibility criteria established by 30 TAC
Section 293.59.

The recommendations are made under authority delegated by the Executive Director of the
Texas Commission on Environmental Quality.

TCMUDO005941
793



Tammy Bentier, Manager
Page 6
January 31, 2014

G. MMENDATION

1.

Approve the bond issue in the total amount of $14,995,000 ($5,765,000 in unlimited tax
bonds and $9,230,000 in revenue bonds) in accordance with the recommended summary of
costs, at 2 maximum net effective interest rate of 6.23%.

. Direct the District’s board to ensure that system revenue is adequate to meet operating

expenses and debt service requirements on revenue debt.

. Direct the District not to expend a total of $12,991,567 ($11,297,015 for construction plus

$1,604,552 in contingencies) for the wastewater treatment plant improvements pending
District board’s receipt of plans and specifications approved by all entities with jurisdiction,
as necessary.

. Standard recommendations regarding consultant fees, surplus proceeds, time of approval,

and bond proceeds fee apply.

TCMUDO005942

794



CERTIFICATE OF SECRETARY

THE STATE OF TEXAS §
§ TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY
COUNTIES OF DENTON AND TARRANT § DISTRICT NO. 1

I, the undersigned, Secretary of the Board of Directors of the Trophy Club Municipal
Utility District No. 1,,DO HEREBY CERTIFY as follows:

1. On the 4™ day of December, 2014, a special meeting of the Board of Directors
(the "Board") of the Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1 (the "District") was held at a
meeting place within the District; the duly constituted members of the Board being as follows: .

JAMES (JIM) MOSS PRESIDENT

JIM HASE VICE PRESIDENT

KEVIN R. CARR SECRETARY/TREASURER
JAMES C. THOMAS DIRECTOR

NEIL TWOMEY DIRECTOR

and all of said persons were présent at said meeting, except the following: _None . Among
other business considered at said meeting, the attached resolution entitled:

RESOLUTION NO. 2014-1204A

"A RESOLUTION authorizing appropriate personnel and consultants to proceed
with arrangements and the preparation of documents for the issuance
and sale of revenue bonds; approving and authorizing publication of a
notice of sale with respect to issuance and sale of such bonds; and
resolving other matters incident and related thereto"

was introduced and submitted to the Board for passage and adoption. After presentation and
due consideration of the resolution, and upon a motion being made and and seconded, the
resolution was finally passed and adopted by the Board to be effective immediately by the
following vote: :

5  voted "For" 0___ voted "Against” 0 abstained
all as shown in the official minutes of the Board for the meeting held on the aforesaid date.

2. The attached resolution is a true and correct copy of the original on file in the
official records of the District; the duly qualified and acting members of the Board on the date of
the aforesaid meeting are those persons shown above and, according to the records of my
office, advance notice of the time, place and purpose of the meeting was given to each member
of the Board; and that said meeting, and the deliberation of the aforesaid public business, was
open to the public and written notice of said meeting, including the subject of the above entitled
resolution, was posted and given in advance thereof in compliance with the provisions of Texas
Government Code, Chapter 551, as amended.

41210585.1/11411680

TCMUDO005943
795



IN WITNESS WHEREQF, | have hereunto signed my name officially and affixed the seal

of said District, this the 4™ day of December, 2014.

- Secretary, Board of Directors
awwhi i, Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1
\‘\\\‘l 9‘19'8'-{”0///’/
SRl
> oz
Z A A
= 2z =
Z &3
”/, }E).(A?O\\\s
7, STRICT Y\
‘o
41210585.1/11411680 [signature page of Certificate of Secretary]

TCMUDO005944
796



RESOLUTION NO. 2014-1204A .

A RESOLUTION authorizing appropriate personnel and consultants to proceed
with arrangements and the preparation of documents for the issuance
and sale of revenue bonds; approving and authorizing publication of a
notice of sale with respect to issuance and sale of such bonds; and
resolving other matters incident and related thereto

WHEREAS, thé Board of Directors (the "Board") of the Trophy Club Municipal Utility
District No. 1 (the "District") has determined that revenue bonds should be issued and sold in a
principal amount not to exceed $9,230,000; and

WHEREAS, the Board hereby finds and determines that it is now proper to (1) authorize
appropriate personnel and consultants to proceed with arrangements and the preparation of
documents for the issuance and sale of revenue bonds and (2) authorize the publication of a
notice of sale with respect to such bonds with a tentative sale date of January 20, 2015,
pursuant to the provisions of Texas Water Code, Section 49.183;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE
TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 1:

SECTION 1: The General Manager for the District, together with the District's financial
advisor, Southwest Securities, Inc. and bond counsel, Fulbright & Jaworski LLP, a member of
Norton Rose Fulbright, are hereby authorized and directed to proceed on behalf of the District
with the preparation of the documents and to make the appropriate arrangements for the
offering and sale of revenue bonds in a principal amount not to exceed $8,230,000.* The
General Manager and other appropriate officials of the District are hereby authorized and
directed to assist and furnish said consultants with information and data necessary for the
preparation of an official statement and other documents for a sale of such bonds to occlir and
be approved by the Board of Directors at a meeting to be held on or about January 20, 2015.

SECTION 2: The Secretary of the Board of Directors is hereby authorized and directed
to cause a notice of sale relating to the sale of revenue bonds to be published (1) at least one
time not less than 10 days before the date of sale in a newspaper of general circulation in the
county or counties in which the District is located and (2) at least one time in one or more
recognized financial publications of general circulation in the State of Texas as approved by the
State Attorney General; such notice of sale to read substantially in the form and content of
Exhibit A hereto attached and incorporated herein by reference as a’part of this Resolution for
all purposes.

SECTION 3: It is officially found, determined and declared that the meeting at which
this Resolution is adopted was open to the public and public notice of the time, place and
subject matter of the public business to be considered at such meeting, including this
Resolution, was given, all as required by all as required by Texas Government Code, Chapter
551, as amended.

SECTION 4: This Resolution shall be in force and effect from and after its passage on
_ the date shown below.

41210574.1/11411680

TCMUDO005945
797



PASSED AND ADOPTED, this December 4, 2014.

TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY
DISTRICT NO. 1

..

Jim MossFresident
Board of Pirectors

ATTEST:

fore

Kevin R. Carr, Secretary/Treasurer
Board of Directors

\\“\\““l[,,

CLUgm
O ‘?‘\{"di
SRy

/s
"’
(D

41210574.1/11411680 [signature page of Resolution]

TCMUDO005946
798



Exhibit A

$9,230,000
TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 1
(A political subdivision of the State of Texas located in Denton and Tarrant Counties, Texas)
WATER AND SEWER SYSTEM REVENUE BONDS, SERIES 2015
Selling: January 20, 2015
Bids due 11:00 a.m. Central Standard Time ("CST")

4

Place and Time of Award: The District will consider the award of the sale of the Bonds on
January 20, 2015 at 6:00 P.M., C.S.T., at the District's Office, 100 Municipal Drive, Trophy Club,
Texas 76262. Action will be taken immediately by the Board of Directors of the District to
accept or reject the best bid. Each bidder must deliver a bank Cashier's Check in the amount of
$184,600, payable to the order of Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1, as a good faith
deposit to the District's Financial Advisor, Dan Almon, Southwest Securities, 1201 Elm St., Swte
3500, Dallas, Texas 75270,-by 11:00 A.M., C.S.T. on the date of the sale.

Address of the Bids Delivered in Person: Sealed written bids, plainly marked "Bid for Bonds"
should be addressed to the Board of Directors of Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1,
and delivered to Dan Almon, Southwest Securities, 1201 Elm St., Suite 3500, Dallas, Texas
75270, by 11:00 A.M., C.S.T. on January 20, 2015. All bids must be signed and submitted on
the "Official Bid Form".

Electronic Bidding Procedures: Any prospective bidder that intends to submit an electronic
bid must submit its electronic bid through the facilities of the Ipreo Holdings LLC, PARITY
System by 11:00 A.M., C.S.T., on January 20, 2015 as described in the "Official Notice of Sale”
described below.

Information: The Bonds are more completely described in the "Official Notice of Sale", "Official
Bid Form" and the "Preliminary Official Statement” for the Bonds which may be obtained from
Dan Almon, Southwest Securities, 1201 Elm St., Suite 3500, Dallas, Texas 75270, Financial
Advisor to the District.

All bidders must submit a SIGNED OFFICIAL BID FORM prior to the time of sale, which is
11:.00 AM., CS.T. on January 20, 2015, to Dan Almon, Southwest Securities, 1201 Elm St.,
Suite 3500, Dallas, Texas 75270 in accordance with the Official Notice of Sale. The bldder
whose bid is the winning bid in accordance with the Official Notice of Sale will be notified
immediately. .
The District reserves the right to reject any or all bids for the Bonds and to waive any and all
irregularities except time of filing. This notice does not constitute an offer to sell the Bonds but
is merely notice of sale of the Bonds as required by law. The offer to sell the Bonds will be
made only by means of the "Official Notice of Sale", the "Preliminary Official Statement" and the
"Official Bid Form" for the Bonds.

This Notice of Sale supersedes and replaces any previously published Notice of Sale for the
Bonds.

Board of Directors
Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1

41210574.1/11411680

TCMUD005947
799



	Page 1
	Page 2
	Page 3
	Page 4
	Page 5
	Page 6
	Page 7
	Page 8
	Page 9
	Page 10
	Page 11
	Page 12
	Page 13
	Page 14
	Page 15
	Page 16
	Page 17
	Page 18
	Page 19
	Page 20
	Page 21
	Page 22
	Page 23
	Page 24
	Page 25
	Page 26
	Page 27
	Page 28
	Page 29
	Page 30
	Page 31
	Page 32
	Page 33
	Page 34
	Page 35
	Page 36
	Page 37
	Page 38
	Page 39
	Page 40
	Page 41
	Page 42
	Page 43
	Page 44
	Page 45
	Page 46
	Page 47
	Page 48
	Page 49
	Page 50
	Page 51
	Page 52
	Page 53
	Page 54
	Page 55
	Page 56
	Page 57
	Page 58
	Page 59
	Page 60
	Page 61
	Page 62
	Page 63
	Page 64
	Page 65
	Page 66
	Page 67
	Page 68
	Page 69
	Page 70
	Page 71
	Page 72
	Page 73
	Page 74
	Page 75
	Page 76
	Page 77
	Page 78
	Page 79
	Page 80
	Page 81
	Page 82
	Page 83
	Page 84
	Page 85
	Page 86
	Page 87
	Page 88
	Page 89
	Page 90
	Page 91
	Page 92
	Page 93
	Page 94
	Page 95
	Page 96
	Page 97
	Page 98
	Page 99
	Page 100

