
oo 
,zt 
oo 
v) 
cz 
co 
CI 

,' 
c.) 
E-0 



3 1 li 

ihis  11111111 

pi!  

if  
A 1  

11 i1 

p 
 

I 
— 

:i.0".bM411-AbtkrOrt'sNfkaoced-avt•TplittN.,:_ ,ii, 

a 

T
C

M
U

D
00

58
49

 



T
C

M
U

D
00

58
5 0

 



T
C

M
U

D
00

58
51

 

EL 

W
a
te

r  
/-

W
a
st

e
w

a
te

r  
 

W
a
te
r
 [W

a
s
te

w
a
te

r  
	 I 

3 •• 

1.4 
ca. 

ai 
:ro 

g,: 
c 
is  
cc 

I 

vl 
03 

til 
co 

W
a
te

r  
/
 W

a
st

e
w

at
e
r  
 

,S. 

,' 
t 

0 '1... 0-. 
o 
IC 

..,a. 

..„.... 

ro 

‘6  CO. 

tii 

5 
c 
CO 

ce 

c 
01 
cc, ' P

e
rs

on
a
l 
P

ro
p
e
rt

y
  P

u
rc

h
as

e;
  
 

• 

E  
c 

cc ' v
e

h
ic

le
s  

P
u
rc

h
a
se
.
 
 

W
a
te

r
  /
  W

a
st

e
w

at
e
r
  
 

-mi 
c• 

,tc ' S
e
tt
le

m
e
nt

  A
g
re

e
m

e
n
t  

W
a

te
r  
/W

a
st

e
w

a
te

r
  
 

. .. 
13 c- 

cc [ F
ire

  T
ru

ck
 
 

W
a
te

r  
W

a
s
te

w
a
te

r  
 

C . 0 _.,-.. 
4 1/), 

..•.• 

.. 
'15  C 

4.) cc 

.L. .0,,, 

• W
a
te

r
  /
  W

a
st

e
w

a
te
r
'
 
 

00 . 
'5 = 

co 
cc [W

a
s
te

w
a
te

r 	
I
 

III i. 
3 

..,, 
fa 
3 

4,  
C 

° ° 
5  v' 

0  g 

M 
lit  
.th 

0 
0 
o 

0 
' 

l 
3
, 2

0
0

,0
0 0

1
  

0 
0 

ll:1 
ifi 

0 
0 

cc,  
N 

0, 00000 
0 
Ct 

LO 
M ' 

0 
0 

1-1 

0. 
CD 

M. 
eis  

0 
0 

d- 
in 
CTI“ 

(
 
4
,5

4
9
,5

2
2
'  

_I 	
4

5
8

,6
09

1  rst 
et 

0' 
et 

0 
0 

0 
m 

0 
.0 

6 
111.  

e-.100N0•00/0 
OD 
40 

O.' 
0.  

0 
0 

6 
N 

0 
0 

6 
N 

CO 
01 

.4i` 
I-1 
rri 

0 
0 

oc' 
-V. 

[ 	
3

3
0

,0
0
0
'  

0 
0 

6 
0 
6.i 

0 
0 

Lo 
RI 

00. 00,0 

0 
0 

6 
I-1 

c4ri  

0 
0 

LIT 
et 

0 
12. 

LIT, 
01 

O a 

, 	ci 
a fi la < 
L./ 

(V 
0 

i-i 

•,, 
I-1 

,i 

".... 
et 
'gr.< 

ei 

rn 

'4.4 

0 ri 

N 

r4I e-I . 

.4  

r4 -,Fer  

4 

4
/2

5
/2

0
0
2
1
  

csi .-, 

in 

0 

isi .......; 
ri -s r.1 

< < < 

, 

CI 0 

. 

T
C

E
Q

  

A
m

o
u

n
t 
A

p
p

ro
v
e
d

 
 

0- 

i ei 

c-1 
VI. 

141 

3
,2

0
0
,0

06
j 

.r.- m 

N
/A

  

in i-i 
mi 

o 
4 

v
/ N

 	
-1  

N
I A

 I 
•-.4. 

0 

nr 

.".... "... ,,,.. ",... 

JO 

Lel 

-CfI 

CR 

0 
3 
vl 

.:.^. 

C 
0. 
CO 

W
W

  &
 S

S
  C

o
m

b
 U

L
 T
ax

  &
 R

ev
  B

o
n

d
s
,  S

er
ie

s  
1

97
6
 (M

11  
 

W
W

 &
 S S

 to
m

b
 U

L
 T
a

x  
&

•  R
e

v
  B

o
n

d
s
,  S

e
ri
e

s  
1

9
80

  (
M

1
)  
 

&
 S

S
  C

o
m

b
  U

L
  T

a
x  

&
 R

e
v  

B
o

nd
s,

  S
er

ie
s
  1

98
3

 (
M

1
)  
 

IU
L T

a
x  

R
ef

u
n
d

in
g

  B
o
nd

s,
  S

e
ri

e
s  

1.
9

8
7

 (
M

1
)  

IU
L T

a
x
  B

o
n
d
s,

  S
e

ri
e

s
  1

98
8

 (
M

2
)  

IQ  
L 

T
ax

  B
on

dS
,  S

e
ri

e
s  
1
5
8
8

,(
M

3
)  

IP
u b

 P
ro

p
e
rt

y
  F

in
an

c
e

  C
o
nt

ra
ct

l 
O

b
lig

,  S
er

ie
t 
1
9
8
9
  (
M

1
)  

IW
W

 &
 S
S

 C
o
m

b
  U

L
 T
ax

  &
 R

ev
  B

o
n

d
s,

  S
er

ie
s
  1

9
9

1
 (

M
1

) 	
I 

l 'U
L

 T
a
x  

R
e
fu

n
d

in
g

  B
o
nd

s,
  S

e
ri
es

  1
9

9
3

 (
M

1
)  

IU
L

 Ta
x  

R
ef

u
n
d

in
g

  B
o

n
d

s
,  
S

er
ie

s
1

9
9S

 (
M

2
)  

IP
u b

 P
ro

p
e
rt

y
  F

in
a
n
ce

  C
o
n
tr

a
ct

'l 
O

b
lig

,  S
e

ri
es

  1
9

9
6
 (

M
1
)  

„
.  

 
IW

W
  &

  S
S

 C
o
m

b
 U

L
 T
a

x  
&

 R
ev

  R
ef
  B

en
d
s,

  S
e
ri
e
s
  1

9
9
7

 (
M

1
) 	

I 
IP

ub
 P

ro
p
e
rt
y
  F

in
a
n
ce

  C
o

n
tr

e
ct
'l
 O
b
lig

,  S
e

rie
s
  1

9
9 5

 (
M

1
) 	

_I
  

IU
l: 

T
ax

  B
o
n

d
s.

  S
e
ri

e
s  

2
0

0
2

 (
M

2
)  

IU
L
 Ta

x  
R

ef
u
n

d
in

g
  B

o
nd

s,
  S

e
ri

e
s  

2
0
0
3
 (

M
1
)  

-
 

I 

2 .... 
M 
0 
0 
N 
61 
`C 

0 
co 

es 
1' 
-1 

lP
u
b
 P

ro
p
e
rt
y
. F

in
a
n

ce
  C

on
tr

a
ct
')
 O
b
lig

,  S
e

ri
e

s  
2

0
0
4
  (
M

1
)  _

  
. 	

- 	
- 

IU
L

  T
a

x  
R

ef
u
n
d
in

g
  B

o
nd

s
;  S

e
ri

e
s  

2
0

0
5,

(M
2

)  

0/
 

 

tP
U

b
 P

ro
p
e
rt

V
  F
in

a
n
ce

  C
on

tr
a
e

l
 O
b
lig

,  S
er

ie
s  

2
0

07
 (
M

1
)  

x
 

IP
ub

 P
ro

p
e
rt
y
  F

in
a
n
ce

  C
o
nt

ra
a

l
 ()

W
ig

,  S
e

ri
e

s
/0

0
9

  (
M

1
) 	

_  
. 	

.  
 

ru
L  T

a
x
  B

on
d
s,

  S
e
ri
e
t  

2
0

1
0

 (M
1 )

 

•"",' -1 
X.1 
N. 
.-1 
0 
N 

t, 
0.1 
VI 
iq.' 
13 , 
0 
03 

X 

0 

i.... Ai 
' 
4..1  

IR
eV

en
u

e
  N

oi
e,

  S
e
ri

e
s  

2
0

12
 (
M

1
1

  

IR
ev

e
n
u
e
  N

ot
e
,  S

e
ri

e
s  

2 0
1

3
 (

M
1
)  

[C
IL

 T
a

x  
R

ef
u
n
d

in
g

  B
on

d
s,

  S
e
ri
eS

  2
0

13
 (
M

1
)  

IU
L

 Ta
x
  B

on
d

s,
  S

er
ie

s
  2

0
1

4
  (

P
ro

p
o
se

d
)  
(M

1
)  

R
e

ve
n

ue
  B

o
n
d
s,

  S
e

ri
es

  2
0
1
4
 (

P
ro

po
se

d
)  
(M

1
)  
 



APPtIMX Sit 	 
CÓNSTRUCTION:CONTRACT C.HterCLIST 

District 
0ond,Issue: 	  
Engineer: 	  
Construction Contract .1bbNo. 	COntract No, 	• Date (of extejltion) 
For: 

Contractor! 	 Contract Amount: 	  Prefmanced by: ‘ 

1, CONSTRUCTION PLANS 3. CONSTRUCTIONPAY 8:sti1kits 
Comments ,Pläns (Sbeits) w/ Engr,,Seal Date Est..No. 	Ara 'to Date 

Slediacatioas (AA& 	___).:Scal 1 
TOO Approval 2 

. 	Wei& 1 
WasfOget (Ibrtreatment plant) 4 Wastewater Or c011ection system ifno City review) 

5 
Outity Enge. Approval (Diainagey 6 

Flood Control DištriOt APprOval (Drainage) 7 
city Approvals (it* City or ETI) • 8 
Recorded Plat 9‘ 
Other: IQ 

11 
12 

2, CONTRACT DOCUMENTS 15 
Bid Abertising Affidavits 14 
Bid Tabulation 15 
Eng, Recommendation 
Exec. Contract w/ Proposal Cbg, Ord. -TCEQ 

Performance Bond 	Payment Bond Date. No. Amount Approval 
Notite to Proceed 

2 
 	3 

COMMENTS & NOTES: 	 4 
5 

4. CONTRACT COMPLETION DOCUMENTS  
S Test gesnits 

Notice 4-Final Inspection 
TCP.0 Inšpectioti (Dist. No. , 	) 
Eng!. Cer6ficate of Completion (see App. 3b) 
contractor's Affidavit of Bills Paid 
Letter of Acceptanee 

46 

TCMUD005852 
704 



010  

oIo  
tr) 

o 

0) 

,o 
o 
,C) 
.0 

o 
o to 

o. o 
o 
o 

a 
<- 5> 
ta" 
.5D CP 

:o 
vr- 

8 
0 
S- 

o o 

cNI 

LOE 
CV 

L0" o 
o 
o o o o 
Lc) 

o 

o o 
•••• 

o o 

o CJ 

o 
tri 

OP- 

co 

.4 
-.... ,... 

	

, 	 0 

	

c 	 0 

	

as 	 c c... 

2 
vi• g  . a 0 r 	c 	E TE, ,0 0 	2 5 x 	11-1 	u) 0 	a. 

c to-  < 
g.c4 	 0 a a 
f2 •E 	

.k 	E 4- Ul * o o c  Cr 	0 

.0 as = o O. ... . 	:a --f 
E? a-   0 	cs 0  ,2 ti 

I--  

.0 

t5 
C 	 ct 0 2 C It LI' W 	1 .C5 0 Ut 2 CS t •-.. 0,  

c uj a) 
o u- . 

IL 
0  ..,... 	pot0g2g c  o v17 	iso .1.- 0 CL = CL :a 0 u)  

7:DC 'i a 	a. to'g .5 'ai fif g Iti: 
Ts 0 ›.. •• 0  < •-• (A c 'il: u- < ,,..T• 
C 1:5' E c 	0 	'47 	al 111 C g 5-.. E  c 0, z• co 	at 

0 	,c2 ,(2 as 

(5 	
uJ 

1.5 c 

- - 51 2 	A 	0 	o 
5 4. 	CO 

T
ot

al
  E

st
im

at
ed

  C
o

s t
  o

f  
Is

su
an

c e
  

E
S

T
IM

A
T
E

D
 C
O

S
T

 O
F

 IS
S

U
A

N
C

E
 

 

 



T0E01„Appileadioit Responses 
Trophy Club Nuni-elpal tfteky.DistrIM btoJ 
PAW.Med bk. SoultiWest Stiebritlet- FitiansialAdytior to the District 

SEcTil346.*INANCIAL INFORMATION 

8A.,  Growth., No Growth 
The edorionigfeitiblity Of theSe Imndišides is base; .6mm-crow*.  
The ItheStArejeded/Mishie 'YnkleahOwn Be oash'flokschedule Is 61.047.27747A 

6/3 - /matt Cerbfled Assaisad 17,elaailon; 
taies4e9.1f1ed Net-fusible Assessed-Valuation ape SepleMber f2013. was $1 047 277A74 

Hericif Tax Lista: 
Thelollowing informationis as of Tvlay 31.203. 

Tax 	is* Tay,it)le 	Debt tervice 
, '_Li413 t 	Ašseased Valuation. 	Tax Ratit 

Maintenance. 
Tax Rate 

Fire Protection 
Tax. Rate 

Total 
Tax Rafe 

Currant Year 
Anibtett 

Collected 
,2008 	$ ' 	960,911,660 	$ 	0,11.4555 t 	0:014049 	6 8.116020 $ 	0244615 $ 	2355,444 
2009 	-0015,777,389 	0.066720 0,027140 0,100140 0205000 2,084.393 
2010 	97890074, 	-0970969 0.008790 0109250 0.195000. 2939371 
-2014 	954,646,475 	0956860 o.0098ti0 moszto 0175000 1706,043 
2012 	993,596063 	60,19g10 0.009690 0.104000 0.131390 1900,252 

80 - Cash and lr'niestmeril.Balaneed. 

Fuld balances *Watt May31, 2013, tineullbad 
tint Amount- 

General Fund $ 	1,94,446 
Debi Senrice Fund 691902 
Capital Projects Fund 369,642 

- Dutsianding Indebtedness 

Estimated Nat Taxable Assessed Valuation used for Debt Ratio calculatIona it as of July f ,2013 $ 	1947277,474 

(tj -Bond Issues 
Outstanding 	Proposed. 	Combined 

Debt 	UL Tait Debt 	IJI.Tik Debt 	UL Tax Debt 	Ratio 
Cateaorir 	,Princioal. 	principal 	principal 	Debt to AV 

Water/ ifastewatet S 	4,145,008 	6 	,7,65,000: 	$ 	9910,000 	095% 
Fire Prelection 	1e20,01:4 	 - 	1 870000 	201% 

Total's $ 15,015.000 $ 6,765000 $ 11.780,000  

Outstanding 	Proposed 	Combined 
debt 	Revenue Debt 	Reventrepibt 	Revenue Debt 	Ratio. 

Category 	Pr' A041 	principal 	MAW 	Debt to AV 
WaterNiestewsier. 	612:000 $ 0.23(1,000 $ 19,042,b0d 	NM' 

: 

0D- Beedfieticlpation Notes: tie DIstricthas no BondAnlicipatirin Notes. 

09) - Commission Rule 293.53,- Not applibable 

(iv) - Tax Anticipation Notes'. The District has no Tax AntidpallogNotei, 

(v):otber ongaiione 
Principal 

Oustainding 
As oi 9-36-12 

PubbcProperly Finance Contractual Obligations 	 $ 	137900 
Notes Payable tor-Equipment 	 1074971 
Notes Payable :for Ground Storage 	 733,000 
Contteptuar Obligations. fos Capital Projects 	 445.006 

	

Total Other Olggations: 5 	1,422.973 

TCMUD005854 
706 



TCP,Appleatton ReaPonses- 
Trig:thy Club. Mt/recipe Uthlty District ito.1..  
Provided by Southwest Securities - Financial Advisor to the 'District 

SECTiON 8-FINANCIAL INFORMATiON • Continued 

8P- Financial Feasibility 
(i) - Eltolid-DutPrejecibne 

ls the feastlidy a the tad l*sues based on growth? hin 

(11)- Dabl-Senilde Schedule 
See-separate Ajtactunentis8P(ii) - Debt Service- Schedules 

(hi) - Revenue Priijections: 
fay 	Does the District intend to uSe.netriVenues here opeallbnefor debt service payinents? Yes.for Revnue Bonds 

See separate Meant:nett 80(i6)(4 • Revenue Prejectiont (Prdforrna) 

(5) 	Dries the Die4dct intend tolise net "r&entes received fro'M a Municipality through either a consent agreement of 
strategreparinershiRogreament for debt serylce payments? No 

(1v) --Operating Eludget.-"See ceparateCost of Issuance Eštimate ea-  inolusidn byengineerinObbrating.Eludget. 

(v)- piojedfed Cash-Flow Analytie fce Proposed and Existing Debt ef District 
Not Applicable 

- No-Growth Cash-Fibw Analysis forPropbsed arid Existing Debt of District 
See separatoAllachment BF(vi)- No-Growth Cesh-FlevrAnalysis 

(ye) Cash ROW Analysiefor AliOyerlapping Taxing Enetiee Not Applicsble 

'Combined Tex Rate: Not Applicable 

(ix).- total Taxable Value of Area to be. taxed: 
2013 Certified Net Tiiiable Valuation: 

tx,)- waiVer ofspeciafapp.ralsak 	Not Applica bie 

- Overlapping Tax Ratesr 

S. 1047,277474 

2012 
Tax Rate Per 

Tex Veer 2013 
Projected 

Tax kate Per 
Governmental entity Tax Year 5100 Valuation 5100 Valuation 
Carroll independent School District 2012 1.400000 1.400000 
Denton County 2012 0.252900 0.282900 
Noghwee IndependentSchool District 2012 1.375000 1.375000 
Tarrant County 2012 0.264000 0.264000 
Tenant County College District 2012 0.149000 0.149000 
Terrant County Hespital Dfsfriot 2012 0227900 0.227900 
Town of TrtipMi ClUb 2012 0 518500 • 0.518500 
Weak% Town of 2012" 0.156800 0.155800 

8G - Develop:nen! Statue 
Does the District have edeyebper es defiled by-Water Code Section 49.052(d)? No 

(i) -Status of Construction:. - Not Applicable 

(6) - Status of rowlit Projected ill PreVlous aondlssue: - flpt Applicable 

8H -Markel infOrmation: 

The District did hol do a market study. 

TCMUD005855 

707 



Attachmt 88 

bgNTONV0110110" 2013 CERTIP1A4 TOTALS 
vtm - Tamy-41413 MUDNO 1 

01c6rWlealion 

%Orly Cain!: 9,182 ANS Approt47otpls 7/22/201/ 62641A54 

t 1E4 • Who I 
' Wompag 164.97$,593 

Non Hbrnesa 46,007,160 
0 

71Mbor Mkrket: O Total Lana (:),) 212,985,75a 

104111}ron•O 
Home.* 541,515,876 
Noritiornege: 25,15%362 Totat linprovomontg (+) 566,667,738 

Non cow* Valtok 

0.4190red PN:Ortf' 177 14,667590 
Mineral fropoty: 116 .95A57 
Autp,t5 0 'rotation Real 14 14,763,387 

Markin Vahte 794,41%878 

7otal,Produc1Miy Market 0 0 
All WOK 0 0 FirOductivity Loa. 
Tknber tim• 0 0 Approtoloi Value 794,416,878, 
PrOdu*IY LW"' 15 

flomosmad tap, 1,512,355 
Assessed Volum 792,904.54 

DV1 16 0 	122,000 122,000 
DV% 9 O. 	90,000 90,000 
DV3 8 o 80,006 8%000 
DV4 25 0 	216;000 216,090 

4 DV4S 
 

D. 	24,000 24,000 
DVHS 7 0 	1,600,630 1,800,560 
111/11S0 2 0 	448.545 446.545 
gx-mi (Pronad) 1 o 04,655 44,05, 
EX-XV 36 0 	18,093,413 13,083,413 

EWA se 0 	8,223 egze 
Coves 5-fi 14,055714 	0 14,055,714 
OV855 34 800,000 	 0. ti00,000 Totol itempilons t) 3080,080 

N.t Taxable 755s45,s43 

APPROXIMATE TeAL LEVY. NET  TAXABLE • {TAX RATE1100) 
1,0005%13 = 7.56,915648 (9,133390/ 100) 

'Tax Increment Financeialue: 
	

0 
Tai lndreinent Hnipoe faivr 
	

0430 

W03/653062 
	

Pafp 816 of 1128 	 True ittIonlation, lno 

TCMUD005856 

708 



.111•••••••••••••••••••••••rn 

Ql SEP 2013 

/ARRANT APPRAISAL DISTR1CT 

TROPHY CLUB MUD #1 

2013 Supplemental Certified 'Appraisal Roll 
Valuation Summary 

I, Jeff LaW, Chief Appralšer for the Tarrant' Appraisal District, to the 
beSt of My ability chi Solemnly sWear that the attached is that portion 

-tho appraisal roll of the Tarrant Appraisal Dištrict which lists 
property taxable by the above named entity' and 'constitutes their 
supplernental certified 'appraisal roil 

APPRAISED VALUE Corliciers %talus Cap!) 	 > $ 

Absolute pceinption 	 $ 	2,6.56,055 
Cases liEfereARS 	 $ 	6,010,651. 
Incompletes . 	 $ 	 ao ;509 
Deferred, Special Use, and-Partial Exemptions $ 	4,818,876 
. See-Totals Report fer breakdoWn of each Exernption 

NET TAXABLE VALUE . 	,, 	 > $ 
Appraised Vaide rniritis Absolute Exemption amount, rninusAREI amount, 
minus irrompletes; minus Deferred, Special' Use and Partial Exemptions. 

. to equal the. NW 

ESTIMATED NET TAXABLE VALUE.  	 > $ 
InclUding suggestbdlialues tO be used for pending A.R.B. accounts 
(see page two), and Mcomplete atcounts (see pagethree), 

303,, 879, 622 

290 , 361 , 511 

294,553,622 

Jeff Laiv9&°, . 'let AppraTer 

Page 1 of 3 zap liancliey-EdeivSenoad ForiVionit, rem rote m7)284-0024 LTRISChl n1400 

Attachment ŠB 

TCMUD005857 

709 



Attachment WY 
Trophy Club MUM 

$5,765,00011nlimited rex Bonds,5eries 2014 
FE t9/30) Printipil Inter* Rite litter* Trail 	_ 

291.4 172,950.00 $ 	172,3040 - 
2015.  155,000.0 6.90% 341,259.00 496,25000 
2016 165400.0d 6.00% 33,10049 495;650.06 
2017 175,0040 600% 321,450.60 446,45640 
2019. 185,00040 6,9904 :310,650,00 495,65049 
2019 195,ocace 6.00% 299,250.00 494,25000 
2020 205,000.00 6.00% 287,250.00 492,25040 
2021 220,00040 6.00% 274,500,00 494,500.00 
2622 '235,000.09 6.00% 260,85640 495,859.00 
2023 250,000.00 6.00% 246;300.00 496,3.p0 
2024 2650-00.00 6.00% 230,850.00 4§5;agq,o0 
2025 280)000.00 6.00% 214,500.00 454;500.00 
_2026 295,000.00. COM 197,250.00 492;25040 
2027 315,000,00 640% 178,950.00 4n950.00 
2028 335„000.00 6m% 49,450.00 494;45040 
2029 355,900.O0 6.00% 1.38,750%) 493,750,00 
2030 380,000.00 640% 116,700,60 496;7000 
2031 400,000.00 6.(xi% 93,300.00 493,36946 
.2032 425„000.00 640% 68;550.00 493550.00 
2033 450,000,00 6.00K 42,30040 49236000 
2034 480,000.00 6.00% 14,400,09 494,400.00 

$ 5,765000;00 $ 4,30,1,10040 $ 10,056,100.0 

TCMUD005858 

710 



Attachment FM) 
nolo* truftWIUD .. 

FYE (940) 
_ 	$9,230,000 .Revetfue,  Bonds, Series 2014 

Principal 	inte:resl, Rate 	intérOst , - NA 
2614 $ 	- $ 	.276,90940Q $ 	76,900.00 
2018 25,000.00 6,00% 546,40.00 791,450.00 
2016 260,000.00 6.00% 531,300:90 791,300.00 
2017 275,000,00 6.00% 515,250.00 290,25000 
20_18 295,090.00 6,00% 498,15000. 793,250.00 
201,9 .115,000 640% 47985000 794,85-0wo 
202ii• jki,00p.ot) 6,00% 460,500.00 790,50040 
2021 .355,000.00 6.60ro 439,950.00 794,950.00 
1022 375,000.00 6.00% 44,00.00 793,050.00 
2023 400,000.00 6.006 394,800.00 194.809.00, 
2024 420,000.00 6.00% 370200.00. 79000.00 
2025- 450,00Q.Q0 6.00% 344,1.00.00 79000.00 
2026 475,000,00 6.00% 316,5O.0O 791,350.00 
2027 5'05ximoir 6.009 286,95000 791,950.00 
2028 535,060.00 6.91:4 255,75.0,6a 790,7500 
2.029 570jpoo.00 G.O01€ 2200.00 792,600.00 
21330 605,000.00 6.0056.  187,350.00 791)35040 
2o31. 645,90.0.00 6.00% 2.49,850.00 794,850.00 
2032 680;000.00 6.00% 110,100.00 790,10000 
2033 725,000.0Q 6.90.% - 	67950,00 792,950.00 
2034 779,090.00 :6,00% 23;100.00 _ 	793„10000 

$ 9,130,000.00 $ 6,495,50000 $ 16;125,500m 

TCMU0005859 

711 



Attachttleat ORO/ 
Trophy kik M60 Aft Cesh Elow,Praforma. and Avatrabla'rundator DatitterVice' 
$9,268:000 Hearottra BOricla, Salas2614 
(NO GROWTH) 

&poses txr:rvgi priziptoseitittutsst C4prOdation,.lend &Oral Outlay 

FY *oar 
Ending 9/30 

Wat6r 
Oonnogbans . 4venges expeAses. 

.Avillable for 
beht Servlce Dibt5enike. 

The. ' 
Eionds 

MIN 
Pebt Service Coverage. - 

201: 8,554 7,055,4165 $5,083,531 $1,97;534. 4240;245 9240;245  811 
2012 3;887 57,461,907 $5,471,5% $;990,339: $700,982 7c10,882. 244 
2013 3,897 47,461,907 .45,471,568 $1,390,333.  $387,088) 487P8 5.14 

2014 3.897 47,461,907 4971,56 $;33039 $53099 $ 27490000 $807,590 2.46 
2015. %op $7,461,07 45,471,466 $3,990,439 $1s420, 70,40.01 .SŠ48;60 lio 
2016 8467 37,461,907 $5,471,568, $1,690,335. 4153,409 741;390,90 6944,706 2.11 
2017 uteu $X461,507 55,91466 599,339 790,250.00 $790,250 2,52 
2018 3,987 $7,451,9p7 55;471,568 $U60,333 793,350,00 5793,130 2.51 
2019 3,887 $7,454907 45,471,568 41,490,359' 794,880.00 5794,850 240 
2020-  3.997 $7,44,007 $5,4715.-99 5;3-90,339 790,500.00,  $790,500 252 
2021 -3,897 37,461,907 55,471,56Š $14%0,339 764,056.00 $7.94,950 1.50 
2M2 3,9874  $7,461;907 4,5,471668 51,6a0,1_39. 79300,00, $7,03,050 251 
2023. 3,887 $7,461;907 $5,474s68 .51,99339 794,800.o0, $794,80,0 2.50' 
2024, 3,887 $7,461,907 55,471;558 53410,339 790,20000 $790,200 2.52 
2025. 9,897 $.7,461,36,7 55,91,56,5 61,660,33.9 794,10000 5794100 2,51. 
zezq 8,887 $7461,502 55,91468 5,690,339 761450.00 $7.53,350 2:52 
2027 3,887 47,461,907 55,471,568 $1499o339 79,1,9.S0.0p $79;950 2.51 
2028 3,887 $7,461:307 $$.471,568' 5%950,330 790,750.00 $790,750 2.52 
2029 3,887' 3.7,461. 9137 55,47,1,568 0,990,339 792,60000 $792,600 2.51 
2030 3,887 $7,!461,907 $5,471,s4 $51,590,339 792„35000 4,792;850 2.51 
2031 3,887 $7i481,907 $5;471,588 41,990,335 794,1150.00 $794,950: 2.50 
2032 ;8;887 $7,48.19,07 35,471,568 $1,990,333 790,10000 $790100 2,52  
2033, 3,887 744414907 $54411,568 51,990,339 792,95000 $792,950 2.51 
2034 3,987 $7,.461,907 45,473,,568 51,990,339 793,10000 $793,10 2.51 
Total. $1,928,368 $14,539,460' $18.081,888  

2011 Revenue an Upenditures from the 2011Auch6 
2012 Revenue and Expenditures frorothe 2012 Audit 

TCMUD005860 

712 



Attachment Ftvi) 

2013 $995,508,563 $834,033 $834,03.3 0.0084 83.4;533 100% 
2014 51,047,277,474 $695,226 $ 172,950.00 $868,176 0.0873 865;170 100% 
2016 $1,047,277;474 $618,508 496,250.00 51414,758 0.1120 1,114,758 100% 
2016 $1,047,277,474 $618,958 496,650:00 , $1,115;308 0.1121 1,115,306 10090  
207 $1,047,277,474 $625,783 496,450.0(1 $1,122,233 0.1128 1,122,23.3 MX 
2018 51,047,27Z 474 $622,ki8 495,650.00 $1,117,958 0.1124 , 1,117958 100% 
2019 $1,0472277,474 $633,533 494,250.00 51,127,783 0.1134 1,127781 100% 
2029 $1,047,277,474 $624,083" 492,20.00-  $1,116,333' ' 0.1122 1  i115.331 100% 
2021 $1,047.,277,474 $628,333 494,500.00 $1422,833 0.1129 1,122,813 100% 
2022 $1;047,277,474. 5631,955 .495,850.00 - $1,127,005 5,1114 ;127,505 ,i 100% 
2023. $1,047277,474 $633,458 436,309.00. $1,129,768_ 0.1116. 1,129,75Š 100% 
2024 $1,047,277,474 $153,183. 495,850.0 $649,033 0.0662 649,033• 190% 
2025 $1,041,277474 $152,683 494,900.0 $647,153 0.0650 647,183 100% 
2026 $1,047,277,474 $148,083 492,250.00 $640,333 0.0644 540,313 10% 
2027 $1,047,277,474 $153,368 493;950.00 $647318 0.0651 647,318 100% 
2028 $1,Q47,277,474 $153,243 494,450.00 $647,693 0.0651 647,693 100% 
2029 $1,Q47,277,474 $152,783. 493,750.00 $646,533 0.0650 546,513 100% 
2030 51;047,277,474 5152,113 496,700.00 $648,813 0.0662 645,811 100% 
2031 $1„,D47.-,277,474 $151,163 433;300.00 $644,463 0.0645 644,463 10% 
2032 $1,047,277,474 493,550.00 $493,550 .6.0496 493,050 1.00%.  
2033 $1,047;277,474 492,300.00 5492,300 0.0495 492,300 100% 
2034 $1,047,277,474 494,400.00 5494,40 0.0497 494,400 100% 

Totals $0,382,491 $1,0,066,100. 

Sedes 2014 Unlimited Teo( Bonds have a projected interest rate of 65 

TCMUD005861 
713 



TOWN CjF TROPHYCLUBI. TEXAS 
ORDINANCE NO.. 2012-29 

AN ORDINANCE 9F, THE TOWN OF TROPHY CLUB, TEXASb 
REPEALING ARTICLE VII 'ENTatar, INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING 
CODE" OF GHAPTER S ENTITLED. "BUILDINGS AND 
coNsmoTIoNo OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE TOWN. 
OF TROPHY CLUB, TF-XAS AND ADOPTING A NEW ARTICLE Vll 
ENTITL.ED "INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE" OF CHApTER 3 
ENTITLED ISIAL,DINGS AND ooNŠTRUOTION" OF THE Com OF 
ORDINANCES OF THE TOWN OF TROPHY CLUB, TEXAS;:  
PROVIDING FOR THE INCORPORATION OF PREMISES; PROVIDING. 
FOR AN AMENDMENT REPEAUNG THE 2003, INTERNATIONAL 
PLUMBING-CODE WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS AND ADOPTING THE 
409 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONkL PLUMBING CODE WITH 
LOCAL AMENDMENTS THERETO, A. COPY OF WHICH. IS ATTACHED 
HERETO AS EXHIBIT "A"; PROVIDING A ouNMATNE REPEALER 
CLAUSE; PROVIDING FOR.SEVERABILITY; PROVIDING A PENALTY 
NOT TO EXCEED THE. SUM: OF TWO THOUSAND DOLLARS 
($2,000,00) FOR EACH OFFENSE AND A SEPARATE OFFENSE 
SHALL BE DEEMED COMMITTED EACH DAY DURING OR ON WHICH 
A VIOLATION OCCURS OR CONTINUES; PROVIDING FOR 
PUBUCATIOW PROVIDING FOR ENGROSSMENT AND 
ENROLLMENT; AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE. 

WHEREAS, the Town Council of the Towri of TrOphy Club, Texas (the. 'Town") is 
a home rule municipality empowered to do all acts and make all regulations which may 
be necessaty or expedient fer the proMotion of the public health, safety and general 
welfarc and 

WHEREAS, the TOwn adopted the 2003 Edition of the Intemafidnal 'Plumbing 
Code in 2604; and 

WHEREAS, the Town of Trophy Club Building Offidal and Community 
Development Department have revieived the.  International Plumbing Code, 2)09 
Edition, (hereioattel: "IPC") and find that it Is trithe best interest of the 'Town of TrnOhy 
Club to repeal the 2003 Edition of the IPC: and all local amendments thereto: end tö 
adopt the 2009 Edition of the International Plumbing Code and local amendmentš 
thereto as. reflected in Exhibit "A to this Ordinance; and 

WHEREAS, the Town Council of the Tdwn of Trophy Club, Texas deems. it 
necessary and beneficial to repeal the 2003 Edition of the International PIUMbing Code 
and local amendments thereto and to adopt the updated 2009 Edition of the 
international Plunibing Code and local amendments as Specified in this Ordinance to 
safeguard the health,:  property, safety and general welfare of the citizens of the Town of 
Trophy Club by regulating the detign, cOnstruction, quality of materials, erection, 

TCMUD005862 

714 



installatIOn, alteration, repair, locatión, relogallon;  replacement, addition tO, Use or 
meintenange. Of plumbing and other piping -Systenis end inspection of plumbing 
sytterns. 

NOW, THEREFORE, Ba IT ORDAINED,  BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE 
TOWN' OF TROPHYCLUE, TEXAS: 

SECTION 1. 
INCORPORATION CLAUSE 

That ail' Of the aboVe premiSes are true-and correct and are hereby incorporaW 
ih the body ofthis Ordinance as V fully set forth herein, 

SECTION 2. 
AMENDMENTS 

2.01. Article vll entitled internatiOng Plumbing Code° of Chapter a entitled °Buildings 
and ConstructiOn'adopting the 2003 Editibh of the IPC is hereby repealed in Vs entirety, 
arid a • new Article VII entitled International Pluinbing Code of Chapter 3_ entitled 
"ibildings and, COnstructiOn' Contaihing the 2009 edition of the Intenrational PlUmbing 
Code and local amendments thereto,. is hereby adopted. as more fully set forth ,iri 
Exhibit "A', a copy ofwhich is attached hereto 'and incOrporated herein. 

SECTION 3. 
CUMUL4TIVE REPEALER  

That this Ordinance shall be cumulative of all Other ordinances ofthe Town and 
shall not rePeSl any of the proVisions of such ordinanceS eitceOt in thoše instances 
where provisions of those ordinances are in direct tonflict With the provisions of this 
Ordinan6e; Whether suob Ordinances are codified of:  ungOdiffed, and all other proVisions 
of the Ordinances of the Town of Trophy Club, codified br uncodified, hot in conflict with 
the •OroVisione of this Ordinance, shall remain in full force and effect. Notwithstanding 
the foregoing, any complaint; action, caute Of action or claim which prior to the effective 
date di this Ordinance has been initiated or hat arisen under or pursuant to such 
repealed Ordiriange(S), shall continue. to 'be voverned by the provisions of ' that 
Ordinance and fOr that purpose the Ordinance shalibe deemed to remain and continue 
in till forge artd effect, 

sgcpriN 4.. 
SEVERABILITY 

If any seCtion, artitle, paragraph, sentence, clause, phrase. or word' in this 
Ordinance, or application thereof' to any. persort ot circurnStance, is held invalid or 
unconstitutional by a Court of ...competent jurisdiction, such holding shall not affect the 
validity of the rernaining portions of the Ordinance, and the Town, Council hereby 
de,clares it would have passed such rernaining of the Ordinance despite such invalidity, 
Which remaining port)ons shall remain 'in full force and effea 

ORD 2012-29 	 Page 2 of 12 

TCMUD005863 

715 



ATTEST: 

annon papal*, Town Secre r  
Town of Trophy Club, Texas 	SEAL 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

0 

A. AdamS, Town Attorney 
of Trophy Club, Texas 

es 

ORE12012-29• 
	 Pogo a of 12 

SECTION t. 
ENGROSSMENT AND ENROLLMENT  

the Town Secretary of the-Town of POW CIO l0 hereby directed to engross 
and *VA tis Ordin.ance ìn opporciange with. thetoWn Charter. 

SECTION 4, 
PENALTY 

it Shall be unlawful for any person to violate any provision of this Ordinance, and 
any person viblating Or failing to .comply with any provision of this OrdirianCe shalt be 
fined, upon convicton, not less than One Dollar ($100). nor more than' TWO ThOušarid 
OgifarS ($Z000,90), and* separate offense Shall bedeertied cOrnmitted upon each day 
during.or on which *violation occurs or continues. 

SECTION 7. 
PUBLICATION 

The Town Secretary of the Town of trophy Club is hereby direded to publish., 
the Caption, Penalty and Effecthie Date of this Ordinance as required by Section 52.011 
of the Texas Local Government COde, 

SECTION S. 
EFFECTIVE DATE 

This Ordinance shall taRe effect on January 1,, 2013; in accordant* with law, and 
it is so ordained. 

PASSED AND APPROVED by the Town Council of the Town of Trophy Club, 
Texas, thisthe 1oth  day of December, 2012. 

onnie White, Mayor 
Town of Trophy Club, Texas 

TCMUD005864 

716 



EXHIBIT A 
INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE 

Proposed Adoptiop: 
The 2000 edition, oflhe Internstional Prprnbing. Cede efthe International Cede council, 
[s herein after amended, is from the effeetive date hereof, hereby adopted at the 
plUrnbing code of the Town of Trophy Club. One copy of such International Plumbing 
-Code is incOrperated herein by reference and shall have been Med for permanent 
record and. inspection irrthe office of the city secretary. 

Amendments. 
AmendMents to the international Plumbing Cede adopted herein ere as follows: 

(1) 	PagXtl Table of COntents, Chapter 7, Section 714) 
Table of eonfents, Chapter 7, SectiOn 714 it hereby amended as follows 
Seotititi 714. Engineered Drainage. DeSigri, Page 67 

(2). (Pagel, Section 101.4 
Sactiert 101.2 is hereby amended to change wording in exeeptions 1-  and 2 as 
follows: 
101.2 Scope (Paragraph. unchanged) 
EXCeptionc. 
1. Detached one and two family Ovellings. (unchanged) international 

Residential Code as adoPted. 
2. Plumbing. systems in existing buildings (unchanged) international Existing 

Building Code or the previsiens for existing buildings in the international 
Building Code as adopted. 

(Page 1, Seotion.102.8) 
Seption 102.8 is hereby amended as föllOws: 
102.5 Referenced codes and standards. The'codes and standards referenced 
In this code shall be those that are listed in Chapter 13 and. such codes, when 
specifically adopted, and standards 'shall be Considered- part of the 
requireMentS of this Code to the prescribed extent of such reference. Where 
the requirements Of referenee standards or manufacturer's.- Installation 
instructions -do not conform to minithum provisions of this code, the provisions 
of the Code shall aPPlit Whenever amendments have -been adopted to the 
referenced cedes and standards, each reference to said code and standard 
shall bp considered to reference the. amendments as well Any reference to-
NEPA 70 or the ICC Electrigal Code. shall mean the Electrical Code as 
adopted. 

(4) (Pao 4, Section 108.5.6) 
Beefier! 106.5.6 is hereby amended ai foliows: 
106.5.6 Retention of construction' documents., (delete last sentence) 

COD 2012--9 	 Page 4 of 12 

TCMUD005865 

717 

(3) 

s. 



(0y (Page .4 Sections f06.021ane1106:45.3) 
Sections 106.612 and 106:6..3 are ,hereby amended as follows: 
106.0.2 Fee schedule.. The-feet feral plumping work shall be as adopted by. 
resolution of the governing body o( the jut-Widen. 
ipe,9,3 Fee Refunds, The code offiCial shaft establish a polity for the 
refunding of fees: (Delete balents of section), 

(5) Seatiort 100 is adOpted as set forth in the 2009 Intemational.Plurnbing torte. 

fPa0e 18 S0,000 305.6.9 
Seal& 306.6.1 is hereby amended as follows:, 
3060.1 Sewer depth. Building sewers shall be a Minimum Of 12 inches 
(304nrri) below grads 

(3) (Page /0 SectiOn 305.9). 
Srection, 305.9 is hereby amended aslollows.: 
305.6. Protection of doinponents of plbmbing system: Components of a 
plumbing systern installed within 3. feet along alleywayS driveways, parking 
garages or other Iodations in a manner in which they would be exposed to 
darnage shall be recessed into the Wall op otherwise protected in an approved 
manner. 

(9) (Page 20, Settler: 310.4) 
Bection 3104 is hereby, amended as follows: 
310.4 Water closet compadment. -(delete) 

(10) (Page 21, Seaton 312,2) 
• Section 312,2 is hereby amended as follows: 

Drairiage.and vent water test (BUlk Of section unchanged)but no section 
shall be tested with less than a 4-fOo1 (1220 mm) heed of Water. (unchanged 
text)shall have been submitted' to a test of not Iesslhan 4-kot 0220 min) 
head of water(Balande of section Unchanged) 

(11) (Page 2Z Section ;112.10:1) 
Section 312.10.1 is hereby amended as follows: 
312.101 Inspections. Annual inspections shall be Made of all Oackflow 
prevention assernbilet and *gaps to determine whether they are Operable.: 
In -the absence Of Wel provisions, the owner iS respónsible to ensure that 
testing is performed. 

(12) (Page 2; Section 312.10.2) 
'$ection 312,10.2 is herebyemended as follow: 
312.10.2 Testing,. RedUced pressure principle backflow preventer assemblies 
double check Aialve assemblies, dotible detector check valve .aSsernblies and 
presspreyaob4m breaker,assemblies shall be tested at the time of installation, 
immediately after repairs or nalecation and at least annually. The teSting 

ORD 2012-29 	 Page 5 of 1 2 

TCMUD005866 

718 



procedure shãll Pe performed irt accordance with applicable local provisions, 
in the absence Of local preVisionsi. the -owner is responsible te ensure that 
testing is. done in accordance with one of the following standards: 
(list &standards unchanged). 

(13) (Page 22, Seclion $104) 
Section 3142,1 it hereby amended as follows: 
314.2.1 Condensate disposal. Condensate from all cooling coils and 
evapOrators Shall be conveyed frcm the drain ,pan oUtlet to an approved place 
of disposal...ftext tinehttnged).„ Condensate shall not discharge in a publicly 
exposed 'area such as ink/ a street; alley, sidewalk, rooftop or other areaS so 
as to cause a nuisance. 

(14) (Page 22, Section 3142.2) 
Section 314.2.2 is hereby amended as follows; 
3142.2 Drain pipe materials and sizes. Components of the condensate 
disposal system shall be cast iron, galvanized steel, qopper, cross-linked 
polyethylene, polyethylene, ABS, OPVC: or Schedule 80 PVC piPe or tubing 
when exposed to ultra Violet light. All components shall be selected for the 
pressure, temperature, and eXposure rating of the installation. (Remainder • , Unchanged) 

(15) (Page 25, Section 40.1.1) 
Section 401,1 is hereby arnended to add a sentence as f011oWs: 
401.1 SCOpe. The provisions of this Chapter are meant to work in coordination 
with the provisions of the Building Code. Should any conflicts arise between 
the two chapters, the Code Official' shall deterrnine which provision applies: 

1' 4 

(16) (Page 25; Section 403.1) 
Section 40a 1 i,s hereby emended as follows: 
403.1 Minimum number cif fixtures. PlUmbing fixtUres shall be provided for the 
type of occupancy and• in the minimum number as follows: 
1. Assembly Occupancies Atleast one drinking fountain shall be °provided at 

each floor level in an approved location. 
ExcePtion: A drinking fountain need not 'be. provided in a drinking or dining 

establishment, 
2. Groups A. B, F, H, l, M and S. Occupancies; Buildings or portions thereof 

where persons are employed shall be provided with at least one water 
closet for each sex except as provided for in Seaton 403.2. 

3, Group E Occupancies: Shall, be provided with fixtures as shown in Table 
403.1. 

4, Greup R OcCupancies Shall be provided with fixtures as 'Shown in Table. 
403.1. 

lt is recommended, but not required, that the minimum number of• rattles 
provided alto comply with the number shown in Table 403.1. Types of 
occupancies not shown in Table 403.1 shall be consideed individually by the 

ORD 2012-29 	 Papa of 12 

TCMUD005867 

719 



Code Official. The number of occupants shall be deterrnined by the 
intemational BUilding edde, Occupency classification shall be determined in.  
accordance with fhe International Building Ciide. 

(17) (Page 28,. Section 403.1.3) 
Seaton 403,1.3 is hereby added as follOws: 
403.1.3 Finish material. Finish materialeshall comply with Section 1209 of the 
international Building Code. 

(18) (Page 29, Sectiiin 405.8) 
Section405.6 is hereby arnended aS fallowt 
406.6 Plumbing in ,mental health centers. (delete),  

(19) fPage 30; Section 4092) 
Section 409:2 is hereby amended as 
409.2 Watet Connection, The water supply to a commercial dishwashing 
machine shall be protected against backfloW by an air gap or baokflow 
preventer ir accordance. with Section 608. 

(20) (Page-30, Section 410.1) 
Section 410.1 IS hereby amended as *AIMS: 
410.1 Approval. Drinking foUntains shall conferm to ASME A 112:19.1, ASME 
A 112,19.2 or ASME 112.19.9, and water coolers shall conform to AR1 1010. 
Drinking fountains and water coolers shall conform to NSF81, Section 9. 
Exception: A drinking fountain need not be provided in a drinking or dining 
establishment 

(21) (Page 30; Section 412.4) 
Section 412.4 is hereby amended as follows: 
412.4 Required location. Floor drains shall be installed In the following areas,, 
1. ln public Coin-operated laundriet end in the central washing facilities of 

multiple family dwellings, the rooms containing the automatic clothes 
washers shall be provided with floor drains located to readily drain the 
entire floor area., 

2. Commercial kitchens. (In lieu of floor drains in cominerclal kitchens, the 
code official may accept flbor sinks.) 

(22) (Page 28, Section 413,4) 
SecliOn 413.4 is hereby emended es follows: 
413.4 Water supply required. All fOod waste grinders shall be provided with a 
supply of cold water. The water supply shall be• protected against backflow by 
an air gap or with the installatibn of a backflow preventer in accordance with 
Section 608. 

ORD 2012-29 	 Page 7 of 12 

TCMUD005868 

720 



(233 (Pat te 	417.5) 
Sectioh 417,5 is hereby'amended as folloWs: 
417.5 ShoWer Boors. or receptOte Flocir Surfaces shall be conetruoted,Df 
impervious, (Vnoorrosive, nonabsorbent and waterProof materiats. Thresh:Ads 
shall be e MiniMurn of2 kiches (51mm) and a maximum of 9 inches (229mm). 
measured fromtop of the drain to top Of threshold otdam. Th4sholdš shall he-
of suMcient.width to accommodate a minimum twenty-two (22) inch (559Mn1) 
door. 
Dception:.  Showers designed to or:imply With 10t/ANSI A117,1, 

(24) (Page 31, Se-ction 07.5.2) 
Seófon 4174.2 is hereby amended as followe 
4175.2,  Shower lining, Floorf under shower ootripertMents„ except where 
prefabridated redeptors have been provided; shall be lined and made water 
tight utilizing material complying +Oh SectiOns 417.5.2.1 through 417.52,4. 
Sudh liners shall turn up on all sides at least.  3 inches (76 mm) above the 
'8nished. threshold. level and shall extend ouhVard OVer the 'threshold and 
fastened to the outside of the threshold jamb. Liners; shall be recessed and 
fattened to an approved bedsing,.,(text unchanged)—and Section 417.7. 

(25) (Page 32, Section 074 
Section 417,7 is hereby added to"read as follows: 
417.7 Test for shower receptors. Shower receptotš shell be *MO for Water 
tightness by filling with water to the level of the rough threshold. The drain 
shalt be plugged in a Manner so that both sides of pans shall be subjected to' 

- the test at the point where it it clamped to the drain. 

(26) (Page 32, Section.419.3) 
Section 419.3 is- hereby amended at follows: 	

• 

419.3 Surromding material. Wall and floor space to a point 2 feet (610mm). in 
front of a urinal lip arid 4 feet (1219mm) above the floor at least 2 feet 
(610mm) to each side of the. urinal :shall be Waterprbofed With a smooth, 
readily cleanable, hard, nenabsorbent material. 

(27) (Page 37, Section 5O2.3) 
Section 502.3 it hereby amended as follows: 
502.3 Water heaters installed in attics(bulk of paragraph unchanged)The clear 
emits opening dimensiont shall be a minimum of 20 inchet by 30 inches 
(508mm by 762 mm), Or larger where such dimensions are not large enough 
to allow removal of the water heater, 

ORD 2012-29 	 Page Sof 12. 

TCMUD005869 

721 



(28) (Page 37, Section 502.6; 546,1) 
Section 502.6, 502.81 15 herebyadded as followa: 
50243 Water heaters above ground or finot When the *it, roof, mezzanine ot 
.platform in whiCh a water heater is installed is more than eight (?) feet 
r(243ernM)" above the ground ot &or leVel, it shill be Made aciclessibie by a 
stairway or permanent ladder fastened to thebuilding. 
Excaotion: Ainat 10 bellcin water heater (or lamer with agprova ) is capable 
of being accessed throunh a iav-in ceilint and a waterheater is installed la nat 
more than ten MI feet (3048mm) above the oround or floor level and mav be. 
reeched bv a Portable ladder.  
502,6AllluminatiOn -and convenience outlet Whenever the Mezzanine or 
ptatforrn is not adequately lighted or access to a receptacle outlet is not 
obtainable kern the Main level, lighting end a receptacle outlet Shall be 
provided in accordance with Section 502,3,1. 

(29) (Pap3 38, Section 504.6.) 
Section ,504.6. is hereby amended as follows: 
504,8 ReqUirenients ler diScharge piping. The discharge piping serving a 
pressure rellefvaivei  teniperature relief valve or conibination thereof shall: 
1. Not be directly connected to the-drainage system. 
2. Diecharge throUgh an *gad, 	, 
3. Not be snialler than the diameter of the outlet of the valve served and shall 

dischargefull size to the air gap. 

	

4, 	Serve a single, relief clavicle and shall pot connect to piping serving any 
other relief device or equipment 

Exception: Multiple relief devices may be installed to a single T & P discharge 
piping system When approVed by the administratiVe authority and permitted 
hy the manufactures installation instructions and,  installed with those 
instructions. 
5. Discharge, to. an Indirect waste receptor or tO the outdoors. Where 

discharging to the .outdoors in areas subject to freezing, discharge piping 
shall be first piped toan indirect waste receptor through an air gap located 
in ä conditioned area. 

6. Discharge. In a manner that does not cause personal injury Or structural 
damage. 

7. pischargé to a termination point that is readily observable by the building 
tidcupants. 

	

8 	Not be trapped.. 
9. Be inštalled So as to flow by graVity. 
10. Not terminate less than 6 inches or more than 24 inches (152 mm) above 

grade nor rnorethan 6 irichesahove the waste receptor. 
11. Not have athreaded connection at the end of such piping. 
12. Not havevalves or tee fittings. 
13. Be constructed of those Materials listed in Section 6054 or materials 

tested, rated and approved for such use in accordance with ASME 
A112.4.1. 

	

ORD 2012-29 	 Page 9 Of 12 

TCMUD005870 

722 



(30) (Page 4a, SediOn 604.4.1) 
Section 604.4.1 is hereby added as follows: 

, 

	

	604.4.1 State maximum flow rate. Where the State mandated maximum flow- 
rate is more restrictive then those of this section, the State flow rate shall take 
precedenee. 

(31) page 44 Section 05.3 and 605,4) 
Section 605.3 and Section 605.4 is hereby atended asfollows: 
605.3 and 605.4 Polybutylene (P8) plastic pipe and tuhing is deleted. 

(32) (Page 48, Section 606.1) 
Seetion 606,1 is hereby amended as follows: 
606.1 Location of full-open valves. (items 4 and 5 ere deleted). 

(33) (Page 46, Section 666.2) 
Section 606.2 Is hereby amended as follows: 
606.2 item 1; On the fixture supply to each plumbing fbdUre. (balante of item 1 
deleted) 
Exception: Tub and shower valves. 
006.2 item 2; 9n the water supply pipe to each silleock when subject to 
freezing. 

(34) (Page48, Section 60.1) 
Section 608.1 is hereby amended as follows: 
608.1 General. A potable Water supply system shall be designed, installed and 
maintained in such a mann& so as to prevent contamination from non-potable 
liquids, solids of gasses being introduced into the potable water supply 
through cross-connections or• any other piping connectiont to the system. 
Back flow preventer applications shall conform to applidable loeal regulations, 
Table 608,1, and as specifically stated in Sections 6882 through 6013.164. 

(35) Page 52, Section 608.16,5) 
SeCtion 698.16.5 is hereby emended as follows: 
608.16.5 Connections to Lawn Irrigation Systems. The potable water suppty 
system to lawn irrigation systems• shall be proteeted against backflow by an 
atmospheric-type vacuum breaker, a pressure type vacuum breaker, a double-
check assembly or a reduced piressure principle backfloW preventer(balance of 
section unchanged). 

(36) Page 52, Section-608.17) 
Section 608.17 is hereby amended as follows: 
608.17 Protection of individual water supplies, An indfividual water supply shall 
be located and constructed so as to be safe guarded against contaminafion In 
accordance with applicable local regulations. In the absence' of other local 
regulations, installation shall be in accedence with sections 608.17.1 through 
608.17.8. 

ORD 2012-29 	 Page 10 ef 12 

TCMUD005871 

723 



(37) (Page-65.  Saadi.? 712.5) 
Section 712.5 is hereby added OS folbws: 
7124 Dual pump. system, All sumps shall be automatically diacharged arid, 
when in any "nubile- use OcctipanCy Where the sump serves More than 10 
fixture. unit; shall be provided with dual purnps or ejectors arranged to 
ftinction independently in case Of Overload or mechanical failure. For storm 
drainage purrips and pumpingSyštern, see SectiOn 1113: 

(38) (Paga 67, Section 714, 714,1) 
Section 714, 714.1 is hereby amended as follows:.  
Section 714 Engineered DrainageDesign. 
714.1 Design of drainage Systein, The. Sizing design and layout of the drainage 
systems-shall be pennitted to be designed by approved design methode. 

(39) (Page 69, SectiOn 802.1.6) 
Section 802.1.8; change to read as follows: 
802,1.6 Domestic dishwashing machines:, Domestic dishwashing machines 
shall disdharge 	indirectly through an air gap or air break intoa standpipe 
or waste receptor in accordance wi(h Section 802.2, or dišcharge into a wye-
branch fitting on the tailpiece of the kitchen sink or the dishwasher connection 
of a food Waste gdrider. The waste line Of a dornestic diahwashing Met:nine 
.discharging into a kitchen sink tailpiece or food waste grinder shall conned to 
a decbmunted airgelx - 

(40) (Page 70, Section 8024) 
Section 8024 is hereby amended to add a sentence as fellows: 
802.4 Standpipes. No standpipe shall be installed below the ground. 

(41) (Page 71, Section 904.1) 
Section. 904.1 is herebyamended as follows: 
904.1 Roof extension, All open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be 
terminated et least siir (6) inches (162mm) above the red, except that where a 
root is to be used for any purptise other than weather pretection, the vent 
extensions shall be run at least 7feet (2134mm). above the roof.. 

(42) .(Page 74, Section 912.1) 
Section 912,1 is hereby amended as f011ows: 
912,1 Type of fixture., A combination drain and vent system shall not serve 
fixtbres other than near drains, stand pipes, hiked.  Waste receptors. 
Combination drain and vent systems shell not receive the discharge of a food 
waste grinder or clinical sink. 

(43) (Page 79, Section 1002.10) 
tedion 1002.10 is hereby attended as follows: 
1002.10 Plumbing in mental health centers. (delete) 

ORD 2012-29 	 Page 11 of 12 

TCMU0005872 

724 



(44), 7 tiV0:8.7, SebflOh 1.101,8) 
Sectfon 1161.6 is. herebyemerided as foilowš: 
1101.8, Cieanouts required. tleanOuts 'shall be installed in the building Stdrert 
drainage systeni(rernainder Of'sectian unchanged) 

(45) (Page .04i .$qction f108.1) 
Section 12106;1 is hereby athended asfoilows; 
1106.1 Genera The size of the: vertical cohdoctors end leaderS, building 
storm drains, building storm sewers, and any horiionfal branches of Mich 
drains Or-Sewers shell be based. oñ šlx (6) inches per hourrainfall rate, 

(46) (page 91, $eotiOr) 11074 
Section 1107,3 it hereby aniended es fellows: 
1107,3 Sizing of Secondary draing. Secondaiy, (ertetgency) toof (trail) systems 
shall be .sized fry accordance with. Section 1106: Scuppers shall be sized to 
prevent ttie. depth Of poridlrig.  water (belende Of section Unchanged). 

(4) (Pagen qaction 1204) 
Šedtioh 1202.1 is hereby attended es folloWs: 
12041 Nonflammable medical gases. Exception #2 (delete) 

(48) (Page -167, AppendbeA through G) 
, Appendix A through G is hereby amended as follows: 
Appendix A through G are for reference only as adopted and amended by 
other Codes. 

ORD 2012-29 	 Page 12 01.12 

TCMU0005873 

725 



          

T
C

M
U

D
00

5 8
74

 

12 

          

         

         

Is
pi

ed
 a

nd
 P

uW
iW

i e
d 

Jo
in

tl
y  

by
  

        

        

        

        

        

        

         

         

          



  

T
C

M
U

D
00

58
75

 

11 

11 

 

4 

  

     



11! 

t Et vJ 4 s _ 
.1 E 1 

11  S% 	4A g 

T
C

M
U

D
00

58
76

 



T
C

M
U

D
00

58
77

 

It 

!I 2 g',5121-51g 

11 
1$ 

1.2 1.14fit 
0:yl i  
Pital g 
114A1 vis s  
JIMA 

AMi I kA gg,i  
II3V[III! 
.5- 1.14e4 3.11 

g! 	;= 
IM11114 
11:14 Eg 

RIWNI 
318i1431 
W1R4 <1 
II tI141 A 

2!fifl.1141`2 
4  " i2111111 111 ,B 4 "ot0444 
I :111:11AS/ s---vg 
I 1111u 2  12  

• 441111i 

5si a iNai -csie.b. g 
<7441214:1  

g " 
+ A.728-1 

I-4 741i4iligi 14 p... !"' :A1614 4 



ggv gi41 

fli 
1%1  

ltgl 

4oz. 
18,1.0.4 
;IV 

be. A 
341 a 
lab 
'gat] I 
aal 

Uatil  

ill J 

I u 
.sE 
.14 

1517 

lit 	fila 
1E; d  §V11 
41A ,0 
1 	

W41 
14illi 11112  

111 
21104 4104 Aetaj 

A 	s a.t 

Yelei Aibpr 

i '4V*1 11111 

IR': ;1114  it1114 

1111411 r 
ar • 8 4 	8. 3 ,• la  

.. 511'411 .21a  Gi 

i 1161;14 rtillr 

I 	1.11111 "1 
k.). 18.1c l':IS 1P - s1 

I 4111141 
G ngt5 111 It 11 

cd 

T
C

M
U

D
00

58
78

 

t§ 



  

T
C

M
U

D
00

58
79

 

gAlisgotagelf 
41:11111141141i 
P§g7,1liti“wv 
199211011,10% 

141V21111111 
WIlitAgagg 

le511"e4111114  

Lai R 14-  9 1W91#111111°4  

1104:11111111131 

1141%!Lnallis 

1
21g8titg°5411 

111-E4W4 i4011-8  

11 

11 

 



1 

 

*4 4,1 ti as 46.44M4,41 

It 

11 

411 

T
C

M
U

D
00

58
80

 



D
al

la
s.

  'I
X

 75
20

7 

6 

It 



sll 	 Is sii iz 
tjai :VW 4  41  

J.1 13'rt 4 	ig r 41 t pw 0 41  = 
k 411.11 1 	 4. 
411.0.11 :11 1.1111a; 

lig 
141141g 1 ig  II 

14- 	It 
a -2  tfil g I .i18-4  

I :4  4fg 

41,6 

1113 

T
C

M
U

D
00

58
8 2

 



M
e
se

  S
cr

vI
ce

s  

—43.81.4 "g'13 
7alc'IAMItal 111 	1 
njiilli'liV 11 le 1;1  
thit4111-1 	 cs  

.°O.g741 -A 	

Ajil ig 
MI ii a 

2̀.- VAI.  it'lLa al 

411iig. 	Am% 1 
. gliRgil  t E.1-0A4 : itLyt 

a 
n44AS 4 

ff 	1-t c, ral 

lit014] il 41,  rt .414 Xp Rk 
tig3alt, W.  Li 

a-Vail. vi 	
$ 
il Zrlif 1 il 

20a v ea 44  
1 1 	 H 

	

i 

 I! 	la 
tg pads._ a- 

	

g 1-8.s2 11 	q 
gts.g c m -1 ,1 ''' ."44P16'l 11 	14 
siwqlmi. '2' tg 
41A&m:iltiffl-s 21 	at 

,as04—ar4 li 
.., 

aat 	ga.g 
fili 	i u l 4e. Al  
;4 0' t P 
IIIIIIIII 
110gii:11  
9s,  g 

• 

12"i glz4.eA-gt tellmva 
a° t.-9911 

Asa i 5  

T
C

M
U

D
00

58
83

 



:011 

I- °I a 

a 
tt 



ORMIEMONES 

00-ENESSONNIMMUM 
NMORN NENEME 

NOREEN 
00ION 

___Ivq1MOMENONEENSI 
NON SUM RR' 

NENE 
MENNEMICEMMEINSIN 

INMENEMN 

TAINESENONEEN 4.1 • 

1111 AMMO 
vo$SOMINSIMONMI

, 

 

IM 
MI 

Inall 
NOME 
MOO * 

mon,iniume 
II 
E 

MOS 
SSE 

WINEMEENEME 
OREENEENEMEN 

NMENNENSION 
sum 
'SUNS 

E 	IIMEN 
nu 
sommiggsms 
SNONImmum*SIN 

"14  

•ummummummilmussim 

NOBSOME=NEENENOMEMENES 

1111111111E 

.-Immumusimins 

NOiN 

I 

ENMCMONMEMENISOMEN 
MME=M0sEssmONEIME 

ESSIMMESIssmsE 
NEEMESIVINF

I
NE 

EMENEINEIN 

ENNEMEINN 

mumiumn 
NENNONSIO 

'ONENESS 
ENOMISIMBES 
ONSENSIONO 

SEEM 

EMS 
Eg 

0w41111MIMMillai EME MI 
INNEEMOMINENIIMEMEN awliniminlanam MN UNE 

I 
i 

NIOEUMNIONIMMONER-EMEN 
ManummussuriMMONINEM 

NURNINNEM INENENRO 

mumgmaili 
11111=ENINEITIONEINNINSERE 

mum mu 

MVO 
"MAIO 

MINEffinill 
MMOMMENNE UM 

Is 
I 
i 

WW1 J. 
1111191 1 . 

mn.s
tildmiliblinTenlirditillii — 

NESISONSII 

MEMENNINNEISION 
--NI MUM SENN 

ISSIONSEUMMIRMSESSIMEONIENS 
leggammomvougunnum 

MI * MEOW 
NMI 
am 

:1 
0w4SIONNESEM 
4,Anummins 

UM 
momME 
mminsum 

MIMI 

NOMEENSIEMEEEzmillinEWINNUMM 
6 	I 

. 
M 

III 

1411119111 

Ill III  MEM=  MU"  In  MI!  11111111111_ 

libmg_ . 
EMM=MMEREMES 

urn-  

ONSISEE 
a 

MEI 
ESE 
mei a 

INERSINNEaMSENSEMOmmENNE 
EMOREMMCMEMIENENNEENNEN 

NEENNIUMEN 

Eno! 
EISNEENNESIVIN 

um SIMM:MENONE 
MUM ONE 

MESMINOSEMENS 
IsMENEssON 

111 1111111111111m=1111111111 

... 
mg 101.111pplo 

miimimmems. 
11111111anin 

11 11111 1111.11 
immlimmullommamplummis 

711 

um 

REMOMENIMENIX 

MEINIENSNEMEN 

1111111 

ONUS 
MU 

NES 

Img 

ME 
II= 

=-Fma.. ...mmoms 
OMMIM 
VIM 

NUNN 
SEEMS 
sam•- 

up n ROO 
MU 

MN  
EN 

E 

immanummin 
EMOWEINNE 

IIMENISOMMENCM 

IMIMERISSOMEIMPIPM 
rinspormmirzEplihn 

OMOMMIENSOCURNERESE 
MENANENBREMEMMINEENOMENNEENEN 

mu 

INIONNINEll NEE 1  
semi in 

i 

nu us ONE XS 
1111111111112111111 
min  

- 	-0 TSB 
sill 

11 1111 
Nil 

L
N 

NOMMMINE 
EM I 

SEW 

1 

ME 
I

T 
INESENNEE 

EMEMEENNEEN 111611116=11111.411111111 
'b  II 11 

mile-g 
tiiiii 

0: 

MROMMAIMMOM 

Ilk  

1 

I 

I 

i 
-4 1111111 

'WO 

:11014-i- 

a 	Al g 
f 

,0,414 

TCMUD005885 
737 



g,R. 8 8 Ei 8 E 1,! 94 8 8 8 8 8 sqsa 
sasgar.ciaga-4=vaoetratagg 

4 	
0. .. 

It 	.  
i n 	fi it 	hitt 
2 11 1  8' it  1019111 
i IlliihlOiaisaLigm 

T
C

M
U

D
00

58
86

 

11 

tz! 



" 11  1111111 gl i litlil  il li illphili A iittif 
i Wit 19 ;. 110110111 1  Vlie 

1 	t 	
ill li nillitli i 41411 
41 1 .4.1.;- 43 . 11 12)4ii 

	

ki I 	
ill li liltai MU li liks4  
911 li li'llitilllt jt ilitil 1 .1... i 	11..i r et et 	pi 

	

t6 5  1 	
0A2. 1 A EM U  ji.  1 ti 1 1, ft 

fril It! 1,4111141  11 il iii ii 

	

901 	1  

	

I 	 IN; glis P 441[1 8141 ig itqf 4 r  a 

	

.i 	I 111 fifverli!- li 1.711; 1 

	

0 	§1 	4.§ 42  -silhlosd Es 1411111  

	

c 	i 	
II/ 	111 lit Vjariii 11  111';:t 

0 
I 11,1  1 14 ' lii : iisRilla ;I ;Intl 

1  1111! 1 41 41.1  4 	
4 a 

A A'AgA 3 ii li 

T
C

M
U

D
00

58
87

10
  





T
C

M
U

D
00

58
89

 



A 	Allar6 	.13  
41 	 x 

IN 	

A 	jail i  II 1 11 6' 	• filli.81 	4 

1  

!I! ilil 
-- ilIA ic 

4 It 
Z 	 ifilVIA  5  illi 
R 	 gi 	lizifil  t I 	.. IA; 0 	 Al 	t atr VI V 1 Z  

g 	
ai 

OP 1 	J4 Slitlil 0 	ill big 
I/1 	 g  WIT. ' 

lailliA i 	;if litill i 1 1 Ai # r-r- 1 0  n 4111441  ; : pi T1 4 	 t 
lin § I tV3 u  iFt 

& 	 i 4 	A 	 a lid Pill 
.F. 	k Il 21011; 1  ii 111.4 

1  Phi 	
3 g 

li 1  illill] i  II dip i 2:2  
hi 

hip 	Pit A'  / X lilh 	I 

8Ig A 1 k ligi 	r = e fp - tif I :i. ifi ..„1 	.0 

T
C

M
U

D
00

58
90

  



 

31 
IV 

gg 

T
C

M
U

D
00

58
91

 

6 .2 6 s g 2 

 



It 

it 

11 
as, 

T
C

M
U

D
00

58
92

 



TiAllid14  
leritill 
tiltil VI:. lskAssii/41  

1 
M5111114 
1 4Illatili 
tfiglil"  
121tf1211" il ISZa AO .0 4:511 ill 
Piliel 
l'a§ vlii slegli..da 1-1- • '1r" 4fl'1EliggV 
Pia:Sgagal .41'8.sapi Vyeg ...1 el'g 4A144 
1111.11:101 
Je;:811illi 
Vii4;1/3a 
Avaiglila 

T
C

M
U

D
00

5 8
93

 

8 



‘24! 
It 

T
C

M
U

D
00

5 8
94

 



EXHIBIT K 

TCMUD005895 

747 



TCEQ COMMISSIOTRS/OGC Fax:5122395533 	May 5 2014 02:17Pm P002/003 

Bryan W. Shaw, 	OW/7W 
Toby Baker; Coinmissioner 
Zak Covar, Commissioner 

TEXAS COMMISSPN ON ENVIRONTVIENTAL QUALM 
ProteptIng Thxas bRedudtig cmd Preventing Pollution 

May 5, 2014 

To: 	Persons on the attached mailing 4st (by mail and facsimile as indicated) 

Re: 	Motions to Overturn the • Executive Director's Approval of an Engineering Project and 
Bond Issuance for Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No, 1; TCEQ Docket No. 
2014:•0347-DIS; Internal Control No. D-09242013-030. 

This courtesy letter is in response to the above referenced Motions to Overturn 

("Motions"). Complete oopies of the fili4gs may be obtained from the Office of Chief CIerlc, 
TCEQ, Mail Code 105, P.O. Box 13087, Austin, Texas 78711-3087. 

Section 50.139 of 30 Texas Administrative Códe applies to these Motions. This letter is 
to notify all persons that, according to the •Chief Clerk's records, the Motions overruled by 
operation of law on May 2, 2014. • • 

If you have'any questions about this Matter, please contact Barham A. Richard, Assistant 
General:Counsel, at (512) 239-0107. 

Anne Idcsl. 	, 
General Counsel 

Mailing List 

P.O. Box 13087 e. Au:stin. Thus 78711-3087 • 512-239-io  oo toeq.texas.gov  
Flowiguyarcustomerservim? voltaxmlgov/customersurvey 

pdaitd Acrem paw 

TCMUD005896 

748 



ICU OOMMISSIONERS/OGC Fax:5122395533 	Nay 5 2014 02:17pm P003/003 

'Mi1ing Lišt. 
Trophy Club MUD No. 1 

TCEQ DocketNo. 2014-0347-DIS 

kunifer McKnight 
General Manager 
Trophy Club MUD No. 1 
100 Municipal Drive 
Trophy Club, Texas 76262 

Robin A. Meivim 
Graveš, Dougherty, Ilearon & Moody, P.C. 
401. Congress Ave., Suite 2200 
Austin, Texas 78701 
512/480-5600 FAX 512/480-5888 

Stephen C. Dickman. 
301 Congtess Ave., Suite 2000 
Austin, Texas 78701 
512/495-6400 FAX 512/495-6401 

David Klein. 
Lloyd, Gosselink, Rochelle & Townsend, P.C. . 
816 Congress Ave., Suite 1900 
Austin., Texas 78701 
512/322-5800 FAX 512/472-0532 

Anthony S. Corbett 
Freeman & Corbett 
8500 Bluffstone Cove, Suite B-104 
Austin, Texas 78759 . 
512/451-6689 FAX 512/453-0865 

Tustin Taack 
TCEQ Water.Supply Division MC 154 
PO Box 13087 
Austin, Texas 7871'1-3087 	. 
512/239-1122 FAX 512/239-6145 

Todd Oaliga 
TCEQ Environmental Law Division MC 173 
P.O. Box 13087 
Austin, Texas 78711-3087 
512/239-0600.FAX 512/239-0606 

Blas Coy 
TCBQ OfEce of Public Interest Counsel MC 103. 
P.O. Box 13087 
AuStin, Texas 78711-3087 
512/239-6363 FAX 512/239-6377  

Docket Clerk 
TCEQ Office of cbief Clerk MC 105 
P.O. Box 13087 	• 
Austin; Texas 78711-3087. 
512/239-3300 FAX 512/239-3311 

Brian Christian 
TCEQ SBEA Division 
Public Participation and Education Program MC 108 
P.O. BOx 13087 
'Austin, Texas 78711-3087 
512/239-4000 FAX 512/239-5678 

TCMUD005897 

749 



Filed In The 
of Travis-Count% Ulf__ 

OCT 
NO. D-1-GN-14-001983 

EX PARTE 
	

IN THE DISTRICT COURT OP 

TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY 
	

TRAVIS COUNTY, TEXAS 
DISTRICT NO. 1 

201st JUDICIAL DISTRICT 

FINAL JUDGMENT 

On July 14, 2014 and October 27, 2014, the Court conducted a trial on the Original 

Petition for Expedited Declaratory Judgment and Motion for Consolidation (the "Petition) filed, 

pursuant to Chapter 1205 of the Texas Government Code ("Chapter 1205), by the Trophy Club 

Municipal Utility District No. 1 (the "Districr) in the above-styled cause (the "Chapter 1205 

Suit"), The District appeared and announced ready by and through its counsel of record. The 

Attomey General of the State of Texas, having been served with process as required by Chapter 

1205, filed an Original Answer and appeared. Opposing party Maguire Partners Solana Land, 

L.P. (`Maguire") also appeared and announced ready for trial. The Court heard and considered 

arguments of counsel, all present opposing parties or intervenors, and evidence presented relative 

to the relief sought in the Petition. 

On July 14, 2014, the Honorable Judge Lora Livingston entered an order that 

consolidated the following administrative appeals with the Chapter 1205 Suit: (i) Maguire 

Partners — Solana Land, L.P. v. Texas Commission on Environmental Quality and Richard 

Hyde, in his official capacity as Executive Director, Cause No. D-1-GN-14-000716, filed in the 

126th Judicial District Court of Travis County, Texas (the "First State Court Action), and (ii) 

Maguire Partners — Solana Land, L.P. v. Texas Commission on Environmental Quality and 

Richard Hyde, in his official capacity as Executive Director, Cause No. D-1-GN-14-001623, 

filed in the 53rd Judicial District of Travis County, Texas (the "Second State Court Action"; 

Final Judgment . 	 - 1 -  
40R04124.4 

TCMUD005898 
750 



collectively with the First State Court Action, the "Administrative Appeals"). This Court has 

jurisdiction over the Administrative Appeals. Further, the Court concludes that Chapter 1205 

confers jurisdiction to fully and finally adjudicate all issues that have been or could be raised in 

any forum that affect the District's authority to construct and finance the Necessary 

Improvements and issue the Proposed Bonds, both as defined and described in the Petition and 

below, including without limitation all claims and matters asserted in the Administrative 

Appeals. 

The Court, having considered the Petition, together with the arguments, authorities, and 

evidence submitted in support thereof, is of the opinion that the Petition is meritorious and 

should be, and hereby is, GRANTED. All questions of fact were submitted to the Court through 

proffered evidence. Such evidence, together with the arguments and authorities cited by counsel, 

supports and is the basis of the Court's findings and conclusions. In support of this Final 

Judgment, the Court makes the following findings and conclusions: 
F 

1. The District has complied with the statutory requirements of Chapter 1205, 

including without limitation, the provisions referenced herein. 

2. The District is a political subdivision of the State of Texas created by a March 4, 

1975 Order of the Texas Water Commission (the predecessor to the Texas Commission on 

Environmental Quality ("TCEO")). Therefore, the District is an "issuer as defined in TEX. 

GOV'T CODE ANN. § 1205.001( I ) and may issue "public securities" as the term is defined in TEX. 

Gov'T CODE ANN. § 1 205.00 I (2). 

3. On August 27, 2013, the District passed Resolution No. 2013-0827A that 

authorized and directed the President and Secretary of the District's Board of Directors, the 
L 

District's attorneys, and the District's engineers: 

Final Jud 	 - 2 - 
401304124.4 

TCMUD005899 

751 



(a) To make application to [TCEQ] for an investigation and report upon the 
feasibility of the District's financing that portion of the Project described 
in the Engineering Report prepared by The Wallace Group in connection 
with this application. 

(b) To request [TCEQ] to approve the unlimited tax and/or unlimited tax and 
revenue bonds of the District in the principal amount not to exceed 
$5,769,217 and the revenue bonds of the District in the principal qmount 
not to exceed $9,230,783, each bearing interest at a net effective interest 
rate not to exceed the maximum legal limit in effect at the time of 
issuance, and each maturing serially in accordance with the schedule 
provided in the aforesaid application and Engineering Report. 

4. On or about September 24, 2013, the District filed an application with TCEQ for 

expedited approval of a proposed engineering project and the issuance of up to $5,769,217 in 

principal amount of its unlimited tax and/or combination unlimited tax and revenue bonds, and 

up to $9,230,783 in revenue bonds, for the purpose of financing improvements to its wastewater 

treatment plant and sewer system (the "Wastewater Treatment Plana 

5. On February 6, 2014, TCEQ entered AN ORDER APPROVING (1) AN 

ENGINEERING PROJECT, (2) THE ISSUANCE OF $5,765,000 IN UNLIMITED TAX 

BONDS, AND (3) THE ISSUANCE OF $9,230,000 IN REVENUE BONDS FOR [THE 

DISTRICT] (the "TCEO Qrder").  The TCEQ Order approved the District's issuance of up to 

$14,995,000 in bonds to finance improvements to the Wastewater Treatment Plant (up to 

$5,765,000 in principal amount of its unlimited tax bonds and up to $9,230,000 in revenue 

bonds). 

6. On March 7, 2014, Maguire filed the First State Court Action requesting that the 

Court set aside the TCEQ Order or remand it back to TCEQ for reconsideration or for a 

contested case evidentiary hearing. On May 30, 2014, Maguire filed the Second State Court 

Action requesting, in addition to the same relief it requested in the First State Court Action, that 

the Court set aside TCEQ's denial of Maguire's Motion to Overturn the TCEQ Order. The Court 

Final Judonent 	 - 3 - 
40804124.4 

TCMUD005900 

752 



finds that (i) the TCEQ Order should be, and hereby is, affirmed in its entirety and (ii) all relief 

requested by Maguire in the Administrative Appeals Should be, .and hereby is, denied with 

prejudice. 

7. On June 23, 2014, pursuant to Chapter 1205, the District filed the Petition in the 

Chapter 1205 Suit. -Pursuant to TEX. GOV'T CODE § 1205.024, the Petition briefly sets out, by 

allegation, reference, or exhibit (1) the District's authority to issue the Proposed Bonds described 

in the Petition, (2) the purpose of the Proposed Bonds described in the Petition, (3) the holding 

and result of any required election, (4) a copy of or a pertinent excerpt from each public šecurity 

authorization, including any essential action or expenditure of motrey, (5) the amount or 

proposed mnximum amount of the public securities, (6) the interest rate or rates or the proposed 

maximum interest rate of the public securities, and (7) any other pertinent matter. 

8. Venue for the Chapter 1205 Suit is proper in this Court pursuant to TEX. GOv'T 

CODE ANN. § 1205.022, since this is "a district court of Travis County?! 

9. - The District properly and timely served the Attorney General of the State of 

Texas as required by TEX. Gov'T CODE ANN. § 1205.042. 

10. Pursuant to TEX. GOV'T CODE § 1205.041, on receipt of the Petition, the Court 

immediately entered an Order Setting Hearing that directed the clerk of the Court to issue an 

Order and Notice of Hearing (the "Order) in the form of a notice to all of the Interested Persons. 

The Order, in general terms and without naming them, advised the Interested Persons and the 

Attorney General of the State of Texas of their right to (1) appear for trial at 10:00 a.m. on the 

first Monday after the 20th day after the date of the Order, and (2) show cause why the Petition 

should not be granted and the public securities or the public security authorization-validated and 

confirmed. The Order further gave a general description of the Petition. 

Final Judgment 	 - 4 -  
40804124.4 

TCMUD005901 

753 



11. Proper and timely notice of the filing of the Chapter 1205 Suit, and of its initial 

July 14, 2014 trial setting, was provided. Specifically, notice was provided by Order, and 

publication of a substantial copy of the same was timely made in newspapers of general 

circulation in Travis, Denton, and Tarrant Counties, Texas in accordance with TEX. Gov'T CODE 

ANN. § 1205.043.1  Such publication is evidenced by the Affidavits of Publication filed of record 

in this matter on behalf of the Austin American-Statesman, Fort Worth Star-Telegram, and 

Denton Record-Chronicle. 

12. On July 14, 2014, at 10:00 a.m., the Chapter 1205 Suit was called for trial as 

mandated by TEX. GOV'T CODE § 1205.04I(b). Counsel for the District, the Attorney General of 

the State of Texas, TCEQ and Richard Hyde (in his official capacity as Executive Director of 

TCEQ), and Maguire made an appearance on the record, and Judge Livingston entered an order 

that consolidated the Administrative Appeals with the Chapter 1205 Suit and continued the trial 

of the Chapter 1205 Suit until October 27, 2014. 

13. The Court has in rem jurisdiction, as well as personal jurisdiction, pursuant to 

TEX. GOV'T CODE ANN. §§ 1205.041-1205.044, over all persons who reside in the territory of 

the District, own property located within the boundaries of the District, are taxpayers of the 

District, or have or claim a right, title or interest in any property or money to be affected by the 

public security authorization or the issuance of the public securities by the District (collectively, 

the "Interested Partiee),  including without limitation Maguire, and over the District and the 

Attorney General of the State of Texas. 

14. The Court has subject matter jurisdiction over this action pursuant to TEX. GOV'T 

CODE ANN. § 1205.021. Each category of relief the District seeks in the Petition is within the 

' The District is located entirely within Tarrant County, Texas and Denton County, Texas, and has its principal 
office in Denton County, Texas. 

Final Judgment 	 - 5 - 
40804124.4 

TCMUD005902 

754 



subject matt& set forth in TEX. GOV'T CODE ANN. § 1205.021 and the Court has the jurisdiction 

to fully and finally adjudicate the issues raised in the Petition, including without limitation the - 

District's requests for a declaratory judgment to conclusively establish (i) the District's authority 

to issue unlimited tax bonds and revenue bondš in one or more series in an aggregate principal 

amount not to exceed $14,995,000 (up to $5,765,000 in•principal amount of its unlimited tax 

bonds and up to $9,230,000 in revenue bonds) pursuant to the terms and conditions specified in 

one or more bond orders (the "ProposedBonds"),2  (ii) the legality and validity of using funds 

from the Proposed Bonds to finance improvements to the Wastewater Treatment Plant, (iii) the 

DistriCt's authority.to  iward contracts for the construCtion of such improvements, and (iv) the 

validity of the TCEQ Order. 

15. The District intends to use the Proposed Bonds to finance the design, planning, 

acquisition, Construction, and equipping of necessary iinprovements to the Wastewater 

Treatment Plant (the "Necessary Improvements"). 

16. ' The Necessary Improvements are needed and necessary for the District to 

maintain regulatory compliance, to meet its c'ustomers service demands as the District's 

p&pulation increases, and to continue to support the health, safety, and welfire of the District's 

population. 

17. Pursuant to, among other things,The TCEQ Order and Sections 49.181 and 54.501 

of the Texas Waier Code, the District is authorized to issue and deliver the Proposed Bonds in 

connection with the financing of the Necessary Improvements as 'described in the Petition in one 

2 The Proposed Bonds are moré particularly described in Exhibits A and B to the Petition (with 
such changes and completion of blanks as are reasonably appropriate to accornmodate the 
structure of one or more series of Proposed Bonds as each particular series of Proposed Bonds is 
priced and sold or in order to obtain the approval of the Attorney General of the State Texas 
pursuant to TEX. Gov. CODE § 1202.003). 

Finql Judgment 	 - 6 -  
40/104124.4 

TCMUD005903 

755 



or more series in an aggregate principal amount not to exceed $14,995,000, such amount 

consisting of the sum of up to $5,765,000 in unlimited tax bonds and up to $9,230,000 in 

revenue bonds. The Proposed Bonds, in the form described in Exhibits A and B to the Petition 

(with such changes and completion of blanks as are reasonably appropriate to accommodate the 

structure of one or more series of Proposed Bonds as each particular series of Proposed Bonds is 

priced and sold or in order to obtain the approval of the Attorney General of the State Texas 

pursuant to TEX. GOV. CODE § 1202.003) will constitute lawful and valid obligations and 

contracts of the District, enforceable according to their terms, and all provisions for the payment 

of, and pledges, liens and security provided for such debt and the interest thereon will constitute 

valid and binding obligations and contracts of the District under the laws of the State of Texas. 

18. Pursuant to Tex. Water Code § 54.505, voter approval is not required for the 

District's issuance of the up to $9,230,000 in revenue bonds that were approved by the TCEQ 

Order. 

19. With respect to the District's issuance of up to $5,765,000 in unlimited tax bonds 

for the Necessary Improvements, the District currently has $5,769,217 in voted but unissued tax 

bonds. Therefore, the District has sufficient voter approval to issue the up to $5,765,000 in 

unlimited tax bonds that were approved by the TCEQ Order. Specifically, an election was held 

May 9, 2009, whereby voters from Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1 and voters from 

Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 2 approved the consolidation of the districts and 

specifically authorized (i) each district to assume the other district's outstanding bonds, notes, 

and obligations and voted but unissued bonds payable in whole or in part from taxation, (ii) the 

District to provide for the payment of principal of and interest on the outstanding bonds, notes 

and obligations of former Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. l and former Trophy Club 

Final Judgment 	 - 7 -  
40804124.4 

TCMUD005904 

756 



Municipal Utility District No. 2, through the levy and collection of a sufficient ad valorem tax 

upon all taxable property within the District, and (iii) the District to issue for and in the name of 

the District the voted but unissued bonds of former Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. l 

in the amount of $3,229,217 and of former Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 2 in the 

amount of $4,540,000, being assumed by the District, as may be appropriate under the specific 

authority and terms and conditions of the propositions submitted at the elections authorizing the 

same, and to provide for the payment of the principal of and interest on such bonds by the levy 

and collection of a sufficient tax upon all taxable property within the District. 

20. 	The actions taken or to be taken by the District, including the undertaking of 

obligations, execution of contracts, and issuance and delivery of the Proposed Bonds are legal, 

valid, binding, enforceable, and, with respect to the Proposed Bonds, upon approval by the 

Attorney General of the State of Texas, will be incontestable under Texas law. Moreover, each 

expenditure or proposed expenditure of money related to the Necessary Improvements is legal 

and valid. - 

IT IS THEREFORE ORDERED; ADJUDGED and DECREED that, purstiant to 

Chapter 1205, the District is entitled to a Final Declaratory Judgment as follows: 

(a) the District is an "issuer of "public securities's within the meaning of TEx.,Gov. 

CODE § 1205.001; 

(b) the TCEQ Order is a valid and final order of the TCEQ that may not be 

challenged in this Court or any other court, agency, or forum; 

(c) the District is authorized to issue and to deliver up to $5,765,000 in principal 

amount of its unlimited tax bonds and up to $9,230,000 in revenue bonds to finance the 

Necessary Improvements, in one or more series pursuant to the terms and conditions specified in 

Final Judament 	 - 8 - 
40804124.4 

TCMUD005905 

757 



the bond orders, substantial copies of which are attached as Exhibits A and B to the Petition, 

with such changes and completion of blanks as are reasonably appropriate to accommodate the 

structure of a particular series of the Proposed Bonds as each particular series of Proposed Bonds 

is priced and sold and in order to obtain the approval of the Attorney General of Texas pursuant 

to TEX. Gov. CODE §1202.003; 

(d) the actions taken or to be taken by the District, including regarding the issuance 

and delivery of the Proposed Bonds pursuant to the provisions of Chapters 49 and 54 of the 

Texas Water Code are valid, binding, and incontestable under Texas law; 

(e) the contracts and agreements executed or proposed to be executed by the District 

in connection with completing the Necessary Improvements are valid and legally binding 

contracts and agreements, and are incontestable under Texas law; and 

(f) the Proposed Bonds and each installment thereof, when issued and executed 

pursuant to the procedural requirements provided by law, including approval by the Attorney 

General of Texas, will constitute lawful and valid obligations and contracts of the District, 

enforceable according to their respective terms, and that all provisions for the payment of, and 

pledges, liens and security provided for such debt and the interest thereon will constitute valid 

and binding obligations and contracts of the District under the laws of the State of Texas. 

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED, ADJUDGED and DECREED that the TCEQ Order is 

affirmed in its entirety. 

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED, ADJUDGED and DECREED that all relief requested 

by Maguire in the Administrative Appeals, or otherwise in this consolidating proceeding, is 

denied with prejudice. 

Final Judgment 	 - 9 -  
4014041 24.4 

TCMUD005906 

758 

1 



IT IS FURTHER ORDERED, ADJUDGED and DECREED that the Proposed Bonds 

shall be sold in compliance yrith the TCEQ Order. 

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED, ADJUDGED and DECREED that, pursuant to TEX. 

GOV'T CODE ANN. § 1205.151, this Final Judgment shall, as to all matters adjudicated, be forever 

binding and conclusive against the District, the Attomey General of the State of Texas, and all 

Interested Parties, irrespective of whether any such parties filed an answer or otherwise appeared 

herein. 

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED, ADJUDGED and DECREED that, pursuant to TEX. 

GOV'T CODE ANN. § 1205.151, this Final Judgment shall constitute a permanent injunction 

against the filing by any person or entity of any action or proceeding contesting the validity of 

the Proposed Bonds, the'authorization of the Proposed Bonds, the expenditure of money relating 

to the Proposed Bonds, the provisions made for the payment of the Proposed Bonds or of interest 

thereon, any matter adjudicated by this Final Judgment,"and any matter that could have been 

raised in these proceedings. 

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED, ADJUDGED and DECREED that the Proposed Bonds 

may include a certificate that contains the follow statement: "This obligation was validated and 

confirmed by a judgment entered on [insert applicable date] by the 53rd Judicial District Court, 

Travis County, Texas, in Ex Parte Trophy Chth MuniczPal Utility District No. I , Cause No. D-1-

GN-14-001983, which perpetually enjoins the commencement of any suit, action, or proceeding 

involving the validity of this obligation, or the provision made for the payment of the principal 

and interest of the obligation." 

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED, ADJUDGED and DECREED that the District may (a) 

complete any blanks contained in the forms of all documents and instruments proposed to be 

Final Judtment 	 - 10 - 
40804124.4 

TCAWD01115907 

.759 



E PRES 

executed, submitted or delivered as set forth in the Petition (with such changes and completion of 

blanks as are reasonably appropriate to accommodate the structure of one or more series of 

Proposed Bonds as each particular series of Proposed Bonds is priced and sold); (b) correct 

clerical errors as may be discovered in the bond orders that are attached to the Petition as 

Exhibits A and B; (c) make changes or corrections to the bonds orders that are attached to the 

Petition as Exhibits A and B, or to any of the documents authorized and approved by the bond 

orders, (i) in order to cure any ambiguity, formal defect, or omission in the bond order or such 

other document, (ii) as may be suggested or required by the initial purchasers of or credit 

enhancers for the Proposed Bonds, subject to the approval of the Attorney General of the State 

Texas, (iii) as may be suggested or required by the Attorney General of the State of Texas or his 

representative prior to obtain the approval of the Proposed Bonds by the Attorney General of the 

State of Texas, and (iv) as may be required or allowed by this Final Judgment. 

The Court denies all other relief not granted in this Final Judgment. This Final Judgment 

disposes of all parties and all claims, and is appealable. 

SO ORDERED AND ADJUDGED on this 30 day of October, 2014. 

Final Judement 	 - 1 1 -  
40504 I 24.4 

TCMUD005908 

760 



RESOLUTION 2013-0827B 

TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 1 

RESOLUTION TO DECLARE OFFICIAL INTENT TO 
REIMBURSE COSTS OF THE UTILITY SYSTEM 
IMPROVEMENT PROJECT 

WHEREAS, the Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1 (the "Districe) is a duly 
created governmental body of the State of Texas; 

WHEREAS, the District expects to pay, or have paid on its behalf, expenditures in 
connection with the design, planning, acquisition, construction and equipping of improvements 
to the wastewater treatment plant and other improvements to the water and sewer system (the 
"Project") prior to the issuance of tax-exempt obligations, tax-credit obligations and/or 
obligations for which a prior expression of intent to finance or refinance is required by Federal or 
state law (collectively and individually, the "Obligatione') to finance the Project; 

WHEREAS, the District finds, considers, and declares that the reimbursement for the 
payment of such expenditures will be appropriate and consistent with the lawful objectives of the 
District and, as such, chooses to declare its intention to reimburse itself for such payments at 
such time as it issues Obligations to finance the Project; 

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF 
TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 1: 

Section 1. The District reasonably expects to incur debt, as one or more series of 
Obligations, with an aggregate maximum principal amount equal to $15,000,000 for the purpose 
of paying the costs of the Project. 

Section 2. All costs to be reimbursed pursuant hereto will be capital expenditures. No 
Obligations will be issued by the District in furtherance of this Statement after a date which is 
later than 18 months after the later of (1) the date the expenditures are paid or (2) the date on 
which the property, with respect to which such expenditures were made, is placed in service. 

Section 3. The foregoing notwithstanding, no Obligation will be issued pursuant to this 
Statement more than three years after the date any expenditure which is to be reimbursed is paid. 

Section 4. The foregoing Sections 2 and 3 notwithstanding, all costs to be reimbursed 
with qualified tax credit obligations shall not be paid prior to the date hereof and no tax credit 
obligations shall be issued after 18 months of the date the original expenditure is made. 

TCMUD005909 

761 



PASSED AND APPROVED THIS AUGUST 27, 2013. 

TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY 
DISTRICT NO. 1 

Jim Moss 
President, 	ard of Directors 

ATTEST: 

Kevin R. Carr 
Secretary, Board of Directors 

TCMUD005910 

762 



SELECTED PROVISIONS OF THE BOND ORDER 

SECTION 1: Definitions and Interpretations. 

(a) 	Unless otherwise expressly provided or unless the context clearly requires 
otherwise, in this Order the following terms shall have the meanings specified below: 

"Additional Parity Obligations" means the additional parity obligations 
permitted to be issued by Section 18 of this Order. 

"Average Annual Debt Service Requirements", means that average 
amount which, at the time of domputation, will be required to pay the Debt 
Service Requirement on all outstanding Bonds and Additional Parity Obligations 
when due (either at Stated Maturity or mandatory redemption) and derived by 
dividing the total of such Debt Service Requirement by the number of Fiscal 
Years then remaining before Stated Maturity of such Bonds and Additional Parity 
Obligations. For purposes of this definition, a fractional period of a Fiscal Year 
shall be treated as an entire Fiscal Year. Capitalized interest payments provided 
from bond proceeds and accrued interest on the Parity Revenue Obligations be 
excluded in making the aforementioned computation. 

"Closing Date" means the date of the initial delivery of and payment for 
the Bonds. 

"Code" means the Internal Revenue Code of 1986, as aniended, 
including applicable regulations, published rulings and court decisions relating 
thereto. 

"Construction Fund" means the construction fund established by Section. 
12 of this Order. 

"Debt Service Requirements" means as of any particular date of 
computation, with respect to any obligations and with respect to any period, the 
aggregate of the amounts to be paid or set aside by the District as of such date 
or in such period for the payment of the principal of, premium, if any, and interest 
(to the extent not capitalized) on such obligations; assuming, in the case of 
obligations without a fixed numerical rate, that such obligations bear interest 
calculated by assuming (i) that the interest rate for every 12-month period on 
such bonds is equal to the rate of interest reported in the most recently published 
edition of The Bond Buyer (or its successor) at the time of calculation as the 
"Revenue Bond Index" or, if such Revenue Bond Index is no longer being 
maintained by The Bond Buyer (or its successor) at the time of calculation, such 
interest rate shall be assumed to be 80% of the rate of interest then being paid 
on United States Treasury obligations of like maturity and (ii) that the principal of 
such bonds is amortized such that annual debt.service is substantially level over 
the remaining stated life of such bonds, and further assuming in the case of 
obligations required to be redeemed or prepaid as to principal prior to Stated 
Maturity, the principal arbounts thereof will be redeemed prior to Stated Maturity 
in accordance with the mandatory redemption provisions applicable thereto. 

B-1 

TCMUD005911 

763 



"Designated Payment/Transfer Office" means (i) with respect to the initial 
Paying Agent/Registrar named herein, its designated office in St. Paul, 
Minnesota, and (ii) with respect to any successor Paying Agent/Registrar, the 
office of such successor designated and located as may be agreed upon by the 
District and such successor. 

"Event of Default" means any Event of Default as defined in Section 20 of 
this Order. 

"Existing Obligations" means the outstanding Trophy Club Municipal 
Utility District No. 1 Revenue Note, Series 2012 and Trophy Club Municipal Utility 
District No. 1 Revenue Note, Series 2013. 

"Fiscal Year means the twelve-month accounting period used by the 
District currently ending on September 30 of each year. 

"Government Securities" (i) direct noncallable obligations of the United 
States of America, including obligations the principal of and interest on which are 
unconditionally guaranteed by the United States of America, (ii) noncallable 
obligations of an agency or instrumentality of the United States, including 
obligations unconditionally guaranteed or insured by the agency or 
instrumentality and on the date of their acquisition or purchase by the District are 
rated as to investment quality by a nationally recognized investment rating firm 
not less than AAA or its equivalent, (iii) noncallable obligations of a state or an 
agency or a county, municipality, or other political subdivision of a state that have 
been refunded and on the date of their acquisition or purchase by the District, are 
rated as to investment quality by a nationally recognized investment rating firm 
not less than AAA or its equivalent and (iv) any other then authorized securities 
or obligations under applicable law that may be used to defease obligations such 
as the Bonds. 

"Initial Bond" means the Bond described in Section 9. 

"Interest and Sinking Fund" means the interest and sinking fund 
established by Section 12 of this Order. 

"Interest Payment Date" means the date or dates upon which interest on 
the Bonds is scheduled to be paid until the maturity of the Bonds, such dates 
being March 1 and September 1 of each year commencing September 1, 2015. 

"Net Revenues" and "Net Revenues of the System" mean all of the 
revenues of every kind and nature received through the operation of the System, 
less the expenses of operation and maintenance paid thereof, including salaries, 
labor, materials, repairs and extensions necessary to render efficient service; 
provided, however, that only such repairs and extensions as in the judgment of 
the Board, reasonably and fairly exercised, are necessary to keep the System in 
operation and render adequate service to the District and the inhabitants thereof, 
or such as might be necessary to meet some physical accident or condition 
which would otherwise impair the security of the Bond or the Additional Parity 
Obligations shall be deducted in determining "Net Revenues". 

"Bonds" means the District's revenue bond entitled "Trophy Club 
Municipal Utility District No. 1 Water and Sewer System Revenue Bonds, Series 
2015" authorized to be issued by this Order. 

B-2 

TCMUD005912 

764 



"Order means this Order. 

"Outstanding" - When used in this Order with respect to Bonds or Parity 
Revenue Obligations means, as of the date of determination, all Bonds 
theretofore issued and delivered, except: 

(1) 	those Bonds or Parity Revenue Obligations 
cancelled by the Paying Agent/Registrar or delivered to the Paying 
Agent/Registrar for cancellation; 

, 	(2) 	those Bonds or Parity Revenue Obligations paid or 
deemed to be paid in accordance with the provisions of Section 22 
hereof, or substantially similar provisions with respect to Parity 
Revenue Obligations; and 

(3) 	those Bonds or Parity Revenue Obligations that have 
been mutilated, destroyed, lost, or*.stolen and replacement Bonds 
have been registered and delivered in lieu thereof as provided in 
Section 21 hereof or similar provisions with respect to Parity 
Revenue Obligations. 

"Parity Revenue Obligations" means the Bonds, the Existing Obligations, 
and Additional Parity Obligations. 

"Paying Agent/Registrar means BOKF, NA dba Bank of Texas, Austin, 
Texas, any successor thereto or an entity which is appointed as and assumes 
the duties of paying agent/registrar as provided in this Order. 

"Project" shall mean the acquisition, construction and equipment of 
improvements to the District's wastewater treatment facilities. 

"Record Date" means the fifteenth (15th) day of the month next preceding 
an Interest Payment Date. 

"Reserve Fund" means the fund established in Section 12 of this Order. 

"Required Reserve" means the amount required to be deposited and 
maintained in the Reserve Fund under the provisions of Section 15 of this Order. 

"System" means the District's water and sewer system, including all 
present and future extensions, additions, replacements and improvements 
thereto. 

(b) Unless the context requires otherwise, words of the masculine gender shall be 
construed to include correlative words of the feminine and neuter genders and vice versa, and 
words of the singular number shall be construed to include correlative words of the plural 
number and vice versa. 

(c) This Order and all the terms and provisions hereof shall be liberally construed to 
effectuate the purposes set forth herein to sustain the validity of this Order. 

SECTION 11: Pledge-Security for the Bonds.  

(a) 	, The Parity Revenue Obligations, incluaing the Bonds, and the interest thereon, 
and any and all other amounts payable thereunder, are and shall be secured by and payable 
from a first lien on and pledge of the Net Revenues of the System (with the exception of those in 

TCMUD005913 

765 



excess of the amounts required to establish and maintain the Interest and Sinking Fund 
hereinafter provided); and the revenues herein pledged are further pledged to the establishment 
and maintenance of the Interest and Sinking Fund hereinafter provided. 

(b) The Bonds are special obligations of the District secured by and payable from a 
first lien on and pledge of the Net Revenues of the System, as provided in this Order, and is not 
a charge on the property of the District or on taxes levied by the District. 	No part of the 
obligation evidenced by the Bonds, whether principal, interest or other obligation, shall ever be 
paid from taxes levied or collected by the District. 

(c) Chapter 1208, Texas Government Code applies to the issuance of the Bond and 
the pledge of the Net Revenues granted by the District under Section 11(a) of this Order, and 
such pledge, therefore, is valid, effective, and perfected. If Texas law is amended at any time 
while the Bonds are outstanding and unpaid such that the pledge of the revenues granted by 
the District under Section 11(a) above is to be subject to the filing requirements of Chapter 9, 
Texas Business and Commerce Code, then in order to preserve to the registered owners of the 
Bond the perfection of the security interest in said pledge, the District agrees to take such 
measures as it determines are reasonable and necessary under Texas law to comply with the 
applicable provisions of Chapter 9, Business and Commerce Code and enable a filing to perfect 
the security interest in said pledge to occur. 

SECTION 12: Funds. The District hereby creates the following special funds or 
accounts: 

(a) Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1, Water and Sewer System Revenue 
Bonds, Series 2015, Interest and Sinking Fund (the "Interest and Sinking Fund"); 

(b) Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1, Water and Sewer System Revenue 
Bonds, Series 2015, Reserve Fund (the "Reserve Fund"); 

(c) Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1, Water and Sewer System Revenue 
Bonds, Series 2015, Construction Fund (the "Construction Fund"). 

SECTION 13: Revenue Fund. A Revenue Fund has previously been established on 
the books of the District in connection with the District's Revenue Note, Series 2012. All gross 
revenues of every nature received from the operation and ownership of the System shall be 
deposited as collected into the Revenue Fund, and the reasonable, necessary, and proper 
expenses of operation and maintenance of the System shall be paid from the Revenue Fund. 
The revenues of the System not actually required to pay said expenses shall be deposited from 
the Revenue Fund into the Interest and Sinking Fund to the extent provided hereunder and to 
the interest and sinking funds as provided in the orders or resolutions authorizing the Parity 
Revenue Obligations. However, until the Parity Revenue Obligations are retired, any surplus 
Net Revenues of the System not required to be deposited in the funds and accounts established 
by the orders or resolutions authorizing the Parity Revenue Obligations shall be deposited in the 
Revenue Fund; provided, however, at such time as the Existing Obligations identified in Section 
1 hereof are no longer outstanding, the following provision shall be applicable to such excess 
Net Revenues: 

Any Net Revenues remaining in the Revenue Fund after satisfying the foregoing 
payments, or making adequate and sufficient provision for the payment thereof, may be 
appropriated and used for any other District purpose now or hereafter permitted by law. 

SECTION 14: Interest and Sinking Fund. (a) Net Revenues of the System shall be 
deposited to the credit of the Interest and Sinking Fund at such times and in such amounts as 
necessary for the timely payment of the principal of and interest on the Bonds. 

B-4 

TCMUD005914 

766 



(b) 	Money on deposit in the Interest and Sinking Fund shall be used to pay the 
principal of and interest on the Bonds as such become.due and payable. 

- SECTION 15: Reserve Fund. To accumulate and maintain a reserve for the payment of 
the Bonds and Additional Parity Obligations (the Required Reserve) equal to the lesser of (i) the 
Average Annual Debt Service Requirements (calculated on a Fiscal Year basis and determined 
as of the date of issuance of the Bonds, the most recently issued series of Additional Parity 
Obligations then Outstanding or, at the option of the District, at the end of each Fiscal Year) for 
the Bonds and Additional Parity Obligations or (ii) the maximum amount in a reasonably 
required reserve fund for the Bonds ahd Additional Parity Obligations, from time to time that can 
be invested without restriction as to yield pursuant to section 148 of the Code (as defined in 
SectiOn 24), the District agrees to maintain the Reserve Fund at an.official depository of the 
District. All funds deposited into the Reserve Fund (excluding surplus funds which include 
earnings and income derived or-received from deposits or investments which will be transferred 
to the Revenue Fund during such period as there is on deposit in the Reserve Fund the 
Required Reserve) shall be used solely for the payment of the principal of and interest on the 
Bonds and Additional Parity Obligations, when and to the extent other funds available for such 
purposes are insufficient, and, in addition, mby be used to retire the last stated maturity or 
interest on the Bonds or Additional Parity Obligations. 

Upon issuance of the Bonds, the total amount required to be accurfidlated and 
maintained in the Reserve Fund is hereby, determined to be $ 	 (the "Required 
Reserve"), which is equal to not less than the Average Annual Debt Service for the Bonds, and 
on or before the 1st day of the month next following the month the Bonds are delivered to the 
Purchasers and on or before the 1st day of each following month, the District shall cause to be 
deposited to the Reserve Fund from the Net Revenues of the Systerri an amount equal to at 
least one-sixtieth (1/60th) of the Required Reserve. After the Required Reserve has been fully 
accumulated and while the total amount on deposit in the Reserve Fund is in exceSs of the 
Required Reserve, no monthly deposits shall be required to be 'made to the Reserve Fund. 

As and when Additional Parity Obligations are delivered or incurred, tlie Required 
Reserve shall be increased, if required, to an amount calculated in the manner provided in the 
first paragraph of this Section. Any additional amount required to be maintained in the Reserve 
Fund shall be so accumulated by the deposit of the necessary amolint of the proceeds of the 
issue or other lawfully available funds in the Reserve Fund immediately after the delivery of the 
then proposed Additional Parity Obligations, or, at the option of the District, by the deposit of 
monthly installments, made on or before the 1st day of each month following the month of 
delivery of the then proposed Additional Parity Obligations, of not less than 1/60th of the 
additional amount to be maintained in the Reserve Fund by reason of the issuahce of the 
Additional Parity Obligations then being issued (or 1/60th of the balance of the additional 
amount not deposited immediately in cash), thereby ensuring the accumulation of the 
appropriate Required Reserve. 

When and so long as th'e Cash and investments in the Reserve Fund equal the Required 
Reserve, no deposits need be made to the credit of the' Reserve Fund; but, if and,  when the 
Reserve Fund at any time contains less than the Required Reserve (other than as the result of 
the issuance of Additional Parity Obligations as provided in the preceding paragraph), the 
District covenants and agrees to cure the deficiency in the Required ReserVe by resuming 
monthly deposits to said Fund or account from the Net Revenues, or any other lawfully available 
funds, such monthly depOsits td be in amounts equal to not less than 1/60th of the Required 
Reserve covenanted by the District to be maintained in the Reserve Fund with any such' 
deficiency payments being made on or before the 1st day of each.  month until the Required 
Reserve has been fully restored. The District further covenants and agrees that, subject only to 
the prior payments to be made to the Interest and Sinking Fund, the Net Revenues shall be 
applied and appropriated and used to establish and maintain the Required Reserve and to cure 

B-5 

TCMUD005915 

767 



any deficiency in such amounts as required by the terms of this Order and any other order or 
resolution pertaining to the issuance of Additional Parity Obligations. 

During such time as the Reserve Fund contains the Required Reserve, the District may, 
at its option, withdraw all surplus funds in the Reserve Fund in excess of the Required Reserve 
and deposit such surplus in the System Fund, unless such surplus funds represent proceeds of 
the Bonds, then such surplus will be transferred to the Interest and Sinking Fund. 

The District, at its option and consistent with the provisions of this Section, may, to the 
extent permitted by then-applicable law, fund the Reserve Fund at the Required Reserve by 
purchasing an insurance policy that will unconditionally obligate the insurance company or other 
entity to pay all, or any part thereof, of the Required Reserve in the event funds on deposit in 
the Interest and Sinking Fund are not sufficient to pay the debt service requirements on the 
Parity Revenue Obligations. All resolutions or orders adopted after the date hereof authorizing 
the issuance of Additional Parity Obligations shall contain a provision to this effect. 

In the event an insurance policy issued to satisfy all or part of the District's obligation 
with respect to the Reserve Fund causes the amount then on deposit in the Reserve Fund to 
exceed the Required Reserve, the District may transfer such excess amount to any fund or 
account established for the payment of or security for the Parity Revenue Obligations (including 
any escrow established for the final payment of any such obligations pursuant to Chapter 1207, 
as amended, Texas Government Code) or use such excess amount for any lawful purpose now 
or hereafter provided by law. 

Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in this Section, the requirements set 
forth above to fund the Reserve Fund in the amount of the Required Reserve may be 
suspended for such time as the Net Revenues for each Fiscal Year are equal to at least 110% 
of the Average Annual Debt Service Requirements. In the event that the Net Revenues for any 
two consecutive Fiscal Years are less than 110% (unless such percentage is below 100% in 
any Fiscal Year, in which case the hereinafter—specified requirements will commence after such 
Fiscal Year) of the Average Annual Debt Service Requirements, the District will be required to 
commence making the deposits to the Reserve Fund, as provided above, and to continue 
making such deposits until the earlier of (i) such time as the Reserve Fund contains the 
Required Reserve or (ii) the Net Revenues for a Fiscal Year have been equal to not less than 
110% of the Average Annual Debt Service Requirements. 

SECTION 16: Construction Fund. 

(a) Money on deposit in the Construction Fund, including investment earnings 
thereof, shall be used for the Project. 

(b) All amounts remaining in the Construction Fund after the accomplishment of the 
Project, including investment earnings of the Construction Fund, shall be deposited into the 
Interest and Sinking Fund, unless a change in applicable law permits or authorizes all or any 
part of such funds to be used for other purposes. 

SECTION 17: Security of Funds — Investments. 

(a) 	All moneys on deposit in the funds referred to in this Order shall be secured in 
the manner and to the fullest extent required by the laws of the State of Texas for the security of 
public funds, and moneys on deposit in such funds shall be used only for the purposes 
permitted by this Order. 

B-6 

TCMUD005916 

768 



(b) Investments. (i) Money in the funds established by this Order, at the option of 
the District, may be invested in such securities or obligations as permitted under applicable law. 

(ii) 	Any securities or obligations in which money is so invested shall be kept and held 
in trust for the benefit of the Owners and shall be sold and the proceeds of sale shall be timely 
applied to the making of all payments required to be made from the fund from which the 
investment was made. 

(c) Investment Income. Inter6st and income derived from investment of any fund 
created by this Order shall be credited to such fund. 

SECTION 18: Additional Parity Obligations. In addition to the right to issue obligations 
of inferior lien as authorized by the laws of this State, the District reserves the right to issue 
notes, bonds and other obligations which, when duly authorized and issued in compliance with 
law and the terms and conditions hereinafter appearing, shall be on a parity with the Parity 
Revenue Obligations, payable,from and equally and ratably secured by a first lien on and 
pledge of the Net Revenues of the System; and the Parity Revenue ,Obligations shall in all 
respects be of equal dignity. The Additional Parity Obligations.  may be issued in one or more 
installments, provided, however, that none shall be issued unless and until-  the following 
conditions have been met: 

(a) A certificate is executed by the District Manager of the District and the President 
of the Board to the effect that no default exists in connection with any of the covenants or 
requirements of the Order or orders or resolutions authorizing the issuance of the Bonds and all 
then outstanding Parity Revenue Obligations; 

(b) A certificate is executed by the District Manager of the District and the President 
of the Board to the effect that the Interest and Sinking Fund and Reserve Fund contains the 
amount of money then required to be on deposit therein; 

(c) A certificate is executed by a Certified Public Accountant to the effect that, in his 
opinion, the Net Earnings of the System either for the last complete fiscal year of the District, or 
for any twelve consecutive calendar month period ending not more than 90 days prior to the 
passage of the Order authorizing the issuance of such Additional Parity Obligations, were at 
least 	times the average annual principal and interest requirements for the then outstanding 
Parity Revenue Obligatidns and the Additional Parity Obligations then proposed to be issued. 

At such time as the Existing Obligations are no longer outstanding, the Accountant, in 
making a determination of the Net Earnings, may take into consideration a change in the rates 
and charges for services and facilities =afforded by the System that became effective at least 
sixty (60) days prior to the last day of the period for which Net Earnings are determined and, for 
purposes of satisfying the above Net Earnings test, make a pro forma deterMination of the Net 
Earnings of the System for the period of time covered by his certification or opinion based on 
such change in rates and charges being in effect for the entire period covered by the 
Accountanfs certificate or opinion. 

PROVIDED, that the term "Net Earnings of the System" shall mean all of the Net 
Revenues of the System, ekcept that in calculatirig Net Revenues there shall not be deducted 
as an expense of operation and maintenance any charge or dišbursement for repairs or 
extensions which, under standard accounting practice, should be charged to capital 
expenditures; and PROVIDED FURTHER, that it shall not be necessary for the District to meet 
the above requiremehts to issue Additidnal Parity Obligations if the District obtains the written 
consent of all of the holders of all outstanding Parity Revenue Obligations. 

B-7 

TCMUD005917 

769 



SECTION 19: Representations and Covenants as to Payment.  

(a) While the Bonds are outstanding and unpaid, there shall be made available to 
the Paying Agent/Registrar, out of the Interest and Sinking Fund and Reserve Fund, if 
necessary, money sufficient to pay the interest on and the principal of the Bonds, as applicable, 
as will accrue or mature on each applicable Interest Payment Date. 

(b) The District will faithfully perform at all times any and all covenants, undertakings, 
stipulations, and provisions contained in this Order and in the Bonds; the District will promptly 
pay or cause to be paid the principal of, interest on, and premium, if any, with respect to, the 
Bonds on due dates and at the places and manner prescribed in such Bonds; and the District 
will, at the times and in the manner prescribed by this Order, deposit or cause to be deposited 
the amounts of money specified by this Order. 

(c) The District is duly authorized under the laws of the State of Texas to issue the 
Bonds; all action on its part for the creation and issuance of the Bond has been duly and 
effectively taken; and the Bonds in the hands of the Owners thereof is and will be valid and 
enforceable obligations of the District in accordance with their terms. 

(d) The District will at all times collect for services rendered by the System such 
amounts as will be at least sufficient to pay all expenses of operation and maintenance, and to 
provide Net Revenues equal to the amount that is sufficient to pay the scheduled principal of 
and interest on the Parity Revenue Obligations, plus one times the amount (if any) required to 
be deposited in any reserve or contingency fund or account created for the payment and 
security of the Parity Revenue Obligations; 

(e) If the System should become legally liable for any other indebtedness, the 
District shall fix, maintain, charge and collect additional rates and services rendered by the 
System, sufficient to establish and maintain funds for the payment thereof. 

SECTION 20: Default and Remedies. 

(a) 	Events of Default. Each of the following occurrences or events for the purpose of 
this Order is hereby declared to be an "Event of Default," to-wit: 

(i) the failure to make payment of the principal of or interest on the 
Bonds when the same become due and payable; or 

(ii) default in the performance or observance of any other covenant, 
agreement or obligation of the District, the failure to perform which materially, 
adversely affects the rights of the Owners, including but not limited to, their 
prospect or ability to be repaid in accordance with this Order, and the 
continuation thereof for a period of 60 days after notice of such default is given 
by any Owner to the District. 

(b) 	Remedies for Default. (i) 	Upon the happening of any Event of Default, then 
and in every case any Owner or an authorized representative thereof, including but not limited 
to, a trustee or trustees therefor, may proceed against the District for the purpose of protecting 
and enforcing the rights of the Owners under this Order, by mandamus or other suit, action or 
special proceeding in equity or at law, in any court of competent jurisdiction, for any relief 
permitted by law, including the specific performance of any covenant or agreement contained 
herein, or thereby to enjoin any act or thing that may be unlawful or in violation of any right of 
the Owners hereunder or any combination of such remedies. 

(ii) 	It is provided that all such proceedings shall be instituted and maintained for the 
equal benefit of all Owners of the Bonds then outstanding. 

B-8 

TCMUD005918 

770 



(c) 	Remedies Not Exclusive. 	(i) No remedy herein conferred or reserved is 
intended to be exclusive of any other available remedy or remedies, but each and every such 
remedy shall be cumulative-and shall be in addition to every other remedy given hereunder or 
under the Bonds or now or hereafter existing at law or in equity; provided, however, that 
notwithstanding any other provision of this Order, the right to accelerate the debt evidenced by 
the Bonds shall not be available as a remedy under this Order. 

(ii) 	The exercise of any remedy herein conferred or reserved shall not be deemed a 
waiver of any other available remedy. 

SECTION 21: Mutilated„Destroved, Lost and Stolen Bonds. In case any Bond shall be 
mutilated, or destroyed, lost or stolen, the Paying Agent/Registrar may execute and deliver a 
replacement Bond of like form and tenor, and in the same denomination and bearing a number 
not contemporaneously outstanding, in exchange and substitution for such mutilated Bond; and 
with respect •to a lost, destroyed or stolen Bond a replacernent Bond may be-issued only upon 
the approval of the District and after (i) the filing by the Holder with the Paying Agent/Registrar 
of evidence satisfactory to the Paying Agent/Registrar of the destruction, loss or theft of such 
Bond, and of. the authenticity of the ownership thereof and (ii) the furnishing to the .Paying 
Agent/Registrar of indemnification'in an amount satisfactory to hold the District and the Paying 
Agent/Registrar harmless. All expenses and charges associated with such indemnity and with 
the preparation, execution and delivery of a replacement Bond shall be borne by the Holder of 
the Bond mutilated, or destroyed, lost or stolen. 

Every replacement Bond issued pursuant to this Section shall be a valid and binding 
obligation, and shall be entitled to all the benefits of this Order equally and ratably with all other 
Outstanding Bonds; notwithstanding the enforceability of payment by anyone of the destroyed, 
lost, or stolen Bonds. 

The provisions of this Section are exclusive and shall preclude (to the extent lawful) all 
other rights and remedies with respect to the replacement and payment of mutilated, destroyed, 
lost or stolen Bonds. 

SECTION 22: Satisfaction of Obligation of District. If the District shall pay or cause to 
be paid, or there shall otherwise be paid to the Holders, the principal of, premium, if any, and 
interest on the Bonds, at the times and in the manner stipulated in this Order, then the pledge of 
taxes levied under this Order and all covenants, agreements, and other obligations of the 
District to the Holders shall thereupon cease, terminate, and be discharged and satisfied. 

Bonds or any principal amount(s) thereof shall be deemed to have been paid within the 
meaning and with the effect expressed above in this Section when (i) money sufficient to pay in 
full such Bonds or the principal amount(s) thereof at maturity or to the redemption date therefor, 
together with all interest due thereon, shall have been irrevocably deposited with and held in 
trust by the Paying Agent/Registrar, or an authorized escrow agent, or (ii) Government 
Securities shall have been irrevocàbly deposited in trust with the Paying Agent/Registrar, or an 
authorized escrow agent, which Government Securities have been certified by an independent 
accounting firm to mature as to principal and interest in such amounts and at such times as will 
insure the availability, without reinvestment, of sufficient money, together with' any moneys 
deposited therewith, if any, to pay when due the principal of and interest on such Bonds, or the 
principal amount(s) thereof, on and prior to the Stated Maturity thereof or (if notice of 
redemption has been düly given or waived or if irrevocable arrangements therefor acceptable to 
the Paying Agent/Registrar have been made) the redemption date therefor. The District 
covenants that no deposit of moneys or Government Securities will be made under this Section 
and no use made of any such deposit which would cause the Bonds to be treated as "arbitrage 
bonds" within the meaning of Section 148 of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986, as amended, 
or regulations adopted pursuant thereto. 

B-9 

TCMU0005919 

771 



Any moneys so deposited with the Paying Agent/ Registrar, or an authorized escrow 
agent, and all income from Government Securities held in trust by the Paying Agent/Registrar, 
or an authorized escrow agent, pursuant to this Section which is not required for the payment of 
the Bonds, or any principal amount(s) thereof, or interest thereon with respect to which such 
moneys have been so deposited shall be remitted to the District or deposited as directed by the 
District. Furthermore, any money held by the Paying Agent/Registrar for the payment of the 
principal of and interest on the Bonds and remaining unclaimed for a period of three (3) years 
after the Stated Maturity, or applicable redemption date, of the Bonds such moneys were 
deposited and are held in trust to pay shall upon the request of the District be remitted to the 
District against a written receipt therefor. Notwithstanding the above and foregoing, any 
remittance of funds from the Paying Agent/Registrar to the District shall be subject to any 
applicable unclaimed property laws of the State of Texas. 

SECTION 23: Order a Contract - Amendments - Outstanding Bonds. This Order shall 
constitute a contract with the Holders from time to time, be binding on the District, and shall not 
be amended or repealed by the District so long as any Bond remains Outstanding except as 
permitted in this Section and in Section 39 hereof. The District may, without the consent of or 
notice to any Holders, from time to time and at any time, amend this Order in any manner not 
detrimental to the interests of the Holders, including the curing of any ambiguity, inconsistency, 
or formal defect or omission herein. In addition, the District may, with the written consent of 
Holders holding a majority in aggregate principal amount of the Bonds then Outstanding 
affected thereby, amend, add to, or rescind any of the provisions of this Order; provided that, 
without the consent of all Holders of Outstanding Bonds, no such amendment, addition, or 
rescission shall (1) extend the time or times of payment of the principal of, premium, if any, and 
interest on the Bonds, reduce the principal amount thereof, the redemption price, or the rate of 
interest thereon, or in any other way modify the terms of payment of the principal of, premium, if 
any, or interest on the Bonds, (2) give any preference to any Bond over any other Bond, or 
(3) reduce the aggregate principal amount of Bonds required to be held by Holders for consent 
to any such amendment, addition, or rescission. 

B-10 

TCMUD005920 

772 



SOUTHWEST 
SECURITIES. 
A Hilltop Hoklings Company 

CLOSING MEMORANDUM  

$9,230,000 
Trophy Club Municipal Utility District ("MUD") No.1 

Water and Sewer System Revenue Bonds, Series 2015 (the "Bonds") 

Date: 

To: 

From: 

February 9, 2015 

Attached Distribution List 

Dan A. Almon 
Southwest Securities 
(214) 859-9452 

1. The closing time and date for the above-referenced issue is Tuesday, 
February 17, 2015, at 10:00 A.M., Central Daylight Time. A final debt service schedule 
is attached as Exhibit A. This fransaction will close through DTC's "Fasr Book Entry 
Only System. 

2. Raymond James & Associates, as the authorized representative of a group of 
purchasers (the "Purchasers"), shall wire $9,245,052.22 to BOKF, NA dba Bank of 
Texas (the "Paying Agent/Registrar) ABA #103900036, Account #600024642, Wealth 
Management Account; Re: Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No.1, Watdr and Sewer 
System Revenue Bonds, Series 2015, Attn: Jose Gaytan (512-813-2002) calculated as 
follows: 

Par Amount of the Bonds 
Plus: Accrued Interest (02/01/15 - 02/17/15) 
Plus: Bidder's Premium 
Total Amount to be Wired by Raymond James & Associates  

$9,230,000.00 
10,437.22 
4 615.00 

$9.245.052.22  

TCMUD005921 

773 



Closing Memorandum 
Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No.1 
February 9, 2015 
Page 2 

	

4. 	The Paying Agent/Registrar shall retain $400.00 in payment of the first year's Paying 
Agent/Registrar fee. 

5. The Paying Agent/Registrar shall wire $189,869.00 from the proceeds of the Bonds, to 
JPMorgan Chase Bank, Houston, Texas, ABA #021000021, for credit to Southwest 
Securities Inc., Account #08805076955, for further credit to Trophy Club Municipal Utility 
District No.1 Water and Sewer System Revenue Bonds, Series 2015 (#94-9030-119042), 
Attn: Ms. Amanda Almanza, (214) 859-6353. Such amount is for the fees and expenses 
associated with the legal authorization and issuance of the Bonds. (See Cost of Issuance 
Breakdown, herein.) 

	

6. 	The Paying Agent/Registrar shall wire $9,054,783.22, from the proceeds of the Bonds, to 
TexPool per wiring instruction shown below: 

State Street Bank and Trust Company, Boston, MA, 
ABA (3400) 011 000 028 
BNF (4200) - TexPool Account # 67573774 
RFB (4320) — Location ID # 77384 
Participant Name — Trophy Club MUD 1 

For final credit by TexPool as follows: 
a) 2014 WW Treatment Plant Construction Fund (OBI (6000) 449-0613300012) 

in the amount (2000) of 	 $9,039,731.00 

Construction Fund Deposit includes $23,017.46 for the TCEQ 
Bond Application Processing Fee (for $9,230,000 only) to be 
paid by the District: 

b) Revenue Interest & Sinking Fund (OBI (6000) 449-0613300013) in 
the amount (2000) of 	 $15,052.22 

(Revenue l&S Fund Deposit includes accrued interest of $10,437.22 
and Bid Premium of $4,615.00) 

	

7. 	Upon receipt of funds from the Purchasers, the good faith check in the amount of 
$184,600.00 shall be returned uncashed (by a trackable method) to: 

Luke Mattson 
Raymond James & Associates 
5956 Sherry Lane, 19th  floor 
Dallas, TX 75225 

TCMUD005922 

774 



Closing Memorandum 
Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No.1 
February 9, 2015 
Page 2 

8. 	The Reconciliation of Receipts and Disbursements is as follows: 

Receipts: 
Par Amount of the Bonds $9,230,000.00 
Plus: Accrued Interest (02/01/15 - 02/17/15) 10,437.22 
Plus Bidder's Premium 4 615.00 
Total Receipts $9.245.052.22 

Disbursements: 
Trophy Club MUD Wastewater Treatment Plant Construction Rind $9,039,731.00 
Trophy Club MUD Interest and Sinking (Revenue Debt Service 
Fund) 15,052.22 
First Year's Paying Agent/Registrar Fee 400.00 
Costs of Issuance to be paid by Southwest Securities 189 869.00 

$9,245.052.22 

NOTE: Upon receipt of funds at delivery, the District will send a check in the amount of 
$23,017.46 to the Texas Commission on Environmental Quality ("TCEQ") for payment 
of the TCEQ Bond Application Processing Fee. Check should be sent to the address 
below: 

Texas Cdmmission on Environmental Quality 
Attention: Andrew Paynter 
12100 Park 35 Circle 
Bldg. F - Mail Code 152 
Austin, Texas 78753 

TCMUD005923 

775 



SOUTHWEST 
SECURIT1ES 
A Hilltop Holdings Company 

February 9, 2015 

Ms. Jennifer McKnight 
General Manager 
Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No.1 
100 Municipal Drive 
Trophy Club, Texas 76262 

STATEMENT 

For services rendered and expenses incurred in connection with the legal 
authorization and issuance of $9,230,000 Trophy Club Municipal Utility 
District No.1 Water and Sewer System Revenue Bonds, Series 2015 
(See Cost of Issuance Breakdown on next page.) 

	
$189.869.00 

TCMUD005924 

776 



TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO.1 
$9,230,000 WATER AND SEWER SYSTEM REVENUE BONDS, SERIES 2015 

COST OF ISSUANCE BREAKDOWN 

Expense Item:  
UL Tax Bonds 
$9,230,000 

  

Financial Advisory Fee / Expenses- Southwest Securities, Inc. 	 $ 	86,150.00 
Bond Counsel Fee /Expenses- Norton Rose Fulbright 	 73,650.00 
Attorney General Fee (Reimbursed to Norton Rose Fulbright) 	 9,230.00 
Ratings: 

S&P 	 15,839.00 
Paying Agent Registrar - Bank of Texas. 

First Year's Paying Agent/ Registrar Fee 	 400.00 
Official Statement (OS) Costs: 

Preparation / Printing / Internet Posting / Electronic Distribution 	 5,000.00 
TCEQ Fee for Processing Application (0.25% of par amount) 

(Based on TCEQ Application par amount of $9,230,000) 	 23,017.46 

Total Estimated Cost of Issuance 	 $ 	213,286.46 

COST OF ISSUANCE BREAKDOWN BY SOURCE OF PAYMEN1 

Cost of Issuance Expenses Paid from Wire to Southwest Securities 

Financial Advisory Fee / Expenses- Southwest Securities, Inc. $ 	86,150.00 
Bond Counsel Fee /Expenses- Norton Rose Fulbright',' 73,650.00 
Attorney General Fee (Reimbursed to Norton Rose Fulbright) 9,230.00 
S&P Rating Fee 15,839.00 
Official Statement Preparation/Printing/Internet Posting/Electronic Distribution 5,000.00 

$ 	189,869.00 $ 	189,869.00 

Cost of Issuance Expenses Paid/Retained by the District from Construction Fund 

TCEQ Fee for Processing Application (0.25% of par amount) 
(Based on par amount of $9,230,000 only) 23,017.46 

23,017.46 23,017.46 

Cost of Issuance Expenses Retained by Paving Agent Registrar 400.00 $ 	400.00 

Total Cost of Issuance' $ 	213,286.46 

2/2/2015 

TCMUD005925 

777 



$9,230,000 
Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No.1 

Water and Sewer System Revenue Bonds, Series 2015 

Distribution List 

issuer 
Ms. Jennifer McKnight 
Ms. Renae Gonzales 
Ms. Terri Sisk 
100 Municipal Drive 
Trophy Club, Texas 76262 

Phone: 	682-831-4610 (Jennifer) 
682-831-4611 (Renae) 
682-831-4618 (Terri) 

Facsimile: 	817-491-9312 
jmcknight@tcmud.org  
rgonzales@tcmud.org  
tsisk@tcmud.org  

Underwriter 
Raymond James 
5956 Sherry Lane 
19th  Floor 
Dallas, TX 75225 

Luke Mattson 
214-692-9866 
luke.mattson@raymondjames.com  

Randall Hawkins 
214-365-5546 
randall.hawkins@raymondjames.com  

Financial Advisor 
Mr. Dan Almon 
Southwest Securities 
1201 Elm Street, Suite 3500 
Dallas, Texas 75270 

Phone: 	214-859-9452 (Dan) 
Facsimile: 	214-859-9475 
DAlmon@swst.com  

Bond Counsel  
Mr. Bob Dransfield 
Ms. Kristen Savant 
Ms. Diane Callahan 
Norton Rose Fulbright 
2200 Ross Ave., Suite 2800 
Dallas, Texas 75201 

Phone 	214-855-8068 (Bob) 
214-855-8072 (Kristen) 
214-855-8024 (Diane) 

Facsimile 	214-855-8200 
Robert.Dransfield@nortonrosefulbright.com  
Kristen.Savant@nortonrosefulbright.com  
Diane.Callahan@nortonrosefulbright.com  

Paying Agent/Registrar 
Mr. Jose Gaytan 
Ms. Anne-Marie Hansen 
Bank of Texas (BOKF,NA) 
Corporate Trust Services 
100 Congress Ave., Suite 250 

Phone: 	512-813-2002 (Jose) 
512-813-2001 (Anne-Marie) 

Facsimile 	512-813-2020 
JGaytan@bankoftexas.com  
AHansen@bankoftexas.com  

TCMUD005926 

778 



SOUTHWEST 	 EXHIBIT 
SECURITIES. 
A Whop Hadmip CoPary 

BOND DEBT SERVICE 

$9,230,000 
TROPHY CLUB MUD NO. 1 

(Denton & Tarrant Counties, Texas) 
Water & Sewer System Revenue Bonds, Series 2015 

Final Numbers: As of January 20, 2015 

Dated Date 
	

02/01/2015 
Delivery Date 
	

02/17/2015 

Period 
Ending Principal Coupon Interest Debt Service 

Ánnual 
Debt Service 

09/01/2015 136,988.54 136,988.54 
09/30/2015 136,988.54 
03/01/2016 117,418.75 117,418.75 
09/01/2016 210,000 2.000% 117,418.75 327,418.75 

- 09/30/2016 444,837.50 
03/01/2017 115,318.75 115,318.75 
09/01/2017 365,000 2.000% 115,318.75 480,318.75 
09/30/2017 • 595,637.50 
03/01/2018 111,668.75 111,668.75 
09/01/2018 375,000 2.000% 111,668.75 486,668.75 
09/30/2018 598,337.50 
03/01/2019 107,918.75 107,918.75 
09/01/2019 380,000 2.000% 107,918.75 487,918.75 
09/30/2019 595,837.50 
03/01/2020 104,118.75 104,118.75 
09/01/2020 390,000 2.000% 104,118.75 494,118.75 
09/30/2020 598,237.50 
03/01/2021 100,218.75 100,218.75 
09/01/2021 400,000 2.000% 100,218.75 500,218.75 
09/30/2021 606,437.50 
03/01/2022 96,218.75 96,218.75 
09/01/2022 410,000 2.000% 96,218.75 506,218.75 
09/30/2022 602,437.50 
03/01/2023 92,118.75 92,118.75 
09/01/2023 420,000 2.000% 92,118.75 512,118.75 
09/30/2023 604,237.50 
03/01/2024 ,, 87,918.75 87,918.75 
09/01/2024 435,000 2.000% 87,918.75 522,918.75 
09/30/2024 610,837.50 
03/01/2025 83,568.75 83,568.75 
09/01/2025 450,000 2.250% 83,568.75 533,568.75 
09/30/2025 617,137.50 
03/01/2026 78,506.25 78,506.25 
09/01/2026 460,000 2.500% 78,506.25 538,506.25 
09/30/2026 617,012.50 
03/01/2027 72,756.25 72,756.25 
09/01/2027 475,000 2'.500% 72,756.25 547,756.25 
09/30/2027 620,512.50 
03/01/2028 66,818.75 66,818.75 
09/01/2028 490,000 2.750% 66,818.75 556,818.75 
09/30/2028 623,637.50 
03/01/2029 60,081.25 60,081.25 
09/01/2029 510,000 2.750% 60,081.25 570,081.25 
09/30/2029 630,162 50 
03/01/2030 53,068.75 53,068.75 
09/01/2030 525,000 3.000% 53,068.75 578,068.75 
09/30/2030 631,137.50 
03/01/2031 45,193.75 45,193.75 
09/01/2031 545,000 3.000% 45,193.75 590,193.75 
09/30/2031 635,387.50 
03/01/2032 37,018.75 *37,018.75 
09/01/2032 565,000 3.000% 37,018.75 602,018.75 
09/30/2032 639,037.50 
03/01/2033 28,543.75 28,543.75 
09/01/2033 585,000 3.000% 28,543.75 613,543.75 
09/30/2033 642,087.50 

Jan 20, 2015 12:02 pm Prepared by Southwest Securities (AK) 	 (Finance 7.010 Trophy Club MUD #1:WWSS-2015REV) Page 6 

TCMUD005927 

779 



SOUTHWEST 
SECURMES 

Hglftop Hotdoqs Compey 

BOND DEBT SERVICE 

$9,230,000 
TROPHY CLUB MUD NO. 1 

(Denton & Tarrant Counties, Texas) 
Water & Sewer System Revenue Bonds, Series 2015 

Final Numbers: As of January 20, 2015 

Period 
Ending Principal Coupon Interest Debt Service 

Annual 
Debt Service 

03/01/2034 19,768.75 19,768.75 
09/01/2034 610,000 3.125% 19,768.75 629,768.75 
09/30/2034 649,537.50 
03/01/2035 10,237.50 10,237.50 
09/01/2035 630,000 3.250% 10,237.50 640,237.50 
09/30/2035 650,475.00 

9,230,000 3,113,951.04 12,343,951.04 12,343,951.04 

Jan 20, 2015 12:02 pm Prepared by Southwest Securities (AK) 
	

(Finance 7.010 Trophy Club MUD #1:WWSS-2015REV) Page 7 

TCMIJDO05928 

780 



Ratings Call 01-05-15 Q&A 

1) Purpose of the bonds- Wastewater plant upgrade 

2) Population and customer growth estimates- Population 10,459 (2013). 

Per Ron 12-31-14, there are 82 homes under construction and 364 left to build out in Trophy 

Club. As part of our FY 15 Budget, the Board set a 3.25% growth rate for meters. 

3) Is there a minimum (take or pay) payment due to Fort Worth for water?- No. 

4) Status of wastewater treatment plant expansion (and any other additional capital needs)-

Currently WWTP expansion is in progress- Financed through tax and revenue bonds. No other 

additional capital needs are planned to be financed this fiscal year. 

5) Will water/sewer revenues be split into different funds, or remain consolidated in the General 

Fund fo(audit purposes?- They will remain consolidated in the General Fund for Audit purposes 

*although they are separated in different general ledger accounts in the accounting system. 

6) In the 2013 audit, how much of the unrestricted cash was available for utility system purposes?-

FY 13 audit had Cash of $3,954,832 in General Fund. $17,879 was in Debt Service, $330,571 was 

in Capital Projects. Of the $3,606,382, $313,050 was in GASB and was restricted, $514,169 was 

in Fire and not available for utility system purposes. $2,779,163 was available for utility system 

purposes. 

7) Potential tax rate and utility rate increases (and multi-year financial projections)- 

Tax rate increases are reviewed in June during the annual budget process. Utility rate increases 

are reviewed annually in May as part of the annual budget process. For FY15 we do not expect a 

utility rate increase. For FY 16, we will do a rate analysis in May 15 and we do expect a rate 

increase of some amount to be determined. 

8) Any policies or targets regarding debt service coverage or 'system liquidity (fund balances)?- ' 

No policies on debt service coverage. GASB 54 policy on fund balances states goal is to achieve 

and maintain General Fund Unassigned Fund Balance equal to 35% of expenditures and pot to 

go below 25% barring unusual or deliberate circumstances. 

TCMUD005929 

781 



INSTRUCTION SHEET 

To move through this Electronic Transcript click on the Bookmark tab on the left side of 
the screen. 

1. Click on the Bookmark entitled Index of Documents. 

2. Click on the document number to move to the document. 

3. The document is searchable. 

TCMUD005930 

782 



TRANSCRIPT OF PROCEEDINGS 

RELATING TO 

$9,230,000 
WATER AND SEWER SYSTEM REVENUE BONDS 

SERIES 2015 

ISSUED BY 

TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT-NO. 1' 

COUNTIES OF DENTON AND TARRANT 

STATE OF TEXAS 

Delivery: February 17, 2015 

NORTON ROSE FULBRIGHT 

41468647.1/11411680 

TCMUD005931 

783 



TRANSCRIPT OF PROCEEDINGS 
RELATING TO 

$9,230,000 
TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 1 

WATER AND SEWER SYSTEM REVENUE BONDS 
SERIES 2015 

Dated February 1, 2015 

Index of Documents 

Tab No. Description of Document  

1 	Order by the Texas Commission on Environment Quality approving an 
Engineering Project and the Issuance of Bonds 

2 	Certified Resolution approving and authorizing publication of Notice of Sale and 
authorizing personnel and consultants to proceed with the arrangements for the 
Bond Sale 

3 	Affidavit of Publication — Texas Bond Reporter 

4 	Affidavit of Publication — Star-Telegram, Inc. 

5 	Affidavit of Publication — Denton Record-Chronicle 

6 	Certified Bond Order 

7 	Paying Agent/Registrar Agreement 

8 	Official Bid Form 

9 	Notice of Sale and Preliminary Official Statement 

10 	Final Official Statement 

11 	Certificate of Certified Public Accountant 

12 	General Certificate 

13 	Signature and No-Litigation Certificate 

14 	Certificate as to Official Statement 

15 	Certificate as to Tax Exemption 

16 	Certificate of Managing Underwriter 

17 	Filed 8038-G Information Return 

41468647.1/11411680 

TCMUD005932 

784 



18 	Attorney General's Opinion and Comptrollers Registration Certificate 

19 	Opinion of Bond Counsel 

20 	Closing Instruction Letter 

21 	Receipt and DisUursement of Funds 

22 	Rating Letters 

23 	DTC Blanket Issuer Letter of Representations 

24 	Original Petition 

25 	Final Judgment 

41468647.1/11411680 

TCMUD005933 

785 



TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALM 

AN ORDER APPROVING (1) AN ENGINEERING PROJECT, 
(2) THE ISSUANCE OF $5,765,000 IN UNLIMITED TAX BONDS, 

AND (3) THE ISSUANCE OF $9,230,000 IN REVENUE BONDS FOR 
TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 1 

OF DENTON AND TARRANT COUNTIES 

An application by Trophy Club County Municipal Utility District No. 1 of Denton and 
Tarrant Counties (hereafter "District") was presented to the Executive Director of the Texas 
Commission on Environmental Quality (TCEQ) for consideration of approval pursuant to TEX. 
WATER CODE §§ 5.122 and 49.181. The District requests approval of an engineering project, the 
issuance of up to $15,000,000 in bonds to finance improvements to the District's existing 
wastewater treatment plant. The TCEQ has jurisdiction to consider this matter, and the 
following Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law are appropriate after examining the 
application and supporting documentation. 

FINDINGS OF FACT 

1. The District filed an application with the TCEQ on September 24, 2013, for approval 
of a proposed engineering project and the issuance of the issuance of up to $15,000,000 in 
bonds. By Resolution No. 2013-0827A dated August 27, 2013, the District requested to issue up 
to $5,769,217 in unlimited tax and/or unlimited tax and revenue bonds and up to $9,230,783 in 
revenue bonds, for a total request of $15,000,000. Application material supports the issuance 
of $5,765,000 in unlimited tax bonds and $9,230,000 in revenue bonds. 

2. The Executive Director has investigated the District. 

3. The application and accompanying documents have been examined, and a 
memorandum was prepared on the project dated January 31, 2014, a copy of which is attached 
and made a part hereof. 

4. The District's project and issuance of $14,995,000  ($5,765,000  in unlimited tax 
bonds and $9,23o,000 in revenue bonds) in bonds at a maximum net effective interest rate of 
6.23% to finance the project should be approved. 

5. The District's board should be directed to ensure that system revenue is adequate to 
meet operating expenses and debt service requirements on revenue debt. 

6. The District should be directed not to expend a total of $12,991,567 ($11,297,015 for 
construction plus $1,694,552 in contingencies) for the wastewater treatment plant 
improvements pending District board's receipt of plans and specifications approved by all 
entities with jurisdiction, as necessary. 

TCMUD005934 

786 



,7. 	The District should be advised that the legal, fiscal agent, and engineering fees have 
not been evaluated to determine whether these fees are reasonable or competitive. These fees 
are included as presented in the engineering report. 

8. 	The District should be directed that any surplus bond proceeds resulting from the 
sale of bonds at a lower interest rate than that proposed shall be shown as a contingency line 
item in the Official Statement and the use of such funds shall be subject to approval pursuant to 
TCEQ rules on surplus funds. 

CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 

1. The TCEQ has jurisdiction to consider the engineering report and bond application 
pursuant to TEX. WATER CODE § 49.181. 

2. The Executive Director has investigated the District, and the TCEQ has found it 
legally organized and feasible. 

3. The TCEQ's memorandum dated January 31,2o14, on this engineering project and 
bond issue should be adopted as the written TCEQ project report in compliance with TEX. 
WATER CODE § 49.181(d). 

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDERED BY THE TEXAS COMMISSION ON 
ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY that the TCEQ's memorandum dated January 31, 2014, on this 
engineering project and bond issue is adopted as the written TCEQ project report. Pursuant to 
TEX. WATER CODE § 49.181, the engineering project for Trophy Club Municipal Utility District 
No. i of Denton and Tarrant Counties is hereby approved together with the issuance of 
$14,995,000 ($5,765,000 in unlimited tax bonds and $9,230,000 in revenue bonds) in bonds at 
a maximum net effective interest rate of 6.23%. The District's board is directed to ensure that 
system revenue is adequate to meet operating expenses and debt service requirements on 
revenue debt. The District is directed not to expend a total of $12,991,567 ($11,297,o15 for 
construction plus $1,694,552 in contingencies) of the bond issue proceeds approved herein for 
the wastewater treatment plant improvements pending District board's receipt of plans and 
specifications approved by all entities with jurisdiction, as necessary. The District is advised 
that the legal, fiscal agent, and engineering fees have not been evaluated to determine whether 
these fees are reasonable or competitive. These fees are included as presented in the 
engineering report. The District is directed that any surplus bond proceeds resulting from the 
sale of bonds at a lower interest rate than that proposed shall be shown as a contingency line 
item in the Official Statement and the use of such funds shall be subject to approval pursuant to 
TCEQ rules on surplus funds. The approval of the sale of these bonds herein shall be valid for 
one year from the date of this Order unless extended by written authorization of the TCEQ staff. 

BE IT FURTHER ORDERED that pursuant to TEX. WATER CODE § 5.701, the District 
shall pay to the Commission o.25% of the principal amount of bonds actually issued not later 
than the seventh (7th) business day after receipt of the bond proceeds. The fees shall be paid by 
check payable to the Texas Commission on Environmental Quality. 

2 

TCMU0005935 

787 



BE IT FURTHER ORDERED that to enable the TCEQ to carry out the responsibilities 
imposed by TEX. WATER CODE §§ 49.181-182, the District shall: (1) furnish the Utilities and 
District's Section copies of all bond issue project construction documentation outlined under 30 
TEX. ADMIN. CODE § 293.62, including detailed progress reports and as-built plans required by 
TEX. WATER CODE § 49.277(b), which have not already been submitted; (2) notify the Utilities 
and District's Section and obtain approval of the TCEQ for any substantial alterations in the 
engineering project approved herein before making such alterations; and (3) ensure, as required 
by TEX. WATER CODE § 49.277(b), that all construction financed with the proceeds from the sale 
of bonds is completed by the construction contractor according to the plans and specifications 
contracted. 

BE IT FURTHER ORDERED that failure of said District to comply with all applicable 
laws and with provisions of this Order shall subject the District and its directors to all penalties 
that are provided by law and shall further be considered by the TCEQ as grounds for refusal to 
approve other bonds of the District. 

The Chief Clerk of the TCEQ is directed to forward the District a copy of this Order. 

If any provision, sentence, clause, or phrase of this Order is for any reason held to be 
invalid, the invalidity of any portion shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of the 
Order. 

Issue Date: February 6, 2014 

For the Commission 

TCMUD005936 

788 

3 



Texas Commission on Environmental Quality  
TECHNICAL MEMORANDUM 

Tammy Benter, Manager 	 Date: January 31, 2014 
Utilities and Districts Section 

ustin P. Taack, Water Supply Division 

To: 

Subject: Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. i. of Denton and Tarrant Counties; 
Application for Approval of $15,000,000 in Unlimited Tax Bonds and Revenue 
Bonds, Sixth Issue, 6.23% Net Effective Interest Rate, Series 2014; Pursuant to 
Texas Water Code Section 49.181. 
TCEQ Internal Control No. D-09242013-030 (TC) 
CN: 600678536 	RN: 101241248 

A. GENERAL INFORMATION 

The Texas Commission on Environmental Quality (TCEQ) received an application from Trophy 
Club Municipal Utility District No. i of Denton and Tarrant Counties (the "District") requesting 
approval for the issuance of $15,000,000 in bonds to finance improvements to the District's 
existing wastewater treatment plant. By Resolution No. 2013-0827A dated August 27, 2013, the 
District requested to issue up to $5,769,217 in unlimited tax and/or unlimited tax and revenue 
bonds and up to $9,230,783 in revenue bonds, for a total request of $15,000,000. Application 
material supports the issuance of $5,765,000 in unlimited tax bondS and $9,230,060 in reirenue 
bonds. 

According to documentation provided, the District currently serves 4,180 equivalent single-
family connections (ESFCs) on approximately 2,688 acres. 

B. KONOMIC ANALYSIS 

Tax'Rate Analysis — Tax/Revenue Supported Debt 

The feasibility of this bond issue is based on no-growth to the 4,180 connections as of December 
31, 2013. The feasibility of the tax supported debt is based on no-growth to the District's 
January 1, 2013 certified taxable assessed valuation of $1,047,277,474 ($756,915,943 for the 
portion of the Districtwithin Denton County and $290,361,531 for the portion of the District 
within Tarrant County). The feasibility of the revenue supported debt is based on revenueš 
earned by the District through services provided to the Districes customers. A market study has 
not been provided, and is not required since the feasibility is based on no-growth. 

According to the Denton Central Appraisal Digtrict and a Tarrant Appraisal District certificate, 
the District's January 1, 2013 certified taxable assessed valuation for each respective county is 
$756,915,943 and $290,361,531, or a total of $1,047,277,474. The annual debt service 
requirements for the requested bond (tax supported) amount of $5,765,000 and existing debt 
averages $838,789 for the 21-year life of the District's bond debt. According to the engineering 
report, the District levied a maintenance tax of $0.01 in 2012 and according to information 
provided, is projecting to levy the same maintenance tax in the future. 

TCMUD005937 

789 



Tammy Benter, Manager 
Page 2 
January 31, 2014 

The District's financial advisor submitted a cash flow schedule considering the requested 
$5,765,000 bond issue (tax supported), no-growth to the Districts January 1, 2013 certified 
taxable assessed valuation of $1,047,277,474, a bond interest rate of 6%, 95% collection rate, 
and a projected tax rate of $0.11 (maximum) per $1oo assessed value. A Water Supply Division 
financial analyst has reviewed the financial information submitted and concluded that the 
following level debt service tax rate would be sufficient. 

District 

Projected 
Tax Rate 

Debt Service $ 0.11 (1)(2) 
Maintenance 

Sub-Total District Taxes 
$ 0.01  (3)  

Town of Trophy Club 
Town of Westlake 

Total District Taxes 

$$ 00.
.
5
12 

0 
 

$ 0.16 
(4) 

 

 ((5
4)) 

$ 0.62 
Notes: 

(1) Based on a net effective interest rate of 6.23%, a 95% collection rate, no-growth to the District's January 1, 
2013 certified taxable assessed valuation of $1,047,277,474, and at least a 25% ending debt service fund 
balance. 

(2) The term "commission-approved tax rate in 30 Texas Administrative Code (TAC) Section 293.85 refers to 
an initial ad valorem debt service tax of at most $0.11 per $3.00 assessed valuation. 

(3) Based on the operating budget provided, the District anticipates an operation and maintenance (General 
Fund) tax rate of $o.or. 

(4) Represents 2013 total tax rates based on information obtained from the Denton Central Appraisal District. 
Information provided does not specify how much, if any, of each total tax rate is attributable to water, 
wastewater, drainage, recreational , or road facilities as required by 30 TAC Section 293,59(f). AS a result, 
staff has included the total tax in order to determine compliance with 30 TAC Sections 293.59(1) and (k)(3). 

(5) Represents the combined projected tax rate as defined by 30 TAC Section 293,59(f). The highest combined 
projected tax rate is the portion of the District that overlaps with the Town of Trophy Club ($0.62), which is 
less than the $1.20 limit allowed under so TAC Sections 293.59(1) and (k)(3). 

The Districes financial advisor submitted a cash fiow schechile considering the requested 
$9,230,000 bond issue (revenue supported) and a bond interest rate of 6%. The cash flow 
schedule provided indicates $1,990,339 ($7,461,907 in revenue less $5,471,568 in expenses) 
being available for the District's current and proposed debt service requirements. According to 
the application material, the $1,990,339 is based on: the District's 2012 fiscal year end audit; no 
additional growth projected for revenue based calculations (e.g. service revenue, etc.); and 
assumes no capital expenses that were accounted for in said fiscal year end. A Water Supply 
Division financial analyst has reviewed the financial information submitted and concluded that 
operating revenues appear to be sufficient for operating expenses and the District's current and 
proposed revenue debt. This determination is based on the following: the District's current 
operating budget provided (2013); no additional growth projected for revenue based 
calculations (e.g. service revenue, etc.); excluding capital expenses and debt service 
requirements that were/are accounted for in the current operating budget provided; and the 
District's general fund balance of approximately $3,913,446  as of May 31, 2013 (as presented in 
the engineering report). 

TCMUD005938 

790 



Tarnmy Benter, Manager 
Page 3 
January 31, 2014 

Additional Financial Comments  

The District is exempt from the 75% and 25% build-out requirements of 30 TAC Sections 
293.59(1)(4) and 293.59(k)(7), respectively, based on its combined no-growth tax rate of $0.62. 
being less than $1.20 pursuant to Sections 293.59(1) and 293.59(k)(11)(C). 

C. ENGINEERING ANALYSIS 
1, 

Water Supply 

The Districts source of water is treated surface water from the City of Fort Worth pursuant to a 
"Contract For Water Service Between The City Of Fort Worth, Texas, And Trophy Club 
Municipal Utility District No. e dated September 16, 2010 (revised from previous bond issue). 
The following table summarizes the water supply facilities serving the District along with the 
ESFC capacity of each component based on criteria stated in 3o TAC Section 290.45: 

acility 

Ground 
Storage 

Elevated Storage 

Booster 
Pump 

Minimum 
Requirements 

200 gal/ESFC 

1.00 gal/ESFC 

2 gpm/ESFC or 
1,000 gpm max. 

Total Capacity,  
(ESFCs) 

6,000,00o gal. 
(34,500 ESFCs)() 

900,000 gal. 
(9,000 ESFCs) 

13,500 gpm 
(6,750 ESFCs) 

Note: (i) Total storage of 6,90 o,000 gallons provides for 34,500  equivalent single-family connections (ESFC) at 200 
gpd per ESFC. 

The Disiricts water supply facilities appear adequate to serve the existing 4,180 connections 
upon which the feasibility of this bond issue is based. 

Wastewater Treatment 

Wastewater treatment for the District is provided by the Districts 1.75 million gallons per day 
wastewater treatment plant. Under TPDES Permit No. WQooll59300l, the plant is authorized 
to discharge 1.75 million gallons per clay. Based on the indicated flow factor of 300 gallons per 
day per ESFC, the Districts 1.75 million gallons per day plant can serve 5,833 ESFCs. The 
District's wastewater treatment plant capacity appears adequate to serve the existing 4,180 
connectiOns upon which the feasibility of this bond issue is based. 

TCMUD005939 

791 



Tammy Benter, Manager 
Page 4 
January 31, 2014 

According to the engineering report, the effective treatment capacity of the plant's processes and 
infrastructure has been reduced as a result of lowering of permit requirements. The proposed 
bond issue (tax and revenue supported) includes funds to finance improvements to the District's 
plant. According to the engineering report, the project (plant improvements) will be divided 
into two phases to allow continuation of plant operations during construction. 

Storm Water Drainage 

Storm water from the Drainage generally drains through underground lines and swales, which 
eventually outfall into Lake Grapevine. 

Purchase of Existing Facilities and/or Assumption of Existing Contracts — None. 

Facilities to be Constructed 

Project 
	

Esti I ated Costs(1) 
Wastewater Treatment Plant 
Improvements 
	

$11,297,015 

Note: (1) Estimated costs as presented in the engineering report. The $11,297,015 includes funds for both phases; 
$5,777,199 for Phase IA and $5,519,816 for Phase 18. 

Approved plans and specifications, and various construction contract documents have not been 
provided. 

D. SUMMARY OF COSTS 

District's Share (1)  Construction Costs 
A. Developer Contribution Items — None. 
B. District Items 

1. Wastewater Treatment Plant Improvements 
2. Contingencies (15% of Item No. 1) 

$ 11,297,015 
1,694,552 

3. Engineering (12% of Item Nos. i and 2) 1,561,000 
Total District Items $ 14,552,567 
Total Construction Costs $ 14,552,567 

Non-Construction Costs 
A. Legal Fees (o.5%) $ 	154,975 (2) 
B. Fiscal Agent Fees 154,975 (3)  
C. Bond Issuance Expense 60,000 

TCMUD005940 

792 



Tammy Benter, Manager 
Page 5 
January 31, 2014 

D. Bond Application Report Costs 	 20,000 
E. Attorney General Fee (o.io%) 	 14,995 (4)  
F. TCEQ Bond Issuance Fee (o.25%) 	 37,488  (4  

Total Non-Construction Costs 	 $ 442,433  
Total Bond Issue Requirement 	$ 14,995,000 

Notes: 
(1) The facilities requested for funding are considered'exempt from the 30% developer contribution ' 

requirement of 30 TAC Section 29147. 
(2) Represents the respective fees for the tax supported ($5,765,o0o) and revenue supported ($9,230,000) 

bond issuances. Pursuant to the contract, fees are 1.5% of the first $3,000,000 of bonds issued, phis 1.0% of 
the bonds issued from $3,000,000 to $5,000,000, plus o.5% the bonds issued above $5,000,000. 

(3) Represents the respective fees for the tax supported ($5,765,000) and revenue supported ($9,230,000) 
bond issuances. Pursuant to the contract, fees are 1.5% of the first $3,000,000 of bonds issued, plus 1.0% of 
the bonds issued from $3,000,000 to $5,000,000, plus 0.5% the bonds issued above $5,000,000. 

(4) Represents the respective fees for the tax supported ($5n65,000) and revenue supported ($9,230,000) 
bond issuances. 

E. SPECIAL CONSIDERATIONS  — None. 

F. CONCLUSIONS 

1. Based on the indicated $27,094,217 in bonds approved by voters, and $21,325,000 
previously approved by the TCEQ and/or issued by the District, the District appears to have 
sufficient voter-authorized bonds ($5,769,217) for the proposed tax supported portion 
($5,765,000) of the bond issuance. 

2. Voter authorization is not required for the proposed revenue portion ($9,230,000) of the 
bond issuance. Based on the review of the financial information submitted, operating 
revenues appear to be sufficient for operating expenses and the District's current and 
proposed revenue debt. 

3. Based on the review of the engineering report and supporting documents, the bond issue is 
considered feasible and meets the economic feasibility criteria estqblished by 30 TAC 
Section 293.59. 

4. The recommendations are made under authority delegated by the Executive Director of the 
Texas Commission on Environmental Quality. 

TCMUD005941 

793 



Tammy Benter, Manager 
Page 6 
January 31, 2014 

G. RECOMMENDATIONS 

1. Approve the bond issue in the total amount of $14,995,000 ($5,765,000 in unlimited tax 
bonds and $9,230,000 in revenue bonds) in accordance with the recommended summary of 
costs, at a maximum net effective interest rate of 6.23%. 

2. Direct the Districes board to ensure that system revenue is adequate to meet operating 
expenses and debt service requirements on revenue debt. 

3. Direct the District not to expend a total of $12,991,567 ($11,297,015 for construction plus 
$1,694,552 in contingencies) for the wastewater treatment plant improvements pending 
District board's receipt of plans and specifications approved by all entities with jurisdiction, 
as necessary. 

4. Standard recommendations regarding consultant fees, surplus proceeds, time of approval, 
and bond proceeds fee apply. 

TCMUD005942 

794 



CERTIFICATE OF SECRETARY 

THE STATE OF TEXAS 
§ TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY 

COUNTIES OF DENTON AND TARRANT § 	DISTRICT NO. 1 

I, the undersigned, Secretary of the Board of Directors of the Trophy Club Municipal 
Utility District No. 1, DO HEREBY CERTIFY as follows: 

1. On the 4th  day of December, 2014, a special meeting of the Board of Directors 
(the "Board") of the Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1 (the "District') was held at a 
meeting place within the District; the duly constituted members of the Board being ds follows: 

JAMES (JIM) MOSS 	 PRESIDENT 
JIM HASE 	 VICE PRESIDENT 
KEVIN R. CARR 	 SECRETARY/TREASURER 
JAMES C. THOMAS 	 DIRECTOR 
NEIL TWOMEY 	 DIRECTOR 

and all of said persons were present at said meeting, except the following:  None  . Among 
other business considered at said meeting, the attached resolution entitled: 

RESOLUTION NO. 2014-1204A 

"A RESOLUTION authorizing appropriate personnel and consultants to proceed 
with arrangements and the preparation of documents for the issuance 
and sale of revenue bonds; approving and authorizing publication of a 
notice of sale with respect to issuance and sale of such bonds; and 
resolving other matters incident arid related thereto" 

was introduced and submitted to the Board for passage and adoption. After presentation and 
due consideration of the resolution, and upon a motion being made and and seconded, the 
resolution was finally passed and adopted by the Board to be effective immediately by the 
following vote: 

5 	voted "For" 0 	voted "Against" 	 0 	abstained 

  

all as shown in the official minutes of the Board for the meeting held on the aforesaid date. 

2. The attached resolution is a true and correct copy of the original on file in the 
official records of the District; the duly qualified and acting members of the Board on the date of 
the aforesaid meeting are those persons shown above and, according to the records of my 
office, advance notice of the time, place and purpose of the meeting was given to each member 
of the Board; and that said meeting, and the deliberation of the aforesaid public business, was 
open to the public and written notice of said meeting, including the subject of the above entitled 
resolution, was posted and given in advance thereof in compliance with the provisions of Texas 
Government Code, Chapter 551, as amended. 

41210585.1/11411680 

TCMUD005943 

795 



IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto signed my name officially and affixed the seal 
of said District, this the 41h  day of December, 2014. 

Secretary, Board of Directors 
Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1 

41210585.1/11411680 	 [signature page of Certificate of Secretary] 

TCMUD005944 

796 



RESOLUTION NO. 2014-1204A 

A RESOLUTION authôrizing appropriate personnel and consultants to proceed 
with arrangements and the preparation of documents for the issuance 
and sale of revenue bonds; approving and authorizing publication of a 
notice of sale with respect to issuance and sale of such bonds; and 
resolving other matters incident and related thereto 

WHEREAS, the Board of Directors (the "Board") of the Trophy Club Municipal Utility 
District No. 1 (the "District') has determined that revenue bonds should be issued and sold in a 
principal amount not to exceed $9,230,000; and 

WHEREAS, the Board hereby finds and determines that it is now proper to (1) authorize 
appropriate personnel and consultants to proceed with arrangements and the preparation of 
documents for the issuance and sale of revenue bonds and (2) authorize the publication of a 
notice of sale with respect to such bonds with a tentative sale date of January 20, 2015, 
pursuant to the provisions of Texas Water Code, Section 49.183; 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE 
TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 1: 

SECTION 1: The General Manager for the District, together with the District's financial 
advisor, Southwest Securities, Inc. and bond counsel, Fulbright & Jaworski LLP, a member of 
Norton Rose Fulbright, are hereby authorized and directed to proceed on behalf of the District 
with the preparation of the documents and to make the appropriate arrangements for the 
offering and sale of revenue bonds in a principal amount not to exceed $9,230,000. '` The 
General Manager and other appropriate officials of the District are hereby authorized and 
directed to assist and furnish said consultants with information and data pecessary for the 
preparation of an official statement and other documents for a sale of such bonds to occiir and 
be approved by the Board of Directors at a meeting to be held on or about January 20, 2015. 

SECTION 2: The Secretary of the Board of Directors is hereby authorized and directed 
to cause a notice of sale relating to the sale of revenue bonds to be published (1) at least one 
time not less than 10 days before the date of sale in a newspaper of general circulation in the 
county or counties in which the District is located and (2) at least one time in one or more 
recognized financial publications of general circulation in the State of Texas as approved by the 
State Attorney General; such notice of sale to read substantially in the form and content of 
Exhibit A hereto attached and incorporated herein by reference as a-part of this Resolution for 
all purposes. 

SECTION 3: It is officially found, determined and declared that the meeting at which 
this Resolution is adopted was open to the public and public notice of the time, place and 
subject matter of the public business to be considered at such meeting, including this 
Resolution, was given, all as required by all as required by Texas Government Code, Chapter 
551, as amended. 

SECTION 4: This Resolution shall be in force and effect from and after its passage on 
the date shown below. 

41210574.1/11411680 

TCMUD005945 

797 



PASSED AND ADOPTED, this December 4, 2014. 

TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL. UTILITY 
DISTRICT NO. 1 

Jim Moss resident 
Board o [rectors 

ATTEST: 

Kevin R. Carr, Secretary/Treasurer 
Board of Directors 

41210574. 1/11411680 	 [signature page of Resolution] 

TCMUD005946 

798 



Exhibit A 

$9,230,000 
TROPHY CLUB MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 1 

(A political subdivision of the State of Texas located in Denton and Tarrant Counties, Texas) 
WATER AND SEWER SYSTEM REVENUE BONDS, SERIES 2015 

Selling: January 20, 2015 
Bids due 11:00 a.m. Central Standard Time ("CST") 

Place and Time of Award: The District will consider the award of the sale of the Bonds on 
January 20, 2015 at 6:00 P.M., C.S.T., at the District's Office, 100 Municipal Drive, Trophy Club, 
Texas 76262. Action will be taken' immediately by the Board of Directors of the District to 
accept or reject the best bid. Each bidder must deliver a bank Cashiers Check in the amount of 
$184,600, payable to the order of Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1, as a good faith 
deposit to the Districts Financial Advisor, Dan Almon, Southwest Securities, 1201 Elm St., Suite 
3500, Dallas, Texas 75270,,by 11:00 A.M., C.S.T. on the date of the sale. 

Address of the Bids Delivered in Person: Sealed written bids, plainly marked "Bid for Bonds" 
should be addressed to the Board of Directors of Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1, 
and delivered to Dan Almon, Southwest Securities, 1201 Elm St., Suite 3500, Dallas, Texas 
75270, by 11:00 A.M., C.S.T. on January 20, 2015. All bids must be signed and submitted on 
the "Official Bid Form". 

Electronic Bidding Procedures: Any prospective bidder that intends to submit an electronic 
bid must submit its electronic bid through the facilities of the lpreo Holdings LLC, PARITY 
System by 11:00 A.M., C.S.T., on January 20, 2015 as described in the "Official Notice of Sale" 
described below. 

Information: The Bonds are more completely described in the "Official Notice of Sale", "Official 
Bid Form" and the "Preliminary Official Statement" for the Bonds which may be obtained from 
Dan Almon, Southwest Securities, 1201 Elm St., Suite 3500, Dallas, Texas 75270, Financial 
Advisor to the District. 

All bidders must submit a SIGNED OFFICIAL Bli5 FORM prior to the time of sale, which is 
11:00 A.M., C.S.T. on January' 20, 2015, to Dan Almon, Southwest Securities, 1201 Elm St., 
Suite 3500, Dallas, Texas 75270 in accordance with the Official Notice of Sale. The bidder 
whose bid is the winning bid in accordance with the Official Notice of Sale will be notified 
immediately. 

The District reserves the right to reject any or all bids for the Bonds and to waive any and all 
irregularities except time of filing. This notice does hot constitute an offer to sell the Bonds but 
is merely notice of sale of the Bonds as required by law. The offer to sell the Bohds will be 
made only by means of the "Official Notice of Sale", the "Preliminary Official Statemenr and the 
"Official Bid Form" for the Bonds. 

This Notice of Sale supersedes and replaces any previously published Notice of Sale for the 
Bonds. 

Board of Directors 
Trophy Club Municipal Utility District No. 1 

41210574.1/11411680 

TCMUD005947 

799 


	Page 1
	Page 2
	Page 3
	Page 4
	Page 5
	Page 6
	Page 7
	Page 8
	Page 9
	Page 10
	Page 11
	Page 12
	Page 13
	Page 14
	Page 15
	Page 16
	Page 17
	Page 18
	Page 19
	Page 20
	Page 21
	Page 22
	Page 23
	Page 24
	Page 25
	Page 26
	Page 27
	Page 28
	Page 29
	Page 30
	Page 31
	Page 32
	Page 33
	Page 34
	Page 35
	Page 36
	Page 37
	Page 38
	Page 39
	Page 40
	Page 41
	Page 42
	Page 43
	Page 44
	Page 45
	Page 46
	Page 47
	Page 48
	Page 49
	Page 50
	Page 51
	Page 52
	Page 53
	Page 54
	Page 55
	Page 56
	Page 57
	Page 58
	Page 59
	Page 60
	Page 61
	Page 62
	Page 63
	Page 64
	Page 65
	Page 66
	Page 67
	Page 68
	Page 69
	Page 70
	Page 71
	Page 72
	Page 73
	Page 74
	Page 75
	Page 76
	Page 77
	Page 78
	Page 79
	Page 80
	Page 81
	Page 82
	Page 83
	Page 84
	Page 85
	Page 86
	Page 87
	Page 88
	Page 89
	Page 90
	Page 91
	Page 92
	Page 93
	Page 94
	Page 95
	Page 96
	Page 97
	Page 98
	Page 99
	Page 100

